
,/ 
I 

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

CHAPTER 23 

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

Authority 

N.J.S.A. 52:27D-123, 123a, 123.2, 123.5, 123.8, 124 and 124f. 

Source and Effective Date 

R.1997 d.409, effective September 9, 1997. 
See: 29 N.J.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a). 

Executive Order No. 66(1978) Expiration Date 

Chapter 23, Uniform Construction Code, expires on September 9, 
2002. 

Chapter Historical Note 

Chapter 23, Uniform Construction Code, was adopted as R.1976 
d.344, d.345, d.346 and d.347, effective January 1, 1977 and codified as 
Subchapter 1, General Provisions; Subchapter 2, Administration and 
Enforcement Process; Subchapter 3, Subcodes, and Subchapter 4, 
Enforcing Agencies: Duties, Powers, Procedures. See: 8 N.J.R. 
216(b), 319(a), 370(d), 414(a); 8 N.J.R. 546(a). Chapter 23 supersed­
ed N.J.A.C. 5:16, Standard Building Code and N.J.A.C. 5:20, Safety 
Glazing Materials, which were repealed by R.1978 d.360, effective 
October 6, 1978. See: 10 N.J.R. 377(a), 10 N.J.R. 470(a). Chapter 23 
also superseded N.J.A.C. 5:21, Uniform Standards Code for Mobile 
Homes, which was repealed by R.1982 d.7, effective February 1, 1982. 
See: 13 N.J.R. 717(a), 14 N.J.R. 142(a). Subchapter 5, Licensing of 
Code Enforcement Officials, was adopted as R.1977 d.304, effective 
October 1, 1977. See: 9 N.J.R. 257(b), 9 N.J.R. 413(b). Subchapter 6, 
Tax Exemption for Solar Facilities, was adopted as R.1978 d.334, 
effective September 18, 1978. See: 10 N.J.R. 222(b), 10 N.J.R. 418(a). 
Pursuant to Executive Order No. 66(1978), Subchapter 6 was readopted 
as R.1980 d.303, effective July 1, 1980. See: 12 N.J.R. 249(c), 12 
N.J.R. 452(c). 

Pursuant to Executive Order No. 66(1978), Chapter 23 was readopt• 
ed as R.1983 d.144, effective April 26, 1983. See: 14 N.J.R 1247(a), 15 
N.J.R. 803(c). Subchapter 7, Barrier Free Subcode, was adopted as 
R.1986 d.448, effective November 3, 1986. See: 18 N.J.R. 757(a), 18 
N.J.R 2194(a). Subchapter 8, Asbestos Hazard Abatement Subcode, 
was adopted as Emergency New Rules R.1985 d.362, effective June 18, 
1985 (expired August 17, 1985). See: 17 N.J.R. 1782(a). The provi­
sions of R.1985 d.362 were readopted as R.1985 d.472, effective August 
16, 1985. See: 17 N.J.R. 2249(a). 

Pursuant to Executive Order No. 66(1978), Chapter 23 was readopt­
ed as R.1988 d.168, effective Match 22, 1988. N.J.A.C. 5:23-6.1, 6.2 
and 6.3, concerning tax exemption for solar facilities, were not readopt­
ed and expired on April 1, 1988. See: 20 N.J.R. 223(a), 20 N.J.R. 
893(a). Subchapter 9, Code Interpretations, was adopted as R.1988 
d.195, effective May 2, 1988. See: 20 N.J.R. 224(a), 20 N.J.R. 977(a). 
Subchapter 10, Radon Hazard Subcode, was adopted as R.1990 d.226, 
effective May 7, 1990. See: 21 N.J.R. 3696(a), 22 N.J.R. 1356(a). 
Subchapter 4A, Industrialized/Modular Buildings and Building Compo­
nents, was adopted as R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990, (operative 
July 1, 1990). See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b). Subchapter 
11, Indoor Air Quality Standards and Procedures for Buildings Occu­
pied by Public Employees, was adopted as R.1992 d.33, effective 
January 21, 1992. See: 23 N.J.R. 1730(b), 24 N.J.R. 229(c). Subchap­
ter 12, Elevator Safety Subcode, was adopted as R.1991 d.325, effective 
July 1, 1991. See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a). 

Pursuant to Executive Order No. 66(1978), Chapter 23 was readopt­
ed as R.1993 d.106, effective February 3, 1993. See: 24 N.J.R. 
1420(b), 25 N.J.R. 920(a). Subchapter 4B, Manufactured Homes and 
Manufactured Home Add-On Units Not Subject to Federal Regulation, 
and Subchapter 4C, Enforcement of Federal Manufactured Home 

New Jersey State Ubrary 23-1 

Standards, were adopted as R.1994 d.96, effective February 22, 1994. 
See: 25 N.J.R. 5388(a), 26 N.J.R. 1073(a). N.J.A.C. 5:23-7.1 through 
7.99 were repealed and 7.100 through 7.116 were recodified as 7.2 
through 7.18 by R.1995 d.144, effective March 20, 1995 (operative July 
1, 1995). See: 26 N.J.R. 2698(a), 26 N.J.R. 2524(a), 27 N.J.R. 1180(a). 
Subchapter 11, Indoor Air Quality Standards and Procedures for 
Buildings Occupied by Public Employees, was repealed by R.1995 
d.612, effective December 4, 1995 (operative July 1, 1995). See: 27 
N.J.R. 3518(a), 27 N.J.R. 4885(a). 

Pursuant to Executive Order No. 66(1978), Chapter 23 was readopt­
ed as R.1997 d.409, effective September 9, 1997. See: Source and 
Effective Date. As a part of R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997, 
Subchapter 6, Tax Exemption, was repealed. See, also, section annota­
tions. 

Cross References 

Child care center physical facility requirements, see N.J.A.C. 
10:122-5.1 et seq. 

Children's group home physical facility requirements, see N.J.A.C. 
10:128-4.1 et seq. 

Children's shelter physical facility requirements, see N.J.A.C. 
10:124-5.1 et seq. 

Residential child care facility maintenance and sanitation require­
ments, see N.J.A.C. 10:127-4.4. 

CHAPTER TABLE OF CONTENTS 

SUBCHAPTER 1. GENERAL PROVISIONS 
5:23-1.1 Title; division into subchapters 
5:23-1.2 Authority 
5:23-1.3 Intent and purpose 
5:23-1.4 Definitions 
5:23~1.5 Effective date 
5:23-1.6 Grace period 
5:23-1.7 Validity 

SUBCHAPTER 2. ADMINISTRATION AND 
ENFORCEMENT; PROCESS 

Title; scope; intent 
Matter covered 
Applicability 
Alterations, replacements and damages 
Concerning increase in size 
Change of use 
Ordinary maintenance 
Installation of equipment 
VariatiO!ls and exceptions 
Applications for variations 
Review of variation applications 
Final decision on variations 
Authority to grant variations 
Construction pennits~when required 
Construction permits-application 
Construction permits-procedure 

5:23-2.1 
5:23-2.2 
5:23-2.3 
5:23-2.4 
5:23-2.5 
5:23-2.6 
5:23-2.7 
5:23~2.8 
5:23-2.9 
5:23-2.10 
5:23-2.11 
5:23-2.12 
5:23-2.13 
5:23-2.14 
5:23-2.15 
5:23-2.16 
5:23-2.17 
5:23-2.17A 
5:23-2.18 
5:23-2.18A 
5:23-2.18B 
5:23-2.18C 
5:23-2.19 
5:23-2.20 
5:23-2.21 
5:23-2.22 
5:23-2.23 

Demolition or removal of structures; abandoned wells 
Minor work 
Inspections 
Utility load management device installation programs 
Utility area lighting facility installation program 
Use and occupancy of swimming pools, spas and hot tubs 
Special technical services 
Tests and special inspections 
Construction control 
Premanufactured construction 
Certificate requirements 

Supp. 6-18-01 



5:23-2.24 Conditions of certificate of occupancy 
5:23-2.25 Establishment of fees 
5:23-2.26 Plan review fees 
5:23-2.27 Refunds 
5:23-2.28 Volume computation 
5:23-2.29 Entry 
5:23-2.30 Violation, notice and orders 
5:23-2.31 Compliance 
5:23-2.32 Unsafe structures 
5:23-2.33 Service of notice 
5:23-2.34 through 5:23-2.37 (Reserved) 
5:23-2.38 Departmental appeal 
5:23-2.39 Automatic fire suppression systems 

SUBCHAPTER 3. SUBCODES 
5:23-3.1 
5:23-3.2 
5:23-3.3 
5:23-3.4 
5:23-3.5 
5:23-3.6 
5:23-3.7 
5:23-3.8 
5:23-3.8A 
5:23-3.9 
5:23-3.10 
5:23-3.11 
5:23-3.11A 

5:23-3.11B 
5:23-3.12 
5:23-3.13 
5:23-3.14 
5:23-3.15 
5:23-3.16 
5:23-3.17 
5:23-3.18 
5:23-3.19 
5:23-3.20 
5:23-3.20A 
5:23-3.21 
5:23-3.22 

Title; scope; intent 
Matters covered; exceptions 
Enforcement 
Responsibility 
Posting structures 
Standards; accepted practice 
Municipal approvals of nonconforming materials 
Departmental approval of nonconforming materials 
Products violating the Code 
Interpretations and opinions 
(Reserved) 
Enforcement activities reserved to the Department 
Public school facility plan review and inspections; Uni­

form Construction Code enhancements in public school 
facilities 

Underground storage tank systems 
Amended rules 
State-sponsored code change proposals 
Building subcode 
Plumbing subcode 
Electrical subcode 
Fire protection subcode 
Energy Subcode 
Manufactured home subcode 
Mechanical subcode 
(Reserved) 
One and two-family dwelling subcode 
Fuelgassubcode 

SUBCHAPTER 4. ENFORCING AGENCIES; DUTIES; 
POWERS; PROCEDURES 

5:23-4.1 
5:23-4.2 
5:23-4.3 
5:23-4.3A 
5:23-4.4 
5:23-4.5 

5:23-4.5A 

5:23-4.6 
5:23-4.7 
5:23-4.8 

5:23-4.9 
5:23-4.10 
5:23-4.11 
5:23-4.12 

5:23-4.13 

5:23-4.14 

5:23-4.15 
5:23-4.16 
5:23-4.17 
5:23-4.18 
5:23-4.19 

Title; scope; intent 
Matter covered; exceptions 
Municipal enforcing agencies-establishment 
Enforcing agency classification 
Municipal enforcing agencies-organization 
Municipal enforcing agencies-administration and enforce­

ment 
Selection of private on-site inspection and plan review 

agencies 
Interlocal enforcing agencies-establishment 
Interlocal enforcing agencies-organization 
Interlocal enforcing agencies-administration and enforce-

ment 
State enforcing agencies-establishment 
State enforcing agencies-organization 
State enforcing agencies-administration and enforcement 
Private on-site inspection and plan review agencies; estab-

lishment 
Private on-site inspection and plan review agencies; orga­

nization 
Private on-site inspection and plan review agencies; admin-

istration and enforcement 
Suspension and revocation 
(Reserved) 
Municipal enforcing agency fees 
Standards for municipal fees 
State of New Jersey training fees 

Supp. 6-18-01 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

5:23-4.20 Departmental fees 
5:23-4.21 Private enforcing agency authorization and reauthorization 

fees 
5:23-4.22 (Reserved) 
5:23-4.23 Payment of fees 
5:23-4.24 Plan review by the Department of Community Affairs 
5:23-4.25 (Reserved) 
5:23-4.26 Certification of building elements 
5:23-4.27 through 5:23-4.40 (Reserved) 

SUBCHAPTER 4A. INDUSTRIALIZED/MODULAR 
BUILDINGS AND BUILDING COMPONENTS 

5:23-4A.1 Purpose 
5:23-4A.2 Findings; functions of the Commission 
5:23-4A.3 Scope 
5:23-4A.4 Definitions 
5:23-4A.5 Standards 
5:23-4A.6 Amendments 
5:23-4A.7 Certification required 
5:23-4A.8 Product control and identification 
5:23-4A.9 Compliance assurance documents 
5:23-4A.10 Uniform Administrative Procedures 
5:23-4A.11 Appeals 
5:23-4A.12 Conduct of hearings 
5:23-4A.13 through 5:23-4A.27 (Reserved) 

SUBCHAPTER 4B. MANUFACTURED HOMES AND 
MANUFACTURED HOME ADD-ON UNITS NOT 
SUBJECT TO FEDERAL REGULATION 

5:23-4B.1 
5:23-4B.2 
5:23-4B.3 
5:23-4B.4 
5:23-4B.5 
5:23-4B.6 

5:23-4B.7 
5:23-4B.8 
5:23-4B.9 

5:23-4B.10 
5:23-4B.ll 

Scope 
Applicability 
Standards 
Administration and enforcement 
Acceptability 
Approvals of building systems and compliance assurance 

program 
Certification 
Labels; fees 
Requirements for submission of compliance assurance 

documents 
Appeals 
Conduct of hearings 

SUBCHAPTER 4C. ENFORCEMENT OF FEDERAL 
MANUFACTURED HOME STANDARDS 

5:23-4C.l Delegation of authority 
5:23-4C.2 Relation to Federal law 
5:23-4C.3 Complaint procedure 
5:23-4C.4 Hearing and appeal procedures 
5:23-4C.5 Monitoring inspection fee 

SUBCHAPTER 5. LICENSING OF CODE 
ENFORCEMENT OFFICIALS 

5:23-5.1 
5:23-5.2 
5:23-5.3 
5:23-5.4 
5:23-5.5 
5:23-5.6 
5:23-5.7 
5:23-5.8 
5:23-5.9 
5:23-5.10 
5:23-5.11 
5:23-5.12 
5:23-5.13 
5:23-5.14 
5:23-5.15 
5:23-5.16 
5:23-5.17 
5:23-5.18 

23-2 

Title; scope; intent 
Licensing unit; hearings 
Types of licenses 
Licenses required 
General license requirements 
Construction official requirements 
Subcode official requirements 
Building inspector H.H.S. requirements 
Building inspector I.C.S. requirements 
Building inspector R.C.S. requirements 
Electrical inspector H.H.S. requirements 
Electrical inspector I.C.S. requirements 
Fire protection inspector H.H.S. requirements 
Fire protection inspector I.C.S. requirements 
Fire protection inspector R.C.S. requirements 
Plumbing inspector H.H.S. requirements 
Plumbing inspector I.C.S. requirements 
Inplant inspector requirements 



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

5:23-5.19 
5:23-5.19A 
5:23-5.20 
5:23-5.21 

__/ 5:23-5.22 
5:23-5.23 
5:23-5.24 
5:23-5.25 

Elevator inspector H.H.S. requirements 
Mechanical inspector requirements 
Standards for educational programs 
Renewal of license 
Fees 
Examination requirements 
Procedure for approving educational programs 
Revocation of licenses and alternative sanctions 

SUBCHAPTER 6. REHABILITATION SUBCODE 
5:23-6.1 
5:23-6.2 
5:23-6.3 
5:23-6.4 
5:23-6.5 
5:23-6.6 
5:23-6.7 
5:23-6.8 
5:23-6.9 
5:23-6.10 

5:23-6.11 
5:23-6.11A 
5:23-6.12 
5:23-6.12A 
5:23-6.13 
5:23-6.13A 
5:23-6.14 
5:23-6.14A 
5:23-6.15 
5:23-6.15A 
5:23-6.16 
5:23-6.16A 
5:23-6.17 
5:23-6.17A 
5:23-6.18 
5:23-6.18A 
5:23-6.19 
5:23-6.19A 
5:23-6.20 
5:23-6.20A 
5:23-6.21 
5:23-6.21A 
5:23-6.22 
5:23-6.22A 
5:23-6.23 
5:23-6.23A 
5:23-6.24 
5:23-6.24A 
5:23-6.25 
5:23-6.25A 
5:23-6.26 
5:23-6.26A 
5:23-6.27 
5:23-6.27A 
5:23-6.28 
5:23-6.28A 
5:23-6.29 
5:23-6.30 
5:23-6.31 
5:23-6.32 
5:23-6.33 

Introduction; using this subcode 
Applicability and compliance 
Definitions 
Repairs 
Renovations 
Alterations 
Reconstruction 
Materials and methods 
New building elements 
Basic requirements and supplemental requirements-gen-

eral 
Basic requirements in all Use Groups 
Supplemental requirements in all Use Groups 
Basic requirements-Use Group A-1 
Supplemental requirements-Use Group A-1 
Basic requirements-Use Group A-2 
Supplemental requirements-Use Group A-2 
Basic requirements-Use Group A-3 
Supplemental requirements-Use Group A-3 
Basic requirements-Use Group A-4 
Supplemental requirements-Use Group A-4 
Basic requirements-Use Group A-5 
Supplemental requirements-Use Group A-5 
Basic requirements-Use Group B 
Supplemental requirements-Use Group B 
Basic requirements-Use Group E 
Supplemental requirements-Use Group E 
Basic requirements-Use Group F 
Supplemental requirements-Use Group F 
Basic requirements-Use Group H 
Supplemental requirements-Use Group H 
Basic requirements-Use Group I-1 
Supplemental requirements-Use Group I-1 
Basic requirements-Use Group I-2 
Supplemental requirements-Use Group I-2 
Basic requirements-Use Group I-3 
Supplemental requirements-Use Group I-3 
Basic requirements-Use Group M 
Supplemental requirements-Use Group M 
Basic requirements-Use Group R-1 
Supplemental requirements-Use Group R-1 
Basic requirements-Use Group R-2 
Supplemental requirements-Use Group R-2 
Basic requirements-Use Groups R-3/R-4 
Supplemental requirements-Use Groups R-3/R-4 
Basic requirements-Use Group S 
Supplemental requirements-Use Group S 
Mixed use buildings 
Special technical requirements-all use groups 
Change of use 
Additions 
Historic buildings 

SUBCHAPTER 7. BARRIER FREE SUBCODE 
5:23-7.1 
5:23-7.2 
5:23-7.3 
5:23-7.4 
5:23-7.5 
5:23-7.6 
5:23-7.7 

/ 5:23-7.8 
5:23-7.9 

Applicability 
Accessibility standards 
Exemptions 
Nonresidential buildings 
Multi-family residential buildings 
Exterior accessible route 
Accessible building entrances 
Interior accessible routes 
Accessible parking 

5:23-7.10 Requirements applicable to specific nonresidential use 
groups and Use Group R-1 

5:23-7.11 Requirements applicable to all nonresidential use groups, 
including spaces other than guestrooms in Use Group 
R-1 

5:23-7.12 Existing facilities 
5:23-7.13 · Variations 
5:23-7.14 Enforcement 
5:23-7.15 Recreation 
5:23-7.16 Recreation: definitions 
5:23-7.17 Recreation: exceptions 
5:23-7.18 Recreation: route of travel 
5:23-7.19 Recreation: pools 
5:23-7.20 Recreation: swimming and skating areas 
5:23-7.21 Recreation: boating areas 
5:23-7.22 Recreation: fishing areas 
5:23-7.23 Recreation: court games 
5:23-7.24 Recreation: ice rinks and roller rinks 
5:23-7.25 Recreation: playing fields 
5:23-7.26 Recreation: golf facilities 
5:23-7.27 Recreation: ski lifts, aerial tramways, and conveyors 
5:23-7.28 Recreation: trails 

23-3 

5:23-7.29 Recreation: camping sites 
5:23-7.30 Recreation: equipment 
5:23-7.31 Recreation: equestrian facilities 

SUBCHAPTER 8. ASBESTOS HAZARD ABATEMENT 
SUBCODE 

5:23-8.1 
5:23-8.2 
5:23-8.3 
5:23-8.4 
5:23-8.5 
5:23-8.6 
5:23-8.7 
5:23-8.8 
5:23-8.9 
5:23-8.10 
5:23-8.11 
5:23-8.12 
5:23-8.13 
5:23-8.14 
5:23-8.15 
5:23-8.16 
5:23-8.17 
5:23-8.18 
5:23-8.19 
5:23-8.20 
5:23-8.21 
5:23-8.22 

Title; scope; intent 
Definitions 
Enforcement; licensing; special technical services 
Variations 
Construction permit for asbestos abatement 
Coordination with other permits 
Inspections; violations 
Certificate of occupancy; certificate of completion 
Fees 
Asbestos safety technician 
Asbestos safety control monitor 
Application of asbestos 
Pre-project procedures 
Operations and maintenance activities 
Asbestos hazard abatement projects 
Asbestos encapsulation and enclosure 
Limited containment removals 
Demolition 
Abatement in occupied buildings 
Removal of non-friable asbestos-containing material 
Air monitoring methodology 
Disposal of asbestos waste 

SUBCHAPTER 9. CODE INTERPRETATIONS 
5:23-9.1 Interpretation: Application of the Plumbing Subcode to 

certain mobile homes 
5:23-9.2 Interpretation: Construction Permit for a single family resi-

dence 
5:23-9.3 Interpretation: Ordinary maintenance 
5:23-9.4 (Reserved) 
5:23-9.5 Interpretation: Records retention 
5:23-9.6 Interpretations: Construction requirements for new and ex­

isting casinos 
5:23-9.7 Interpretation: Manufacturing, production and process 

equipment 
5:23-9.8 Interpretation: bed and breakfast guesthouses-change in 

use group requirements 
5:23-9.9 Foundation systems for garden type utility sheds and similar 

structures 

SUBCHAPTER 10. RADON HAZARD SUBCODE 
5:23-10.1 
5:23-10.2 
5:23-10.3 

Title; scope; intent 
Definitions 
Enforcement 

Supp. 6-18-01 



5:23-10.4 Construction techniques 

APPENDIX 10-A. NEW JERSEY MUNICIPALITIES IN 
TIER 1 

SUBCHAPTER 11. PLAYGROUND SAFETY SUBCODE 

5:23-11.1 Subcode adopted 
5:23-11.2 Definition 
5:23-11.3 Enforcement of subcode 
5:23-11.4 Compliance schedule 

SUBCHAPTER 12. ELEVATORSAFETY SUBCODE 

5:23-12.1 
5:23-12.2 
5:23-12.3 
5:23-12.4 
5:23-12.5 
5:23-12.6 
5:23-12.7 
5:23-12.8 

5:23-12.9 
5:23-12.10 
5:23-12.11 
5:23-12.12 

Title; scope; intent 
Referenced standards 
Inspection and test schedule 
Registration of elevator devices 
Registration fee 
Test and inspection fees 
Licensing 
Alterations, replacements, damages, increases in size, 

changes in use group, minor work, ordinary repairs 
Certificate of compliance requirements 
Inspections in seasonal facilities 
Notice concerning accidents 
Special safety equipment 

SUBCHAPTER 12A. OPTIONAL ELEVATOR 
INSPECTION PROGRAM 

5:23-12A.1 Title; scope; intent 
5:23-12A.2 Qualified elevator device inspection firms 
5:23-12A.3 Qualified elevator device inspector 
5:23-12A.4 Enrollment of devices 
5:23-12A.5 Permit process and monitoring 
5:23~12A.6 Special inspection and compliance procedures 

SUBCHAPTER 1. GENERAL PROVISIONS 

5:23-1.1 Title; division into subchapters 

(a) These regulations shall be known as the "Regulations 
for the New Jersey Uniform Construction Code" and are 
referred to herein as "the regulations". 

(b) The chapter consists of the following subchapters: 

1. "General provisions" which may be cited throughout 
the regulations as N.J.A.C. 5;23-1 and when referred to in 
subchapter 1 of this chapter may be cited as this subchap­
ter. 

2. "Administration and enforcement; process" which 
may be cited throughout the regulations as N.J.A.C. 
5:23-2 and when referred to in subchapter 2 of this 
chapter may be cited as this subchapter. 

3. "Subcodes" which may be cited throughout the regu­
lations as N.J.A.C. 5:23-3 and when referred to in sub­
chapter 3 of this chapter may be cited as this subchapter. 

Supp. 6-18-01 23-4 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

i. N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.11B contains references to the De­
partment of Environmental Protection's rules concern­
ing underground storage tanks, codified at N.J.A.C. 
7:14B, which are jointly enforced by this Department \. _./ 
and local enforcing agencies pursuant to this chapter. 

4. "Enforcing agencies: duties, powers, and proce-
dures" which may be cited throughout the regulations as 
N.J.A.C. 5:23-4 of this chapter and when referred to in 
subchapter 4 of this chapter may be cited as this subchap­
ter. 

5. "Industrialized/Modular Buildings and Building 
Components" which may be cited throughout the regula­
tions as N.J.A.C. 5:23-4A and when referred to N.J.A.C. 
5:23-4A may be cited as this subchapter. 

6. "Manufactured Homes and Manufactured Home 
Add-On Units Not Subject to Federal Regulations" which 
may be cited throughout the regulations as N.J.A.C. 
5:23-4B and when referred to in subchapter 4B may be 
cited as this subchapter. 

7. "Enforcement of Federal Manufactured Home Stan­
dards" which may be cited throughout the regulations as 
N.J.A.C. 5:23-4C and when referred to in subchapter 4C 
may be cited as this subchapter. 

8. "Licensing of Code Enforcement Officials" which 
may be cited throughout the regulations as N.J.A.C. 
5:23-5 and when referred to in subchapter 5 of this 
chapter may be cited as this subchapter. 

9. "Rehabilitation Subcode" which may be cited 
throughout the regulations as N.J.A.C. 5:23-6 and, when 
referred to in subchapter 6 of this chapter, may be cited 
as this subchapter. 

10. "Barrier Free Subcode" which may be cited 
throughout the regulations as N.J.A.C. 5:23-7 and when 
referred to in subchapter 7 of this chapter may be cited as 
this subchapter. 

11. "Asbestos Hazard Abatement Subcode" which may 
be cited throughout the regulations as N.J.A.C. 5:23-8 
and when referred to in subchapter 8 of this chapter may 
be cited as this subchapter. 

12. "Code Interpretations" which may be cited 
throughout the regulations as N.J.A.C. 5:23-9 and when 
referred to in subchapter 9 of this chapter may be cited as 
this subchapter. 

13. "Radon Hazard Subcode" which may be cited 
throughout the regulations as N.J.A.C. 5;23-10 and when 
referred to in subchapter 10 of this chapter may be cited 
as this subchapter. 

14. "Playground safety subcode" which may be cited 
throughout this chapter as N.J.A.C. 5:23-11 and, when 
referred to in subchapter 11 of this chapter, may be cited 
as "this subchapter." 

15. "Elevator Safety Subcode" which may be cited 
throughout the rules as N.J.A.C. 5:23-12 and when re­
ferred to in subchapter 12 of this chapter may be cited as 
this subchapter. 

Next Page is 23~4.1 

) 
i ' 
'-..____./ 



I 
~· 

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

ii. In Section 501.2, delete the words "imposed ac­
cording" from line three. 

iii. In Section 502.4, replace the word "approval" 
with "approved." 

iv. In Section 505.2.2, delete the exception and re­
place it with the following text: "Except where required 
by the radon subcode, a base course is not required 
when the concrete slab is installed on well-drained or 
sand-gravel mixture soils." 

v. In Section 505.2.3, exception, insert the phrase 
"Where permitted by the radon subcode," at the begin­
ning of line one. 

6. Chapter 6, entitled "Wall Construction," is amended 
as follows: 

i. In Section 601.1, delete the words "Section 108" 
and in lieu thereof insert "N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.6 and 3.7"; 

ii. Delete Section 604.1.1. 

7. Chapter 7, entitled "Wall Covering," is amended as 
follows: 

i. In Section 701.1, delete the words "Section 108" 
and in lieu thereof insert "N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.6 and 3.7"; 

8. Chapter 8, entitled "Roof Ceiling Construction," is 
amended as follows: 

i. In Section 801.1, delete the words "Section 108" 
and in lieu thereof insert "N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.6 and 3.7." 

9. Chapter 9, entitled "Roof Coverings," is amended 
as follows: 

i. In Section 901.1, delete the words "Section 108" 
and in lieu thereof insert "N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.6 and 3.7"; 

ii. In Section 901.3, "Roof Covering Materials," on 
line three, delete the phrase "in areas . . . 3 feet" and 
replace with the phrase: "when the edge of the roof is 
less than 6 feet ( 1829 mm)"; 

iii. Section 910.1 is amended to delete the words 
"Sections 117 and" and substitute the word "Section" 
and to delete the sentence "When the repair . . . for 
the new roofing." 

iv. Section 910.3, item number 3 is amended to 
delete the word "three" and substitute in lieu thereof 
"two." 

10. Chapter 10, entitled "Chimneys and Fireplaces," is 
amended as follows: 

i. Section 1001.7 is amended to add the following 
phrase after "1800°F": "and embedded in medium duty 
refractory mortar complying with ASTM C105." Delete 
the Exception. 

ii. Section 1002 is amended to add the sentence: 
"Factory-built chimneys shall conform to UL 103 and 
be installed in accordance with their listing." 

23-59 

5:23-3.21 

iii. In Section 1003.4, in the last line, change "10 
inches" to "12 inches." 

iv. In Section 1003.7, in the second line, change "2 
inches (51 mm) thick" to "4 inches (102 mm) solid 
masonry or equivalent." 

v. In Section 1003.9, in the second and fifth lines, 
change "2 inches (51 mm)" to "4 inches (102 mm)" and 
add the sentence "The minimum clearance to combusti­
bles from the exterior surface of the smoke chamber 
shall be 2 inches (51 mm)." 

vi. Section 1004.1, item #4 is amended to add the 
following after the word "opening": "for a fireplace 
having an opening of less than 6 square feet. The 
hearth of a fireplace with a larger opening shall extend 
a minimum of 20 inches (508 mm) beyond the face of 
the fireplace opening and a minimum of 12 inches (305 
mm) on each side of the fireplace opening." Also, in 
item #5 of Section 1004.1, delete the text and substi­
tute in lieu thereof: "Factory-built fireplaces shall be 
listed, labeled and tested according to UL 127, and 
installed according to their listing." 

vii. Section 1005.1 is amended to add "Factory-built 
fireplace stoves shall be tested according to UL 737." to 
the end of the section. 

11. Chapter 11 entitled, "Mechanical Administration" 
is amended as follows: 

i. Section 1101.2 is deleted; 

ii. Section 1103 is deleted. 

12. Chapter 12, entitled "Mechanical Definitions," is 
amended as follows: 

i. In Section 1202.0, the term and definition "Unusu­
ally tight construction" are deleted. 

13. Chapter 13 entitled, "General Mechanical System 
Requirements" is amended as follows: 

i. Section 1304.1 is amended to add the sentence, 
"This section shall not preclude the employees of a 
natural gas utility from converting existing liquefied 
petroleum installations to natural gas without permits." 

ii. Section 1307.1 is amended to delete the last sen­
tence. 

iii. Section 1307.4 is deleted. 

14. Chapter 14, entitled "Heating and Cooling Equip­
ment," is amended as follows: 

i. Section 1401.3 is deleted. 

15. Chapter 15 entitled, "Electric Resistance Heating" 
is amended as follows: 

i. Section 1501.1 is amended to delete the words 
"Chapters 39-46 of this code" and substitute in lieu 
thereof "the requirements of the electrical subcode." 

Supp. 6-18-01 



5:23-3.21 

ii. Section 1502.1 is amended to delete the words 
"Chapters 39-46 of this code" and substitute in lieu 
thereof "the requirements of the electrical subcode." 

iii. Section 1502.2 is amended to delete the words 
"Chapters 39-46 of this code" and substitute in lieu 
thereof "the requirements of the electrical subcode." 

iv. Section 1503.1 is amended to delete the words 
"Chapters 39-46 of this code" and substitute in lieu 
thereof "the requirements of the electrical subcode." 

16. Chapter 21 entitled, "Chimneys and Vents" is 
amended as follows: 

i. Section 2101.3 is amended to replace the words 
"cleaned and free of obstructions." with the words 
"inspected in accordance with the chimney certification 
program as provided for in N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.20(c)." 

17. Chapter 25 entitled, "Hydronic Piping" is amended 
as follows: 

i. Section 2501.3 is amended to delete the words 
"Chapter 29-38 of this code" and substitute in lieu 
thereof "the requirements of the plumbing subcode." 

ii. Section 2501.4 is amended to delete the words 
"the provisions listed in Section 3402" and substitute in 
lieu thereof "the requirements of the plumbing sub­
code." 

18. Chapter 26 entitled, "Fuel-Gas Piping" is amended 
as follows: 

i. Section 2602 is deleted; 

ii. Section 2603.1 is deleted; 

iii. Section 2603.2 is deleted; 

iv. Section 2603.3 is deleted; 

v. Section 2608.9 is amended to delete the words 
"Chapters 39-46 of this code" and substitute in lieu 
'thereof "the requirements of the elec.trical subcode." 

19. Chapters 29 through 46 are deleted. 

20. Appendices A through F are deleted. 

New Rule, R.1985 d.324, effective July 1, 1985. 
See: 17 N.J.R. 861(c), 17 N.J.R. 1646(a). 
Amended by R.1987 d.374, effective September 21, 1987. 
See: 19 N.J.R. 1024(a), 19 N.J.R. 1720(b). 

Model subcode revisions. 
Amended by R.1988 d.388, effective August 1, 1988. 
See: 20 N.J.R. 1130(a), 20 N.J.R. 2073(b). 

Added (c). 
Amended by R.1990 d.253, effective May 21, 1990. 
See: 22 N.J.R. 909(b), 22 N.J.R. 1554(a). 

References to 1989 Supplement added; (b)1ii(5), 2, 4, 8 and 9 
amended; (b)5, 6 and 7 added; (c) deleted; Table R-201.2 added. 
Amended by R.1991 d.571, effective November 18, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R. 2619(a), 23 N.J.R. 3444(b). 

Added new (c). 
Amended by R.1992 d.208, effective May 18, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 680(a), 24 N.J.R. 1879(a). 

Code provisions applicable to flood hazard zones clarified. 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993. 
See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a). 
Amended by R.1998 d.332, effective July 6, 1998. 
See: 30 N.J.R. 1377(a), 30 N.J.R. 2421(b). 

Rewrote the section. 
Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April17, 2000. 
See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a). 

In (c)4, substituted "more pressure than would be exerted by back­
fill" for "lateral pressure from soils" following "subject to" in ii, and 
substituted "drainage" for "designated disposal" preceding "system" 
and added "according to the Unified Soil Classification System, Group 
I Soils" at the end of iii; and inserted ( c )9iv. 

5:23-3.22 Fuel gas subcode 

(a) Rules concerning the subcode adopted are as follows: 

1. Pursuant to authority of P.L. 1975, c.217, the Com­
missioner hereby adopts the model code of the Interna­
tional Code Council, Inc., known as the International 
Fuel Gas Code/2000. This code is hereby adopted by 
reference as the Fuel Gas Subcode for the State of New 
Jersey subject to the modifications stated in (b) below. 

i. Copies of this code may be obtained the sponsor 
at: BOCA International, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, 
Country Club Hills, Illinois 60478-5795. 

ii. The International Fuel Gas Code/2000 may be 
known and cited as the "fuel gas subcode." 

2. Any references to the International Building Code, 
International Plumbing Code, ICC Electrical Code, Inter­
national Fire Code or the International Energy Conserva-
tion Code listed in Chapter 7 shall be considered a u 
reference to the appropriate adopted building, plumbing, · · 
electrical, BOCA National Fire Prevention Code-1996 or 
energy subcode in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3. 

3. Anywhere the term "code" appears, shall be a 
reference to "subcode" as defined in N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4 for 
any of the adopted national model codes as appropriate. 

(b) The following chapters, sections or pages of the Inter­
national Fuel Gas Code/2000 are amended as follows: 

1. Chapter 1 of the fuel gas subcode, entitled "Admin­
istration" is deleted in its entirety; 

2. Chapter 2 of the fuel gas subcode, entitled "Defini­
tions," is amended as follows: 

i. Section 201.3 is amended to delete the words 
"International Building Code, ICC Electrical Code, 
International Fire Code, International Plumbing Code," 
and in lieu thereof substitute "building, electrical, fire 
protection, and plumbing subcodes." 

ii. The definition of the term "alteration" is deleted 
and the definition found in N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4 is substi­
tuted; 

iii. The definition of the term "approved" is delet­
ed; 

iv. The definition of the term "code" is deleted; 

Supp. 6-18-01 23-60 Next Page is 23-60.1 



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

v. The definition of the term "code official" is 
deleted, and the following language is substituted: "For 
the purpose of the fuel gas subcode, the term "code 
official" shall mean the appropriate subcode official as 
designated in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.4." 

vi. The definition of the term "unlisted boiler" is 
deleted. 

3. Chapter 3 of the fuel gas subcode, entitled "Gener­
al Regulations," is amended as follows: 

i. Section 301.1 is amended to delete the words "in 
accordance with Section 101.2." 

ii. Section 301.3 is amended to delete the words "in 
accordance with Section 105" on lines 2 and 4. 

iii. Section 301.9 is deleted. 

iv. Section 305.1. Delete the second paragraph in its 
entirety. 

v. Section 306.2 is amended to delete the dimension 
35 and substitute 36. 

vi. Section 307.1 is amended to delete "approved 
plumbing fixture" on line 3 and insert the following: 
"drywell, sump pump, floor drain, or drainage system 
below floor." 

vii. Section 307.2 is deleted. 

viii. Section 308.3 is amended to delete the words 
"308.3.1 through 308.3.6" and substitute in lieu thereof 
"308.3.1, 308.3.2 and 308.3.4 through 308.3.6." 

ix. · Section 308.3.3 is deleted. 

x. Section 308.4 is amended to delete the words 
"308.4.1 through 308.4.8" on line 3 and substitute in 
lieu thereof "308.4.1 through 308.4.6 and 308.4.8." 

xi. Section 308.4.7 is deleted. 

xii. Section 308.4.8. Delete "or 308.4.7" on line 2. 

4. Chapter 4 of the fuel gas subcode, entitled "Gas 
Piping Installation," is amended as follows: 

i. Section 401.2 is amended to add the following: 
"Delete in its entirety Section 3-2.5 "Installation of 
Containers on Roofs of Buildings" in NFPA-58, 1998 
Edition." Installation of LP-Gas containers on roofs of 
buildings shall be strictly prohibited. 

ii. Section 403.3 is deleted. 

5. Chapter 5 of the fuel gas code, entitled "Chimneys 
and Vents," is amended as follows: 

i. Section 503.5.6 is amended to replace the words 
"cleaned and free of obstructions" with the words 
"inspected in accordance with the chimney certification 
program as provided for in N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.20(c)." 

ii. Section 503.5.6, exception: Delete the exception 
in its entirety. 

6. Chapter 6 of the fuel gas code, entitled "Specific 
Appliances" is amended as follows: 

i. Section 622.2 is deleted. 

ii. Section 622.3 is deleted. 

iii. Section 626.10 is deleted. 

5:23-4.1 

7. Chapter 7 of the fuel gas code, entitled "Refer­
enced Standards," is amended as follows: 

i. Under the heading "Codes," amend the following 
titles: 

(1) Delete "IBC-2000 International Building 
Code." 

(2) Delete "IFC-2000 International Fire Code" 
and substitute the following: "BOCA National Fire 
Prevention Code/1996." 

(3) Delete "IECC-2000 International Energy Con­
servation Code." 

( 4) Delete "IPC-2000 International Plumbing 
Code." 

(5) Delete "IEC-2000 Electrical Code." 

8. Appendices A, B, and C of the fuel gas subcode are 
informative and are not part of the subcode itself. 

New Rule, R.2001 d.l96, effective June 18, 2001. 
See: 33 N.J.R. 6(a), 33 N.J.R. 2090(a). 

SUBCHAPTER 4. ENFORCING AGENCIES; 
DUTIES; POWERS; PROCEDURES 

5:23-4.1 Title; scope; intent 
(a) This subchapter, adopted pursuant to authority of the 

State Uniform Construction Code Act and entitled "Enforc­
ing agencies; duties; powers; procedures", shall be known 
and may be cited through the regulation as N.J.A.C. 
5:23-4," and when referred to in this part of the regulations, 
may be cited as "this subchapter". 

(b) Unless otherwise specifically provided, all references 
to article or section numbers or to provisions not specifically 
identified by number, shall be construed to refer to such 
article, section or provision of this subchapter. 

(c) This subchapter and N.J.A.C. 5:23-4A, 4B, 4C shall 
control matters related to: the structure, organization, and 
procedures of municipal, State, and interlocal enforcing 
agencies; their interrelationships; the structure, organiza­
tion, and procedures of boards of appeal; the approval of 
premanufactured construction; private enforcing agencies; 
and the establishment of fees. 

(d) This subchapter seeks to provide an efficient adminis­
trative structure for enforcing agencies and boards of ap­
peal, through which delay in the construction process can be 
reduced, uniformity of systems and procedures encouraged, 
and the public health and safety protected. Such intent 
shall be given full effect in the construction of any specific 
provision of this subchapter. 

23-60.1 Supp. 6-18-01 



5:23-4.1 

Amended by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990. 
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b). 

Reference to subchapter 4A added to (c). 
Amended by R.1994 d.96, effective February 22, 1994. 
See: 26 N.J.R. 1073(a). 

Law Review and Journal Commentaries 

Municipal employees-Construction Code Officials. Judith Nallin, 
135 N.J.L.J. No. 14, 50 (1993). 

Case Notes 

Citation to former N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.9 on enforcement. Newark 
Health Welfare Dept. v. Rogers, 179 N.J.Super. 389, 432 A.2d 135 
(Ch.Div.1981). 

City must proceed against property through its own ordinances rather 
than seek common law public nuisance injunction where no local board 
of health established and nuisance not proven. Newark Health & 
Welfare Dept. v. Rogers, 179 N.J.Super. 389, 432 A.2d 135 (Ch.Div. 
1981). 

5:23-4.2 Matters covered; exceptions 

(a) Except as otherwise provided in subsection (b) below, 
the provisions of this subchapter shall apply to all agencies 
with an enforcement. responsibility under the act and regula­
tions. 

(b) Rules concerning exceptions are: 

1. Interstate agencies: This subchapter shall not apply 
to agencies created by Interstate Compact. Such agencies 
shall administer and enforce the subcodes, under such 
rules and regulations as they may develop, pursuant to 
authority of the State Uniform Construction Code Act, 
and any other applicable law of this State. 

2. Department of Education: 

i. When final plans for the construction or altera­
tion of a public school facility have been submitted to 
the Department of Education, and approved under the 
standards for educational adequacy set forth at 
N.J.A.C. 6:22, and have been submitted for review to, 
and released by, either the Department of Community 
Affairs or a construction official of an enforcing agency, 
such plans shall be filed with the enforcing agency of 
the municipality in which the public school facility is 
located. 

ii. · The enforcing agency shall inspect any construc­
tion or alteration of a public school facility in the same 
manner as any other building or structure subject to the 
code for the purpose of determining if there are any 
violations of the educational enhancement and adequa­
cy requirements as set forth at N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.11A(c) 
and (d) or any other provision of the State Uniform 
Construction Code. 

(c) Rules concerning matters not specifically provided for 
are: 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

' 

1. Any type or class of enforcing agency or board of 
appeals, the procedures of which are developed in this 
subchapter, may individually adopt further rules for their 
internal governance, not inconsistent with any specific 
provision of this subchapter, or with its stated intent. 

0 

Amended by R.1991 d.309, effective June 17, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R. 1084(a), 23 N.J.R. 1922(a). 

Rule conformed to P.L. 1990 c.23; reference to N.J.A.C. 6:22 added. 
Amended by R.1997 d.417, effective October 6, 1997. 
See: 29 N.J.R. 3387(a), 29 N.J.R. 4285(a). 

In (b)2i, substituted "educational adequacy" for "facility adequacy", 
inserted "either the Department or" preceding "a construction official"; 
and substantially amended (b )2ii. 
Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective Apri117, 2000. 
See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a). 

Rewrote (b )2ii. 

5:23-4.3 Municipal enforcing agencies-establishment 
(a) Notice of intention to establish: 

1. Any municipality seeking to establish and operate 
an enforcing agency, pursuant to the act and the regula-
tions, shall first notify the department of its intent to 
establish such an agency by registered and certified mail, 
return receipt requested, not later than one month prior 
to the effective date of the regulations. Such notice, in 
the form of a resolution of the governing body, shall state 
that enforcement will be carried out either by the munici-
pal enforcing agency or by interlocal agreement. The 
resolution shall also state the extent to which the munici-
pality anticipates that private on-site agencies will be 
utilized. The resolution shall state the address of the 
enforcing agency and the board of appeals, if different. ·0 
Such resolution shall additionally state whether a board of 
appeals will be appointed within the municipality, whether 
an intermunicipal joint board of appeals will be estab-
lished or whether appeals will be left to the jurisdiction of 
the county. 

2. Any municipality which shall not choose to estab­
lish and operate an enforcing agency pursuant to the act 
and the regulations shall notify the department of this 
intent by registered or certified mail, return receipt re­
quested, not later than one month prior to the effective 
date of the regulations. Such notice, in the form of a 
resolution of the governing body, shall state that the 
governing body requests that the department assume the 
task of administration and enforcement. 

3. A municipality may, by resolution, provide for the 
employment of an elevator subcode official, licensed in 
accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-5, to perform inspections 
and witness tests within its jurisdiction. If a municipality 
fails to employ such an official by July 1, 1992, the 
Department shall have exclusive jurisdiction to review 
plans and witness tests for, and inspect elevators within, 
the municipality. Thereafter, a municipality may acquire 
such jurisdiction by enacting the necessary resolution and 
employing an elevator subcode official, but the transfer of 
jurisdiction to the municipality shall not be effective until -\ 
120 calendar days after a certified copy of the resolutien \ __ _) 
is received by the Department. 

Supp. 6-18-01 23-60.2 Next Page is 23-61 



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

5:23-4.7 Interlocal enforcing agencies-organization 

(a) General: Except as is provided in this section, enforc­
''----/ mg agencies organized pursuant to this section shall, insofar 

as is practicable, be organized in the same manner as are 
municipal enforcing agencies. 

(b) Exception: Nothing contained in N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.3, 
with respect to offices, shall require that only one central 
office be established pursuant to this section. Whenever 
municipalities join pursuant to this section, they shall estab­
lish offices which are reasonably accessible in terms of 
distance, location and function. 

5:23-4.8 Interlocal enforcing agencies-administration 
and enforcement 

(a) General: Enforcing agencies organized pursuant to 
this article shall administer and enforce the regulations in 
the same manner as municipal enforcing agencies. 

(b) The provisions of N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.3 regarding conflict 
of interest shall be applicable to interlocal enforcing agen­
cies, including all municipalities party to the interlocal 
agreement, to the extent that the agreement covers specific 
subcode activities. 

5:23-4.9 State enforcing agencies-establishment 

,/ (a) Department of Community Affairs: 

~, 1. The Bureau of Local Code Enforcement in the 
Division of Codes and Standards is constituted as the 
enforcing agency for the purpose of administering and 
enforcing the code in those municipalities which have 
decided, pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.3, not to enforce the 
code. 

2. Pursuant to Reorganization Plan No. 004--1996, the 
Department is constituted as the sole plan review agency 
for the administration and enforcement of Federal and 
State standards applicable to the construction, alternation, 
demolition or maintenance of health care facilities, as 
defined in N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4. 

(b) Division of Building and Construction, Department of 
the Treasury: 

1. The Division of Building and Construction is con­
stituted as the enforcing agency for the purpose of per­
forming plan review with respect to buildings owned by 
the State, and any of its departments, divisions, bureaus, 
boards, councils, authorities or other agencies. 

Administrative Correction to (a)l. 
See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b). 
Amended by R.1997 d.417, effective October 6, 1997. 
See: 29 N.J.R. 3387(a), 29 N.J.R. 4285(a). 

In (a)1, changed enforcing agency and amended N.J.A.C. references; 
~ deleted (a)li and (c); inserted (a)2; and recodified former (d) as (c). 
"'-__./Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April17, 2000. 

See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a). 

5:23-4.11 

In (b)1, substituted "performing plan review" for "administering and 
enforcing the regulation" following "purpose of'; and deleted a former 
(c). 

5:23-4.10 State enforcing agencies-organization 

(a) Department of Community Affairs: The Construction 
Code Element shall be organized, insofar as is practicable, 
in the same manner as are municipal enforcing agencies. 

1. The Element shall employ persons qualified and 
certified in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-5. 

(b) Other State agencies: Code enforcement functions of 
the Division of Building and Construction may be organized 
as such division may deem appropriate, but not in a manner 
inconsistent with the intent of this subchapter. 

1. The Division shall employ persons qualified and 
certified in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-5. 

Administrative Corrections to (a) and (a)l. 
See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b). 
Amended by R.1997 d.417, effective October 6, 1997. 
See: 29 N.J.R. 3387(a), 29 N.J.R. 4285(a). 

Substantially amended (b). 
Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April17, 2000. 
See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a). 

In (b), deleted references to the Department of Labor throughout. 

5:23-4.11 State enforcing agencies-administration and 
enforcement 

(a) Department of Community Affairs: The Division of 
Codes and Standards shall administer and enforce this 
chapter, insofar as is practicable, in the same manner as a 
municipal enforcing agency. 

1. The conflict of interest provisions contained in 
N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.5 shall be applicable only to personnel 
responsible for the administration and enforcement of this 
chapter and shall not extend to persons otherwise em­
ployed by the Division. 

(b) Division of Building and Construction, Department of 
the Treasury: The Division of Building and Construction 
may administer and enforce the rules as the Division may 
deem appropriate, but not inconsistent with the intent of 
this subchapter. 

1. The conflict of interest provisions contained in 
N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.5 shall apply to personnel involved in the 
administration and enforcement of the rules. 

Amended by R.1992 d.243, effective July 6, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 678(a), 24 N.J.R. 2422(a). 

Change made to reflect Department organizational changes. 
Amended by R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997. 
See: 29 N.J.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a). 
Amended by R.1997 d.417, effective October 6, 1997. 
See: 29 N.J.R. 3387(a), 29 N.J.R. 4285(a). 

Deleted (c); and recodified former (d) as (c). 
Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April17, 2000. 
See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a). 

Deleted a former (c). 

23-75 Supp. 4-17-00 



5:23-4.12 

5:23-4.12 Private on-site inspection and plan review 
agencies; establishment 

(a) The Department shall authorize the establishment of 
private on-site inspection and plan review agencies, herein­
after called "on-site inspection agencies," for the purpose of 
contracting with municipalities in order to act in the place of 
a subcode official for specified subcodes. 

1. No person shall undertake the services herein de­
scribed or enter into any contract pursuant to this chapter 
without first receiving the authorization of the Depart­
ment. 

i. Except that, applicants who have received notice 
from the department that their application is complete 
and suitable for processing may begin to promote or 
otherwise make their anticipated availability known to 
municipalities, provided that the applicant discloses in 
writing at the time of undertaking any such activity, that 
he has not yet been authorized by the department. 

(b) Applicants for authorization as an on-site inspection 
agency shall submit an application, the required fee, and any 
additional information the department may require. 

(c) Following a determination by the department that an 
application is complete and suitable for processing, the 
department shall review and evaluate the information con­
tained in the application and such other information as the 
department shall deem necessary to enable it to make an 
accurate and informed determination of approval or disap­
proval. Within 90 days following the receipt of a completed 
application, the department shall make its determination as 
to whether authorization as an on-site inspection agency 
shall be granted or denied, and shall notify the applicant. 
In the event of denial, the department shall provide the 
applicant with a written explanation of the reasons therefor. 

(d) The application shall contain information relating to: 

1. The financial integrity of the applicant and any of 
its principal officers. 

2. The qualifications of the management and technical 
personnel of the applicant, including a statement that all 
technical personnel are certified by the commissioner in 
accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-5. 

3. The range of salaries and other compensation of all 
of the inspectors and other technical personnel of the 
applicant. 

4. The policies and procedures of the applicant for the 
hiring, training and supervision of all technical personnel, 
including education and training. 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

5. The prior experience of the applicant in performing 
similar or related functions. 

6. The capability of the applicant to review plans and~' 
specifications and to inspect construction to insure that 
the completed work is in compliance with the appropriate 
subcode. 

7. A statement that the applicant is not affiliated with, 
influenced or controlled by any producer, manufacturers, 
supplier or vendor of products, supplies or equip;m.ent 
used in construction, components or assemblies. 

(e) Authorization shall be valid for a period of one year. 

(f) Applications for reauthorization shall be filed with the 
Department at least 60 days prior to the scheduled expira­
tion for the current authorization from the Department. 
The on-site inspection agency shall make current the infor­
mation previously submitted to the Department. The on­
site inspection agency shall provide such additional informa­
tion as the Department may request. The application shall 
be accompanied by the fee established by this chapter. The 
Department may conduct such additional investigations of 
the applicant as it may deem necessary. 

1. Within 30 days following receipt by the Department 
of an application for reauthorization, the Department 
shall make its determination as to whether the on-site 
inspection agency continues to meet the requirements of 
this chapt~r. In the e~en~ of dis~pproval, the .Depart~ent \, 
shall provtde the on-s1te mspect10n agency wtth a wntten'._) 
explanation of the reasons for such disapproval. Each 
reauthorization shall expire one year from the date of the 
current authorization from the Department. 

2. The department may, on its own motion or at the 
request of any on-site inspection agency, grant a tempo­
rary reauthorization of such agency for a period not to 

· exceed 60 days. 

(g) Existing private electrical inspection authorities, li­
censed by the Board of Public Utilities pursuant to N.J.A.C. 
14:5-7, may continue to operate as inspection authorities for 
a period of one year from the effective date of this chapter. 
Thereafter, they shall continue in operation only if autho­
rized in accordance with this chapter, and shall become 
known as "on-site inspection agencies-electrical''. 

1. Electrical inspection authorities may continue to 
operate pursuant to N.J.A.C. 14:5-7 until such time as the 
municipality contracts directly with an on-site inspection 
agency-electrical for exclusive services in the municipality 
or appoints an electrical subcode official. In no case shall 
existing electrical inspection authorities continue after 
January 1, 1978, except in conformity with this section. 

Supp. 4-17-00 23-76 Next Page is 23-76.1 



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a). 

Reference to Subchapter 12 added. 
Amended by R.1992 d.272, effective July 6, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 1446(a), 24 N.J.R. 2424(a). 

Stylistic changes. 

Law Review and Journal Commentaries 

Municipal employees-Construction Code Officials. Judith Nallin, 
135 N.J.L.J. No. 14, 50 (1993). 

Case Notes 

Legislature sought to establish uniform statewide construction stan­
dards. Voges v. Borough of Tinton Falls, 268 N.J.Super. 279, 633 A.2d 
566 (A.D.1993), certification denied 135 N.J. 466, 640 A.2d 848. 

Uniform Construction Code Act preempted field of code enforce­
ment. Voges v. Borough of Tinton Falls, 268 N.J.Super. 279, 633 A.2d 
566 (A.D.1993); certification denied 135 N.J. 466, 640 A.2d 848. 

5:23-5.2 Licensing nnit; hearings 

(a) There is hereby established in the Bureau of Code 
Services, Division of Codes and Standards, a Licensing Unit. 
The unit sl;!all enforce this subchapter. 

(b) The unit shall have the following responsibilities in 
addition to all others provided in this subchapter: 

1. To issue such licenses as may be called for herein 
when warranted; 

2. To keep accur.ate records of all applications for a 
license and any official action thereon and to make such 
records available for inspection by the public at all rea­
sonable times; 

3. To suspend or revoke a license provided for herein 
upon the establishment of good cause. 

(c) Any person aggrieved by any notice, action, ruling or 
order of the Commissioner, with respect to this subchapter, 
shall have a right to a hearing before the Office of Adminis­
trative Law. The final decision in any such case shall be 
issued by the Commissioner. 

1. The aggrieved person must request a hearing in 
writing. The request must be filed within 15 days after 
receipt of the notice, order, action or ruling being appeal­
ed. 

2. The request shall be filed with the Hearing Coordi­
nator, Division of Codes and Standards, PO Box 802, 
Trenton, NJ 08625-0802. 

3. The request for hearing shall set forth all issues that 
will be raised at the hearing. 

As amended, R.1980 d.316, eff. July 17, 1980. 
See: 12 N.J.R. 303(b), 12 N.J.R. 452(d). 
As amended, R.1981 d.134, eff. May 7, 1981. 
See: 13 N.J.R. 119(a), 13 N.J.R. 258(c). 

(b)2 concerning licensure advisory board deleted and (b)3 renumber­
ed as (b)2. 
As amended, R.1982 d.436, eff. December 20, 1982. 
See: 14 N.J.R. 734(a), 14 N.J.R. 1449(a). 

5:23-5.3 

Added to (b)1 that cases to be heard by the OAL with final decision 
by the Commissioner. Deleted old text concerning hearings. 
Amended by R.1987 d.509, effective December 7, 1987. 
See: 19 N.J.R. 1264(a), 19 N.J.R. 2270(a). 

Deleted text in (b )2i "Responsibility to request ... ". 
Administrative Corrections to section heading, (a), (a)1, (b)2i. 
See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b). 
Amended by R.1992 d.272, effective July 6, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 1446(a), 24 N.J.R. 2424(a). 

Stylistic changes. 
Amended by R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997. 
See: 29 N.J.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a). 

Substantially amended section. 

5:23-5.3 Types of licenses 

(a) Rules concerning code enforcement licensure catego­
ries are: 

1. Technical licenses: Subject to the requirements of 
this subchapter, persons may apply for and may be li­
censed in the following specialties: 

i. Building inspector: Building inspectors are autho­
rized to carry out field inspection and plan review work 
pursuant to the regulations subject to the limitations 
specified herein. 

(1) Building inspector with a specialty in high-rise 
and hazardous structures (H.H.S.): Building inspec­
tors H.H.S. are authorized to review plans and carry 
out field inspection activities for structures in classes 

. I, II and III. 

(2) Building inspector with a specialty in industrial 
and commercial structures (I.C.S.): Building inspec­
tors I.C.S. are authorized to review plans for struc­
tures in classes II and III, and to carry out field 
inspection activities for structures in classes I, II and 
III. 

(3) Building inspector with a specialty in residen­
tial and small commercial structures (R.C.S.): Build­
ing inspectors R.C.S. are authorized to review plans 
for structures in class III and to carry out field 
inspection activities for structures in classes I, II and 
III. 

ii. Electrical inspector: Electrical inspectors are au­
thorized to carry out field inspection and plan review 
work pursuant to the regulations subject to the limita­
tions specified herein. 

(1) Electrical inspector with a specialty in high-rise 
and hazardous structures (H.H.S.): Electrical inspec­
tors H.H.S. are authorized to review plans and carry 
out field inspection activities for structures in classes 
I, II and III. 

(2) Electrical inspector with a specialty in industri­
al and commercial structures (I.C.S.): Electrical in­
spectors I.C.S. are authorized to review plans for 
structures in classes II and III, and to carry out field 
inspection activities for structures in classes I, II and 
III. 

23-103 Supp. 10-6-97 



5:23-5.3 

m. Fire protection inspector: Fire protection in­
spectors are authorized to carry out field inspection and 
plan review work pursuant to the regulations subject to 
the limitations specified herein. 

(1) Fire protection inspector with a specialty in 
high-rise and hazardous structures (H.H.S.): Fire 
protection inspectors H.H.S. are authorized to review 
plans and carry out field inspection activities for 
structures in classes I, II and III. 

(2) Fire protection inspector with a specialty in 
industrial and commercial structures (I.C.S.): Fire 
protection inspectors I.C.S. are authorized to review 
plans for structures in classes II and III, and to carry 
out field inspection activities for structures in classes 
I, II and III. 

(3) Fire protection inspector with a specialty in 
residential and small commercial structures (R.C.S.): 
Fire protection inspectors R.C.S. are authorized to 
review plans for structures in class III and to carry 
out field inspection activities for structures in classes 
I, II and III. This license will no longer be available 
after July 31, 1991, and all licenses issued on or 
before that date shall cease to be valid after July 31, 
1993. 

iv. Plumbing inspector: Plumbing inspectors are au­
thorized to carry out field inspection and plan review 
work pursuant to the regulations subject to the limita­
tions specified herein. 

(1) Plumbing inspector with a specialty in high-rise 
and hazardous structures (H.H.S.): Plumbing inspec­
tors H.H.S. are authorized to review plans and carry 
out field inspection for structures in classes I, II and 
III. 

(2) Plumbing inspector with a specialty in industri­
al and commercial structures (I.C.S.): Plumbing in­
spectors I.C.S. are authorized to review plans for 
structures in classes II and III, and to carry out field 
inspection activities for structures in classes I, II and 
III. 

v. Inplant inspector: Inplant inspectors are autho­
rized to carry out field inspections and plan review 
work of premanufactured components pursuant to this 
subchapter. 

vi. Elevator inspector with a specialty in high-rise 
and hazardous structures (H.H.S.): Elevator inspectors 
H.H.S. are authorized to review plans and carry out the 
elevator device inspections, or to witness tests required 
by this chapter in all structures. 

vii. Mechanical inspector: Mechanical inspectors 
are authorized to carry out field inspection and plan 
review work for all work under the mechanical subcode 
in Use Group R-3 or R-4 structures. Only a person 
already holding a valid inspector's license may apply for 
a mechanical inspector's license. 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

2. Administrative licenses: In addition to the basic 
required technical licenses specified in N.J.A.C. 
5:23-5.3(b)l, a person may apply for the administrative 
licenses specified herein. 

i. Construction official: A construction official is 
authorized to act as the chief administrator of the 
enforcing agency as required by N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.4. 

ii. Building subcode official: A building subcode 
official is authorized to act as the administrator of the 
building subcode as required by N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.4. 

iii. Electrical subcode official: An electrical sub­
code official is authorized to act as the administrator of 
the electrical subcode as required by N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.4. 

iv. Fire protection subcode official: A fire protec­
tion subcode official is authorized to act as the adminis­
trator of the fire protection subcode as required by 
N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.4. 

v. Plumbing subcode official: A plumbing subcode 
official is authorized to act as the administrator of the 
plumbing subcode as required by N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.4. 

vi. Elevator subcode official: An elevator subcode 
official is authorized to act as the administrator of the 
elevator safety subcode, as required by N.J.A.C. 
5:23-4.4. 

Amended by R.1977 d.435, effective December 15, 1977. 
See: 9 N.J.R. 456(c), 9 N.J.R. 558(b). 
Amended by R.1981 d.462, effective December 7, 1981. 
See: 13 N.J.R. 390(a), 13 N.J.R. 885(d). 

(b): Renumbering; (b)4 and 4i added. 
Amended by R.1991 d.308, effective June 17, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R. 1085(a), 23 N.J.R. 1923(a). 

RCS license to be phased out, effective July 31, 1993. 
Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a). 

Elevator inspector classification and authority added at (b). 
Amended by R.1992 d.272, effective July 6, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 1446(a), 24 N.J.R. 2424(a). 

Text deleted at (a); (b) recodified. 
Amended by R.l993 d.187, effective May 3, 1993. 
See: 25 N.J.R. 624(a), 25 N.J.R. 1875(a). 

Added (b) 1 vii. 

5:23-5.4 Licenses required 

(a) No person shall be appointed to, or shall hold, the 
position of construction official or subcode official unless 
that person has received a license required for that position 
pursuant to these regulations. 

(b) No person shall be appointed to, or shall hold, a 
technical inspector position in an enforcing agency for which 
a license requirement has been established by this chapter 
unless that person has received the license required by these 
rules for that position. 

Supp. 10-6-97 23-104 



·~·../ 

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

2. It shall be a violation of these rules for any person to 
hold or perform the duties of an office for which a license 
is required herein, or for any person to represent himself 
or herself as qualified for such position, or to use any title 
or otherwise represent himself or herself as licensed or 
authorized to act under the code if the person does not 
possess that license. In addition .to any other remedy 
available under law, such action shall be deemed a viola­
tion of this section and subject to a penalty of not more 
than $500.00 for each offense. 

3. It shall be a violation of these rules in the case of 
construction and subcode officials and technical inspec­
tors for any enforcing agency, including private on-site 
inspection and plan review agencies, to offer employment 
to or to retain for employment any person who is not 
licensed in accordance with these mles if such person has 
not been previously and continuously employed by such 
agency. Further, it shall be a violation of these rules for 
an enforcing agency to continue an individual in employ­
ment in a position for which a license is required pursuant 
to these rules, or to hire an individual for such a position, 
if such person is not licensed in accordance with this 
subchapter. Violation of this section shall be deemed a 
failure to perform within the meaning of N.J.A.C. 
5:23-4.3(f), and the Department may exercise the reme­
dies provided therein. 

4. It shall be a violation of the State Uniform Con­
struction Code Act for any agency of the State of New 
Jersey, which is charged with enforcing agency responsi­
bilities pursuant to the act or these rules, to fail to comply 
with paragraphs 1, 2 and 3 of this subsection. 

Amended by R.1984 d.494, effective November 5, 1984. 
See: 16 N.J.R. 1643(a), 16 N.J.R. 3007(a). 

(d) substantially amended. . 
Amended by R.1985 d.85, effective March 4, 1985. 
See: 16 N.J.R. 3372(a), 17 N.J.R. 579(a). 

(d) amended. 
Amended byR.1985 d.231, effective May 20, 1985. 
See: 17 N.J.R. 341(a), 17 N.J.R. 1258(a). 

(d)li added. 
Amended by R.1985 d.353, effective July 15, 1985. 
See: 17 N.J.R. 1032(a), 17 N.J.R. 1758(b). 

Subsection (d) substantially amended. 
Amended by R.1985 d.612, effective January 6, 1986. 
See: 17 N.J.R. 1821(a), 18 N.J.R. 80(a). 

(d)3 substantially amended. . 
Amended by R.1987 d.509, effective December 7, 1987. 
See: 19 N.J.R. 1264(a), 19 N..J.R. 2270(a). 

Substantially amended. 
Administrative Corrections to (c), (d)2 and (d)2ii. 
See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b). 
Amended by R.1992 d.272, effective July 6, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 1446(a), 24 N.J.R. 2424(a). 

Trainee registration required; processing fee raised to $20.00; "di­
rectly" broadened to "significant". 
Amended by R.1992 d.292, effective July 20, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 1669(b), 24 N.J.R. 2557(a). 

Provision to license interns added. 
Amended by R.1993 d.105, effective March 1; 1993. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 4309(a), 2'5 N.J.R. 920(b). 

Added subsection (g). 
Amended by R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997. 
See: 29 N.J.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a). 

5:23-5.5 

Amended internal citations throughout; in (a) and (b), deleted 
October 1, 1978 trigger date; in (f)3, inserted ", or to hire an individual 
for such a position,"; and deleted (g), relating to interim rules. 

5:23-5.5 General license requirements 

(a) A candidate for a license of any type issued pursuant 
to this subchapter shall submit an application to the Licens­
ing Unit, Bureau of Code Services, accompanied by the 
required nonrefundable application fee established in 
N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.22. The application shall include such in­
formation and documentation as the Commissioner may 
require pursuant to this subchapter. 

(b) After receipt of the required nonrefundable fee, the 
Department shall determine, by examination of the applica­
tion and review of supporting documents, including sub­
stantial evidence of acceptable experience, successful test 
results, training and/or education submitted, whether an ap­
plicant is qualified for a license of the type and specialty 
for which the application has been made. If the applica­
tion is satisfactory, the Commissioner shall issue a license 
to the applicant. This license will show that the person has 
met the established requirements and is eligible to be 
employed in this State in accordance with the provisions of 
this chapter. 

1. The Commissioner may deny or refuse to issue a 
license to an applicant if the application is incomplete or 
upon proof that there has been any act or omission which 
would constitute grounds for revocation under this sub­
chapter. 

2. Upon receipt of an incomplete application, the 
non-refundable application fee shall be collected and a 
letter of acknowledgment forwarded to the applicant set­
ting forth the manner in which the application is incom­
plete. 

3. The applicant shall submit a complete application 
within 18 months of receipt of the letter of acknowledg­
ment. If a complete application is not submitted within 
the 18 month period, the application shall be deemed 
abandoned, no further action shall be taken on it by the 
Department and a new application and non-refundable 
fee shall be required if the applicant desires to reapply. 

4. Only test results for test modules passed within three 
years prior to, or at the time of, application shall be 
accepted toward fulfilling the requirement for the license 
sought. 

5. Only those approved courses completed within a 
five-year period immediately preceding the time of appli­
cation for a license shall be considered acceptable toward 
fulfilling the requirements for the technical or administra­
tive license sought. 

i. Persons who have completed an approved course 
shall be eligible for tuition reimbursement when funds 
for such reimbursement are available; provided, howev­
er, that persons who repeat a course for any reason, 

23-107 Supp. 10-20-97 



5:23-5.5 

and have previously received tuition reimbursement for 
the course, shall not again be eligible for reimburse­
ment for that course. 

6. No credit shall be given by the Department for any 
experience not involving the construction or alteration of 
buildings, or its equivalent, as determined by the Depart­
ment. 

7. No credit shall be given by the Department for any 
journeyman experience unless documentation of the com­
pletion of a formal or informal apprenticeship program, 
or its equivalent, as determined by the Department, is 
provided. In general, the Department makes reference to 
the U.S. Department of Labor's National Apprenticeship 
Program for assigning the length of· time required to 
complete an apprenticeship program in a given trade. 

8. Credit for part-time work experience shall be given 
by the Department on a proportional basis. The Depart­
ment has established a 35-hour work-week as the stan­
dard full time equivalent. No additional credit will be 
given for hours in excess of 35 per week, regardless of any 
amount of overtime which an applicant claims to have 
worked. 

(c) A person licensed by the Department on the basis of 
having had a license, tenure or permanent civil service status 
prior to January 1, 1978 who subsequently loses his or her 
license as a result of revocation or of failure to renew within 
three years of lapsing must reapply for licensure under the 
requirements in effect at the time of reapplication. 

(d) Special provisions: 

1. An applicant who is licensed as a building inspec­
tor, electrical inspector, fire protection inspector or 
plumbing inspector shall be eligible for licensure as an 
inspector at the same level or lower in any other subcode, 
other than the elevator safety subcode, upon satisfactory 
completion of the approved educational program, if appli­
cable, and the examination for licensure as an inspector in 
that other subcode, provided that· the applicant has at 
least the number of years experience required for that 
other subcode inspector's license. 

2. An applicant licensed as an inspector may apply for 
a mechanical inspector's license to perform mechanical 
inspections of Use Group R-3 or R-4 structures. 

Amended by R.1981 d.462, effective December 7, 1981. 
See: 13 N.J.R. 390(a), 13 N.J.R. 885(d). 

(b)9 through 9ii added. 
Amended by R.1981 d.463, effective December 7, 1981. 
See: 13 N.J.R. 635(a), 13 N.J.R. 886(c). 

(c) added "no credit shall be given ... builc,ling". 
Amended by R.1982 d.8, effective February 1, 1982. 
See: 13 N.J.R. 799(b), 14 N.J.R. 143(a). 

(b)liii and v: "such" added after "provided that"; "24" was "12"; 
and deleted "and further provided that's"; (b)5iii(3) deleted. 
Amended by R.1982 d.19, effective February 1, 1982. 
See: 13 N.J.R. 801(a), 14 N.J.R. 143(b). 

(b) Substantially amended. 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

(c) "and" added between "application" and "review"; "alternative" 
deleted before "experience"; "pursuant to . . . N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.9" 
deleted. 
Amended by R.l982 d.56, effective March 1, 1982. 
See: 14 N.J.R. 8(a), 14 N.J.R. 237(a). 

(b)1i: added "provided ... 52:27D-126(b);". 
Amended by R.1983 d.641, effective January 17, 1984. 
See: 15 N.J.R. 1911(a), 16 N.J.R. 129(b). 

Substantially amended. 
Amended by R.1984 d.425, effective October 1, 1984. 
See: 16 N.J.R. 1644(a), 16 N.J.R. 2520(b). 

Section substantially amended. 
Amended by R.1985 d. 612, effective January 6, 1986. 
See: 17 N.J.R. 1821(a), 18 N.J.R. 80(a). 

Substantially amended. 
Amended by R.l986 d.255, effective July7, 1986. 
See: 18 N.J.R. 594(a), 18 N.J.R. 1373(a). 

Deleted "satisfies the experience requirements for licensure" and 
substituted "is licensed" in ( d)5. 
Amended by R.1987 d.509, effective December 7, 1987. 
See: 19 N.J.R. 1264(a), 19 N.J.R. 2270(a). 

Substantially amended. 
Administrative Correction to (a). 
See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b). 
Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a). 

Test result and licensure requirements specified further at (b )4 and 
(c)3. 
Amended by R.1992 d.272, effective July 6, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 1446(a), 24 N.J.R. 2424(a). 

Work week set at 35 hours; (d)l-4 deleted. 
Amended by R.1993 d.105, effective March 1, 1993. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 4309(a), 25 N.J.R. 920(b). 

Persons serving as elevator inspectors when licensing rules proposed 
have an opportunity to qualify for licenses. 
Amended by R.1993 d.187, effective May 3, 1993. 
See: 25 N.J.R. 624(a), 25 N.J.R. 1875(a). 

Added (d)2. 
Administrative Correction. 
See: 26 N.J.R. 1495(a). 
Amended by R.l996 d.53, effective February 5, 1996. 
See: 27 N.J.R. 4056(a), 28 N.J.R. 815(b). 
Amended by R.1996 d.544, effective December 2, 1996 (operative 

February 1, 1997). 
See: 28 N.J.R. 3996(a), 28 N.J.R. 5071(a). 
Amended by R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997. 
See: 29 N.J.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a). 

In (b )4, deleted exception for tests taken prior to July 1, 1991; and 
substantially amended (c). 

5:23-5.6 Construction official requirements 
(a) A candidate for a license as a construction official 

shall meet the following qualifications: 

1. Possession of the qualifications established herein 
for at least one of the five subcode official licenses; 
provided, however, that any person qualified as a fire 
protection subcode official must also have experience for 
the applicable period of time specified by N.J.S.A. 
52:27D-126b; and 

2. Successful completion of an approved construction 
official educational program as required by N.J.A.C. 
5:23-5.20 prior to application. 

3. A provisional license shall be issued to any person 
provided that such person is licensed or is simultaneously 
licensed as a subcode official. Such person shall have 
successfully completed the educational program required 
herein within 24 months of issuance of the provisional 
license. 

Supp. 10-20-97 23-108 



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

Amended by R.1985 d.612, effective January 6, 1986. 
See: 17 N.J.R. 1821(a), 18 N.J.R. 80(a). 

. Was 5:23-5.5(b}l. 
\~: Amended by R.1987 d.509, effective December 7,1987. 

See: 19 N.J.R. 1264(a}, 19 N.J.R. 2270(a). 

'·~ 

Deleted text in (a)1 "in the specialty ... license is sought". 
Administrative Correction to (a)2. 
See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b). 
Amended by R.1992 d.272, effective July 6, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 1446(a), 24 N.J.R. 2424(a). 

Simultaneous license accepted. 

Case Notes. 

Citation tp former N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.25 for construction official's quali­
fications; township manager without authority over matters of code 
enforcement and official discipline due to State legislative preemption. 
J.P, Properties, Inc. v. Macy, 183 N.J.Super. 572, 444 A.2d 1131 (Law 
Div.1982). 

Forgery conviction warrants revocation of construction code official's 
professional licenses. Rapp v. Department of Community Affairs, 96 
N.J.A.R.2d (CAF) 51. 

Fraud and deceit while practicing as a licensed code enforcement 
official or inspector warranted license revocation. Regulatory Affairs v. 
Zieniuk, 9.5 N.J.A.R.2d (CAF) 15. 

5:23-5.7 Subcode official requirements 

(a) A candidate for a license as a building, electrical, fire 
protection, plumbing or elevator subcode official shall meet 
the following qualifications: 

1. Possession of the qualifications established herein 
for a technical inspector license in at least the same 
specialty as the subcode official license being applied for; 
and 

1. Successful completion of an approved subcode offi­
cial educational program as established in N.J.A.C. 
5:13-5.10 prior to, or at the time of, application; and 

3. Completion of such additional experience in the 
subcode of qualification as may be required, beyond that 
needed for licensure as a technical inspector, to provide at 
least the following total experience: 

i. Ten years in construction, design or supervision 
as a journeyman in a skilled construction trade current­
ly regulated by the Uniform Construction Code; or 10 
years as a technical inspector; or 10 years as a con­
struction contractor in a field of construction currently 
regulated by the construction code; or 

ii. Five years of experience in construction, design 
or supervision in building construction work, provided 
that such persons possess, prior to this experience, at 
least a bachelor's degree from an accredited institution 
of higher education in architecture or engineering, or in 
architectural or engineering technology, or in any other 
major area of study significantly related to building 
construction; or 

iii. Three years of experience in construction, design 
or supervision as a licensed engineer or registered 
architect, provided that such person possess a license as 

5:23-5.7 

an engineer or architect issued by the State of New 
Jersey at the time of application. 

4. Exceptions to experience requirements follow: 

i. A candidate for a license as a fire protection 
subcode official shall possess at least the following 
experience: 

(1) Three years of experience as a fire prevention 
officiaf; or 

(2) Three years of experience as a fire protection 
official; or 

(3) Three years of experience as a firefighter. 

ii. A candidate for a license as a building, plumbing 
or electrical subcode official who obtained the technical 
license in that subcode area under the provisions of 
N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.5(d)1 shall possess the following experi­
ence: 

(1) Three years of experience as an inspector in 
that specific subcode area; or 

(2) Three years of experience in a skilled trade 
directly related to that specific subcode area; or 

(3) Two years of experience in that specific sub­
code area as an inspector or in· construction, design 
or supervision with at least a bachelor's degree from 
an accredited institution of higher education in archi­
tecture or engineering or in architecture or engineer­
ing technology or in a major area of study directly 
related to building construction; or 

( 4) One year of experience in that specific subcode 
area as an inspector or in construction, design or 
supervision as a licensed engineer or registered archi­
tect, provided that such person possesses a license as 
an engineer or architect issued by the State of New 
Jersey at the time of application. 

5. A provisional license shall be issued to any person 
who possesses the required experience listed above pro­
vided that such person is licensed or is simultaneously 
licensed as a technical inspector in the same subcode 
area. Such person shall have successfully completed the 
c;:ducational program required herein within 24 months of 
issuance of the provisional license. 

6. A person who is already licensed as a fire protec­
tion subcode official must have the total years of experi­
ence as described in (a )3 above to satisfy the experience 
requirement for any other subcode official license. 

Amended by R.1985 d.612, effective January 6, 1986. 
See: 17 N.J.R. 1821 (a), 18 N.J.R. 80(a). 

Was 5.5(b)2. 
Amended by R.1986 d.255, effective July 7, 1986. 
See: 18 N.J.R. 594(a), 18 N.J.R. 1373(a). 

Added text to (a)6 "other than fire protection subcode official 
license". 
Correction: Added "experience" to text in (a)6. 
See: 18 N.J.R. 1963(b). 

23-109 Supp. 10-20-97 



5:23-5.7 

Amended by R.1987 d.509, effective December 7, 1987. 
See: 19 N.J.R. 1264(a), 19 N.J.R. 2270(a). 

Substantially amended. 
Administrative Correction to (a)2. 
See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b). 
Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a). 

Elevator subcode official added. 
Amended by R.1992 d.272, effective July 6, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 1446(a), 24 N.J.R. 2424(a). 

Experience to be prior to application; simultaneous licensing accept­
ed. 
Amended by R.1992 d.393, effective October 5, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 2661(a), 24 N.J.R. 3525(a). 

Experience requirements for reciprocal subcode license added to 
(a)4; (a)6 deleted. 
Amended by R.1996 d.544, effective December 2, 1996 (operative 

February 1, 1997). 
See: 28 N.J.R. 3996(a), 28 N.J.R. 507l(a). 

Case Notes 
Position of electrical subcode official not a professional service; 

contract to approved inspection agency requires competitive bidding 
(citing former N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.5) Twp. of Burlington v. Middle Depart­
ment Inspection Agency, Inc., 175 N.J.Super. 624, 421 A.2d 616 (Law 
Div.1980). 

5:23-5.8 Building inspector H.H.S. requirements 

(a) A candidate for a license as a building inspector 
H.H.S. shall meet one of the following educational and/or 
experience requirements: 

1. Seven years of experience consisting of one of the 
following, or a combination thereof: 

i. Experience in construction, design or supervision 
as a journeyman in a skilled trade currently regulated 
by the building subcode; or 

ii. Experience as a building or housing inspector; or 

iii. Experience as a construction contractor in a 
field of construction currently regulated by the building 
subcode; or 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

2. Graduation from an accredited institution of higher 
education with a bachelor's degree in architecture or 
engineering, or in architectural or engineering technology, 
or in any other major area of study significantly related to 
building construction, and two years of subsequent experi­
ence in construction, design, inspection or supervision in a 
field of construction currently regulated by the building 
subcode; or 

3. Possession of an associate's degree in code enforce­
ment from an accredited institution of higher education, 
and three years of subsequent experience in the construc­
tion, design, inspection or supervision of construction 
work regulated by the building subcode; or 

4. Possession of a current New Jersey registration/li­
cense as an architect or engineer. 

(b) A candidate for a license as a building inspector 
H.H.S. shall also meet the following requirements: 

1. Successful completion of an approved educational 
program meeting the requirements established in N.J.A.C. 
5:23-5.20 for building inspector H.H.S.; provided, howev­
er, that persons having a bachelor's degree in architecture 
or engineering, or in architectural or engineering technol­
ogy, or in any other major area of study significantly 
related to building construction, or who possess a current 
New Jersey registration/license as an architect or engineer 
shall be exempted from the educational program require­
ments for building inspector H.H.S. 

2. Successful completion of an examination as re­
quired by N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.23. 

3. Possession of, or eligibility for, the building inspec­
tor I.C.S. license. 

Amended by R.1985 d.612, effective January 6, 1986. 

Supp. 10-20-97 23-110 

~-



\ ~/ 

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

Case Notes 

Regulations valid and applicable to plumbing inspectors. New Jersey 
State Plumbing Inspectors Assn., Inc. v. Sheehan, 163 N.J.Super. 398; 
394 A.2d 1244 (App.Div.1978) certification denied 79 N.J. 484, 401 
A.2d 239 (1979). 

5:23-5.17 Plumbing inspector I.C.S. requirements 

(a) A candidate for a license as a plumbing inspector 
I.C.S. shall meet one of the following educational and/or 
experience requirements: 

1. Five years of experience consisting of one of the 
following, or a combination thereof: 

i. Experience in construction, design or supervision 
as a journeyman in a skilled trade currently regulated 
by the plumbing subcode; or 

ii. Experience as a plumbing inspector; or 

iii. Experience as a construction contractor in a 
field of construction currently regulated by the plumb­
ing subcode; or 

2. Graduation from an accredited institution of higher 
education with a bachelor's degree in architecture or 
engineering, or in architectural or engineering technology, 
or in any other major area of study significantly related to 
building construction, and one year of subsequent experi­
ence in construction, design, inspection or supervision in a 
field of construction currently regulated by the plumbing 
subcode; or 

3. Possession of an associate's degree in code enforce­
ment from an accredited institution of higher education, 
and two years of subsequent experience in the construc­
tion, design, inspection or supervision of construction 
work regulated by the plumbing subcode; or 

4. Possession of a current New Jersey registration/li­
cense as an architect or engineer. 

(b) A candidate for a license as a plumbing inspector 
I.C.S. shall also meet the following requirements: 

1. Successful completion of an approved educational 
program meeting the requirements established in N.J.A.C. 
5:23-5.20 for plumbing inspector I.C.S.; provided, howev­
er, that persons having a bachelor's degree in architecture 
or engineering, or in architectural or engineering technol­
ogy, or in any other major area of study significantly 
related to building construction, or who possess a current 
New Jersey registration/license as an architect or engi­
neer, shall be exempted from the educational program 
requirements for plumbing inspector I.C.S. 

2. Successful completion of an examination as re­
quired by N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.23. 

Amended by R.1985 d.612, effective January 6, 1986. 
See: 17 N.J.R. 1821(a), 18 N.J.R. 80(a). 

Was 5:23-5.5(b)6ii. 
Amended by R.1987 d.509, effective December 6, 1987. 
See: 19 N.J.R. 1264(a), 19 N.J.R. 2270(a). 

Substantially amended. 
Amended by R.1992 d.272, effective July 6, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 1446(a), 24 N.J.R. 2424(a). 

5:23-5.19 

Experience subsequent to study; architects and engineers added; 
"significantly" replaced "directly". 

5:23-5.18 lnplant inspector requirements 

(a) A candidate for a license as an inplant inspector shall 
meet one of the following educational and/or experience 
requirements: 

1. Five years of experience consisting of one of the 
following, or a combination thereof: 

i. Experience in construction, design or supervision 
as a journeyman in a skilled trade currently regulated 
by the building, electrical, fire protection or plumbing 
subcode, or a combination thereof; or 

ii. Experience as a building, electrical, fire protec­
tion or plumbing inspector, or a combination thereof; 
or 

iii. Experience as a construction contractor current­
ly regulated by any of the four above enumerated 
subcodes, or a combination thereof;· or 

2. Graduation from an accredited institution of higher 
education with a bachelor's degree in fire science or fire 
science technology, or in architecture or engineering, or in 
architectural or engineering technology, or in any other 
major area of study significantly related to building con­
struction or fire science, and three years of subsequent 
experience in any one or more of the fields regulated by 
the above enumerated subcodes; or 

3. Possession of a current New Jersey registration/li­
cense as an architect or engineer. 

(b) A candidate for a license as an inplant inspector shall 
have successfully completed examinations as required by 
N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.23. 

Amended by R.1985 d.612. effective January 6, 1986. 
See: 17 N.J.R. 1821(a), 18 N.J.R. 80(a). 

Was 5:23-5.5(b)7. 
Correction: (a)2 was inadvertently omitted from Section. 
See: 18 N.J.R. 1963(c). 
Amended by R.1987 d.509, effective December 7, 1987. 
See: 19 N.J.R. 1264(a), 19 N.J.R. 2270(a). 

Substantially amended. 
Amended by R.1992 d.272, effective July 6, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 1446(a), 24 N.J.R. 2424(a). 

Fire science added. 

5:23-5.19 Elevator inspector H.H.S. requirements 

(a) A candidate for a license as an elevator inspector of 
high-rise and hazardous structures (H.H.S.) shall meet the 
following educational and/or experience requirements: 

1. Seven years of experience consisting of one of the 
following, or combination thereof: 

23-115 Supp. 10-6-97 



5:23-5.19 

i. Experience in construction, design or. supervision 
as a journeyman in a skilled trade currently regulated 
by the elevator subcode; 

ii. Experience as an elevator inspector; or 

iii. Experience as a construction contractor in a 
field of construction currently regulated by the elevator 
subcode; or 

2. Graduation from an accredited institution of higher 
education with a bachelor's degree in architecture or 
engineering, or in architectural or engineering technology, 
or in any other major area of study signifl.cantly related to 
building construction, and two years of subsequent experi­
ence in construction, design, inspection or supervision in a 
field of construction regulated by the elevator subcode; 
or 

3. Possession of an associate's degree in code enforce­
ment from an accredited institution of higher education 
and three years of subsequent experience in the construc­
tion, design, inspection, or supervision of construction 
work currently regulated by the elevator subcode; or 

4. Possession of a current New Jersey registration/li­
cense as an architect or engineer. 

(b) A candidate for licensure as an elevator inspector 
H.H.S. shall also meet the following requirements: 

1. Successful completion of an approved educational 
program meeting the requirements established in N.J.A.C. 
5:23-5.20 for elevator inspector H.H.S.; provided, howev­
er, that persons having a bachelor's degree in architecture 
or engineering, or in architectural or engineering technol­
ogy, or in any other major area of study significantly 
related to building construction, or who possess a current 
New Jersey registration/license as an architect or engi­
neer, shall be exempted from the educational program 
requirements for elevator inspector H.H.S. Additionally, 
any individual who has successfully completed an edu­
cational program determined by the Department as equiv­
alent to that established in N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.20 shall also 
be exempted from the educational program requirements 
for elevator inspector H.H.S., provided application. for 
licensure is received by the Department on or before June 
30, 1992. 

2. Successful completion of an examination as re­
quired by N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.23. 

(c) No person shall work either as an elevator inspector 
or as a subcode official who does not hold an Elevator 
Inspector HHS License or an Elevator Inspector Interim 
License. 

1. For an Elevator Inspector Interim License, an ap­
plicant shall document that he or she was employed as an 
elevator inspector on June 30, 1992, provide documenta­
tion of any additional relevant experience, and satisfy the 
educational and examination requirements set forth in 
(b)l and 2 above. This license shall be renewable, subject 
to the requirements of N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.21. 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

i. An Elevator Inspector Interim License with Sub­
code Official endorsement shall be issued to any appli­
cant for such endorsement who has satisfied the re­
quirements for the Elevator Inspector Interim License; 
provided that, if the applicant has not successfully 
completed an approved subcode official educational 
program, as set forth in N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.20, the en­
dorsement shall be issued on a provisional basis, pursu­
ant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.7(a)5, and shall be valid for a 
period of 24 months only. 

Amended by R.1985 d.612, effective January 6, 1986. 
See: 17 N.J.R. 1821(a), 18 N.J.R. 80(a). 

Was 5:23-5.5(b)8. 
Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a). 

Elevator inspector requirements specified. 
Amended by R.1992 d.272, effective July 6, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 1446(a), 24 N.J.R. 2424(a). 

"Significantly" replaced "directly". 
Amended by R.l992 d.394, effective October 5, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 2662(a), 24 N.J.R. 3525(b). 

Experience must be in title of elevator inspector. 
Amended by R.1994 d.435, effective September 6, 1994 (operative 

January 1, 1995). 
See: 26 N.J.R. 1912(a), 26 N.J.R. 3706(c). 
Amended by R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997. 
See: 29 N.J.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a). 

In (c), deleted January 1, 1995 trigger date, deleted N.J.A.C refer­
ence, and deleted reference to Elevator Inspector Certification; deleted 
(c)l; and recodified (c)2 as (c)l. 

5:23-5.19A Mechanical inspector requirements 

(a) A person validly licensed as an inspector in any 
subcode may apply for a mechanical inspector's license 
qualifying such person to perform mechanical inspections of 
Use Group R-3 or R-4 structures, if that person successful­
ly completes the examinations required by N.J.A.C. 
5:23-5.23. 

(b) Notwithstanding the three-year time limit set forth in 
N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.5(b )4, results from any of the examinations 
already successfully completed and currently used for licen­
sure may be submitted at the time of application and, in 
such case, examinations need not be re-taken. 

New Rule, R.1993 d.l87, effective May 3, 1993. 
See: 25 N.J.R. 624(a), 25 N.J.R. 1875(a). 

5:23-5.20 Standards for educational programs 

(a) To carry out their responsibilities, code enforcement 
officials must be fully knowledgeable about code standards 
and adequately prepared to administer and enforce them 
properly. Code enforcement officials have the necessary 
technical and administrative training to effectively enforce 
the Uniform Construction Code at the local level. This 
article adopts explicit guidelines and standards for code 
enforcement official educational programs. Procedures 
governing the approval of such educational programs set 
forth in N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.24. 

Supp. 10-6-97 23-116 

\....._) 



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

2. A non-refundable application fee of $35.00 shall be 
charged for each administrative license applied for sepa­
rately from a technical license. 

\._./ 3. Persons rejected for one or more licenses, and who 

·\... ___ -/ 

subsequently reapply, are subject to the fee schedule as 
defined in (a)li, ii and iii above. 

Next Page is 23-127 23-126.1 

5:23-5.22 

4. Renewal fee: The three year renewal application 
fee shall be $65.00. 

Supp. 5-18-98 



/' 
! 

~-

I 

\ ·-

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

S. Persons who have become ineligible to retain their 
administrative license by reason of failure to remove the 
provisional status of such license within the prescribed 
two-year period must submit a non-refundable application 
fee of $3S.OO in order to reapply for said administrative 
license without recourse to any further provisional status 
privilege. 

6. Registration and examination fees for the certifica­
tion of construction code officials: The fee schedule shall 
be as submitted by the administrative agency of the 
examination program to the Department. 

Amended by R.1983 d.548, effective December 5, 1983. 
See: 15 N.J.R. 1406(a), 15 N.J.R. 2033(b). 

In (a)1, added i-iii. In (a) 2 and 3, deleted old and added new text. 
In ·(a)4, increased fee from $20.00 to $30.00. Also added 5 and 6. 
Amended by R.1985 d.612, effective January 6, 1986. 
See: 17 N.J.R. 1821(a), 18 N.J.R. 80(a). 

Was 5:23-5.12. 
Amended by R.1987 d.509, effective December 7, 1987. 
See: 19 N.J.R. 1264(a), 19 N.J.R. 2270(a). 

Recodified from 5.23. 
Administrative Correction to (a)3. 
See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b). 
Amended by R.1991 d.181, effective April1, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R. 257(b), 23 N.J.R. 1029(a). 

In (a)1, fee increased from $30.00 to $40.00. 
In (a)2, fee increased from $10.00 to $20.00. 
In (a)4, fee increased from $30.00 to $40.00. 
In (a)5, fee increased from $10.00 to $20.00. 

Amended by R.1992 d.272, effective July 6, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 1446(a), 24 N.J.R. 2424(a). 

Fee non-refundable; fee as charged to Department by administering 
agency. 
Amended by R.1993 d.187, effective May 3, 1993. 
See: 25 N.J.R. 624(a), 25 N.J.R. 1875(a). 

Mechanical inspector added to (a)li. 
Amended by R.1996 d.53, effective February 5, 1996. 
See: 27 N.J.R. 4056(a), 28 N.J.R. 815(b). 

5:23-5.23 Examination requirements 

(a) Examinations shall be held, at least twice annually, to 
establish eligibility for the following license specialties: 
building inspector R.C.S., building inspector I.C.S., building 
inspector H.H.S., electrical inspector I.C.S., electrical in­
spector H.H.S., fire protection inspector I.C.S., fire protec­
tion inspector H.H.S., plumbing inspector I.C.S., plumbing 
inspector H.H.S., elevator inspector H.H.S., and inplant 
inspector. 

1. In instances where more than one license level 
within a given subcode area requires the successful com­
pletion of one or more examination modules, award of 
the higher level license specialty will be dependent upon 
successful completion of the educational program in ac­
cordance with N.J.A.C. S:23-S.20 and the examination 
module(s) required for the lower level license, or posses­
sion of the applicable lower level license. 

2. Applicants for licenses listed above shall demon­
strate competence by successful completion of the rele­
vant examination modules of the National Certification 
Program for Construction Code Inspector administered 
by the Educational Testing Service for the Department. 

23-127 

5:23-5.23 

(b) Requirements for specific licenses are as follows: 

1. Examination requirement for the building inspector 
R.C.S.: 

i. Successful completion of examination module 
!A-Building One and Two Family Dwelling. 

2. Examination requirements for building inspector 
I.C.S.: 

i. Successful completion of examination modules 
lB-Building General and 4A-Mechanical One and 
Two Family Dwelling. 

3. Examination requirements for building inspector 
H.H.S.: 

i. Successful completion of examination module 
lC-Building Plan Review. 

4. Examination requirements for electrical inspector 
I.C.S.: 

i. Successful completion of examination modules 
2A-Electrical One and Two Family Dwelling and 
2B-Electrical General. 

S. Examination requirements for electrical inspector 
H.H.S.: 

i. Successful completion of examination module 
2C-Electrical Plan Review. 

6. Examination requirements for fire protection in­
spector I.C.S.: 

i. Successful completion of examination modules 
3B-Fire Protection General and 4A-Mechanical One 
and Two Family. 

7. Examination requirements for fire protection in­
spector H.H.S.: 

i. Successful completion of examination module 
3C-Fire Protection Plan Review. 

8. Examination requirements for plumbing inspector 
I.C.S.: 

i. Successful completion of examination modules 
SA-Plumbing One and Two Family Dwelling and 
SB-Plumbing General. 

9. Examination requirements for plumbing inspector 
H.H.S.: 

i. Successful completion of examination module 
SC-Plumbing Plan Review. 

10. Examination requirements for inplant inspector: 

i. Successful completion of examination modules 
!A-Building One and Two Family Dwelling, 2A­
Electrical One and Two Family Dwelling, 4A-Me­
chanical One and Two Family Dwelling and SA­
Plumbing One and Two Family Dwelling. 

Supp. 2-20-96 



5:23-5.23 

11. Examination requirements for elevator inspector: 

i. Successful completion of examination module 
6B-Elevator General. 

12. Examinati~n requirements for mechanical licen­
sure are: 

i. Successful completion of the National Certifica­
tion Test, 4A Mechanical, 1 and 2 family; and 

ii. Successful completion of the National Certifica­
tion Test, 4B Mechanical General. 

(c) Rules concerning notice of examinations are: 

1. Notice of examinations shall be given by announce­
ments available from the Licensing Unit and at such other 

· places as the Department may determine to be appropri­
ate. 

(d) Examinations shall be conducted in accordance with 
the rules and procedures · established by the Educational 
Testing Service. 

(e) After an examination has been completed and scored, 
applicants shall be notified of their final rating. 

(f) The following records pertaining to every examination 
shall be preserved for a period of three years: 

1. The resulting list of grades; 

2. Such other records of information in the custody of 
the Department as may be pertinent. 

Amended by R.1982 d.10, effective February 1, 1982. 
See: 13 N.J.R. 801(a), 14 N.J.R. 143(b). 

(a) substantially amended. 
Amended by R.1982 d.436, effective December 20, 1982. 
See: 14 N.J.R. 734(a), 14 N.J.R. 1449(a). 

Increased examinations from once to twice annually. Added the 
National Certification Program Construction Code Inspector Tests by 
E.T.S. Deleted old text in (i) concerning rules for the conduct of 
examinations and added present text. Revised (m) concerning the 
preservation of examination records by deleting description of tests and 
applicant test papers. 
Amended by R.1983 d.641, effective January 17, 1984. 
See: 15 N.J.R. 1911(a), 16 N.J.R. 129(b). 

Substantially amended. 
Amended by R.1985 d.612, effective January 6, 1986. 
See: I7 N.J.R. 182I(a), 18 N.J.R. 80(a). 

Was 5:23-5.9. 
Amended by R.1987 d.509, effective December 7, 1987. 
See: 19 N.J.R. 1264(a), 19 N.J.R. 2270(a). 

Recodified from 5.24 and deleted (f) and (g). 
Administrative Correction to (a). 
See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b). 
Amended by R.199I d.308, effective June 17, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R. I085(a), 23 N.J.R. 1923(a). 

Exam modules 4A-Mechanical and I and 2 Family added to fire 
protection inspector ICS exam requirements. 
Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July I, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a). 

Stylistic changes. 
Amended by R.1992 d.272, effective July 6, I992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 1446(a), 24 N.J.R. 2424(a). 

Stylistic changes. 
Amended by R.1993 d.187, effective May 3, 1993. 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

See: 25 N.J.R. 624(a), 25 N.J.R. 1875(a). 
Added (d)12. 

5:23-5.24 Procedure for approving educational programs 

(a) Any licensed institution of higher education may sub­
mit any credit or noncredit course for approval as a compo­
nent of the educational programs required by N.J.A.C. 
5:23-5.20 herein. The application should be in letter form, 
be submitted at least 60 days prior to the first class session 
of the course, and contain all the information specified 
herein. 

(b) Each application should be submitted in the name of 
the institution by a person authorized to do so. It should 
contain the following minimum information: 

1. The name of the course or program; 

2. A description of the length of each session, the 
frequency of the sessions and the total number of ses­
.sions; 

3. An outline showing the course or program content 
broken down by session. Any laboratory or practical 
work should be identified as such; 

4. A description of any. texts or materials to be used. 
The description should identify whether the text or mate­
rials will be mandatory or suggested; 

5. A description of the institution's standard for facul­
ty members who will be employed to instruct the course 
or program; 

6. An estimate of the program's duration (that is, the 
number of times it will be offered); 

7. A statement that the institution will notify the 
department if the program is withdrawn or changed at 
anytime; 

8. A statement that the institution will conduct the 
course or program in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.20 
herein and will maintain such records as are therein 
required; 

9. A statement of such charges as the institution has 
established for the course or program. 

(c) The Department reserves the right to undertake such 
reviews as may be necessary to verify the accuracy of an 
application or conformity with these regulations. The insti­
tution, by submitting an application, expressly agrees to 
cooperate in such reviews. 

(d) An institution may conduct a program which satisfies 
only a portion of the requirements established in N.J.A.C. 
5:23-5.20 or may establish a series of courses designed to 
fulfill all the requirements for the educational program of 
that article. 

Supp. 2-20-96 23-128 Next Page is 23-128.1 



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

(e) Upon verification that the program or course will 
satisfy some or all of the educational program requirements, 
the department will: 

1. Issue a letter of approval to the institution which 
letter shall contain any terms or conditions of such ap­
proval; 

Next Page is 23-129 23-128.1 

5:23-5.24 

2. Place the name of the institution and the course on 
the Department's list of approved courses. That list will 
be made available to the public. 

i. Any approval shall be limited in that it is effective 
only as long as the course conforms to the application 
submitted and approved. 

Supp. 2-20-96 


