UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

CHAPTER 23

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

Authority
N.J.S.A. 52:27D-123, 123a, 123.2, 123.5, 123.8, 124, 124f and 133.4.

Source and Effective Date

R.2003 d.70, effective January 15, 2003.
See: 34 NJ.R. 351(a), 35 N.J.R. 1054(a).

Chapter Expiration Date

Chapter 23, Uniform Construction Code, expires on January 15,
2008.

Chapter Historical Note

Chapter 23, Uniform Construction Code, was adopted as R.1976
d.344, d.345, d.346 and d.347, effective January 1, 1977 and codified as
Subchapter 1, General Provisions; Subchapter 2, Administration and
Enforcement Process; Subchapter 3, Subcodes, and Subchapter 4,
Enforcing Agencies: Duties, Powers, Procedures. See: 8 N.J.R.
216(b), 319(a), 370(d), 414(a); 8 N.J.R. 546(a). Chapter 23, Uniform
Construction Code, superseded N.J.A.C. 5:16, Standard Building Code
and N.J.A.C. 5:20, Safety Glazing Materials, which were repealed by
R.1978 d.360, effective October 6, 1978. See: 10 NJ.R. 377(a), 10
N.J.R. 470(a). Chapter 23, Uniform Construction Code, also supersed-
ed NJ.A.C. 5:21, Uniform Standards Code for Mobile Homes, which
was repealed by R.1982 d.7, effective February 1, 1982. See: 13 N.J.R.
717(a), 14 N.J.R. 142(a).

Subchapter 5, Licensing of Code Enforcement Officials, was adopted
as R.1977 d.304, effective October 1, 1977. See: 9 N.J.R. 257(b), 9
N.J.R. 413(b). Subchapter 6, Tax Exemption for Solar Facilities, was
adopted as R.1978 d.334, effective September 18, 1978. See: 10 N.J.R.
222(b), 10 N.J.R. 418(a).

Pursuant to Executive Order No. 66(1978), Subchapter 6, Tax Ex-
emption for Solar Facilities, was readopted as R.1980 d.303, effective
July 1, 1980. See: 12 N.J.R. 249(c), 12 N.J.R. 452(c).

Pursuant to Executive Order No. 66(1978), Chapter 23, Uniform
Construction Code, was readopted as R.1983 d.144, effective April 26,
1983. See: 14 N.J.R 1247(a), 15 N.J.R. 803(c).

Subchapter 7, Barrier Free Subcode, was adopted as R.1986 d.448,
effective November 3, 1986. See: 18 N.J.R. 757(a), 18 N.J.R 2194(a).

Subchapter 8, Asbestos Hazard Abatement Subcode, was adopted as
Emergency New Rules R.1985 d.362, effective June 18, 1985 (expired
August 17, 1985). See: 17 N.J.R. 1782(a).

Pursuant to Executive Order No. 66(1978), the provisions of R.1985
d.362 were readopted as R.1985 d.472, effective August 16, 1985. See:
17 NJ.R. 2249(a).

Pursuant to Executive Order No. 66(1978), Chapter 23, Uniform
Construction Code, was readopted as R.1988 d.168, effective March 22,
1988. N.J.A.C. 5:23-6.1, 6.2 and 6.3, concerning tax exemption for
solar facilities, were not readopted and expired on April 1, 1988. See:
20 N.J.R. 223(a), 20 N.J.R. 893(a).

Subchapter 9, Code Interpretations, was adopted as R.1988 d.195,
effective May 2, 1988. See: 20 N.J.R. 224(a), 20 N.J.R. 977(a).

Subchapter 10, Radon Hazard Subcode, was adopted as R.1990
d.226, effective May 7, 1990. See: 21 N.J.R. 3696(a), 22 N.J.R.
1356(a).

New Jersey State Library

23-1

Subchapter 4A, Industrialized/Modular Buildings and Building Com-
ponents, was adopted as R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990, (opera-
tive July 1, 1990). See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).

Subchapter 11, Indoor Air Quality Standards and Procedures for
Buildings Occupied by Public Employees, was adopted as R.1992 d.33,
effective January 21, 1992. See: 23 N.J.R. 1730(b), 24 N.J.R. 229(c).

Subchapter 12, Elevator Safety Subcode, was adopted as R.1991
d.325, effective July 1, 1991. See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a).

Pursuant to Executive Order No. 66(1978), Chapter 23, Uniform
Construction Code, was readopted as R.1993 d.106, effective February
3,1993. See: 24 N.J.R. 1420(b), 25 N.J.R. 920(a).

Subchapter 4B, Manufactured Homes and Manufactured Home Add-
On Units Not Subject to Federal Regulation, and Subchapter 4C,
Enforcement of Federal Manufactured Home Standards, were adopted
as R.1994 d.96, effective February 22, 1994. See: 25 N.J.R. 5388(a), 26
N.J.R. 1073(a).

NJ.A.C. 5:23-7.1 through 7.99 were repealed and 7.100 through
7.116 were recodified as 7.2 through 7.18 by R.1995 d.144, effective
March 20, 1995 (operative July 1, 1995). See: 26 N.J.R. 2698(a), 26
N.J.R. 2524(a), 27 N.J.R. 1180(a).

Subchapter 11, Indoor Air Quality Standards and Procedures for
Buildings Occupied by Public Employees, was repealed by R.1995
d.612, effective December 4, 1995 (operative July 1, 1995). See: 27
N.J.R. 3518(a), 27 N.J.R. 4885(a).

Pursuant to Executive Order No. 66(1978), Chapter 23, Uniform
Construction Code, was readopted as R.1997 d.409, effective Septem-
ber 9, 1997. As a part of R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997,
Subchapter 6, Tax Exemption, was repealed. See: 29 N.J.R. 2736(a),
29 NJ.R. 4281(a).

Subchapter 6, Rehabilitation Subcode, was adopted as R.1998 d.28,
effective January 5, 1998. See: 29 N.UJ.R. 3603(a), 30 N.J.R. 129(a).

Subchapter 12A, Optional Elevator Inspection Program, was adopted
as R.1998 d.480, effective September 21, 1998. See: 30 N.J.R. 1119(b),
30 N.J.R. 3461(a).

Subchapter 11, Playground Safety Subcode, was adopted as R.1999
d.351, effective October 18, 1999. See: 31 N.J.R. 1838(a), 31 NJ.R.
3082(a).

Subchapter 3A, State-Jurisdiction Subcodes, was adopted as R.2001
d.303, effective September 4, 2001. See: 33 N.J.R. 1991(a), 33 N.J.R.
2989(a).

Chapter 23, Uniform Construction Code, was readopted as R.2003
d.70, effective January 15, 2003. See: Source and Effective Date.

Cross References

Child care center physical facility requirements, see N.J.A.C.
10:122-5.1 et seq.

Children’s group home physical facility requirements, see N.J.A.C.
10:128-4.1 et seq.

Children’s shelter physical facility requirements, see N.J.A.C.
10:124-5.1 et seq.

Residential child care facility maintenance and sanitation require-
ments, see N.J.A.C. 10:127-4.4.

CHAPTER TABLE OF CONTENTS

SUBCHAPTER 1. GENERAL PROVISIONS

5:23-1.1 Title; division into subchapters
5:23-1.2  Authority
5:23-1.3 Intent and purpose

Supp. 4-5-04



COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

5:23-1.4 Definitions
5:23-1.5 Effective date
5:23-1.6  Grace period
5:23-1.7 Validity

SUBCHAPTER 2. ADMINISTRATION AND
ENFORCEMENT; PROCESS

5:23-2.1
5:23-2.2
5:23-2.3
5:23-24
5:23-25
5:23-2.6
5:23-2.7
5:23-2.8
5:23-2.9
5:23-2.10
5:23-2.11
5:23-2.12
5:23-2.13
5:23-2.14
5:23-2.15
5:23-2.16
5:23-2.17
5:23-2.17A
5:23-2.18
5:23-2.18A
5:23-2.18B
5:23-2.18C
5:23-2.19
5:23-2.20
5:23-2.21
5:23-2.22
5:23-2.23
5:23-2.24
5:23-2.25
5:23-2.26
5:23-2.27
5:23-2.28
5:23-2.29
5:23-2.30
5:23-2.31
5:23-2.32
5:23-2.33

Title; scope; intent

Matter covered

Applicability

Alterations, replacements and damages
Concerning increase in size

Change of use

Ordinary maintenance

Installation of equipment

Variations and exceptions

Applications for variations

Review of variation applications

Final decision on variations

Authority to grant variations
Construction permits—when required
Construction permits—application
Construction permits—procedure
Demolition or removal of structures; abandoned wells

- Minor work

Inspections

Utility load management device installation programs
Utility area lighting facility installation program

Use and occupancy of swimming pools, spas and hot tubs
Special technical services

Tests and special inspections

Construction control

Premanufactured construction

Certificate requirements

Conditions of certificate of occupancy

Establishment of fees

(Reserved)

Refunds

Volume computation

Entry

Violation, notice and orders

Compliance

Unsafe structures

Service of notice

5:23-2.34 through 5:23-2.37 (Reserved)

5:23-2.38
5:23-2.39

Departmental appeal
Automatic fire suppression systems

SUBCHAPTER 3. SUBCODES

5:23-3.1
5:23-3.2
5:23-3.3
5:23-3.4
5:23-3.5
5:23-3.6
5:23-3.7

5:23-3.8
5:23-39
5:23-3.10
5:23-3.11
5:23-3.11A

5:23-3.11B
5:23-3.12
5:23-3.13
5:23-3.14
5:23-3.15
5:23-3.16
5:23-3.17
5:23-3.18
5:23-3.19

Supp. 4-5-04

Title; scope; intent

Matters covered; exceptions

Enforcement

Responsibilities

Posting structures

Standards; accepted practice

Municipal approvals of alternative materials, equipment,
or methods of construction

Products violating the Code

Interpretations and opinions

(Reserved)

Enforcement activities reserved to the Department

Public school facility plan review and inspections; Uni-
form Construction Code enhancements in public school
facilities

Underground storage tank systems

Amended rules

State-sponsored code change proposals

Building subcode

Plumbing subcode

Electrical subcode

Fire protection subcode

Energy Subcode

Manufactured home subcode

5:23-3.20  Mechanical subcode

5:23-3.20A (Reserved)

5:23-3.21  One and two-family dwelling subcode
5:23-3.22  Fuel gas subcode

SUBCHAPTER 3A. STATE-JURISDICTION SUBCODES

5:23-3A.1 Scope
5:23-3A.2 Subcodes established

SUBCHAPTER 4. ENFORCING AGENCIES; DUTIES;
POWERS; PROCEDURES

5:23-4.1 Title; scope; intent

5:23-4.2  Matter covered; exceptions

5:23-4.3  Municipal enforcing agencies—establishment

5:23-4.3A  Enforcing agency classification

5:23-44  Municipal enforcing agencies—organization

5:23-4.5  Municipal enforcing agencies—administration and enforce-
ment

5:23-4.5A  Selection of private on-site inspection and plan review
agencies

5:23-4.6  Interlocal enforcing agencies—establishment

5:23-47  Interlocal enforcing agencies—organization

5:23-4.8  Interlocal enforcing agencies—administration and enforce-
ment

5:23-4.9  State enforcing agencies—establishment

5:23-4.10  State enforcing agencies—organization

5:23-4.11 State enforcing agencies—administration and enforcement

5:23-4.12  Private on-site inspection and plan review agencies; estab-
lishment

5:23-4.13  Private on-site inspection and plan review agencies; organ-
ization

5:23-4.14  Private on-site inspection and plan review agencies; admin-
istration and enforcement

5:23-4.15  Suspension and revocation

5:23-4.16  (Reserved)

5:23-4.17 Municipal enforcing agency fees

5:23-4.18  Standards for municipal fees

5:23-4.19  New Jersey State permit surcharge fees

5:23-4.20 Departmental fees

5:23-4.21 Private enforcing agency authorization and reauthorization
fees

5:23-4.22  (Reserved)

5:23-4.23  Payment of fees

5:23-4.24  Plan review by the Department of Community Affairs

5:23-4.25  (Reserved)

5:23-4.26  Certification of building elements

5:23-4.27 through 5:23-4.40 (Reserved)

SUBCHAPTER 4A. INDUSTRIALIZED/MODULAR
BUILDINGS AND BUILDING COMPONENTS

5:23-4A.1  Purpose

5:23-4A.2  Findings; functions of the Commission
5:23-4A.3  Scope

5:23-4A.4  Definitions

5:23-4A.5  Standards

5:23-4A.6  Amendments

5:23-4A.7  Certification required

5:23-4A.8  Product control and identification
5:23-4A.9  Compliance assurance documents
5:23-4A.10 Uniform Administrative Procedures
5:23-4A.11 Appeals

5:23-4A.12 Conduct of hearings

5:23-4A.13 through 5:23-4A.27 (Reserved)

SUBCHAPTER 4B. MANUFACTURED HOMES AND
MANUFACTURED HOME ADD-ON UNITS NOT
SUBJECT TO FEDERAL REGULATION

5:23-4B.1  Scope

5:23-4B.2  Applicability

5:23-4B.3  Standards

5:23-4B.4  Administration and enforcement

23-2 f.“\:f‘:’";;gp- o : ) " ) - . “ . .



N

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-4B.5
5:23-4B.6

5:23-4B.7
5:23-4B.8
5:23-4B.9

5:23-4B.10
5:23-4B.11

Acceptability

Approvals of building systems and compliance assurance
program

Certification

Labels; fees

Requirements for submission of compliance assurance
documents

Appeals

Conduct of hearings

SUBCHAPTER 4C. ENFORCEMENT OF FEDERAL
MANUFACTURED HOME STANDARDS

5:23-4C.1
5:23-4C.2
5:23-4C3
5:23-4C4
5:23-4C5

Delegation of authority
Relation to Federal law
Complaint procedure

Hearing and appeal procedures
Monitoring inspection fee

SUBCHAPTER 5. LICENSING OF CODE
ENFORCEMENT OFFICIALS

5:23-5.1
5:23-5.2
5:23-53
5:23-5.4
5:23-5.5
5:23-5.6
5:23-5.7
5:23-5.8
5:23-5.9
5:23-5.10
5:23-5.11
5:23-5.12
5:23-5.13
5:23-5.14
5:23-5.15
5:23-5.16
5:23-5.17
5:23-5.18
5:23-5.19
5:23-5.19A
5:23-5.19B
5:23-5.19C
5:23-5.19D

5:23-5.19E
5:23-5.19F

5:23-5.20
5:23-5.21
5:23-5.22
5:23-5.23
5:23-523A

5:23-5.24
5:23-5.25

Title; scope; intent

Licensing unit; hearings

Types of licenses

Licenses required

General license requirements

Construction official requirements

Subcode official requirements

Building inspector H.H.S. requirements

Building inspector 1.C.S. requirements

Building inspector R.C.S. requirements

Electrical inspector H.H.S. requirements

Electrical inspector I.C.S. requirements

Fire protection inspector H.H.S. requirements

Fire protection inspector 1.C.S. requirements

Fire protection inspector R.C.S. requirements

Plumbing inspector H.H.S. requirements

Plumbing inspector I.C.S. requirements

Inplant inspector requirements

Elevator inspector H.H.S. requirements

Mechanical inspector requirements

Amusement ride inspector I.C.S. requirements

Amusement ride inspector H.H.S. requirements

Boiler, pressure vessel and refrigeration inspector R.C.S.
requirements

Boiler, pressure vessel and refrigeration inspector I.C.S.
requirements

Boiler, pressure vessel and refrigeration inspector H.H.S.
requirements

Standards for educational programs

Renewal of license

Fees

Examination requirements

Examination requirements for State-jurisdiction subcode
technical licensure

Procedure for approving educational programs

Revocation of licenses and alternative sanctions

SUBCHAPTER 6. REHABILITATION SUBCODE

5:23-6.1
5:23-6.2
5:23-6.3
5:23-6.4
5:23-6.5
5:23-6.6
5:23-6.7
5:23-6.8
5:23-6.9
5:23-6.10

5:23-6.11
5:23-6.11A
5:23-6.12

Introduction; using this subcode

Applicability and compliance

Definitions

Repairs

Renovations

Alterations

Reconstruction

Materials and methods

New building elements

Basic requirements and supplemental requirements—gen-
eral

Basic requirements in all Groups

Supplemental requirements in all Groups

Basic requirements—Group A-1

23-3

5:23-6.12A  Supplemental requirements—Group A-1

5:23-6.13  Basic requirements—Group A-2 Nightclubs

5:23-6.13A  Supplemental requirements—Group A-2 Nightclubs

5:23-6.14  Basic requirements—Groups A-2 other than Nightclubs,
A-3 and A4

5:23-6.14A Supplemental requirements—Groups A-2 other than
Nightclubs, A-3 and A-4

5:23-6.15  Basic requirements—Group A-3 Places of Worship

5:23-6.15A  Supplemental requirements—Group A-3 Places of Wor-
ship

5:23-6.16  Basic requirements—Group A-5

5:23-6.16A  Supplemental requirements—Group A-5

5:23-6.17  Basic requirements—Group B

5:23-6.17A  Supplemental requirements—Group B

5:23-6.18  Basic requirements—Group E

5:23-6.18A  Supplemental requirements—Group E

5:23-6.19  Basic requirements—Group F

5:23-6.19A  Supplemental requirements—Group F

5:23-6.20  Basic requirements—Group H

5:23-6.20A  Supplemental requirements—Group H

5:23-6.21  Basic requirements—Group I-1

5:23-6.21A  Supplemental requirements—Group I-1

5:23-6.22  Basic requirements—Groups I-2 and I-4

5:23-6.22A  Supplemental requirements—Groups 1-2 and 1-4

5:23-6.23  Basic requirements—Group 1-3

5:23-6.23A  Supplemental requirements—Group I-3

5:23-6.24  Basic requirements—Group M

5:23-6.24A  Supplemental requirements—Group M

5:23-6.25  Basic requirements—Group R-1

5:23-6.25A  Supplemental requirements—Group R-1

5:23-6.26  Basic requirements—Groups R-2 and R-4

5:23-6.26A Supplemental requirements—Groups R-2 and R—4

5:23-6.27  Basic requirements—Groups R-3 and R-5

5:23-6.27A  Supplemental requirements—Groups R-3 and R-5

5:23-6.28  Basic requirements—Group S

5:23-6.28A  Supplemental requirements—Group S

5:23-6.29  Mixed use buildings

5:23-6.30  Special technical requirements—all groups

5:23-6.31 Change of use

5:23-6.32  Additions

5:23-6.33  Historic buildings

SUBCHAPTER 7. BARRIER FREE SUBCODE

5:23-7.1  Applicability

5:23-7.2  Accessibility standard

5:23-7.3  Exceptions

5:23-7.4  Nonresidential buildings and buildings of Use Group R-1.

5:23-7.5  Residential buildings other than Group R-1

5:23-7.6  Exterior accessible route

5:23-7.7  Accessible building entrances

5:23-7.8  Interior accessible routes

5:23-7.9  Accessible parking

5:23-7.10 Requirements applicable to specific nonresidential Groups
and Group R-1

5:23-7.11 Requirements applicable to all nonresidential use groups,
including spaces other than guestrooms in Use Group
R-1

5:23-7.12  Existing facilities

5:23-7.13  Variations

5:23-7.14 Enforcement

5:23-7.15 Recreation

5:23-7.16 Recreation: definitions

5:23-7.17 Recreation: exceptions

5:23-7.18 Recreation: route of travel

5:23-7.19 Recreation: pools

5:23-7.20 Recreation: swimming and skating areas

5:23-7.21 Recreation: boating areas

5:23-7.22 Recreation: fishing areas

5:23-7.23 Recreation: court games

5:23-7.24 Recreation: ice rinks and roller rinks

5:23-7.25 Recreation: playing fields

5:23-7.26 Recreation: golf facilities

5:23-7.27 Recreation: ski lifts, aerial tramways, and conveyors

5:23-7.28 Recreation: trails

Supp. 4-5-04



COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

5:23-7.29 Recreation: camping sites
5:23-7.30 Recreation: equipment
5:23-7.31 Recreation: equestrian facilities

SUBCHAPTER 8. ASBESTOS HAZARD ABATEMENT

5:23-12.10 Inspections in seasonal facilities
5:23-12.11 Notice concerning accidents
5:23-12.12 Special safety equipment

SUBCHAPTER 12A. OPTIONAL ELEVATOR

SUBCODE . INSPECTION PROGRAM
5:23-8.1  Title; scope; intent 5:23-12A.1 Title; scope; intent
5:23-82  Definitions ) . . . . 5:23-12A.2 Qualified elevator device inspection firms
5:23-8.3  Enforcement; licensing; special technical services 5:23-12A.3 Qualified elevator device inspector
5:23-8.4  Variations . 5:23-12A.4 Enrollment of devices
5:23-8.5  Construction permit for asbestos abatement 5:23-12A.5 Permit process and monitoring
5:23-8.6  Coordination with other permits 5:23-12A.6 Special inspection and compliance procedures
5:23-8.7  Inspections; violations
5:23-8.8  Certificate of occupancy; certificate of completion
5:23-8.9  Fees
5:23-8.10 Asbestos safety technician
5:23-8.11 Asbestos safety control monitor
5:23-8.12  Application of asbestos
5:23-8.13 Pre-project procedures SUBCHAPTER 1. GENERAL PROVISIONS
5:23-8.14 Operations and maintenance activities
5:23-8.15 Asbestos hazard abatement projects 5:23-1.1 Title; division into subchapters
5:23-8.16  Asbestos encapsulation and enclosure . ‘ .
523817 Limited containment removals (a) These regulations .shall be known as the “Regulations
5:23-8.18 Demolition for the New Jersey Uniform Construction Code” and are
5:23-8.19  Abatement in occupied buildings i referred to herein as “the regulations”.
5:23-8.20 Removal of non-friable asbestos-containing material
5:23-8.21  Air monitoring methodology : ; .
523-822 Disposal of asbestos waste (b) The chapter consists of the following subchapters:

SUBCHAPTER 9. CODE INTERPRETATIONS

5:23-9.1 Interpretations: Plumbing Subcode

5:23-9.2  Interpretation: Construction Permit for a single family resi-
dence

(Reserved)

(Reserved)

Interpretation: Records retention

Interpretations: Construction requirements for new and ex-
isting casinos

Interpretation:
equipment

Interpretation: bed and breakfast guest houses—change in
Group requirements

Foundation systems for garden type utility sheds and similar
structures

5:23-93
5:23-9.4
5:23-95
5:23-9.6
5:23-9.7

Manufacturing, production and process

5:23-9.8

5:23-9.9

SUBCHAPTER 10. RADON HAZARD SUBCODE
5:23-10.1 Title; scope; intent

5:23-10.2  Definitions

5:23-10.3 Enforcement

5:23-10.4 Construction techniques

APPENDIX 10-A. NEW JERSEY MUNICIPALITIES IN
TIER 1

SUBCHAPTER 11. PLAYGROUND SAFETY SUBCODE

5:23-11.1 Subcode adopted

5:23-11.2 Definition

5:23-11.3 Enforcement of subcode

5:23-11.4 Compliance schedule

SUBCHAPTER 12. ELEVATOR SAFETY SUBCODE

5:23-12.1  Title; scope; intent

5:23-12.2  Referenced standards

5:23-12.3  Inspection and test schedule

5:23-12.4  Registration of elevator devices

5:23-12.5  Registration fee

5:23-12.6  Test and inspection fees

5:23-12.7  Licensing

5:23-12.8  Alterations, replacements, damages, increases in- size,
changes in use group, minor work, ordinary repairs

5:23-12.9  Certificate of compliance requirements

Supp. 4-5-04 234

1. “General provisions” which may be cited through-
out the regulations as N.J.A.C. 5:23-1 and when referred
to in subchapter 1 of this chapter may be cited as this
subchapter.

2. “Administration and enforcement; process” which
may be cited throughout the regulations as N.J.A.C.
5:23-2 and when referred to in subchapter 2 of this
chapter may be cited as this subchapter.

3. “Subcodes” which may be cited throughout the
regulations as N.J.A.C. 5:23-3 and when referred to in
subchapter 3 of this chapter may be cited as this subchap-
ter.

i. NJ.A.C. 5:23-3.11B contains references to the
Department of Environmental Protection’s rules con-
cerning underground storage tanks, codified at N.J.A.C.
7:14B, which are jointly enforced by this Department
and local enforcing agencies pursuant to this chapter.

4. “Enforcing agencies: duties, powers, and proce-
dures” which may be cited throughout the regulations as
N.J.A.C. 5:23-4 of this chapter and when referred to in
subchapter 4 of this chapter may be cited as this subchap-
ter.

5. “Industrialized/Modular Buildings and Building
Components” which may be cited throughout the regula-
tions as N.J.A.C. 5:23-4A and when referred to N.J.A.C.
5:23-4A may be cited as this subchapter.

6. “Manufactured Homes and Manufactured Home
Add-On Units Not Subject to Federal Regulations” which
may be cited throughout the regulations as N.J.A.C.
5:23-4B and when referred to in subchapter 4B may be
cited as this subchapter.



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-1.3

7. “Enforcement of Federal Manufactured Home
Standards” which may be cited throughout the regulations
as N.J.A.C. 5:23-4C and when referred to in subchapter
4C may be cited as this subchapter.

8. “Licensing of Code Enforcement Officials” which
may be cited throughout the regulations as N.J.A.C.
5:23-5 and when referred to in subchapter 5 of this
chapter may be cited as this subchapter.

9. “Rehabilitation Subcode” which may be cited
throughout the regulations as N.J.A.C. 5:23-6 and, when
referred to in subchapter 6 of this chapter, may be cited
as this subchapter.

10. “Barrier Free Subcode” which may be cited
throughout the regulations as N.J.A.C. 5:23-7 and when
referred to in subchapter 7 of this chapter may be cited as
this subchapter.

11. “Asbestos Hazard Abatement Subcode” which
may be cited throughout the regulations as N.J.A.C.
5:23-8 and when referred to in subchapter 8 of this

Text on elevators added at (b).
Amended by R.1992 d.183, effective April 20, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 167(a), 24 N.J.R. 1475(b).
Reference to Indoor Air Quality Subcode added at (b)12.
Amended by R.1994 d.96, effective February 22, 1994.
See: 25 N.J.R. 5388(a), 26 N.J.R. 1073(a).
Amended by R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a).
Deleted (b)14.
Amended by R.1998 d.28, effective January 5, 1998.
See: 29 N.J.R. 3603(a), 30 N.J.R. 129(a).
In (b)9, substituted “Rehabilitation Subcode” for “Tax Exemptions”.
Amended by R.1998 d.480, effective September 21, 1998.

See: 30 N.J.R. 1119(b), 30 N.J.R. 3461(a).

In (b), added 16.
Amended by R.1999 d.351, effective October 18, 1999.
See: 31 N.J.R. 1838(a), 31 N.J.R. 3082(a).

Rewrote (b)14.

Case Notes

Councilperson violated local ethics law; project manager for private
construction company. Bleeker v. Local Finance Board, 94 N.J.A.R.2d
(CAF) 122.

chapter may be cited as this subchapter.

12. “Code Interpretations” which may be cited

5:23-1.2 Authority

throughout the regulations as N.J.A.C. 5:23-9 and when
referred to in subchapter 9 of this chapter may be cited as

this subchapter.

13. “Radon Hazard Subcode” which may be cited

These regulations are promulgated by the Commissioner

of the Department of Community Affairs pursuant to the
authority of the “State Uniform Construction Code Act”
(P.L. 1975, ¢.217, as amended).

5:23-1.3 Intent and purpose

throughout the regulations as N.J.A.C. 5:23-10 and when

referred to in subchapter 10 of this chapter may be cited

as this subchapter.

14. “Playground safety subcode” which may be cited
throughout this chapter as N.J.A.C. 5:23-11 and, when
referred to in subchapter 11 of this chapter, may be cited

as “this subchapter.”

15. “Elevator Safety Subcode” which may be cited

throughout the rules as N.J.A.C. 5:23-12 and when re-

ferred to in subchapter 12 of this chapter may be cited as

this subchapter.

16. “Optional elevator inspection program” which
may be cited throughout the rules as NJ.A.C. 5:23-12A

and, when referred to in subchapter 12A of this chapter,

may be cited as “this subchapter.”

Amended by R.1978 d.350, eff. October 1, 1978.
See: 10 N.J.R. 378(a), 10 N.J.R. 469(f).
Amended by R.1987 d.509, effective December 7, 1987.
See: 19 N.JR. 1264(a), 19 N.J.R. 2270(a).

(b) substantially amended.
Amended by R.1990 d.226, effective May 7, 1990.
See: 21 N.J.R. 3696(a), 22 N.J.R. 1356(a).

Added 9 and 10 to (b).
Amended by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).

Text added at (b)5.

Amended by R.1990 d.562, effective November 19, 1990.

See: 22 N.J.R. 2629(c), 22 N.J.R. 3482(d).
Added reference to N.J.A.C. 7:14B.

Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991.

See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a).

23-5

(a) It is the intent and purpose of the regulations:

1. To encourage innovation and economy in construc-
tion and to provide requirements for construction and
construction materials consistent with nationally recog-
nized standards.

2. To formulate such requirements, to the extent prac-
ticable, in terms of performance objectives, so as to make
adequate performance for the use intended as the test of
acceptability.

3. To permit to the fullest extent feasible the use of
modern technical methods, devices and improvements,
including premanufactured systems, consistent with rea-
sonable requirements for the health, safety and welfare of
occupants or users of buildings and structures.

4. To eliminate restrictive, obsolete, conflicting and
unnecessary construction regulations that tend to unnec-
essarily increase construction costs or retard the use of
new materials, products or methods of construction, or
provide preferential treatment to types or classes of mate-
rials or products or methods of construction.

5. To insure adequate maintenance of buildings and
structures throughout the State and to adequately protect
the health, safety and welfare of the people.

6. To eliminate unnecessary duplication of effort and
fees in the review of construction plans and the inspection
of construction.

Supp. 12-15-03



5:23-1.3

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Case Notes

Intent is elimination of construction regulations by local government
units. Home Builders League of South Jersey, Inc. v. Evesham Twp.,
174 N.J.Super. 252, 416 A.2d 81 (Law Div.1980).

Uniform Construction Code codified in regulations. Bureau of
Construction Code Enforcement v. Hasbrouck Heights, 4 N.J.A.R. 282
(1983).

5:23-1.4 Definitions

The following words and terms, when used in this chapter,
shall have the following meanings unless the context clearly
indicates otherwise.

“Alteration” means the rearrangement of any space by
the construction of walls or partitions, the addition or
elimination of any door or window, the extension or rear-
rangement of any system, the installation of any additional
equipment or fixtures and any work which affects a primary
structural component.

“Building” means a structure enclosed with exterior walls
or fire walls, built, erected and framed of component struc-
tural parts, designed for the housing shelter, enclosure and
support of individuals, animals or property of any kind.
When used herein, building and structure shall be inter-
changeable except where the context clearly indicates other-
wise.

“Building subcode official” means a qualified person ap-
pointed by the municipal appointing authority or the com-
missioner pursuant to the act and the regulations to enforce
the provisions of the building subcode within the jurisdiction
of the enforcing agency.

“Business day” means any day of the year, exclusive of
Saturdays, Sundays, and legal holidays.

“Certificate of approval” means a certificate issued pursu-
ant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-2 upon completion of work that re-
quires a construction permit but not a certificate of occu-

pancy.

“Certificate of compliance” means the certificate provid-
ed for in N.J.A.C. 5:23-2 and 12, indicating that potentially
hazardous equipment is being maintained in accordance
with the Act and this chapter.

“Certificate of continued occupancy” means the certifi-
cate provided for in N.J.A.C. 5:23-2, indicating that as a
result of a general inspection of the visible parts of the
building, no violations of N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.14 "have been
determined to have occurred and no unsafe conditions
violative of N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.32 have been found, and that
the existing use of the building has heretofore lawfully
existed.

“Certificate of occupancy” means the certificate provided
for in N.J.A.C. 5:23-2, indicating that the construction
authorized by the construction permit has been completed
in accordance with the construction permit, the act and the
regulations.

Supp. 12-15-03

“Change of use” means a change from one use to another
use in a building or tenancy or portion thereof.

“Class I structure” means a structure not listed in
N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.3A(d)1i through v or 2ii through xx.

“Class II structure” means a structure listed in N.J.A.C.
5:23-4.3A(d)2ii through xx.

“Class III structure” means a structure listed in N.J.A.C.
5:23-4.3A(d)1i through v.

“Commissioner” means the Commissioner of the Depart-
ment of Community Affairs.

“Construction Board of Appeals” means the board pro-
vided for in N.J.A.C. 5:23A.

“Construction official” means a qualified person appoint-
ed by the municipal appointing authority or the commission-
er pursuant to the act and the regulations to enforce and
administer the regulations within the jurisdiction of the
enforcing agency.

“Construction permit” means an authorization to begin
work subject to the conditions established in subchapter 2 of
this chapter.

“Department” means the Department of Community Af-
fairs.

“Effective date” means, in the case of a new rule, amend-
ment or repeal, the date of promulgation in the New Jersey
Register. The effective date of a readoption is the date of
filing with the Office of Administrative Law.

“Electrical subcode official” means a qualified person
appointed by the municipal appointing authority or the
commissioner pursuant to the act and the regulations to
enforce and provisions of the electrical subcode within the
jurisdiction of the enforcing agency.

“Elevator” or “elevator device” means a hoisting and
lowering device equipped with a car or platform which
moves in guides for the transportation of individuals or
freight in a substantially vertical direction through successive
floors or levels of a building or structure; or a power driven,
inclined, continuous stairway used for raising or lowering
passengers; or a type of passenger carrying device on which
passengers stand or walk, and in which the passenger carry-
ing surface remains parallel to its direction of motion and is
uninterrupted. This includes, but it is not limited to, eleva-
tors, escalators, moving walks, dumbwaiters, wheelchair lifts,
manlifts, stairway chairlifts and any device within the scope
of ASME A17.1 (Safety Code for Elevators and Escalators)
or ASME A90.1 (Safety Standards for Belt Manlifts).

“Elevator subcode official” means a qualified person ap-
pointed by the municipal appointing authority or the Com-
missioner, pursuant to the Act and this chapter, to enforce
the provisions of any subcode specifically designated for
such enforcement in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3, within the jurisdiction
of the enforcing agency.

23-6



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-14

“Enforcing agency” means the municipal or State admin-
istrative entity charged with the administration and enforce-
ment of the regulations consisting of the construction offi-
cial, subcode officials and assistants thereto appointed in
accordance with N.J.S.A. 52:27D-126 of the act and the
regulations.

“Equipment” means plumbing, heating, electrical, venti-
lating, air conditioning, refrigerating and fire prevention
equipment, and elevators, dumb waiters, escalators, boilers,
pressure vessels and other mechanical facilities or installa-
tions, which are related to building services and shall not
include manufacturing, production or process equipment,
but which shall include connections from building service to
process equipment.

“Facility” for the purpose of applying for an annual
permit means exclusive of a hotel/casino, a building or
group of buildings under common ownership or control and
whose maintenance work is performed under the direct
supervision of a maintenance supervisor.

“Fire protection subcode official” means a qualified per-
son appointed by the appropriate appointing authority or
the commissioner pursuant to the act and the regulations to
enforce those portions of any subcode, specifically designat-
ed for such enforcement in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3, within the
jurisdiction of the enforcing agency.

“Health care facility” means the facility or institution,
whether public or private, engaged principally in providing
services for health maintenance organizations, diagnosis or
treatment of human disease, pain, injury, deformity or physi-
cal condition, including but not limited to a general hospital,
special hospital, mental hospital, public health center, diag-
nostic center, treatment center, rehabilitation center, ex-
tended care facility, skilled nursing home, nursing home,
intermediate care facility, tuberculosis hospital, chronic dis-
ease hospital, maternity hospital, outpatient clinic, dispensa-
ry, home health care agency, home for the sheltered care of
adult persons, and bioanalytical laboratory or central ser-
vices facility serving one or more such institutions, but
excluding institutions that provide healing solely by prayer.

1. This definition shall not be deemed to include
nurses, doctors, or other staff housing not attached in
accordance with minimum fire separation standards in the
building subcode; administrative offices not attached in
accordance with minimum fire separation standards in the
building subcode; parking garages, or other such facilities
for which the Federal government does not impose stan-
dards as a condition of funding.

“Hearing examiner” means a person appointed by the
commissioner to conduct hearings, summarize evidence and
make findings of fact.

“Lead abatement” means a process designed either to
mitigate or to eliminate permanently lead-based paint haz-
ards on a premises and includes, but is not limited to: the
removal of lead-based paint and lead-contaminated dust;
the containment or encapsulation of lead-based paint; the
replacement of lead-painted surfaces or fixtures; the remov-
al or covering of lead-contaminated soil; and all prepara-
tion, cleanup, disposal and post-abatement clearance testing
activities associated with such measures. “Lead abatement”
shall not include painting, woodworking, structural renova-
tion or other indoor or outdoor contracting services that
may result in the disturbance of paint, unless it is evident
from the statements and/or actions of a person or persons
authorizing or performing such services that an objective of
the work is the mitigation or permanent elimination of a
lead-based paint hazard.

“Lead evaluation” means a surface-by-surface investiga-
tion to determine the presence and condition of lead-based
paint and the provision of a report explaining the results of
the investigation, including, but not limited to, hazards and
recommendations for abatement.

“Maintenance” means the replacement or mending of
existing work with equivalent materials or the provision of
additional work or material for the purpose of the safety,
healthfulness and upkeep of the structure and the adher-
ence to such other standards of upkeep as are required in
the interest of public safety, health and welfare.

“Manufactured home” means a structure, transportable in
one or more sections, which in the traveling mode, is eight
body feet or more in width, or 40 body feet or more in
length, or, when erected on site, is 320 or more square feet,
and which is built on a permanent chassis and designed to
be used as a dwelling with or without a permanent founda-
tion when connected to the required utilities, and includes
the plumbing, heating, air conditioning and electrical sys-
tems contained therein; except that such term shall also
include any structure which meets all of the requirements of
this paragraph except the size requirements and with respect
to which the manufacturer has voluntarily filed a certifica-
tion required by the Secretary of the United States Depart-
ment of Housing and Urban Development and complies
with the standards established under 42 U.S.C. Section 5401
et seq.

“Minor work” means construction work undertaken in
existing structures, requiring no prior approvals and no plan
review, not altering in any way the structural members of a
building and meeting the definition set forth in N.J.A.C.
5:23-2.17A.

“Municipality” means any city, borough, town, township
or village.

“Municipal Procedures Manual” means the book estab-
lished by the Commissioner, effective January 1, 1984, and
any subsequent revisions, detailing the steps to be followed
in completing, processing and filing the standards forms,
logs and reports required for administration and enforce-
ment of the State Uniform Construction Code.

23-7 Supp. 12-15-03



5:23-1.4

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

“Operative date” means the date upon which the Depart-
ment and local enforcing agencies shall enforce, and all
parties shall comply with, an effective rule. Unless other-
wise provided in the notice of adoption published in the
New Jersey Register, the effective date is the operative date.

“Ordinary maintenance” means restoration or improve-
ment of a routine or usual nature which is done by replacing
a part of, or putting together, something that is worn or
broken in a building, electrical, plumbing, heating, ventila-
tion or air conditioning system and meeting the definition
set forth in N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.7.

“Owner” means the owner or owners in fee of the
property or a lesser estate therein, a mortgagee or vendee in
possession, an assignee of rents, receiver, executor, trustee,
lessee or any other person, firm or corporation, directly or
indirectly in control of a building, structure or real property
and shall include any subdivision thereof of the State.

“Plans and specifications” means and includes all of the
written, graphic and pictorial documents prepared or assem-
bled for describing the design, location and physical charac-
teristics of the elements of the project controlled by these
rules and necessary for obtaining a permit. They shall be
drawn to an appropriate scale. Where the plans and specifi-
cations show, describe or document features of the project
not controlled by these rules, the portion(s) of the plans and
specifications showing features not controlled by these rules
shall not be considered to be “plans and specifications”
within the meaning of this definition.

“Plumbing subcode official” means a qualified person
appointed by the municipal appointing authority or the
commissioner pursuant to the act and the regulations to
enforce the provisions of the plumbing subcode within the
jurisdiction of the enforcing agency.

“Premanufactured system” or “premanufactured con-
struction” means an assembly of materials or products that
is intended to comprise all or part of a building or structure
and that is assembled off-site by a repetitive process under
circumstances intended to insure uniformity of quality and
material content. The term shall include, but not be limited
to, manufactured homes and industrialized/modular build-
ings.

“Primary function space” means a room or space housing
a major activity for which the building or tenancy is intend-
ed, including, but not limited to, office area, auditorium,
assembly space, dining room, bar or lounge, warehouse,
factory, dwelling, care, confinement, retail, and educational
spaces, but not including kitchens, bathrooms, storage rooms
or other spaces supporting a primary function space. A
building or tenancy may contain more than one primary
function space.

Supp. 12-15-03

23-8

“Prior approvals” means the necessary certifications or
approvals issued or authorized by any Federal or State
agency, or any political subdivision of the State, which are
not inconsistent with this chapter and which are conditions
precedent to the issuance of a construction permit or a
certificate of occupancy or approval, as the case may be.
Prior approvals shall include, but not be limited to, the
following:

1. Zoning;

2. Soil erosion and sediment control;

3. Highway curb cuts;

4. Water and sewer treatment works approvals;
5. Coastal areas facilities review;

6. Compliance of underground storage tank systems
with N.J.A.C. 7:14B;

i. An approval granted by the Department of Envi-
ronmental Protection or the construction official by
authority of N.J.A.C. 7:14B shall be deemed to be a
prior approval;

7. Educational adequacy review of public school facili-
ties under N.J.A.C. 6A:26;

8. Pinelands review; and

9. Compliance of abandoned wells with N.J.A.C.
7:9-9.

i. Compliance with N.J.A.C. 7:9-9.1 shall be evi-
denced by a certification issued by a well driller li-
censed by the Department of Environmental Protec-
tion.

“Private inplant inspection agency”, or “evaluation and
inspection agency”, means a business entity authorized pur-
suant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-4 or 4A to approve premanufactured
construction.

“Private on-site inspection and plan review agencies”
means a business entity authorized pursuant to N.J.A.C.
5:23-4 to act in lieu of a subcode official.

“Public school facility” means any building or part thereof
used by a local, regional or consolidated board of education
as a primary or secondary school.

“Reconstruction” means any project where the extent and
nature of the work is such that the work area cannot be
occupied while the work is in progress and where a new
certificate of occupancy is required before the work area can
be reoccupied. Reconstruction may include repair, renova-
tion, alteration or any combination thereof. Reconstruction
shall not include projects comprised only of floor finish
replacement, painting or wallpapering, or the replacement
of equipment or furnishings. Asbestos hazard abatement
and lead hazard abatement projects shall not be classified as
reconstruction solely because occupancy of the work area is
not permitted.

Next Page is 23-8.0.1

N

T
,
'\)

@



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-1.4

“Rehabilitation” means the repair, renovation, alteration
or reconstruction of any building or structure.

“Renovation” means the removal and replacement or
covering of existing interior or exterior finish, trim, doors,
windows, or other materials with new materials that serve
the same purpose and do not change the configuration of
space. Renovation shall include the replacement of equip-
ment or fixtures.

“Repair” means the restoration to a good or sound
condition of materials, systems and/or components that are
worn, deteriorated or broken using materials or components
identical to or closely similar to the existing.

“Small job” means construction work requiring no prior
approvals and the total cost of which is under $5,000. A
“small job” may involve more than one trade and may
require plan review.

“State sponsored code change proposal” means any pro-
posed amendment or code change adopted by the commis-
sioner in accordance with subsection c. of section 6 of the
act as amended for the purpose of presenting such proposed
amendment or code change at any of the periodic code
change hearings held by the National Model Code adoption
agencies, the codes of which have been adopted as subcodes
under the Act. For purposes of this definition a State
sponsored code change proposal may also oppose any code
change under consideration by a model code agency.

“Stop construction order” means the order provided for
in N.JS.A. 52:27D-132 of the act and NJ.A.C. 5:23-2.

“Structure” means a combination of materials to form a
construction for occupancy, use or ornamentation, whether
installed on, above, or below the surface of a parcel of land;
provided, the word “structure” shall be construed when used
herein as though followed by the words “or part or parts
thereof and all equipment therein” unless the context clearly
requires a different meaning.

“Subcode” means any of the national model codes, parts
thereof or other codes or standards as adopted by reference
in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3 or as set forth in N.J.A.C. 5:23-7, 8, 10
and 12.

“Tenancy” means an entire building, or that portion of a
building or story, which is or is intended to be under the
control of a single owner or tenant.

“Use” means that portion of a building or tenancy which
.is devoted to a single use group or special use or occupancy,
as defined in the building subcode, or as established by the
provisions of any other subcode for the purpose of specify-
ing special requirements applicable to that portion of a
building or tenancy.

“Work area” means any entire use, primary function
space or tenancy comprising all or part of a reconstruction

23-8.0.1

project as delineated on the approved permit application
and/or plans. :

As amended, R.1977 d.256, effective August 1, 1977.
See: 9 N.J.R. 164(a), 9 N.J.R. 358(a).

As amended, R.1978 d.162, effective June 1, 1978.
See: 10 N.J.R. 141(a), 10 N.J.R. 225(a).

As amended, R.1981 d.133, effective May 7, 1981.
See: 13 N.J.R. 119(a), 13 N.J.R. 258(c).

“Certificate of continued occupancy” and “prior approvals” recodi-
fied.

As amended, R.1982 d.7, effective February 1, 1982.
See: 13 N.J.R. 717(a), 14 N.J.R. 142(a).

“Manufactured home” was “mobile home”, and definition substan-
tially amended. Added “or premanufactured construction” to “pre-
manufactured system”, and added “The terms . .. homes”.

As amended, R.1983 d.611, eff. January 3, 1984.
See: 15 N.J.R. 1789(a), 16 N.J.R. 45(b).

Added definitions of “major work”, “minor work”, “municipal proce-
dures manual”, “ordinary repair” and “small job”.
As amended, R.1984 d.120, effective April 16, 1984.
See: 16 N.J.R. 179(a), 16 N.J.R. 873(a).

“Certificate of occupancy” added “N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4 have ..
found” to definitions.

Amended by R.1985 d.351, effective July 15, 1985.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1029(a), 17 N.J.R. 1756(b).

Definition for “Facility” added.

Amended by R.1990 d.57, effective February 5, 1990.
See: 21 N.J.R. 3345(b), 22 N.J.R. 350(b).

Reference to compliance with N.J. Underground Storage of Hazard-
ous Substances Act, and deletion of language excluding “public school
buildings” from definitions of “building” and “structure”.

Amended by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).

Industrialized/modular buildings added to definition of premanufac-
tured system.

Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a).

Definitions of certificate of approval, elevator and elevator subcode

official added.
Amended by R.1992 d.244, effective June 15, 1992.

See: 24 N.J.R. 1147(a), 24 N.J.R. 2243(a). '
Definitions added for Class I, IT and III structures.
Amended by R.1993 d.420, effective September 7, 1993.

See: 25 N.J.R. 2158(a), 25 N.J.R. 4072(a).

Amended by R.1993 d.580, effective November 15, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 3692(a), 25 N.J.R. 5145(c).
Administrative Correction.

See: 26 N.J.R. 2779(c).

Amended by R.1995 d.381, effective July 17, 1995.
See: 27 N.J.R. 970(a), 27 N.J.R. 2715(a).

Amended by R.1995 d.544, effective October 16, 1995.
See: 27 N.J.R. 2827(a), 27 N.J.R. 3933(a).

Amended by R.1996 d.190, effective April 15, 1996.
See: 28 N.J.R. 320(a), 28 N.J.R. 1981(a).

Added “construction documents”.

Amended by R.1996 d.236, effective May 20, 1996 (operative January 1,

1997).

See: 27 N.J.R. 4050(a), 28 N.J.R. 2586(a).
Amended by R.1996 d.323, effective July 15, 1996 (operative January 1,

1997).
See: 28 N.J.R. 2112(a), 28 N.J.R. 3549(a).
Amended by R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a).

Amended “Prior approvals” and “Subcode”.
Amended by R.1997 d.417, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 3387(a), 29 N.J.R. 4285(a).

Amended “Prior approvals” and “Public school facility”.
Amended by R.1998 d.28, effective January 5, 1998.

See: 29 N.J.R. 3603(a), 30 N.J.R. 129(a).

In list of definitions, added “Alteration”, “Change of use”, “Primary
function space”, “Reconstruction”, ‘“Rehabilitation”, “Renovation”,
“Repair”, “Tenancy”, “Use”, “Work area”.

Amended by R.1999 d.424, effective December 6, 1999.

. been

Supp. 12-15-03



5:23-1.4

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

See: 31 NL.ILR. 2428(a), 31 N.J.R. 4001(c).
Changed “Ordinary repair” definition to “Ordinary maintenance”.
Administrative change.
See: 34 N.J.R. 1022(a).
Amended by R.2003 d.216, effective May 19, 2003.
See: 35 N.J.R. 16(a), 35 N.J.R. 2203(a).
Deleted “Construction documents”; added “Plans and specifica-
tions”.
Amended by R.2003 d.473, effective December 15, 2003.
See: 35 N.J.R. 2421(a), 35 N.J.R. 5543(a).
Deleted “Major work”.

Case Notes

Citation to definitions of construction permit and certificate of
occupancy. Home Builders League of South Jersey, Inc. v. Evesham
Twp., 174 N.J.Super. 252, 416 A.2d 81 (Law Div.1980).

Citation to mobile home definition in former regulation (similar to
present manufactured home definition); mobile homes acceptable form
of moderate cost housing. Southern Burlington County N.A.A.C.P. v.
Twp. of Mt. Laurel, 161 N.J.Super. 317, 391 A.2d 935 (Law Div.1978)
affirmed in part, reversed in part 92 N.J. 158, 456 A.2d 390, on remand
207 N.J.Super 169, 504 A.2d 66.

Applicant for construction permit must provide assurances that nec-
essary prior approvals obtained. Riggins v. Pinelands Commission, 8
N.J.AR. 441 (1985).

5:23-1.5 Effective date

(a) The provisions of the regulations shall take effect on
January 1, 1977. All construction regulations incorporated
in any act of the State of New Jersey, or of any municipality
presently in effect, or validly promulgated or enacted by any
board, department, commission or agency thereof, shall
continue in effect until January 1, 1977, and shall thereafter
be superseded and of no further force and effect. Any law
or regulation addressing areas for which the commissioner
shall not have promulgated a subcode may continue in effect
until such time as a subcode therefor is adopted.

(b) Exceptions include:

1. This section shall not apply to those aspects of the
act which were capable of taking effect on the effective
date of the act.

2. This section shall not apply to those parts of
N.J.A.C. 5:23-4 which require the adoption of a resolu-
tion or other action prior to the effective date. Such
section shall take effect upon adoption.

3. This section shall not apply to laws or regulations
specifically saved by the act or the regulations.

5:23-1.6 Grace period
(a) For a period of six months following the operative

date of a subcode revision, applicants may submit a com- -

plete permit application, including all prior approvals, to be
reviewed under the code in force immediately preceding the
subcode revision. Provided that the application is complete,
the construction official and applicable subcode officials
shall perform the plan review and issue construction per-
mit(s) based on the code in force immediately prior to the
operative date of the subcode revision. This grace period
shall apply only to revisions of subcodes.

Supp. 12-15-03

(b) In the case of a project under review for which a
permit has not been issued on the operative date of any
subcode revision, review shall continue and permits shall be
issued based on the code in force immediately prior to the
operative date of the subcode revision.

As amended, R. 1978 d.350, eff. October 1, 1978.

See: 10 N.J.R. 378(a), 10 N.J.R. 469(f).

As amended, R.1984 d.267, eff. June 14, 1984 to expire August 13,
1984.

See: 16 N.J.R. 1812(a).
New (c) added.

Readoption: R.1984 d.382, eff. August 13, 1984, to expire April 1,
1988.

See: 16 N.J.R. 1812(a), 16 N.J.R. 2356(d).

Administrative Correction to (b): Changed “receive” to “received”.

See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b).

Amended by R.1993 d.353, effective July 19, 1993.

See: 25 N.JR. 1629(a), 25 N.J.R. 3147(a).

Amended by R.1995 d.544, effective October 16, 1995.

See: 27 N.J.R. 2827(a), 27 N.J.R. 3933(a).

Amended by R.1997 d.303, effective July 21, 1997.

See: 29 N.J.R. 1437(b), 29 N.J.R. 3247(a).
Amended section name; rewrote (a); and substantially amended (b).

5:23-1.7 Validity

(a) If any provision of the regulations or the application
thereof to any person or circumstances is held invalid, the
invalidity shall not effect other provisions or applications of
the regulations which can be given effect, and to this end
the provisions of the regulations are severable.

(b) Nothing contained in the act or the regulations shall
be deemed to affect, repeal, or invalidate local zoning
ordinances or the regulation or licensing of any trade or
profession engaged in construction work.

SUBCHAPTER 2. ADMINISTRATION AND
ENFORCEMENT; PROCESS

5:23-2.1 Title; scope; intent

(a) This part of the regulations, adopted pursuant to
authority of the State Uniform Construction Code Act, and
entitled “Administration and enforcement; process”, shall
be known and may be cited throughout the regulations as
N.J.A.C. 5:23-2, and when referred to in subchapter 2 of
this chapter, may be cited as this subchapter.

(b) Unless otherwise specifically provided, all references
to article or section numbers, or to provisions not specifical-
ly identified by number, shall be construed to refer to such
article, section or provision of this subchapter.

(c) Except as is otherwise specified, these regulations
shall control all matters concerning the construction, altera-
tion, addition, repair, removal, demolition, use, location and
occupancy of all buildings and structures and their service
equipment as herein defined, and shall apply to existing or
proposed buildings and structures in the State of New
Jersey.

23-8.0.2

O



N

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.8

1. A field evaluation label and report or letter issued
by a nationally recognized testing laboratory verifying that
the specific material, equipment, or method of construc-
tion meets the identified standards or has been tested and
found to be suitable for the intended use, shall be accept-
ed by the appropriate subcode official as meeting the
requirements of (a) above.

2. Reports of engineering findings issued by nationally
recognized evaluation service programs, such as, but not
limited to, the Building Officials and Code Administrators
(BOCA), the International Conference of Building Offi-
cials (ICBO), the Southern Building Code Congress Inter-
national (SBCCI), the International Code Council (ICC),
and the National Evaluation Service, Inc., shall be accept-
ed by the appropriate subcode official as meeting the
requirements of (a) above. The materials, equipment, or
assembly shall be installed in accordance with the condi-
tions specified in the report.

(b) Research and investigations: The appropriate sub-
code official shall require that sufficient technical data be
submitted to substantiate the proposed use of any material
or assembly, and if it is determined that the evidence
submitted is satisfactory proof of performance for the use
intended, he may approve its use subject to the require-
ments of the regulations. The cost of all tests, reports and
investigations required under these provisions shall be paid
by the applicant.

(c) Research reports: The appropriate subcode official
may accept, as supporting data to assist in this determina-
tion, duly authenticated research reports from approved
authoritative sources for all materials or assemblies pro-
posed for use which are not specifically provided for in the
regulations.

Amended by R.1992 d.390, effective October 5, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 1844(a), 24 N.J.R. 3515(b).
Reference to exception in 3.8 added.
Amended by R.2003 d.384, effective October 6, 2003.
See: 35 N.J.R. 2422(a), 35 N.J.R. 4712(a).
Rewrote (a).

5:23-3.8 Products violating the Code

(a) The Department shall, after public hearing and in
accordance with the Administrative Procedure Act (P.L.
1968, c.410, as amended), establish and distribute to all
enforcing agencies a list of items, devices and materials the
regular and intended use of which would violate any provi-
sion of the State Uniform Construction Code. A list of
such items is set forth in (d) below.

(b) Upon determining that any manufacturer or distribu-
tor in the State is selling or offering for retail sale any
product on the list which does not have a regular and
intended use that does not violate the Code, or any product
which may have one or more such non-violative regular and
intended use but which is being advertised or promoted for
a use that does violate the Code, the Department or any

23-37

enforcing agency having jurisdiction shall give written notice
of the violation of N.J.S.A. 52:27D-138a(5) to such seller.
Such notice shall forbid the further sale or offering for retail
sale of such product within the State and shall specify a date
and time by which such product shall be removed from
display to customers.

(c) Any person who, having received a notice of violation
pursuant to this section, continues to sell or offer for retail
sale products specified in such notice, shall be deemed to be
knowingly selling or offering the product for sale in violation
of the Code and shall be subject to penalty as provided by
statute, in accordance with the procedures set forth in
N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.31.

(d) The Commissioner has determined that the following
materials and supplies are not in conformance with the
State Uniform Construction Code:

1. Building materials and supplies:

1. Wood paneling being used as an interior finish
not in conformance with section 803.2 of the building
subcode. This section specifies that finish shall be
classified in accordance with ASTM E84;

ii. Carpeting used as an interior floor finish materi-
al not in conformance with section 805.2 of the building
subcode. This section specifies that interior floor finish
shall be classified in accordance with ASTM E648; and

2. Electrical materials/supplies:

i. As stated in the National Electric Code (sections
90-7, 110-2, 110-3, and 100), only products listed,
labeled, approved, and identified are acceptable. Ap-
proval is to be based on tests and listings of testing
laboratories such as Underwriters Laboratories Inc.
(UL), Factory Mutual (FM), or Canadian Standards
Association/Nationally Recognized Testing Laboratory
(CSA/NRTL), etc.

3. Plumbing materials/supplies:

1. All purpose solvent cement, except transition
glues permitted in the plumbing subcode;

ii. Clear PB piping;
iii. Flexible traps and tailpieces;

iv. Sheet and tubular copper and brass trap and
tailpiece fittings less than B & S 17 gauge (.045 in.);

v. Water closets requiring in excess of an average of
1.6 gallons per flush, that either have a manufacturer’s
date stamp of July 1, 1991 or later or were not pur-
chased by the distributor prior to July 1, 1991;

vi. Plumbing fixtures that do not meet the standards
listed in the plumbing subcode.

4. Miscellaneous materials and supplies:

Supp. 4-5-04



5:23-3.8

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

i. Portable unvented natural gas, liquified petro-
leum gas and kerosene heaters when offered for sale
for ws¢ in buildings for human occupancy, unless they
are tested, listed, labeled and certified by a nationally
recognized testing laboratory such as the American Gas
Association Laboratories (AGA), Underwriters Labora-
tories. Inc. (UL) or Factory Mutual (FM);

ii. Urea formaldehyde foam insulation, unless of-
fered for sale for use elsewhere than in buildings.

R.1983 d.296, effective August 1, 1983.
See: 15 N.J.R. 587(a), 15 N.J.R. 1247(a).
Amended by R.1985 d.38, effective February 19, 1985.
See: 16 N.J.R. 3074(a), 17 N.J.R. 421(a).
(d) added.
Amended by R.1987 d.374, effective September 21, 1987.
See: 19 N.J.R. 1024(a), 19 N.J.R. 1720(b).
(d)1i and ii: 904.2 was 1404.2; 904.3 was 1404.3.
Amended by R.1990 d.507, effective October 15, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 2208(a), 22 N.J.R. 3214(a).
Text conformed to BOCA National Code/1990.
Amended by R.1992 d.47, effective February 3, 1992.
See: 23 N.J.R. 3602(a), 24 N.J.R. 405(a).
Low volume water closet exception added at (d)4iii.
Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a).
Amended by R.1997 d.508, effective December 1, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 3762(a), 29 N.J.R. 5062(a).
In (d)2i, added reference to CSA/NRTL standards; in (d)3i, added
the exception for transition glues; and inserted (d)3vi.
Recodified from N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.8A by R.2003 d.384, effective October
6, 2003.
See: 35 N.J.R. 2422(a), 35 N.J.R. 4712(a).
Former N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.8, Department approval of nonconforming
materials, repealed.

5:23-3.9 Interpretations and opinions

(a) Whenever the Commissioner shall, in accordance with
applicable provisions of the Administrative Procedure Act,
make any rule constituting an interpretation of any provi-
sion of the regulations, such shall be binding provided,
however, that such interpretations shall be prospective in
nature. Such interpretations shall not alter the ruling of a
subcode official already rendered in a specific instance
relating to a specific permit or structure. Requests for
interpretations shall be in the form, and submitted in accor-
dance with the procedure, set forth in N.J.A.C. 5:2-2.

(b) In response to a written inquiry or request setting
forth a specific factual situation, or upon its own initiative,
the Construction Code Element may issue a formal techni-
cal opinion to clarify provisions of the adopted subcodes.
Such formal technical opinion shall be signed by the Assis-
tant Director of the Element and shall be binding upon the
Element and upon other code enforcement agencies and
licensed officials. Formal technical opinions shall be pro-
spective in nature, shall be based upon adopted subcodes or
upon authoritative test results or standards incorporated by
reference into an adopted subcode and shall not alter the
ruling of a licensed official already rendered in a specific
instance relating to a specific permit or structure, except
that any such formal technical opinion may be considered in
the context of an appeal from any such ruling.

Supp. 4-5-04

(c) The Construction Code Element may issue bulletins
to provide advice to code enforcing agencies, builders, and
designers. Bulletins may be issued when the Element finds
that an issue that is in need of clarification is adequately
dealt with by existing rules and that rulemaking is therefore
not appropriate or necessary. Consultation with the Code
Advisory Board shall be required prior to the issuance of
any bulletin.

(d) In response to a written or oral inquiry or request
setting forth a specific factual situation, a staff member of
the Construction Code Element may issue an informal
opinion as to the proper application of the regulations if the
issue is one with which he has authority to deal. Such
informal opinion shall only be in writing if it is issued in
response to a written inquiry or request and shall not be
binding upon the Element or any other party.

Amended by R.1981 d.454, effective December 7, 1981.
See: 13 N.J.R. 561(a), 13 N.J.R. 886(a).
Section substantially amended.
Administrative Correction: Name change.
See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b).
Amended by R.1995 d.340, effective June 19, 1995.
See: 27 N.J.R. 1512(a), 27 N.J.R. 2388(a).
Redesignated (c) as (d) and added a new (c).
Administrative correction.
See: 31 N.J.R. 4259(a).

5:23-3.10 (Reserved)

Amended by R.1987 d.509, effective December 7, 1987. \/ )
See: 19 N.JL.R. 1264(a), 19 N.J.R. 2270(a).
Substantially amended.
Amended by R.1990 d.507, effective October 15, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 2208(a), 22 N.J.R. 3214(a).
Text conformed to BOCA National Code/1990.
Recodified to 5:23-4.3A by R.1992 d.272, effective July 6, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 1446(a), 24 N.J.R. 2424(a).
Section was “Enforcing agency classification”.

5:23-3.11 Enforcement activities reserved to the
Department

(a) Except as otherwise provided in NJ.AC.
5:23-3.11A(b), the Department of Community Affairs shall
be the sole plan review agency for the following structures:

1. FElectrical generating stations and substations, in-
cluding nuclear;

2. Incineration plants;
3. Solid waste disposal plants;

4. Class I and Class II structures where required in
accordance with NJA.C. 5:23-43A and NJAC
5:23-4.24(a)2ii;

5. Casino hotels;

6. Public mausoleums, vaults, crypts and other struc- | |
tures intended to hold or contain human remains;

23-38



N

o~

o

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.11

7. All premanufactured systems for Class I and Class
II structures, other than those authorized to be approved
by an inplant inspection agency licensed to perform Class
I and Class II plan review as provided in N.J.A.C.
5:23-4A.10, and all on-site installation of Class I and
Class II premanufactured construction within the jurisdic-
tion of a local enforcing agency that is not a Class I or
Class II agency, as the case may be.

8. Health care facilities, as defined in N.J.A.C.

5:23-1.4;

9. Public school facilities, as defined in N.J.A.C.
5:23-1.4; and

10. Prototype plans intended for use in more than one
municipality.

(b) The Department of Community Affairs shall be the
sole plan review agency for elevators, escalators, and moving
walks in structures of Groups other than R-2, R-3, R4, or
R-5 in which the elevator devices are wholly within dwelling
units and not accessible to the general public, in all build-
ings and structures other than those that:

1. Are in a municipality that has an elevator subcode
official; and

2. Are otherwise within the plan review jurisdiction of
the local enforcing agency.

(c) A permit shall not be issued until the required plans
for the building or structure have been released by the
department. The Department shall insure that the municipal
enforcing agency receives a copy of the released plans.

1. Exception: In the case of a permit application
based upon prototype plans released by the Department,
it shall be the responsibility of the applicant to submit the
items listed at N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.15(e)2ii, including a refer-
ence set of plans, the prototype file identification number,
the plan number and date of the released prototype plan,
to the municipal enforcing agency.

(d) The department may perform field inspections for
any of the above projects when it deems such activity
appropriate. However, such action shall not relieve the
municipality of the obligation to perform field inspections
for any project for which the municipality has granted a
permit.

(e) Whenever the department shall determine that there
exists a violation of these regulations, it shall take appropri-
ate action and shall provide the municipality with copies of
all notices, orders, and other applicable information. The
department and any municipality may consolidate or take
other steps to expedite any matter of which they jointly
complain, but in no event shall the owner of any building
subject to the act be sanctioned twice for the same viola-
tions.

23-39

(f) In any case where the department shall notify a
municipality that a violation exists, no certificate of occu-
pancy may issue until the department notifies the municipal-
ity that the violation has been abated.

(g) The Department of Community Affairs shall be the
sole agency for the enforcement of the Barrier Free Recre-
ation Standards (N.J.A.C. 5:23-7.15 through 7.31). Any
complaint of noncompliance with these rules shall be for-
warded to the Department.

(h) The Department of Community Affairs shall be the
sole agency having authority to grant variations from the
requirements of the Asbestos Hazard Abatement Subcode,
pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-8.4.

(i) The Department of Community Affairs shall be the
sole agency for the enforcement of the Playground Safety
Subcode (N.J.A.C. 5:23-11) with regard to all matters not
within the scope of a construction permit issued by a local
enforcing agency; provided, however, that this subsection
shall not be construed as prohibiting the Department of
Education from including review of compliance with appli-
cable playground requirements in its ongoing district moni-
toring process.

(j) The Department shall be the sole enforcing agency for
the following work:

1. Amusement rides;

2. Ski lifts;

3. High pressure boilers;
4. Refrigeration systems;
5. Pressure vessels; and

6. Liquefied petroleum gas installations, except one-
and two-family residential (building subcode Use Groups
R-3 and R-5) or vapor delivery installations utilizing
containers with an aggregate water capacity of 2,000
gallons or less, which jurisdiction is retained by the munic-
ipal enforcing agency.

Amended by R.1981 d.455, effective December 7, 1981.
See: 13 N.J.R. 561(b), 13 N.J.R. 886(b).
Correction: Codification error and (a)6 was missing.
See: 16 N.J.R. 1621(a).
Administrative Change: This section has been divided into 3.11 and
3.11A administratively.
See: 18 N.J.R. 1842(a).
Amended by R.1988 d.352, effective August 1, 1988.
See: 19 N.J.R. 1270(a), 20 N.J.R. 1873(b).
Added (f).
Amended by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).
Industrialized/modular buildings requirements added to (a)7.
Amended by R.1990 d.507, effective October 15, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 2208(a), 22 N.J.R. 3214(a).
Text conformed to BOCA National Code/1990.
Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a).
Enforcement of elevator, moving walk and escalator requirements for
other than R-3 and R—4 reserved to Department.

Supp. 4-5-04



5:23-3.11

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Amended by R.1992 d.147, effective April 6, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 170(a), 24 N.J.R. 1397(a).

Elevators wholly within R-2 residences exempt.
Amended by R.1992 d.183, effective April 20, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 167(a), 24 N.J.R. 1475(b).

Enforcement of public employees’ indoor air quality subcode as-
signed to DCA.

Amended by R.1994 d.28, effective January 18, 1994.
See: 25 N.J.R. 4546(b), 26 N.J.R. 352(a).

Amended by R.1994 d.96, effective February 22, 1994.
See: 26 N.J.R. 1073(a).

Amended by R.1997 d.377, effective September 15, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 2741(b), 29 N.I.R. 4102(b).

In (g), amended N.J.A.C. references; deleted (g)1; and substantially
amended (h).

Amended by R.1997 d.417, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 3387(a), 29 N.J.R. 4285(a).

In (a), inserted “Except as otherwise provided ...
(a)8 and 9; and in (g), amended N.J.A.C. references.
Amended by R.1999 d.351, effective October 18, 1999.
See: 31 N.J.R. 1838(a), 31 N.J.R. 3082(a).

Added (i).

Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April 17, 2000.
See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a).

In (a), changed N.J.A.C. reference; and added (j).
Amended by R.2001 d.127, effective April 16, 2001.
See: 33 N.J.R. 392(a), 33 N.J.R. 1195(a).

In (g), amended the N.J.A.C. reference.

Amended by R.2001 d.141, effective May 7, 2001.
See: 32 N.J.R. 3917(a), 33 N.J.R. 746(a), 33 N.J.R. 1399(d).

In (j)6, inserted “or vapor delivery installations utilizing containers
with an aggregate water capacity of 2,000 gallons or less,” following
“(building subcode Use Group R-3/R-4)”.

Amended by R.2004 d.67, effective February 17, 2004.
See: 35 N.J.R. 4627(a), 36 N.I.R. 949(b).

In (b), substituted “moving walks in structures of Groups other than
R-2, R-3, R4, or R-5" for “moving walks in Use Groups R-3, R—4, or
R-2 structures” preceding “in which the elevator devices are wholly
within dwelling units”.

Amended by R.2004 d.144, effective April 5, 2004.
See: 35 N.J.R. 4944(a), 36 N.J.R. 1753(a).

Added (a)10; in (c), substituted “released” for “approved” following
“enforcing agency receives a copy of the” and added 1.

Administrative correction.
See: 36 N.J.R. 1757(a).

and (d),”; added

Case Notes

Delaware River Port Authority was not subject to Construction Code
or anti-discrimination laws. Eastern Paralyzed Veterans Ass’n, Inc. v.
City of Camden, 111 N.J. 389, 545 A.2d 127 (1988).

5:23-3.11A Public school facility plan review and
inspections; Uniform Construction Code
enhancements in public school facilities

(a) Plan review for the following types of projects shall be
performed by the Department of Community Affairs. Prior
to the release of plans for the following types of projects,
the Department of Education shall ensure that the plans
meet the standards for educational adequacy set forth in
N.J.A.C. 6A:26:

1. New public school buildings, including the creation
of a new public school building through the change of use
of an existing building;

2. Additions to existing public school buildings;

Supp. 4-5-04

3. Alterations changing the total number of instruc-
tional spaces, the size of any such spaces or type of any
such spaces;

4. Installations of mobile units; or

5. Any site or building change or alteration for the
purpose of making the site and school barrier-free pursu-
ant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-7 and accessible to the handicapped
pursuant to section 504 of the Federal Rehabilitation Act
of 1973.

(b) In lieu of obtaining construction code plan review and
release from the Department of Community Affairs, a
school district, upon notice to and approval by the Depart-
ment, may secure construction code plan review and release
from a municipal code enforcing agency, pursuant to P.L.
1990, c.23.

1. The municipal code enforcing agency providing
construction code plan approval must agree to perform
the review and must be appropriately classified for the
proposed project in accordance with this chapter.

i. The municipal code enforcing agency in the mu-
nicipality where the proposed project is to take place
shall be given the right of first refusal to review the
plans provided that the agency is appropriately classi-
fied for the proposed project in accordance with this
chapter.

2. The municipal code enforcing agency performing
the construction code plan review may require the pay-
ment of any municipal plan review fees.

3. No construction permit shall be issued for a public
school facility unless and until the final plans and specifi-
cations have been released by the Department or an
appropriately classified municipal code enforcing agency.

4. The municipal code enforcing agency within the
jurisdiction in which the facility is located shall be respon-
sible for construction permit issuance, construction in-
spection and certificate of occupancy issuance.

5. Amendments to released plans and specifications
for reasons other than educational adequacy shall be
submitted for review and release to the Department or
the municipal code enforcing agency, whichever originally
released the plans.

6. Release of the plans by the Department or the
municipal code enforcing agency, as the case may be, shall
not preclude the enforcing agency doing the inspection
from issuing a stop work order in the event of a violation
of the code. The enforcing agency doing the inspection
shall not, however, issue a stop work order based on its
disagreement with the released plans unless the agency
that released the plans, be it the Department or another
local enforcing agency, agrees that the issuance of such an
order is appropriate. In the event that the enforcing
agency doing the inspection believes there to be an error
in the plans, that enforcing agency shall give prompt
notice of the error that is believed to exist to the Depart-
ment or the municipal agency that reviewed the plans, as
the case may be.

23-40

®,

»



N

77N
KA\ .

N

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.11A

(c) The Department or the municipal code enforcing
agency providing construction code plan release or inspec-
tion shall be responsible for enforcing the following Uni-
form Construction Code enhancements in public school
facilities:

1. An automatic fire detection system shall be install-
ed in all new buildings of Group E (educational), in
accordance with National Fire Protection Association
standard 72. The system shall utilize:

i. Combination fixed-temperature and rate of rise
devices in classrooms and other spaces not covered in
(c)1ii below;

ii. Devices to detect abnormal visible smoke densi-
ties or gaseous products of combustion in corridors and
exit stairs;

iii. An automatic fire suppression system and, in
areas where suppression is deleted, automatic detection
devices; or

iv. A combination of the above three types of detec-
tion devices except that a fixed-temperature detector
shall be permitted in approved locations, such as in a
boiler room or incinerator.

2. Manual fire alarm boxes, in addition to require-
ments from Section 907.3 of the building subcode, shall be

Next Page is 23-43

23-41

provided in the natural path of escape from fire, near
each exterior door from the corridor, kitchen, heater
room and other exits that are required to serve 50 or
more persons. Additional fire alarm boxes shall be located
in the main office, stage, at each stairway entrance from a
corridor or place of assembly and near one exterior exit in
each section of a place of assembly. It shall not be
necessary to traverse more than 200 feet of unobstructed
horizontal distance on the same floor in order to reach a
fire alarm box.

3. [Each instructional space and room of assembly
which is illuminated with the use of high intensity dis-
charge (HID) sources, such as mercury vapor, high
pressure sodium and metal halide lamps, shall also be
provided with a second source of illumination to pro-
vide illumination instantly upon activation of the circuit.
All high intensity discharge (HID) lamps shall be of the
fail-safe type which will permanently extinguish within
15 minutes after the outer glass of the bulb is broken.
All lamps shall be provided with a glass or plastic lens
to protect the bulb.

4. All school buildings shall be equipped with a me-
chanical air supply and exhaust ventilation system which
will provide, during periods of occupancy, standard tem-
pered outdoor air supply and mechanical exhaust at the
minimum rates set forth in the mechanical subcode.

Supp. 4-5-04



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.11B

(d) Pursuant to Reorganization Plan No. 114-1996, the
Department or the municipal code enforcing agency shall
have authority to enforce and cite violations of N.J.A.C.
6A:26-6.2.

Amended by R.1986 d.142, effective May 5, 1986.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1169(a), 18 N.J.R. 945(a).

New (a)7; old (a)7 through 9 renumbered (a)8.-10.

Administrative' Change: This section was originally part of NJ.A.C.
5:23-3.11.

See: 18 N.J.R. 1842(a).

Amended by R.1988 d.155, effective April 4, 1988.

See: 20 N.J.R. 824(d).

Added (d). This was amended by the rule adoption of the Depart-
ment of Education published in the New Jersey Register at 20 N.J.R.
824(d).

Administrative Correction to (c).

See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b).

Amended by R.1990 d.507, effective October 15, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 2208(a), 22 N.J.R. 3214(a).

Text conformed to P.L. 1990, c.23, qualified agencies may perform
plan review of public school structures.

Amended by R.1991 d.309, effective June 17, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 1084(a), 23 N.J.R. 1922(a).

Rule conformed to P.L. 1990 c. 23; text at (c) revised to specify type
of project covered; BOCA cites updated; reference to NJ.A.C. 6:22
added.

Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a).

Amended by R.1997 d.417, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 3387(a), 29 N.J.R. 4285(a).

Deleted (a); recodified former (b) through (e) as (a) through (d); in
(b), Inserted “Prior to the release ... of projects,”; in (b)1 and 2,
inserted “public” preceding “school buildings”; in (c)7, deleted option
of inspecting agency requiring subsequent correction of any errors in
the plans, inserted second sentence, and in third sentence amended
notice provisions.

Amended by R.1998 d.332, effective July 6, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 1377(a), 30 N.J.R. 2421(b).

In (d), substituted “alarm” for “detection”, changed BOCA reference
and substituted a reference to (d)5ii for a reference to (e)5ii in 5, and
changed BOCA in 6.

Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April 17, 2000.
See: 31 N.JR. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a).

Rewrote the section.

Amended by R.2001 d.127, effective April 16, 2001.
See: 33 N.J.R. 392(a), 33 N.J.R. 1195(a).

In ()3, substituted “instructional spaces, the size of any such spaces”
for “units” and substituted “such” for * instructional”.
Administrative change.

See: 33 N.J.R. 4101(a).
Amended by R.2004 d.68, effective February 17, 2004.
See: 35 N.J.R. 4630(a), 36 N.J.R. 952(a).

In (b), inserted “and approval by” following “upon notice to” and
substituted “a” for “any” preceding “municipal code” in the introducto-
ry paragraph and added 1i; in (c), rewrote the introductory paragraph
of 1, substituted a reference to the building subcode for a reference to
BOCA/96 section 918.5 in 2 and substituted a reference to the mechani-
cal subcode for a reference to the BOCA National Mechanical Code in
4.

5:23-3.11B Underground storage tank systems

(a) The installation, repair (other than “minor repair,” as
defined in N.J.A.C. 7:14B-10.5), and closure (or “demoli-
tion”) of underground storage tank systems, as defined in
N.J.A.C. 7:14B-10.1, shall be controlled by the State Uni-
form Construction Code and by N.J.A.C. 7:14B-1 through
15.

(b) A DEP permit for the installation, repair or closure
of an underground storage tank system that requires a DEP
approval, or any part thereof, or an emergency permit
granted pursuant to N.J.A.C. 7:14B, shall be a prior approv-
al for any permit application submitted pursuant to the
State Uniform Construction Code Act and these rules.
Applicants installing secondarily contained systems for
which no prior DEP approval is necessary shall be required
to submit engineering drawings of the secondarily contained
systems and to certify that the underground storage tank
system meets all requirements of N.J.A.C. 7:14B.

(c) Construction code officials shall retain all penalty
powers, as set forth in these rules, with respect to the
installation, usage or closure (demolition) of underground
storage tank systems and parts thereof in violation of the
State Uniform Construction Code Act or these rules.

(d) The following types of underground storage tank
systems requiring a construction permit are exempt from the
requirements of N.J.A.C. 7:14B:

1. Farm or residential tanks of 1,100 gallons or less
capacity used for storing motor fuel for noncommercial
purposes;

2. Tanks with a capacity of 2,000 gallons or less used
to store heating oil for onsite consumption in a nonresi-
dential building;

3. Tanks used to store heating oil for onsite consump-
tion in a residential building;

4. Septic tanks installed in compliance with rules
adopted by DEP pursuant to P.L. 1954, c.199 (N.J.S.A.
58:11-23 et seq.);

5. Tanks situated in an underground area, including,
but not limited to, basements, cellars, mines, drift shafts,
or tunnels, if the storage tank is situated upon or above
the surface of the floor;

6. Tanks situated in an underground area, including,
but not limited to, basements, cellars, mines, drift shafts,
or tunnels, if the storage tank is equipped with secondary
containment and is uncovered so as to allow visual inspec-
tion of the exterior of the tank;

7. Wastewater treatment tanks;
8. Electrical equipment;
9. Hydraulic lift tanks; and

10. Any pipes, lines, fixtures, or other equipment con-
nected to any tank exempted from the provisions of
N.J.A.C. 7:14B as set forth in (b)1 to 9 above.

New Rule, R.1990 d.562, effective November 19, 1990.
See: 22 NJ.R. 2629(c), 22 N.J.R. 3482(d).
Amended by R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a).
In (d)3, deleted maximum capacity for tanks of 2000 gallons.
Amended by R.1998 d.332, effective July 6, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 1377(a), 30 N.J.R. 2421(b).

23-43 Supp. 2-17-04



5:23-3.11B

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

In (d)3, deleted “with a capacity of 2000 gallons or less” foilowing
“Tanks”. ‘

5:23-3.12 Amended rules

Whenever the Commissioner shall make any modifica-
tions to the rules, notice of same shall be published in the
New Jersey Register.

Amended by R.1995 d.544, effective October 16, 1995.
See: 27 N.J.R. 2827(a), 27 N.J.R. 3933(a).
Amended by R.2000 d.413, effective October 16, 2000.
See: 32 N.J.R. 2278(a), 32 N.J.R. 3783(a).

Rewrote the section.

ii. The IBC/2000, as amended, may be known and
cited as the “building subcode.”

2. Any references to the mechanical code, plumbing
code, International Residential Code, ICC Al117.1 stan-
dard (including reference to Chapter 11) or the ICC
Electrical Code listed in Chapter 35 shall be considered a
reference to the appropriate adopted mechanical, plumb-
ing, one- and two-family dwelling or electrical subcode
referenced in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3 or to the barrier free
subcode, N.J.A.C. 5:23-7, as appropriate.

(b) The following chapters of the building subcode are

modified as follows:

5:23-3.13 State-sponsored code change proposals

(a) Any municipality, other political subdivision, or agen-
cy of the State seeking to submit a “State-sponsored code
change proposal” shall do so not less than 90 days prior to
the code change meeting of the model code adoption agency
for which the amendment is proposed.

(b) Such proposal shall be on a form provided by the
model code organization where one is available. If none is
available, such proposal shall state the name and address of
the official proposing the code change, the agency or politi-
cal subdivision represented, the text of the amendment
suggested and an explanation of the amendment together
with any technical justification deemed necessary by the
proponents.

(c) A hearing shall thereafter be held in accordance with
N.J.S.A. 52:27D-124 of the Act.

(d) Copies of the submitted applications for code change
proposals, transcripts of hearings on such applications and
State-sponsored code change proposals as adopted, shall be
available from the department at a fee of $.50 per page.

(e) Whenever a model code change hearing is scheduled
so as not to permit adequate time to meet the procedures
set forth in this section and in N.J.S.A. 52:27D-124 of the
Act, the Commissioner may hold a hearing and require the
advice of the code advisory board within a lesser time
period, as the situation dictates.

5:23-3.14 Building subcode

(a) Rules concerning the building subcode are as follows:

1. Pursuant to authority of P.L. 1975, c.217, as modi-
fied by P.L. 1996, .53, the Commissioner hereby adopts
the model code of the International Code Council, Inter-
national Building Code, known as the “IBC/2000.” This
code is hereby adopted by reference as the building
subcode for New Jersey subject to the modifications
stated in (b) below.

i. Copies of this code may be obtained from the
International Code Council at 4051 West Flossmoor
Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois 60478-5795.

Supp. 2-17-04 23-44

1. Chapter 1, Administration, shall be deleted in its
entirety. In addition, any referenced section of Chapter 1
shall be deleted throughout the code and “the administra-
tive provisions of the Uniform Construction Code
(N.J.A.C. 5:23)” shall be inserted.

2. Chapter 2, Definitions, shall be amended as fol-
lows:

i. The definition of “addition,” shall be deleted.

ii. In the definition of agricultural buildings, “A
structure qualifying under the Uniform Construction
Code definition of a Commercial Farm Building may be
built according to the regulations at N.J.A.C.
5:23-3.2(d)” shall be inserted after the last sentence.

iii. The definition of “alteration” shall be deleted.

iv. The definition of “building” shall be deleted and
the following shall be inserted: “BUILDING. A struc-
ture enclosed with exterior walls or fire walls, built,
erected and framed of component structural parts, de-
signed for the housing shelter, enclosure and support of
individuals, animals or property of any kind. When used
herein, building and structure shall be interchangeable
except where the context clearly indicates otherwise.”

v. The definition of “building line” shall be deleted.

vi. The definition of ‘“building official” shall be
deleted and the following shall be inserted: “BUILD-
ING SUBCODE OFFICIAL. A qualified person ap-
pointed by the municipal appointing authority or the
commissioner pursuant to the act and the regulations to
enforce the provisions of the building subcode within
the jurisdiction of the enforcing agency.”

vii. The definitions of “existing structure,” “historic
building,” and “jurisdiction” shall be deleted.

viii. The definition of “owner” shall be deleted and
the following shall be inserted: “OWNER. The owner
or owners in fee of the property of a lesser estate
therein, a mortgagee or vendee in possession, an assign-
ee of rents, receiver, executor, trustee, lessee or any
other person, firm or corporation, directly or indirectly
in control of a building, structure or real property and
shall include any subdivision thereof of the State.”

Next Page is 23-44.1

O

C



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.14

ix. The definitions of “permit,” “person,” and “re-
pair” shall be deleted.

x. The definition of “structure” shall be deleted and
the following shall be inserted: “STRUCTURE. A com-
bination of materials to form a construction for occu-

Next Page is 23-45 23-44.1

pancy, use, or ornamentation, whether installed on,
above, or below the surface of a parcel of land; provid-
ed the word ”structure shall be construed when used
herein as though followed by the phrase “or part or
parts thereof and all equipment therein“ unless the
context clearly requires a different meaning.

Supp. 2-17-04



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.22

See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a).

In (c)4, substituted “more pressure than would be exerted by back-
fill” for “lateral pressure from soils” following “subject to” in ii, and
substituted “drainage” for “designated disposal” preceding “system”
and added “according to the Unified Soil Classification System, Group
I Soils” at the end of iii; and inserted (c)9iv.

Amended by R.2001 d.369, effective October 15, 2001.
See: 33 N.JR. 2365(a), 33 N.J.R. 3674(a).

In (b), inserted “that are” following “type 5B construction”, “no
more” preceding “than 4,800 square feet”, and substituted “seven feet”
for “7% feet (2,235 mm.)”.

Amended by R.2003 d.187, effective May 5, 2003.
See: 34 N.J.R. 4248(a), 35 N.J.R. 1939(c).

Rewrote the section.

Amended by R.2003 d.420, effective November 3, 2003.

Next Page is 23-59

23-57

See: 34 N.J.R. 4248(a), 35 N.J.R. 5073(a).
Rewrote (c).

5:23-3.22 Fuel gas subcode

(a) Rules concerning the subcode adopted are as follows:

1. Pursuant to authority of P.L. 1975, ¢.217, the Com-
missioner hereby adopts the model code of the Interna-
tional Code Council, Inc.,, known as the International
Fuel Gas Code/2000. This code is hereby adopted by
reference as the Fuel Gas Subcode for the State of New
Jersey subject to the modifications stated in (b) below.

Supp. 11-3-03



~_

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.22

1. Copies of this code may be obtained from BOCA
International, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country
Club Hills, Illinois 60478-5795.

ii. The International Fuel Gas Code/2000 may be
known and cited as the “fuel gas subcode.”

2. Any references to the International Building Code,
International Plumbing Code, ICC Electrical Code, Inter-
national Fire Code or the International Energy Conserva-
tion Code listed in Chapter 7 shall be considered a
reference to the appropriate adopted building, plumbing,
electrical, BOCA National Fire Prevention Code-1996 or
energy subcode in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.

3. Anywhere the term “code” appears, shall be a
reference to “subcode” as defined in N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4 for
any of the adopted national model codes as appropriate.

(b) The following chapters, sections or pages of the Inter-
national Fuel Gas Code/2000 are amended as follows:

1. Chapter 1 of the fuel gas subcode, entitled “Admin-
istration” is deleted in its entirety.

2. Chapter 2 of the fuel gas subcode, entitled “Defini-
tions,” is amended as follows:

i. Section 201.3 is amended to delete the words
“International Building Code, ICC Electrical Code,
International Fire Code, International Plumbing Code,”
and in lieu thereof substitute “building, electrical, fire
protection, and plumbing subcodes.”

ii. The definition of the term “alteration” is deleted
and the definition found in N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4 is substi-
tuted;

iii. The definition of the term “approved” is delet-
ed;

iv. The definition of the term “code” is deleted;

v. The definition of the term “code official” is
deleted, and the following language is substituted: “For
the purpose of the fuel gas subcode, the term “code
official” shall mean the appropriate subcode official as
designated in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.4.”

3

vi. The definition of the term “unlisted boiler” is

deleted.

3. Chapter 3 of the fuel gas subcode, entitled “Gener-
al Regulations,” is amended as follows:

i. Section 301.1 is amended to delete the words “in
accordance with Section 101.2.”

ii. Section 301.3 is amended to delete the words “in
accordance with Section 105” on lines 2 and 4.

iii. Section 301.9 is deleted.

iv. Section 305.1. Delete the second paragraph in its
entirety.

23-59

v. Section 306.2 is amended to delete the dimension
35 and substitute 36.

vi. Section 307.1 is amended to delete “approved
plumbing fixture” on line 3 and insert the following:
“drywell, sump pump, floor drain, or drainage system
below floor.”

vii. Section 307.2 is deleted.

viii. Section 308.3 is amended to delete the words
“308.3.1 through 308.3.6” and substitute in licu thereof
“308.3.1, 308.3.2 and 308.3.4 through 308.3.6.”

ix. Section 308.3.3 is deleted.

X. Section 308.4 is amended to delete the words
“308.4.1 through 308.4.8” on line 3 and substitute in
lieu thereof “308.4.1 through 308.4.6 and 308.4.8.”

xi. Section 308.4.7 is deleted.
xii. Section 308.4.8. Delete “or 308.4.7” on line 2.

4. Chapter 4 of the fuel gas subcode, entitled “Gas
Piping Installation,” is amended as follows:

1. Section 401.2 is amended to add the following:
“Delete in its entirety Section 3-2.5 “Installation of
Containers on Roofs of Buildings” in NFPA—58, 1998
Edition.” Installation of LP-Gas containers on roofs of
buildings shall be strictly prohibited.

ii. Section 403.3 is deleted.

5. Chapter 5 of the fuel gas code, entitled “Chimneys
and Vents,” is amended as follows:

i. Section 503.5.6 is amended to replace the words
“cleaned and free of obstructions” with the words
“inspected in accordance with the chimney certification
program as provided for in NJ.A.C. 5:23-2.20(c).”

ii. Section 503.5.6, exception: Delete the exception
in its entirety.

6. Chapter 6 of the fuel gas code, entitled “Specific
Appliances” is amended as follows:

i. Section 622.2 is deleted.
ii. Section 622.3 is deleted.
ili. Section 626.10 is deleted.

7. Chapter 7 of the fuel gas code, entitled “Refer-
enced Standards,” is amended as follows:

i. Under the heading “Codes,” amend the following
titles:

(1) Delete
Code.”

(2) Delete “TFC-2000 International Fire Code”
and substitute the following: “BOCA National Fire
Prevention Code/1996.”

“IBC-2000 International Building

Supp. 2-18-03



5:23-3.22

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

(3) Delete “IECC-2000 International Energy Con-
servation Code.” '

(4) Delete “IPC-2000 International
Code.”

(5) Delete “IEC-2000 Electrical Code.”

Plumbing

8. Appendices A, B, and C of the fuel gas subcode are
informative and are not part of the subcode itself.

New Rule, R.2001 d.196, effective June 18, 2001.
See: 33 N.J.R. 6(a), 33 N.J.R. 2090(a).
Administrative correction.

See: 33 N.J.R. 3310(a).

SUBCHAPTER 3A. STATE-JURISDICTION
SUBCODES

5:23-3A.1 Scope

This subchapter shall govern the enforcement by the
Department of Community Affairs of the State Uniform
Construction Code, in conjunction with other rules adminis-
tered by the Department, in facilities and installations for
which the Department is the sole enforcing agency, as set
forth in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.11(j).

5:23-3A.2 Subcodes established

(a) All provisions of adopted model codes that are appli-
cable to the construction, alteration, installation, erection or
demolition of carnival-amusement rides or ski lifts shall be
designated collectively as the amusement ride subcode.

(b) All provisions of adopted model codes that are appli-
cable to the construction, alteration, installation, erection or
demolition of high pressure boilers, pressure vessels or
refrigeration systems shall be designated collectively as the
boiler, pressure vessel and refrigeration subcode.

(c) The amusement ride subcode and the boiler, pressure
vessel and refrigeration subcode shall be known, and may be
designated, as “State-jurisdiction subcodes.”

SUBCHAPTER 4. ENFORCING AGENCIES;
DUTIES; POWERS; PROCEDURES

5:23-4.1 Title; scope; intent

(a) This subchapter, adopted pursuant to authority of the
State Uniform Construction Code Act and entitled “Enforc-
ing agencies; duties; powers; procedures”, shall be known
and may be cited through the regulation as N.J.A.C.
5:23-4,” and when referred to in this part of the regulations,
may be cited as “this subchapter”.

Supp. 2-18-03

23-60

(b) Unless otherwise specifically provided, all references
to article or section numbers or to provisions not specifically
identified by number, shall be construed to refer to such
article, section or provision of this subchapter.

(c) This subchapter and N.J.A.C. 5:234A, 4B, 4C shall
control matters related to: the structure, organization, and
procedures of municipal, State, and interlocal enforcing
agencies; their interrelationships; the structure, organiza-
tion, and procedures of boards of appeal; the approval of
premanufactured construction; private enforcing agencies;
and the establishment of fees.

(d) This subchapter seeks to provide an efficient adminis-
trative structure for enforcing agencies and boards of ap-
peal, through which delay in the construction process can be
reduced, uniformity of systems and procedures encouraged,
and the public health and safety protected. Such intent
shall be given full effect in the construction of any specific
provision of this subchapter.

Amended by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).

Reference to subchapter 4A added to (c).
Amended by R.1994 d.96, effective February 22, 1994..
See: 26 N.J.R. 1073(a).

Law Review and Journal Commentaries

Municipal employees—Construction Code Officials. Judith Nallin,
135 N.J.L.J. No. 14, 50 (1993).

Case Notes

Citation to former N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.9 on enforcement. Newark
Health Welfare Dept. v. Rogers, 179 N.J.Super. 389, 432 A.2d 135
(Ch.Div.1981).

City must proceed against property through its own ordinances rather
than seek common law public nuisance injunction where no local board
of health established and nuisance not proven. Newark Health &
Welfare Dept. v. Rogers, 179 N.J.Super. 389, 432 A.2d 135 (Ch.Div.
1981).

5:23-4.2 Matters covered; exceptions

(a) Except as otherwise provided in subsection (b) below,
the provisions of this subchapter shall apply to all agencies
with an enforcement responsibility under the act and regula-
tions.

(b) Rules concerning exceptions are:

1. Interstate agencies: This subchapter shall not apply
to agencies created by Interstate Compact. Such agencies
shall administer and enforce the subcodes, under such
rules and regulations as they may develop, pursuant to
authority of the State Uniform Construction Code Act,
and any other applicable law of this State.

2. Department of Education:

Next Page is 23-60.1



NS

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-4.3

i. When final plans for the construction or altera-
tion of a public school facility have been submitted to
the Department of Education, and approved under the
standards for educational adequacy set forth at
N.J.A.C. 6A:26, and have been submitted for review to,
and released by, either the Department of Community
Affairs or a construction official of an enforcing agency,
such plans shall be filed with the enforcing agency of
the municipality in which the public school facility is
located.

ii. The enforcing agency shall inspect any construc-
tion or alteration of a public school facility in the same
manner as any other building or structure subject to the
code for the purpose of determining if there are any
violations of the educational enhancement and adequa-
cy requirements as set forth at NJ.A.C. 5:23-3.11A(c)
and (d) or any other provision of the State Uniform
Construction Code.

(c) Rules concerning matters not specifically provided for
are:

1. Any type or class of enforcing agency or board of
appeals, the procedures of which are developed in this
subchapter, may individually adopt further rules for their
internal governance, not inconsistent with any specific
provision of this subchapter, or with its stated intent.

Amended by R.1991 d.309, effective June 17, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 1084(a), 23 N.J.R. 1922(a).

Rule conformed to P.L. 1990 ¢.23; reference to N.J.A.C. 6:22 added.
Amended by R.1997 d.417, effective October 6, 1997.

See: 29 N.J.R. 3387(a), 29 N.J.R. 4285(a).

In (b)2i, substituted “educational adequacy” for “facility adequacy”,
inserted “either the Department or” preceding “a construction official”’;
and substantially amended (b)2ii.

Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April 17, 2000.

See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a).
Rewrote (b)2ii.

Administrative change.

See: 34 N.J.R. 1022(a).

5:23-4.3 Municipal enforcing agencies—establishment
(a) Notice of intention to establish:

Next Page is 23-61

23-60.1

1. Any municipality seeking to establish and operate
an enforcing agency, pursuant to the act and the regula-
tions, shall first notify the department of its intent to
establish such an agency by registered and certified mail,
return receipt requested, not later than one month prior
to the effective date of the regulations. Such notice, in
the form of a resolution of the governing body, shall state
that enforcement will be carried out either by the munici-
pal enforcing agency or by interlocal agreement. The
resolution shall also state the extent to which the munici-
pality anticipates that private on-site agencies will be
utilized. The resolution shall state the address of the
enforcing agency and the board of appeals, if different.
Such resolution shall additionally state whether a board of
appeals will be appointed within the municipality, whether
an intermunicipal joint board of appeals will be estab-
lished or whether appeals will be left to the jurisdiction of
the county.

2. Any municipality which shall not choose to estab-
lish and operate an enforcing agency pursuant to the act
and the regulations shall notify the department of this
intent by registered or certified mail, return receipt re-
quested, not later than one month prior to the effective
date of the regulations. Such notice, in the form of a
resolution of the governing body, shall state that the
governing body requests that the department assume the
task of administration and enforcement.

3. A municipality may, by resolution, provide for the
employment of an elevator subcode official, licensed in
accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-5, to perform inspections
and witness tests within its jurisdiction. If a municipality
fails to employ such an official by July 1, 1992, the
Department shall have exclusive jurisdiction to review
plans and witness tests for, and inspect elevators within,
the municipality. Thereafter, a municipality may acquire
such jurisdiction by enacting the necessary resolution and
employing an elevator subcode official, but the transfer of
jurisdiction to the municipality shall not be effective until
120 calendar days after a certified copy of the resolution
is received by the Department.

Supp. 2-18-03






UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-4.19

iv. As soon as practical after the conclusion of such
a hearing, the commissioner shall make a finding and
determination as to whether the fee schedule in ques-
tion, as a whole or in any of its parts, conforms or fails
to conform to the standards established in this section.

2. In addition to any other actions that he may take
upon determining that the fees established by a munici-
pality fail to meet the standards of this section, the
commissioner may order the repayment of the excess
amount of such fees to the persons who have paid them.

(j) Fees to be charged by municipalities where private on-
site inspection and plan review agencies carry out subcode
official responsibilities shall not exceed the amounts to be
paid to those private agencies for those services, pursuant to
the contract between the private agency and the municipali-
ty, by more than 15 percent.

(k) The fee charged for the annual electrical inspection
of swimming pools, spas or hot tubs shall be a flat fee and
the amount of the fee shall be set to cover the costs.

Amended by R.1984 d.260, effective July 2, 1984.
See: 16 N.J.R. 3(a), 16 N.J.R. 1714(c).

Section substantially amended.

Amended by R.1985 d.351, effective July 15, 1985.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1029(a), 17 N.J.R. 1756(b).

Old (a)4 deleted and new text substituted.
Amended by R.1986 d.213, effective June 16, 1986.
See: 17 N.J.R. 2490(a), 18 N.J.R. 1266(a).

Added text to (a)4 “annual permit-fees shall be non-refundable” and
(a)5 “Prior to the issuance of the annual permit” and “Bureau of
Construction Code Enforcement.”

Emergency amendment, R.1989 d.405, effective July 3, 1989 (expires

September 1, 1989).

See: 21 N.J.R. 2127(b).

Minor technical changes made throughout section.

Adopted concurrent proposal, R.1989 d.512, effective September 1,

1989 (operative January 1, 1990 for 4.18(c)-(e)).

See: 21 N.J.R. 2127(a), 21 N.J.R. 3086(a).

Provisions of emergency amendment R.1989 d.405 readopted with
change.

Added sections (c)4; (k)liv and v.

Deleted sections (¢), “Removal permit fees”; (I)1ii, “Fire subcode”;
and (/)4, “Elevator fees ...”, with renumbering and recodification.
Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991.

See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a).

Uniform flat fees for elevators to be set forth in ordinance and

schedule.
Amended by R.1992 d.230, effective June 1, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 168(a), 24 N.J.R. 2052(a).
Form numbers changed in (a)5.
Amended by R.1992 d.313, effective August 3, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 1846(a), 24 N.J.R. 2712(b).
No inspection fee for gas service entrances.
Amended by R.1993 d.187, effective May 3, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 624(a), 25 N.J.R. 1875(a).
Added (c)5.
Amended by R.1993 d.353, effective July 19, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 1629(a), 25 N.J.R. 3147(a).
Amended by R.1993 d.665, effective December 20, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 4548(a), 25 N.J.R. 5928(a).
Amended by R.1994 d.96, effective February 22, 1994.
See: 25 N.J.R. 5388(a), 26 N.J.R. 1073(a).
Amended by R.1994 d.323, effective July 5, 1994 (operative January 1,

19953).

See: 25 N.J.R. 2162(a), 26 N.J.R. 2780(a).
Amended by R.1995 d.381, effective July 17, 1995.

23-81

See: 27 NJ.R. 970(a), 27 N.J.R. 2715(a).
Amended by R.1995 d.475, effective September 5, 1995 (operative
January 1, 1996).
See: 27 N.J.R. 1716(a), 27 N.J.R. 3325(a).
In (a)(5) added individuals to be trained and registered.
Amended by R.1995 d.476, effective September 5, 1995 (operative
January 1, 1996).
See: 27 N.J.R. 1846(a), 27 N.J.R. 3325(b).
Rewrote (f) and (g).
Amended by R.1995 d.603, effective November 20, 1995 (operative
March 20, 1996).
See: 27 NJ.R. 2655(a), 27 N.J.R. 4699(a).
Amended by R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 NJ.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a).
Amended by R.1997 d.418, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 3402(a), 29 N.J.R. 4286(a).
In (c)5, inserted reference plumbing inspector.
Amended by R.2000 d.47, effective February 7, 2000.
See: 31 N.J.R. 2314(a), 32 N.J.R. 443(a).
Rewrote (¢)3; and added (/).
Amended by R.2001 d.347, effective October 1, 2001.
See: 32 N.J.R. 3218(a), 33 N.J.R. 3430(a).
Rewrote (f).
Amended by R.2004 d.67, effective February 17, 2004.
See: 35 N.J.R. 4627(a), 36 N.J.R. 949(b).
In (c), rewrote 5.
Amended by R.2004 d.144, effective April 5, 2004.
See: 35 N.J.R. 4944(a), 36 N.J.R. 1753(a).
In (b), rewrote 2, deleted the N.J.A.C. reference in 3 and added 4;
deleted former (i) and recodified former (j) through (/) as (i) through

(K).

Case Notes

Owner was not entitled to hearing before administrative law judge to
review adverse determination of Department of Community Affairs
regarding its challenge to permit fees charged in connection with
construction of new building absent evidence that township’s permit fee
revenues exceeded its expenditures, in violation of governing law. Toys
R Us, Inc. v. Township of Mount Olive, 300 N.J.Super. 585, 693 A.2d
539 (A.D.1997).

Fee standards violation. Bureau of Construction Code Enforcement
v. Hasbrouck Heights, 4 N.J.A.R. 282 (1983).

5:23-4.19 New Jersey State permit surcharge fees

(a) In order to provide for the training and certification
and technical support programs required by the Act, an
enforcing agency, including the Department when acting as
the local agency, shall collect a surcharge fee to be based
upon the volume of new construction within the municipali-
ty. Said fee shall be accounted for and forwarded to the
Division of Codes and Standards in the manner herein
provided.

(b) Amount: This fee shall be in the amount of $0.00265
per cubic foot volume of new buildings and additions.
Volume shall be computed in accordance with N.J.A.C.
5:23-2.28. The fee for all other construction shall be $1.35
per $1,000 of value of construction.

1. No fee shall be collected for preengineered systems
of commercial farm buildings.

2. No fee shall be collected for permits to perform
asbestos abatement or lead abatement.

3. No fee shall be collected for permits for the con-
struction or rehabilitation of residential units that are to

Supp. 4-5-04



5:23-4.19

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

be legally restricted to occupancy by households of low or
moderate income, as defined in N.J.A.C. 5:43-1.5.

4. No fee shall be collected for demolition of build-
ings or structures.

5. No fee shall be collected for work consequential to
a natural disaster when the local code enforcement agen-
cy is waiving its fee.

(c) Remitting and reporting:

1. The municipality shall remit fees to the Bureau on
a quarterly basis, in conjunction with report number
R-840B State Training Fee Report in accordance with
NJ.A.C. 5:23-45(e). Fees remitted shall be for the
quarter. Checks shall be made payable to “Treasurer,
State of New Jersey.”

Amended by R.1982 d.220, effective July 19, 1982.
See: 14 NLJ.R. 456(a), 14 N.J.R. 755(b).

In (c)3i deleted “state fiscal” and “third and fourth quarter” and
added “quarters of the calendar” year. In (c)3ii deleted reporting on
an annual basis and added quarterly report. Also added iii and (1).
Prior to recodification of N.J.A.C. 5:23, this section was codified at
5:23-4.8(c).

Amended by R.1983 d.611, effective January 3, 1984.
See: 15 N.J.R. 1789(a), 16 N.J.R. 45(b).

In (c), deleted old 1.-3. and added new 1.

Emergency adoption, R.1989 d.405, effective July 3, 1989 (expires

September 1, 1989).

See: 21 N.J.R. 2127(b).

In (b): changed “will” to “shall” and changed “$0.0006” to
“$0.0014” per cubic foot.

Adopted concurrent proposal, R.1989 d.512, effective September 1,

1989.

See: 21 N.J.R. 2127(a), 21 N.J.R. 3086(a).

Provisions of emergency amendment R.1989 d.405 readopted without
change.

Amended by R.1990 d.61, effective February 5, 1990.
See: 21 N.J.R. 3346(b), 22 N.J.R. 351(b).

At (c)1, monthly reporting and fee submissions changed to quarterly.
Amended by R.1991 d.181, effective April 1, 1991, operative July 1,

1991.

See: 23 N.J.R. 257(b), 23 N.J.R. 1029(a).

In (b) increased fee amount from $0.0014 to $0.0016 per cubic foot.
Amended by R.1992 d.47, effective February 3, 1992.

See: 23 NUJ.R. 3440(a), 24 N.J.R. 405(a).

Fees to be paid to Regulatory Affairs.

Amended by R.1992 d.392, effective October 5, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 2657(a), 24 N.J.R. 3521(b).

Fee amount amended at (b).

Amended by R.1995 d.603, effective November 20, 1995 (operative

March 20, 1996).

See: 27 N.J.R. 2655(a), 27 N.J.R. 4699(a).
Administrative Correction.

See: 28 N.J.R. 1981(b).

Amended by R.1997 d.303, effective July 21, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 1437(b), 29 N.J.R. 3247(a).

Subdivided (b); in (b), deleted reference to preengineered systems of
commercial farm buildings; and added (b)2.

Amended by R.2001 d.194, effective June 18, 2001.

See: 33 N.J.R. 1041(a), 33 N.J.R. 2097(a).

*In (a), substituted “Division of Codes and Standards” for “Bureau of
Regulatory Affairs”; in (b), added 3 and 4.
Amended by R.2002 d.42, effective February 4, 2002.
See: 33 N.IR. 3713(a), 34 N.J.R. 732(a).
In (b), added 5.
Amended by R.2002 d.260, effective August 5, 2002.
See: 34 N.J.R. 1572(a), 34 N.J.R. 2781(c).

Supp. 4-5-04

In (b), substituted “$0.0019” for “$0.0016” and “$0.96” for “$0.80” in
the introductory paragraph.
Administrative correction.
See: 35 N.J.R. 2208(b).
Amended by R.2003 d.249, effective June 16, 2003.
See: 35 NJ.R. 1361(a), 35 N.J.R. 2639(a).

In (b), substituted “$ 0.00265” for “$ 0.0019” and “$ 1.35” for
“$ 0.96”.

5:23-4.20 Departmental fees

(a) General:

1. The fee for plan review, computed as a percentage
of the fee for a construction permit, shall be paid at the
time of application for a permit. The amount of this fee
shall then be deducted from the amount of the fee due
for a construction permit, when the permit is issued.
Plan review fees are not refundable.

2. The fee to be charged for a construction permit will
be the sum of the basic construction fee plus all applica-
ble special fees, such as elevator or sign fees. This fee
shall be paid before a permit is issued.

3. The fee to be charged for a certificate of occupancy
shall be paid before a certificate is issued. This fee shall
be in addition to the construction permit fee.

4. Where the Department, pursuant to N.J.A.C.
5:23-4.24, is designated as the plan review agency, or
when the Department has been requested to provide plan
review services by a municipality pursuant to N.J.A.C.
5:23-4.24, or when the Department is designated as the
local enforcing agency pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.3, the
following schedule of fees shall pertain.

5. The construction or rehabilitation of residential
units that are to be legally restricted to occupancy by
households of low or moderate income shall be exempted
from the fees set forth in (b) and (c) below and otherwise
payable to the Department.

6. No fee shall be collected for work consequential to
a natural disaster when the Department is the local
enforcing agency.

(b) Departmental plan review fee:

1. The plan review fee for new construction shall be
based upon the volume of the structure.

i. For buildings or structures in Use Groups A, F or
S, the plan review fee shall be $.010 per cubic foot;

ii. For health care facilities in Use Groups B or I,
the plan review fee shall be $.022 per cubic foot; and

iii. For all other buildings or structures, the plan
review fee shall be $.016 per cubic foot.

23-82



N

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:234.20

2. The plan review fee for renovations, alterations,
repairs, site construction associated with pre-engineered
systems of commercial farm buildings, premanufactured
construction and external utility connections for premanu-
factured construction shall be based upon the estimated
cost of work.

i. For health care facilities in Use Groups B or I,
the fee shall be $14.00 per $1,000 or part thereof for
estimated cost not exceeding $50,000, $11.00 per $1,000
or part thereof for estimated cost in excess of the first
$50,000 and not exceeding $100,000, and $9.00 per
$1,000 or part thereof for estimated cost in excess of
the first $100,000; and

ii. For all other buildings or structures, the fee shall
be $10.00 per $1,000 or part thereof for estimated cost
not exceeding $50,000, $8.00 per $1,000 or part thereof
for estimated cost in excess of the first $50,000 and not
exceeding $100,000, and $7.00 per $1,000 or part there-
of for estimated cost in excess of the first $100,000.

3. The elevator device plan review fee shall be as set
forth in (c)6 and 7 below.

4. There shall be an additional fee of $45.00 per hour
for review of any amendment or change to a plan that has
already been released.

5. In any case where the Department conducts plan
review for a local enforcing agency, the fee charged by the
local enforcing agency for inspection services shall be 80
percent of the fee that would otherwise be determined
under the local fee schedule.

(c) Department (enforcing agency) fees shall be as fol-
lows:

1. The fee for plan review shall be 20 percent of the
amount to be charged for a construction permit.

i. The elevator device plan review fee shall be as in
(c)6 and 7 below.

ii. The fee for plan review for Statewide prototype
plans released by the Department or for other proto-
type plans where the prototype did not include the
foundation detail shall be five percent of the amount to
be charged for a construction permit.

2. The basic construction permit fee shall be the sum
of the parts computed on the basis of the volume or cost
of construction, the number of plumbing fixtures and
pieces of equipment, the number of electrical fixtures and
rating of electrical devices, the number of sprinklers,
standpipes and detectors (smoke and heat) at the unit
rates and/or the applicable flat fees as provided herein
plus any special fees.

i. Building volume or cost: The fees for new con-
struction or alteration are as follows:

(1) Fees for new construction shall be based upon
the volume of the structure. Volume shall be com-

23-83

puted in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.28. The
new construction fee shall be in the amount of $0.027
per cubic foot of volume for buildings and structures
of all use groups and types of construction as classi-
fied and defined in articles 3 and 4 of the building
subcode; except that the fee shall be $0.015 per cubic
foot of volume for use groups A-1, A-2, A-3, A-4,
A-5, F-1, F-2, S-1 and S-2, and the fee shall be
$0.0008 per cubic foot for structures on farms, includ-
ing commercial farm building under N.J.A.C.
5:23-3.2(d), with the maximum fee for such struc-
tures on farms not to exceed $1,145.

(2) Fees for renovations, alterations and repairs or
site construction associated with pre-engineered sys-
tems of commercial farm buildings, premanufactured
construction, and the external utility connection for
premanufactured construction shall be based upon
the estimated cost of work. The fee shall be in the
amount of $24.00 per $1,000. From $50,001 to and
including $100,000, the additional fee shall be in the
amount of $18.00 per $1,000 of estimated cost above
$50,000. Above $100,000, the additional fee shall be
in the amount of $15.00 per $1,000 of estimated cost
above $100,000. For the purpose of determining esti-
mated cost, the applicant shall submit to the Depart-
ment such cost data as may be available produced by
the architect or engineer of record, or by a recog-
nized estimating firm, or by the contractor. A bona
fide contractor’s bid, if available, shall be submitted.
The Department shall make the final decision re-
garding estimated cost.

(3) Fees for additions shall be computed on the
same basis as for new construction for the added
portion.

(4) Fees for combination renovations and addi-
tions shall be computed as the sum of the fees
computed separately in accordance with items (2)
and (3) above. '

(5) The fee for tents, in excess of 900 square feet
or more than 30 feet in any dimension, shall be
$92.00.

(6) The fee for roofing and siding work completed
on structures of Group R-3 or R-5 shall be $46.00.

(7) The fee for an above-ground swimming pool
shall be $100.00 for a pool with a surface area greater
than 550 square feet; the fee in all other cases shall
be $50.00. The fee for an in-ground swimming pool
shall be $150.00 for a pool with a surface area greater
than 550 square feet; the fee in all other cases shall
be $75.00.

il. Plumbing fixtures and equipment: The fees shall
be as follows:

(1) The fee shall be in the amount of $10.00 per
fixture, piece of equipment or appliance -connected to

Supp. 4-5-04



5:23-4.20

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 4-5-04

the plumbing system, and for each appliance connect-
ed to the gas piping or oil piping system, except as
indicated in (c)2ii(2) below.

(2) The fee shall be $65.00 per special device for
the following: grease traps, oil separators, refrigera-
tion units, utility service connections, backflow pre-
venters equipped with test ports (double check valve
assembly, reduced pressure zone and pressure vacu-
um breaker backflow preventers), steam boilers, hot
water boilers (excluding those for domestic water
heating), active solar systems, sewer pumps and inter-
ceptors. There shall be no inspection fee charged
for gas service entrances.

iii. Electrical fixtures and devices: The fee shall be
as follows:

(1) For the first block consisting of one to 50
receptacles, fixtures or devices, the fee shall be
$36.00; for each additional block consisting of up to
25 receptacles, fixtures or devices, the fee shall be
$6.00. For the purpose of computing this fee, recep-
tacles, fixtures or devices shall include lighting fix-
tures, wall switches, convenience receptacles, sensors,
dimmers, alarm devices, smoke and heat detectors,
communications outlets, light-standards eight feet or
less in height including luminaries, emergency lights,
electric signs, exit lights or similar electric fixtures
and devices rated 20 amperes or less including mo-
tors or equipment rated less than one horsepower
(hp) or one kilowatt (kw).

(2) For each motor or electrical device rated from
one hp or one kw to 10 hp or 10 kw; for each
transformer or generator rated from one kw or one
kva to 10 kw or 10 kva; for each replacement of
wiring involving one branch circuit or part thereof;
for each storable pool or hydro massage bath tub; for
each under-water lighting fixture; for household elec-
tric cooking equipment rated up to 16 kw; for each
fire, security or burglar alarm control unit; for each
receptacle rated from 30 amperes to 50 amperes; for
each light-standard greater than eight feet in height
including luminaries; and for each communications
closet, the fee shall be $10.00.

(3) For each motor or electrical device rated from
greater than 10 hp or 10 kw to 50 hp or 50 kw; for
each service equipment, panel board, switch board,
switch gear, motor-control-center, or disconnecting
means rated 225 amperes or less; for each transform-
er or generator rated from greater than 10 kw or 10
kva to 45 kw or 45 kva; for each electric sign rated
from greater than 20 amperes to 225 amperes includ-
ing associated disconnecting means; for each recepta-
cle rated greater than 50 amperes; and for each
utility load management device, the fee shall be
$46.00.

23-84

(4) For each motor or electrical device rated from
greater than 50 hp or 50 kw to 100 hp or 100 kw; for
each service equipment, panel board, switch board,
switch gear, motor-control-center or disconnecting
means rated from greater than 225 amperes to 1,000
amperes; and for each transformer or generator rated
from greater than 45 kw or 45 kva to 112.5 kw or
112.5 kva, the fee shall be $92.00.

(5) For each motor or electrical device rated
greater than 100 hp or 100 kw; for each service
equipment, panel board, switch board, switch gear,
motor-control-center or disconnecting means rated
greater than 1,000 amperes; and for each transformer
or generator rated greater than 112.5 kw or 112.5
kva, the fee shall be $457.00.

(6) The fee charged for electrical work for each
permanently installed private swimming pool as de-
fined in the building subcode, spa, hot tub or foun-
tain shall be a flat fee of $46.00 which shall include
any required bonding, and associated equipment such
as filter pumps, motors, disconnecting means,
switches, required receptacles, and heaters, etc., ex-
cepting panelboards and under-water lighting fix-
tures. For public swimming pools, the fee shall be
charged on the basis of number of electrical fixtures
and rating of electrical devices involved in accor-
dance with (c)2iii(1) through (5) above.

(7) The fee charged for the installation of single
and multiple station smoke or heat detectors and
fire, burglar or security alarm systems in any one or
two-family dwelling shall be a flat fee of $23.00 per
dwelling unit. For fire, burglar and security alarm
systems and detectors in buildings other than one or
two-family dwellings, the fee shall be charged in
accordance with (c)2iii(1) and (2) above.

(8) For installations consisting of multimeter
stacks, the fee shall be based on the ampere rating of
the main bus and not upon the number of meters or
rating of disconnects on the meter stack. Individual
loadside panel boards shall be charged in accordance
with (c)2iii(3), (4) or (5) above. There shall be no
additional fee charged for the concurrent installation
of individual feeder conductors.

(9) For motors or similar devices requiring concur-
rent installation of individual controls, relays and
switches, the fee shall be based only upon the rating
of the motor or device. There shall be no additional
fee charged for the concurrent installation of individ-
ual circuit components, for example, controllers,
starters, and disconnecting means.

(10) For electrical work requiring replacement of
service entrance conductors or feeder conductors
only, the fee shall be in accordance with (c)2iii(2)
through (5) above based on the designated ampere
rating of the overcurrent device of the service or
feeder.



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-4.20

(11) The fee charged for process equipment shall
be based on the ampere rating of the overcurrent
device protecting the conductor feeding the process
equipment or the cutoff device.

(12) For the purpose of computing these fees, all
electrical and communications devices, utilization
equipment and motors which are part of premises
wiring, except those which are portable plug-in type,
shall be counted.

iv. For fire protection and hazardous equipment,
sprinklers, standpipes, detectors (smoke and heat), pre-
engineered suppression systems, gas and oil fired appli-
ances not connected to the plumbing system, kitchen
exhaust systems, incinerators and crematoriums, the fee
shall be as follows:

(1) The fee for 20 or fewer heads shall be $65.00;
for 21 to and including 100 heads, the fee shall be
$120.00; for 101 to and including 200 heads, the fee
shall be $229.00; for 201 to and including 400 heads,
the fee shall be $594.00; for 401 to and including
1,000 heads, the fee shall be $822.00; for over 1,000
heads, the fee shall be $1,050.

(2) The fee for one to 12 detectors shall be $36.00;
for each 25 detectors in addition to this, the fee shall
be in the amount of $12.00.

(3) The fee for each standpipe shall be $229.00.

(4) The fee for each independent pre-engineered
system shall be $92.00.

(5) The fee for each gas or oil fired appliance that
is not connected to the plumbing system shall be
$46.00.

(6) The fee for each kitchen exhaust system shall
be $46.00.

(7) The fee for each incinerator shall be $365.00.
(8) The fee for each crematorium shall be $365.00.

(9) For single and multiple station smoke or heat
detectors and fire alarm systems in any one or two-
family dwellings, there shall be a flat fee of $23.00
per dwelling unit. For detectors and fire alarm sys-
tems in buildings other than one or two-family dwell-
ings, the fee shall be charged in accordance with
(c)2iv(2) above.

3. Fees for certificates and other permits are as fol-

lows:

i. The fee for a demolition or removal permit shall
be $65.00 for a structure of less than 5,000 square feet
in area and less than 30 feet in height, for one- or two-
family dwellings (Group R-3 or R-5 of the building
subcode), structures on farms, including commercial
farm buildings under N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.2(d), and $120.00
for all other Groups.

23-85

ii. The fee for a permit to construct a sign shall be
in the amount of $1.20 per square foot surface area of
the sign, computed on one side only for double-faced
signs. The minimum fee shall be $46.00.

iii. The fee for a certificate of occupancy shall be
$28.00.

iv. The fee for a certificate of occupancy granted
pursuant to a change of use group shall be $120.00.

v. The fee for a certificate of continued occupancy
issued under N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.23(c) shall be $120.00.

vi. The fee for the first issuance and the renewal of
a temporary certificate of occupancy shall be $28.00.

(1) Exception: There shall be no fee for the first
issuance of the temporary certificate of occupancy
provided the certificate of occupancy fee is paid at
that time.

(2) Exception: Where a written request for a tem-
porary certificate of occupancy is made for reasons
other than uncompleted work covered by the permit
(such as uncompleted work required by prior approv-
als from state or municipal agencies), no renewal fee
shall be charged.

vii. The fee for plan review of a building for compli-
ance under the alternate systems and nondepletable
energy source provisions of the energy subcode shall be
$274.00 for one- and two-family dwellings (Group R-3
or R-5 of the building subcode), and for light commer-
cial structures having the indoor temperature controlled
from a single point, and $1,369 for all other structures.

viii. The fee for an application for a variation in
accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.10 shall be $594.00 for
class I structures and $120.00 for class II and class III
structures. The fee for resubmission of an application
for a variation shall be $229.00 for class I structures and
$65.00 for class II and class III structures.

ix. The fee for a permit for lead hazard abatement
work shall be $140.00. The fee for a lead abatement
clearance certificate shall be $28.00.

4. For cross connections and backflow preventers that
are subject to testing, requiring reinspection annually, the
fee shall be $46.00 for each device when they are tested.

5. Annual permit requirements are as follows:

i. The fee to be charged for an annual construction
permit shall be charged annually. This fee shall be a
flat fee based upon the number of maintenance workers
who are employed by the facility, and who are primarily
engaged in work that is governed by a subcode. Man-
agers, engineers and clericals shall not be considered
maintenance workers for the purpose of establishing
the annual construction permit fee. Annual permits
may be issued for building/fire protection, electrical and
plumbing.

Supp. 4-5-04



5:23-4.20

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

ii. Fees for annual permits shall be as follows:

(1) One to 25 workers (including foremen)
$667.00/worker; each additional worker over 25,
$232.00/worker.

(2) Prior to the issuance of the annual permit, a
training registration fee of $140.00 per subcode and a
list of not more than three individuals to be trained
per subcode shall be submitted by the applicant to
the Department of Community Affairs, Bureau of
Code Services, Education Unit along with a copy of
the construction permit (Form F170). Checks shall
be made payable to “Treasurer, State of New Jer-
sey.” The Department shall register these individu-
als and notify them of the courses being offered.

6. The fee for plan review for elevator devices in
structures of Group R-3, R—4, or R-5, and for elevator
devices wholly within dwelling units in structures of
Group R-2 shall be $50.00 for each device.

7. The fee for plan review for elevator devices in
structures of Groups other than R-3, R-4, or R-5 and
devices in structures of Group R-2 exempted by (c)6
above shall be $260.00 for each device.

8. The fees for elevator device inspections and tests
shall be as set forth in N.J.A.C. 5:23-12.

9. The fee for a mechanical inspection in a structure
of Group R-3 or R-5 by a mechanical inspector shall be
$43.00 for the first device and $10.00 for each additional
device. No separate fee shall be charged for gas, fuel oil,
or water piping connections associated with the mechani-
cal equipment inspected.

10. The fee for the annual electrical inspection of
swimming pools, spas or hot tubs shall be $36.00.

(d) The fee for an application by a manufacturer, distrib-
utor, owner or any other person for approval of any fixture,
appurtenance, material or method, pursuant to N.J.A.C.
5:23-3.8, shall be an amount equal to the cost incurred, or
to be incurred, by the Department for such tests as the
Department may require, plus an administrative surcharge
in the amount of 10 percent of such cost.

Amended by R.1982 d.402, effective November 15, 1982.
See: 14 N.J.R. 943(a), 14 N.JL.R. 1300(b).
Text substantially amended. Department fees increased approxi-
mately 50 percent.
Amended by R.1982 d.463, effective January 3, 1983.
See: 14 N.J.R. 1129(a), 14 N.J.R. 1449(a).
Added (c)10, periodic reinspection fees.
Amended by R.1983 d.548, effective December 5, 1983.
See: 15 N.J.R. 1406(a), 15 N.I.R. 2033(b).
In (c)2., added “mechanical systems and equipment” and “the num-
ber of sprinklers and standpipes”. Also added iv.-v.
Amended by R.1983 d.641, effective January 17, 1984.
See: 15 N.J.R. 1911(a), 16 N.J.R. 129(b).
Substantial changes in section.
Correction: 16 N.J.R. 2267(a).
Amended by R.1985 d.351, effective July 15, 1985.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1029(a), 17 N.J.R. 1756(b).
(c)11 and 12 added.

Supp. 4-5-04

Amended by R.1986 d.213, effective June 16, 1986.
See: 17 N.J.R. 2490(a), 18 N.J.R. 1266(a).

Added text to (a)12 “Prior to the issuance of the annual permit” and
“Bureau of Construction Code Enforcement”.

Amended by R.1987 d.490, effective November 16, 1987.
See: 19 N.J.R. 1684(a), 19 N.J.R. 2134(a).

Fees raised.

Emergency amendment, R.1989 d.405, effective July 3, 1989 (expires

September 1, 1989).

See: 21 N.JR. 2127(b).

Amended extensively based on an overall increase of approximately
30 percent in fees for code enforcement and planned real estate
development, and an increase in the State training fee per cubic foot
volume of new construction. Changed fee amounts throughout.
Adopted concurrent proposal, R.1989 d.512, effective September 1,

1989.

See: 21 N.JR. 2127(a), 21 N.J.R. 3086(a).

Provisions of emergency amendment R.1989 d.405 readopted with
change.

Restructured section.

In (a): added new 5.

In (c): deleted (c)2i(5) regarding minor construction work fees.

In (c)2ii(2): added text to specify equipment fees and deleted
(c)2ii(3) regarding fixtures.

In (c)2iii: deleted (3)-(5) and added new (3)-(6).

Deleted (c)3-6 regarding fees, and added (c)2iv, with new (3)-(7) on
new fee structure.

Added (c)3 and 4 and renumbered (c)7-12 as (c)3-6ii.

Amended by R.1990 d.61, effective February 5, 1990.
See: 21 N.J.R. 3346(b), 22 N.J.R. 351(b).

Technical change of Form number in (c)6ii.
Amended by R.1991 d.181, effective April 1, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 257(b), 23 N.J.R. 1029(a).

In (b), plan review surcharge increased from 30 to 40 percent; plan
review only increased from 20 to 25 percent; minimum fee increased
from $33.00 to $43.00.

In (c)2, basic construction fee permit increased from $33.00 to
$43.00.

In (c)2i(1), new construction fee increased from $0.019 to $0.025; for
use groups A-1, A-2, A-3, A4, F-1, F-2, S-1, S-2 increased from
$0.011 to $0.014; farm structures increased from $0.0005 to $0.0007;
maximum farm structures fee increased from $815.00 to $1,060.

In (c)2i(2), fees increased from $17.00 to $22.00; from $13.00 to
$17.00 above $50,000; from $11.00 to $14.00 above $100,000.

In (c)2ii(1), fee increased from $7.00 to $9.00 per fixture.

In (c)2ii(2), fee increased from $46.00 to $60.00 per special device.

In (c)2iii(1), fee increased from $25.00 to $33.00 for one to 50
receptacles or fixtures; each 25 additional increased from $4.00 to
$5.00.

In (c)2iii(2), fee increased from $7.00 to $9.00.

In (c)2iii(3), fee increased from $33.00 to $43.00.

In (c)2iii(4), fee increased from $65.00 to $85.00.

In (c)2iii(5), fee increased from $325.00 to $423.00.

In (c)2iv(1), fee increased from $46.00 to $60.00 for 20 or fewer
heads; from $85.00 to $111.00 for 21 to 100 heads; from $163.00 to
$212.00 for 101 to 200 heads; from $423.00 to $550.00 for 201 to 400
heads; from $585.00 to $761.00 for 401 to 1,000 heads; from $748.00 to
$972.00 for over 1,000 heads.

In (c)2iv(2), fee increased from $163.00 to $212.00.

In (c)2iv(3), fee increased from $65.00 to $85.00.

In (c)2iv(4) and (5), fee increased from $33.00 to $43.00.

In (c)2iv(6) and (7), fee increased from $260.00 to $338.00.

In (c)4i, demolition and removal permit increased from $46.00 to
$60.00 and for form structure removal from $85.00 to $111.00.

In (c)4ii, fee for permit to construct a sign increased from $0.85 to
$1.11 per square foot; minimum fee increased from $33.00 to $43.00

In (c)4iii, certificate of occupancy fee increased from $85.00 to
$111.00; minimum fee for form structures increased from $46.00 to
$60.00.

In (c)4iv, fee increased from $124.00 to $161.00.

In (c)4v, fee increased from $85.00 to $111.00.

In (c)4vii, fee increased from $20.00 to $26.00.

23-86



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-4.22

In (c)4viii, fees increased from $195.00 to $254.00 for one and two-
family homes and from $975.00 to $41,268 for light commercial struc-
tures.

In (c)4ix, fees increased from $423.00 to $550.00 for class I structures
and from $85.00 to $111.00 for class II and III structures. Resubmis-
sion of applications increased from $163.00 to $212.00 for class I
structures and from $46.00 to $60.00 for class II and III structures.

In (c)siii, fees increased from $33.00 to $43.00 for thrice annual
testing and from $85.00 to $111.00 for annual testing.

In (c)6ii(1), fees increased from $475.00 to $618.00 for one to 25
workers and from $165.00 to $215.00 per worker over 25.

In (c)6ii(2), fee increased from $100.00 to $130.00.

Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a).

Departmental fees set at (c).

Amended by R.1992 d.147, effective April 6, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 170(a), 24 N.J.R. 1397(a).

Elevators wholly within R-2 residences exempt.

Notice of correction, effective May 18, 1992.

See: 24 N.J.R. 1879(b).

Amended by R.1992 d.230, effective June 1, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 168(a), 24 N.J.R. 2052(a).

Form numbers changed in (c).

Amended by R.1992 d.313, effective August 3, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 1846(a), 24 N.J.R. 2712(b).

No inspection fee for gas service entrances.
Amended by R.1992 d.390, effective October 5, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 1844(a), 24 N.J.R. 3515(b).

Fee for indirect apportionment systems set at (d).
Amended by R.1992 d.392, effective October 5, 1992.
See: 24 N.JR. 2657(a), 24 N.J.R. 3521(b).

Fees increased throughout.

Amended by R.1993 d.187, effective May 3, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 624(a), 25 N.J.R. 1875(a).

Added (c)9.

Amended by R.1994 d.28, effective January 18, 1994.

See: 25 N.J.R. 4546(b), 26 N.J.R. 352(a).

Administrative Correction.

See: 26 N.J.R. 796(a).

Amended by R.1994 d.96, effective February 22, 1994.

See: 25 N.J.R. 5388(a), 26 N.J.R. 1073(a).

Amended by R.1994 d.323, effective July 5, 1994 (operative January 1,

1995).

See: 25 N.J.R. 2162(a), 26 N.J.R. 2780(a).
Amended by R.1994 d.434, effective September 6, 1994 (operative

January 1, 1995).

See: 26 N.J.R. 1911(a), 26 N.J.R. 3706(b).

Amended by R.1995 d.381, effective July 17, 1995.

See: 27 N.J.R. 970(a), 27 N.J.R. 2715(a).

Amended by R.1995 d.475, effective September 5, 1995 (operative

January 1, 1996).

See: 27 N.J.R. 1716(a), 27 N.J.R. 3325(a).

In (¢)5ii(2) added individuals to be trained and registered.

Amended by R.1995 d.476, effective September 5, 1995 (operative

January 1, 1996).

See: 27 N.J.R. 1846(a), 27 N.J.R. 3325(b).

Eliminated minimum fee in (b) and rewrote (c).

Amended by R.1995 d.603, effective November 20, 1995 (operative

March 20, 1996).

See: 27 N.J.R. 2655(a), 27 N.J.R. 4699(a).
Amended by R.1995 d.647, effective December 18, 1995 (operative

March 18, 1996).

See: 27 N.J.R. 3517(a), 27 N.J.R. 5012(a).

Amended by R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 NJ.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a).

Amended by R.1998 d.35, effective January 5, 1998.
See: 29 N.J.R. 4215(a), 30 N.J.R. 194(a).

In (c)2.i.(1), added A-5 structures to the fee schedule.
Amended by R.2000 d.47, effective February 7, 2000.
See: 31 N.J.R. 2314(a), 32 N.J.R. 443(a).

Rewrote (c).

Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April 17, 2000.
See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a).
In (c)3i, inserted a reference to group R-4.

23-87

Amended by R.2001 d.194, effective June 18, 2001.
See: 33 N.J.R. 1041(a), 33 N.J.R. 2097(a).
In (a)5, substituted “The construction or rehabilitation of” for “New-
ly constructed”.
Amended by R.2001 d.347, effective October 1, 2001.
See: 32 N.J.R. 3218(a), 33 N.J.R. 3430(a).
In (c)3, inserted new vi, and recodified former vi through viii as vii
through ix. ‘
Amended by R.2002 d.6, effective January 7, 2002.
See: 33 N.J.R. 2570(a), 33 N.J.R. 3883(a), 34 N.J.R. 268(a).
In (c)5ii(2), substituted “Education Unit” for “Training Section”.
Amended by R.2002 d.42, effective February 4, 2002.
See: 33 N.J.R. 3713(a), 34 N.J.R. 732(a).
In (a), added 6.
Amended by R.2002 d.260, effective August 5, 2002.
See: 34 N.J.R. 1572(a), 34 N.J.R. 2781(c).
Rewrote (b) and (c)1.
Amended by R.2004 d.67, effective February 17, 2004.
See: 35 N.J.R. 4627(a), 36 N.J.R. 949(b).
Added references to Group R-5 throughout.
Amended by R.2004 d.144, effective April 5, 2004.
See: 35 N.J.R. 4944(a), 36 N.J.R. 1753(a).
Rewrote (c)1.

5:23-4.21 Private enforcing agency authorization and
reauthorization fees

(a) Authorization fee: Any onsite inspection agency sub-
mitting an application to the Department under N.J.A.C.
5:23-4.12 for approval as an inspection agency shall pay a
fee of $2,800 for each subcode for which authorization is
sought.

(b) Reauthorization fee: Any onsite inspection agency
submitting an application to the Department under N.J.A.C.
5:23-4.12 for reapproval as an inspection agency shall pay a
fee of $1,400 for each subcode for which authorization is
sought plus an amount equal to five percent of the gross
revenue earned from State Uniform Construction Code
enforcement activities during the previous 12-month period.
This fee shall be paid to the Department in 12 equal
installments, beginning with the month immediately follow-
ing the end of the 12 month period from which the fee is
calculated. Payment shall be made prior to the last business
day of each month.

Amended by R.1984 d.260, effective July 2, 1984.
See: 16 N.J.R. 3(a), 16 N.J.R. 1714(e).

Section substantially amended.

Amended by R.1985 d.353, effective July 15, 1985.
See: 17 NJ.R. 1032(a), 17 N.J.R. 1758(b).

(b)1: substantially amended.

Public Notice: Notice of Petition to amend section.
See: 17 N.J.R. 2688(a).

Amended by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 NJ.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).

Text on inplant inspection agencies deleted.
Amended by R.1991 d.181, effective April 1, 1991.
See: 23 NJ.R. 257(b), 23 N.J.R. 1029(a).

In (a), authorization fee increased from $2,000 to $2,600.
reauthorization fee increased from $1,000 to $1,300.
Amended by R.1992 d.392, effective October 5, 1992.
See: 24 NJ.R. 2657(a), 24 N.J.R. 3521(b).

Fees increased.

In (b),

5:23-4.22 (Reserved)

Amended by R.1984 d.481, effective November 5, 1984.
See: 16 N.J.R. 2031(a), 16 N.J.R. 3006(a).

Supp. 4-5-04



5:23-4.22

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Amended by R.1986 d.142, effective May 5, 1986.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1169(a), 18 N.J.R. 945(a).
Substantially amended.
Amended by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).
Modular unit fee of $100.00 deleted; title changed.
Amended by R.1991 d.181, effective April 1, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 257(b), 23 N.J.R. 1029(a).
In (a) and (b), insignia fee increased from $50.00 to $65.00.
Amended by R.1992 d.392, effective October 5, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 2657(a), 24 N.L.R. 3521(b).
Fees increased.
Repealed by R.1994 d.96, effective February 22, 1994.
See: 25 N.J.R. 5388(a), 26 N.J.R. 1073(a).
Section was “Building element and manufactured home add-on unit
insignia of certification fees”.

5:23-4.23 Payment of fees

(a) All fees paid to the Department under the regulations
shall be nonrefundable except as otherwise specifically set
forth in the regulations. All fees shall be paid by check or
money order, payable to the “Treasurer, State of New
Jersey”.

5:23-4.24 Plan review by the Department of Community
Affairs

(a) There is established in the Department of Community
Affairs, Division of Codes and Standards, a Bureau of
Construction Projects Review, hereinafter “the plan review
bureau.” The plan review bureau shall review plans, applica-
tions and specifications submitted to the Department in its
enforcing agency capacity, and as further required or per-
mitted by this section.

(b) Plan review:

1. Plan review shall be required for all uses except as
may be otherwise provided in the regulations whenever
the department acts as an enforcing agency in any munici-

pality.

2. Special or hazardous uses and types of construc-
tion:

i. NJA.C. 5:223-3 divides all construction into
three classes according to its ‘complexity and potential
hazard to the public health and safety. N.J.A.C. 5:23-5
provides for three levels of subcode official certification
which correspond to the three classes in N.J.A.C.
5:23-5.

ii. For class 1, department plan review and release
shall be required on the effective date of the regula-
tions prior to the issuance of a construction permit
unless the construction official and each appropriate
subcode official in the municipal enforcing agency is
certified by the commissioner as a class one construc-
tion official or subcode official.

Supp. 4-5-04

iii. For class two, department plan review and re-
lease shall be required after January 1, 1981, prior to
the issuance of a construction permit unless the con-
struction official and each appropriate subcode official
in the municipal enforcing agency is certified by the
commissioner as a class one or class two construction
official or subcode official.

iv. For class three, departmental plan review shall
not be required except when the department acts as the
enforcing agency.

v. Installations of elevators, escalators, and moving
walks, except devices in structures of Group R-3, R4,
or R-5 and those devices in structures of Group R-2
that are otherwise exempted in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.11(b),
shall require Departmental plan review and release.

3. Premanufactured construction: Department plan
review and release shall be required for all modular
construction other than those authorized to be approved
by an inplant inspection agency as provided in N.J.A.C.
5:23-4A.10.

(c) The plan review bureau shall review all applications,
plans and specifications for conformance to the regulations.

(d) Plans reviewed by the Department that are judged to
be in conformance with the regulations shall be stamped
with the word “released” and signed and dated by the
reviewing official of the Department.

(e) All plans submitted, and any amendments thereto,
accompanied by the required fee, shall be numbered, dock-
eted, and examined promptly after their submission for
compliance with the regulations. In the case of plans
submitted by an architect or engineer bearing his or her
signature, registration number, and seal, plan examination
may, except for compliance with exit requirements, be limit-
ed to a supervisory check.

(f) If the Department judges a plan not to be in conform-
ance with the regulations, it shall notify the applicant in
writing of the reason for rejection.

(g) The Department shall provide such technical assis-
tance to the applicant as may be appropriate pursuant to the
regulations.

(h) The municipal enforcing agency shall perform all field
inspections required by the regulations, except that the
Department shall have the right to perform partial or
complete field inspection services for any project for which
it has released plans.

Amended by R.1986 d.142, effective May 5, 1986.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1169(a), 18 N.J.R. 945(a).
(a)iii added.
Amended by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).
Reference to subchapter 4A added at (a)2iii.
Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991.

23-88

|

-
N

»

v



o

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-4.33

See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a).

Text added at (a)2i(5).

Amended by R.1992 d.147, effective April 6, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 170(a), 24 N.J.R. 1397(a).

Elevators wholly within R-2 residences exempt.
Amended by R.1994 d.96, effective February 22, 1994.
See: 26 N.J.R. 1073(a).

Amended by R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a).

Deleted (a) and (b); recodified (a)l as (a), (a)2 as (b), and (b)l
through 6 as (c) through (h); in (a), amended agencies referenced, in
(a) through (h), deleted titling of subsections; and in (h), substituted
“Department shall have the right” for “department deserves the right”.
Amended by R.2004 d.67, effective February 17, 2004.

See: 35 N.J.R. 4627(a), 36 N.J.R. 949(b).

In (b)2v, added R-5 to the list of groups.

5:23-4.25 (Reserved)

Amended by R.1986 d.142, effective May 5, 1986.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1169(a), 18 N.J.R. 945(a).
Subsections (b) and (r) recodified as 4.26 through 4.38.
Repealed by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).

5:23-4.26 Certification of building elements

(a) Building elements shall be certified in accordance
with the following provisions:

1. Building elements, such as trusses, fire walls, fire
separation walls, wall panels, pre-stressed/prefabricated
floor or roof panels and pre-engineered structural frames,
built in accordance with the New Jersey Uniform Con-
struction Code, may be approved by any of the following
options:

i. Approval for both design and construction by a
nationally recognized laboratory or a product certifica-
tion agency. The local municipal subcode official has
the authority to accept such approvals based on the
evidence, test and/or documentation presented to him
or her.

ii. Approval for both design and construction by a
professional engineer licensed either in the State of
New Jersey or in the state of manufacture. The local
municipal subcode official has the authority to accept
such approvals based on the evidence, of test and/or
documentation presented to him or her.

Amended by R.1986 d.142, effective May 5, 1986.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1169(a), 18 N.J.R. 945(a).

Recodified from 4.25(b) and substantially amended.
Amended by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).

Text at (a), (a)1, (a)2, (b) and (c) deleted; stylistic revisions.
Amended by R.1994 d.96, effective February 22, 1994.
See: 25 N.J.R. 5388(a), 26 N.J.R. 1073(a).

Next Page is 23-91

23-89

5:23-4.27 (Reserved)

Amended by R.1986 d.142, effective May 5, 1986.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1169(a), 18 N.J.R. 945(a).

Recodified from 4.25(c) and substantially amended.
Repealed by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).

5:23-4.28 (Reserved)

Amended by R.1986 d.142, effective May 5, 1986.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1169(a), 18 N.J.R. 945(a).

Recodified from 4.25(d) and substantially amended.
Repealed by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).

5:23-4.29 (Reserved)

Amended by R.1986 d.142, effective May 5, 1986.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1169(a), 18 N.J.R. 945(a).

Recodified from 4.25(e) and substantially amended.
Amended by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).

Text at (a)1, 2, 3, 5, (b)1, and (c) through (g) deleted; references to
premanufactured system deleted and references to manufactured home
add-on units and building elements added.

Repealed by R.1994 d.96, effective February 22, 1994.
See: 25 N.J.R. 5388(a), 26 N.J.R. 1073(a).
Section was “Approval of premanufactured systems documentation”.

5:23-4.30 (Reserved)

Amended by R.1986 d.142, effective May 5, 1986.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1169(a), 18 N.J.R. 945(a).
Recodified from 4.25(h)-(j) and substantially amended.
Repealed by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).

5:23-4.31 (Reserved)

Amended by R.1986 d.142, effective May 5, 1986.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1169(a), 17 N.J.R. 945(a).
Recodified from 4.25(k) and substantially amended.
Amended by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).
Text at (a) through (e) and (f)1, 2 and 4 deleted.
Repealed by R.1994 d.96, effective February 22, 1994.
See: 25 N.J.R. 5388(a), 26 N.J.R. 1073(a).
Section was “Insignia of certification for manufactured home add-on
unit and building element”.

5:23-4.32 (Reserved)

Amended by R.1986 d.142, effective May 5, 1986.
See: 17 N.JR. 1169(a), 17 N.J.R. 945(a).

Recodified from 4.25(/ ) and substantially amended.
Repealed by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).

5:23-4.33 (Reserved)
Amended by R.1986 d.142, effective May 5, 1986.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1169(a), 18 N.J.R. 945(a).

Recodified from 4.25(m) and substantially amended.
Repealed by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 NJ.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).

Supp. 4-5-04



