UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 5:23-2.14

9. A permit shall not be required for fences six feet or tains any electrical equipment. Outdoor mazes that do not
less in height. This exception does not apply to barriers require a permit are subject to the permitting requirements
surrounding public or private swimming pools. of the Uniform Fire Code (N.J.A.C. 5:70-2.7).

10. A construction permit is not required for an out-
door maze, unless it is six feet or greater in height or con-

New Jersey State Library

Next Page is 23-8.1 23-8.0.2.9 Supp. 12-15-08



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-2.14

i.  For the purposes of applying this requirement, an  shall be forwarded by the Construction Official to the Depart-

outdoor maze is an attraction that lacks a roof and is  ment of Community Affairs Training Section along with the

designed to disorient patrons, reduce vision, present  appropriate training registration fee.

- barriers, or otherwise impede the flow of traffic and does
not consist solely of living rooted plants such as corn
stalks or trees, but includes mazes created from plants
that have been cut and attached to an object to support
them.

(c) An annual construction permit may be issued by the
construction official to educational, industrial, institutional,
mercantile, business and government facilities based upon
submission of the following in duplicate:

1. Identification of the facility and the buildings cov-
ered by the application for the annual permit.

2. Identification of the location within the facility
where the annual permit records will be maintained.

3. A listing of the names, titles and trade specialties of
the facility’s full-time maintenance staff.

4. The name of the person responsible for the main-
tenance logs, job assignments and quality control.

5. A statement from the management of the facility
attesting that the maintenance staff performing work under
the annual permit are under the direct supervision of a
qualified individual, as set forth under N.J.A.C. 5:23-
2.14(e)1, or are individually qualified in their respective
v trades.

| e i.  Evidence of qualification shall be journeyman

status, civil service status, trade experience, trade school
certification, college degree, State licensure pursuant to
law or other appropriate evidence of competence.

ii. No person employed on the maintenance staff of
a facility shall be deemed to be qualified to engage in
lead abatement unless he or she has been certified by the
New Jersey Department of Health pursuant to section 3
of P.L. 1993, c.288 (N.J.S.A. 26:20-3) (see N.J.A.C.
8:62).

6. A statement from the management explaining their
procedures for providing training at Department seminars
| on construction codes on a regular basis for at least one,
but not more than three, individuals per subcode.

7. A statement from the management explaining the
procedures of the applicant to ensure proper quality control
of the work performed under the annual permit.

8. Receipt of the required annual permit fee and train-
ing registration fee.

(d) The Construction Official, upon review of the applica-
tion may issue or deny an annual construction permit in
whole or in part. The construction permit (Form F-170C)
shall state that the permit is an annual permit and indicate the
technical subcodes in which the facility is approved to do
work under the annual permit. A copy of the annual permit

-

| 23-8.1

(e) Conditions of the annual permit are as follows:

1. The “annual permit” may be issued for building/fire
protection, electrical, mechanical or plumbing work or any
combination of those classifications of work, providing that
the individual responsible for work done under the annual
permit possesses knowledge as evidenced in accordance
with N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.14(c)5, in the technical work classi-
fication for which the annual permit is sought.

1. An approved copy of the annual permit applica-
tion shall be kept at a facility’s maintenance office
within the municipality having jurisdiction for review by
the Construction Official and appropriate subcode
official. The Construction Official shall be notified of
the location of the facilities maintenance office.

2. The life of the annual construction permit shall be
limited to one year;

3. The facility shall maintain a construction log of all
work performed. The construction log shall contain the
date, a brief description and estimated or actual cost of the
project. This log shall be subject to a quarterly inspection
by the construction official or his authorized representative.
Any business record showing when and where work was
done and the extent of such work shall be deemed to be a
construction log: Applications for the renewal of the
“annual permit” shall be filed with the Construction Of-
ficial at least 60 days prior to the expiration of the current
annual permit. The facility application shall make current
the information previously submitted to the Construction
Official. The application for renewal shall be accompanied
by the established fee.

4. The annual permit covers all work subject to this
chapter done by the facility’s full-time maintenance staff,
but shall not include work performed by outside contract
even if the contractor is hired by the facility and is working
under direct supervision of the facility’s maintenance staff.
Work performed by outside contract shall be subject to
applicable UCC regulations and State Licensure Law.

5. A permanent work log, approved by the construction
official, of all work done under the “annual permit” must
be maintained at a facilities maintenance office on site or
must be available at the time of the inspection upon 24
hours notice of such inspection. The log must contain the
date, a brief description of the work, photographs for any
work which was not inspected prior to closing as set forth
in (e)8 below, and the name of the person supervising the
work. The log shall be retained for three years.

6. Architectural or engineering drawings, as required
by law for work done under the annual permit, shall be
prepared by a registered architect or licensed engineer as

Supp. 10-2-06



5:23-2.14

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

defined by the statutory requirements of the professional
registration laws of this State and shall be kept perma-
nently on file and be made available to the Construction
Official and appropriate subcode official, for review upon
request.

7. The appropriate subcode official, at least two (2)
times a year, shall perform inspections of the facility for
which an annual permit has been issued. The maximum
time between inspections shall be a six month period.

8. Work that is normally inspected prior to closing
shall be ordered to be reopened by the facility upon written
notice from the Construction Official or appropriate
subcode official if he has reason to believe that a violation
is present. A photograph shall be taken of any work
intended to be enclosed without inspection.

9. Any work that is done under the supervision of the
facilities maintenance staff and under a regular construc-
tion permit shall be entered into the annual permit log. The
construction permit number shall be listed as a part of the

entry.

10. Training for annual permits shall be provided at the
seminars for code officials.

i.  The facility shall provide a list of at least one, but
not more than three, individuals per subcode who are
required to complete five hours of continuing education
per year.

ii. The Department shall maintain the training rec-
ords for each annual permit. The annual permit shall not
be renewed unless the facility completes the training for
each issued subcode.

iii. The Department shall notify the construction of-
ficial who issued the permit if the training has not been
completed.

11. Any changes to the annual construction permit ap-
plication shall be forwarded to the Construction Official
within 30 days of the change.

12. The following work is not permitted under an annual
permit:

i.  Any work done on a facility that would result in
a change of use of a building or part of a building;

ii. New buildings and additions regardless of size;

ili. Renovation, alteration or reconstruction work
completed between inspection periods in an area in
excess of 5,000 square feet per building;

iv. Any work done on a facility that would result in
an increase to the area of a building;

v. The installation or alteration of a sprinkler sys-

vi. Any work that affects the required means of
egress;

vii. Any modification work, other than routine
maintenance, that affects life safety systems, such as, but
not limited to:

(1) Emergency lighting systems;

(2) Smoke and heat detection systems;

(3) Stand-by generator systems;

(4) Emergency smoke evacuation systems.

viii. Any work which would disturb asbestos and re-
quire a permit to perform.

(f) Construction requirements for commercial farm build-
ings shall be as set forth in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.2(d).

(g) No person shall construct, enlarge, alter, reconstruct, or
demolish a retaining wall or series of retaining walls having a
total height four feet or greater, or a retaining wall less than
four feet having a negative impact on a foundation, without
first obtaining a construction permit. The height of a retaining
wall shall be the sum of the heights of all retaining walls on
the same slope.

1. Exception: This requirement shall not apply to any
retaining wall that is intended to be dedicated to the
municipality and is subject to regulation, inspection, and
the issuance of bonds under Article 6, Subdivision and Site
Plan Review and Approval, of the Municipal Land Use
Law, P.L. 1975, c.291 (N.J.S.A. 40:55D-37 et seq.).

As amended, R.1981 d.462, eff. December 7, 1981.
See: 13 N.J.R. 390(a), 13 N.J.R. 885(d).
(c)li: added “under the control and supervision of a person”; (c)liii:
added ““any business construction log.”
Amended by R.1985 d.351 effective July 15, 1985.
See: 17 NJ.R. 1029(a), 17 N.J.R. 1756(b).
Section substantially amended.
Amended by R.1986 d.213, effective June 16, 1986.
See: 17 N.J.R. 2490(a), 18 N.J.R. 1266(a).
Subsection (e) substantially amended.
Administrative Correction: “facility’s” changed from “facilities”
throughout.
See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b).
Amended by R.1990 d.558, effective November 19, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 1969(b), 22 N.J.R. 3483(a).
Conditional exemption for hoophouses or polyhouses added.
Amended by R.1991 d.60, effective February 19, 1991.
See: 22 N.J.R. 3609(a), 23 N.J.R. 405(b).
Gas utilities exempt from permit and notice requirements.
Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991.
See: 23 NJ.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a).
Mechanical work added to (e)1.
Amended by R.1992 d.230, effective June 1, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 168(a), 24 N.J.R. 2052(a).
Form numbers changed in (d).
Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a).
Amended by R.1995 d.381, effective July 17, 1995.
See: 27 N.J.R. 970(a), 27 N.J.R. 2715(a).
Amended by R.1995 d.475, effective September 5, 1995 (operative Jan-

tem, uary 1, 1996).
See: 27 N.J.R. 1716(a), 27 N.J.R. 3325(a).
Rewrote (¢)6 and (e)10.
Supp. 10-2-06 - 23-8.2




UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-2.15

Amended by R.1996 d.297, effective July 1, 1996 (operative October 1,

1996).

See: 28 N.J.R. 1586(b), 28 N.J.R. 3301(a).

In (b) added exception for signs.

Amended by R.1997 d.302, effective July 21, 1997 (operative

September 24, 1997).

See: 29 N.J.R. 2202(a), 29 N.J.R. 3242(b).

Added (b)7.

Amended by R.1998 d.28, effective January 5, 1998.
See: 29 N.J.R. 3603(a), 30 N.J.R. 129(a).

Rewrote (a); added (a)1 stating exception; amended (e)4 and (e)12iii.

Administrative change.

See: 31 N.J.R. 135(b).

Amended by R.1999 d.424, effective December 6, 1999.
See: 31 N.J.R. 2428(a), 31 N.J.R. 4001(c).

In (a)l and (b)1, substituted references to ordinary maintenance for
references to ordinary repairs.
Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April 17, 2000.
See: 31 NJ.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a).

In (b), added 8 and 9.
Administrative correction.
See: 34 N.J.R. 2965(a).
Amended by R.2003 d.187, effective May 5, 2003.
See: 34 N.J.R. 4248(a), 35 N.J.R. 1939(c).

In (b), rewrote 4.

Amended by R.2004 d.67, effective February 17, 2004.
See: 35 N.J.R. 4627(a), 36 N.J.R. 949(b).

In (b)8, substituted “that” for “, which” preceding “are 100 square feet
or less in area”, substituted “Group R-2, R-3, R-4 or R-5” for “Use
Groups R-2, R-3 or R-4”, and inserted “the requirements at” preceding
“N.J.A.C. 5:23-9.9”,

Amended by R.2005 d.228, effective July 18, 2005.
See: 37 N.J.R. 163(a), 37 N.J.R. 2673(b).

Added (g).

Amended by R.2006 d.157, effective May 1, 2006.
See: 37 N.J.R. 3108(a), 38 N.J.R. 1824(a).

Deleted (a)1; and in (b), rewrote 4 and added (b)10.
Amended by R.2006 d.355, effective October 2, 2006.
See: 38 N.J.R. 1789(a), 38 N.J.R. 4175(a).

Rewrote (a)l.

Administrative correction.

See: 38 N.J.R. 5355(b).

Amended by R.2009 d.126, effective April 20, 2009.
See: 41 N.J.R. 16(a), 41 N.J.R. 1725(a).

In (b)8, substituted “construction permit for building work” for “per-
mit”, inserted “and which do not contain a water, gas, oil or sewer con-
nection”, and rewrote the last sentence.

Next Page is 23-9

23-8.3

5:23-2.15 Construction permits—application

(a) The application for a permit shall be submitted on the
standard Construction Permit Application form prescribed by
the Commissioner at N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.5(b)2 and shall be
accompanied by the required fee, as provided for in this
subchapter and N.J.A.C. 5:23-4. The application shall contain
a general description of the proposed work, its location, the
use and occupancy of all parts of the building or structure and
all portions of the site or lot not covered by the building or
structure, and such additional information as may be required
by the construction official, which shall include, but not be
limited to, the following:

1. The name and address of the owner: Where the
owner is not a resident of the State, he shall designate a
resident as agent for the purpose of service of any notices
or orders which may be necessary. Such address shall not
be limited to a post office box, but shall specify a physical
location where such owner or agent may be found during
normal business hours. Where the owner is a corporation,
partnership or other business entity, the application shall
indicate the names and addresses of the officers, or other
responsible persons upon whom service may be made;

2. The street address and lot and block number of the
property upon which the building or structure is proposed
to be erected;

3. A description of the proposed work, including the
use group classification, proposed construction type, lot
ground coverage in square feet, total floor area in square
feet, total building or structure volume in cubic feet, the
total number of plumbing fixtures, the total number of
electrical fixtures, outlets and major appliances, a descrip-
tion of the type of heating system, the source of water
supply, the mode of sanitary waste disposal and a listing of
any special, unusual or hazardous facilities proposed for
inclusion in the building or structure;

Supp. 4-20-09



~

NS

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-2.16

application for purposes of an appeal to the Construction
Board of Appeals, unless such period of time has been ex-
tended with the consent of the applicant. Whenever plans
have been rejected and are thereafter revised and resubmitted,
the revised plans shall be released if the deficiencies that were
stated as grounds for rejection have been corrected and code
compliance has been demonstrated. In that case, a written
notice of release shall be given to the applicant not later than
seven business days after the resubmission of the revised
plans. When the grounds for rejection have not been corrected
or when code compliance has not been demonstrated, a writ-
ten notice of rejection stating the grounds for rejection shall
be given to the applicant not later than seven business days
after the resubmission of the revised plans.

1. Exception: For a building designed in conformance
with the one-and two-family dwelling subcode, where the
Department or local enforcing agency has released a proto-
type plan which is to be used for the work covered by the
permit application, the construction official shall act on the
application within three business days.

i.  Where the prototype release did not include the
foundation detail, the construction official shall act on
the application within seven business days.

2. Exception: For a building designed in conformance
with the building subcode, where the Department or local
enforcing agency has released a plan which is to be used
for the work covered by the permit application, provided
that the permit is complete, the construction official shall
act on the application within five business days.

(b) Suspension of permit: Any permit issued shall become
invalid if the authorized work is not commenced within 12
months after issuance of the permit, or if the authorized work
is suspended or abandoned for a period of six months after
the time of commencing the work.

(c) Previous approvals: The rules shall not require changes
in the plans, construction or designated use of a building for
which a lawful permit has been heretofore issued or otherwise
lawfully authorized, and the construction of which shall have
been actively prosecuted within six months after the operative
date of the rules and completed with dispatch. This six
months provision shall also apply to subsequent amendments.

(d) Signature to permit: The construction official shall at-
tach his signature to every permit; or he may authorize a sub-
ordinate to affix such signature thereto. By doing so he shall
certify that each responsible subcode official shall have re-
viewed and approved the application for permit.

(e) Released plans: The construction official shall stamp or
endorse in writing both sets of plans released, and one set of
such released plans shall be retained and the other set shall be
kept at the building site, open to inspection of the construc-
tion official or the construction official’s authorized repre-
sentative at all reasonable times.

23-15

(f) Revocation of permits:

1. The construction official may revoke a permit or
approval issued under the provisions of this code in the
following cases:

i.  If the applicant has submitted any false statement
or misrepresentation of fact in the application or on the
plans on which the permit or approval was based; or

ii. If the project for which the permit was obtained
is not completed by the third anniversary of the date of
issuance of the permit or January 14, 2005, whichever is
later. If a project is not completed by the such date, the
permit holder may apply to the enforcing agency for a
one-year extension of time for completion of the project.
The enforcing agency shall not unreasonably withhold
approval of any such extension request. If the project is
not completed within the time allowed, the enforcing
agency shall take such action under the code as may be
appropriate, including, without limitation, demolition of
the structure, in which case the legal authority of the
jurisdiction shall institute appropriate action against the
owner of the property for recovery of the costs incurred.
The provisions of this subparagraph shall not apply to:

(1) Improvements to the interior of a building in
which the permit holder is currently residing, if such
improvements are not visible from outside of the

property;

(2) Any building in which all exterior work and
all required site improvements have been completed,;
or

(3) Any project currently under the control of a
mortgagee in possession.

(g) Approval of part: The construction official shall issue a
permit for the construction of foundations or any other part of
a building or structure before the entire plans and specifica-
tions for the whole building or structure have been submitted,
provided adequate information and detailed statements have
been filed complying with all the pertinent requirements of
this code. The holder of such permit for the foundations or
other part of a building or structure shall proceed at his own
risk with the building operation and without assurance that a
permit for the entire structure will be granted.

(h) Posting of permit: A true copy of the construction
permit shall be kept on the site of operations open to inspec-
tion during the entire time of prosecution of the work and
until the completion of the same.

(i) Notice of start: At least 24 hours notice of start of work
under a construction permit shall be given to the construction
official.

(5) Conditions of permit: The issuance of the construction
permit shall be conditioned upon the following:

1. The payment of appropriate fees;

Supp. 12-15-08



5:23-2.16

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

2. That work will conform to the requirements of the
code applicable to the work for which the permit has been
issued including prior approvals and any approved amend-
ments thereto;

3. That the permit is a license to proceed with the work
and shall not be construed as authority to violate, cancel or
set aside any of the provisions of the regulations;

4. That the owner, his agent, contractor or other em-
ployees will assist the enforcing agency in its inspection
work, if requested; and

5. That all escrows required to be paid by the applicant,
pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.17(d), in connection with work
done under permits issued for development-wide violation
correction, pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.35(a)1, have been
paid unless there is an appeal pending. For purposes of
applying this paragraph, any escrow due from any person
or entity affiliated with the applicant by way of having any
common officers, directors, or shareholders with at least a
ten percent interest shall be deemed to be due from the
applicant.

(k) Upon request of the local health department, the con-
struction official shall supply copies of permits issued for
lead abatement work.

Amended by R.1993 d.420, effective September 7, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 2158(a), 25 N.J.R. 4072(a).

Amended by R.1995 d.381, effective July 17, 1995.

See: 27 N.J.R. 970(a), 27 N.J.R. 2715(a).

Amended by R.1995 d.544, effective October 16, 1995.
See: 27 N.J.R. 2827(a), 27 N.J.R. 3933(a).

Amended by R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a).

Amended by R.1998 d.36, effective January 5, 1998.
See: 29 N.J.R. 4214(a), 30 N.J.R. 193(a).

Deleted (k); recodified existing (/) as (k).

Amended by R.2003 d.216, effective May 19, 2003.
See: 35 N.J.R. 16(a), 35 N.J.R. 2203(a).

Rewrote the section.

Amended by R.2004 d.144, effective April 5, 2004.
See: 35 NJ.R. 4944(a), 36 N.J.R. 1753(a).

In (a), rewrote 1 and added 2.

Amended by R.2004 d.364, effective October 4, 2004 (operative January

14, 2005).

See: 36 N.J.R. 2604(a), 36 N.J.R. 4440(a).

Rewrote (f).

Amended by R.2006 d.355, effective October 2, 2006.
See: 38 N.J.R. 1789(a), 38 N.J.R. 4175(a).

In (j)4, substituted “; and” for a period at the end; and added (j)5.
Amended by R.2007 d.124, effective May 7, 2007.

See: 38 N.J.R. 3708(a), 39 N.J.R. 1669(a).

In (a)2, deleted “prototype™ preceding “plan”, inserted “provided that
the permit is complete,”, and substituted “five” for “seven”.
Administrative correction.

See: 40 NJ.R. 3991(a).

Case Notes

Construction permit could be voided by developer suspending con-
struction for period of more than six months. Palatine I v. Planning Bd.
of Tp. of Montville, 133 N.J. 546, 628 A.2d 321 (1993).

Determination as to whether conditions of a prior approval have been

met is made by the agency or official authorized to issue the prior
approval, not the construction code enforcing agency. Club Flirt v. Dep’t

Supp. 12-15-08

of Community Affairs, OAL Dkt. No. CAF 09333-06, 2007 N.J. AGEN
LEXIS 336, Final Decision (March 26, 2007).

Appeal of a local planning board’s decision that construction does not
conform to the approved site plan is to the Law Division of Superior
Court; in the event of a final court decision reversing the planning
board’s ruling, any order to stop construction that was based on the
planning board’s ruling would be rescinded. A planning board’s ruling
cannot be contested indirectly in an administrative proceeding to hear an
appeal of the stop construction order that is a necessary consequence of
the planning board’s ruling. Club Flirt v. Dep’t of Community Affairs,
OAL Dkt. No. CAF 09333-06, 2007 N.J. AGEN LEXIS 336, Final
Decision (March 26, 2007).

5:23-2.16A Records retention

(a) Copies of the following documents shall be retained by
the construction official for the life of the building or struc-
ture:

—

Construction applications;

Permits;

Permit updates;

Decisions on applications for variations;
Decisions of the Construction Board of Appeals;
Certificates of occupancy;

Elevator inspections;

The ongoing inspection control card; and

¥ ® N o kW

Notices of unsafe structure.

(b) Permits that have been revoked shall be kept for at
least three years, or until the building or structure is demol-
ished, whichever comes first.

(c) Plans and specifications including amended drawings,
shall be retained by the construction official for a period of at
least 10 years unless litigation is pending.

1. Plans and specifications, including amended draw-
ings, shall be retained for the life of the building or struc-
ture for the following:

i.  Hospitals and emergency care facilities;
ii. Fire, rescue and police stations;
iii. Designated emergency shelters;

iv. Designated emergency preparedness, communi-
cation, and operation centers;

v. Power generating stations;

vi. Buildings of Groups H-1 or H-2;
vii. Prisons;

viii. Casino hotels;

ix. Aviation control towers;

23-16



N

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-2.32

2. Notice of unsafe structure: If an unsafe or unsanitary
condition is found in a building or structure, the construc-
tion official shall serve a written notice describing the
building or structure deemed unsafe and specifying the re-
quired repairs or improvements to be made to render the
building or structure safe and secure, or requiring the
unsafe building or structure or portion thereof to be vacated
or demolished within a stipulated time. Such notice shall
require the person thus notified to immediately declare to
the construction official his or her acceptance or rejection
of the terms of the order. Such person may seek review
before the Construction Board of Appeals within 15 days
of receipt of the notice.

3. Restoration of unsafe structure: A building or struc-
ture condemned by the construction official may be re-
stored to a safe condition in accordance with N.J.A.C.
5:23-6, Rehabilitation Subcode. A certificate of approval or
certificate of occupancy, as appropriate, shall be obtained
prior to reoccupancy of the building or structure.

4. Posting notice of unsafe structure: If the person ad-
dressed with a notice of unsafe structure cannot be found
within the municipality after diligent search, then such no-
tice shall be sent by registered or certified mail to the last
known address of such person, as on file with the office of
the tax collector, and a copy of the notice of unsafe struc-
ture shall be posted in a conspicuous place on the premises;
and such procedures shall be deemed the equivalent of
personal notice.

5. Upon refusal or neglect of the person served with a
notice of unsafe structure to comply with the requirements
of the order to abate the unsafe condition, the construction
official shall, in addition to any other remedies herein pro-
vided, forward the matter to the legal counsel of the juris-
diction for an action to compel compliance.

(b) Emergency measures:

1. When, in the opinion of the construction official and
appropriate subcode officials, there is actual and immediate
danger of failure or collapse of a building or structure or
any part thereof which would endanger life, or when any
structure or part of a structure has fallen and life is en-
dangered by the occupation of the building or structure, the
construction official is hereby authorized and empowered
to order and require the occupants to vacate the same
forthwith. The construction official shall cause to be posted
at each entrance to such building a notice reading as
follows: This structure is unsafe and its use or occupancy
has been prohibited by the construction official, and it shall
be unlawful for any person to enter such building or struc-
ture except for the purpose of making the required repairs
or demolishing the same. The order of the construction
official shall be effective immediately.

2. Temporary safeguards: When, in the opinion of the
construction official, there is actual and immediate danger
of collapse or failure of a building or structure or any part

23-29

thereof which would endanger life, the construction official
shall cause the necessary work to be done to render such
building or structure or part thereof temporarily safe,
whether or not the legal procedure herein has been in-
stituted. Such work may include such demolition as may be
necessary in order to eliminate any actual and immediate
danger to human life; provided, however, that any demo-
lition work shall not commence until at least 24 hours
following service of notice of the pending demolition upon
the owner, unless such service is not possible because the
identity or the address of the owner cannot be determined
from public records. Upon expiration of the 24-hour pe-
riod, demolition may proceed unless stayed by order of the
Superior Court.

~

3. Closing streets: When necessary for the public
safety, the construction official may temporarily close side-
walks, streets, buildings and structures and places adjacent
to such unsafe structure, and prohibit the same from being
used.

4. Emergency repairs or demolition: For the purpose of
this section, the construction official shall employ the nec-
essary labor and materials to perform the required work as
expeditiously as possible.

5. Costs of emergency repairs: Costs incurred in the
performance of emergency work shall be paid from the
treasury of the jurisdiction on certificate of the construction
official; and the legal authority of the jurisdiction shall
institute appropriate action against the owner of the prem-
ises for the recovery of such costs.

6. Appeals: An emergency order issued by a municipal
construction official pursuant to this subsection shall be
appealable only to a court of competent jurisdiction.

Amended by R.1991 d.509, effective October 7, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 2236(a), 23 N.J.R. 3001(a).
C.O. required prior to reoccupancy.
Amended by R.1996 d.236, effective May 20, 1996 (operative January
1, 1997).
See: 27 N.J.R. 4050(a), 28 N.J.R. 2586(a).
Amended by R.1999 d.424, effective December 6, 1999.
See: 31 N.J.R. 2428(a), 31 N.J.R. 4001(c).
Rewrote (a)3.
Amended by R.2003 d.201, effective May 19, 2003.
See: 35 N.J.R. 303(a), 35 N.J.R. 2207(a).
Rewrote (b).

Law Review and Journal Commentaries

Tort Claims Act—Landlords. P.R. Chenoweth, 138 N.J.L.J. No. 2, 77
(1994).

Case Notes

Civil rights action challenging township actions regarding use of
property as church were not ripe for adjudication until township plan-
ning board decided site plan application and any need for variance.
Trinity Resources, Inc. v. Township of Delanco, D.N.J.1994, 842
F.Supp. 782.

Mobile park owner that leased space to mobile home owners could

not require residents to convert from oil heat to gas heat as condition of
approving prospective purchases. Garden Park Mobile Home Owners

Supp. 7-21-08



5:23-2.32

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Ass’n v. Garden Park Associates, 292 N.J.Super. 442, 678 A.2d 1191
(L.1996).

City, as landowner, did not have immunity from claim it negligently
maintained buildings in dangerous condition, resulting in spread of fire
to surrounding buildings. Saldana v. DiMedio, 275 N.J.Super. 488, 646
A.2d 522 (A.D.1994).

If activities of building inspector and public works director required
discretionary decisions and were subject to qualified immunity, standard
of liability would be whether decisions were palpably unreasonable or
whether they merely failed to follow mandates of higher-up decisions.
Saldana v. DiMedio, 275 N.J.Super. 488, 646 A.2d 522 (A.D.1994).

“Dangerous condition” for tort liability was satisfied with respect to
surrounding buildings damaged by fire which spread from buildings on
city-owned lots. Saldana v. DiMedio, 275 N.J.Super. 488, 646 A.2d 522
(A.D.1994).

Loss of housing which occurred when premises was evacuated for
safety of tenants upon broken water main was a natural disaster that
precluded payment of relocation benefits. Union Gardens’ v. Township
of Montclair, 95 N.J.A.R.2d (CAF) 85.

5:23-2.33 Service of notice

Except as is specifically provided for by the act with re-
spect to stop construction orders, service of notices and orders
pursuant to this section shall be upon the owner or the person
specified as agent for receipt of same in the application for a
permit or the person responsible for the work or in the case of
unsafe structures upon any agent or person in control of the
building. Service may be made by personal delivery or by
leaving a copy at the dwelling house or usual place of abode
of such person, with a competent member of his household of
the age of 14 years or older than residing therein, or by any
other method or upon any other person approved pursuant to
Rules 4:4-4 and 4:4-5 of the New Jersey Supreme Court, or
which is otherwise consistent with due process.

5:23-2.34 Protection of adjoining properties

(a) Owners who undertake construction, rehabilitation, or
demolition work at their properties shall protect adjoining
properties from damage caused by the work.

(b) The owner intending to undertake the construction, re-
habilitation, or demolition work that could potentially damage
adjoining properties shall deliver written notice of such intent
to the owners of the affected properties. The notice shall
request written permission to enter the adjoining properties to
determine the measures that must be taken to safeguard the
properties from damage.

1. Written consent from the owners of the adjoining
properties must be obtained prior to entering the properties.

2. In those cases where owners of adjoining properties
refuse access, work shall not proceed unless access to the
properties is granted by the courts.

(c) The measures to be taken to safeguard adjoining
properties shall be submitted with the permit application for
review and approval by the construction official.

Supp. 7-21-08

23-30

(d) Upon approval of the measures to safeguard the adjoin-
ing properties, the owner intending to undertake the construc-
tion, rehabilitation, or demolition work shall provide a copy
of the measures to the owners of adjoining properties and
shall request written permission to implement the measures
prior to the commencement of work.

i. Written consent from the owners of the adjoining
properties to implement the measures to safeguard the
properties must be obtained.

Repealed by R.1996 d.236, effective May 20, 1996 (operative January 1,
1997).

See: 27 N.J.R. 4050(a), 28 N.J.R. 2586(a).
Section was “Construction board of appeals”.

New Rule, R.2008 d.39, effective March 3, 2008.

See: 39 N.J.R. 2175(a), 40 N.J.R. 1084(a).
Section was “Reserved”.

5:23-2.35 Enforcement actions after issuance of
certificate(s) of occupancy

(a) Subsequent to the issuance of a certificate of occu-
pancy, the construction official shall issue a notice of vio-
lation for any violation of the provisions of the Code in effect
at the time of permit application that comes to his or her
attention. Pursuant to N.J.S.A. 2A:14-1.1, no notice of
violation may be issued to the developer or to any contractor
more than 10 years after issuance of the certificate of occu-

pancy.

1. If violations of any of the following provisions of
the Code in effect at the time of permit application are
found in a residential structure in a development, other than
Group R-1, subsequent to the issuance of a certificate of
occupancy, the construction official shall issue such notices
and orders as may be necessary to ensure that all units
within the development that might have similar violations
are inspected for such violations and that any such vio-
lations found are cited and abated:

i.  N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.32 Unsafe structures;

ii. The following provisions of the building sub-
code:

(1) Chapter 4, Special Detailed Requirements
Based on Use and Occupancy, except for sections
401, 402.3, 403.14, 409, 412;

(2) Chapter 7, Fire-resistant Rated Construction;
(3) Section 803, Wall and Ceiling Finishes;
(4) Chapter 9, Fire Protection Systems; and

(5) Chapter 10, Means of Egress, except for sec-
tions 1009.3.2, 1009.3.3, 1009.10, 1009.11, 1025.11,
1025.13 and 1025.14;

iii. The following provisions of the one- and two-
family dwelling subcode:

(1) Section R-302.1, Exterior walls;

Next Page is 23-30.0.1



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-2.38

(2) Section R-313, Smoke Alarms; and

(3) Sections R-317.1 and R-317.2, Dwelling Unit

- Fire Separations;

iv. The following provisions of the electrical sub-
code:

(1) Section 240.3,
Against Overcurrent;

(2) Section 2404,
Against Overcurrent;

(3) Section 2504,
Grounding and Bonding;

Protection of Equipment

Protection of Conductors

General Requirements for

v.  Subchapter 7, the barrier free subcode; and

vi. Any structural deficiency, which is present or
likely to occur that has the potential for injury or sig-
nificant damage to the livability of a home. This shall
include any structural member that exceeds the per-
mitted deflection established at N.J.A.C. 5:23-6.5(c)1i
through iii.

2. The municipality may retain the services of a pro-
fessional engineer or registered architect, to be paid at an
hourly rate and to work subject to the supervision and
control of the construction official, for inspections, review
of plans and supporting documents and preparation of
reports and documents, in connection with enforcement of
(a)1 above provided that the professional retained is in-

- dependent of both the builder and the homeowner and has
no actual or apparent conflict of interest that would call
into question his or her ability to carry out these duties im-
partially. Any person carrying out inspections under such a
contract shall be, at a minimum, a licensed engineer or a
registered architect or shall have a bachelor’s degree from
an accredited institution of higher education in engineering
or in architecture, or in engineering or architectural tech-
nology and shall have not less than five years of experience
in the design, construction or rehabilitation of woodframe
structures.

Repealed by R.1996 d.236, effective May 20, 1996 (operative January 1,

1997).

See: 27 N.J.R. 4050(a), 28 N.J.R. 2586(a).

Section was “Applicant’s right of appeal; procedure”.
New Rule, R.2006 d.353, effective October 2, 2006.
See: 38 N.J.R. 1789(a), 38 N.J.R. 4175(a).

Amended by R.2008 d.192, effective July 21, 2008.
See: 39 N.J.R. 4985(a), 40 N.J.R. 4314(b).

Section was “Enforcement actions in residential developments after
issuance of certificate(s) of occupancy”. In (a)lii(l), substituted
“403.14” for “403.12, 406.1, 406.2, 406.3.1, 406.3.2, 406.3.3, 406.3.4,
406.3.5, 406.3.6, 406.3.7, 406.4, 406.5”; in (a)lii(5), substituted
“1009.3.2, 1009.3.3, 1009.10, 1009.11, 1025.11, 1025.13 and 1025.14”
for “1003.3.3.3.1, 1003.3.3.3.2, 1003.3.3.11, 1003.3.12, 1008.9,
1009.11, and 1008.12”; in (a)1iii(1), substituted “Section” for “Sections™
and “Exterior walls” for “R-302.2 and R-302.3, Required Fire Resis-
tance Ratings”; in (a)liii(2), substituted “R-313” for “R-317”; and in
(a)1iii(3), substituted “R-317.1” for “R-321.1” and “R-317.2” for “R-
321.2”; and in (a)lvi, inserted a comma following “deficiency” and

: b s
" inserted “through iii”.

23-30.0.1

5:23-2.36  (Reserved)

Repealed by R.1996 d.236, effective May 20, 1996 (operative January 1,
1997).

See: 27 N.J.R. 4050(a), 28 N.J.R. 2586(a).
Section was “Procedure of the board”.

5:23-2.37 (Reserved)

Repealed by R.1996 d.236, effective May 20, 1996 (operative January 1,
1997).

See: 27 N.J.R. 4050(a), 28 N.J.R. 2586(a).
Section was “Decision of the board”.

5:23-2.38 Departmental appeal

(a) Whenever the Department shall act as the enforcing
agency under the State Uniform Construction Code Act
(N.J.S.A. 52:27D-128), an appeal in lieu of the appeal to the
county, municipal or joint construction board of appeals may
be made to the Hearing Coordinator, Division of Codes and
Standards, Department of Community Affairs, PO Box 802,
Trenton, NJ 08625.

1. The case shall be adjudicated before the Office of
Administrative Law and the final decision shall be issued
by the Commissioner.

2. Such hearings shall be governed by the provisions of
the Administrative Procedure Act, N.J.S.A. 52:14B-1 et
seq., and the Uniform Administrative Procedure Rules,
N.J.A.C. 1:1, and the time provisions applicable to con-
struction boards of appeal.

(b) Any party in interest aggrieved by any decision made
by a facility manager or owner or administering agency with
respect to compliance with either the Barrier Free Recreation
Standards (N.J.A.C. 5:23-7.15 through 7.31) or the Play-
ground Safety Subcode (N.J.A.C. 5:23-11) shall have the
right to appeal the decision to the Department.

1. The Department shall forward a copy of the com-
plaint to the facility manager and to the facility owner or
agency responsible for administration of the facility and
shall request a response from the facility manager.

2. The facility manager shall respond in writing within
45 days of receipt of the request.

3. The Department shall review the response and shall
determine whether the complaint is justified and what
corrective measures shall be required to be taken by the
facility owner or administering agency. The Department
shall make such determination and issue any necessary
orders within 60 days.

4. In the event that the owner or administering agency
of a facility appeals any such order and the Department
determines that a contested case exists, it shall forward
such case for adjudication in an administrative hearing
before the Office of Administrative Law and the final
decision shall be issued by the Commissioner. Hearings
shall be conducted in accordance with the provisions of the

Supp. 7-21-08



5:23-2.38

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 7-21-08

Administrative Procedure Act (N.J.S.A. 52:14B-1 et seq.)
and the Uniform Administrative Procedure Rules (N.J.A.C.
1:1).

5. A “party in interest” may be either the owner, or
authorized representative of the owner, of the premises that
is the subject of the decision or an occupant, user or pro-

23-30.0.2

spective occupant or user, of the premises, or a group
representative of such occupants, users or prospective oc-
cupants or users; provided, however, that an occupant, user
or representative group shall only be deemed to be a party
in interest if notice of such interest has been given to the
Department by the party prior to the issuance of the De-
partment’s determination.

Next Page is 23-30.1

"



\\wggr/

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.11

manufactured construction within the jurisdiction of a local
enforcing agency that is not a Class I or Class II agency, as
the case may be.

8. Health care facilities, as defined in N.J.A.C. 5:23-
1.4;

9. Public school facilities, as defined in N.J.A.C. 5:23-
1.4;

10. Prototype plans intended for use in more than one
municipality; and

11. High level alarm systems in terminals, as defined in
N.J.S.A. 52:27D-214.

(b) The Department of Community Affairs shall be the
sole plan review agency for elevators, escalators, and moving
walks in structures of Groups other than R-2, R-3, R-4, or R-5
in which the elevator devices are wholly within dwelling
units and not accessible to the general public, in all buildings
and structures other than those that:

1. Are in a municipality that has an elevator subcode
official; and

2. Are otherwise within the plan review jurisdiction of
the local enforcing agency.

(c) A permit shall not be issued until the required plans for
the building or structure have been released by the depart-
ment. The Department shall insure that the municipal enforc-
ing agency receives a copy of the released plans.

1. Exception: In the case of a permit application based
upon prototype plans released by the Department, it shall
be the responsibility of the applicant to submit the items
listed at N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.15(f)2ii, including a reference set
of plans, the prototype file identification number, the plan
number and date of the released prototype plan, to the
municipal enforcing agency.

(d) The department may perform field inspections for any
of the above projects when it deems such activity appropriate.
However, such action shall not relieve the municipality of the
obligation to perform field inspections for any project for
which the municipality has granted a permit.

(e) Whenever the department shall determine that there
exists a violation of these regulations, it shall take appropriate
action and shall provide the municipality with copies of all
notices, orders, and other applicable information. The depart-
ment and any municipality may consolidate or take other
steps to expedite any matter of which they jointly complain,
but in no event shall the owner of any building subject to the
act be sanctioned twice for the same violations.

(f) In any case where the department shall notify a munic-
ipality that a violation exists, no certificate of occupancy may
issue until the department notifies the municipality that the
violation has been abated.

(g) The Department of Community Affairs shall be the
sole agency for the enforcement of the Barrier Free Recrea-
tion Standards (N.J.A.C. 5:23-7.15 through 7.31). Any com-

23-39

plaint of noncompliance with these rules shall be forwarded
to the Department.

(h) The Department of Community Affairs shall be the
sole agency having authority to grant variations from the
requirements of the Asbestos Hazard Abatement Subcode,
pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-8.4.

(i) The Department of Community Affairs shall be the
sole agency for the enforcement of the Playground Safety
Subcode (N.J.A.C. 5:23-11) with regard to all matters not
within the scope of a construction permit issued by a local
enforcing agency; provided, however, that this subsection
shall not be construed as prohibiting the Department of Edu-
cation from including review of compliance with applicable
playground requirements in its ongoing district monitoring
process.

(j) The Department shall be the sole enforcing agency for
the following work:

1. Amusement rides;
2. Ski lifts;

3. Billboards located on land owned or controlled by
any State, county or local department, agency, board, com-
mission, authority, or instrumentality; and

4. Liquefied petroleum gas installations, except vapor
delivery installations utilizing containers with an aggregate
water capacity of 2,000 gallons or less, which jurisdiction
is retained by the municipal enforcing agency.

Amended by R.1981 d.455, effective December 7, 1981.
See: 13 NJ.R. 561(b), 13 N.J.R. 886(b).
Correction: Codification error and (a)6 was missing.
See: 16 N.J.R. 1621(a).
Administrative Change:
3.11A administratively.
See: 18 N.J.R. 1842(a).
Amended by R.1988 d.352, effective August 1, 1988.
See: 19 N.J.R. 1270(a), 20 N.J.R. 1873(b).
Added (f).
Amended by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).
Industrialized/modular buildings requirements added to (a)7.
Amended by R.1990 d.507, effective October 15, 1990.
See: 22 NJ.R. 2208(a), 22 N.J.R. 3214(a).
Text conformed to BOCA National Code/1990.
Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a).
Enforcement of elevator, moving walk and escalator requirements for
other than R-3 and R-4 reserved to Department.
Amended by R.1992 d.147, effective April 6, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 170(a), 24 N.J.R. 1397(a).
Elevators wholly within R-2 residences exempt.
Amended by R.1992 d.183, effective April 20, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 167(a), 24 N.J.R. 1475(b).
Enforcement of public employees’ indoor air quality subcode
assigned to DCA.
Amended by R.1994 d.28, effective January 18, 1994.
See: 25 NJ.R. 4546(b), 26 N.J.R. 352(a).
Amended by R.1994 d.96, effective February 22, 1994.
See: 26 N.J.R. 1073(a).
Amended by R.1997 d.377, effective September 15, 1997.
See: 29 NJ.R. 2741(b), 29 N.J.R. 4102(b).
In (g), amended N.J.A.C. references; deleted (g)1; and substantially
amended (h).
Amended by R.1997 d.417, effective October 6, 1997.

This section has been divided into 3.11 and

Supp. 11-5-07



5:23-3.11

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

See: 29 N.J.R. 3387(a), 29 N.J.R. 4285(a).

In (a), inserted “Except as otherwise provided ... and (d),”; added (a)8
and 9; and in (g), amended N.J.A.C. references.
Amended by R.1999 d.351, effective October 18, 1999.
See: 31 N.J.R. 1838(a), 31 N.J.R. 3082(a).

Added (i).

Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April 17, 2000.
See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a).

In (a), changed N.J.A.C. reference; and added (j).
Amended by R.2001 d.127, effective April 16, 2001.
See: 33 N.J.R. 392(a), 33 N.J.R. 1195(a).

In (g), amended the N.J.A.C. reference.

Amended by R.2001 d.141, effective May 7, 2001.
See: 32 N.J.R. 3917(a), 33 N.J.R. 746(a), 33 N.J.R. 1399(d).

In (j)6, inserted “or vapor delivery installations utilizing containers
with an aggregate water capacity of 2,000 gallons or less,” following
“(building subcoede Use Group R-3/R-4)”.

Amended by R.2004 d.67, effective February 17, 2004.
See: 35N.J.R. 4627(a), 36 N.J.R. 949(b).

In (b), substituted “moving walks in structures of Groups other than
R-2, R-3, R-4, or R-5” for “moving walks in Use Groups R-3, R-4, or R-
2 structures” preceding “in which the elevator devices are wholly within
dwelling units™.

Amended by R.2004 d.144, effective April 5, 2004.
See: 35 N.J.R. 4944(a), 36 N.J.R. 1753(a).

Added (a)10; in (c), substituted “released” for “approved” following
“enforcing agency receives a copy of the” and added 1.

Administrative correction.
See: 36 N.J.R. 1757(a).
Amended by R.2004 d.260, effective July 6, 2004.
See: 35 N.J.R. 3474(b), 36 N.J.R. 3274(a).

In (j), rewrote 3, deleted former 4 and 5, and recodified former 6 as 4.
Amended by R.2004 d.291, effective August 2, 2004.

See: 36 N.J.R. 1858(a), 36 N.J.R. 3525(b).

In j(4), deleted, “one- and two-family residential (building subcode
Use Groups R-3 and R-5) or” preceding “vapor delivery”.

Amended by R.2005 d.446, effective December 19, 2005.
See: 37 N.J.R. 2747(a), 37 N.J.R. 4907(a).

In (a), added «, plans and equipment” to the introductory paragraph

and added (a)11.
Administrative correction.
See: 38 N.J.R. 3024(a).
Administrative correction.

See: 39 N.J.R. 4571(a).

Case Notes

Delaware River Port Authority was not subject to Construction Code
or anti-discrimination laws. Eastern Paralyzed Veterans Ass’n, Inc. v.
City of Camden, 111 N.J. 389, 545 A.2d 127 (1988).

5:23-3.11A Public school facility plan review and
inspections; Uniform Construction Code
enhancements in public school facilities

(a) Plan review for the following types of projects shall be
performed by the Department of Community Affairs. Prior to
the release of plans for the following types of projects, the
Department of Education shall ensure that the plans meet the
standards for educational adequacy set forth in N.J.A.C.
6A:26:

1. New public school buildings, including the creation
of a new public school building through the change of use
of an existing building;

2. Additions to existing public school buildings;

Supp. 11-5-07

3. Alterations changing the total number of instruc-
tional spaces, the size of any such spaces or type of any
such spaces;

4. Installations of mobile units; or

5. Any site or building change or alteration for the pur-
pose of making the site and school barrier-free pursuant to
N.J.A.C. 5:23-7 and accessible to the handicapped pursuant
to section 504 of the Federal Rehabilitation Act of 1973.

(b) In lieu of obtaining construction code plan review and
release from the Department of Community Affairs, a school
district, upon notice to and approval by the Department, may
secure construction code plan review and release from a mu-
nicipal code enforcing agency, pursuant to P.L. 1990, c¢.23.

1. The municipal code enforcing agency providing con-
struction code plan approval must agree to perform the
review and must be appropriately classified for the pro-
posed project in accordance with this chapter.

i.  The municipal code enforcing agency in the
municipality where the proposed project is to take place
shall be given the right of first refusal to review the
plans provided that the agency is appropriately classified
for the proposed project in accordance with this chapter.

2. The municipal code enforcing agency performing
the construction code plan review may require the payment
of any municipal plan review fees.

3. No construction permit shall be issued for a public
school facility unless and until the final plans and spec-
ifications have been released by the Department or an ap-
propriately classified municipal code enforcing agency.

4. The municipal code enforcing agency within the
jurisdiction in which the facility is located shall be
responsible for construction permit issuance, construction
inspection and certificate of occupancy issuance.

5. Amendments to released plans and specifications for
reasons other than educational adequacy shall be submitted
for review and release to the Department or the municipal
code enforcing agency, whichever originally released the
plans.

6. Release of the plans by the Department or the mu-
nicipal code enforcing agency, as the case may be, shall not
preclude the enforcing agency doing the inspection from
issuing a stop work order in the event of a violation of the
code. The enforcing agency doing the inspection shall not,
however, issue a stop work order based on its disagreement
with the released plans unless the agency that released the
plans, be it the Department or another local enforcing
agency, agrees that the issuance of such an order is ap-
propriate. In the event that the enforcing agency doing the
inspection believes there to be an error in the plans, that
enforcing agency shall give prompt notice of the error that
is believed to exist to the Department or the municipal
agency that reviewed the plans, as the case may be.

23-40



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.16

trical subcode official. Approval shall be in accordance
with N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.7, 3.8 and 3.8A.”

ii. The definition of “Authority having jurisdiction”
is replaced with “Unless otherwise specifically noted,
the authority having jurisdiction for the Electrical Sub-
code shall be the Electrical Subcode Official.”

iii. The definition of the term “building” is deleted
and in lieu thereof, substitute the definition of the term
“building” found in N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4”.

3. Chapter 2 of the electrical subcode, entitled “Wiring

and Protection,” is amended as follows:

i.  Section 210.8 (A)?2) and (5) of Article 210,
entitled Branch Circuits, is deleted; it is replaced by
Section 210.8(A)(2) and (5) and the exceptions in the
National Electrical Code 2005 as follows:

“210.8(A)(2) — Garages, and also accessory build-
ings that have a floor located at or below grade level
not intended as habitable rooms and limited to storage
areas, work areas, and areas of similar use.

Exception No. 1 to (2) — Receptacles that are not
readily accessible.

Exception No. 2 to (2) — A single receptacle or a
duplex receptacle for two appliances located within
dedicated space for each appliance that, in normal use,
is not easily moved from one place to another and that
is cord-and-plug connected in accordance with

i.  Section 300.4(A)(1) is amended to delete the
words from “so that the edge...” on line four through “...
cannot be maintained” on line six and in lieu thereof
substitute “as required by the building subcode. Where
the distance from the edge of the hole to the nearest edge
of the wood member is less than 32 mm (1% inches).”

ii. Section 334.10(1) is amended to add “and acces-
sory buildings or structures” after the word dwellings.

iii. Section 334.12(A)(2) is deleted in its entirety.

iv. In Section 342.30, Intermediate Metal Conduit,
“or permitted to be unsupported in accordance with
342.30.(C)” shall be deleted; in Section 344.30, Rigid
Metal Conduit, “or permitted to be unsupported in
accordance with 344.30.(C)” shall be deleted; in Section
352.30, Rigid Polyvinyl Chloride Conduit, “or permitted
to be unsupported in accordance with 352.30.(C)” shall
be deleted; in Section 355.30, Metallic Tubing
Reinforced Thermosetting Resin Conduit, “or permitted
to be unsupported in accordance with 355.30.(C)” shall
be deleted; and in Section 358.30, Electrical Metallic
Tubing, “or permitted to be unsupported in accordance
with 358.30.(C)” shall be deleted.

v.  Subsection (C) shall be deleted from each of the
following sections: Section 342.30, Intermediate Metal
Conduit, Section 344.30, Rigid Metal Conduit, Section
352.30, Rigid Polyvinyl Chloride Conduit, Section
355.30, Metallic Tubing Reinforced Thermosetting
Resin Conduit, and Section 358.30, Electrical Metallic

~ 400.7(A)(6), (A)7, or (A)(8). Tubing.

Receptacles installed unde}* the exceptions to 5. Chapter 5 of the electrical subcode, entitled “Special
210.8(A)(2) shall not be considered as meeting the Occupancies,” is amended as follows:
requirements of 210.52(G).

. i.  Sections 514.11(B) and 514.11(C) are amended
210.8(A)(5) — Unfinished basements: For purposes to delete the phrase “authority having jurisdiction” and
of this section, unfinished basements are defined as substitute in lieu thereof the phrase “fire protection sub-
portions or areas of the basement not intended as code official
habitable rooms and limited to storage areas, work
areas, and the like. ii. Section 525.5(B) of Article 525, entitled Car-
) nivals, Circuses, Fairs and Similar Events, is deleted; it

Exception No. 1 to (5) — Receptacles that are not is replaced by Section 525.5(B) in the National Elec-
readily accessible. trical Code 2005 as follows:

Exception No. 2 to (5) — A single receptacle or a “525.5(B) Clearances to Rides and Attractions.
duplex receptacle for two appliances located within Amusement rides and amusement attractions shall be
dedicated space for each appliance that, in normal use, maintained not less than 4.5 m (15 ft) in any direction
is not easily moved from one place to another and that from overhead conductors operating at 600 volts or
is cord-and-plug connected in accordance with less, except for the conductors supplying the amuse-
400.7(A)(6), (A)7, or (A)(8). ment ride or attraction. Amusement rides or attrac-

Exception No. 3 to (5) — A receptacle supplying tion‘s shall not be located under or wit_hin 4.5 m (15 ft)
only a permanently installed fire alarm or burglar horizontally of conductors operating in excess of 600
alarm system shall not be required to have ground- volts.”
fault circuit-interrupter protection.” iii. Part IT of Article 550, entitled “Mobile Homes,

) 4. Chapter 3 of the electrical subcode, entitled “Wiring Manuf_agtured Homes, and Mobile Home Parks”
g Methods and Materials,” is amended as follows: comprising sections 550.11 through 550.25 is deleted.
N Section 550.10 shall be retained.

23-58.7 Supp. 9-7-10



5:23-3.16

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

(1) Exception—Part II is retained in its entirety in
the case of mobile/manufactured homes undergoing
repair, renovation, or alteration.

iv. In Article 551, entitled “Recreation Vehicles and
Recreation Vehicle Parks,” delete from the title the
words “Recreational Vehicles and.”

(1) Parts II, 1L, 1V, and V, comprising sections
551.20 through 551.60, are deleted in their entirety,
with the exception of Figure 551.46(C), which shall
be retained.

v. Article 552 shall be applicable to structures cov-
ered by the recreational park trailers subcode, N.J.A.C.
5:23-4D, provided that:

(1) The structure is restricted to seasonal use as
per Section 552.4. For purposes of applying this
requirement, the park in which the structure is located
shall be open for six months or less each year or
access to the structures shall be otherwise restricted to
a period of six months or less each year; and

(2) No additions, alterations, or extensions of any
kind shall be made to the electrical system or structure
unless the entire electrical system shall be made to
conform to the electrical requirements of this code
applicable to single family dwellings.

6. Annex H of the electrical subcode, entitled “Admini-
stration and Enforcement,” is deleted in its entirety.

7. Chapter 8 of the electrical subcode, entitled “Com-
munication Systems,” is amended as follows:

i.  Section 800.156, entitled “Dwelling Unit Com-
munications Outlet,” is deleted in its entirety.

(¢) A newly installed automatic lawn sprinkler system,
where such systems are not prohibited by local ordinance,
shall be equipped with an automatic rain sensor device or
switch that will override the irrigation cycle of the automatic
lawn sprinkler system when rainfall of more than one-half
inch has occurred.

Amended by R.1981 d.132, effective May 7, 1981.
See: 13 NJ.R. 121(a), 13 N.J.R. 258(d).

Amended by R.1984 d.314, effective August 6, 1984.
See: 16 NLJ.R. 1139(a), 16 N.J.R. 2084(b).

Section substantially amended.

Amended by R.1987 d.374, effective September 21, 1987.
See: 19 NLJ.R. 1024(a), 19 N.J.R. 1720(b).
Model subcode revisions.
Amended by R.1990 d.253, effective May 21, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 909(b), 22 N.J.R. 1554(a).
Amendments to (b)4i(2), ii(2).
Administrative Correction to (b)4i(2).
See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b).
Amended by R.1990 d.507, effective October 15, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 2208(a), 22 N.J.R. 3214(a).

Text conformed to BOCA National Code/1990.
Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a).

Amended by R.1998 d.332, effective July 6, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 1377(a), 30 N.J.R. 2421(b).

Supp. 9-7-10

Rewrote the section.

Amended by R.1998 d.362, effective July 20, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 1122(a), 30 N.J.R. 2644(b).

In (a), inserted a new 3.

Amended by R.2000 d.48, effective February 7, 2000.
See: 31 NJ.R. 2317(a), 32 N.J.R. 445(a).

In (a), substituted references to 1999 for references to 1996 through-
out, substituted a reference to One Batterymarch Park for a reference to
Batterymarch Park in 1i, and inserted 2i; and in (b), inserted 1ii, inserted
a new 3, recodified former 3 and 4 as 4 and 5, substituted a reference to
line four for a reference to line three and substituted a reference to line
six for a reference to line five in the new 41, and substituted a reference
to section 500-5(a)(4) for a reference to section 500-3(a)4 in the new 5i.
Amended by R.2003 d.187, effective May 5, 2003.

See: 34 N.J.R. 4248(a), 35 N.J.R. 1939(c).

Rewrote the section.

Amended by R.2003 d.240, effective June 16, 2003.
See: 34 N.J.R. 3045(a), 35 N.J.R. 2637(c).

Added (c).

Amended by R.2006 d.158, effective May 1, 2006.
See: 37 N.J.R. 4105(a), 38 N.J.R. 1827(a).

In (a)l, (a)2 and (a)2.i, substituted “2005” for “2002”; also in (a)2.i,
substituted “#06-2" for “#03-1"; in (a)3, substituted “C2-2002” for “C2—
1997”; deleted (b)1 and recodified (b)2 through (b)6 as (b)1 through
(b)5; in (b)4.ii, substituted “(2)” for “(1)”, in (b)5iii(1), substituted “4”
for “2”; in (b)3iii(2), substituted “V” for “VI” and “551.20” for
“551.10”; and inserted (b)6.

Amended by R.2007 d.310, effective October 1, 2007.
See: 39 N.J.R. 135(a), 39 N.J.R. 4113(b).

Added (b)7.

Amended by R.2007, d.384, effective December 17, 2007.
See: 39 NJ.R. 2684(a), 39 N.J.R. 5211(a).

Added new (b)4ii; recodified former (b)4ii as (b)4iii; and in (b)4iii,
substituted “(2)” for “(1)”.

Amended by R.2008 d.213, effective August 4, 2008.
See: 39 N.J.R. 2411(a), 40 N.J.R. 4523(b).

Rewrote (b)5iv.

Amended by R.2009 d.100, effective April 6, 2009.
See: 40 NJ.R. 5900(a), 41 N.J.R. 1397(a).

In the introductory paragraphs of (a)l and (a)2 and in (a)2i, sub-
stituted “2008” for “2005”; in (a)2i, substituted “#09-1” for “#06-2",
rewrote (b)3i; added (b)div and (b)4v; added new(b)5ii; recodified
former (b)Sii through (b)5iv as (b)5iii through (b)Sv; deleted
(b)5iii(1)(A) and former (b)Siv(1); recodified former (b)5iv(2) as new
(b)5iv(1); in (b)6, substituted “H” for “G”; and rewrote (b)7.

Case Notes

Former N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.6 designated “National Electrical code of
1975 as controlling code; statute of limitations. Brown v. Jersey Central
Power and Light Co., 163 N.J.Super. 179 394 A.2d 397 (App.Div.1978)
certification denied 79 N.J. 489 401 A.2d 244.

5:23-3.17 Fire protection subcode

(a) Rules concerning the subcode adopted are as follows:

1. Pursuant to the authority of P.L. 1975, c. 217 as
modified by P.L. 1996, c. 53, the Commissioner hereby
adopts the following portions of the building, electrical,
mechanical and fuel gas subcodes, to the extent delineated
in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.4, as the fire protection subcode for
New Jersey.

i.  International Building Code/2009 of the Interna-
tional Code Council, Inc. (N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.14):

(1) Chapter 3—Use and Occupancy Classifica-
tion;

23-58.8



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-4.4

5:23-4.4 Municipal enforcing agencies—organization

(a) The municipality shall organize its enforcing agency in
accordance with the ordinance adopted pursuant to N.J.A.C.
5:23-4.3 and to meet the following additional requirements:

1. Construction official: The construction official shall
serve as the chief administrator of the enforcing agency. He
shall establish the day to day operating routines of the
agency and shall coordinate the activities of the subcode
officials. He shall be qualified in accordance with subchap-
ter 5 of this chapter in at least one subcode.

2. Subcode officials: Subcode officials shall enforce
the provisions of those subcodes for which they are respon-
sible in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-3 and qualified in
accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-5 and for which they have
been appointed by the appointing authority. Each subcode
official shall be responsible for the administration and en-
forcement of the appropriate subcode, subject to the
procedures of the enforcing agency as administered by the
construction official. However, each subcode official shall
have exclusive decision-making authority with respect to
the technical provisions of the subcode for which he has
been appointed the official.

3. Interface: Nothing shall prevent one person from
serving in more than one position for which he is certified
and qualified. However, more than one person shall not be
appointed concurrently to the same position.

4. Assistants: The appointing authority may establish
positions other than those provided in N.J.A.C. 5:23-5 as is
deemed necessary. The commissioner reserves the right to
establish categories of certification for such positions. The
construction official or appropriate subcode official shall
be responsible for the supervision of any such personnel.

5. Whenever the municipality contracts with private
on-site inspection agencies for all subcodes, it shall as a
minimum appoint a construction official to coordinate
activities.

6. Acting appointments: A municipality shall appoint
an acting construction official or subcode official any time
the absence of such official would impede orderly adminis-
tration of the Uniform Construction Code and other duties
mandated by the municipality. Acting appointments shall
be accomplished by any mechanism acceptable to the mu-
nicipality; providing, however, that a written record shall
be kept. Notice to the Department shall be provided within
seven days any time an appointment is made for more than
30 days. Acting appointments may not be made for longer
than 60 days, nor may they be extended or renewed beyond
60 days unless specific authority to do so is granted in
writing by the Department.

i.  Only an individual licensed as a construction of-
ficial may be appointed as an acting construction official
and only an individual licensed as a subcode official in a
particular subcode may be appointed as an acting sub-

23-64.1

code official for that subcode. The technical license level
of an acting construction or subcode official shall be
superior or parallel to the enforcing agency classification
of the municipality or such municipal classification shall
be downgraded to the technical license level of the
acting official for the period of time in the position.
Employees of private on-site inspection agencies shall
not serve as acting construction officials. Employees of
private on-site inspection agencies may serve as acting
subcode officials, provided that notice of any such
appointment shall be given to the Department by the
construction official within seven days of the making of
the appointment and that such notice shall contain
information as to the form and amount of the payment
being made to the agency for the services of the acting
subcode officials.

ii. Acting appointments shall not constitute the
statutory four-year term for construction and subcode
officials or any portion thereof.

iii. Conflict of interest provisions set forth in this
subchapter shall apply to acting officials.

iv. Nothing in (b) of this section shall be interpreted
as prohibiting licensed officials from serving in more
than one municipality in regular or acting appointments.

7. The municipality shall provide the construction of-
ficial, each subcode official and each inspector with per-
sonal identification which includes at least the name of the
municipality, and the name, title and photograph of the
individual. The identification shall be validated by the
municipality.

8. A municipality may, in its discretion, employ a
mechanical inspector to perform plan review and mechan-
ical inspections, with oversight by a designated subcode
official, for structures of Group R-3, R-4, or R-5.

9. Provisions concerning reappointment of construction
and subcode officials in non-civil service municipalities are
as follows:

i. At least 30 days prior to the expiration of the
statutory four-year term of office of a construction or
subcode official, the appointing authority shall give
written notice to the official indicating whether or not he
or she is going to be reappointed.

ii. In the event that the official is neither reap-
pointed, nor given written notice that he or she is not
being reappointed, prior to the date of expiration of the
statutory four-year term of office, the official shall be
deemed to have been appointed to serve in an acting
capacity for a period of not more than 60 days, in ac-
cordance with (a)6 above. The municipality is not re-
lieved of the obligation, pursuant to (a)6 above, to notify
the Department within seven days any time any acting
appointment will exceed 30 days.

Supp. 5-7-07



5:23-4.4

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

iii. In the event that the official is neither reap-
pointed, nor given written notice that he or she is not
being reappointed, prior to the expiration of the 60-day
period following the date of expiration of the prior
statutory four year term of office, the Department, in
such circumstance, shall not extend any such acting
appointment and the official shall be deemed to have
been reappointed, such reappointment being effective
retroactively to the date of expiration of the prior
statutory four-year term.

(b) The municipality shall establish a central permit office
under the direction and supervision of the construction of-
ficial. This office shall receive applications for construction
permits and plan review, issue construction permits and
certificates of occupancy, collect fees, penalties, fines and
issue notices, and orders. The office shall be open during
normal business hours at times to be determined by the mu-
nicipality. These times shall be posted in a conspicuous place
and shall be comparable with the amount of construction
activity in the municipality. Nothing herein shall prevent a
municipality from establishing branch offices, but the public
shall not, unless in the case of an emergency, unforeseen or
unavoidable circumstance, be required to do business, except
at the central permit office.

(c) The construction official and the subcode officials shall
be available for consultation and discussion during normal
business hours at scheduled times to be determined by the
construction official. All inspections may take place between
7:00 A.M. and 6:00 P.M. on business days or on days and at
times at which construction is taking place or at such other
times as may be acceptable to the owner or the owner’s
representative, or otherwise in case of emergency.

(d) The municipality shall ensure that the enforcing agency
has adequate staff to review plans, applications, specifications
and to schedule and perform inspections in a timely manner.

Amended by R.1982 d.23, effective February 1, 1982.

See: 13 N.J.R. 863(a), 14 N.J.R. 142(b).
(a)6: text deleted and replaced with new text through (a)6iv.

Notice of correction: “30 days. Acting appointments may not be made
for longer than” was omitted from text in (a)6.

See: 20 N.J.R. 2823(a).

Amended by R.1993 d.187, effective May 3, 1993.

See: 25 N.J.R. 624(a), 25 N.J.R. 1875(a).
Added (a)8.

Amended by R.1994 d.323, effective July 5, 1994 (operative January 1,
1995).

See: 25 N.J.R. 2162(a), 26 N.J.R. 2780(a).

Amended by R.1996 d.387, effective August 19, 1996 (operative

Case Notes

Municipal construction code official’s appearance for work for 11
days after his four-year term expired did not confer tenure on him on
basis of appointment to second consecutive term. Cutler v. Borough of
Westwood, 295 N.J.Super. 344, 685 A.2d 44 (A.D.1996).

Township’s failure to make a proper temporary appointment in con-
formance with regulation resulted in plaintiff’s appointment as subcode
plumbing inspector becoming one of tenure pursuant to N.J.S.A.
52:27D-126(b). DeStefano v. Washington Twp., 220 N.J.Super. 273,
531 A.2d 1090 (L.1987).

5:23-4.5 Municipal enforcing agencies—administration
and enforcement

(a) Records and procedures: The municipality shall ensure
that the construction official, with the assistance of the sub-
code officials and other necessary municipal employees,
maintains a central file system, by block and lot, for each
property in the municipality for which a permit has been
issued or requested or for which an action has been taken by
the municipal enforcing agency.

1. The files shall contain all information, including in-
spection reports, correspondence, and so forth, relevant to
each application for a construction permit or certificate of
occupancy.

2. The files shall contain or indicate the storage loca-
tion of all plans and specifications too bulky for inclusion
in the central file.

3. The files and records of the municipal enforcing
agency shall be open to Department review and audit
during normal business hours.

i.  File copies of all documents in connection with
building operations shall be retained in the official
records as provided by law.

ii. Files and records shall be maintained in a manner
consistent with the Municipal Procedures Manual estab-
lished by the commissioner for this purpose.

(b) Forms:

1. The construction official shall ensure that all neces-
sary forms and applications are available to the public at
the central permit office.

2. The following standardized forms established by the
Commissioner are required for use by the municipal en-
forcing agency:

November 1, 1996). Form No. Name , L
See: 28 N.I.R. 2434(a), 28 N.J.R. 3923(a). F100 Construction Permit Application
In (a) added provisions relating to reappointment of construction and ~ F101 Consent to Undertake Proposed Work
subcode officials in non-civil service municipalities. F110 Building Subcode Technical Section
Amended by R.2004 d.67, effective February 17, 2004. F120 Electrical Subcode Technical Section
Seii 35) ;‘Ud% 3?{275(;1),316 }‘Isg Rf g9r49(bs)' F130 Plumbing Subcode Technical Section
n (a)o, aade => 1o the 11st O oups. H : :
Amended by R.2007 d.143, effective May 7, 2007. ;iig ﬁgiﬁ;ﬁzzf‘fnzggzgf?} ei;‘r’ltl‘gﬁ Section
See: 39 NJ.R. 7(a), 39 N.J.R. 1672(a). F150 El Subcode Technical Secti
Rewrote (c). evator Subcode Technical Section
F-155 Elevator Subcode Multiple Devices
F-160B Application for a Variation
F170 Construction Permit, Required Inspection
Supp. 5-7-07 23-64.2




UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-4.5

Form No.
F180
F190
F211

F212
F213

Next Page is 23-65

Name

Construction Permit Notice

Permit Update

Notice of Violation and Order to
Terminate

Notice and Order of Penalty

Notice of Violation and Order to Termi-

Form No.

F214

23-64.3

Name
nate (Post Certificate of Occupancy —
Residential Construction)

Notice and Order of Penalty (Post Certifi-
cate of Occupancy — Residential
Construction)

Supp. 5-7-07



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-4.5

F221 Inspection Sticker Approval for Building

F-222A Inspection Sticker Approval for Electric

F223 Inspection Sticker Approval for
Plumbing

F-224A Inspection Sticker Approval for Fire
Protection

F-225 Inspection Sticker Approval for Elevator

F-230B Inspection Sticker Approval—Not
Approved

F241 Notice of Unsafe Structure

F242 Notice of Imminent Hazard

F-245A Unsafe Structure Notice

F250 Stop Construction Order

F-255A Stop Construction Notice

F260 Certificate

F270 Application for Certificate

F310 Elevator Inspection

F-320A Elevator Notice

F-325 Notice of Elevator Device Sealed Out of
Operation

F326 Accident/Incident Report

F-350B Cut-In Card

F-360 Denial of Permit

F-370 Chimney Certification for Replacement
of Fuel Fired Equipment

F380 Hydraulic System Data Plate

F390 Framing Checklist

3. The following standardized forms established by the
Commissioner are optional for use by the municipal en-
forcing agency; provided, however, that where they are not
used, equivalent forms or mechanisms are used by the en-
forcing agency to accomplish the same purpose:

Form No. Name

F-200A Inspection Notice

F-280B T.C.O. Control Card

F-290A Ongoing Inspections Control Card
F-300A Ongoing Inspections Schedule
F375 Tickler/X-Ref Card

4. No forms other than those established by the Com-
missioner shall be required of the public in connection with
the administration and enforcement of the State Uniform
Construction Code. The municipal enforcing agency may
use additional forms for its own internal processing and
recordkeeping. Nothing in this section pertaining to forms
or in the forms themselves shall be deemed to affect the
requirements for plans and specifications or documentation
of prior approvals. Where there is insufficient space on a
form for all required information, the form shall be used
with attachments.

5. Printing of forms: The municipal enforcing agency
shall arrange for the printing of all forms. Other interested
persons may also arrange for the printing of forms or they
may purchase and use forms printed by others. The muni-
cipal enforcing agency may provide for the inclusion of its
name and other appropriate identifying information on the
forms it has printed. However, the municipal enforcing
agency shall accept forms not having municipal identifica-
tion and shall, in any such case, insert the name of the

23-65

municipality. All required forms shall be exact replicas of
the forms required by the Commissioner, conforming in
content, size, format and colors, except that all multi-part
forms may be printed with an additional copy so long as
the additional copy shall be in a color distinct from those
specified by the Commissioner. Forms F-110A, F-120A, F-
130A and F-140A may have the Subcode Technical Sec-
tions printed in any color or colors of ink as desired and
Form F-310A (Elevator Inspection) may be printed as a
multipart form on separate pages with up to four copies of
each page. '

(¢) Logs:
1. The following standardized logs established by the

Commissioner are required to be maintained by the munici-
pal enforcing agency:

Log No. Name

L700 Permit Fee Log

L-710A Inspection Log

L720 Certificate Log

L730 Ongoing Inspection Log

2. The municipal enforcing agency shall maintain the
required logs either on log sheets established by the com-
missioner or on log sheets or ledger books of its own
choice or design, provided that all required entries are
maintained.

(d) Monthly reports:

1. The following standardized report forms established
by the Commissioner are required to be completed by the
municipal enforcing agency and transmitted to the Depart-
ment by the tenth business day following the end of each
calendar month:

Report No. Name
Municipal Monthly Activity
R-811B Report Certificates
R-812B Municipal Monthly Activity Report Permits

2. Municipalities currently submitting monthly reports
electronically shall continue to do so. Municipalities that
do not already submit monthly reports electronically using
UCCARS T shall begin to do so according to the following
schedule:

i. By December 31, 1992, all municipalities issuing
600 or more permits per year as determined by the De.
partment shall submit monthly reports electronically.

ii. By December 31, 1993, all municipalities issuing
fewer than 600, but more than 200, permits per year as
determined by the Department shall submit monthly re-
ports electronically.

iii. All other municipalities shall have the option of
submitting monthly reports electronically or by mail.
Any municipality which issues more than 200 permits
per year as determined by the Department for any future
year shall submit monthly reports electronically begin-
ning during the following year.

Supp. 4-2-07



5:23-4.5

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

iv. A municipality that determines that compliance
with this schedule would impose an undue hardship may
apply to the Department for an extension of time. A
request for an extension shall be in writing and shall set
forth the reason(s) for such extension and the period of
time for which the extension is sought. The Department
shall give the municipality written notice of its determi-
nation in response to the extension request.

3. As long as funding permits, the Department shall
provide the UCCARS 1 software, training and technical
support for the system free of charge to municipalities.
Municipalities may submit monthly reports electronically
using an alternative system compatible with UCCARS as
determined by the Department and capable of transmitting
a monthly report based on UCCARS specifications.

4. Municipalities, at their option, may choose to add
UCCARS 1I and III systems to their UCCARS I System
and may obtain them, at no cost, from the Department,
when available.

(e) Quarterly reports: The following standardized report
established by the Commissioner is required to be completed
by the municipal enforcing agency for State of New Jersey
training fees and must be submitted quarterly, with the ac-
companying fees, pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.19:

Report No. Name
R840 State Training Fee Report

(f) The following standardized report form established by
the Commissioner is optional for use by the municipal en-
forcing agency:

Report No. Name
R-800A Inspector’s Report

(g) Exceptions: Exceptions may be made by the municipal
enforcing agency to those requirements for records and pro-
cedures, forms, logs, and reports as stated in this section and
in the Municipal Procedures Manual established by the com-
missioner only with the express written authorization of the
Department. Requests for exceptions shall be in writing and
shall detail the requirement(s) to which an exception is
sought, the reason(s) for such exception and the duration for
which the exception is sought, and shall be accompanied by
any appropriate documentation and examples of alternative
procedures, forms, logs or reports.

(h) Duties of construction officials:

1. The construction official shall enforce the regula-
tions and:

i.  Provide that applications are available, and assist
the public in preparing the applications whenever neces-

sary;

ii. Review all applications for completeness as to
form and for verification of prior approvals. He may re-

Supp. 4-2-07 23-66

quest additional documentation concerning prior approv-
als whenever it is deemed necessary;

ifi. Upon receipt of the completed application, the
construction official shall determine the proper fee for
the work required;

iv. Collect all fees and penalties and ensure that
funds are properly accounted for;

v.  Ensure that the proper subcode official shall have
an adequate time period to review appropriate applica-
tions, plans and specifications;

vi. Ensure that all requests for variation are properly
prepared, documented and referred to the appropriate
subcode officials;

vii. Issue the construction permit upon receiving the
approval of all appropriate subcode officials;

viii. Record all notices of violation upon receiving
notification of the appropriate subcode official, and de-
termine all penalties for noncompliance with the penalty
notices;

ix. Ensure that all required inspections are scheduled
and performed within three business days of the time for
which inspection has been requested;

x.  Ensure that the reports of all inspections are com-
pleted and properly filed,

xi. Record stop construction orders upon notification
of the appropriate subcode official or, in the case of a
development-wide stop construction order, issue the stop
construction order upon recommendation of the appro-
priate subcode official. Within 24 hours of issuance, a
copy of the development-wide stop construction order
shall be forwarded to the Department via mail to: De-
partment of Community Affairs, Office of Regulatory
Affairs, 101 S. Broad Street, PO Box 818, Trenton, NJ
08625. :

xii. Ensure that all final inspections have been com-
pleted prior to the issuance of a certificate of occupancy.

(1) Ensure that all inspection required for the pur-
pose, has been completed prior to the issuance of tem-
porary certificate of occupancy;

xiii. Issue the certificate of occupancy, upon receiving
the approval of all appropriate subcode officials.

(1) Issue the temporary certificate of occupancy,
upon receiving the approval of all appropriate subcode
officials;

xiv. Ensure, in the case of a change of use, or upon a
request for a certificate of continued occupancy, that
each subcode official gives an approval based on an in-
spection and the review of all submitted data before issu-
ing a certificate of continued occupancy;




UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-4.5

xv.  Prepare and obtain reports required in the regu-
lations;

xvi. Attend meetings and hearings as required by
the regulations;

xvii. Carry out such other functions as are necessary
and appropriate to the position of construction official;

xviii. Coordinate the activities of the subcode offi-
cials in enforcement of the energy radon hazard, elevator
safety and mechanical subcodes;

xix.  Reply within three business days to any request
from the municipal search officer for information con-
cerning construction permits or certificates of occu-
pancy;

xx.  Comply with any local procedures which may
be established by the governing body to provide the mu-
nicipal search officer with information concerning con-
struction permits and certificates of occupancy;

xxi.  File with the Department a notice of the execu-
tion of each contract with a private on-site inspection
agency, which notice shall specify the subcode(s) cov-
ered by the contract, within 10 days after the effective
date of the contract;

xxii. Take or initiate appropriate disciplinary action
in the case of any subcode official or inspector failing to
properly enforce the UCC. If the action includes sus-
pension or dismissal, the construction official shall re-
port this action to the Office of Regulatory Affairs via
mail: Department of Community Affairs, Office of
Regulatory Affairs, 101 S. Broad Street, PO Box 818,
Trenton, NJ 08625;

xxiii. Issue a notice of violation pursuant to N.J.A.C.
5:23-2.35 for any violation of the provisions of the Code
in effect at the time of permit application that comes to
his or her attention. Pursuant to N.J.S.A. 2A:14-1.1, no
notice of violation may be issued to the developer or to
any contractor more than 10 years after issuance of the
certificate of occupancy;

xxiv. Ensure that all units within a residential devel-
opment, other than Group R-1, that might have similar
violations are inspected for such violations and that any
such violations found are cited and abated if violations
of the provisions of the Code in effect at the time of
permit application listed at N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.35(a)1 are
found in a residential structure in the development sub-
sequent to the issuance of a certificate of occupancy. The
construction official shall supervise the work of any
professional engineer or registered architect hired by the
municipality for this purpose; and

xxv. Report the name of the developer and the na-
ture of the code violation(s) to the Department by send-
ing this information in writing to the Office of Regula-
tory Affairs, 101 S. Broad Street, PO Box 818, Trenton,
NJ 08625 whenever:

23-67

(1) It is necessary to take development-wide ac-
tion for code violations discovered after issuance of
certificate(s) of occupancy pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-
2.35(a)1;

(2) The municipal engineer advises the construc-
tion official that the municipality has had to call a
bond posted pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40:55D-53 due to
failure of the developer to complete site improve-
ments satisfactorily; or

(3) The developer fails to maintain funds in the
escrow account required pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-
4.17 unless the charges to the escrow account are un-
der appeal.

2. Nothing contained herein shall prevent the construc-
tion official from overruling a decision of a subcode offi-
cial if he is qualified and certified in that subcode pursuant
to subchapter 5 of this chapter.

(i) Duties of subcode officials:

1. The subcode official shall enforce the regulations
and:

i.  Review those aspects of the application, plans
and specifications appropriate to his subcode for ap-
proval and release to the construction official for issu-
ance of the permit;

ii. Receive and review directly from the applicant
applications involving only one trade or subcode and
minor or emergency work for approval and release to the
construction official for issuance of the permit;

iii. Collect fees for permit applications involving
only trade or subcode and minor or emergency work and
forward same to the construction official for proper ac-
counting;

iv. Comply with the time limitations for review as
determined by the construction official;

v. Review requests for variations as necessary;

vi. Perform all required inspections within three bus-
iness days of the time for which inspection has been re-
quested,

vii. Issue in the name of the enforcing agency notices
of violation and notify the construction official of same.
The subcode official may issue verbal orders at the job-
site and shall record such orders in his inspection report;

viii. Complete reports of all inspections performed;

ix. Issue stop construction orders in the name of the
enforcing agency and notify the construction official of
same or, in the case of a development-wide stop con-
struction order, make a recommendation to the construc-
tion official for issuance of the order;

x. Perform final inspection and notify construction
official of approval in order that the construction official
may issue certificate of occupancy;

Supp. 9-15-08



5:23-4.5

DEPT. OF COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 9-15-08

xi. Make inspection, review submitted data and no-
tify construction official of approval in the case of a
change of use, or a request for a certificate of continued
occupancy;

xii. Assist the construction official in the preparation
of all reports required in the regulations;

xiii. Attend meetings and hearings as required by the
regulations;

xiv. Issue documentation and certification, such as
cut-in cards to utilities and/or public agencies if required
by the regulations;

xv. Carry out such other functions as are necessary
and appropriate to the position of subcode official.

2. In the course of enforcing the regulations, the fire
protection subcode official shall cooperate, to the greatest
extent possible, with the local fire service, which is the
local fire department or district having jurisdiction.

i.  The fire protection subcode official shall, upon
request of the local fire service, allow a designated rep-
resentative of the local fire service reasonable access to,
and opportunity to review, plans submitted to the fire
protection subcode official for his approval.

ii. The fire protection subcode official shall consult
with the local fire service prior to granting any variations
from the requirements of the fire protection subcode. If
the fire protection subcode official is not himself a
member of the local fire service, he shall, upon receipt of
an application for a variation, forward a copy thereof to
the local fire service and shall not grant a variation until
he has received the comments of the local fire service or
until 10 business days have passed, whichever comes
first.

iii. The participation of the local fire service in the
code enforcement process shall in no way be construed
as reducing the responsibility of the fire protection
subcode official for the proper enforcement of the fire
protection subcode. Advice rendered by the local fire
service shall in no way be binding upon the subcode
official.

() Conflict of interest:

1. No person employed by an enforcing agency as a
construction or subcode official or as an inspector shall
knowingly carry out any inspection or enforcement
procedure with respect to any property or business in
which he or she, or any close relative or household mem-
ber, or his or her superior within the enforcing agency, or
any close relative or household member of such superior,
or any other public official or employee having any direct
or indirect control over the funding or operations of the
enforcing agency, or any household member of any such
public official or employee, has an economic interest. For
purposes of this paragraph, “close relative” shall mean and

23-68

include a spouse, sibling, ancestor or descendant, or the
spouse of any of them.

i.  Where an inspection or enforcement procedure is
necessary or required in any such property or business,
and there is no other person employed by the enforcing
agency who is qualified, pursuant to this chapter, to
perform the inspection or enforcement procedure and
who is not a subordinate of the person with the direct or
indirect economic interest in such property or business,
the official or inspector shall arrange for the inspection
or enforcement to be carried out either by another local
enforcing agency or by the Department.

ii. A separate log shall be maintained by the enforc-
ing agency of all inspections and enforcement proce-
dures performed, when permitted in accordance with
(j1i above, with regard to any properties or businesses
in which any persons employed by the enforcing agency
have a direct or indirect economic interest.

2. No person employed by an enforcing agency as a
construction or subcode official, assistant to the construc-
tion or subcode official, trainee, inspector or plan reviewer,
shall, whether directly or indirectly, be engaged in
ownership of, or employment by, or contracting to provide
goods or services to, any business or employment furnish-
ing labor, materials, products or services for the construc-
tion, alteration or demolition of buildings or structures that
is engaged in any such activity within any municipality in
which he is so employed by an enforcing agency, or in any
municipality adjacent to any municipality in which he is
thus employed. For purposes of the prohibition set forth in
this paragraph, it shall be immaterial whether the em-
ployment by the business, or the providing of goods and
services to the business, occurred within the employing
municipality or an adjacent municipality or occurred else-
where.

3. Persons subject to this subsection shall annually re-
port any income or benefits received from any business or
property subject to the Code, or from any business furnish-
ing materials, products, labor or services for types of work
subject to the Uniform Construction Code regulations, to
the municipal governing body. This report shall include a
list of all sources of income, but need not list the amount.

4. No person employed by a municipal enforcing
agency as a construction official, subcode official or in-
spector shall be employed to appear before any construc-
tion board of appeals, or be involved in any court pro-
ceeding within the State, as a paid expert witness, or in any
other compensated capacity in any proceeding involving
the enforcement of the Uniform Construction Code except
on behalf of another enforcing agency, or as a court-
appointed witness.

i.  This prohibition shall not apply to any litigation
not involving enforcement of the Code, or to an appear-
ance as a fact witness; nor shall it apply to any activities

C

)



(N

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-4.5

unrelated to an action for, or an appeal of, enforcement
of the Code.

5. This section shall not apply to:

i.  The ownership of stock or other investment in-
strument in any corporation listed on any national stock
exchange.

ii. Any such business or employment outside the
State;

iii. Dual employment by two or more enforcing
agencies;

iv. Any business or employment which is not sub-
ject to the regulations.

v. Service as an instructor in a code enforcement
training program.

6. Nothing herein shall prohibit a municipality from
establishing by ordinance more restrictive provisions cov-
ering conflict of interest.

(k) No person employed by an enforcing agency as a con-
struction official, subcode official or inspector shall accept, or
continue to hold, employment in one or more other munic-
ipalities as a construction official, subcode official or inspec-
tor unless the resulting combined workload is such that it can
be discharged in a manner consistent with the requirements of
this chapter.

Amended by R.1983 d.611, eff. January 3, 1984.
See: 15 N.J.R. 1789(a), 16 N.J.R. 45(b).
Deleted old (b)2.-3. and (c) and added new (b)2, (c), (d) and (e).
Renumbered old (d)-(f) as new (f)-(h).
Amended by R.1984 d.303, effective July 16, 1984.
See: 16 N.J.R. 950(a), 16 N.J.R. 1968(b).
Added (g)2.
Amended by R.1990 d.61, effective February 5, 1990.
See: 21 N.J.R. 3346(b), 22 N.J.R. 351(b).
Form numbers updated, new (d)2. added and reference made to
reports and fees being submitted quarterly.
Amended by R.1990 d.226, effective May 7, 1990.
See: 21 NLJ.R. 3696(a), 22 N.J.R. 1356(a).
Radon mitigation added to (f)1xviii.
Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a).
Elevator safety added at (f)1xviii; conflict of interest provision added
at (h).
Amended by R.1992 d.47, effective February 3, 1992.
See: 23 N.J.R. 3440(a), 24 N.J.R. 405(a).
Electronic monthly reporting added at (d)2.-4.
Amended by R.1992 d.230, effective June 1, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 168(a), 24 N.J.R. 2052(a).
Form numbers changed in (b).
Amended by R.1992 d.243, effective July 6, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 678(a), 24 N.J.R. 2422(a).
Conflict of interest and exception provisions added.
Amended by R.1992 d.392, effective October 5, 1992.
See: 24 NJ.R. 2657(a), 24 N.J.R. 3521(b).
Report form number changed at (e).
Amended by R.1993 d.581, effective November 15, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 3693(a), 25 N.J.R. 5146(a).
Amended by R.1994 d.323, effective July 5, 1994 (operative January 1,
1995).
See: 25 N.J.R. 2162(a), 26 N.J.R. 2780(a).

23-69

Amended by R.1995 d.249, effective June 5, 1995, (operative October 1,

1995).

See: 27 N.J.R. 619(a), 27 N.J.R. 2187(a).
In (b)2 added Form No. F-370.
Amended by R.1996 d.512, effective November 4, 1996.
See: 28 N.J.R. 3697(a), 28 N.J.R. 4782(a).
Amended by R.1997 d.64, effective February 18, 1997 (operative May
19, 1997).
See: 28 N.J.R. 4695(a), 29 N.J.R. 550(a).

In (b)2, amended form references.

Amended by R.1997 d.378, effective September 15, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 2742(a), 29 N.J.R. 4103(a).

In (b)2 and (c)1, amended form designations and in (b)2 deleted form
F-330A and F-340A.

Amended by R.1997 d.419, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 3406(a), 29 N.J.R. 4287(a).

In ()1, inserted “, or his or her superior within ... any such superior,”;
in (j)1i inserted “, and there is no other person ... property or business,”;
and added (j)1ii.

Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April 17, 2000.
See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a).

In (b)2, inserted a reference to Form No. F380.
Amended by R.2000 d.413, effective October 16, 2000.
See: 32 N.J.R.2278(a), 32 N.J.R. 3783(a).

In (j)1, substituted references to close relatives or household members
for references to members of the immediate family, and added the
second sentence; and deleted former (j)7.

Amended by R.2003 d.363, effective September 15, 2003.
See: 35 N.J.R. 2426(a), 35 N.J.R. 4281(a).

In (b), added forms F211, F212, F241, F242 and deleted form F240;
deleted the revision dates of the referenced forms throughout.
Amended by R.2003 d.385, effective October 6, 2003.
See: 35 N.J.R. 2423(a), 35 N.J.R. 4713(a).

In (h), added 3.

Amended by R.2005 d.446, effective December 19, 2005.
See: 37 N.J.R. 2747(a), 37 N.J.R. 4907(a).

Added (h)1xxii.

Amended by R.2006 d.75, effective February 21, 2006.
See: 37 N.J.R. 3110(a), 38 N.J.R. 1183(a).

In (b)2, added Form F390, Framing Checklist.

Administrative correction.
See: 38 N.J.R. 1827(b).

In (h)1xxii, substituted “818” for “817” to correct PO Box number.
Amended by R.2006 d.355, effective October 2, 2006.

See: 38 N.J.R. 1789(a), 38 N.J.R. 4175(a).

In the table in (b)2, added entries for forms “F101”, “F213”, and
“F214”; in (h)1xxi, deleted “and” from the end; in (h)1xxii, substituted a
semicolon for a period at the end; added (h)lxxiii through xxv; and
deleted (h)3.
Amended by R.2007 d.46, effective February 5, 2007.
See: 38 N.J.R. 872(a), 39 N.J.R. 370(b).

Rewrote (h)1xi and (i)lix.
Administrative correction.
See: 39 NJ.R. 1249(a).
Amended by R.2007 d.143, effective May 7, 2007.
See: 39 N.J.R. 7(a), 39 N.J.R. 1672(a).

In (j)1, inserted “, or any other public official or employee having any
direct or indirect control over the funding or operations of the enforcing
agency or any close relative or household member of any such public
official or employee,”.

Administrative correction.
See: 39 N.JR. 3296(a).
Amended by R.2007 d.310, effective October 1, 2007.
See: 39 N.JR. 135(a), 39 N.JR. 4113(b).
Added (k).
Administrative correction.
See: 40 N.J.R. 113(a).
Amended by R.2008 d.273, effective September 15, 2008.
See: 40 N.J.R. 2630(a), 40 N.J.R. 5195(c).

In the introductory paragraph of (j)1, inserted “a” preceding “con-
struction”, inserted “knowingly” and inserted a comma following
“agency” twice, and deleted “close relative or” preceding the third
occurrence of “household member”; and rewrote (j)2.

Supp. 12-15-08



5:23-4.5

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Case Notes

Former N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.3 regarding conflict of interest valid. New
Jersey State Plumbing Inspectors Assn., Inc. v. Sheehan, 163 N.J.Super.
398, 394 A.2d 1244 (App.Div.1978), certiorari denied 79 N.J. 484, 401
A.2d 239 (1979).

Adopting Initial Decision’s conclusion that 60-day suspension of
license, rather than revocation, was sufficient punishment for infractions
where there was no evidence that the municipal building code official
intended to receive an economic benefit, within the meaning of N.J.A.C.
5:23-4.5(j), on the transfer of stocks of the official’s former plumbing
business (adopting 2007 N.J. AGEN LEXIS 763 as modified). Mazzer v.
Office of Regulatory Affairs, OAL Dkt. No. CAF 07898-07 (On
Remand), 2008 N.J. AGEN LEXIS 12, Final Decision (January 10,
2008).

Construction official violated N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.5()(2), where the
official performed architectural services on an ongoing basis for a
builder undertaking construction in the municipality in which the official
was employed, as well as in the adjoining municipality. Easse v. Dep’t
of Community Affairs, Office of Regulatory Affairs, OAL Dkt. No.
CAF 03043-07, 2007 N.J. AGEN LEXIS 842, Final Decision (July 24,
2007).

Location of the projects for which an official receives compensation
for services from a builder is not relevant to the analysis of whether
N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.5()(2) was violated; an official may not perform ser-
vices for a builder anywhere, once that builder undertakes construction
in the municipality in which the official is employed or an adjoining
municipality. Easse v. Dep’t of Community Affairs, Office of Regu-
latory Affairs, OAL Dkt. No. CAF 03043-07, 2007 N.J. AGEN LEXIS
842, Final Decision (July 24, 2007).

Code official does not have to commit a criminal offense in order to
be in violation of N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.5(j)2. A code official is in violation of
NJ.A.C. 5:23-4.5()2 if he or she enters into, or maintains, any in-
volvement with any person or business entity that is involved in
construction under circumstances where such involvement might
reasonably be perceived as compromising the objectivity of the official
and, thus, the integrity of the code enforcement system. Easse v. Dep’t
of Community Affairs, Office of Regulatory Affairs, OAL Dkt. No.
CAF 03043-07, 2007 N.J. AGEN LEXIS 842, Final Decision (July 24,
2007).

Willfulness is not an element of violation of the Uniform Construction
Code rules. Easse v. Dep’t of Community Affairs, Office of Regulatory
Affairs, OAL Dkt. No. CAF 03043-07, 2007 N.J. AGEN LEXIS 842,
Final Decision (July 24, 2007).

Code official’s issuance of permits to a builder during the same period
of time in which the official was providing compensated architectural
services to the builder violated not only N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.25(a)5, but also
N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.5(j)2. Easse v. Dep’t of Community Affairs, Office of
Regulatory Affairs, OAL Dkt. No. CAF 03043-07, 2007 N.J. AGEN
LEXIS 842, Final Decision (July 24, 2007).

Multiple incidents involving conflicts of interest under N.J.A.C. 5:23-
4.5(j)2 warranted revocation of all of the official’s Uniform Construction
Code licenses, and a previously “unblemished” record did not overcome
the seriousness of the violation. Easse v. Dep’t of Community Affairs,
Office of Regulatory Affairs, OAL Dkt. No. CAF 03043-07, 2007 N.J.
AGEN LEXIS 842, Final Decision (July 24, 2007).

Monetary penalty against builder for code violations was not reduced
for financial hardship, but was reduced by half to secure prompt com-
pliance. Bureau of Housing Inspection v. Regency Village Apartments,
95 N.J.LA.R.2d (CAF) 37.

Fraud and deceit while practicing as a licensed code enforcement of-
ficial or inspector warranted license revocation. Regulatory Affairs v.
Zieniuk, 95 N.J.A.R.2d (CAF) 15.

Conflict of interest precluded employment as elevator inspector. Kunz
v. Department of Community Affairs, 94 N.J.A.R.2d (CAF) 32.

Supp. 12-15-08

23-70

5:23-4.5A (Reserved)

Repealed by R.2006 d.128, effective April 3, 2006.
See: 37 N.JR. 4106(a), 38 N.J.R. 1573(a).

Section was “Selection of private on-site inspection and plan review
agencies”.

5:23-4.6 Interlocal enforcing agencies—establishment

(a) Parties: Any two or more municipalities may, by ordi-
nance, join to administer and enforce the regulations and any
subcode under the regulations. Any municipalities party to an
agreement establishing one enforcing agency consisting of all
subcodes may further provide for the establishment of a joint
board of appeals.

(b) Agreement: Except as the section may add or substitute
requirements, the procedures for the execution of any agree-
ment pursuant to this section, shall be governed by the Inter-
local Services Act (N.J.S.A. 40:8A-1 et seq.).

1. Upon the final adoption of an ordinance pursuant to
the Interlocal Services Act, a copy of such ordinance, the
contract, and any other pertinent information shall be for-
warded to the department;

2. The term of any contract entered into pursuant to this
section shall be four years.

3. The contract shall stipulate that the term of office of
any construction or subcode official shall, except for good
cause, be four years.

4. Such contract shall provide a mechanism for admin-
istration and enforcement within each of the contracting
municipalities by one or more of the contracting municipal-
ities, on an interim or emergency basis, should such
agreement be invalidated by a court of competent juris-
diction or prove otherwise unenforceable.

5. The contract shall additionally stipulate the informa-
tion contained in N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.7(b) and 4.8(a).

5:23-4.7 Interlocal enforcing agencies—organization

(a) General: Except as is provided in this section, enforc-
ing agencies organized pursuant to this section shall, insofar
as is practicable, be organized in the same manner as are
municipal enforcing agencies.

(b) Exception: Nothing contained in N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.3,
with respect to offices, shall require that only one central of-
fice be established pursuant to this section. Whenever munic-
ipalities join pursuant to this section, they shall establish
offices which are reasonably accessible in terms of distance,
location and function.

5:23-4.8 Interlocal enforcing agencies—administration
and enforcement

(a) General: Enforcing agencies organized pursuant to this
article shall administer and enforce the regulations in the
same manner as municipal enforcing agencies.

Next Page is 23-70.1



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-4.9

(b) The provisions of N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.3 regarding conflict

(b) Division of Building and Construction, Department of

of interest shall be applicable to interlocal enforcing agencies,  the Treasury:

including all municipalities party to the interlocal agreement,
to the extent that the agreement covers specific subcode ac-
tivities.

5:23-4.9 State enforcing agencies—establishment

(a) Department of Community Affairs:

1. The Bureau of Local Code Enforcement in the Divi-

1. The Division of Building and Construction is con-
stituted as the enforcing agency for the purpose of per-
forming plan review if the Department of Community
Affairs cannot approve plans within the 20-day period pro-
vided for in N.J.S.A. 52:27D-131, with respect to buildings
built under the supervision of the Division of Building and
Construction.

sion of Codes and Standards is constituted as the enforcing édnﬁ;lizsﬁa}i\{{e g;(l)'ge(%t)ion to (a)l.
« . . . ce: N\ .
agency for the purpose of administering and enforcing the Amended by R.1997 d.417, effective October 6, 1997,

code in those municipalities which have decided, pursuant See: 29 N.J.R. 3387(a), 29 N.J.R. 4285(a).

to N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.3, not to enforce the code.

In (a)1, changed enforcing agency and amended N.J.A.C. references;

deleted (a)li and (c); inserted (a)2; and recodified former (d) as (c).
2. Pursuant to Reorganization Plan No. 004-1996, the =~ Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April 17, 2000.

Department is constituted as the sole plan review agency ~ S¢¢ 31 N.JR. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a).

for the administration and enforcement of Federal and State

In (b)1, substituted “performing plan review” for “administering and

enforcing the regulation” following “purpose of”’; and deleted a former

standards applicable to the construction, alternation, demo-  (c).
lition or maintenance of health care facilities, as defined in ~ Administrative correction.
Next Page is 23-71 23-70.1 Supp. 12-15-08



-

N
K

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-4.14

ment for supervising the activities of the elevator subcode
official.

(f) Each on-site inspection agency shall maintain an ade-
quate number of offices for the purpose of meeting with the
public and shall maintain records at such offices.

1. The on-site inspection agency shall provide the mu-
nicipal construction official with a schedule stating when
these offices will be open during normal business hours
and when the designated responsible official will be in that
office.

2. All inspections may take place between 7:00 A.M
and 6:00 P.M. on business days or on days and at times at
which construction is taking place, or at such other times as
may be acceptable to the owner or the owner’s representa-
tive, or otherwise in case of emergency.

(g) Each on-site inspection agency shall employ a suffi-
cient number of certified personnel to perform all administra-
tive, plan review, inspection and reinspection functions re-
quired by the regulations.

Amended by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).
Text of (b), on private inplant inspection agencies, deleted.
Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a).
Chain of responsibility specified at (¢).
Amended by R.2007 d.143, effective May 7, 2007.
See: 39 N.J.R. 7(a), 39 N.J.R. 1672(a).
In the introductory paragraph of (f), substituted “at such offices.” for
“as follows:”; and rewrote (f)2.
Administrative correction.
See: 39 N.J.R. 3296(a).

5:23-4.14 Private on-site inspection and plan review
agencies; administration and enforcement

(a) Records shall be maintained by the “on-site inspection
agency” of all inspections, applications and plans reviewed
and any other information that may be required by the munic-
ipal construction official or the Department. These records
shall be open to Department audit and shall not be destroyed
or removed from the offices of the on-site inspection agency
without the permission of the Department.

(b) The on-site inspection agency shall provide the Depart-
ment with the following:

1. A copy of each executed contract and all amend-
ments thereto, including any attachments containing any
terms of the agreement, to be submitted at least 10 days
prior to their effective date. Any subsequent amendments
shall also be submitted;

2. A list of the municipalities served, and a current list
of names, addresses and telephone numbers of the agency’s
designated representatives actually serving as subcode
officials in each municipality, who may be contacted in
connection with routine matters during normal working

23-73

hours and, in the event of emergency, during other than
normal working hours;

3. A list of names, certification numbers, addresses and
telephone numbers of all technical personnel employed;
and

4. Monthly reports, due on the 15th of every month
covering the period of the previous month, setting forth the
following:

i.  The number of inspections performed under each
subcode in each municipality and the number of inspec-
tions performed under each subcode in each municipal-
ity more than 72 hours after the receipt of an inspection
request by the construction official or the subcode of-
ficial, whichever occurs first.

ii.  The total number of inspections, broken down by
subcode discipline, performed by the private agency dur-
ing the reporting period and the total number of subcode
officials and inspectors available during the reporting
period, expressed as full-time equivalent (FTE). For
purposes of this report, one FTE shall be the total num-
ber of subcode official and inspector hours worked dur-
ing the reporting period divided by eight, divided by the
number of working days in the reporting period. All days
other than Saturdays, Sundays and official holidays shall
be considered working days;

iii. The total payments received from each munic-
ipality during the reporting period; and

iv.  The total amount billed to each municipality dur-
ing the reporting period.

(c) Except as stated in the regulations, an executed con-
tract in accordance with “Local Public Contracts Law” shall
be required between the on-site inspection agency and a
municipality prior to the enforcement of any subcode in that
municipality by the on-site inspection agency.

(d) The on-site inspection agency shall not collect fees
from the property owner, his designated agent or anyone in
his employ. The municipal construction official shall be the
sole agent for the collection of all fees and penalties.

(e) Each on-site inspection agency shall have the following
responsibilities:

1. To maintain an adequate number of certified staff to
review all plans and specifications for all classes and types
of construction not reserved to the State.

2. To act in place of the municipal subcode official and
to perform the duties of a subcode official as defined in
these rules, except all notices of violation and all stop work
orders will be issued through the construction official’s
office.

3. To report to the municipal construction official and
to be subject to his rulings, directives and orders.

Supp. 10-1-07



5:23-4.14

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 10-1-07

4. To provide adequate supervision, so that its employ-
ees are prompt and diligent in discharging their duties.

5. To carry general liability insurance, at least in the
amount of $1,000,000 for each person and each occur-
rence, to satisfy claims or judgments for property damage
and/or personal injury.

6. To process and return all documents, plans, spec-
ifications, and applications within the time frame specified
by the rules or the contract with the municipality, which-
ever is the lesser.

7. To provide technical assistance to applicants in the
preparation of a construction permit application, if re-
quested by the construction official.

8. To perform all required inspections and reinspec-
tions.

9. To perform nondestructive tests, if required by the
rules.

10. To give testimony at hearings or in court, if
required by the construction official.

11. To prepare all reports to the Department as are re-
quired by the regulations or as may be required from time
to time.

12. To meet its obligations under its contract with the
municipal enforcing agency.

13. To issue documentation and certification, such as
cut-in cards, to utilities and or public agencies if required
by the rules.

14. To ensure the attendance of all technical and super-
visory employees at required training and orientation
programs.

15. To carry to full completion and receive all fees on
all projects initiated prior to the termination of their con-
tract with the municipality by reason of non-renewal, un-
successful bidding, Department authorization disapproval
or other reason except suspension or revocation.

(f) Except as otherwise provided in this subsection, no
person employed by or associated with an on-site inspection
agency as an employee, proprietor, officer, director, partner
or manager shall engage in, or otherwise be connected di-
rectly or indirectly, for purposes of economic gain with, any
business or employment furnishing labor, materials, products
or services for the construction, alteration or demolition of
buildings within the State. Nor shall any such proprietor,
officer, director, partner, manager or employee engage in any
other work that conflicts with his or her or the agency’s
official duties, including, without limitation, employment to
testify or appear before any construction board of appeals, or
to be involved in any court proceeding within the State, as a
paid expert witness against any construction official, subcode
official, inspector or enforcing agency, or in any other com-
pensated capacity except on behalf of an enforcing agency, or
as a court-appointed witness.

23-74 Next Page is 23-76.3



~_

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-4.14

1. This prohibition shall not apply to any litigation not
involving enforcement of the Code, or as a fact witness;
nor shall it apply to any activities unrelated to an action for,
or an appeal of, enforcement of the Code.

2. This subsection shall not apply to:

i.  The ownership of stock or other investment
instrument in any corporation listed on any national
stock exchange;

ii. Any such business or employment outside the
State;

ili. Any business or employment which is not sub-
ject to the regulations.

3. An on-site inspection agency may employ municipal
subcode officials and inspectors on a part-time basis. This
employment, however, shall be subject to the following
conditions:

i.  The on-site inspection agency can only employ
municipal subcode officials and inspectors. A municipal
construction official shall not be employed by an agency
in any capacity.

ii. The written approval of the construction official
supervising a municipal subcode official or inspector
shall be obtained by the on-site inspection agency prior
to hiring such municipal subcode official or inspector.

iii. An on-site inspection agency that hires a munic-
ipal subcode official or inspector shall thereupon waive
the right to bid or contract in the employed subcode
official or inspector municipality or municipalities.

iv. No person employed by, or associated with, an
on-site inspection agency as an employee, proprietor,
officer, director, partner or manager shall be permitted to
retain such employment or association if he or she
accepts employment with a municipality as a subcode
official or inspector enforcing a subcode that was the
subject of a contract or proposed contract for which the
on-site agency was an unsuccessful bidder at any time
during the previous 24-month period.

v. If an agency employee terminates employment
with the agency and accepts employment in a munici-
pality which was under contract with the agency, the
agency shall waive the right to contract with that
municipality for a period of two years.

(g) The amount charged to a municipality by a private
agency for work subject to a minimum fee under N.J.A.C.
5:23-4.20(c)2 or for certificates of occupancy, certificates of
approval and certificates of continued occupancy shall be the
percentage set forth in a contract entered into in accordance
with N.J.S.A. 52:27D-124.3, times the amount of the mini-
mum fee or fee for a certificate of occupancy or certificate of
approval, times the amount determined in accordance with
this subsection.

1. In the case of work requiring inspections by four
subcode officials or their designees, the allocation of the
fee revenue shall be as follows:

23-76.3

i.  Building subcode: 40 percent;
ii.  Fire protection subcode: 20 percent;
iii. Plumbing subcode: 20 percent; and
iv. Electrical subcode: 20 percent.

2. In the case of work requiring inspections by fewer
than four subcode officials or their designees, the alloca-
tion shall be among or between the subcodes involved in
the proportions set forth in (g)1 above. (Thus, for example,
in work involving only the building and plumbing
subcodes, two-thirds of the fee (40/60) would be allocated
to the building subcode and one-third of the fee (20/60) to
the plumbing subcode.)

(h) Where plan review is performed more than one month
before the construction permit is issued, or where a project
does not go forward after a private on-site agency has
performed plan review, then the municipality shall pay to the
private agency 20 percent of the amount that would otherwise
be due, which amount shall be determined by multiplying the
relevant fee set forth in N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.20 by the percentage
set forth in the contract between the municipality and the
private agency entered into in accordance with N.J.S.A.
52:27D-124.3.

(i) Private on-site agencies shall bill for their services at
least once monthly. Each bill shall specify the billing period
and the amount currently due, amounts already paid, and any
remaining balances, identified by permit number and totaled
for the billing period.

(j) The private agency shall be paid for work performed
even if the municipality receives no inspection fee for such
work.

(k) Private enforcing agencies shall charge no fees other
than the fees set forth in N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.20 multiplied by the
percentage set forth in the contract between the private
agency and the municipality. Private enforcing agencies shall
furnish no services other than subcode enforcement services
to municipalities and shall not receive any payments from
municipalities for any other goods or services whatsoever.

Amended by R.1983 d.642, effective January 17, 1984.
See: 15 N.J.R. 1406(a), 16 N.J.R. 129(a).
Use of municipal subcode officials and inspectors further delineated.
Amended by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).
Text of (b), on private inplant inspection agencies, deleted.
Amended by R.1992 d.243, effective July 6, 1992.
See: 24 NJ.R. 678(a), 24 N.J.R. 2422(a).
Conflict of interest provisions added.
Amended by R.1994 d.323, effective July 5, 1994 (operative January 1,
1995).
See: 25 N.J.R. 2162(a), 26 N.J.R. 2780(a).
Amended by R.1996 d.273, effective June 17, 1996 (operative October
1, 1996).
See: 28 N.J.R. 1586(c), 28 N.J.R. 3120(a).
Amended by R.2006 d.128, effective April 3, 2006.
See: 37 N.J.R. 4106(a), 38 N.J.R. 1573(a).
In introductory paragraphs (g) and (h), replaced “N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.5A”
with new statute citation.

Supp. 7-19-10



5:23-4.14

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Case Notes

In wrongful discharge claim brought by former employee for termi-
nation in violation of Family Leave Act, trial judge did not abuse his
discretion in barring testimony from former employee’s proffered expert
on applicable conflict-of-interest regulations, even though former em-
ployer alleged that such testimony could have established that former
employee’s outside business activities violated Code regulation that
prohibited an employee of an on-site inspection agency from engaging in
any remunerated construction or alteration services within the State.
DePalma v. Bldg. Insp. Underwriters, 350 N.J.Super. 195, 794 A.2d 848.

5:23-4.15  Suspension and revocation

(a) General:

1. In addition to any other remedies provided by the
regulations, the Department may suspend or revoke its
authorization of any private on-site agency if the Depart-
ment determines that the authorization or reauthorization
was based on the submission of fraudulent or materially
inaccurate information, or that the authorization or reau-
thorization was issued in violation of the regulations, or
that a change of facts or circumstances make it unlikely
that the inspection agency can continue to discharge its
responsibilities under the regulations in a satisfactory
manner, or that the inspection agency has violated the
regulations.

2. During the period of suspension the affected agency
shall not be authorized to discharge any of its responsi-
bilities under the regulations unless otherwise specified in
the notice of suspension or order of the department.

(b) Notice:

1. The department shall notify such agency of its
suspension or revocation in writing. Copies of the notice of
suspension shall be forwarded by the department to all
manufacturers or municipalities with implementing con-
tracts with the affected inspection agency.

2. The suspension shall be effective on the date the
affected inspection agency receives the notice of sus-
pension or on any later date that may be designated in the
notice of suspension.

(c) Revocation without suspension:

1. The Department may revoke its approval of any
inspection agency without previously suspending its
authorization. In such event, the Department shall send a
written notice to the affected inspection agency of its
intention to consider revocation of its authorization, stating
the grounds therefor, and establishing a time and a place
for a hearing on the question. The notice shall be sent to
the affected inspection agency and to all manufacturers or
municipalities having contracts with the affected inspection
agency.

2. No such agency shall reapply for approval as an on-
site agency until the expiration of one year from the date of
the order of revocation.

Supp. 7-19-10

23-76.4

(d) Termination of contract: Upon the suspension or revo-
cation of approval of any inspection agency, any municipality
or any manufacturer with an implementing contract with the
inspection agency shall have the right to terminate its contract
with such inspection agency and be free of all obligations
thereon and to enter with such inspection agency and be free
of all obligations thereon and to enter into an implementing
contract with any other inspection agency.

(e) In the case of the suspension or revocation of any on-
site inspection agency, the department shall, upon the request
of any municipality with an implementing contract with the
suspended or revoked inspection agency, consult with such
municipality to establish a temporary arrangement by which
the municipality can continue to enforce the regulations until
the suspension or revocation is lifted or an implementing
contract entered into with another on-site inspection agency.
For these purposes, the department may, at its discretion,
discharge some or all of the responsibilities of an on-site
inspection agency. The department may also approve any
other temporary arrangement which the department deter-
mines would best promote the purposes of the act and these
regulations under the circumstances.

(f) The department shall provide any person aggrieved by
any action of the department pursuant to this section with a
hearing in accordance with the applicable provisions of the
Administrative Procedure Act, N.J.S.A. 52:14B-1 et seq. and
N.J.A.C. 1:1. The case shall be adjudicated before the Office
of Administrative Law and the final decision shall be issued
by the Commissioner.

Amended by R.1982 d.436, effective December 20, 1982.
See: 14 N.J.R. 734(a), 14 N.J.R. 1449(a).
Added cases to be heard by the OAL with final decision by the
Commissioner.
Amended by R.1990 d.313, effective June 18, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 691(a), 22 N.J.R. 1915(b).
Text on inplant inspection agencies and temporary arrangements
deleted.
Notice of Petition to amend section.
See: 27 NUJ.R. 3232(a).
Amended by R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 NJ.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a).

Case Notes

Pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.15(a), the Department may suspend or re-
voke its authorization when a private on-site agency submits fraudulent
or materially inaccurate information. This remedy is in addition to any
other remedies provided by the regulations under N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.31(b),
allowing a penalty of up to $500 in the case of a false or misleading
written statement made to the Department that is not willful, and
N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.31(e), allowing for a penalty of up to $2,000 in a case
where such a statement is made willfully; therefore, N.J.A.C. 5:23-
4.15(a)1 does not preclude the levying of a penalty in addition to, or in
lieu of, suspension or revocation of an authorization previously given to
a private on-site inspection agency (adopting with modification 2009
N.J. AGEN LEXIS 700). Office of Regulatory Affairs v. EIC Inspection
Agency Corp., OAL Dkt. No. CAF 01069-09, 2009 N.J. AGEN LEXIS
1022, Final Decision (November 12, 2009).

5:23-4.16 (Reserved)

Repealed by R.1987 d.374, effective September 21, 1987.
See: 19 NJ.R. 1024(a), 19 N.J.R. 1720(b).
Section was “Fire limits”.

Next Page is 23-77



(\

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-5.25

5:23-5.25 Revocation of licenses and alternative

sanctions

(a) The Department may revoke or suspend a license,
and/or assess a civil penalty in accordance with N.J.A.C.
5:23-2.31, if the Department determines that the person in-
volved, at any time during the preceding 10-year period:

1. Has violated the provisions of the Uniform Con-
struction Code regulations;

2. Has obtained a license by fraud or misrepresentation,
or the person named in the licensed has obtained it by fraud
or misrepresentation;

3. Has aided or abetted in practice as a licensed code
enforcement official any person not authorized to practice
as a licensed code enforcement official under the pro-
visions of these regulations;

4. Has fraudulently or deceitfully practiced as a li-
censed code enforcement official;

5. Has been grossly negligent or has engaged in mis-
conduct in the performance of any of his duties;

6. Has failed, over a period of time, to maintain a
minimally acceptable level of competence;

7. Has been found to have failed to report an offer or
bribe or other favor in a proceeding under this act or other
appropriate law of this or any other state or jurisdiction;

8. Has failed to comply with any order issued by the
department;

9. Has made a false or misleading written statement, or
has made a material omission in any submission to the
department;

10. Has engaged in any conduct which demonstrates
incompetency or dishonesty; or

11. Has failed to enforce the Uniform Construction Code
Act or regulations.

(b) The Department, in addition or as an alternative, as the
case may be, to revoking or suspending a license, or assessing
a penalty, may issue a letter of warning, reprimand, or
censure with regard to any conduct which, in the judgment of
the Department, warrants a letter of warning, reprimand or
censure. Such letters, in addition to any other filing of re-
quirements, shall be made a part of the licensing file of the
individual.

(c) Conviction of a crime, or conviction of an offense in
connection with one’s performance as a licensed code en-
forcement official or inspector, or a determination by the
Department that a licensee has engaged in conduct consti-
tuting a conflict of interest under N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.5(j)2, shall
constitute grounds for revocation of a license.

(d) The Commissioner shall appoint review committees to
advise the Department concerning the appropriateness of

23-129

sanctions that the Department proposes to take against per-
sons licensed under the respective subcodes who are alleged
to have done any act or omission proscribed by (a) above.
The Department shall provide necessary staff for the review
committees.

1. Each review committee shall consist of three persons
who are licensed as subcode officials in the subcode, and
are currently employed by municipalities as subcode offi-
cials in the subcode and/or as construction officials. To be
eligible for appointment to a review committee, a construc-
tion official shall have had experience as a subcode official
employed by a municipality in that subcode. Of the persons
appointed, at least two shall also be licensed as construc-
tion officials and at least one shall be employed by at least
one enforcing agency for a total of not more than 20 hours
per week.

2. Members of the review committees shall be ap-
pointed by the Commissioner and shall serve for terms of
three years, and until their successors shall have been ap-
pointed; except that, of those members first appointed, one
shall serve for one year, one shall serve for two years, and
one shall serve for three years.

3. The Commissioner shall also appoint two alternate
members of each committee, who shall be persons licensed
as subcode officials in the subcode and currently employed
by municipalities as subcode officials in the subcode and/or
as construction officials. To be eligible for appointment as
an alternate member of a review committee, a construction
official shall have had experience as a subcode official
employed by a municipality in that subcode. The Commis-
sioner shall designate each alternate as either a first or a
second alternate. Alternates shall serve for two years, and
until their successors shall have been appointed, except
that, of the alternates first appointed to each review com-
mittee, one shall serve for two years and one shall serve for
one year.

4. The Commissioner shall give the State organizations
of officials and inspectors in each subcode an opportunity
to comment on persons proposed to serve as members or
alternate members of each review committee prior to their
appointment.

5. No review committee shall hear any case or issue
any recommendation without three members, who may be
either regular or alternate members, being present.

6. In any case in which the Department makes a pre-
liminary finding that a licensee has done any act or
omission proscribed under (a) above, it shall have the case
reviewed by the appropriate review committee prior to the
issuance of any order revoking or suspending the license or
assessing a civil penalty.

7. The Department shall present whatever evidence it
may have to the review committee. The licensee shall be
given notice of the meeting of the review committee and
may appear before the review committee to present his or

Supp. 7-19-10



5:23-5.25

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

her position, but there shall be no cross-examination of
either the licensee or any representative of the Department.
Nothing said by the licensee or by any other persons at the
meeting of the review committee shall be used in any way,
nor shall any member of a review committee be required to
testify concerning proceedings before the review commit-
tee, in any subsequent proceeding.

8. The review committee shall submit its recommen-
dations as to the sanctions, if any, that ought to be imposed,
to the Assistant Director for Construction Code Enforce-
ment within 20 business days following the meeting. No
sanctions shall then be imposed without the express
approval of the Assistant Director for Construction Code
Enforcement. Failure of a review committee to submit a
timely recommendation shall be deemed to be concurrence
with the action proposed to be taken by the Department.
Notice of the review committee’s recommendation, or fail-
ure to issue a recommendation, shall be given to the li-
censee.

9. A meeting of the review committee shall not be
deemed to be a hearing or an adversarial proceeding and
the findings of the advisory committee shall be deemed to
be only a recommendation that is not binding on the
Department.

10. A licensee shall be entitled to contest any order
imposing sanctions in an administrative hearing, pursuant
to N.JLA.C. 5:23-5.2, regardless of whether he or she has
exercised the option of appearing before a review com-
mittee.

(e) If a mechanical inspector loses any licensure, through
any circumstances, mechanical licensure shall be terminated
at the same time, whether or not the loss of the other licensure
is in any way related to the performance of mechanical
inspection duties.

As amended, R.1978 d.350, effective October 1, 1978.
See: 10 N.J.R. 378(a), 10 N.J.R. 469(f).

As amended, R.1981 d.134, effective April 10, 1981.
See: 13 N.J.R. 119(a), 13 N.J.R. 258(b).

(b) added, and old (b) renumbered as (c).

As amended, R.1982 d.8, effective February 1, 1982.
See: 13 N.J.R. 799(b), 14 N.J.R. 143(a).

Catchline: added “and alternative sanctions”.

(a): added “or assess ... $500.00”; (a)8-10 added.

(b): added “or assessing a penalty”; deleted “does not warrant ...
suspension”; added “warrants ... censure”; deleted “of warning ...
censure”.

As amended, R.1982 d.436, effective December 20, 1982.
See: 14 N.J.R. 734(a), 14 N.J.R. 1449(a).

Added “of a crime, or conviction of an offense” and “shall constitute”
to (c).

Amended by R.1985 d.528, effective October 21, 1985.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1705(a), 17 N.J.R. 2535(b).

Added test in (a) “suspend a license for not more than 60 days and/”.
Amended by R.1985 d.612, effective January 6, 1986.

See: 17 N.J.R. 1821(a), 18 N.J.R. 80(a).

Was 5:23-5.11.

Amended by R.1986 d.173, effective May 19, 1986.
See: 18 N.J.R. 16(b), 18 N.J.R. 1099(b).

(a)10 added; old (a)l10 renumbered (a)ll. This amendment was

proposed under the old citation 5:23-5.11.

Supp. 7-19-10

23-130

Amended by R.1987 d.509, effective December 7, 1987.
See: 19 N.J.R. 1264(a), 19 N.J.R. 2270(a).

This section recodified from section 26.
Amended by R.1992 d.68, effective February 3, 1992.
See: 23 N.J.R. 3441(a), 24 N.J.R. 406(a).

Text on review committees added at (d).
Amended by R.1992 d.272, effective July 6, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 1446(a), 24 N.J.R. 2424(a).

Stylistic changes.
Amended by R.1993 d.187, effective May 3, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 624(a), 25 N.J.R. 1875(a).

Added (e).

Amended by R.1996 d.545, effective December 2, 1996.
See: 28 N.J.R. 3997(a), 28 N.J.R. 5071(b).

Amended by R.2004 d.365, effective October 4, 2004.
See: 36 N.J.R. 2605(a), 36 N.J.R. 4441(a).

In (a), substituted “in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.31” for “of not
more than $500.00” in the introductory paragraph.
Amended by R.2004 d.366, effective October 4, 2004.
See: 36 N.J.R. 2606(a), 36 N.J.R. 4442(a).

In (d)2, deleted the second sentence.

Amended by R.2008 d.273, effective September 15, 2008.
See: 40 N.J.R. 2630(a), 40 N.J.R. 5195(c).

In (c), inserted “or a determination by the Department that a licensee
has engaged in conduct constituting a conflict of interest under N.J.A.C.
5:23-4.5(j)2,” and deleted “or suspension” following “revocation”.
Amended by R.2008 d.332, effective November 3, 2008.

See: 40 N.J.R. 4270(a), 40 N.J.R. 6439(a).

In the introductory paragraph of (a), inserted “or suspend” and “, at
any time during the preceding 10-year period”, and deleted “suspend a
license for not more than 60 days,” following “a license,”.

Case Notes

N.J.A.C. 5:23-525(d) applies only when the Department of Com-
munity Affairs is sanctioning a licensee with suspension, revocation
and/or a penalty; a private on-site inspection agency was not “licensee”
of the DCA and, therefore, was not entitled to a committee review prior
to the issuance of a Notice of Violation and Order to Pay Penalty
(adopting with modification 2009 N.J. AGEN LEXIS 700). Office of
Regulatory Affairs v. EIC Inspection Agency Corp., OAL Dkt. No. CAF
01069-09, 2009 N.J. AGEN LEXIS 1022, Final Decision (November 12,
2009).

Initial Decision (2007 N.J. AGEN LEXIS 764) adopted, which af-
firmed denial of a building inspector license because the applicant made
false and misleading statements on the application; the applicant an-
swered criminal history questions in the negative although the applicant
had a criminal history and was on probation. Bureau of Code Services v.
Guerriero, OAL Dkt. No. CAF 09580-07, 2008 N.J. AGEN LEXIS 38,
Final Decision (January 3, 2008).

Code official’s issuance of permits to a builder during the same period
of time in which the official was providing compensated architectural
services to the builder violated not only N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.25(a)3, but also
NJ.A.C. 5:23-4.5(j)2. Easse v. Dep’t of Community Affairs, Office of
Regulatory Affairs, OAL Dkt. No. CAF 03043-07, 2007 N.J. AGEN
LEXIS 842, Final Decision (July 24, 2007).

Where a building inspector accepted bribes relating to inspections and
attempted to negotiate a bribe larger than originally offered, the dis-
honesty demonstrated by the inspector’s admitted misconduct neces-
sitated the revocation of all of his construction code licenses, including
building inspector, construction official, and building subcode official
(adopting as modified 2006 N.J. AGEN LEXIS 319). Office of Reg-
ulatory Affairs v. DiStefano, OAL Dkt. No. CAF 4604-05, 2006 N.J.
AGEN LEXIS 518, Final Decision (April 17, 2006).

Fraud and deceit while practicing as a licensed code enforcement
official or inspector warranted license revocation. Regulatory Affairs v.
Zieniuk, 95 N.J.A.R.2d (CAF) 15.

Next Page is 23-130.0.0.1



