UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-2.19

(n) If the three percent or greater program-wide defect rate
cannot be reduced within two weeks, the program may be
terminated by the Department by notifying the utility and all
affected municipalities.

(0) A municipality in which a defect rate equal to or
greater than seven percent has been twice reported to the De-
partment and which has reason to believe that the program
cannot be successfully implemented within its jurisdiction
may notify the Department and the utility of the need for
termination of the program in that municipality. The Depart-
ment, upon verifying the accuracy of the municipality’s
claim, shall issue a notice to the utility and to the municipality
ordering the termination of the program in that municipality.

New Rule, R.1989 d.550, effective November 6, 1989.
See: 21 N.J.R. 233(a), 21 N.J.R. 3458(a).

Amended by R.1994 d.28, effective January 18, 1994.
See: 25 N.J.R. 4546(b), 26 N.J.R. 352(a).

Amended by R.1996 d.512, effective November 4, 1996.
See: 28 N.J.R. 3697(a), 28 N.J.R. 4782(a).

5:23-2.18B Utility area lighting facility installation
program

(a) Whenever an electric utility proposes to undertake in-
stallation of area lighting facilities located on private property
on metal poles with an underground electric feed, having no
ancillary utility facilities attached to said poles, the utility
shall follow the procedures set forth in this section.

(b) Installation of an area lighting facility shall be treated
as minor work in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.17A. The
utility shall, within five business days after verbal notice to
the enforcing agency of a proposed installation, mail a permit
application to the enforcing agency setting forth, at a min-
imum, the identity of the utility, the street address and
location of the site lighting facilities, the number of facilities
to be installed and a description of the installation.

(c) The utility shall pay a fee which shall be computed at
25 percent of the otherwise applicable permit fee chargeable
for such installations as per the Department fee schedule
established under N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.20(¢)2i(2) and iii(1).

(d) If any violations are noted by an inspector, the inspec-
tor shall notify the affected utility and the Department. Code
officials shall not issue “Stop Construction Orders” or “No-
tices of Violation” for such installations unless expressly au-
thorized to do so by the Department.

New Rule, R.1998 d.362, effective July 20, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 1122(a), 30 N.J.R. 2644(b).

5:23-2.18C Use and occupancy of swimming pools, spas
and hot tubs

(a) It shall be unlawful to continue the use and occupancy
of a swimming pool, spa or hot tub until a copy of a valid
bonding and grounding certificate has been made available to
the construction official, the pool, spa or hot tub has been
inspected, and an electrical certificate of compliance has been
issued. This requirement shall apply to any swimming pool,

New Jersey State Library

23-19

hot tub or spa located on any property other than one or two-
family residential property and includes, but is not limited to,
pools, hot tubs or spas open for the use of members, residents
or the public.

1. The electrical certificate of compliance shall be is-
sued annually by the local enforcing agency upon the
presentation of a valid bonding and grounding certificate,
satisfactory completion of an inspection by the electrical
subcode official and payment of an inspection fee. This
certificate shall be evidence that, based upon a visual
inspection, the wiring in or around the pool pump and as-
sociated electrical equipment is free from electrical safety
hazards, and meets the applicable requirements of the 1996
National Electrical Code.

2. The bonding and grounding certificate shall be is-
sued in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.20(e).

3. A bonding and grounding certificate shall also be
required for swimming pools, spas, or hot tubs which either
are newly constructed or have undergone modifications
that impact the bonding or grounding system. No addition-
al visual inspection shall be required for the issuance of an
electrical certificate of compliance where a construction
permit is issued for the electrical work pertaining to the
pool, spa, or hot tub.

(b) The most recent bonding and grounding certificate and
electrical certificate of compliance shall be posted in accord-
ance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.5(f).

New Rule, R.2000 d.47, effective February 7, 2000.
See: 31 N.J.R. 2314(a), 32 N.J.R. 443(a).
Administrative correction.

See: 35 N.J.R. 4861(a).

5:23-2.19 Special technical services

(a) Whenever the construction official and the appropriate
subcode official determine that a need for special technical
services exists with regard to a particular project for which
the municipal enforcing agency is classified to perform plan
review, the construction official may require the applicant to
obtain and furnish to the construction official, at the appli-
cant’s expense, a report from a licensed engineer or registered
architect. Such report shall contain the information deemed
necessary by the construction official to aid in his determi-
nation. Such may include, but not be limited to:

1. Analysis of materials and installation or design
methods not covered by the provisions of the subcodes;

2. Site investigation;
3. Structural analysis;

4. Building systems analysis (that is, mechanical,
electrical, vertical transportation, and so forth).

(b) The commissioner reserves the right to further regulate
the performance of special technical services.

Amended by R.1998 d.28, effective January 5, 1998.
See: 29 N.J.R. 3603(a), 30 N.J.R. 129(a).

Supp. 11-5-07



5:23-2.20

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

5:23-2.20 Tests and special inspections

(a) All tests required by the provisions of the regulations
shall be made and conducted under the supervision of the
enforcing agency and in accordance with such inspection and
test procedures as may be prescribed by the provisions of the
regulations, with the expense of all test and inspections to be
borne by the owner or lessee, or the contractor performing the
work.

(b) All special inspections, as provided in the building sub-
code, shall apply to Class I buildings. A special inspector
shall be independent of the contractor and shall be respon-
sible to the building owner or building owner’s agent. Special
inspectors shall be certified in the appropriate specialty.

1. Special inspections for soil conditions and pile foun-
dations shall be performed under the direct supervision of a
New Jersey licensed engineer.

(¢) The construction official may accept tests and test re-
ports of the Department and other government agencies, as
well as signed statements and supporting inspection and test
reports filed by qualified licensed professionals or approved
agencies or firms.

(d) The construction official may accept a Chimney Certi-
fication for Replacement of Fuel-Fired Equipment (Form F-
370), signed by the contractor who installed the replacement
fuel-fired equipment, in lieu of requiring the removal and
reinstallation of the chimney vent connector for purposes of
inspection of the chimney or vent. Certifications from home-
owners shall not be accepted in lieu of the required inspec-
tion.

(e) The bonding and grounding certificate for swimming
pools, spas and hot tubs, shall be issued by a recognized elec-
trical testing agency or a New Jersey State licensed electrical
contractor. This certificate shall verify the continuity and
integrity of the bonding and grounding system. It shall be
valid for five years from the date of issuance.

Amended by R.1992 d.244, effective June 15, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 1147(a), 24 N.J.R. 2243(a).
Special inspections added.
Amended by R.1995 d.249, effective June 5, 1995, (operative October 1,
1995).
See: 27 N.J.R. 619(a), 27 N.J.R. 2187(a).
Added (c).
Amended by R.1996 d.512, effective November 4, 1996.
See: 28 N.J.R. 3697(a), 28 N.J.R. 4782(a).
Amended by R.1997 d.376, effective September 15, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 2741(a), 29 N.J.R. 4102(a).
In (c), inserted “Form (F-370)”, substituted “contractor” for “person”
and added last sentence.
Amended by R.2000 d.47, effective February 7, 2000.
See: 31 N.J.R. 2314(a), 32 N.J.R. 443(a).
Added (d).
Amended by R.2003 d.187, effective May 5, 2003.
See: 34 N.J.R. 4248(a), 35 N.J.R. 1939(c).
Added a new (b); recodified former (b) through (d) as (c) through (e).
Amended by R.2006 d.381, effective November 6, 2006.
See: 38 N.J.R. 35(a), 38 N.J.R. 4691(a).
In the introductory paragraph of (b), added the last sentence; and
added (b)1.

Supp. 11-5-07

5:23-2.21 Construction control

(a) Responsibilities: The provisions of this section shall
define the construction controls required for all buildings in-
volving professional architecture/engineering services and de-
lineate the responsibilities of such professional services to-
gether with those services that are the responsibility of the
contractor during construction.

(b) Professional architecture or engineering services:

1. Design: All new, renovation, alteration, reconstruc-
tion, expansion, addition or modification work involving
the practice of professional architecture or engineering, as
defined by the statutory requirements of the professional
registration and licensing laws of this State, shall be
prepared by registered architects or licensed engineers. All
plans, computations and specifications required for a con-
struction permit application must be prepared by or under
the direct supervision of a registered architect or licensed
engineer and bear his or her signature and seal in accord-
ance with the State’s statutes and regulations governing the
professional registration and licensing of architects and
engineers.

(c) Responsible person in charge of work: The owner shall
designate a person to be in charge of the work who shall be
responsible for:

1. Verification of all controlled materials per building
subcode requirements of testing, certification and identifi-
cation;

2. Special inspection of critical construction compo-
nents;

3. Submission of amended plans and specifications
whenever substantial deviations are necessary or desired,
or when required to do so pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-
2.15(f)4v; and

4. The responsible person in charge of work shall per-
form the necessary services and be present on the construc-
tion site on a regular and periodic basis to determine that,
generally, the work is proceeding in accordance with the
code and any conditions of the construction permit.

(d) Reporting: At the completion of the construction, the
responsible person in charge of work shall submit to the
construction official a report as to the satisfactory completion
and the readiness of the project for occupancy and shall
certify that, to the best of the responsible person’s knowledge
and belief, such has been done substantially in accordance
with the code and with those portions of the plans and spec-
ifications controlled by the code, with any substantial devia-
tions noted.

(e) Construction contractor services: The actual construc-
tion of the work shall be the responsibility of the contractor(s)
as identified on the approved construction permit and shall
involve:

23-20

(/‘



e

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.16

(a)li had a change of address; (a)3 and (c) added.
Amended by R.1987 d.81, effective February 2, 1987.
See: 18 N.J.R. 2237(b), 19 N.J.R. 289(d).

Amended by R.1987 d.374, effective September 21, 1987.
See: 19 N.J.R. 1024(a), 19 N.J.R. 1720(b).

Model subcode revisions.

Amended by R.1989 d.66, effective February 6, 1989.
See: 20 N.J.R. 2846(a), 21 N.J.R. 288(a).

Added (c).

Amended by R.1990 d.58, effective February 5, 1990.
See: 21 N.J.R. 3346(a), 22 N.J.R. 351(a).

Added (d) adopting the 1989 Supplement to the 1987 National Stan-
dard Plumbing Code.

Amended by R.1990 d.253, effective May 21, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 909(b), 22 N.J.R. 1554(a).

Text added at (a)3; (d)3ii amended.

Amended by R.1990 d.507, effective October 15, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 2208(a), 22 N.J.R. 3214(a).

Text conformed to BOCA National Code/1990.

Amended by R.1991 d.326, effective July 1, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 804(a), 23 N.J.R. 2044(a).
GPF set at 1.6; gravity water closets not permitted in commercial
uses.
Amended by R.1991 d.571, effective November 18, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 2619(a), 23 N.J.R. 3444(b).
Added new (c).
Amended by R.1992 d.67, effective February 3, 1992.
See: 23 N.J.R. 3602(a), 24 N.J.R. 404(b).
Low volume water closet exception added at (b)18i(1).
Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a).
Amended by R.1995 d.122, effective March 6, 1995 (operative July 1,

1995).
See: 26 N.J.R. 4874(a), 27 N.J.R. 894(a).
Amended by R.1998 d.136, effective March 16, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 4(a), 30 N.J.R. 1038(a).

In (b)9, added xii.
Amended by R.1998 d.332, effective July 6, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 1377(a), 30 N.J.R. 2421(D).

Rewrote the section.

Amended by R.2001 d.340, effective September 17, 2001.
See: 33 N.J.R. 1245(a), 33 N.J.R. 3308(b).

Rewrote the section.

Amended by R.2002 d.393, effective December 16, 2002.
See: 34 N.J.R. 2914(a), 34 N.J.R. 4428(a).

In (b)8, deleted former (ii) and recodified existing (iii) to (ix) as (ii) to
(viii).
Amended by R.2005 d.35, effective January 18, 2005.
See: 36 N.J.R. 3329(b), 37 N.J.R. 267(a).

Rewrote the section.
Administrative correction.
See: 37 N.J.R. 885(a).
Amended by R.2005 d.341, effective October 17, 2005.
See: 37 N.J.R. 164(a), 37 N.J.R. 3974(b).

In (b)3iv, added “and add the following sentence at the end: ‘Mini-
mum earth cover for building sewers connected to a private sewage
disposal system shall be 6 inches.’  at the end of the paragraph.
Amended by R.2007 d.65, effective February 20, 2007.

See: 38 N.J.R. 3348(a), 39 N.J.R. 633(a).

Rewrote the section.

Amended by R.2008 d.274, effective September 15, 2008.
See: 40 N.J.R. 2629(a), 40 N.J.R. 5195(b).

In paragraph 7.23 of (b)8vi, substituted “Spas and Hot Tubs” for
“spas and hot tubs”; in subparagraph 2 of paragraph 7.23.3 of (b)8vi,
inserted a period at the end; in paragraph 7.23.4.1 of (b)8vi, added the
second paragraph; and in paragraph 7.23.5 of (b)8vi, inserted the closing
quotation mark at the end.

Amended by R.2008 d.346, effective November 17, 2008.
See: 40 N.J.R. 3778(a), 40 N.J.R. 6540(a).

In (b)4iv, inserted “the” preceding “Construction” and substituted
“2004” for “1998”; added (b)10vi; recodified former (b)10vi and
(b)10vii as (b)10vii and (b)10viii; and in (b)10viii, substituted “2004”
for ©1999”.

23-58.0.5

Amended by R.2009 d.48, effective February 2, 2009.
See: 40 N.J.R. 5319(a), 41 N.J.R. 733(b).

Case Notes

Statute providing that only licensed master plumbers could be plumb-
ing contractors was unconstitutional. Mechanical Contractors Ass’n of
New Jersey, Inc. v. State, 255 N.J.Super. 488, 605 A.2d 743 (A.D.1992).

5:23-3.16 Electrical subcode
(a) Rules concerning the subcode adopted are as follows:

1. Pursuant to authority of P.L. 1975, c. 217, as modi-
fied by P.L. 1996, c.53, the Commissioner hereby adopts
the model code of the National Fire Protection Association,
known as “The National Electrical Code 2005 as the elec-
trical subcode for New Jersey.

i.  Copies of this code may be obtained from the
sponsors at NFPA, One Batterymarch Park, Quincy,
Massachusetts 02269.

2. The National Electrical Code 2005 may be known
and cited as “the electrical subcode.”

i.  Codes and standards referenced in the Fine Print
Notes (FPNs) of the electrical subcode (NEC 2005) shall
be considered adopted by reference to the extent pre-
scribed by each related section. These codes and stan-
dards also are printed in DCA Bulletin #06-2, which
contains a list of adopted codes and standards that are
applicable to the enforcement of the electrical subcode.

3. The Commissioner hereby adopts the National Elec-
trical Safety Code (ANSI C2-2002) for the installation of
area lighting facilities by an electric utility on private
property on metal poles with an underground electric feed.

i. Copies of the National Electrical Safety Code
may be obtained from the Institute of Electrical and
Electronic Engineers, Inc., PO Box 1331, 445 Hoes
Lane, Piscataway, New Jersey 08855-1331.

(b) The following chapters or articles of the electrical
subcode are amended as follows:

1. Article 90 of the electrical subcode, entitled “Intro-
duction,” is amended as follows:

i.  Section 90.4, entitled “Enforcement,” is amended
to delete in the first paragraph the phrase, “authority
having jurisdiction for enforcement of the code” and
substitute in lieu thereof, the term ‘“electrical subcode
official.” And add a new last sentence in the first para-
graph: “Approval shall be in accordance with N.J.A.C.
5:23-2.9.” Delete in the second paragraph the phrase
“authority having jurisdiction” and substitute in lieu
thereof the term “electrical subcode official” and add
after “effective safety” the phrase “as provided in
NJ.A.C. 5:23-2.9.” Delete in the third paragraph the
phrase “authority having jurisdiction” and substitute in
lieu thereof the term “electrical subcode official” and
delete the phrase “by the jurisdiction” after the word
“adopted.”

Supp. 2-2-09



5:23-3.16

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 2-2-09

ii. Section 90.5, entitled “Mandatory Rules, Per-
missive Rules, and Explanatory Material,” is amended to
add “except as outlined under N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.16(a)2i”
after the word “Code” in line 6 under paragraph (C).

2. Chapter 1 of the electrical subcode, Article 100, en-

titled “Definitions,” is amended as follows:

i. The definition of the term “approved” is
amended to delete the phrase “the authority having juris-
diction” and substitute in lieu thereof, the phrase “elec-
trical subcode official. Approval shall be in accordance
with N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.7, 3.8 and 3.8A.”

ii. The definition of “Authority having jurisdiction”
is replaced with “Unless otherwise specifically noted,
the authority having jurisdiction for the Electrical Sub-
code shall be the Electrical Subcode Official.”

iii. The definition of the term “building” is deleted
and in lieu thereof, substitute the definition of the term
“building” found in N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4”.

3. Chapter 2 of the electrical subcode, entitled “Wiring

and Protection,” is amended as follows:

i.  Section 210.12(B) of Article 210, entitled
“Branch Circuits,” is amended to insert the following
sentence at the end of the section, “This requirement
shall be considered optional.”

4. Chapter 3 of the electrical subcode, entitled “Wiring

Methods and Materials,” is amended as follows:

i.  Section 300.4(A)(1) is amended to delete the
words from “so that the edge...” on line four through “...
cannot be maintained” on line six and in lieu thereof
substitute “as required by the building subcode. Where
the distance from the edge of the hole to the nearest edge
of the wood member is less than 32 mm (1% inches).”

ii. Section 334.10(1) is amended to add “and acces-
sory buildings or structures” after the word dwellings.

iii. Section 334.12(A)(2) is deleted in its entirety.
5. Chapter 5 of the electrical subcode, entitled “Special

Occupancies,” is amended as follows:

i.  Sections 514.11(B) and 514.11(C) are amended
to delete the phrase “authority having jurisdiction” and
substitute in lieu thereof the phrase “fire protection
subcode official.”

ii. Part IT of Article 550, entitled “Mobile Homes,
Manufactured Homes, and Mobile Home Parks” com-
prising sections 550.11 through 550.25 is deleted. Sec-
tion 550.10 shall be retained.

(1) Exception—Part II is retained in its entirety in
the case of mobile/manufactured homes undergoing
repair, renovation, or alteration.

23-58.0.6

(A) Section 550.25 is amended to add the fol-
lowing sentence at the end of the section: “This
requirement shall be considered optional.”

iii. In Article 551, entitled “Recreation Vehicles and
Recreation Vehicle Parks,” delete from the title the
words “Recreational Vehicles and.”

(1) Section 551.1 is amended to delete the phrase
“within or on recreational vehicles” on line 4.

(2) Parts I, III, IV, and V, comprising sections
551.20 through 551.60, are deleted in their entirety,
with the exception of Figure 551.46(C), which shall
be retained.

iv. Article 552 shall be applicable to structures cov-
ered by the recreational park trailers subcode, N.J.A.C.
5:23-4D, provided that:

(1) The structure is restricted to seasonal use as
per Section 552.4. For purposes of applying this
requirement, the park in which the structure is located
shall be open for six months or less each year or
access to the structures shall be otherwise restricted to
a period of six months or less each year; and

(2) No additions, alterations, or extensions of any
kind shall be made to the electrical system or structure
unless the entire electrical system shall be made to
conform to the electrical requirements of this code
applicable to single family dwellings.

6. Annex G of the electrical subcode, entitled “Admin-

istration and Enforcement,” is deleted in its entirety.

7. Chapter 6 of the electrical subcode, entitled “Special

Equipment,” is amended as follows:

i.  Section 680.26(C), entitled “Equipotential Bond-
ing Grid,” is amended to add the phrase “conform to the
contours of the pool and shall” before the word “extend”
and to add the words “within or” after the word “extend”
in the first paragraph. Insert the following paragraph
immediately following the first paragraph: “Exception:
The equipotential bonding grid shall not be required to
be installed under the bottom of or vertically along the
walls of vinyl lined polymer wall, fiberglass composite,
or other pools constructed of nonconductive materials.
Any metal parts of the pool, including metal structural
supports, shall be bonded in accordance with 680.26(B).
For the purposes of this section, poured concrete, pneu-
matically applied (sprayed) concrete, and concrete block,
with painted or plastered coatings, shall be considered
conductive material.”

ii. Section 680.26(C)(1), is amended to add the
phrase “or deck” after the word “pool”. Add a new last
sentence as follows: “Where deck reinforcing steel is not
an integral part of the pool, the deck reinforcing steel
shall be bonded to other parts of the bonding grid using a

Next Page is 23-58.0.6.1

@,




UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.17

minimum 8 AWG solid copper conductor. Connection
shall be per 680.26(D).”

(¢) A newly installed automatic lawn sprinkler system,
where such systems are not prohibited by local ordinance,
shall be equipped with an automatic rain sensor device or
switch that will override the irrigation cycle of the automatic
lawn sprinkler system when rainfall of more than one-half
inch has occurred.

Amended by R.1981 d.132, effective May 7, 1981.
See: 13 NJ.R. 121(a), 13 N.J.R. 258(d).

Amended by R.1984 d.314, effective August 6, 1984,
See: 16 N.J.R. 1139(a), 16 N.J.R. 2084(b).

Section substantially amended.

Amended by R.1987 d.374, effective September 21, 1987.
See: 19 N.J.R. 1024(a), 19 N.J.R. 1720(b).

Model subcode revisions.

Amended by R.1990 d.253, effective May 21, 1990.

See: 22 N.J.R. 909(b), 22 N.J.R. 1554(a).
Amendments to (b)4i(2), ii(2).

Administrative Correction to (b)4i(2).

See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b).

Amended by R.1990 d.507, effective October 15, 1990.

See: 22 N.J.R. 2208(a), 22 N.J.R. 3214(a).

Text conformed to BOCA National Code/1990.
Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a).

Amended by R.1998 d.332, effective July 6, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 1377(a), 30 N.J.R. 2421(b).

Rewrote the section.

Amended by R.1998 d.362, effective July 20, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 1122(a), 30 N.J.R. 2644(b).

In (a), inserted a new 3.

Amended by R.2000 d.48, effective February 7, 2000.
See: 31 N.J.R. 2317(a), 32 N.J.R. 445(a).

In (a), substituted references to 1999 for references to 1996 through-
out, substituted a reference to One Batterymarch Park for a reference to
Batterymarch Park in 1i, and inserted 2i; and in (b), inserted 1ii, inserted
a new 3, recodified former 3 and 4 as 4 and 5, substituted a reference to
line four for a reference to line three and substituted a reference to line
six for a reference to line five in the new 4i, and substituted a reference
to section 500-5(a)(4) for a reference to section 500-3(a)4 in the new 5i.
Amended by R.2003 d.187, effective May 5, 2003.

Next Page is 23-58.0.7

23-58.0.6.1

See: 34 N.J.R. 4248(a), 35 N.J.R. 1939(c).

Rewrote the section.

Amended by R.2003 d.240, effective June 16, 2003.
See: 34 N.J.R. 3045(a), 35 N.J.R. 2637(c).

Added (c).

Amended by R.2006 d.158, effective May 1, 2006.
See: 37 N.J.R. 4105(a), 38 N.J.R. 1827(a).

In (a)1, (a)2 and (a)2.i, substituted “2005” for “2002”; also in (a)2.i,
substituted “#06-2" for “#03-1”; in (a)3, substituted “C2-2002” for “C2—
1997”; deleted (b)1 and recodified (b)2 through (b)6 as (b)1 through
(b)5; in (b)4.ii, substituted “(2)” for “(1)”, in (b)5iii(1), substituted “4”
for “2”; in (b)5iii(2), substituted “V” for “VI” and “551.20” for
“551.10”; and inserted (b)6.

Amended by R.2007 d.310, effective October 1, 2007.
See: 39 N.J.R. 135(a), 39 N.J.R. 4113(b).

Added (b)7.

Amended by R.2007, d.384, effective December 17, 2007.
See: 39 N.J.R. 2684(a), 39 N.J.R. 5211(a).

Added new (b)4ii; recodified former (b)4ii as (b)4iii; and in (b)4iii,
substituted “(2)” for “(1)”.

Amended by R.2008 d.213, effective August 4, 2008.
See: 39 N.J.R. 2411(a), 40 N.J.R. 4523(b).
Rewrote (b)Siv.

Case Notes

Former N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.6 designated “National Electrical code of
1975” as controlling code; statute of limitations. Brown v. Jersey Central
Power and Light Co., 163 N.J.Super. 179 394 A.2d 397 (App.Div.1978)
certification denied 79 N.J. 489 401 A.2d 244.

5:23-3.17 Fire protection subcode

(a) Rules concerning the subcode adopted are as follows:

1. Pursuant to the authority of P.L. 1975, c. 217 as
modified by P.L. 1996, c. 53, the Commissioner hereby
adopts the following portions of the building, electrical,
mechanical and fuel gas subcodes, to the extent delineated
in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.4, as the fire protection subcode for
New Jersey.

Supp. 11-17-08



