
/ 

L 

UNIFORM FIRE CODE 

Emergency power loads; Section 604.2.17, Group I-3 
occupancies; Section 604.2.18, Airport traffic control 
towers; Section 604.2.19, Elevators; Section 604.2.19.1, 
Manual transfer; Section 604.2.19.2, One elevator; 
Section 604.2.19.3, Two or more elevators; and Section 
604.2.19.4, Venting. 

xvii. New Section 604.3.1.1, Testing, shall be in­
serted as follows, "604.3.1.1 Testing: Required emer­
gency lighting systems, including exit signs, shall be 
tested for proper operation for a minimum of 30 seconds 
every month. An annual test shall be conducted for at 
least 1 hour. Equipment shall function properly for the 
duration of these tests." 

xviii. New Section 604.3.1.2, Battery system, shall 
be inserted as follows, "604.3.1.2 Battery system. Where 
battery systems or unit equipment are involved, includ­
ing batteries utilized for starting, control or ignition in 
auxiliary engines, routine maintenance shall be provided 
in accordance with the manufacturer's specifications." 

xix. New Section 604.3.1.3, Emergency generators, 
shall be inserted as follows, "604.3.1.3 Emergency gen­
erators. Required emergency generators shall be tested at 
least annually in accordance with the manufacturer's 
specifications under anticipated load conditions. 

1. Transition test. A transition test shall be con-
ducted annually to ensure that the transfer time from 
normal power to emergency power is 10 seconds or 
less. 

2. Fuel supply. Where internal combustion en­
gines are utilized as the prime mover for an emer­
gency generator, an on-site fuel supply shall be pro­
vided sufficient for not less than 2 hours full-demand 
operation of the system." 

xx. In Section 605.1, Abatement of electrical 
hazards, "ICC Electrical Code" shall be deleted and 
"electrical subcode of the Uniform Construction Code" 
shall be inserted. After "used," "All electrical wiring, 
devices, appliances and other equipment shall be main­
tained in accordance with the provisions of the New 
Jersey Uniform Construction Code Electrical Subcode 
and this subchapter." shall be inserted. 

xxi. In Section 605.3, Working space and clear-
ance, Exception, 1, after "allowed by," "the ICC Elec­
trical Code" shall be deleted and "the Uniform Construc­
tion Code." shall be inserted. 

xxii. In Section 605.4, Multiplug adapters, "the ICC 
Electrical Code" shall be deleted and "the electrical sub­
code of the Uniform Construction Code" shall be in­
serted. 

xxiii. In Section 605.9, Temporary wiring, "the ICC 
Electrical Code" shall be deleted and "the electrical 
subcode of the Uniform Construction Code" shall be 
inserted. 

New Jersey State Library 70-41 

5:70-3.2 

xxiv. New Section 605.11, Unused equipment, shall 
be inserted as follows, "605 .11 Unused equipment. All 
unused fixtures, circuits, wiring and electrical devices or 
fixtures shall be removed or properly secured in place 
and maintained." 

xxv. In Section 606.1, Scope; Section 606.2, Re-
frigerants; Section 606.3, Refrigerant classification; Sec­
tion 606.4, Change in refrigerant type; Section 606.6.1, 
Periodic testing; and Section 606.8, Refrigerant detector, 
"the International Mechanical Code" shall be deleted 
and "the mechanical subcode of the Uniform Construc­
tion Code" shall be inserted. 

xxvi. In Section 606.7, Emergency signs, "Inter­
national Mechanical Code" shall be deleted and "me­
chanical subcode of the Uniform Construction Code" 
shall be inserted. 

xxvii. In Section 606.16, Electrical equipment, "the 
International Mechanical Code" shall be deleted and 
"the mechanical subcode of the Uniform Construction 
Code" shall be inserted. "The ICC Electrical Code" shall 
be deleted and "the electrical subcode of the Uniform 
Construction Code" shall be inserted. In the Exception, 
"Section 1106.3.20 of the International Mechanical 
Code" shall be deleted and "the mechanical subcode of 
the Uniform Construction Code" shall be inserted. 

xxviii. In Section 607.3, Elevator keys, after "fire 
department," "and shall be in compliance with N.J.A.C. 
5:70-2.23, Elevator key lock boxes." shall be inserted. 

xxvix. In Section 608.4, Room design and construc­
tion, "the International Building Code" shall be deleted 
and "the building subcode of the Uniform Construction 
Code" shall be inserted. 

xxx. In Section 608.6.1, Room ventilation, "the In-
ternational Mechanical Code" shall be deleted and "the 
mechanical subcode of the Uniform Construction Code" 
shall be inserted. 

xxxi. In Section 608.8, Seismic protection, "the 
International Building Code" shall be deleted and "the 
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code" 
shall be inserted. 

xxxii. In Section 608.9 Smoke detection, "installed" 
shall be deleted and "maintained" shall be inserted. 

xxxiii. In Section 609.1, General, "including those in 
mobile enclosed units" shall be inserted after "exhaust 
hoods" and "comply" shall be deleted and "be main­
tained in accordance" shall be inserted. Also, "the Inter­
national Mechanical Code" shall be deleted and "the 
mechanical subcode of the Uniform Construction Code 
and NFP A 96" shall be inserted. 

xxxiv. In Section 609.2, Where required, "Where 
required" shall be deleted and the text of the section 
shall be deleted and the following text shall be inserted, 
"609 .2 Maintenance. Commercial kitchen exhaust sys­
tems shall be cleaned to remove deposits of residue and 

Supp. 2-2-09 



5:70-3.2 

grease in the system at intervals specified in the cleaning 
schedule required to be submitted in accordance with 
609.2.1. Thorough cleaning of ducts, hoods and fans 
shall require scraping, brushing or other positive clean­
ing methods." 

xxxv. New Section 609.2.I, Cleaning schedule, 
shall be inserted as follows, "609.2.1 Cleaning schedule. 
Where a cleaning schedule is not on file, the fire official 
shall require a schedule to be submitted, indicating the 
method of cleaning and the time intervals between clean­
ings." 

7. Chapter 7, Fire-Resistance-Rated Construction, shall 
be amended as follows: 

i. In Section 703.2, Opening protectives, the fol-
lowing text shall be inserted after the word "inoperable" 
"Door stops, wedges and other unapproved hold-open 
devices shall be prohibited." 

ii. In Section 703.2.2, Hold-open devices and clos­
ers, the following text shall be inserted before the first 
sentence starting with the word "hold-open," "Approved 
self-closing". The following text shall be inserted fol­
lowing the second sentence after the word "position," 
"Where it is desired to keep the doors open, an 
automatic-closing device actuated by automatic fire 
detectors shall be provided in accordance with the build­
ing subcode of the Uniform Construction Code. 

iii. In Section 704.1, Enclosure, the words "Table 
704.1" shall be deleted and the following text shall be 
inserted, "the construction code in effect at the time of 
construction or N.J.A.C. 5:70-4 as applicable." 

iv. Table 704.1, Vertical Opening Protection Re­
quired shall be deleted. 

8. Chapter 8, Interior Finish, Decorative Materials And 
Furnishings, shall be amended as follows: 

i. In Section 803 .I, General, the text of the section 
following "803.I General." shall be deleted in its 
entirety and the following shall be inserted, "The interior 
finish and trim shall be maintained in accordance with 
the requirements of N.J.A.C. 5:23, the Uniform Con­
struction Code or N.J.A.C. 5:70-4 the Uniform Fire 
Code, Fire Safety Code as applicable. Any interior finish 
or trim installed without a permit issued in accordance 
with N.J.A.C. 5:23, the Uniform Construction Code, 
shall be removed." 

ii. In Section 803, Interior Wall and Ceiling Finish 
and Trim in Existing Buildings, the following sections 
shall be deleted: 803.1.1, Classification; 803 .2, Stability; 
803.3, Interior fmish requirements based on occupancy; 
803 .4, Fire retardant coatings; 803.5, Textiles; 803.5.1, 
Textile wall coverings; 803.5.1.1, Method A. test proto­
col Textiles; 803.6, 803.6.1, Expanded vinyl wall or ceil­
ing coverings, General; and 803.6.2, Compliance alter­
native. 

Supp. 2-2-09 70-42 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

111. Table 803.3, Interior Wall And Ceiling Finish 
Requirements By Occupancy, shall be deleted in its 
entirety. 

iv. In Section 803.7.1, Combustibility character­
istics, the following shall be deleted, "in Section 2603.9 
of the International Building Code" and the following 
shall be inserted, "the building subcode of the Uniform 
Construction Code." 

v. In Section 803.7.2, Thermal barrier, the follow­
ing shall be deleted, "Section 2603.4 of the International 
Building Code", and the following shall be inserted, "the 
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code". 

vi. Section 804, Interior Wall and Ceiling Trim in 
New and Existing Buildings, shall be deleted in its en­
tirety. 

vii. In Section 805, Upholstered Furniture And Mat­
tresses In New And Existing Buildings, the following 
text shall be deleted, "In New And Existing Buildings." 

viii. In Section 806, Decorative Vegetation In New 
And Existing Buildings, the following text shall be de­
leted, "In New And Existing Buildings." 

ix. In Section 806.1.1, Restricted occupancies, the 
following text shall be deleted, "Group A, E. 1-1, 1-2, 1-
3, 1-4, M, R-I, R-2, R-4" and the following text shall be 
inserted, "all". In Section 806.1.1, Restricted Occupan­
cies, Exception, I. The following text shall be deleted, 
"in Groups A, E, M. R-1 and R-2." In Section 806.l.I, 
Restricted Occupancies, Exception 2, the following text 
shall be deleted, "in Group R-2 occupancies" and the 
word "individual" shall be added after the word 
"within." 

x. In Section 806.3, Obstruction of Means of 
Egress, after "vegetation," the "and the decorative vege­
tation shall not be placed near any stairway or elevator 
shaft" shall be inserted. 

xi. New Section 806.6, Show windows, shall be in­
serted as follows, "806.6 Show windows. "Decorative 
vegetation and wreaths shall not be used for decorative 
purposes in show windows or other parts of buildings in 
such a quantity as to constitute a fire hazard unless such 
material is flameproofed in an approved manner." 

xii. New Section 806.7, Under-tree decorations, shall 
be inserted as follows, "806.7 Under-tree decorations. 
No flammable decorations, combustible tree skirts or 
decorative gift packages may be placed on or under or 
around decorative vegetation. This restriction does not 
apply to decorative vegetation displayed in a sprinklered 
building." 

xiii. New Section 806.8, Holiday wreaths, shall be 
inserted as follows, "806.8 Holiday wreaths: Holiday 
wreaths shall be permitted in any building but such 



( 

~· 

UNIFORM FIRE CODE 

every structure shall be responsible for the safety of all 
persons in, or occupying, such premises with respect to 
the adequacy of means of egress therefrom." 

x. In Section 1003.2, Ceiling height, the text of the 
section shall be deleted and the following shall be in­
serted, "Egress plan. Where required by Section 404.2, a 
plan complying with Section 404.3 shall be submitted to 
the fire official and an approved copy shall be kept on 
the premises of assembly occupancies." 

xi. In Section 1003.3, Protruding objects, the text of 
the section shall be deleted and the following shall be 
inserted, "Occupant load.: The occupant load for struc­
tures shall be maintained pursuant to the New Jersey 
Uniform Construction Code provisions in effect at the 
time of construction. The occupant load for structures 
constructed under standards in force prior to adoption of 
the New Jersey Uniform Construction Code shall be 
calculated in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:70-4.ll(f)3." 

xii. In Section 1003, General Means of Egress, the 
following sections shall be deleted in their entirety: 
Section 1003.3.1, Headroom; Section 1003.3.2, Free 
standing objects; Section 1003.3.3, Horizontal projec­
tions; and Section 1003.3.4, Clear width. 

xm. In Section 1003.4, Floor surface, the text of 
the section shall be deleted and the following shall be 
inserted, "Posting of occupant load. An assembly occu­
pancy shall be posted with an approved legible sign in 
contrasting colors conspicuously located near the main 
point of egress from the room or space stating the 
number of occupants permitted within such space. The 
number of occupants permitted shall be in accordance 
with the current certificate of occupancy issued pursuant 
to the New Jersey Uniform Construction Code for struc­
tures constructed and occupied under the provisions of 
that code, and shall be in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:70-
4.11(f)3. for structures constructed under standards in 
force prior to adoption of the New Jersey Uniform 
Construction Code for which structures no such certifi­
cate of occupancy has subsequently been issued." 

xiv. In Section 1003.5, Elevation change, the text 
of the section shall be deleted and the following shall be 
inserted, "Overcrowding. A person shall not permit 
overcrowding or admittance of any person beyond the 
approved occupant load. The fire official, upon finding 
overcrowded conditions or obstructions in aisles, pas­
sageways or other means of egress, or upon finding any 
condition which constitutes a hazard to life and safety, 
shall cause the occupancy, performance, presentation, 
spectacle or entertainment to be stopped until such a 
condition or obstruction is corrected and the addition of 
any further occupants prohibited until the approved 
occupant load is reestablished." 

xv. In Section 1003.6, Means of egress continuity, 
the text of the section shall be deleted and the following 

70-48.1 

5:70-3.2 

shall be inserted, "Operator responsibility. The operator 
or the person responsible for the operation of an as­
sembly or educational occupancy shall check egress 
facilities before such building is occupied to determine 
compliance with this chapter. If such inspection reveals 
that any element of the required means of egress cannot 
be accessed, is obstructed, locked, fastened or otherwise 
unsuited for immediate utilization, admittance to the 
building shall not be permitted until necessary corrective 
action has been completed." 

xvi. Section 1003.7, Elevators, escalators and mov-
ing walks, shall be deleted in its entirety. 

xvii. Section 1004, Occupant Load, shall be deleted 
in its entirety. 

xviii. Section 1005, Egress Width, shall be deleted 
in its entirety. 

xvix. In Section 1006.1, Illumination required, Ex­
ceptions, "in Groups R-1, R-2 and R-3 of 3. and 4. 
Sleeping units of Group I occupancies" shall be deleted. 

xx. In Section 1006, Means of Egress Illumi-
nation, the following sections shall be deleted in their 
entirety: Section 1006.2, Illumination level, Section 
1006.3, Illumination emergency power, Section 1006.4, 
Performance of system. 

xxi. Section 1007, Accessible Means of Egress, 
shall be deleted in its entirety. 

xxii. Section 1008.1, Doors, the following shall be 
deleted, "Means of egress doors shall meet the require­
ments of this section. Doors serving a means of egress 
section shall meet the requirements of this section and 
Section 10 17.2." 

xxiii. In Section 1008, Doors, Gates and Turnstiles, 
the following sections shall be deleted in their entirety, 
Section 1008.1.1, Size of doors; Section 1008.1.1.1, Pro­
jections into clear width; Section 1008.1.2, Door swing; 
Section 1008.1.3, Special doors; Section 1008.1.3.1, 
Revolving doors, Table 1008.1.3.1, Revolving door 
speeds; Section 1008.1.3.1.1, Egress component; Section 
1008.1.3.1.2, Other than egress components; Section 
1008.1.3 .2, Power operated doors; Section 1008.1.3 .3, 
Horizontal sliding doors; and 1008.1.3.4, Access con­
trolled egress doors. 

xxiv. Section 1008.1.3.5, Security grilles, the fol­
lowing text shall be deleted, "In Groups B, F, M and S," 
and "Where two or more means of egress are required, 
not more than one half of the exits or exit access door­
ways shall be equipped with horizontal sliding or 
vertical security grilles." 

xxv. In Section 1008, Doors, Gates and Turnstiles, 
the following sections shall be deleted in their entirety: 
Section 1 008.1.4, Floor elevation; Section 1 008.1.5, 

Supp. 2-2-09 



5:70-3.2 

Landings at doors; Section 1008.1.6, Thresholds; and 
Section 1008.1.7, Door arrangement. 

xxvi. In Section 1008.1.8, Door operations, "Except 
as specifically permitted by this section" shall be de­
leted. 

xxvii. Section 1008.1.8.2, Hardware height shall be 
deleted in its entirety. 

xxviii. New Section 1008.4, Locks permitted, shall be 
inserted as follows, "Locks permitted. Locks or fasteners 
shall not be installed on egress doors, except in accor­
dance with the following conditions: 

1. In mental, penal or other institutions where 
the security of inmates is necessary, in which case 
properly trained supervisory personnel shall be con­
tinuously on duty and approved provisions shall be 
made to remove occupants safely in case of a fire or 
other emergencies. 

2. In problem security areas, special-purpose 
door alarms or locking devices shall be approved prior 
to installation. Manually operated edge or surface­
molded flush bolts shall be prohibited. 

3. Where the door hardware is in compliance 
with the Uniform Construction Code." 

xxvix. New Section 1008.5. Special performance 
features, shall be inserted as follows, "Special perfor­
mance features. All hardware systems or assemblies util­
ized in the operation of a door, including special perfor­
mance features, shall be inspected for proper operation. 
The inspection shall determine that the hardware 
operates as required by this code." 

xxx. New Section 1008.6, Panic hardware, shall 
be inserted as follows, "Panic hardware. All doors equip­
ped with latching devices serving rooms or spaces with 
an assembly or educational occupancy with an occupant 
load greater than 100 shall have the approved panic 
hardware maintained in compliance with the construc­
tion code in effect at the time offrrst occupancy." 

xxxi. New Section 1008.7, Closing, shall be in-
serted as follows "Closing. All frre doors shall comply 
with Section 703." 

xxxii. The following sections shall be deleted in 
their entirety: Section 1008.1.8.3 Locks and latches; 
Section 1008.1.8.5, Unlatching; and Section 1 008.1.8.6 
Delayed egress locks. 

xxxm. In Section 1008.1.8.7, Stairway doors, Ex­
ception 2 "the International Building Code" shall be 
deleted and "the building subcode of the Uniform Con­
struction Code" shall be inserted. 

xxxiv. In Section 1008, Doors, Gates and Turnstiles, 
the following sections shall be deleted in their entirety: 
Section 1008.1.9, Panic and frre exit hardware; Section 

Supp. 2-2-09 70-48.2 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

1008.2, Gates; Section 1008.2.1, Stadiums; Section 
1008.3, Turnstiles; Section 1008.3.1, High turnstile; and 
Section 1008.3 .2, Additional door. 

xxxv. In Section 1009, Stairways, the following 
sections shall be deleted in their entirety: Section 1009.1, 
Stairway width; Section 1009.2, Headroom; Section 
1009.3, Stair treads and risers; Section 1009.3.1, Winder 
treads; Section 1009.3.3, Profile; Section 1009.4, Stair­
way landings; Section 1009.5, Stairway construction; 
Section 1009.5.2, Outdoor conditions; Section 1009.5.3, 
Enclosures under stairways; Section 1009.6, Vertical 
rise; Section 1009.7, Curved stairways; Section 1009.8, 
Spiral stairways; Section 1009.9, Alternating tread 
devices; Section 1009.9 .I, Handrails of alternating tread 
devices; Section 1009.9.2, Treads of alternating tread 
devices; Section 1009.10, Handrails; Section 1009.11, 
Stairway to roof; Section 1009.11.1, Roof access; and 
Section 1009.11.2, Protection at roof hatch openings. 

xxxvi. In Section 1010, Ramps, the following sec­
tions shall be deleted in their entirety: Section 1 0 1 0.1, 
Scope; Section 1010.2, Slope; Section 1010.3, Cross 
slope; Section 1010.4, Vertical rise; Section 1010.5, 
Minimum dimensions; Section 1010.5.1, Width; Section 
1010.5.2, Headroom; Section 1010.5.3, Restrictions; 
Section 1010.6, Landings; Section 1010.6.1, Slope; 
Section 1010.6.2, Width; Section 1010.6.3, Length; 
Section 1010.6.4, Change in direction; Section 1010.6.5, 
Doorways; Section 1010.7, Ramp construction; Section 
1010.7.1, Ramp surface; Section 1010.7.2, Outdoor 
conditions; Section 1010.8, Handrails; Section 1010.9, 
Edge protection; Section 1010.9.1, Curb, rail, wall or 
barrier; Section 1010.9.2, Extended floor or ground 
surface; and Section 1010.10, Guards. 

xxxvii. In Section 1 0 11.1, Where required, the text 
of the section shall be deleted and the following shall be 
inserted, "Exit signs. All means of egress shall be 
indicated with approved "Exit" signs where required by 
the construction code in effect at the time of frrst 
occupancy or N.J.A.C. 5:70-4 et seq., as applicable. All 
"Exit" signs shall be maintained visible, and all illumi­
nated exit signs shall be illuminated at all times the 
structure is occupied. Supplemental internally illumi­
nated directional signs, when necessary, shall be in­
stalled in accordance with the technical requirements of 
the Uniform Construction Code indicating the direction 
and way of egress." 

xxxviii. In Section 1011.2, Illumination, the text of 
the section shall be deleted and the following shall be 
inserted, "Information signs. A sign shall be provided at 
each floor landing in all interior stairways more than 
three stories above grade, designating the floor level 
above the floor of discharge. All elevator lobby call 
stations on all floor levels shall be identified by 
approved signs in accordance with the requirements for 
new buildings in the Uniform Construction Code. Ex­
ception: The emergency sign shall not be required for 

Next Page is 70-48.2.1 

u 

u 



/ 

UNIFORM FIRE CODE 

xxiv. 2404.16.1, General, "International Fuel Gas 
Code" shall be deleted and "fuel gas subcode of the Uni­
form Construction Code" shall be inserted. 

xxv. In Section 2404.16.2, Location of containers, 
in the first sentence, "or on the exterior perimeter of a 
canopy" shall be inserted after "outside." 

xxvi. Section 2404.16.2.1, "Containers 500 gallons 
or less, The following text shall be deleted "500 gallons 
or less. Portable LP gas containers with a capacity of 
500 gallons (1893 L) or less shall have a minimum sep­
aration between the container and structure not less than 
10 feet (3048 mm)." The following text shall be inserted 
after "Containers," "LP-gas containers shall be located a 
minimum of 5 feet from any heat producing appliance." 

xxvii. Section 2404.16.2.2 shall be deleted. 

xxviii. In Section 2404.21, Vegetation removal, "30 
feet (9144 mm)" shall be deleted and "20 feet" shall be 
inserted. 

xxix. In Section 2404.22, Waste material, in the first 
sentence, "30 foot (9144 mm)" shall be deleted and "20 
foot" shall be inserted. 

25. Chapter 25, Tire Rebuilding and Tire Storage, shall 
be amended as follows: 

i. Section 2501.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its 
entirety. 

ii. In Section 2503.1, Construction, "the Interna­
tional Building Code" shall be deleted and "the construc­
tion code in effect at the time of construction" shall be 
inserted. 

26. Chapter 26, Welding and Other Hot Work, shall be 
amended as follows: 

i. Section 2601.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its 
entirety. 

ii. In Section 2602, Defmitions, the definition of 
"hot work permits" shall be deleted in its entirety. In the 
defmition of "hot work program," in the first sentence, 
"permitted" shall be deleted before "program," "and 
issue permits for" shall be deleted before "hot work," 
and "or" shall be deleted after "personnel." In addition, 
in the definition of "responsible person," in the second 
sentence, "permits" shall be deleted and "approvals" 
shall be inserted and "permit" shall be deleted before 
"program." 

iii. In Section 2603.1, General, "and NFPA 51B" 
shall be inserted at the end of the sentence after "chap­
ter." 

iv. In the title of Section 2603.3, "permit" shall be 
deleted. In addition, the text of the definition shall be 
deleted and the following shall be inserted: "Hot work 
approvals issued by a responsible person under a hot 

5:70-3.2 

work program shall be available for review by the fire 
official at the time the work is conducted and for 48 
hours after the work is complete." 

v. In Section 2603.4, Qualifications of operators, in 
the first sentence, "A permit" shall be deleted. The sen­
tence shall begin with "Approval." 

vi. In Section 2604.3, Area reviews, at the end of the 
second sentence, "in accordance with Section 105.6" 
shall be deleted. 

vii. In Section 2606.4, Emergency disconnect, in the 
second sentence, "the ICC Electrical Code" shall be de­
leted and "the electrical subcode of the Uniform Con­
struction Code" shall be inserted. 

27. Chapter 27, Hazardous Materials-General Provi­
sions, shall be amended as follows: 

i. Section 2701.1.1, Waiver, shall be deleted in its 
entirety. 

ii. In Section 2701.2.2.2, Health hazards, new Item 
3 shall be inserted as follows: "3. Radioactive mate­
rials." 

iii. In Section 2701.5, Permits, "Sections 105.6 and 
105.7" shall be deleted and "Subchapter 2 of the 
Uniform Fire Code" shall be inserted. 

iv. In Section 2701.5.1, Hazardous Materials Man­
agement Plan, in the first sentence, "or life hazard use 
registration" shall be inserted after "permit." 

v. In Section 2701.5.2, Hazardous Materials Inven­
tory Statement (HMIS), in the first sentence, "or life 
hazard use registration" shall be inserted after "permit." 

vi. In Section 2701.6.2, Permanently out-of-service 
facilities, in the first sentence, "required" shall be in­
serted before "permit" and "or life hazard use registra­
tion" shall be inserted after "permit." In addition, in the 
second sentence, "and life hazard use facilities" shall be 
inserted after "permittees." 

vii. In Section 2702, Defmitions, a definition for 
"radioactive material" shall be inserted as follows: "Ra­
dioactive Material. Any material or combination of ma­
terials that spontaneously emit ionizing radiation." 

viii. In Table 2703.1.1(1), Maximum allowable quan­
tity per control area of hazardous materials posing a 
physical hazard, in footnotes p.3 and p.4, "International 
Fuel Gas Code" and "International Mechanical Code" 
shall be deleted and "fuel gas subcode of the Uniform 
Construction Code" and "mechanical subcode of the 
Uniform Construction Code," respectively, shall be in­
serted. 

ix. In Table 2703.1.1(2), Maximum Allowable 
Quantity per Control Area of Hazardous Materials 
Posing a Health Hazarda,b,cj, and Table 2703.1.1(4), 

70-48.2.11 Supp. 2-2-09 



5:70-3.2 

Maximum Allowable Quantity per Control Area of 
Hazardous Materials Posing a Health Hazard in an 
Outdoor Control Areaa,b,c, the following text shall be 
inserted as the fourth row of table 2703.1.1(2) under 
"Material" "Storaged" "Use-Closed Systemsd" and 
Use-Ope~ Systemsd" Add footnote "k. Maximum 'dosage 
allowed in any single whole-body short term (1 hour or 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

less) exposure." the following text shall be inserted as 
the fourth row of table 2703.1.1(4) under "Material," 
"Storage," "Use-Closed Systems," and Use-Open Sys­
tems" Add footnote "h. Maximum dosage allowed in 
any single whole-body short term (1 hour or less) ex­
posure." 

MATERIAL STORAGE SYSTEMd 

TABLE 2703.1.1(2) 

USE-CLOSED SYSTEMd USE-OPEN SYSTEMd 
"Radioactive 25 REM unsealed source 

100 REM sealed source 
100 REM sealed source 25 REM sealed source 

k. Maximum dosage allowed in any single whole body short term (I hour or less) exposure." 

MATERIAL STORAGE SYSTEM 

TABLE 2703.1.1(4) 

USE-CLOSED SYSTEM USE-OPEN SYSTEM 
"Radioactive 25 REM unsealed source 

100 REM sealed source 
1 00 REM sealed source 25 REM sealed source 

h. Maximum dosage allowed in any single whole body short term (I hour or less) exposure." 

x. In Section 2703.2.8, Seismic protection, "the 
International Building Code" shall be deleted and "the 
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code" 
shall be inserted. 

xi. In Section 2703.7.3, Industrial Trucks, "ICC 
Electrical Code" shall be deleted and "electrical subcode 
of the Uniform Construction Code" shall be inserted. 

xii. In Section 2703.8.1, Buildings, in the first 
sentence, "maintained as" shall be inserted before "con­
structed." In addition, "International Building Code" 
shall be deleted and "building subcode of the Uniform 
Construction Code" shall be inserted. 

xiii. In Section 2703.8.3.1, Construction require­
ments, "maintained as" shall be inserted before "sepa­
rated." In the same section, "Section 706 of the Inter­
national Building Code" shall be deleted and "the 
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code" 
shall be inserted. In addition, "Section 711 of the In­
ternational Building Code" shall be deleted and "the 
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code" 
shall be inserted. 

xiv. In Section 2703.8.3.2, Percentage of maximum 
allowable quantities, "Table 2703.8.3.2" shall be deleted 
and "the Uniform Construction Code" shall be inserted. 

xv. In Section 2703.8.3.3, Number, "Table 
2703.8.3.2" shall be deleted and "the Uniform Con­
struction Code" shall be inserted. 

xvi. In Section 2703.8.3.4, Fire-resistance rating 
requirements, in the first sentence, "Table 2703.8.3.2" 
shall be deleted and "the Uniform Construction Code" 
shall be inserted. In addition, the second sentence and 
the exception shall be deleted in their entirety. 

Supp. 2-2-09 70-48.2.12 

xvii. In Section 2703.8.4.1, Construction, in the 
second sentence, "the International Building Code based 
on the occupancy group into which it has been clas­
sified" shall be deleted and "building subcode of the 
Uniform Construction Code" shall be inserted. 

xviii. In Section 2703.8.4.2, Ventilation system, in ·\ 
the second sentence, "the International Mechanical W 
Code" shall be deleted and "the mechanical subcode of 
the Uniform Construction Code" shall be inserted. 

xvix. In Section 2703.8.5.2, Ventilation, in the third 
sentence, "the International Mechanical Code" shall be 
deleted and "the mechanical subcode of the Uniform 
Construction Code" shall be inserted. 

xx. In Section 2703.8.6.2, Ventilation, in the third 
sentence, "the International Mechanical Code" shall be 
deleted and "the mechanical subcode of the Uniform 
Construction Code" shall be inserted. 

xxi. In Section 2703.8.7.1, Construction, "ICC 
Electrical Code" shall be deleted and "electrical subcode 
of the Uniform Construction Code" shall be inserted. 

xxii. In Section 2703.9.4, Electrical wiring and 
equipment, "the ICC Electrical Code" shall be deleted 
and "the electrical subcode of the Uniform Construction 
Code" shall be inserted. 

xxiii. In Section 2703.9.5, Static accumulation, after 
"charge," "in accordance with NFPA 77" shall be in­
serted at the end of the sentence. 

xxiv. In Section 2703.9.9, Shelf storage, in the frrst 
sentence, "the International Building Code" shall be de- , '! 
leted and "the building subcode of the Uniform Con- ~ 
struction Code" shall be inserted. 


