
0 

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

requirements of USEPA 40 CFR 61 subpart M have been or 
shall be met. A permit to demolish or remove the structure 
shall not be issued until the owner or agent notifies the 
enforcing agency that all friable asbestos or asbestos-con­
taining material that will become friable during demolition or 
removal has been or will be properly abated prior to demol­
ition. 

Amended by R.1993 d.198, effective June 7, 1993. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 1422(a), 25 N.J.R. 2519(b). 
Amended by R.1993 d.420, effective September 7, 1993. 
See: 25 N.J.R. 2158(a), 25 N.J.R. 4072(a). 
Amended by R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997. 
See: 29 N.J.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a). 
Amended by R.1998 d.36, effective January 5, 1998. 
See: 29 N.J.R. 4214(a), 30 N.J.R. 193(a). 

Added (b); and recodified existing (b) through (d) as (c) through (e). 

5:23-2.17 A Minor work 

(a) The issuance of a permit shall not be required before 
minor work may proceed. The owner, or an architect or 
contractor acting on behalf of the owner, shall, however, 
provide notice of the work to the enforcing agency before 
work begins. 

(b) Notice ofwork; application: 

1. Notice of minor work shall be a personal or tele­
phoned oral notice before work commences. This oral 
notice shall be provided to the enforcing agency between 
9:00A.M. and 5:00P.M., Monday through Friday, except 
holidays. In those cases where the local enforcing agency 
is not open and available to receive notice at those times 
then notice shall be provided to the municipal clerk; 

2. In addition to oral notice, the owner or his agent 
shall be required to file an application. The completed 
application with the fee shall be delivered in person or by 
mail to the enforcing agency, within five business days 
from the date of the oral notice. 

(c) Minor work: 

1. Minor work shall mean and include: 

i. The construction or total replacement of any 
porch or stoop which does not provide structural support 
for any roof or portion of a building; 

ii. Renovation or alteration work in an existing one 
or two-family dwelling, provided that no primary struc­
tural members are altered in any way, and further pro­
vided that the work does not constitute reconstruction; 
and 

111. The removal and replacement of more than 25 
percent of the exterior siding of a one or two-family 
dwelling; 

2. Minor work shall also mean and include the replace­
ment of any existing plumbing piping work with new and 
approved material of like capacity; the installation of 
drinking fountains and condensate drains in existing struc-

New Jersey State Ubrary 
23-17 

5:23-2.17A 

tures; the replacement of existing low pressure hot water 
heaters with new ones of like capacity; and the new 
installation of lavatories, water closets, tubs, showers, 
washers or dishwashers, and garbage disposers in existing 
space of one and two-family dwellings where the new 
installation of additional fixtures can be accommodated 
with no increase in the size of the water distribution sys­
tem, water service or house drain; 

3. Minor work shall also mean and include new elec­
trical work incidental to the installation of air conditioning, 
equipment, clothes dryers, and ranges or ovens in one and 
two-family dwellings; the installation of five or less 110 or 
220 volt receptacles or fixtures where existing circuits 
and/or available space circuits and service are adequate to 
support the load; the replacement of existing wiring with 
new wiring of the same capacity provided that the new 
wiring shall be of a type approved for the use by the code; 

4. Minor work shall also mean and include the fol­
lowing: 

i. The installation of any fire detection or suppres-
sion device in any one-or two-family dwelling; 

ii. The installation of a radon mitigation system in 
an existing one-or two-family dwelling; 

iii. The installation of a burglar alarm or security 
system in any structure; 

iv. The installation of communications wiring in any 
Class 1 or Class 2 structure or any Class 3 structure 
involving the penetration of a fire-resistance rated 
assembly. 

(1) For the purposes of applying this provision, 
communications wiring shall mean any wiring cov­
ered by Chapter 8 of the electrical subcode. Commun­
ications wiring shall also include data circuits between 
computers/information technology equipment, which 
may be classified as "communications circuits," in ac­
cordance with Article 725 of the electrical subcode; 

5. Minor work shall not include lead abatement. 

6. Minor work on elevator devices shall also mean and 
include work as outlined below and not involving any 
structural modification to a building and as scoped within 
the applicable sections of Part XII of ASME A17 .1 refer­
enced in the building subcode: 

i. Alteration to hoistway enclosures (ASME A17.1 
Part XII, Rule 120l.la, 1203.1a); 

ii. Alteration to construction at top of hoistways 
(120l.lc) and at bottom ofhoistways (120l.ld); 

iii. Alteration to hoistways which affects control of 
smoke and hot gases (120l.le); 

iv. Construction and alteration of machine room and 
machinery spaces (1201.2, 1203.1b); 

Supp. 1-17-06 



5:23-2.17A 

v. Installation and alteration of electrical equip­
ment, wiring, pipes and ducts in hoistway and machine 
rooms (1201.3, 1203.1c); 

vi. Alteration to pits (1201.6, 1203.1f); 

vii. Alteration to bottom and top car counterweight 
clearances and runbys (1201.7, 1203.1g, 2508); 

viii. Alteration to horizontal car and counterweight 
clearances (1201.8, 1203.1h); 

ix. Additions, alterations or replacements of hoist­
way entrances (1201.10, 1203.1j); 

x. Installation or alteration ofhoistway door locking 
devices, access switches, parking devices and unlocking 
devices (1201.11, 1203.1k); 

xi. Alteration or addition of power operation of 
hoistway doors (1201.12, 1203.1m); 

xii. Alteration of spring buffers and bumpers 
(1202.2, 1203.2b); 

xiii. Alteration of counterweights (1202.3; 1203.1d 
and 1203.2c); 

xiv. Alteration of car frames and platforms (1202.4a, 
1203.2d); 

xv. Alteration of car enclosures, car doors, gates, and 
illumination of cars (1202.5 except installation of new 
cars, 1203.2e); 

xvi. Use of freight elevators to carry passengers, hy-
draulic elevators only (1203.2j); 

xvii. Relocation of power unit (1203.3f); 

xviii. Replacement oftanks (1203.6); 

xix. Addition or alteration of top-of-car operating 
devices (1202.12a, 1203.8a); 

xx. Addition or alteration or car-leveling or truck­
zoning devices (1202.12b, 1203.8b); 

xxi. Alteration of anti-creep leveling devices 
(1203.8c); 

xxii. Change of power supply, hydraulic elevators 
only (1203.8d); 

xxiii. Addition of rope equalizers (1202.14c, 
1203.9c); 

xxiv. Addition of auxiliary rope-fastening devices 
(1202.14d); 

xxv. Alteration of manual operating devices which 
are provided to manually operate elevators in case of 
power failure; 

xxvi. Alteration of handrails on escalators and 
moving walks (1207.6, 1208.6); 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

xxvii. Alteration or addition of lighting and access to 
interiors and related electrical work (1207.14, 1208.14); 
and 

xxviii. Alteration of entrances or egresses on escala­
tors (1207.15). 

(d) Inspection of minor work: 

1. Inspections shall be required for minor work and the 
enforcing agency shall inspect any such work within 30 
days of the request for inspection; 

2. The construction official shall issue a certificate of 
approval stating that the work performed under a Minor 
Work Permit substantially complies with the UCC. The 
inspection shall be based upon what is visible at the time of 
said inspection and the certificate of approval shall so 
indicate. 

Amended by Rl991 d.509, effective October 7, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R 2236(a), 23 N.J.R 3001(a). 

Stylistic changes. 
Amended by R.l993 d.580, effective November 15, 1993. 
See: 25 N.J.R 3692(a), 25 N.J.R. 5145(c). 
Amended by R.1993 d.663, effective December 20, 1993. 
See: 25 N.J.R. 4546(a), 25 N.J.R 5927(a). 
Amended byR1995 d.381, effective July 17,1995. 
See: 27 N.J.R 970(a), 27 N.J.R 2715(a). 
Amended by R1995 d.476, effective September 5, 1995 (operative 

January 1, 1996). 
See: 27 N.J.R. 1846(a), 27 N.J.R 3325(b). 

Rewrote (d). 
Amended by R1995 d.564, effective November 6, 1995 (operative 

March 1, 1996). 
See: 27 N.J.R. 2829(a), 27 N.J.R 4281(b). 

N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.17A(c)6xxv through xxvii, as added by R.1995 
d.564, operative May 1, 1996. 
Amended by R1998 d.28, effective January 5, 1998. 
See: 29 N.J.R 3603(a), 30 N.J.R 129(a). 

Amended (c)li through (c)liii. 
Amended by R2000 d.166, effective April 17, 2000. 
See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R 1376(a). 

In (c)6, inserted a reference to 2508 in vii, inserted a new xxv, and 
recodified former xxv through xxvii as xxvi through xxviii. 
Amended by R.2003 d.473, effective December 15, 2003. 
See: 35 N.J.R. 2421(a), 35 N.J.R 5543(a). 

In (c)6, substituted "modification" for "alteration". 
Amended by R2004 d.467, effective December 20, 2004. 
See: 36 N.J.R. 2122(a), 36 N.J.R 5709(b). 

In (c), rewrote 4. 

5:23-2.18 Inspections 

(a) Preliminary inspection: Before issuing a permit, the 
construction official and appropriate subcode official shall, 
where necessary, examine or cause to be examined all build­
ings, structures and sites for which an application has been 
filed for a construction permit. 

(b) Inspections during the progress of work: The construc­
tion official and appropriate subcode officials shall carry out 
periodic inspections during the progress of work to ensure 
that work inspected conforms to the requirements of the code. 

Supp. 1-17-06 23-18 Ne.xt Page is 23-18.1 

0 



0 

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

1. Inspections of one-and two-family dwellings for 
which construction must cease until the inspection is made 
shall be limited to the following: 

i. The bottom of footing trenches before placement 
of footings, except that in the case of pile foundations, 
inspections shall be made in accordance with the re­
quirements of the building sub code; 

ii. Foundations and all walls up to grade level prior 
to covering or back filling; 

(1) For new construction, a foundation location 
survey showing all building comers of the foundation 
shall be submitted to the construction official as soon 
as possible after the installation of the foundation 
wall. A land surveyor licensed in the State of New 
Jersey shall prepare the survey. The proposed founda­
tion location as shown on the original plot plan shall 
also be shown on the foundation location survey. 

(A) Exception: A foundation location survey 
shall not be required for additions, decks, swim­
ming pools, sheds as described in N.J.A.C. 5:23-9.9 
or similar structures. 

(2) For new construction and additions, the 
foundation location survey for a building that is lo­
cated in a flood plain shall include flood hazard certif­
icates as required by section 1612.5 of the building 
subcode or section R301.2.4 of the one-and two­
family dwelling subcode. 

iii. Utility services, including septic; 

iv. Mid-point inspections shall include the fol­
lowing: 

(1) Building Subcode: All structural framing, 
connections, wall and roof sheathing, and insulation. 

(A) The framing inspection shall take place 
after the rough electrical and plumbing inspections 
and after the installation of the heating, ventilation 
and/or air conditioning duct system. 

(B) For buildings containing roof or other truss 
systems, a truss system and permanent truss bracing 
inspection shall be performed prior to the instal­
lation of any interior roof truss covering material. 
Where the truss design utilizes the interior fmish as 
bracing for the bottom cord, that portion of the 
bracing shall be part of the fmal inspection and 
shall be in addition to the components of the final 
inspection in (d) below. 

(C) The insulation inspection shall be per­
formed after all other subcode rough inspections 
and prior to the installation of any interior fmish 
material. 

(D) The inspector shall use a Department ap­
proved checklist. 

5:23-2.18 

(2) Electrical Subcode: Rough wiring, panel and 
service installation. 

(3) Plumbing Subcode: Rough piping. 

2. Inspections for all subcodes of construction, other 
than one-and two-family dwellings, shall be limited to 
those required for one-and two-family dwellings and the 
following: fire suppression systems; heat producing de­
vices; any special inspections required by any subcode of 
the regulations; 

(i) The mid-point inspection shall include a review 
for compliance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-7, the Barrier Free 
Subcode, for buildings required by N.J.A.C. 5:23-7.1 to 
be accessible. 

3. Any additional inspections, as permitted by this 
chapter and as may be required by the municipality, shall 
be of the type and nature that construction may continue 
without interruption; 

4. Additional inspection schedule: Where buildings 
proposed for construction exceed two stories in height or 
by their nature pose complex or unusual inspection prob­
lems, the construction official or appropriate subcode of­
ficial may specify additional inspections to the applicant in 
writing prior to the issuance of a permit and during con­
struction in the case of unforeseeable circumstances. 

(c) Notice for inspection: 

1. The owner or other responsible person in charge of 
work shall notify the enforcing agency when the work is 
ready for any required inspection specified herein or 
required by the construction official or appropriate subcode 
official. This notice shall be given at least 24 hours prior 
to the time the inspection is desired. Inspections shall be 
performed within three business days of the time for which 
it was requested. The work shall not proceed in a manner 
which will preclude the inspection until it has been made. 

(d) Final inspection: Upon completion of the building or 
structure, and before the issuance of a certificate of use and 
occupancy required herein, a fmal inspection shall be made, 
and any violations of the code shall be noted and the holder of 
the permit shall be notified of any discrepancies by the 
construction official. The final inspection shall include: 

1. Building and Fire Subcode: Installation of all inter­
ior and exterior finish materials, sealing of exterior joints, 
mechanical system and any other required equipment. 

2. Electrical Subcode: Wiring, devices and fixtures. 

3. Plumbing Subcode: Piping, trim and fixtures. 

4. Tests required by any provision of the adopted sub­
codes. 

5. A review for compliance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-7, the 
Barrier Free Subcode, for all buildings required by 
N.J.A.C. 5:23-7.1 to be accessible. 

23-18.1 Supp. 1-17-06 



5:23-2.18 

6. Verification of compliance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.5, 
Posting structures. 

(e) Inspections records: The enforcing agency shall make 
a written record of all inspections, including any discrep­
ancies or violations noted and shall maintain those reports as 
a public record which shall be available for public inspection 
during normal business hours. 

(f) Department inspections: At the request of an enforcing 
agency, the Department may assist the enforcing agency in 
the inspection of any construction, provided that the enfor­
cing agency has submitted the plans and specifications for 
such construction to the Department. 

(g) The construction official shall serve as an agent of the 
Bureau of Housing Inspection of the Department of Com­
munity Affairs for the purpose of inspecting newly con­
structed and altered hotels and multiple dwellings in order to 
enforce the provisions of the regulations for the maintenance 
of hotels and multiple dwellings (N.J.A.C. 5: 10). Responsi­
bility for inspection may be delegated to the appropriate sub­
code official(s). 

(h) Periodic inspections: The building subcode official or 
fire protection subcode official may periodically inspect all 
existing buildings and structures, except one and two family 
dwellings, for compliance with the rules with respect to post­
ing. Such inspection shall specify any violation of the rules 
with respect to the posting of floor load, occupancy load and 
use group of the building. 

Amended by R.1981 d.182, effective June 4, 1981. 
See: 13 N.J.R. 187(b), 13 N.J.R. 333(b). 
Amended by R.l992 d.244, effective June 15, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 1147(a), 24 N.J.R. 2243(a). 

Class I inspections added to (b )liv. 
Amended by R.l996 d.323, effective July 15, 1996 (operative January 1, 

1997). 
See: 28 N.J.R. 2112(a), 28 N.J.R. 3549(a). 
Amended by R.1997 d.304, effective July 21, 1997. 
See: 29 N.J.R. 2204(a), 29 N.J.R. 3248(a). 

Added (b)1ii(1) and (d)l. 
Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April 17, 2000. 
See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a). 

In (d), added 2; and added (h). 
Amended by R.2003 d.187, effective May 5, 2003. 
See: 34 N.J.R. 4248(a), 35 N.J.R. 1939(c). 

In (b ),rewrote liv. 
Amended by R.2003 d.216, effective May 19, 2003. 
See: 35 N.J.R. 16(a), 35 N.J.R. 2203(a). 

Rewrote the section. 
Administrative correction. 
See: 35 N.J.R. 3298(a). 

5:23-2.18A Utility load management device installation 
programs 

(a) Whenever a public utility proposes to undertake a 
program of installing load management devices at the prop­
erties of a substantial number of service customers within a 
limited period of time, it may apply to the Department for 
permission to utilize the procedure set forth in this section. 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

(b) A utility with a program to install load management 
devices shall submit detailed information to the Department 
on the design of the device. 

(c) The utility shall provide an educational program 
acceptable to the Department to acquaint any interested 
Department personnel and municipal subcode officials with 
the device and with installation and operating procedures. 

(d) The utility shall insure that all devices to be installed 
are identical in design, listed and labeled or otherwise 
approved according to this chapter for their intended use. 

(e) At least one month in advance of any installations, the 
utility shall submit to the Department, and to each affected 
municipality, notice of the anticipated number of installations 
to be performed in each municipality. A maximum and a 
minimum figure may be submitted where there is uncertainty 
about the number to be scheduled by customers. An approx­
imate number of weeks for installations in that municipality 
shall be given along with an approximate number of instal­
lations per week. 

1. Each week, in advance of installation, the utility 
shall notify the municipality of any change in the antici­
pated number of installations for that week. No weekly 
number of installations shall be so great that the cumulative 
number of installations in the municipality shall exceed the 
maximum anticipated number submitted. 

2. Prior to the commencement of any installation, and 
as soon as may be practicable, the utility or its contractors 
will provide to each municipality notice of the actual sites 
of installations. 

3. The Department and the municipalities shall be 
notified as soon as possible in the event of any change in 
existing schedules by the utility or its contractors. 

(f) On the Monday following installations, the utility shall 
submit to each municipality a completed permit applic~tion 
for all installations completed in the municipality's juris­
diction during the preceding week. 

1. A listing of all permits so delivered shall be filed by 
the utility with the Department. 

2. All devices installed during that week, by a single 
contractor, shall be included on that application. The ap­
plication shall include the Construction Permit Application 
and an Electrical Subcode Technical Section. 

3. Since the permit is not, typically, for work at a single 
location, the block number shall be entered as "UCC 2.18" 
and the lot as "A." The work site location shall be the name 
of the municipality and the owner in fee shall be the utility. 

4. In addition to the Construction Permit Application, 
the utility or contractor shall supply the municipality a 
complete listing of locations where the devices, listed on 
this permit, were installed. This list shall include owner's 

Supp. 1-17-06 23-18.2 

0 

\~ 

0 



0 

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

name, owner's address, block and lot, date of installation, 
type of device(s) installed, and the contractor's name. 

(g) If, for any reason, a permit application, or any part, is 
found to have been submitted in error, the utility or its con­
tractors shall notify the municipality as soon as possible. 

(h) When all required municipal and utility inspections 
have been approved, a single certificate of approval, for that 
permit, shall be issued to the utility. 

(i) If any municipality or the Department has reason to 
suspect that permit applications are being mishandled or care­
lessly accounted for, an investigation may be conducted of 
the utility's permit files for this project and of any permits in 
the possession of individual contractors in the utility's 
employ for this project. 

G) The utility shall pay to each municipality 30 percent of 
the permit fees otherwise due and owing. 

(k) The municipality shall inspect 30 percent of the 
installations performed and shall record the results of those 
inspections. The utility shall inspect at least 10 percent ofthe 
installations performed and shall record the results of those 
inspections and forward those results concurrently to the 
municipality and to the Department weekly. 

5:23-2.18A 

(l) If a municipality or a utility discovers a defect rate of 
not less than seven percent for any contractor employed by 
the utility, the Department shall be immediately notified. The 
Department shall investigate and, in the interest of public 
safety, shall be authorized to order that: 

1. The offending contractor cease to be employed by 
the utility for this project; 

2. The utility remit the fees necessary to inspect all 
existing installations of the offending contractor in all 
municipalities where that contractor has performed work; 

3. That each municipality affected perform inspections 
of all the offending contractor's existing installations; and 

4. That the utility or its designees correct or remove all 
defective installations to the satisfaction of the municipal 
officials. 

(m) If, at any time, the Department tabulates a program­
wide defect rate equal to or exceeding three percent, the 
utility shall be notified and the inspection rate and fee rate in 
G) and (k) above shall rise to 50 percent. 

Next Page is 23-19 23-18.3 Supp. 1-17-06 



/ 

l_j 

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

5. The following amendments are made to Chapter 7 
of the energy subcode titled "Building Design for all 
Buildings Other than Residential Buildings": 

i. Section 702.1 is amended to read "building de­
signs shall meet the requirements of Sections 5.2, 6.2, 
7.2, 9.2 and 10.2 in Standard RS-22 listed in Chapter 
8." 

ii. Section 702.2 is amended to read: 

"In addition, building designs shall meet the pres­
criptive criteria of Sections 5.3, 6.3, 7.3 and 9.3." 

The exception is amended to read: 

"1. The system performance requirements of 
Standard RS-22 may be used in the following cases: 

1.1 A building design meeting Section 6.1.3 in­
stead of the Section 6.2 and 6.3 prescriptive require­
ments in Standard RS-22. 

1.2 A building meeting Section 5.4 instead of the 
5.3 prescriptive requirements in Standard RS-22. 

2. A building design meeting the Section 11 
building energy cost budget method in Standard 
RS-22." 

6. Chapter 8 titled "Referenced Standards" is amend­
ed as follows: 

i. RS-22 is amended to read "ASHRAEIIES 
90.1-1999 Energy Efficient Design of New Buildings 
Except Low Rise Residential Buildings ©2000." 

Amended by R.1987 d.387, effective October 5, 1987. 
See: 19 N.J.R. 433(b), 19 N.J.R. 1793(a). 

Substantially amended. 
Amended by R.1988 d.50, effective February 1, 1988. 
See: 19 N.J.R. 1862(b), 20 N.J.R. 268(a). 

Added (b)6; renumbered (b)6.-7. as (b)7.-8. 
Amended by R.1988 d.417, effective September 6, 1988. 
See: 20 N.J.R. 699(b), 20 N.J.R. 2274(a). 

Substantially amended. 
Amended by R.1990 d.507, effective October 15, 1990. 
See: 22 N.J.R. 2208(a), 22 N.J.R. 3214(a). 

Text conformed to BOCA National Code/1990. 
Amended by R.1991 d.326, effective July 1, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R. 804(a), 23 N.J.R. 2044(a). 

Section E--502.1 deleted. 
Amended by R.1991 d.429, effective August 19, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R. 1487(a), 23 N.J.R. 2501(a). 

In (b)5, deleted old and added new i. 
Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993. 
See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a). 
Amended by R.1995 d.143, effective March 20, 1995 (operative July 1, 

1995). 
See: 26 N.J.R. 4872(a), 27 N.J.R. 1179(b). 
Amended by R.1998 d.332, effective July 6, 1998. 
See: 30 N.J.R. 1377(a), 30 N.J.R. 2421(b). 

Rewrote the section. 
Amended by R.2001 d.244, effective July 16, 2001 (operative January 

16, 2002). 
See: 33 N.J.R. 1241(a), 33 N.J.R. 2471(a). 

Rewrote the section. 
Administrative change. 
See: 33 N.J.R. 3310(a). 
Administrative correction. 

5:23-3.19 

See: 35 N.J.R. 2494(b). 

Case Notes 

Registered architect retained to sign and seal drawings to comply 
with permit regulations entitled to approve as prepared or return for 
compliance modifications (citing Small Dwelling Energy Subcode). 
Deck House, Inc. v. New Jersey State Board of Architects, 531 F.Supp. 
633 (D.N.J.l982). 

Departments of Community Affairs and Energy could not amend 
state energy subcode. New Jersey Builders Ass'n v. Coleman, 227 
N.J.Super. 23, 545 A.2d 783 (A.D.1988). 

5:23-3.19 Manufactured home subcode 

(a) Pursuant to authority of P .L. 1975, c.217, as amended, 
the Commissioner hereby adopts the Federal Manufactured 
Home Construction and Safety Standards, as set forth in 
Part 3280 of Title 24 of the Code of Federal Regulations, 
including all subsequent revisions and amendments thereto, 
as the manufactured home subcode for New Jersey. 

1. Copies of the volume of the Code of Federal 
Regulations containing Part 3280 of Title 24 may be 
obtained from the Superintendent of Documents, U.S. 
Government Printing Office, Washington, D.C. 20420. 

2. Part 3280 of Title 24 of the Code of Federal 
Regulations, including all subsequent revisions and 
amendments thereto, may be known and cited as the 
manufactured home subcode. 

(b) The following sections of Subpart A of Part 3280 are 
deemed to be administrative in nature and are therefore 
excluded from the manufactured home subcode: 

1. Section 3280.1, entitled "Scope"; 

2. Section 3280.5, entitled "Data plate"; 

3. Section 3280.6, entitled "Serial number"; 

4. Section 3280.7, entitled "Modular homes"; and 

5. Section 3280.8, entitled "Certification label". 

(c) Any manufactured home construction or safety issue 
not covered under the manufactured home subcode which 
is, however, covered under another subcode adopted pursu­
ant to this subchapter shall be determined in accordance 
with such other subcode. 

(d) The adoption of a manufactured home subcode shall 
not be construed as in any way limiting the power or duty of 
the Department of Community Affairs to enforce and com­
ply with all applicable provisions of the Federal Manufac­
tured Housing Construction and Safety Standards Act of 
1974 and the regulations promulgated pursuant thereto, 
including all subsequent revisions and amendments thereto, 
when authorized to do so by the Secretary of the United 
States Department of Housing and Urban Development. 

Amended by R.1982 d.7, eff. February 1, 1982. 
See: 13 N.J.R. 171(a), 14 N.J.R. 142(a). 

This section was recodified from 5:23-3.9. 

23-49 Supp. 3-21-05 



5:23-3.20 

5:23-3.20 Mechanical subcode 

(a) Rules concerning the subcode adopted are as follows: 

1. Pursuant to authority of P.L. 1975, c.217, the Com­
missioner hereby adopts the model code of the Interna­
tional Code Council, Inc., known as the International 
Mechanical Code/2003. This code is hereby adopted by 
reference as the Mechanical Subcode for the State of New 
Jersey subject to the modifications in (b) below. 

i. Copies of this code may be obtained from the 
International Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor 
Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois 60478-5795. 

ii. The International Mechanical Code/2003 may be 
known and cited as the "mechanical subcode." 

2. Any references to the International Plumbing 
Code, ICC Electrical Code, the International Energy 
Conservation Code or the International Existing Building 
Code listed in Chapter 15 shall be considered a reference 
to the appropriate adopted plumbing, electrical, or energy 
subcode in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3 or rehabilitation subcode in 
N.J.A.C. 5:23-6. 

3. Anywhere the term "code" appears, shall be a 
reference to "subcode" as defined in N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4 for 
any of the adopted national model codes as appropriate. 

(b) The following chapters, sections or pages of the Inter­
national Mechanical Code/2003 are amended as follows: 

1. Chapter 1 of the mechanical subcode, entitled "Ad­
ministration," is deleted in its entirety. 

2. Chapter 2 of the mechanical subcode, entitled 
"Definitions," is amended as follows: 

i. In Section 201.3 delete "ICC Electrical Code and 
International Plumbing Code," and insert "electrical 
subcode and plumbing subcode." 

ii. The definition of the term "alteration" is deleted 
and substitute the definition found in N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4. 

iii. The definition of the term "approved" is delet­
ed. 

iv. The definition of the term "building" is deleted 
and substitute the definition found in N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4. 

v. The definition of the term "code" is deleted. 

vi. The definition of the term "code official" is 
deleted, and the following language is substituted: "For 
the purpose of the mechanical subcode, the term "code 
official" shall mean the appropriate subcode official as 
designated in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.4." 

3. Chapter 3 of the mechanical subcode, entitled 
"General Regulations," is amended as follows: 

i. Section 301.1 is amended to delete the words "in 
accordance with Section 101.2." 

Supp. 3-21-05 23-50 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

ii. Section 301.4 is amended to delete the words "in 
accordance with Section 105." 

iii. Section 301.11 is deleted. 

iv. In Section 305.5 delete 1.5 on line 4 and insert 
1.0. 

v. Section 307.1 is amended to delete "approved 
plumbing fixture" on line 3 and insert the following: 
"drywell, sump pump, floor drain, or drainage system 
below floor." 

vi. Section 307.2.1 is amended to add the following 
after the word "disposal" on line 3: "in accordance with 
the adopted plumbing subc~de." 

vii. Section 307.2.2 is deleted. 

viii. Section 309 is deleted. 

ix. Section 312 is deleted. 

4. Chapter 4 of the mechanical subcode, entitled 
"Ventilation," is amended as follows: 

i. Section 403.2 is amended to add the following 
language: "Exception: Where the registered design pro­
fessional demonstrates that an engineered ventilation 
system design will prevent the maximum concentration 
of contaminants from exceeding that obtainable by the 
rate of outdoor air ventilation determined in accor­
dance with Section 403.3, the minimum required rate of 
outside air shall be reduced in accordance with such 
engineered system design." 

5. Chapter 5 of the mechanical subcode, entitled "Ex­
haust Systems," is amended as follows: 

i. Section 503.1 is amended to replace the second 
sentence with the following: "The type and wiring 
methods for motors in areas that contain flammable 
vapors or dusts shall be in accordance with the electri­
cal subcode." 

ii. Section 512.1 is amended to add a sentence as 
follows: "This section shall not apply to radon construc­
tion techniques covered by subchapter 10 of the Uni­
form Construction Code." 

iii. 513.11 is amended to replace the third sentence 
with the following: "Secondary power shall be from a 
legally required standby power source complying with 
the electrical subcode." Also, delete the following sen­
tences: "Power distribution from the two sources shall 
be by independent routes. Transfer to full standby 
power shall be automatic and within 60 seconds of 
failure of the primary power." 

iv. 513.12.1 is amended to delete the wording in its 
entirety and substitute the following: "Wiring. All wir­
ing shall be in accordance with the electrical subcode." 

.· ~ 
( ' 
~ 

6. Chapter 6 of the mechanical subcode, entitled .__ "'\ 
"Duct Systems," is amended as follows: 0 



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

i. Section 602.2.1 is amended to modify Exception 
3 to read: "This section shall not apply to materials 
exposed within plenums in one-and two-family 
dwellings. Wire exposed in plenums of one-and two­
family dwellings shall conform to the requirements of 
the electrical subcode." 

ii. Section 602.2.1.1 is deleted in its entirety and 
substitute the following language: "Wiring, cable and 
raceways installed in a plenum shall be listed and 
installed in accordance with the electrical subcode." 

iii. Section 602.2.1.4 is deleted in its entirety and 
substitute the following language: "Combustible 
electrical equipment exposed within a plenum shall be 
listed and labeled and shall be installed in accordance 
with the requirements of the electrical subcode." 

7. Chapter 9 of the mechanical subcode, entitled 
"Specific Appliances, Fireplaces and Solid Fuel Burning 
Equipment," is amended as follows: 

1. Section 917.2 is deleted in its entirety. 

ii. Section 917.3 is deleted in its entirety. 

8. Chapter 10 of the mechanical subcode, entitled 
"Boilers, Water Heaters and Pressure Vessels," is amended 
as follows: 

i. Section 1001.1 is amended to replace the words 
"installation, alteration, and repair of boilers," with the 
words "installation and alteration of boilers." 

ii. Section 1003.1 is amended to add the following 
phase: "Pressure vessels shall be designed and 
constructed in accordance with the requirements of 
ASME "Rules for Construction of Pressure Vessels, 
Section VIII/1998"." 

9. Chapter 11 of the mechanical subcode, entitled 
"Refrigeration," is amended as follows: 

i. Section 1102.2.2 is deleted. 

ii. Section 1109 is deleted. 

10. Chapter 13 ofthe mechanical subcode, entitled "Fuel 
Oil Piping And Storage," is amended as follows: 

i. Section 1301.2 is amended to add the following 
sentence: "Where the tank is of a size and type that is 
subject to the Department of Environmental Protection 
rules for the installation of Underground Storage Tanks 
at N.J.A.C. 7: 14B, those rules shall apply." 

11. Chapter 15 of the mechanical subcode, entitled 
"Referenced Standards," is amended as follows: 

1. Under the heading "ICC," amend the following 
titles: 

(1) Delete "IBC-03, International Building 
Code" and insert "IBC-00, International Building 
Code." 

5:23-3.20 

(2) Delete "ICC EC-03, ICC Electrical Code." 

(3) Delete "IEBC-03, International Existing 
Building Code." 

( 4) Delete "IECC-03, International Energy 
Conservation Code." 

(5) Delete "IFC-03, International Fire Code" 
and insert "IFC-00, International Fire Code." 

(6) Delete "IPC-03, International Plumbing 
Code." 

(7) Delete "IRC-03, International Residential 
Code" and insert "IRC-00, International Residential 
Code." 

12. Appendix A of the mechanical subcode entitled 
"Combustion Air and Chimney Connector Pass-Throughs" 
is informative and is not part of the code. 

13. Appendix B of the mechanical subcode entitled 
"Recommended Permit Fee Schedule," is deleted in its 
entirety. 

(c) Single station carbon monoxide alarms shall be 
installed and maintained in full operating condition in the 
immediate vicinity of each sleeping area in any guestroom or 
dwelling unit located in a building of Group I-1, R-1, R-2, R-
3, R-4, or R-5, if the building contains a fuel-burning 
appliance or has an attached garage. An "open parking 
structure," as defmed in the building subcode, shall not be 
deemed to be an attached garage. 

1. Exceptions: Guestrooms or dwelling units which do 
not themselves contain a fuel-burning appliance or have an 
attached garage, but which are located in a building with a 
fuel-burning appliance or an attached garage, need not be 
provided with single station carbon monoxide alarms 
provided that: 

i. The guestroom or dwelling unit is located more 
than one story above or below any story which contains 
a fuel-burning appliance or an attached garage; the 
guestroom or dwelling unit is not connected by duct 
work or ventilation shafts to any room containing a fuel­
burning appliance or to an attached garage; and the 
building is provided with a common area carbon 
monoxide alarm system. The individual alarms shall be 
located in every room adjacent to the room(s) containing 
a fuel-burning appliance, and in every corridor, hall or 
lobby adjacent to such room(s) and in the immediate 
vicinity of any ventilated shaft, including, but not limited 
to, stair shafts, elevator shafts, ventilation shafts on the 
story containing the fuel-burning appliance and any 
story within two stories above or below said story. All 
such common area alarm devices shall be connected to 
an alarm monitoring station or shall be interconnected; 
or 

23-51 Supp. 11-21-05 



5:23-3.20 

ii. The building is provided with a monitored 
carbon monoxide alarm system. Individual alarms shall 
be located in every room containing a fuel-burning 
appliance. All such alarms shall be connected to an 
alarm monitoring station that shall be staffed at all times 
by a person who is trained and qualified to respond so as 
to protect the health and safety of building occupants in 
the event of the activation of one or more alarms. 
Carbon monoxide alarms and ftre alarms may be 
incorporated into a common monitored system. 

2. Carbon monoxide alarms shall be manufactured, 
listed and labeled in accordance with UL 2034 and shall be 
installed in accordance with the requirements of this 
section and NFPA 720. Carbon monoxide alarms shall be 
battery operated, hard-wired or of the plug-in type. 

R.l984 d.314, eff. August 6, 1984. 
See: 16 N.J.R. 1139(a), 16 N.J.R. 2084(b). 

New rule. 
Amended by R.l985 d.154, effective April 1, 1985 (operative July 1, 

1985). 
See: 17 N.J.R. 239(a), 17 N.J.R. 810(a). 

(a)2 added; subsection (c) added. 
Amended by R.1986 d.380, effective September 22, 1986. 
See: 18 N.J.R. 1235(a), 18 N.J.R. 1931(a). 

Substantially amended. 
Amended by R.l987 d.14, effective January 5, 1987. 
See: 18 N.J.R. 2083(a), 19 N.J.R. 63(a). 

In (b)5iv Section M-508 was deleted and Section M-508.1 was 
substituted. 
Amended by R.l987 d.374, effective September 21, 1987. 
See: 19N.J.R.1024(a), 19N.J.R. 1720(b). 

Model subcode revisions. 
Amended by R.l988 d.270, effective June 20, 1988. 
See: 20 N.J.R. 575(a), 20 N.J.R. 1344(a). 

Added (a)3 and (c). 
Amended by R.l990 d.253, effective May 21, 1990. 
See: 22 N.J.R. 909(b), 22 N.J.R. 1554(a). 

References to 1989 Supplement added; (c)1 and 3 added. 
Amended by R.1990 d.507, effective October 15, 1990. 
See: 22 N.J.R. 2208(a), 22 N.J.R. 3214(a). 

Text conformed to BOCA National Code/1990. 
Amended by R.1991 d.429, effective August 19, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R. 1487(a), 23 N.J.R. 2501(a). 

In (a), added 3. Added new (c). 
Amended by R.l992 d.183, effective April20, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 167(a), 24 N.J.R. 1475(b). 

Text added at (b)7 and (c)1, deleting parts of article 16 of the 
mechanical subcode. 
Amended by R.l993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993. 
See: 25 N.J.R. 389l(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a). 
Amended by R.1995 d.l20, effective March 6, 1995 (operative July 1, 

1995). 
See: 26 N.J.R. 4874(b), 27 N.J.R. 894(b). 
Amended by R.l999 d.259, effective August 16, 1999. 
See: 31 N.J.R. 825(a), 31 N.J.R. 2330(a). 

Added (c). 
Amended by R.2001 d.196, effective June 18, 2001. 
See: 33 N.J.R. 6(a), 33 N.J.R. 2090(a). 

Rewrote (a) and (b). 
Administrative correction. 
See: 33 N.J.R. 3310(a). 
Amended by R.2002 d.l5, effective January 22,2002. 
See: 33 N.J.R. 2933(b), 33 N.J.R. 3883(a), 34 N.J.R. 521(a). 

In (c), added the last sentence in the introductory paragraph, and 
rewrote 1. 
Amended by R.2003 d.137, effective April7, 2003. 
See: 34 N.J.R. 4277(a), 35 N.J.R. 1558(c). 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

In (c), deleted", or any dwelling unit ofUse Group" following "R-2", 
and substituted", R-3 or R-4" for "R-3 located in a building required to 
be registered as a multiple dwelling" in the introductory paragraph. 
Amended by R.2004 d.67, effective February 17,2004. 
See: 35 N.J.R. 4627(a), 36 N.J.R. 949(b). 

In (c), added R-5 to the list of groups. 
Amended by R.2005 d.35, effective January 18,2005. 
See: 36 N.J.R. 3329(b), 37 N.J.R. 267(a). 

Rewrote the section. 
Administrative correction. 
See: 37 N.J.R. 885(a). 

5:23-3.20A (Reserved) 

New Rule R.l992 d.183, effective April20, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 167(a), 24 N.J.R. 1475(b). 
Repealed by R.2001 d.196, effective June 18,2001. 
See: 33 N.J.R. 6(a), 33 N.J.R. 2090(a). 

Section was "Indoor air quality subcode". 

5:23-3.21 One- and two-family dwelling subcode 

(a) Rules concerning the subcode are adopted as follows: 

1. Pursuant to authority of P.L. 1975, c.217, as modi­
fled by P.L. 1996, c.53, the Commissioner hereby adopts 
the model code of the International Code Council, 
International Residential Code known as the "IRC/2000" 
as the one-and two-family dwelling subcode in New Jersey 
subject to the modifications stated in (c) below. 

i. Copies of this code may be obtained from the 
International Code Council at 4051 West Flossmoor 
Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois 60478-5795. 

ii. The IRC/2000 may be known and cited as the 
one-and two-family dwelling subcode. 

(b) The provisions of this subcode shall apply to the 
construction, alteration, repair, or increase in size of detached 
one-or two-family dwellings, or single family townhouses, of 
Group R-5 not more than three stories in height. For this 
purpose, a townhouse shall be as defmed in Section 202 of 
the International Residential Code: "A single-family dwelling 
unit constructed in a group of three or more attached units in 
which each unit extends from foundation to roof and with 
open space on at least two sides." 

(c) The following chapters or sections of the IRC/2000 
shall be modified as follows: 

1. Chapter 1, General Administration, shall be deleted 
in its entirety. In addition, any referenced section of 
Chapter 1 shall be deleted throughout the code and "the 
administrative provisions of the Uniform Construction 
Code (N.J.A.C. 5:23)" shall be inserted. 

2. Chapter 2, Definitions, shall be amended as follows: 

i. The defmition of"Additions" shall be deleted. 

ii. The defmition of"Alteration" shall be deleted. 

111. The defmition of "Approved" shall be deleted 
and the following shall be inserted: "Approved refers to 
approval by the building subcode official or other 

Supp. 11-21-05 23-52 

<J 



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

mechanical means into an approved drainage system that 
complies with the plumbing subcode. 

Exception: Where a site is located in well-drained gravel or 
sand/gravel mixture soils, a dedicated drainage system is not 
required. 

5. Chapter 5, Floors, shall be amended as follows: 

i. In Section R502.11.4, entitled "Truss Design 
Drawings," the second sentence shall be amended to 
insert "and truss layout drawings" after "Truss design 
drawings." 

ii. New Section R502.11.5, entitled "Truss Identi­
fication," shall be inserted as follows: "Each truss shall 
be labeled or otherwise indelibly marked at the factory 
with the individual truss number as assigned in the truss 
layout plan. The indelible marking or label shall be 
located on the bottom chord of the truss, inside the 
bearing points. When indelible markings are used, each 
digit shall be not less than one inch high. When labels 
are used, the label shall be a minimum of five inches by 
three inches and shall be affixed to the truss by a truss 
plate. Labels shall remain affixed to the truss." 

6. Chapter 6, Wall Construction, shall be amended as 
follows: 

i. In Figure R602.6.1, Notching and Bored Hole 
Limitations for Exterior Walls and Bearing Walls, "six-
16 penny nails" shall be deleted and "three-8d nails" 
shall be inserted. 

ii. In Table R602.10.1, Wall Bracing, under the 
column "Seismic Design Category or Wind Speed," at 
Category D1 and D2, "less than 110 mph" shall be 
deleted and "less than 120 mph" shall be inserted. In 
addition, the fourth row of Table R602.10.1 shall be 
deleted in its entirety. 

iii. Section R606.1.1, Professional registration not 
required, shall be deleted in its entirety. 

iv. In Section R611.1, General, the second sentence 
shall be deleted. 

7. Chapter 8, Roof Ceiling Construction, shall be 
amended as follows: 

i. In Section R802 .1 0.1, entitled "Truss Design 
Drawings," the third sentence shall be amended to insert 
"and truss layout drawings" after "Truss design draw­
ings." 

ii. New Section 802.10.5, entitled "Truss Identifi­
cation," shall be inserted as follows: "Each truss shall be 
labeled or otherwise indelibly marked at the factory with 
the individual truss number as assigned in the truss lay­
out plan. The indelible marking or label shall be located 
on the bottom chord of the truss, inside the bearing 
points. When indelible markings are used, each digit 
shall be not less than one inch high. When labels are 

5:23-3.21 

used, the label shall be a minimum of five inches by 
three inches and shall be affixed to the truss by a truss 
plate. Labels shall remain affixed to the truss." 

iii. Table R802.11, Required Strength of Truss or 
Rafter Tie-Down Connections to Resist Wind Uplift 
Forces •, b' ", d' shall be deleted and the following shall be 
inserted: 

"Required Strength of Truss or Rafter Tie-Down Connections 
to Resist Wind Uplift Forces•,h,c,d 
(Pounds per tie-down connection) 

Design Wind Total Roof Width Including Overhang (feet) 
Load (J:1sfld 24 28 32 36 40 

20 192 224 256 288 320 
30 432 504 576 648 720 
40 672 784 895 1,008 1,120 
50 912 1,064 1,216 1,368 1,520 
60 1,152 1,344 1,536 1,728 1,920 
70 1,392 1,624 1,856 2,088 2,320 
80 1,632 1,904 2,176 2,448 2,720 
90 1,872 2,184 2,496 2,808 3,120 

For SI: I inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm, 1 pound per square 
foot= 0.0479 kN/m2, 1 pound= 0.454 kg. 
a. Wind uplift forces are based on 24-inch spacing of roof trusses 
or rafters. For spacing other than 24 inches, forces shall be 
adjusted accordingly. 
b. Interpolation is permitted for intermediate values of wind 
uplift pressures and roof widths. 
c. The rated capacity of approved tie-down devices is permitted to 
include up to a 60-percent increase for wind effects where allowed 
by material specifications. 
d. Figure R301.2(4) and Table R301.2(2) shall be used in deter­
mining the design wind load. 

8. Chapter 10, Chimneys and Fireplaces, shall be 
amended as follows: 

i. In Section R1001.15, Chimney clearances, Ex-
ception 3, "12 inches" shall be deleted and "six inches" 
shall be inserted. 

ii. In Figure 1001.15, Clearance from Combustibles, 
"12 IN. MIN." shall be deleted and "6 IN. MIN." shall 
be inserted. 

iii. In Section R1 003.12, Fireplace clearance, Ex­
ception 3, "12 inches" shall be deleted and "six inches" 
shall be inserted. 

9. Chapter 11, Energy Efficiency, shall be deleted in its 
entirety. 

10. Chapter 12, Mechanical Administration, shall be 
amended as follows: 

i. Section M-1202, Existing Mechanical Systems, 
shall be deleted in its entirety. 

11. Part VI, Fuel Gas, shall be amended as follows: 

23-57 Supp. 2-6-06 



5:23-3.21 

i. In Section G2402.3, Terms defined in other 
codes, "ICC Electrical Code, International Building 
Code, International Fire Code, and International Plumb­
ing Code" shall be deleted and "electrical, building, fire 
protection, and plumbing subcodes" shall be inserted. 

ii. Section G2403, entitled "General Defmitions" 
shall be amended as follows: 

(1) The defmition "code" shall be deleted. 

(2) The definition of "code official" shall be 
deleted and the following shall be inserted: "For the 
purpose of this subcode, the term 'code official' shall 
mean the appropriate subcode official as required by 
N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.4." 

(3) In the definition of "labeled," "authority hav­
ing jurisdiction" shall be deleted and "construction 
official" shall be inserted. 

( 4) In the definition of "listed," "authority having 
jurisdiction" shall be deleted and "Uniform Construc­
tion Code (N.J.A.C. 5:23)" shall be inserted. 

iii. Section G2404.5, Repair, shall be deleted in its 
entirety. 

iv. In Section G2408.1, General, the second para­
graph shall be deleted in its entirety. 

v. Section G2409, Clearance Reduction, shall be 
amended as follows: 

(1) In Section G2409.4, Central heating boilers 
and furnaces, "G2409.4.1 through G2409.4.7" shall be 
deleted and "G2409.4.1 through G2409.4.5 and 
G2409.4.7" shall be inserted. 

(2) Section G2409.4.6, Unlisted central heating 
furnaces, shall be deleted in its entirety. 

vi. Section G2411.2, Liquefied petroleum gas stor­
age, shall be amended as follows: "Delete in its entirety 
Section 3-2.5, entitled 'Installation of Containers on 
Roofs of Buildings' in NFPA 58, 1998 Edition. The 
installation of LP Gas containers on roofs of buildings 
shall be strictly prohibited." shall be inserted after the 
frrst sentence. 

vii. Section G2413.3, Other materials, shall be 
deleted in its entirety. 

viii. In Section G2426.5.5, Inspection of chimneys, 
"clear and free of obstructions" shall be deleted and 
"inspected in accordance with the chimney certification 
program as provided for in N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.20(c)" shall 
be inserted. In the same section, the exception shall be 
deleted in its entirety. 

12. Part VII, Plumbing, shall be deleted in its entirety. 
Plumbing requirements Wider the scope of this subcode 
shall be regulated by the plumbing subcode. 

13. Part VIII, Electrical, shall be deleted in its entirety. 
Electrical requirements under the scope of this subcode 
shall be regulated by the electrical subcode. 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

14. Part IX, Chapter 42, Referenced standards, shall be 
amended as follows: 

i. Under the subheading, NFPA, "NFPA 13-96, 
Installation of Sprinkler Systems," shall be deleted and 
"NFPA 13-99, Installation of Sprinkler Systems; NFPA 
13D-99, Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One-and 
Two-Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes; and 
NFPA 13R-99, Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Res­
idential Occupancies Up To and Including Four Stories 
in Height" shall be inserted. 

15. The Appendices shall be amended as follows: 

i. In Appendix A, Sizing and Capacities of Gas 
Piping, at Letters (e) and (d), "authority having juris­
diction" shall be deleted and "construction official" shall 
be inserted. 

ii. Appendix D, Recommended Procedure for 
Safety Inspection of an Existing Appliance Installation: 
Appendix E, Manufactured Housing Used as Dwellings: 
and Appendix F, Radon Control Methods, are deleted in 
their entirety. 

iii. In Appendix G, Section AG102.1, General, the 
defmition of "swimming pool" shall be deleted and the 
following shall be inserted: "Any structure intended for 
swimming or recreational bathing that can hold water 24 
inches (610 mm) or more in depth. This includes in­
ground, above-ground, on-ground swimming pools, hot 
tubs, and spas." 

iv. In Appendix G, Section AG105.1, Application, 
"subject to this code" shall be inserted at the end of the 
first sentence. 

v. In Appendix G, Section AG105.2, Outdoor 
swimming pool, Provision 9 shall be deleted in its 
entirety. In the same section, under Provision 10, Item 
10.1 shall be deleted. Item 10.2 shall be renumbered as 
10.1 and the last sentence shall be deleted. 

vi. Appendix H, Patio Covers; Appendix I, Private 
Sewage Disposal; and Appendix J, Existing Buildings 
and Structures, shall be deleted in their entirety. 

New Rule, R.1985 d.324, effective July 1, 1985. 
See: 17 N.J.R. 861(c), 17 N.J.R. 1646(a). 
Amended by R.1987 d.374, effective September 21, 1987. 
See: 19 N.J.R. 1024(a), 19 N.J.R. 1720(b). 

Model subcode revisions. 
Amended by R.1988 d.388, effective August 1, 1988. 
See: 20 N.J.R. 1130(a), 20 N.J.R. 2073(b ). 

Added (c). 
Amended by R.1990 d.253, effective May 21, 1990. 
See: 22 N.J.R. 909(b), 22 N.J.R. 1554(a). 

References to 1989 Supplement added; (b)lii(S), 2, 4, 8 and 9 
amended; (b)S, 6 and 7 added; (c) deleted; Table R-201.2 added. 
Amended by R.1991 d.571, effective November 18, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R. 2619(a), 23 N.J.R. 3444(b). 

Added new (c). 
Amended by R.1992 d.208, effective May 18, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 680(a), 24 N.J.R. 1879(a). 

Code provisions applicable to flood hazard zones clarified. 
Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993. 

Supp. 2-6-06 23-58 Next Page is 23-58.1 



c 

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a). 
Amended by R.1998 d.332, effective July 6, 1998. 
See: 30 N.J.R. 1377(a), 30 N.J.R. 2421(b). 

Rewrote the section. 
Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April17, 2000. 
See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a). 

In (c)4, substituted "more pressure than would be exerted by backfill" 
for "lateral pressure from soils" following "subject to" in ii, and 
substituted "drainage" for "designated disposal" preceding "system" and 
added "according to the Unified Soil Classification System, Group I 
Soils" at the end of iii; and inserted (c)9iv. 
Amended by R.2001 d.369, effective October 15,2001. 
See: 33 N.J.R. 2365(a), 33 N.J.R. 3674(a). 

In (b), inserted "that are" following ''type 5B construction", "no 
more" preceding "than 4,800 square feet", and substituted "seven feet" 
for "7 113 feet (2,235 rom.)". 
Amended by R.2003 d.l87, effective May 5, 2003. 
See: 34 N.J.R. 4248(a), 35 N.J.R. 1939(c). 

Rewrote the section. 
Amended by R.2003 d.420, effective November 3, 2003. 
See: 34 N.J.R. 4248(a), 35 N.J.R. 5073(a). 

Rewrote (c). 
Amended by R.2005 d.403, effective November 21, 2005. 
See: 37 N.J.R. 2753(a), 37 N.J.R. 4399(b). 

Rewrote (c). 
Amended by R.2006 d.28, effective January 17,2006. 
See: 37 N.J.R. 2750(a), 38 N.J.R. 485(b). 

Rewrote (c)15. 
Administrative correction. 
See: 38 N.J.R. 926(a). 

5:23-3.22 Fuel gas subcode 

(a) Rules concerning the subcode adopted are as follows: 

1. Pursuant to authority of P.L. 1975, c.217, the 
Commissioner hereby adopts the model code of the Inter­
national Code Council, Inc., known as the International 
Fuel Gas Code/2003. This code is hereby adopted by ref­
erence as the fuel gas subcode for the State of New Jersey 
subject to the modifications in (b) below. 

i. Copies of this code may be obtained from the 
International Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, 
Country Club Hills, Illinois 60478-5795. 

ii. The International Fuel Gas Code/2003 may be 
known and cited as the "fuel gas subcode." 

2. Any references to the International Plumbing Code, 
ICC Electrical Code, International Energy Conservation 
Code or the International Existing Building Code listed in 
Chapter 8 shall be considered a reference to the appropriate 
adopted plumbing, electrical, or energy subcode in 
N.J.A.C. 5:23-3 or rehabilitation subcode in N.J.A.C. 5:23-
6. 

3. Anywhere the term "code" appears, shall be a 
reference to "subcode" as defmed in N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4 for 
any of the adopted national model codes as appropriate. 

(b) The following chapters, sections or pages of the 
International Fuel Gas Code/2003 are amended as follows: 

1. Chapter 1 of the fuel gas subcode, entitled "Admin­
istration" is deleted in its entirety. 

23-58.1 

5:23-3.22 

2. Chapter 2 of the fuel gas subcode, entitled "Defmi­
tions," is amended as follows: 

i. In Section 201.3 delete "ICC Electrical Code, 
and International Plumbing Code," and insert "electrical 
subcode and plumbing subcode." 

ii. The defmition of the term "alteration" is deleted 
and the defmition found in N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4 is 
substituted; 

iii. The defmition of the term "approved" is deleted; 

iv. The definition of the term "code" is deleted; 

v. The definition of the term "code official" is 
deleted, and the following language is substituted: "For 
the purpose of the fuel gas subcode, the term "code 
official" shall mean the appropriate subcode official as 
designated in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.4." 

vi. The defmition of the term "unlisted boiler" is 
deleted. 

3. Chapter 3 of the fuel gas subcode, entitled "General 
Regulations," is amended as follows: 

i. Section 301.1 is amended to delete the words "in 
accordance with Section 101.2." 

ii. In Section 301.3 delete "in accordance with 
Section 105." 

iii. Section 301.9 is deleted. 

iv. Section 305.l.Delete the second paragraph in its 
entirety. 

v. Section 307.1 is amended to delete "approved 
plumbing fixture" on line 3 and insert the following: 
"drywell, sump pump, floor drain, or drainage system 
below floor." 

vi. Section 307.2 is deleted. 

4. Chapter 4 of the fuel gas subcode, entitled "Gas Pip­
ing Installation," is amended as follows: 

i. Add new Section 401.9 as follows: 

401.9 Protection from vehicle impact. Gas meters, 
related regulators and piping that are installed indoors 
or outdoors and are subject to vehicle impact shall be 
protected by barriers meeting the requirements of 
Section 312 of the International Fire Code. For the 
purpose of applying this provision, "subject to vehicle 
impact" shall mean located within three feet of any 
garage door opening, driveway or designated parking 
area and not separated by a building wall from the 
space where a vehicle may be operated. 

(1) Exception: If verification of the installation of 
an excess flow valve is provided by the gas utility, 
vehicle impact barriers shall not be required. 

Supp. 2-6-06 



5:23-3.22 

ii. Section 401.2 is amended to add the following: 
"Delete in its entirety Section 3-2.5 "Installation of 
Containers on Roofs of Buildings" in NFPA-58, 1998 
Edition." Installation of LP-Gas containers on roofs of 
buildings shall be strictly prohibited. 

iii. Section 403 .3 is deleted. 

5. Chapter 5 of the fuel gas code, entitled "Chimneys 
and Vents," is amended as follows: 

i. In Section 503.5.6 delete "cleaned and free of 
obstructions" and insert "inspected in accordance with 
the chimney certification program as provided for in 
N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.20." 

ii. Section 503.5.6.1, exception: Delete the excep­
tion in its entirety. 

6. Chapter 6 of the fuel gas code, entitled "Specific 
Appliances" is amended as follows: 

i. Section 623 .2 is deleted. 

ii. Section 623 .3 is deleted. 

iii. Section 627.10 is deleted. 

7. Chapter 8 of the fuel gas code, entitled "Referenced 
Standards," is amended as follows: 

i. Under the heading "ICC," amend the following 
titles: 

(1) Delete "IBC-03, International Building 
Code" and insert "IBC-00, International Building 
Code." 

(2) Delete "ICC EC-03, ICC Electrical Code." 

(3) Delete "IEBC-03, International Existing 
Building Code." 

(4) Delete "IECC-03, International Energy 
Conservation Code." 

(5) Delete "IFC-03, International Fire Code" 
and insert "IFC-00, International Fire Code." 

(6) Delete "IPC-03, International Plumbing 
Code." 

(7) Delete "IRC-03, International Residential 
Code" and insert "IRC-00, International Residential 
Code." 

8. Appendices A, B, and C of the fuel gas subcode are 
informative and are not part of the subcode itself. 

9. Appendix D of the fuel gas subcode, entitled 
"Recommended Procedure for Safety Inspection of an 
Existing Appliance Installation," is deleted in its entirety. 

New Rule, R.2001 d.196, effective June 18,2001. 
See: 33 N.J.R. 6(a), 33 N.J.R 2090(a). 
Administrative correction. 
See: 33 N.J.R. 3310(a). 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

Amended by R.2004 d.468, effective December 20, 2004. 
See: 36 N.J.R. 1858(b), 36 N.J.R. 5711(a). 

In (b), added a new 4i and recodified existing i through ii as ii through 
iii. 
Amended by R.2005 d.35, effective January 18, 2005. 
See: 36 N.J.R. 3329(b), 37 N.J.R 267(a). 

Rewrote the section. 
Administrative correction. 
See: 37 N.J.R. 885(a). 

APPENDIX 3-A 

APPENDIX 

NEW JERSEY DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 
DIVISION OF CODES AND STANDARDS 

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL 
REHABILITATION SUBCODE (N.J.A.C. 5:23-6) 

Proposals must be presented with language proposed for deletion in 
brackets [ ]. 
Proposals must be presented with language proposed for addition 
underlined: 
Mail code change proposals to: 

Code Development Unit 
Department of Community Affairs 

Division of Codes and Standards 

POBox802 
Trenton, New Jersey 08625 

Fax code change proposals to: . 
Code Development Unit 
(609) 984-7717 or 
(609) 633-{;729 

Direct questions to the Code Development or Code Assistance Units at 
(609) 984-7609. 

Section (citation) proposed for change:---------­
Sections (companion changes) that might also need to be changed: 

NAME: _________________ __ 

ORGANIZATION (if any):----------------------
ADDRESS: _____________________ ___ 

TELEPHONE: FAX: _______ E-mail: _____ _ 

Proposed Code Change: 

Supporting Statement (reason for code change): 

New Rule, R.2004 d.261, effective July 6, 2004. 
See: 35 N.J.R 1267(a), 36 N.J.R. 3275(a). 

SUBCHAPTER 3A. STATE-JURISDICTION SUBCODES 

S:23-3A.l Scope 

This subchapter shall govern the enforcement by the 
Department of Community Affairs of the State Uniform 

Supp. 2-6-06 23-58.2 



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

Construction Code, in conjunction with other rules admin­
istered by the Department, in facilities and installations for 
which the Department is the sole enforcing agency, as set 
forth in N.J.A.C. 5:23·3.110). 

5:23-3A.2 Subcodes established 

(a) All provisions of adopted model codes that are appli­
cable to the construction, alteration, installation, erection or 

5:23-3A.2 

demolition of carnival-amusement rides or ski lifts shall be 
designated collectively as the amusement ride subcode. 

(b) All provisions of adopted model codes that are appli­
cable to the construction, alteration, installation, erection or 
demolition of high pressure boilers, pressure vessels or refrig­
eration systems shall be designated collectively as the boiler, 
pressure vessel and refrigeration subcode. 

Next Page is 23-59 23-58.3 Supp. 2-6-06 



(- '~ 
··, ___ _) 

c 

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

F221 

F-222A 

F223 

F-224A 

F-225 

F-230B 

F241 
F242 
F-245A 
F250 
F-255A 
F260 
F270 
F310 
F-320A 
F-325 

F326 
F-350B 
F-360 
F-370 

F380 

Inspection Sticker Approval for 
Building 

Inspection Sticker Approval for Elec­
tric 

Inspection Sticker Approval for 
Plumbing 

Inspection Sticker Approval for Fire 
Protection 

Inspection Sticker Approval for Ele­
vator 

Inspection Sticker Approval-Not 
Approved 

Notice of Unsafe Structure 
Notice of Imminent Hazard 
Unsafe Structure Notice 
Stop Construction Order 
Stop Construction Notice 
Certificate 
Application for Certificate 
Elevator Inspection 
Elevator Notice 
Notice of Elevator Device Sealed Out 

of Operation 
Accident/Incident Report 
Cut-In Card 
Denial of Permit 
Chimney Certification for Replace­

ment of Fuel Fired Equipment 
Hydraulic System Data Plate 

3. The following standardized forms established by the 
Commissioner are optional for use by the municipal 
enforcing agency; provided, however, that where they are 
not used, equivalent forms or mechanisms are used by the 
enforcing agency to accomplish the same purpose: 

Form No. 
F-200A 
F-280B 
F-290A­
F-300A 
F375 

Name 
Inspection Notice 
T.C.O. Control Card 
Ongoing Inspections Control Card 
Ongoing Inspections Schedule 
Tickler/X-Ref Card 

4. No forms other than those established by the Com­
missioner shall be required of the public in connection 
with the administration and enforcement of the State 
Uniform Construction Code. The municipal enforcing 
agency may use additional forms for its own internal 
processing and recordkeeping. Nothing in this section 
pertaining to forms or in the forms themselves shall be 
deemed to affect the requirements for plans and specifica­
tions or documentation of prior approvals. Where there 
is insufficient space on a form for all required informa­
tion, the form shall be used with attachments. 

5. Printing of forms: The municipal enforcing agency 
shall arrange for the printing of all forms. Other interest­
ed persons may also arrange for the printing of forms or 
they may purchase and use forms printed by others. The 
municipal enforcing agency may provide for the inclusion 
of its name and other appropriate identifying information 
on the forms it has printed. However, the municipal 
enforcing agency shall accept forms not having municipal 
identification and shall, in any such case, insert the name 

5:23-4.5 

of the municipality. All required forms shall be exact 
replicas of the forms required by the Commissioner, 
conforming in content, size, format and colors, except that 
all multi-part forms may be printed with an additional 
copy so long as the additional copy shall be in a color 
distinct from those specified by the Commissioner. 
Forms F-llOA, F-120A, F-130A and F-140A may have 
the Subcode Technical Sections printed in any color or 
colors of ink as desired and Form F-310A (Elevator 
Inspection) may be printed as a multipart form on sepa­
rate pages with up to four copies of each page. 

(c) Logs: 

1. The following standardized logs established by the 
Commissioner are required to be maintained by the mu­
nicipal enforcing agency: 

Log No. 
L700 
L-710A 
L720 
L730 

Name 
Permit Fee Log 
Inspection Log 
Certificate Log 
Ongoing Inspection Log 

2. The municipal enforcing agency shall maintain the 
required logs either on log sheets established by the 
commissioner or on log sheets or ledger books of its own 
choice or design, provided that all required entries are 
maintained. 

(d) Monthly reports: 

1. The following standardized report forms estab­
lished by the Commissioner are required to be completed 
by the municipal enforcing agency and transmitted to the 
Department by the tenth business day following the end 
of each calendar month: 

Report No. 

R-811B 
R-812B 

Name 
Municipal Monthly Activity 
Report Certificates 
Municipal Monthly Activity Report Permits 

2. Municipalities currently submitting monthly reports 
electronically shall continue to do so. Municipalities that 
do not already submit monthly reports electronically using 
UCCARS I shall begin to do so according to the following 
schedule: 

i. By December 31, 1992, all municipalities issuing 
600 or more permits per year as determined by the 
Department shall submit monthly reports electronically. 

ii. By December 31, 1993, all municipalities issuing 
fewer than 600, but more than 200, permits per year as 
determined by the Department shall submit monthly 
reports electronically. 

iii. All other municipalities shall have the option of 
submitting monthly reports electronically or by mail. 
Any municipality which issues more than 200 permits 
per year as determined by the Department for any 

23-65 Supp. 2-17-04 



5:23-4.5 

future year shall submit monthly reports electronically 
beginning during the following year. 

iv. A municipality that determines that compliance 
with this schedule would impose an undue hardship 
may apply to the Department for an extension of time. 
A request for an extension shall be in writing and shall 
set forth the reason(s) for such extension and the 
period of time for which the extension is sought. The 
Department shall give the municipality written notice of 
its determination ih response to the extension request. 

3. As long as funding permits, the Department shall 
provide the UCCARS I software, training and technical 
support for the system free of charge to municipalities. 
Municipalities may submit monthly reports electronically 
using an alternative system compatible with UCCARS as 
determined by the Department and capable of transmit­
ting a monthly report based on UCCARS specifications. 

4. Municipalities, at their option, may choose to add 
UCCARS II and III systems to their UCCARS I System 
and may obtain them, at no cost, from the Department, 
when available. 

(e) Quarterly reports: The following standardized report 
established by the Commissioner is required to be complet­
ed by the municipal enforcing agency for State of New 
Jersey training fees and must be submitted quarterly, with 
the accompanying fees, pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.19: 

Report No. 
R840 

Name 
State Training Fee Report 

(f) The following standardized report form established by 
the Commissioner is optional for use by the municipal 
enforcing agency: 

Report No. Name 
R-800A Inspector's Report 

(g) Exceptions: Exceptions may be made by the munici­
pal enforcing agency to those requirements for records and 
procedures, forms, logs, and reports as stated in this section 
and in the Municipal Procedures Manual established by the 
commissioner only with the express written authorization of 
the Department. Requests for exceptions shall be in writing 
and shall detail the requirement(s) to which an exception is 
sought, the reason(s) for such exception and the duration 
for which the exception is sought, and shall be accompanied 
by any appropriate documentation and examples of alterna­
tive procedures, forms, logs or reports. 

(h) Duties of construction officials: 

1. The construction official shall enforce the regula­
tions and: 

i. Provide that applications are available, and assist 
the public in preparing the applications whenever nec­
essary; 

Supp. 2-17-04 23-66 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

ii. Review all applications for completeness as to 
form and for verification of prior approvals. He may 
request additional documentation concerning prior ap­
provals whenever it is deemed necessary; 

iii. Upon receipt of the completed application, the 
construction official shall determine the proper fee for 
the work required; 

iv. Collect all fees and penalties and ensure that 
funds are properly accounted for; 

v. Ensure that the proper subcode official shall have 
an adequate time period to review appropriate applica­
tions, plans and specifications; 

vi. Ensure that all requests for variation are proper­
ly prepared, documented and referred to the appropri­
ate subcode officials; 

vii. Issue the construction permit upon receiving the 
approval of all appropriate subcode officials; 

vm. Record all notices of violation upon receiving 
notification of the appropriate subcode official, and 
determine all penalties for noncompliance with the 
penalty notices; 

ix. Ensure that all required inspections are sched­
uled and performed within three business days of the 
time for which inspection has been requested; 

x. Ensure that the reports of all inspections are 
completed and properly filed; 

xi. Record stop work orders, upon notification of 
the appropriate subcode official; 

xii. Ensure that all final inspections have been com­
pleted prior to the issuance of a certificate of occupan­
cy. 

(1) Ensure that all inspection required for the 
purpose, has been completed prior to the issuance of 
temporary certificate of occupancy; 

xiii. Issue the certificate of occupancy, upon receiv­
ing the approval of all appropriate subcode officials. 

(1) Issue the temporary certificate of occupancy, 
upon receiving the approval of all appropriate sub­
code officials; 

xiv. Ensure, in the case of a change of use, or upon 
a request for a certificate of continued occupancy, that 
each subcode official gives an approval based on an 
inspection and the review of all submitted data before 
issuing a certificate of continued occupancy; 

xv. Prepare and obtain reports required in the regu­
lations; 

xvi. Attend meetings and hearings as required by 
the regulations; 



( '\ u 

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

i. The ownership of stock or other in estment 
instrument in any corporation listed on any · onal 
stock exchange. 

ii. Any such business or employment outside the 
State; 

iii. Dual employment by two or more enforcing 
agencies; ' 

iv. Any business or employment which is not 
subject to the regulations. 

v. Service as an instructor in a code enforcement 
training program. 

6. Nothing herein shall prohibit a municipality from 
establishing by ordinance more restrictive provisions 
covering conflict of interest. 

Amended by R.l983 d.61l, efT. January 3, 1984. 
See: 15 N.J.R. 1789(a),l6 N.J.R. 45(b). 

Deleted old (b)2.-3. and (c) and added new (b)2, (c), (d) and (e). 
Renumbered old (d)-( f) as new (t)-(h). 
Amended by R.l984 d.303, effective July 16, 1984. 
See: 16 N.J.R. 950(a), 16 N.J.R. 1968(b). 

Added(g)2. 
Amended by R.l990 d.61, effective February 5, 1990. 
See: 21 N.J.R. 3346(b), 22 N.J.R. 35l(b). 

Fonn numbers updated, new (d)2. added and reference made to 
· reports and fees being submitted quarterly. 

Amended by R.l990 d226, effective May 7, 1990. 
See: 21 N.J.R. 3696(a), 22 N.J.R. 1356(a). 

Radon mitigation added to (f)lxviii. 
Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a). 

Elevator safety added at (t)1xviii; conflict of interest provision added 
at (h). 
Amended by R.l992 d.47, effective February 3, 1992. 
See: 23 N.J.R. 3440(a), 24 NJ.R. 405(a). 

Electronic monthly reporting added at (d)2.-4. 
Amended by R.l992 d.230, effective June 1, 1992. 
See: 24 NJ.R. 168(a), 24 N.J.R. 2052(a). 

Fonn numbers changed in (b). 
Amended by R.l992 d.243, effective July 6, 1992. 
See: 24 NJ.R. 678(a), 24 N.J.R. 2422(a). 

Conflict of interest and exception provisions added. 
Amended by R.l992 d.392, effective October 5, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 2657(a), 24 NJ.R. 3521(b). 

Report fonn number changed at (e). 
Amended by R.l993 d.581, effective November 15, 1993. 
See: 25 N.J.R. 3693(a), 25 NJ.R. 5146(a). 
Amended by R.l994 d323, effective July 5, 1994 (operative January 1, 

1995). 
See: 25 N.J.R. 2162(a), 26 N.J.R. 2780(a). 
Amended by R.l995 d.249, effective June 5, 1995, (operative October 1, 

1995). 
See: 27 NJ.R. 619(a), 27 N.J.R. 2187(a). 

In (b)2 added Fonn No. F-370. 
Amended by R.l996 d.512, effective November 4, 1996. 
See: 28 N.J.R. 3697(a), 28 N.J.R. 4782(a). 
Amended by R.l997 d.64, effective February 18, 1997 (operative May 

19,1997). 
See: 28 NJ.R. 4695(a), 29 NJ.R. 550(a). 

In (b )2, amended fonn references. 
Amended by R.l997 d378, effective September 15,1997. 
See: 29 N.J.R. 2742(a), 29 NJ.R. 4103(a). 

In (b)2 and (c)l, amended fonn designations and in (b)2 deleted fonn 
F-330A and F-340A. . 
Amended by R.1997 d.419, effective October6,1997. 
See: 29 NJ.R. 3406(a), 29 N.J.R. 4287(a). 

S:l3-4.5A 

In (j)l, inserted", or his or her superior within ... any such superior,"; 
in (j)li inserted", and there is no other person •.• property or business,"; 
and added (j)1ii. 
Amended by R.2000 d.l66, effective Aprill7, 2000. 
See: 31 NJ.R. 415l(a), 32 NJ.R. 1376(a). 

In (b )2, inserted a reference to Fonn No. F380. 
Amended by R.2000 d.413, effective October 16, 2000. 
See: 32 NJ.R. 2278(a), 32 N.J.R. 3783(a). 

In (j)l, substituted references to close relatives or household members 
for references to members of the immediate family, and added the 
second sentence; and deleted fonner (j)7. 
Amended by R.2003 d.363, effective September 15, 2003. 
See: 35 NJ.R. 2426(a), 35 N.J.R. 428l(a). 

In (b), added fonns F211, F212, F241, F242 and deleted fonn F240; 
deleted the revision dates of the referenced forms throughout. 
Amended by R.2003 d.385, effective October 6, 2003. 
See: 35 N.J.R. 2423(a), 35 N.J.R. 4713(a). 

In (h), added 3. 
Amended by R.2005 d.446, effective December 19, 2005. 
See: 37 NJ.R. 2747(a), 37 N.J.R. 4907(a). 

Added (h)lxxii. 

Case Notes 

Fonner N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.3 regarding conflict of interest valid. New 
Jersey State Plumbing Inspectors Assn., Inc. v. Sheehan, 163 N.J.Super. 
398, 394 A.2d 1244 (App.Div.1978), certiorari denied 79 N.J. 484, 401 
A.2d 239 (1979). 

Monetary penalty against builder for code violations was not reduced 
for fmancial hardship, but was reduced by half to secure prompt 
compliance. Bureau of Housing Inspection v. Regency Village 
Apartments, 95 NJ.A.R.2d (CAF) 37. 

Fraud and deceit while practicing as a licensed code enforcement 
official or inspector wammted license revocation. Regulatory Affairs v. 
Zieniuk, 95 N.J.A.R.2d (CAF) 15. 

Conflict of interest precluded employment as elevator inspector. · 
Kunz v. Department of Community Affilirs, 94 N.J.A.R.2d (CAF) 32. 

S:l3-4.5A Selection of private on-site inspection and plan 
review ageneies 

(a) Whenever a local governing body having jurisdiction 
elects to contract with a private onsite inspection and plan 
review agency to carry out the enforcement of one or more 
subcodes, as permitted by N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.14, the agency 
shall be selected in accordance with the provisions of this 
section. 

(b) Prior to the selection of an on-site inspection agency, 
the local enforcing agency shall notify each private on-site 
agency authorized by the Department to serve as a subcode 
official for the subcode(s) to be contracted. The notification, 
which shall specify the term of the proposed cOJ1tl'am;. shaJJ be 
delivered by certified mail, return receipt requested. The 
notice shall specify any local procedural requirements. 
including, but not limited to, staffing and response time 
requirements exceeding the minimum standards set forth in 
the code, with which the construction official and/or the 
governing body would expect a private on-site agency to 
comply in order to effectively enforce a subcode in 
accordance with the performance standards of the local 
enforcing agency. No other notice shall be required. 

23-69 Supp. 12-19-05 



S:23-4.SA 

I. The notice shall specifY that a written, sealed bid is 
requested, together with a qualification statement 
containing the information set forth in N.J.A.C. 5:23-
4.5A(d), shall identifY the subcode(s) for which a bid is 
requested, shall state the date and time by which bids and 
accompanying qualification statements must be submitted, 
which shall not be less than 30 days following the date of 
mailing of the request for bids, and shall state the name 
and address of the person to whom bids and accompanying 
qualification statements shall be mailed or delivered. 

2. All bids shall set forth the fees which the private on­
site agency proposes to charge for work done by it in the 
municipality. Such fees shall be expressed as a uniform 
percentage, by subcode, which shall not exceed I 00 
percent, of the fees charged, as of the date on which the 
bids are opened, by the Department when it serves as an 
enforcing agency, which fees are set forth at N.J.A.C. 5:23-
4.20. 

Supp. 12-19-05 23-70 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

3. The contract shall be awarded to the bidder that 
offers to charge the lowest percentage of the Department's 
fees and is determined by the governing body, after U 
consultation with the construction official, to be able to 
effectively enforce the subcode(s) for which the bid was 
submitted. 

4. The amounts to be charged by a private on-site 
agency awarded a contract pursuant to this section shall be 
the amounts set forth in N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.20 and/or 5:23-
12.6(a) and (b) as ofthe date ofthe opening of the bids, 
multiplied by the percentage set forth in the bid. Such 
amounts shall be in effect for the entire contract period and 
shall not be affected by any subsequent increase in the fees 
set forth in N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.20 or 5:23-12.6(a) and (b). 

Next Page is 23-73 


