MEDICAID ONLY

10:71-4.8

1. Child not living with parents due to institutional-
ization: If a physician has certified that the child’s duration
of stay in a Title XIX facility (or a combination of such
facilities) is expected to be 30 consecutive days or more,
such child shall be considered to be not living with his/her
parents at the time of such certification. In such cir-
cumstances, only the child’s own countable resources shall
be applied to the resource maximum for an individual.

2. Parental resource maximums (including steppar-
ents):

i.  One parent: The total value of countable re-
sources in excess of the source limit for an individual
(see N.J.A.C. 10:71-4.5) shall be applied toward the
eligible child’s resource maximum.

ii. Two parents: The total value of countable re-
sources in excess of the resource limit for a couple (see
N.JLLA.C. 10:71-4.5) shall be applied toward the eligible
child’s resource maximum.

3. More than one eligible child: If there is more than
one eligible child in the household, the total value of count-
able resources in excess of the appropriate parental maxi-
mum shall be equally divided among such children. In
cases of this nature, no part of the value of such resources
shall be allocated to ineligible children residing in the
household.

(f) Deeming resources of an alien’s sponsor: When the
sponsor of an alien is subject to deeming provisions (see
N.J.A.C. 10:71-5.7) any countable resources of the sponsor in
excess of the appropriate resource limit (the resource limit for
an individual or the resource limit for a couple if the sponsor
resides with his or her spouse) shall be considered to be
resources of the alien in addition to whatever resources the
alien has.

As amended, R.1983 d.373, effective September 6, 1983.
See: 15 NJ.R.999(b), 15 N.J.R. 1477(a).

Added, deeming resources of alien’s sponsor.
Amended by R.1985 d.474, effective September 16, 1985.
See: 17 NJ.R. 1525(a), 17 N.J.R. 2274(a).

Substantially amended.

Amended by R.1991 d.32, effective January 22, 1991.
See: 22 N.J.R. 7(a), 23 N.J.R. 215(b).

Added (c)1. Deleted statement regarding physician’s certification and
added text establishing resources counted when one member of a couple
is institutionalized.

Amended by R.2000 d.415, effective October 16, 2000.
See: 32 N.J.R. 2565(a), 32 N.J.R. 3844(a).
Substituted “beneficiary” for “recipient” throughout.

Case Notes

Federal Medicaid statute requiring that state’s methodology for
determining resource eligibility of medically needy person be no more
restrictive than for categorically needy person required exclusion of
husband’s individual retirement account from computation of wife’s
resources for purposes of determining eligibility. Mistrick v. Division of
Medical Assistance and Health Services, 299 N.J.Super. 76, 690 A.2d
651 (A.D.1997).

Custodial bank accounts of Medicaid applicant’s children were not
available to applicant or her husband and thus were not countable re-

New Jersey State Library

71-28.1

sources in determining applicant’s eligibility for the Nursing Home
Medicaid program for the year in question. L.A.S. v. Union County Div.
of Soc. Servs., OAL Dkt. No. HMA 1215-05, 2006 N.J. AGEN LEXIS
348, Initial Decision (April 26, 2006).

10:71-4.7 (Reserved)

R.1983 d.373, effective September 6, 1983.

See: 15 N.J.R. 999(b), 15 N.J.R. 1477(a).

Amended by R.1985 d.474, effective September 16, 1985.
See: 17 NJ.R. 1525(a), 17 N.J.R. 2274(a).

Other resources changed from “$600.00” to “$1,100” and the total
changed from “$1,600” to “$2,100.”

Emergency amendment, R.1990 d.424, effective July 30, 1990 (expires

September 28, 1990).

See: 22 N.J.R. 2604(a).

Revised resource transfer provisions based on Medicare Catastrophic
Coverage Act of 1988. Added new (a), recodifying (a)-(c) as (b)-(d), and
deleting old (c) on “excluded resources”. Added new (¢), recodifying old
(d)-(i) as (f)~(k). Added new (/).

Adopted concurrent proposal, R.1990 d.524, effective September 27,

1990.

See: 22 N.J.R. 2604(a), 22 N.J.R. 3372(b).

Provisions of emergency amendment R.1990 d.424 readopted without
change.

Amended by R.2000 d.415, effective October 16, 2000.
See: 32 N.J.R. 2565(a), 32 N.J.R. 3844(a).

In (d)2, substituted “Medical Review Team” for “Disability Review
Section™; in (i), substituted “beneficiaries” for “recipients”.

Amended by R.2001 d.199, effective June 18, 2001.
See: 32 N.J.R. 2021(a), 33 NJ.R. 2195(a).

In (a), rewrote the introductory paragraph; in (b), inserted “shall”
preceding “apply” in the introductory paragraph.
Petition for Rulemaking.

See: 39 NJ.R. 2157(a), 2660(a), 4453(a).
Petition for Rulemaking,
See: 42 NJ.R. 1434(a), 1918(a), 2645(a).
Repealed by R.2012 d.025, effective February 6, 2012,
See: 43 N.J.R. 804(a), 44 N.J.R. 230(a).
Section was “Transfer of resources™.

10:71-4.8 Institutional eligibility; resources of a couple

(a) In the determination of resource eligibility for an indi-
vidual requiring long-term care, the county welfare agency
shall establish the combined countable resources of a couple
as of the first period of continuous institutionalization begin-
ning on or after September 30, 1989. This determination shall
be made upon request for a resource assessment in accor-
dance with N.J.A.C. 10:71-4.9 or at the time of application
for Medicaid benefits. The total countable resources of the
couple shall include all resources owned by either member of
the couple individually or together. The county welfare
agency shall establish a share of the resources to be attributed
to the community spouse in accordance with this section. (No
community spouse’s share of resources may be established if
the institutionalized individual’s current continuous period of
institutionalization began at any time before September 30,
1989.)

1. The community spouse’s share of the couple’s
combined countable resources is based on the couple’s
countable resources as of the first moment of the first day
of the month of the current period of institutionalization
beginning on or after September 30, 1989 and shall not
exceed $113,640, as indexed annually in accordance with
42 U.S.C. §1396r-5(g) and published as a notice in the

Supp. 6-18-12



10:71-4.8

HUMAN SERVICES

New Jersey Register, and unless authorized in (a)4 or 5
below. The community spouse’s share of the couple’s
resources shall be the greater of:

i.  $22,728, as indexed annually in accordance with
42 U.S.C. §1396r-5(g) and published as a notice in the
New Jersey Register; or

ii. One half of the couple’s combined countable re-
sources.

2. In determining the resource eligibility of the institu-
tionalized spouse, the community spouse’s share of the
resources is subtracted from couple’s total combined re-
sources as of the first moment of the first day of the month
of application for Medicaid. If the remaining resources are
less than or equal to $2,000, the institutionalized spouse is
resource eligible. If the remaining resources exceed $2,000,
eligibility may not be established.

i.  In the case of an individual whose eligibility for
institutional care is determined in accordance with the
rules applicable for New Jersey Care (see N.J.A.C.
10:72), resource eligibility will exist when the couple’s
combined resources, less the community spouse’s share
of the resources, are equal to or less than $4,000.

3. To the extent that the community spouse’s share of
the combined resources are not already owned by the com-
munity spouse, the ownership of the community spouse’s
share of the resources must be transferred to the com-
munity spouse within 90 days of a determination of eligi-
bility for institutional Medicaid services. The CWA may
extend the transfer period if individual circumstances
warrant a longer period to affect the transfer. Resources not
transferred by the end of the 90-day period (or extension)
shall be counted in the determination of eligibility for the
institutionalized individual.

i.  Eligibility for the institutionalized individual
shall be established pending the actual transfer of the re-
sources if he or she attests, in writing, that he or she in-
tends to transfer the community spouse’s share of the re-
sources to the community spouse.

4. If a court of competent jurisdiction has ordered that
resources be transferred to the community spouse in an
amount higher than that authorized in (a)l above, the
higher court-ordered amount shall be recognized as the
community spouse’s share. Any resource transferred under
such a court order shall not be subject to the resource
transfer penalty described at N.J.A.C. 10:71-4.10.

5. If, in accordance with N.J.A.C. 10:71-5.7(d), addi-
tional resources have been authorized to be set aside for the
community spouse in order to provide for a sufficient
income maintenance level, such additional resources are
not subject to the limitation in this section on the commu-
nity spouse’s share of the couple’s combined resources.
Any resource transferred to the community spouse under
this provision shall not be subject to the resource transfer
provision described at N.J.A.C. 10:71-4.10.

Supp. 6-18-12

6. For purposes of this section, an institutionalized in-
dividual does not include any individual who is not likely
to remain in a Title XIX facility for a period of 30 con-
secutive days. If a physician has not certified that the in-
dividual’s stay in the facility is expected to be a period of
30 or more consecutive days, that individual’s Medicaid el-
igibility will be determined as if he or she continued to re-
side in the community until he or she has been in a Title
XIX facility (or a combination of Title XIX facilities) for a
period of 30 consecutive days.

7. For purposes of this section, a continuous period of
institutionalization means 30 consecutive days of institu-
tional care in a medical institution, and/or Medicaid funded
home and community-based waiver services. Continuity is
broken by absences from the institution for 30 consecutive
days or the non-receipt of home or community based ser-
vices for 30 consecutive days.

8. For purposes of determining the community spouse’s
share of the couple’s resources only, countable resources of
a couple shall include all resources not subject to exclusion
under N.J.A.C. 10:71-4.4, except that one automobile shall
be excluded without regard to the dollar limits set forth at
N.J.A.C. 10:71-4.4(b)2 and personal effects and household
goods shall be excluded without regard to the dollar limits
set forth at N.J.A.C. 10:71-4.4(b)3.

9. In determining retroactive eligibility (the three-
month period immediately preceding the month of applica-
tion) based on the first Medicaid application in a contin-
uous period of institutionalization, the community spouse’s
share of the resources shall be deducted from the couple’s
combined total resources. If the institutionalized individual
subsequently files another Medicaid application for the
same continuous period of institutionalization, retroactive
eligibility will be based on all resources actually owned by
the institutionalized individual.

New Rule, R.1991 d.32, effective January 22, 1991.
See: 22 N.J.R. 7(a), 23 N.J.R. 215(b).
Emergency Amendment, R.1992 d.84, effective January 22, 1992,

operative January 1, 1992, (expires March 22, 1992).

See: 24 NJ.R. 651(a).

Resource eligibility revised upward.

Adopted concurrent amendment, R.1992 d.191, effective April 20, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 651(a), 24 N.J.R. 1498(b).

Provisions of emergency amendment, R.1992 d.84, readopted without
change.

Amended by R.1993 d.402, effective August 16, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 1818(a), 25 N.J.R. 3786(a).

Amended by R.1994 d.428, effective August 15, 1994.
See: 26 N.J.R. 1754(a), 26 N.J.R. 3478(a).

Amended by R.1996 d.46, effective January 16, 1996.
See: 27 N.J.R. 3668(a), 28 N.J.R. 291(a).

In (a)1 and (a)1i resource eligibility revised upward.
Amended by R.1996 d.466, effective October 7, 1996.
See: 28 NLJ.R. 2779(c), 28 NJ.R. 4480(a).

Amended by R.2000 d.413, effective October 16, 2000.
See: 32 NJ.R. 2565(a), 32 N.J.R. 3844(a).

In (a), substituted “board of social services” for “welfare agency” in
the introductory paragraph, substituted “$84,120” for “$76,740” in the
introductory paragraph of 1, substituted “$16,824” for “$15,348” in 1i,
and substituted “CBOSS” for “CWA” throughout.

71-28.2



MEDICAID ONLY

10:71-4.9

Amended by R.2001 d.199, effective June 18, 2001.
See: 32 N.J.R. 2021(a), 33 N.J.R. 2195(a).

In (a), rewrote the third and fourth sentences of the introductory para-
graph, substituted “$84,120, as indexed annually in accordance with 42
U.S.C. § 1396r-5(g) and published as a notice in the New Jersey Reg-
ister, and” for “$74,740” in 1, and rewrote 1i.

Amended by R.2004 d.401, effective November 1, 2004.
See: 36 N.J.R. 922(b), 36 N.J.R. 4982(a).

In (a)1, substituted “$92,760” for “$84,120” in the introductory para-
graph, and substituted “$18,552” for “$16,824” in i.

Amended by R.2006 d.133, effective November 6, 2006.
See: 37 NJ.R. 3774(a), 37 N.LR. 4505(a), 38 NJ.R. 4712(a).

In (a)l, substituted “$95,100” for “$92,760"; and in (a)li, substituted
“$19,020” for “$18,552”.

Public Notice: Notice of Increase in the Community Spouse’s Share of a

Couple’s Combined Countable Resources.

See: 39 N.J.R. 705(b).
Public Notice: Notice of Increase in the Community Spouse’s Share of a

Couple’s Combined Countable Resources.

See: 40 N.J.R. 2295(a).
Public Notice: Notice of Increase in the Community Spouse’s Share of a

Couple’s Combined Countable Resources.

See: 41 N.J.R. 2507(a).
Amended by R.2012 d.025, effective February 6, 2012.
See: 43 N.J.R. 804(a), 44 N.J.R. 230(a).

In the introductory paragraph of (a), substituted “welfare agency” for
“board of social services” twice; in (a)l, substituted “$109,560” for
“$95,100”; in (a)li, substituted “$21,912” for “$19,020”; in (a)2i,
deleted “et seq.” following the N.J.A.C. reference; in the introductory
paragraph of (a)3, substituted “CWA” for “CBOSS”; and in (a)4 and
(a)s, updated the N.J.A.C. reference.

Administrative change.
See: 44 N.J.R. 1780(b).

Case Notes

Income subject to transfer from an institutionalized spouse was not
limited to the income he was earning as of the date when the couple’s
resources were allocated for purposes of determining Medicaid Only
eligibility. The other spousc’s minimum monthly maintenance needs
allowance deficit could be made up with the Social Security disability
income the institutionalized spouse was reasonably expected to earn
thereatter. N.E. v. New Jersey Div. of Med. Assistance & Health Servs.,
399 N.J. Super. 566, 945 A.2d 109, 2008 N.J. Super. LEXIS 78
(App.Div. 2008).

Claimant was not eligible for Medicaid Only Benefits for nursing
home costs because, as of the first day of the month of the current period
of institutionalization, his resources exceeded the maximum amount
permitted by N.J.A.C. 10:71-4.5(c). N.E. v. New Jersey Div. of Med.
Assistance & Health Servs., 399 N.J. Super. 566, 945 A.2d 109, 2008
N.J. Super. LEXIS 78 (App.Div. 2008).

Medicaid eligibility when one spouse is institutionalized and the other
is living in the community is determined by reference to total assets
owned by the couple at time of application, and amount of exempt assets
attributable to community spouse that was previously established at time
of institutionalization, plus $2,000 of assets attributable to institution-
alized spouse, constitute the asset cap that cannot be exceeded at the
time of application, unless that cap was increased to reflect a rise in the
consumer price index. A.K. v. Div. of Med. Assistance, 350 N.J.Super.
175,794 A.2d 835.

Federal Medicaid statute requiring that state’s methodology for deter-
mining resource eligibility of medically needy person be no more re-
strictive than for categorically needy person required exclusion of hus-
band’s individual retirement account from computation of wife’s re-
sources for purposes of determining eligibility. Mistrick v Division of
Medical Assistance and Health Services, 299 N.J.Super. 76, 690 A.2d
651 (A.D.1997).

Individual Retirement account (IRA) in husband’s name is includable
resource for purposes of determining a wife’s Medicaid eligibility when
wife enters a nursing home but husband remains in the community, de-

71-28.3

spite claim that the “no more restrictive” provision excluding IRAs from
supplemental security income (SSI) eligibility determinations controlled;
the “no more restrictive” provision was superseded by Medicare Cata-
strophic Coverage Act of 1988 (MCCA). Mistrick v. Division of Medi-
cal Assistance & Health Services, 154 N.J. 158, 712 A.2d 188 (N.J.
1998).

Resources of a Medicaid applicant’s ex-wife that were acquired dur-
ing the couple’s 23-year separation but prior to their Pennsylvania di-
vorce could not be considered as available to the applicant for the
purpose of determining the countable resources of the couple pursuant to
N.J.A.C. 10:71-4.8; the applicant’s rights to those resources were de-
termined by Pennsylvania law, and a valid Pennsylvania divorce decree
was issued indicating that the applicant had no legal rights to those re-
sources. S.P. v. DMAHS, OAL Dkt. No. HMA 10019-07, 2008 N.J.
AGEN LEXIS 304, Initial Decision (April 14, 2008).

Initial Decision (2007 N.J. AGEN LEXIS 189) adopted, which con-
cluded that in calculating the Community Spouse Resource Allowance,
repayments on home equity loans or lines of credit are not deductible as
a shelter expense unless there is a direct relationship to preserving the
marital home, such as when the loan proceeds are used for major repairs
or capital improvements necessary to protect the home. A.F. v. DMAHS,
OAL Dkt. No. HMA 12301-06, 2007 N.J. AGEN LEXIS 330, Final
Decision (May 24, 2007).

Custodial bank accounts of Medicaid applicant’s children were not
available to applicant or her husband and thus were not countable
resources in determining applicant’s eligibility for the Nursing Home
Medicaid program for the year in question. L.A.S. v. Union County Div.
of Soc. Servs., OAL Dkt. No. HMA 1215-05, 2006 N.J. AGEN LEXIS
348, Initial Decision (April 26, 2006).

Where trust property was described, in testimony, as the family home,
and under the Trust Agreement co-trustees could in their sole discretion
distribute all or any part of the trust principal reasonably necessary for
the Settlor’s care, support, and maintenance, and where a provision
requiring the trustee to take into account any funds that may be available
to the Settlor to meet those needs from any source other than the trust,
which would presumably include Medicaid funds, flew in the face of the
law and public policy, the applicant and his wife had resources in excess
of the maximum permitted under the regulation. J.C. v. DMAHS, OAL
Dkt. No. HMA 7550-05, 2006 N.J. AGEN LEXIS 349, Initial Decision
(April 25, 2006).

Spouse’s IRA must be included in calculation of institutionalized
spouse’s available resources for Medicaid eligibility determination. S.M.
v. Division of Medical Assistance and Health Services and Passaic
County Board of Social Services, 96 N.J.A.R.2d (DMA) 37.

Combined countable resources included unsecured promissory notes.
H.H. v. New Jersey Division of Medical Assistance and Health Services,
93 N.J.A.R.2d (DMA) 58.

Husband’s estate funds were available to pay wife’s nursing home
costs. L.S. v. Division of Medical Assistance and Health Services, 93
N.J.A.R2d (DMA) 7.

10:71-4.9 Resource assessment

(a) At the beginning of the first continuous period of insti-
tutionalization (beginning on or after September 30, 1989),
the institutionalized spouse or the community spouse (or a
representative of either spouse) may request an assessment of
the couple’s total countable resources. The purpose of the
assessment is to establish the community spouse’s share of
the couple’s total countable resources (see N.J.A.C. 10:71-
4.8(a)).

(b) The county welfare agency shall, upon a request for a
resource assessment, advise the requesting parties of the

Supp. 6-18-12



10:71-4.9

HUMAN SERVICES

documentation and verification necessary to make the
assessment. When the necessary documentation and verifica-
tion is not submitted to the county welfare agency in a timely
manner, the requesting parties shall be advised that the
resource assessment cannot be completed. Upon receipt of all
relevant documentation of resources from the couple the
county welfare agency shall establish the total countable
resources of the couple. The county welfare agency shall
notify both members of the couple of the total value assigned
to their combined countable resources and the community
spouse’s share of those resources. A copy of the notice shall
be retained at the county welfare agency.

1. The county shall complete the resource assessment
and notify the requesting parties of its results within 45
calendar days of the request unless third-party verification
has not been received by the county welfare agency or the
requesting parties request a delay.

(c) At the time of providing the couple with a copy of the
resource assessment, the county welfare agency shall advise
the couple that there is no immediate right to a fair hearing on
the county’s resource assessment, but that there will be an
opportunity to appeal the findings of the assessment when
and if the institutionalized spouse applies for Medicaid.

New Rule, R.1991 d.32, effective January 22, 1991.
See: 22 N.J.R. 7(a), 23 N.J.R. 215(b).
Amended by R.2000 d.415, effective October 16, 2000.
See: 32 N.J.R. 2565(a), 32 N.J.R. 3844(a).
In (b) and (c), substituted “board of social services” for “welfare
agency” throughout. i
Amended by R.2012 d.025, effective February 6, 2012.
See: 43 N.J.R. 804(a), 44 N.J.R, 230(a).
Substituted “welfare agency” for “board of social services” through-
out; and in (b)1, substituted “third-party” for “third party”.

10:71-4.10 Transfer of assets

(a) The provisions of this section shall apply, effective
June 18, 2001, only to persons who are receiving an institu-
tional level of services, including individuals who are receiv-
ing services under a 42 U.S.C. §1915(c) home and commu-
nity care waiver under Medicaid, or who are seeking that
level of service, and who have transferred assets on or after
August 11, 1993. An individual shall be ineligible for institu-
tional level services through the Medicaid program if he or
she (or his or her spouse) has disposed of assets at less than
fair market value at any time during or after the 60-month
period immediately before:

1. In the case of an individual who is already eligible
for Medicaid benefits, the date the individual becomes an
institutionalized individual; or

2. In the case of an individual not already eligible for
Medicaid benefits, the date the individual applies for Medi-
caid as an institutionalized individual.

(b) The following definitions shall apply to the transfer of
assets: '

1. Individual means:

Supp. 6-18-12

71-28.4

i.  The individual him or herself who is applying for
benefits;

ii. The individual’s spouse;

iii. A person, including a court or administrative
body, with legal authority to act in place of or on behalf
of the individual or the individual’s spouse;

iv. Any person including a court or administrative
body, acting at the direction or upon the request of the
individual or the individual’s spouse.

2. An institutionalized individual, for the purposes of
this chapter, is a person who is receiving care in a Medi-
caid certified nursing facility, intermediate care facility for
the mentally retarded (ICFMR), or a licensed special hos-
pital (Class C) or Title XIX psychiatric hospital (if under
the age of 21 or age 65 and over). For purposes of this
chapter, an institutionalized individual shall also include a
person seeking benefits under a home or community care
waiver program. An institutionalized individual shall not
include a person who is receiving care in an acute care
general hospital.

3. Assets shall include all income and resources of the
individual and of the individual’s spouse. Assets shall also
include income and resources which the individual or the
individual’s spouse is entitled to but does not receive be-
cause of action or inaction by the individual or the indi-
vidual’s spouse; or by any person, including a court or ad-
ministrative body with the legal authority to act in place of
or on behalf of the individual or the individual’s spouse; or
any person, including a court or administrative body, acting
at the direction of or upon the request of the individual or
the individual’s spouse. Examples of actions that would
cause income or resources not to be received shall include,
but shall not be limited to:

i.  Irrevocably waiving pension income;

ii. Waiving the right to receive an inheritance, in-
cluding spousal elective share pursuant to N.J.S.A. 3B:8-
10;

iii. Not accepting or accessing injury settlements;

iv. Tort settlements which are diverted by the defen-
dant into a trust or similar device to be held for the bene-
fit of an individual who is a plaintiff; and

v. Refusal to take legal action to obtain a court
ordered payment that is not being paid, such as child
support or alimony.

4. Resources, for the purpose of asset transfer, shall
include all resources, both included and excluded, in accor-
dance with the provisions of this chapter. For example, the
transfer of a home, even if it is serving as the individual’s
principal place of residence, shall be subject to the transfer
of assets provisions.



