NS

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-2.7

ii. Water supply, sewer, drainage, gas, soil, waste,
vent or similar piping;

ifi. Electrical wiring, other than wiring for a low
voltage communication system in a one- or two-family
dwelling; or

New Jersey State Library

Next Page is 23-9 23-8.1

iv. Mechanical or other work affecting public health
or general safety; or

7. Any work undertaken for the purpose of lead
abatement.

Supp. 4-21-03



e

N/

7

7150 . 515 )02

~—

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-2.14

Amended by R.1993 d.487, effective October 4, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 2159(a), 25 N.J.R. 4592(a).
Amended by R.1993 d.580, effective November 15, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 3692(a), 25 N.J.R. 5145(c).
Amended by R.1995 d.381, effective July 17, 1995.
See: 27 N.J.R. 970(a), 27 N.J.R. 2715(a).
Amended by R.1999 d.424, effective December 6, 1999.
See: 31 N.J.R. 2428(a), 31 N.J.R. 4001(c).
Substituted references to ordinary maintenance for references to
ordinary repairs throughout; and in (a), substituted a reference to
permit applications for a reference to applications.

Case Notes

Municipal order under zoning ordinance to remove sleeping trailers
and disconnect utilities used by a refinery repair crew proper exercise of
police power; action not preempted by Occupational Safety and Health
Act. Twp. of Greenwich v. Mobil Oil Corp., 504 F.Supp. 1275 (D.N.J.
1981).

5:23-2.8 Installation of equipment

When the installation, extension or alteration of mechani-
cal equipment, refrigeration, air conditioning or ventilating
apparatus, plumbing, gas piping, electric wiring, heating
system or any other equipment is specifically controlled by
the provisions of this chapter, it shall be unlawful to use
such equipment until a certificate of occupancy or certificate
of approval, as the case may be, has been issued therefor by
the construction official having jurisdiction. Use of elevator
devices shall be subject to N.J.A.C. 5:23-12.9.

Amended by R.1991 d.509, effective October 7, 1991.

See: 23 N.J.R. 2236(a), 23 N.J.R. 3001(a).
Stylistic changes.

Amended by R.1996 d.323, effective July 15, 1996, (operative January 1,
1997).

See: 28 N.J.R. 2112(a), 28 N.J.R. 3549(a).

5:23-2.9 Variations and exceptions

(a) No variations or exceptions from the requirements of
any subcode of these regulations may be made, except upon
the following findings:

1. That strict compliance with any specific subcode
provision, if required, would result in practical difficulty
to such owner; and

2. That the exception, if granted, will not jeopardize
the health, safety and welfare of intended occupants and
the public generally.

(b) Except as may be otherwise specified in this chapter,
no variations shall be granted from any of the requirements
of N.J.A.C. 5:23-2,4 or 5.

Amended by R.1996 d.236, effective May 20, 1996 (operative January 1,
1997).

See: 27 N.J.R. 4050(a), 28 N.J.R. 2586(a).
Added (b).

5:23-2.10 Applications for variations

(a) An application for a variation pursuant to this section
shall be filed in writing with the construction official and
shall state specifically:

23-9

1. A statement of the requirements of the subcode
from which a variation is sought;

2. A statement of the manner by which strict compli-
ance with said provisions would result in practical difficul-
ties;

3. A statement of the nature and extent of such
practical difficulties; and

4. A statement of feasible alternatives to the require-
ments of the subcode which would adequately protect the
health, safety and welfare of the occupants or intended
occupants and the public generally.

Administrative Correction to (a): Changed “set” to “state”.
See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b).

5:23-2.11 Review of variation applications

Within 20 business days next succeeding the receipt by the
construction official of the application, it shall be denied or
granted by written order stating the reasons therefor. The
application shall be deemed denied for purposes of appeal if
no decision is forthcoming within such 20-day period. Rec-
ords of all applications for variation, and actions taken
thereon shall be available for public inspection at the en-
forcing agency during normal business hours.

5:23-2.12 Final decision on variations

The appropriate subcode official(s) shall make the final
determination with respect to matters within their jurisdic-
tion. The construction official shall notify the applicant of
that determination. Whenever an application for a varia-
tion shall result in contradictory or inconsistent determina-
tions by different subcode officials having jurisdiction pursu-
ant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-3, the construction official shall rule as
to which subcode official’s determination shall be final, and
shall notify the applicant of that ruling. Whenever the
construction official shall be certified in a particular sub-
code, he may modify the determination of the subcode
official.

5:23-2.13 Authority to grant variations

The enforcing agency with plan review responsibility shall
have the sole authority to grant variations.

5:23-2.14 Construction permits—when required

(a) It shall be unlawful to construct, enlarge, repair,
renovate, alter, reconstruct or demolish a structure, or
change the use of a building or structure, or portion thereof,
or to install or alter any equipment for which provision is
made or the installation of which is regulated by this
chapter, or to undertake a project involving lead abatement
in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:17, without first filing an
application with the construction official, or the appropriate
subcode official where the construction involves only one
subcode, in writing and obtaining the required permit there-
for.

Supp. 8-19-02



5:23-2.14

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

1. Exception: No permit shall be required for ordinary
maintenance as defined in N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4 and 2.7.

(b) The following are exceptions from (a) above:

1. Ordinary maintenance as defined in N.J.A.C.
5:23-2.7 shall not require a permit or notice to the
enforcing agency;

2. Minor work as defined by N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.17A shall
require a permit. However, work may proceed, upon
notice to the enforcing agency, before the permit is
issued;

3. Emergency work not involving lead abatement, ex-
cept that a permit shall be applied for or notice given as
soon thereafter as is practicable, but not later than 72
hours thereafter.

4. Permit requirements for tents and membraned
structures shall be as set forth in N.JA.C.
5:23-3.14(b)23ii. A temporary greenhouse meeting the
criteria set forth in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.14(b)23ii(4) shall not
require a permit except as otherwise provided in N.J.A.C.
5:23-3.14(b)23ii(5).

5. Gas utility company shall not be required to obtain
a permit or give notice to the enforcing agency for
replacement of interior gas utility company-owned meter-
ing (meter and related appurtenances) by exterior gas
utility company owned-metering if the work is performed
by qualified employees of the gas utility company.

6. A permit shall not be required for a sign that meets
all of the following conditions; provided, however, that
the construction official shall have authority to require the
removal of any sign that creates an unsafe condition or
otherwise to require correction of any such condition:

i. It is supported by uprights or braces in or upon
the ground surface;

ii. It is not served by an electrical circuit directly
connected to thé sign;

iii. It is not greater than 25 square feet in surface
area (one side); and

iv. It is not more than six feet above the ground
(mounted height).

7. Lead abatement work performed on a steel struc-
ture or other superstructure or in a commercial building.

8. A permit shall not be required for garden type
utility sheds and similar structures, which are 100 square
feet or less in area, 10 feet or less in height and accessory
to buildings of Use Groups R-2, R-3 or R—4. Such
garden type utility sheds and similar structures are re-
quired to comply with N.J.A.C. 5:23-9.9.

9. A permit shall not be required for fences six feet or
less in height. This exception does not apply to barriers
surrounding public or private swimming pools.

Supp. 8-19-02

(c) An annual construction permit may be issued by the
construction official to educational, industrial, institutional,
mercantile, business and government facilities based upon
submission of the following in duplicate:

1. Identification of the facility and the buildings cov-
ered by the application for the annual permit.

2. Identification of the location within the facility
where the annual permit records will be maintained.

3. A listing of the names, titles and trade specialties of
the facility’s full-time maintenance staff.

4. The name of the person responsible for the mainte-
nance logs, job assignments and quality control.

5. A statement from the management of the facility
attesting that the maintenance staff performing work un-
der the annual permit are under the direct supervision of
a qualified individual, as set forth under N.J.A.C.
5:23-2.14(e)1, or are individually qualified in their respec-
tive trades.

i. Evidence of qualification shall be journeyman
status, civil service status, trade experience, trade school
certification, college degree, State licensure pursuant to
law or other appropriate evidence of competence.

ii. No person employed on the maintenance staff of
a facility shall be deemed to be qualified to engage in
lead abatement unless he or she has been certified by
the New Jersey Department of Health pursuant to
section 3 of P.L. 1993, ¢.288 (N.J.S.A. 26:20-3) (see
N.J.A.C. 8:62).

6. A statement from the management explaining their
procedures for providing training at Department seminars
on construction codes on a regular basis for at least one,
but not more than three, individuals per subcode.

7. A statement from the management explaining the
procedures of the applicant to ensure proper quality
control of the work performed under the annual permit.

8. Receipt of the required annual permit fee and
training registration fee.

(d) The Construction Official, upon review of the appli-
cation may issue or deny an annual construction permit in
whole or in part. The construction permit (Form F-170C)
shall state that the permit is an annual permit and indicate
the technical subcodes in which the facility is approved to do
work under the annual permit. A copy of the annual
permit shall be forwarded by the Construction Official to
the Department of Community Affairs Training Section
along with the appropriate training registration fee.

(e) Conditions of the annual permit are as follows:

23-10

\/}



A —

e’

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-2.14

1. The “annual permit” may be issued for building/fire
protection, electrical, mechanical or plumbing work or any
combination of those classifications of work, providing
that the individual responsible for work done under the
annual permit possesses knowledge as evidenced in accor-
dance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.14(c)5, in the technical work
classification for which the annual permit is sought.

i. An approved copy of the annual permit applica-
tion shall be kept at a facility’s maintenance office
within the municipality having jurisdiction for review by
the Construction Official and appropriate subcode offi-
cial. The Construction Official shall be notified of the
location of the facilities maintenance office.

2. The life of the annual construction permit shall be
limited to one year;

3. The facility shall maintain a construction log of all
work performed. The construction log shall contain the
date, a brief description and estimated or actual cost of
the project. This log shall be subject to a quarterly
inspection by the construction official or his authorized
representative. Any business record showing when and
where work was done and the extent of such work shall be
deemed to be a construction log: Applications for the
renewal of the “annual permit” shall be filed with the
Construction Official at least 60 days prior to the expira-
tion of the current annual permit. The facility applica-
tion shall make current the information previously submit-
ted to the Construction Official. The application for
renewal shall be accompanied by the established fee.

4. The annual permit covers all work subject to this
chapter done by the facility’s full-time maintenance staff,
but shall not include work performed by outside contract
even if the contractor is hired by the facility and is
working under direct supervision of the facility’s mainte-
nance staff. Work performed by outside contract shall be
subject to applicable UCC regulations and State Licen-
sure Law. '

5. A permanent work log, approved by the construc-
tion official, of all work done under the “annual permit”
must be maintained at a facilities maintenance office on
site or must be available at the time of the inspection
upon 24 hours notice of such inspection. The log must
contain the date, a brief description of the work, photo-
graphs for any work which was not inspected prior to
closing as set forth in (e)8 below, and the name of the
person supervising the work. The log shall be retained
for three years.

6. Architectural or engineering drawings, as required
by law for work done under the annual permit, shall be
prepared by a registered architect or licensed engineer as
defined by the statutory requirements of the professional
registration laws of this State and shall be kept perma-
nently on file and be made available to the Construction
Official and appropriate subcode official, for review upon
request.

7. The appropriate subcode official, at least two (2)
times a year, shall perform inspections of the facility for

23-11

which an annual permit has been issued. The maximum
time between inspections shall be a six month period.

8. Work that is normally inspected prior to closing
shall be ordered to be reopened by the facility upon
written notice from the Construction Official or appropri-
ate subcode official if he has reason to believe that a
violation is present. A photograph shall be taken of any
work intended to be enclosed without inspection.

9. Any work that is done under the supervision of the
facilities maintenance staff and under a regular construc-
tion permit shall be entered into the annual permit log.
The construction permit number shall be listed as a part
of the entry.

10. Training for annual permits shall be provided at
the seminars for code officials.

i. The facility shall provide a list of at least one, but
not more than three, individuals per subcode who are
required to complete five hours of continuing education
per year.

ii. The Department shall maintain the training rec-
ords for each annual permit. The annual permit shall
not be renewed unless the facility completes the train-
ing for each issued subcode.

ili. The Department shall notify the construction
official who issued the permit if the training has not
been completed.

11. Any changes to the annual construction permit
application shall be forwarded to the Construction Offi-
cial within 30 days of the change.

12. The following work is not permitted under an
annual permit:

i. Any work done on a facility that would result in a
change of use of a building or part of a building;

ii. New buildings and additions regardless of size;

iii. Renovation, alteration or reconstruction work
completed between inspection periods in an area in
excess of 5,000 square feet per building;

iv. Any work done on a facility that would result in
an increase to the area of a building;

v. The installation or alteration of a sprinkler sys-
tem;

vi. Any work that affects the required means of
egress;

vii. Any modification work, other than routine
maintenance, that affects life safety systems, such as,
but not limited to:

(1) Emergency lighting systems;

(2) Smoke and heat detection systems;
(3) Stand-by generator systems;

(4) Emergency smoke evacuation systems.

viii. Any work which would disturb asbestos and
require a permit to perform.

Supp. 8-19-02



5:23-2.14

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

(f) Construction requirements for commercial farm build-
ings shall be as set forth in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.2(d).

As amended, R.1981 d.462, eff. December 7, 1981.
See: 13 N.J.R. 390(a), 13 N.J.R. 885(d).
(c)1i: added “under the control and supervision of a person”; (c)liii:
added “any business construction log.”
Amended by R.1985 d.351 effective July 15, 1985.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1029(a), 17 N.J.R. 1756(b).
Section substantially amended.
Amended by R.1986 d.213, effective June 16, 1986.
See: 17 N.J.R. 2490(a), 18 N.J.R. 1266(a).
Subsection (e) substantially amended.
Administrative - Correction: “facility’s” changed from “facilities”
throughout.
See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b).
Amended by R.1990 d.558, effective November 19, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 1969(b), 22 N.J.R. 3483(a).
Conditional exemption for hoophouses or polyhouses added.
Amended by R.1991 d.60, effective February 19, 1991.
See: 22 N.J.R. 3609(a), 23 N.J.R. 405(b).
Gas utilities exempt from permit and notice requirements.
Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a).
Mechanical work added to (e)1.
Amended by R.1992 d.230, effective June 1, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 168(a), 24 N.J.R. 2052(a).
Form numbers changed in (d).
Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a).
Amended by R.1995 d.381, effective July 17, 1995.
See: 27 N.J.R. 970(a), 27 N.J.R. 2715(a).
- Amended by R.1995 d.475, effective September 5, 1995 (operative
January 1, 1996).
See: 27 N.J.R. 1716(a), 27 N.J.R. 3325(a).
Rewrote (c)6 and (¢)10.
Amended by R.1996 d.297, effective July 1, 1996 (operative October 1,
1996).
See: 28 N.J.R. 1586(b), 28 N.J.R. 3301(a).
In (b) added exception for signs.
Amended by R.1997 d.302, effective July 21, 1997 (operative September
24, 1997).
See: 29 N.J.R. 2202(a), 29 N.J.R. 3242(b).
Added (b)7.
Amended by R.1998 d.28, effective January 5, 1998.
See: 29 N.J.R. 3603(a), 30 N.J.R. 129(a).
Rewrote (a); added (a)l stating exception; amended (e)4 and (e)12iii.
Administrative change.
See: 31 N.J.R. 135(b).
Amended by R.1999 d.424, effective December 6, 1999.
See: 31 N.J.R. 2428(a), 31 N.J.R. 4001(c).
In (a)l and (b)1, substituted references to ordinary maintenance for
references to ordinary repairs.
Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April 17, 2000.
See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a).
In (b), added 8 and 9.
Administrative correction.
See: 34 N.J.R. 2965(a).

5:23-2.15 Construction permits—application

(a) The application for a permit shall be submitted on the
standard Construction Permit Application form prescribed
by the Commissioner at N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.5(b)2 and shall be
accompanied by the required fee, as provided for in this
subchapter and N.J.A.C. 5:23-4. The application shall con-
tain a general description of the proposed work, its location,
the use and occupancy of all parts of the building or
structure and all portions of the site or lot not covered by
the building or structure, and such additional information as
may be required by the construction official, which shall
include, but not be limited to, the following:

Supp. 8-19-02

23-12

1. The name and address of the owner: Where the
owner is not a resident of the State, he shall designate a

. resident as agent for the purpose of service of any notices

or orders which may be necessary. Such address shall not
be limited to a post office box, but shall specify a physical
location where such owner or agent may be found during
normal business hours. Where the owner is a corpora-
tion, partnership or other business entity, the application
shall indicate the names and addresses of the officers, or
other responsible persons upon whom service may be
made;

2. The street address and lot and block number of the
property upon which the building or structure is proposed
to be erected;

3. A description of the proposed work, including the
use group classification, proposed construction type, lot
ground coverage in square feet, total floor area in square
feet, total building or structure volume in cubic feet, the
total number of plumbing fixtures, the total number of
electrical fixtures, outlets and major appliances, a descrip-
tion of the type of heating system, the source of water
supply, the mode of sanitary waste disposal and a listing
of any special, unusual or hazardous facilities proposed
for inclusion in the building or structure;

4. The estimated cost of the work for which a permit
is sought, including but not limited to building construc-
tion, on-site construction, and all integral equipment,
built-in furnishings and finishes. Where any material or
labor proposed for installation in the building or structure
is furnished or provided at no cost, its normal or usual
cost shall be included in the estimated cost;

5. A statement that all required State, county and
local prior approvals have been given, including such
certification as the construction official may require;

6. For Class I structures, a list of all materials and
work requiring special inspections, and a list of agencies,

qualified licensed professionals or firms intended to be

retained for conducting those inspections in accordance
with the requirements of the building subcode; °

7. 1If the work involves lead abatement, the applicant
shall provide the following:

i. A copy of the scope of work which shall describe
precisely the location and extent of the work;

ii. A sketch plan showing the locations where abate-
ment work is to be performed and showing emergency
egress routes for any occupants to be in the building
during abatement;

ili. A record of all materials to be used for all
phases of the job, including encapsulants, enclosures,
containment materials and replacement components, as
appropriate;

VAR
.



L

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-2.15

iv. A copy of the lead evaluation report, if any has
been done, prepared by a business firm certified by the
Department pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:17 to do lead evalu-
ation; and

v. The degree to which any lead hazard identified in
any report prepared by a lead evaluation firm certified
by the Department will be abated; and

8. If the work involves reconstruction, an identifica-
tion of the work area, except where plans are filed with
the application, in which case the work area shall be
delineated on the plans.

(b) In addition, the following information shall be re-
quired on any application for a construction permit when
such information is available, but not later than the com-
mencement of work.

1. The names and addresses of all contractors en-
gaged or planned for engagement by the owner in the
execution of the work.

i. A current validated State builder registration card
shall be shown by the contractor and the registration
number of the contractor shall be recorded on the
permit, pursuant to the New Home Warranty and
Builder’s Registration Act (N.J.S.A. 46:3B-1 et seq.), if
the project is a one or two family dwelling, condomini-
um or cooperative, unless it is to be built in whole or in
part by an owner, in which case an affidavit shall be
filed by the owner on a form prescribed by the Depart-
ment of Community Affairs, in which he acknowledges
that work done by him, or by a subcontractor working
under his supervision, is not covered under the New
Home Warranty and Builders’ Registration Act and
states that he will disclose this information to any
person purchasing the property from him within 10
years of the date of issuance of a certificate of occupan-

cy.

2. The name and license number of the contractor or
subcontractor for plumbing and for electrical work where
such work is proposed.

i. Plumbing and electrical work shall not be under-
taken except by persons licensed to perform such work
pursuant to law, except in the case of a single family
homeowner on his own dwelling.

Next Page is 23-17

23-13

ii. The seal and signature of the licensed plumbing
and electrical contractor shall be affixed to the corre-
sponding subcode application form.

3. The name and address of the responsible person
who will be in charge of the work and who is responsible
to the owner for ensuring that all work is installed and
completed in conformity with the regulations. The per-
son may be the design architect or engineer, the contrac-
tor or a third party acceptable to the construction official.

4. If the work involves lead abatement, one of the
following shall be supplied:

i. The name and Departrhent certification number
issued pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:17 of any business firm
undertaking the lead abatement; or

ii. If the work is to be done by employees of the
owner of the property, the name and New Jersey
Department of Health certification number issued pur-
suant to N.J.A.C. 8:62 of each such employee; or

iii. If the work is to be done on an owner-occupied
single family dwelling, a certification by the owner
stating that he or she owns and occupies the property
as a principal place of residence, will be performing the
abatement work, and has received the written informa-
tion for homeowners prepared by the Department ex-
plaining the danger of improper lead abatement, proce-
dures for conducting safe lead abatement, and the
availability of certified lead abatement contractors or of
any available training for homeowners.

5. In the event of any change of contractor or person
in charge of work under (b)l, 2, 3 and 4 above, such
change shall be filed as an amendment to the application.

(c) A separate application and permit shall be required
for each building.

(d) Application for a permit shall be made by the owner,
or his agent, a licensed engineer, architect or plumbing,
electrical or other contractor employed in connection with
the proposed work. If the application is by a person other
than the owner in fee, it shall be accompanied by an
affidavit of the owner or the authorized person making the
application, that the proposed work is authorized by the
owner in fee, and that the applicant is authorized to make
such application. All issued permits shall remain the prop-
erty of the owner even if the application was made by a
contractor or authorized agent.

Supp. 8-19-02



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-2.15

(e) Plans, plan review, plan approval:

1. Plans and specifications: The application for the
permit shall be accompanied by no fewer than two copies
of specifications and of plans drawn to scale, with suffi-
cient clarity and detail dimensions to show the nature and
character of the work to be performed. Plans submitted
shall only be required to show such detail and include
such information as shall be reasonably necessary to
assure compliance with the requirements of the code and
these regulations. When quality of materials is essential
for conformity to the regulations, specific information
shall be given to establish such quality; and this code
shall not be cited, or the term “legal” or its equivalent be
used, as a substitute for specific information.

i. Site diagram: There shall also be filed a site plan
showing to scale the size and location of all the new
construction and all existing structures on the site,
distances from lot lines and the established street
grades; accessible route(s) for buildings required by
N.J.A.C. 5:23-7.1 to be accessible; and it shall be
drawn in accordance with an accurate boundary line
survey. In the case of demolition, the site plan shall
show all construction to be demolished and the location
and size of all existing structures and constructlon that
are to remain on the site or plot.

ii. Building plans and specifications shall contain:
Foundation, floor, roof and structural plans; door,
window and finish schedules; sections, details, connec-
tions and material designations.

iii. Electrical plans and specifications shall contain:
Floor and ceiling plans; lighting, receptacles, motors
and equipment; service entry location, line diagram
and wire, conduit and breaker sizes.

iv. Plumbing plans and specifications shall contain:
Floor plan; fixtures, pipe sizes and other equipment
and materials; isometric with pipe sizes, fixture sched-
ule and sewage disposal.

v. Mechanical plans and specifications shall contain:

Floor or ceiling plans; equipment, distribution location,
size and flow; location of dampers and safeguards; and
all materials.

vi. Engineering details and specifications: The con-
struction official and appropriate subcode official may
require adequate details of structural, mechanical,
plumbing and electrical work, including computations,
stress diagrams and other essential technical data to be
filed. All engineering plans and computations shall
bear the seal and signature of the licensed engineer or
registered architect responsible for the design. Plans
for buildings shall indicate how required structural and
fire-resistance rating will be maintained for pen-
etrations made for electrical, mechanical, plumbing and
communication conduits, pipes and systems.

(1) Plumbing plans for class III structures may be
prepared by persons licensed pursuant to “The Mas-

23-17

ter Plumber Licensing Act”, N.J.S.A. 45:14C-1 et
seq. Electrical plans for class Il structures may be
prepared by persons licensed pursuant to “The Elec-
trical Contractors Licensing Act”, N.J.S.A. 45:5A-1
et seq.;

(2) Whenever the licensing board pursuant to ei-
ther of the above Acts shall provide for a seal
evidencing that the holder is licensed, such shall be
acceptable to the enforcing agency in lieu of affidavit;

(3) Mechanical plans for class III structures may
be prepared by mechanical contractors.

vii. Work area: For reconstruction work in an exist-
ing structure, the work area shall be clearly delineated
on the plans.

viii. Architect’s or engineer’s seal: The seal and
signature of the registered architect or licensed engi-
-neer who prepared the plans shall be affixed to each
sheet of each copy of the plans submitted and on the
first or title sheet of the specifications and any addition-
al supportive information submitted. The construction
official shall waive the requirement for sealed plans in
the case of a single family home owner who had
prepared his own plans for the construction, alteration
or repair of a structure used or intended to be used
exclusively as his private residence, and to be construct-
ed by himself, providing that the owner shall submit an
affidavit attesting to the fact that he has prepared the
plans and provided further that said plans are in the
opinion of the construction official, and appropriate
subcode official, legible and complete for purposes of
ensuring compliance with the regulations.

ix. The construction official upon the advice of the
appropriate subcode official may waive the requirement
for plans when the work is of a minor nature.

x. Building, electrical, plumbing and mechanical
work required to be shown may be shown on a single
set of plans or a single drawmg so long as the drawings
are clear and legible.

2. Examination of plans: All plans submitted and any
amendments thereto accompanied by the required docu-
mentation and application, and upon payment of the fee
established by the enforcing agency, shall be numbered,
docketed and examined promptly after their submission
for compliance with the provisions of the regulations.

3. Plan review:

i. Department or other State agency review: When
a review and release of plans by the Department or
other State agency designated by the Department pur-
suant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-3 is required, the owner or agent
of the owner shall file an application for construction
plan release for each project, along with three sets of
plans, specifications and such other supporting informa-
tion as the Department or other designated reviewing
agency may require on forms obtained from the De-
partment or such reviewing agency. The plans, specifi-
cations and other supporting information shall conform
to the requirements of (&) above.

Supp. 1-5-98



5:23-2.15

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 1-5-98

(1) Release of plans: Plans complying with the
provisions of the regulations shall be released by the
department and written notice of approval shall be
given the applicant promptly and no later than 20
business days after the submission thereof. Plans
failing to comply with the provisions of the code shall
be rejected and written notice of rejection, stating the
ground of rejection, shall be given the applicant
promptly and not later than 20 business days after
the submission thereof. Whenever plans have been
rejected and are thereafter revised and resubmitted
to meet stated grounds of rejection, the revised plan
shall be approved if they meet the stated grounds of
rejection; and written notice of approval or written
notice of rejection stating the grounds of rejection
shall be given the applicant promptly and not later
than seven business days after the resubmission
thereof. (Exception: The Department shall issue a
plan release for prototype plans for which a “proto-
type or master plan” has been previously released in
the same municipality, within three business days
from application.)

(2) Endorsement of released plans: All plans and
amendments thereto, when approved by the depart-
ment, shall be stamped or endorsed “released”, fol-
lowed by a notation of the date of plan release. One
set of such released plans shall be retained by the
department, two sets of such released plans shall be
submitted to the local enforcing agency with the
application for construction permit as herein provid-
ed. :

(3) Partial filing: When circumstances require, a
project may be filed in part (that is, footings, struc-
tural, electrical, plumbing, and so forth). Each partial
submittal shall include sufficient detail to assure that
the proposed portion of work complies with the
regulations. A plan “release” for such a portion of
work shall be issued without prejudice as to whether
a “release” shall be issued for the entire project.

(4) Prototype or master plan filing: Designs re-

peatedly used at different locations may be designat-

ed as “prototype or master plans” and filed as fol-
lows: On initial application, one additional complete
set of repeated portions of the project, with as many
variations as can be shown on the plans, may be
submitted along with a request for prototype or
master plan filing. Subsequent submittals shall con-
sist of at least a plot plan which is signed and sealed
by a registered architect or licensed professional en-
gineer, including utilities, exterior elevations of the
specific building, and the prototype or master plan
file identification number. In addition, a schematic
or sketch plan that clearly shows the floor plan
arrangement, and any necessary mechanical, electri-
cal and plumbing information not clearly shown in
the prototype plan or on the subcode sections, must
be submitted.

23-18

(5) Construction permits: Owners and their agents
shall not apply to a local enforcing agency for a
construction permit for any building or structure for
which a department plan review and release is re-

quired by NJ.A.C. 5:23-3, unless such review and .

release has been applied for and received by the
applicant as evidenced by presentation of released
plans to the local enforcing agency.

ii. Local enforcing agency plan review: Where a
Department or other State plan review is not required
by the regulations, an applicant for a construction
permit shall be deemed to have applied for a local
enforcing agency plan review by filing an application for
a construction permit.

(1) When the plans submitted with an application
for a construction permit or amendment thereto are
accompanied by plans which have been released by
the department or other designated agency pursuant
to the regulations, then further municipal plan review
and fee therefor shall not be required. Release of
the plans by the department shall not prevent enforc-
ing agency officials from thereafter requiring correc-
tion of any errors in said plans or from issuing a stop
work order when in violation of the regulations. In
such case the enforcing agency shall notify the de-
partment;

(2) Whete a design is used repeatedly at different
locations, the plans attached to the first application
for the construction permit may be designated as a
“prototype or master plan”. These plans may include
as many variations as can be shown. Subsequent
submittals shall consist of a plot plan which is signed
and sealed by a registered architect or professional
engineer, including utilities, exterior elevations, and a
reference to the prototype plan by application or
permit number. In addition, a schematic or sketch
plan that clearly shows the floor plan arrangement,
and any necessary mechanical, electrical and plumb-
ing information not clearly shown in the prototype
plan or on the subcode sections, must be submitted;

iii. Validity of plan release or prototype approval:
The released plans or prototype approval (Department
or local) shall be valid for the purposes of applying for
a construction permit until six months after the opera-
tive date of the next edition of the code, as set forth in
N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.6(b).

iv. Time limitation of application: An application
for a permit for any proposed work shall be deemed to
have been abandoned six months after date of filing,
unless such application has been diligently prosecuted
or a permit shall have been issued; except that for
reasonable cause, the construction official may grant

" one or more extensions of time for additional periods

not exceeding 90 days each.

N/

g i/



N

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-2.16

,v. Amendments to application: Amendments to an
application, plan or other records accompanying the
same may be filed at any time; such amendments shall
be deemed part of the original application and shall, if
approved, be filed therewith. If the amendment in-
volves a substantial deviation from the original applica-
tion, a new affidavit of consent shall be required. If a
Department plan review was required originally, the
enforcing agency shall not permit an amendment to an
application unless the amendment has been released by
the Department.

vi. . Building systems: Structural, electrical and me-
chanical designs performed and certified by licensed
architects or engineers need not be checked in detail by
the staff of the enforcing agency, but shall remain as
the responsibility of the professional certifying such
design.

vii. A schematic or sketch plan, when required pur-
suant to this subsection, shall not be deemed to be a
construction copy of a plan and shall therefore not be
required to be signed or sealed by a registered architect
or licensed professional engineer.

Amended by R.1985 d.352, effective July 15, 1985.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1031(a), 17 N.J.R. 1758(a).

(b)1i: deleted text “The registration number of the contractor”, and
added “A current validated . .. contractor and the”.
Amended by R.1985 d.479, effective September 16, 1985.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1462(a), 17 N.J.R. 2248(b).

(b)2ii added. (d) text added “All issued permits ...”.
Administrative Correction: Cleaned up typographical errors.
See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b).

Amended by R.1992 d.244, effective June 15, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 1147(a), 24 N.J.R. 2243(a).

Text added at (a)6 on Class I structure.
Amended by R.1993 d.353, effective July 19, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 1629(a), 25 N.J.R. 3147(a).
Amended by R.1995 d.381, effective July 17, 1995.
See: 27 N.J.R. 970(a), 27 N.J.R. 2715(a).
Amended by R.1995 d.544, effective October 16, 1995.
See: 27 N.JI.R. 2827(a), 27 N.J.R. 3933(a).
Amended by R.1997 d.304, effective July 21, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 2204(a), 29 N.J.R. 3248(a).

In (e)1, substituted “no fewer” for “no less”; and in (e)li, inserted
reference to-accessible routes.

Amended by R.1998 d.28, effective January 5, 1998.
See: 29 N.J.R. 3603(a), 30 N.J.R. 129(a).
Amended (a)6, (a)7v and (e)3v; inserted (a)8 and (e)1vii.

Case Notes

Zoning permit may be required pursuant to Municipal Land Use Law
but not Uniform Construction Code Act. Acqua Development Corp. v.
Township of Holmdel, 287 N.J.Super. 578, 671 A.2d 636 (L.1995).

Compliance with former N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.5 requirements for permit
to non-contractor owner to perform repairs. Winn v. Margate City,
204 N.J.Super. 114, 497 A.2d 928 (Law Div.1985).

Requirement of architect’s or engineer’s seal on plans does not
broaden scope of engineering practice into architecture; engineer’s
plan limitations. State Board of Architects v. North, 197 N.J.Super.
349, 484 A.2d 1297 (Ch.Div.1984).

Prior-approval rule discussion; zoning matters involved in construc-
tion must be resolved before issuance of permits. Bell v. Twp. of Bass
River, 196 N.J.Super. 304, 482 A.2d 208 (Law Div.1984).

23-19

Construction permit application and fee requirements under former
NJ.A.C. 5:23-2.5; municipal requirement for payment of property
taxes before issuance of permit invalid as preempted by legislation.
Home Builders League of South Jersey, Inc. v. Evesham Twp., 174
N.J.Super. 252, 416 A.2d 81 (Law Div.1980).

Construction permit applicant must provide assurances that prior
approvals obtained. Riggins v. Pinelands Commission, 8 N.J.A.R. 441
(1985).

5:23-2.16 Construction permits—procedure

(a) Action on application: The construction official or
the appropriate subcode official in the case of construction
involving only one trade or subcode, shall examine or cause
to be examined all applications for permits and amendments
thereto, and approve or deny in whole or in part the
application, within 20 business days. If the application is
denied in whole or in part, the enforcing agency shall set
forth the reasons therefor in writing. If an enforcing agency
fails to grant, in whole or in part, or deny an application
within 20 business days, such failure shall be deemed a
denial of the application for purposes of an appeal to the
Construction Board of Appeals, unless such period of time
has been extended with the consent of the applicant.

1. Exception: The construction official shall issue a
permit for prototype plans for which a “prototype or
master plan” permit has been previously issued in the
same municipality, within three business days from appli-
cation.

(b) Suspension of permit: Any permit issued shall be-
come invalid if the authorized work is not commenced
within 12 months after issuance of the permit, or if the
authorized work is suspended or abandoned for a period of
six months after the time of commencing the work.

(c) Previous approvals: The rules shall not require
changes in the plans, construction or designated use of a
building for which a lawful permit has been heretofore
issued or otherwise lawfully authorized, and the construction
of which shall have been actively prosecuted within six
months after the operative date of the rules and completed
with dispatch. This six months provision shall also apply to
subsequent amendments.

(d) Signature to permit: The construction official shall
attach his signature to every permit; or he may authorize a
subordinate to affix such signature thereto. By doing so he
shall certify that each responsible subcode official shall have
reviewed and approved the application for permit.

(e) Approved plans: The construction official shall stamp
or endorse in writing both sets of corrected plans approved,
and one set of such approved plans shall be retained by him
and the other set shall be kept at the building site, open to
inspection of the construction official or his authorized
representative at all reasonable times.

(f) Revocation of permits: The construction official may
revoke a permit or approval issued under the provisions of

Supp. 1-5-98



5:23-2.16

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

this code in case of any false statement or misrepresentation
of fact in the application or on the plans on which the
permit or approval was based.

(g) Approval of part: The construction official shall issue
a permit for the construction of foundations or any other
part of a building or structure before the entire plans and
specifications for the whole building or structure have been
submitted, provided adequate information and detailed
statements have been filed complying with all the pertinent
requirements of this code. The holder of such permit for
the foundations or other part of a building or structure shall
proceed at his own risk with the building operation and
without assurance that a permit for the entire structure will
be granted.

(h) Posting of permit: A true copy of the construction
permit shall be kept on the site of operations open to
inspection during the entire time of prosecution of the work
and until the completion of the same.

(i) Notice of start: At least 24 hours notice of start of
work under a construction permit shall be given to the
construction official.

(j) Conditions of permit: The issuance of the construc-
tion permit shall be conditioned upon the following:

1. The payment of appropriate fees;

2. That work will conform to the approved application,
plans and specifications for which the permit has been
issued including prior approvals and any approved amend-
ments thereto;

3. That the permit is a license to proceed with the work
and shall not be construed as authority to violate, cancel
or set aside any of the provisions of the regulations;

4, That the owner, his agent, contractor or other em-
ployees will assist the enforcing agency in its inspection
work, if requested.

(k) Upon request of the local health department, the
construction official shall supply copies of permits issued for
lead abatement work.

Amended by R.1993 d.420, effective September 7, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 2158(a), 25 N.J.R. 4072(a).
Amended by R.1995 d.381, effective July 17, 1995.
See: 27 N.J.R. 970(a), 27 N.J.R. 2715(a).
Amended by R.1995 d.544, effective October 16, 1995.
See: 27 N.J.R. 2827(a), 27 N.J.R. 3933(a).
Amended by R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a).
Amended by R.1998 d.36, effective January 5, 1998.
See: 29 N.J.R. 4214(a), 30 N.J.R. 193(a).

Deleted (k); recodified existing (/) as (k).

Case Notes

Construction permit could be voided by developer suspending con-
struction for period of more than six months. Palatine I v. Planning
Bd. of Tp. of Montville, 133 N.J. 546, 628 A.2d 321 (1993).

Supp. 1-5-98

5:23-2.17 Demolition or removal of structures; abandoned
wells

(a) Service connections: Before a structure can be de-
molished or removed, the owner or agent shall notify all
utilities having service connections within the structure, such
as water, electric, gas, sewer and other connections. A
permit to demolish or remove a structure shall not be issued
until releases are obtained from all utilities that provided
service to the property, stating that their respective service
connections and appurtenant equipment, such as meters and
regulators, have been removed or sealed or plugged in a
safe manner.

(b) Abandoned wells:

1. In the event that there is a well on the property that
has been abandoned, or that will be abandoned in con-
junction with the proposed demolition, a permit to demol-
ish or remove a structure on that property shall not be
issued until a certification has been obtained from a well
driller licensed by the Department of Environmental Pro-
tection indicating that the well has been sealed in accor-
dance with N.J.A.C. 7:9-9. If such certification is not
presented within 15 days of the application for the permit,
the construction official shall give notice of the absence of
such certification to the Bureau of Water Allocation,
Department of Environmental Protection, PO Box 029,
Trenton, NJ 08625-0029.

2. Notice shall also be given by the construction official
to the Bureau of Water Allocation in the event of any
demolition activity found to have been undertaken with-
out a permit at a building or premises currently or
previously served by a well and in any other case in which
no permit application for demolition has been made but
the construction official becomes aware that a well has
been, or is about to be, abandoned without having been
sealed by a licensed well driller.

(c) Notice to adjoining owners: Only when written notice
has been given by the applicant to the owners of adjoining
lots and to the owners of wired or other facilities, of which
the temporary removal may be necessitated by the proposed
work, shall a permit be granted for the demolition or
removal of a building or structure.

(d) Lot regulation: Whenever a structure is demolished
or removed, the premises shall be maintained free from all
unsafe or hazardous conditions by the proper regulation of
the lot, restoration of established grades and the erection of
the necessary retaining walls and fences in accordance with
the provisions of the appropriate subcodes.

(e) Asbestos abatement: Before a structure can be de-
molished or removed, the owner or agent shall document
that the requirements of USEPA 40 CFR 61 subpart M
have been or shall be met. A permit to demolish or remove
the structure shall not be issued until the owner or agent
notifies the enforcing agency that all friable asbestos or
asbestos-containing material that will become friable during
demolition or removal has been or will be properly abated
prior to demolition.

23-20

NS

_J

J
s



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-2.17A

Amended by R.1993 d.198, effective June 7, 1993.
See: 24 N.J.R. 1422(a), 25 N.J.R. 2519(b).
Amended by R.1993 d.420, effective September 7, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 2158(a), 25 N.J.R. 4072(a).
Amended by R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a).
Amended by R.1998 d.36, effective January 5, 1998.
See: 29 N.T.R. 4214(a), 30 N.J.R. 193(a).
Added (b); and recodified existing (b) through (d) as (c) through (e).

5:23-2.17A Minor work

(a) The issuance of a permit shall not be required before
minor work may proceed. The owner, or an architect or
contractor acting on behalf of the owner, shall, however,
provide notice of the work to the enforcing agency before
work begins.

(b) Notice of work; application:

1. Notice of minor work shall be a personal or tele-
phoned oral notice before work commences. This oral
notice shall be provided to the enforcing agency between
9:00 A.M. and 5:00 P.M., Monday through Friday, except
holidays. In those cases where the local enforcing agency
is not open and available to receive notice at those times
then notice shall be provided to the municipal clerk;

2. In addition to oral notice, the owner or his agent
shall be required to file an application. The completed
application with the fee shall be delivered in person or by
mail to the enforcing agency, within five business days
from the date of the oral notice.

(¢) Minor work:
1. Minor work shall mean and include:

i. The construction or total replacement of any porch
or stoop which does not provide structural support for
any roof or portion of a building;

ii. Renovation or alteration work in an existing one
or two-family dwelling, provided that no primary struc-
tural members are altered in any way, and further
provided that the work does not constitute reconstruc-
tion; and

iii. The removal and replacement of more than 25
percent of the exterior siding of a one or two-family
dwelling;

2. Minor work shall also mean and include the re-
placement of any existing plumbing piping work with new
and approved material of like capacity; the installation of
drinking fountains and condensate drains in existing struc-
tures; the replacement of existing low pressure hot water
heaters with new ones of like capacity; and the new
installation of lavatories, water closets, tubs, showers,
washers or dishwashers, and garbage disposers in existing
space of one and two-family dwellings where the new
installation of additional fixtures can be accommodated
with no increase in the size of the water distribution
system, water service or house drain;

23-21

3. Minor work shall also mean and include new elec-
trical work incidental to the installation of air condition-

‘ing, equipment, clothes dryers, and ranges or ovens in one

and two-family dwellings; the installation of five or less
110 or 220 volt receptacles or fixtures where existing
circuits and/or available space circuits and service are
adequate to support the load; the replacement of existing
wiring with new wiring of the same capacity provided that
the new wiring shall be of a type approved for the use by
the code;

4. Minor work shall also mean and include the instal-
lation of any fire detection or suppression device in any
one- or two-family dwelling; installation of a radon miti-
gation system in an existing detached one or two-family
dwelling; the installation of a burglar alarm or security
system in any structure and the installation of a low
voltage communication system in any structure other than
a one- or two-family dwelling;

5. Minor work shall not include lead abatement.

6. Minor work on elevator devices shall also mean and
include work as outlined below and not involving any
structural alteration to a building and as scoped within the
applicable sections of Part XII of ASME A17.1 refer-
enced in the building subcode:

i. Alteration to hoistway enclosures (ASME A17.1
Part XII, Rule 1201.1a, 1203.1a);

ii. Alteration to construction at top of hoistways
(1201.1c) and at bottom of hoistways (1201.1d);

ili. Alteration to hoistways which affects control of
smoke and hot gases (1201.1e);

iv. Construction and alteration of machine room
and machinery spaces (1201.2, 1203.1b);

v. Installation and alteration of electrical equip-
ment, wiring, pipes and ducts in hoistway and machine
rooms (1201.3, 1203.1c);

vi. Alteration to pits (1201.6, 1203.1f);

vii. Alteration to bottom and top car counterweight
clearances and runbys (1201.7, 1203.1g, 2508);

viii. Alteration to horizontal car and counterweight
clearances (1201.8, 1203.1h);

ix. Additions, alterations or replacements of hoist-
way entrances (1201.10, 1203.1j); '

x. Installation or alteration of hoistway door locking
devices, access switches, parking devices and unlocking
devices (1201.11, 1203.1k);

xi. Alteration or addition of power operation of
hoistway doors (1201.12, 1203.1m);

xii. Alteration of spring buffers and bumpers
(1202.2, 1203.2b);

Supp. 4-17-00



5:23-2.17A

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

xiii. Alteration of counterweights (1202.3; 1203.1d
and 1203.2¢c);

xiv. Alteration of car frames

(1202.4a, 1203.2d);

xv. Alteration of car enclosures, car doors, gates,
and illumination of cars (1202.5 except installation of
new cars, 1203.2¢);

and platforms

xvi. Use of freight elevators to carry passengers,
hydraulic elevators only (1203.2));

xvii. Relocation of power unit (1203.3f);
xviii. Replacement of tanks (1203.6);

xix. Addition or alteration of top-of-car operating
devices (1202.12a, 1203.8a);

xx. Addition or alteration or car-leveling or truck-
zoning devices (1202.12b, 1203.8b);

xxi. Alteration of anti-creep leveling devices
(1203.8c);
xxii. Change of power supply, hydraulic elevators

only (1203.8d);
xxiii. Addition of rope equalizers (1202.14c, 1203.9c);

xxiv. Addition of auxiliary rope-fastening devices
(1202.144d);

xxv. Alteration of manual operating devices which
are provided to manually operate elevators in case of
power failure;

xxvi. Alteration of handrails on escalators and mov-
ing walks (1207.6, 1208.6);

xxvii. Alteration or addition of lighting and access
to interiors and related electrical work (1207.14,
1208.14); and

xxviii. Alteration of entrances or egresses on escala-
tors (1207.15).

(d) Inspection of minor work:

1. Inspections shall be required for minor work and
the enforcing agency shall inspect any such work within 30
days of the request for inspection;

2. The construction official shall issue a certificate of
approval stating that the work performed under a Minor
Work Permit substantially complies with the UCC. The
inspection shall be based upon what is visible at the time
of said inspection and the certificate of approval shall so
indicate.

Amended by R.1991 d.509, effective October 7, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 2236(a), 23 N.J.R. 3001(a).

Stylistic changes.
Amended by R.1993 d.580, effective November 15, 1993.
" See: 25 N.J.R. 3692(a), 25 N.J.R. 5145(c).
Amended by R.1993 d.663, effective December 20, 1993.
See: 25 N.I.R. 4546(a), 25 N.J.R. 5927(a).

Supp. 4-17-00

Amended by R.1995 d.381, effective July 17, 1995.
See: 27 N.J.R. 970(a), 27 N.J.R. 2715(a).
Amended by R.1995 d.476, effective September 5, 1995 (operative
January 1, 1996).
See: 27 N.J.R. 1846(a), 27 N.J.R. 3325(b).
Rewrote (d).
Amended by R.1995 d.564, effective November 6, 1995 (operative
March 1, 1996). '
See: 27 N.J.R. 2829(a), 27 N.J.R. 4281(b).
NJA.C. 5:23-2.17A(c)6xxv through xxvii, as added by R.1995
d.564, operative May 1, 1996.
Amended by R.1998 d.28, effective January 5, 1998.
See: 29 NJ.R. 3603(a), 30 N.J.R. 129(a).
Amended (c)1i through (c)liii. )
Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April 17, 2000.
See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a).
In (c)6, inserted a reference to 2508 in vii, inserted a new xxv, and
recodified former xxv through xxvii as xxvi through xxviii.

N

5:23-2.18

(a) Preliminary inspection: Before issuing a permit, the
construction official and appropriate subcode official shall,
where necessary, examine or cause to be examined all
buildings, structures and sites for which an application has
been filed for a construction permit.

Inspections

(b) Inspections during the progress of work:

1. The construction official and appropriate subcode
officials shall carry out such periodic inspection during the
progress of work as are necessary to insure that work
installed conforms to the approved plans and the require-
ments of the regulations.

i. Inspection by all subcodes for one and two-family
dwellings for which construction must cease until in-
spection is made shall be limited to four as follows:

(1) The bottom of footing trenches before place-
ment of footings, except that in the case of pile
foundations, inspections shall be made in accordance
with the requirements of the building subcode;

(2) Foundations and all walls up to grade level
prior to back filling;

(3) All structural framing and connections prior to
covering with finish or infill material; plumbing un-
derground services, rough piping, water service, sew-
er, septic services and storm drains; electrical rough
wiring, panels and service installations; insulation
installations;

(4) Installation of all finished materials, sealings of
exterior joints; plumbing piping, trim and fixtures;
electrical wiring, devices and fixtures; mechanical
systems equipment.

ii. Inspections for all subcodes of construction, other
than one and two-family dwellings, shall be limited to
those required for one and two-family dwellings and the
following: fire suppression systems; heat producing
devices; any inspections required by any subcode of the
regulations;

23-22

-



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-2.18A

(1) The framing inspection shall include a review
for compliance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-7, the Barrier Free
Subcode, for buildings required by N.J.A.C. 5:23-7.1
to be accessible.

iii. Any additional inspections, as permitted by this
chapter and as may be required by the municipality,
shall be of the type and nature that construction may
continue without interruption;

iv. Special inspection schedule: Where buildings
proposed for construction exceed two stories in height
or by their nature pose complex or unusual inspection
problems, the construction official or appropriate sub-
code official may specify additional or special inspec-
tions to the applicant in writing prior to the issuance of
a permit and during construction in the case of unfore-
seeable circumstances. Where Class I structures incor-
porate construction techniques covered under the spe-
cial inspection provisions of the building subcode, such
special inspections shall be provided for. The applicant
shall provide a list of special inspections required by the
building subcode when applying for the permit.

(c) Notice for inspection:

1. The owner or other responsible person in charge of
work shall notify the enforcing agency when the work is
ready for any required inspection specified herein or
required by the construction official or appropriate sub-
code official. This notice shall be given at least 24 hours
prior to the time the inspection is desired. Inspections
shall be performed within three business days of the time
for which it was requested. The work shall not proceed
in a manner which will preclude the inspection until it has
been made.

(d) Final inspection: Upon completion of the building or
structure, and before the issuance of a certificate of use and
occupancy required herein, a final inspection shall be made,
and any violations of the approved plans and permit shall be

noted and the holder of the permit shall be notified of any -

discrepancies by the construction official.

1. The final inspection shall include a review for com-
pliance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-7, the Barrier Free Subcode,
for all buildings required by N.J.A.C. 5:23-7.1 to be
accessible. .

2. The final inspection shall verify compliance with
N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.5, Posting structures.

(e) Inspections records: The enforcing agency shall make
a written record of all inspections, including any discrepan-
cies or violations noted and shall maintain those reports as a
public record which shall be available for public inspection
during normal business hours.

(f) Department inspections: At the request of an enforc-
. ing agency, the Department may assist the enforcing agency
in the inspection of any construction, provided that the

23-23

enforcing agency has submitted the plans and specifications
for such construction to the Department.

(g) The construction official shall serve as an agent of the
Bureau of Housing Inspection of the Department of Com-
munity Affairs for the purpose of inspecting newly con-
structed and altered hotels and multiple dwellings in order
to enforce the provisions of the regulations for the mainte-
nance of hotels and multiple dwellings (N.J.A.C. 5:10).
Responsibility for inspection may be delegated to the appro-
priate subcode official(s).

(h) Periodic inspections: The building subcode official or
fire protection subcode official may periodically inspect all
existing buildings and structures, except one and two family
dwellings, for compliance with the rules with respect to
posting. Such inspection shall specify any violation of the
rules with respect to the posting of floor load, occupancy
load and use group of the building.

Amended by R.1981 d.182, effective June 4, 1981.
See: 13 N.J.R. 187(b), 13 N.J.R. 333(b).
Amended by R.1992 d.244, effective June 15, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 1147(a), 24 N.I.R. 2243(a).
Class I inspections added to (b)1iv.
Amended by R.1996 d.323, effective July 15, 1996 (operative January 1,
1997).
See: 28 N.J.R. 2112(a), 28 N.J.R. 3549(a).
Amended by R.1997 d.304, effective July 21, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 2204(a), 29 N.J.R. 3248(a).
Added (b)1ii(1) and (d)1.
Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April 17, 2000.
See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a).
In (d), added 2; and added (h).

5:23-2.18A Utility load management device installation
programs

(a) Whenever a public utility proposes to undertake a
program of installing load management devices at the prop-
erties of a substantial number of service customers within a
limited period of time, it may apply to the Department for
permission to utilize the procedure set forth in this section.

(b) A utility with a program to install load management
devices shall submit detailed information to the Department
on the design of the device.

(c) The utility shall provide an educational program ac-
ceptable to the Department to acquaint any interested
Department personnel and municipal subcode officials with
the device and with installation and operating procedures.

(d) The utility shall insure that all devices to be installed
are identical in design, listed and labeled or otherwise
approved according to this chapter for their intended use.

(e) At least one month in advance of any installations,
the utility shall submit to the Department, and to each
affected municipality, notice of the anticipated number of
installations to be performed in each municipality. A maxi-
mum and a minimum figure may be submitted where there
is uncertainty about the number to be scheduled by custom-

Supp. 4-17-00



5:23-2.18A

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

ers. An approximate number of weeks for installations in
that municipality shall be given along with an approximate
number of installations per week.

1. Each week, in advance of installation, the utility
shall notify the municipality of any change in the antici-
pated number of installations for that week. No weekly
number of installations shall be so great that the cumula-
tive number of installations in the municipality shall ex-
ceed the maximum anticipated number submitted.

2. Prior to the commencement of any installation, and
as soon as may be practicable, the utility or its contractors
will provide to each municipality notice of the actual sites
of installations.

3. The Department and the municipalities shall be
notified as soon as possible in the event of any change in
existing schedules by the utility or its contractors.

(f) On the Monday following installations, the utility shall
submit to each municipality a completed permit application
for all installations completed in the municipality’s jurisdic-
tion during the preceding week. :

1. A listing of all permits so delivered shall be filed by
the utility with the Department.

2. All devices installed during that week, by a single
contractor, shall be included on that application. The
‘application shall include the Construction Permit Applica-
tion and an Electrical Subcode Technical Section.

3. Since the permit is not, typically, for work at a
single location, the block number shall be entered as
“UCC 2.18” and the lot as “A.” The work site location
shall be the name of the municipality and the owner in
fee shall be the utility.

4. In addition to the Construction Permit Application,
the utility or contractor shall supply the municipality a
complete listing of locations where the devices, listed on
this permit, were installed. This list shall include owner’s
name, owner’s address, block and lot, date of installation,
type of device(s) installed, and the contractor’s name.

(g) If, for any reason, a permit application, or any part, is

found to have been submitted in error, the utility or its
contractors shall notify the municipality as soon as possible.

(h) When all required municipal and utility inspections
have been approved, a single certificate of approval, for that
permit, shall be issued to the utility.

(i) If any municipality or the Department has reason to
suspect that permit applications are being mishandled or
carelessly accounted for, an investigation may be conducted
of the utility’s permit files for this project and of any permits
in the possession of individual contractors in the utility’s
employ for this project.

(j) The utility shall pay to each municipality 30 percent of
the permit fees otherwise due and owing.

Supp. 4-17-00

23-24

(k) The municipality shall inspect 30 percent of the instal-
lations performed and shall record the results of those — -.
inspections. The utility shall inspect at least 10 percent of |
the installations performed and shall record the results of
those inspections and forward those results concurrently to
the municipality and to the Department weekly.

(/) If a municipality or a utility discovers a defect rate of
not less than seven percent for any contractor employed by
the utility, the Department shall be immediately notified.
The Department shall investigate and, in the interest of
public safety, shall be authorized to order that:

1. The offending contractor cease to be employed by
the utility for this project;

2. The utility remit the fees necessary to inspect all
existing installations of the offending contractor in all
municipalities where that contractor has performed work;

3. That each municipality affected perform inspections
of all the offending contractor’s existing installations; and

4. That the utility or its designees correct or remove
- all defective installations to the satisfaction of the munici-
pal officials.

(m) If, at any time, the Department tabulates a program-
wide defect rate equal to or exceeding three percent, the
utility shall be notified and the inspection rate and fee rate
in (j) and (k) above shall rise to 50 percent.

SN

(n) If the three percent or greater program-wide defect
rate cannot be reduced within two weeks, the program may ™%
be terminated by the Department by notifying the utility and
all affected municipalities.

(0) A municipality in which a defect rate equal to or
greater than seven percent has been twice reported to the
Department and which has reason to believe that the pro-
gram cannot be successfully implemented within its jurisdic-
tion may notify the Department and the utility of the need
for termination of the program in that municipality. The
Department, upon verifying the accuracy of the municipali-
ty’s claim, shall issue a notice to the utility and to the
municipality ordering the termination of the program in that
municipality.

New Rule, R.1989 d.550, effective November 6, 1989.
See: 21 N.JR. 233(a), 21 N.L.R. 3458(a).
Amended by R.1994 d.28, effective January 18, 1994.
See: 25 N.J.R. 4546(b), 26 N.J.R. 352(a).

Amended by R.1996 d.512, effective November 4, 1996.
See: 28 N.J.R. 3697(a), 28 N.J.R. 4782(a).

5:23-2.18B  Utility area lighting facility installation
program

(a) Whenever an electric utility proposes to undertake
installation of area lighting facilities located on private
property on metal poles with an underground electric feed,

having no ancillary utility facilities attached to said poles, /~ ™\

the utility shall follow the procedures set forth in this \‘!!,

section.

Next Page is 23-24.1




AN

~—

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-2.20

(c) The utility shall pay a fee which shall be computed at
25 percent of the otherwise applicable permit fee chargeable
for such installations as per the Department fee schedule
established under N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.20(c)2i(2) and iii(1).

(d) X any violations are noted by an inspector, the inspec-
tor shall notify the affected utility and the Department.
Code officials shall not issue “Stop Construction Orders” or
“Notices of Violation” for such installations unless expressly
authorized to do so by the Department.

New Rule, R.1998 d.362, etfective July 20, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 1122(a), 30 N.J.R. 2644(b).

5:23-2.18C Use and occupancy of swimming pools, spas
and hot tubs

(a) It shall be unlawful to continue the use and occupan-
cy of a swimming pool, spa or hot tub until a copy of a valid
bonding and grounding certificate has been made available
to the construction official, the pool, spa or hot tub has been
inspected, and an electrical certificate of compliance has
been issued. This requirement shall apply to any swimming
pool, hot tub or spa located on any property other than one
or two-family residential property and includes, but is not
limited to, pools, hot tubs or spas open for the use of
members, residents or the public.

1. The electrical certificate of compliance shall be
issued annually by the local enforcing agency upon the
presentation of a valid bonding and grounding certificate,
satisfactory completion of an inspection by the electrical
subcode official and payment of an inspection fee. This
certificate shall be evidence that, based upon a visual
inspection, the wiring in or around the pool pump and
associated electrical equipment is free from electrical
safety hazards, and meets the applicable requirements of
the 1996 National Electrical Code.

2. The bonding and grounding certificate shall be
issued in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.20(d).

3. A bonding and grounding certificate shall also be
required for swimming pools, spas, or hot tubs which
either are newly constructed or have undergone modifica-
tions that impact the bonding or grounding system. No
additional visual inspection shall be required for the
issuance of an electrical certificate of compliance where a
construction permit is issued for the electrical work per-
taining to the pool, spa, or hot tub.

(b) The most recent bonding and grounding certificate
and electrical certificate of compliance shall be posted in
accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.5(f).

New Rule, R.2000 d.47, effective February 7, 2000.
See: 31 N.J.R. 2314(a), 32 N.J.R. 443(a).

5:23-2.19 Special technical services

(a) Whenever the construction official and the appropri-
ate subcode official determine that a need for special techni-

23-25

cal services exists with regard to a particular project for
which the municipal enforcing agency is classified to per-
form plan review, the construction official may require the
applicant to obtain and furnish to the construction official,
at the applicant’s expense, a report from a licensed engineer
or registered architect. Such report shall contain the infor-
mation deemed necessary by the construction official to aid
in his determination. Such may include, but not be limited

" to:

1. Analysis of materials and installation. or design
methods not covered by the provisions of the subcodes;

2. Site investigation; °
3. Structural analysis;

4. Building systems analysis (that is, mechanical, elec-
trical, vertical transportation, and so forth).

(b) The commissioner reserves the right to further regu-
late the performance of special technical services.

Amended by R.1998 d.28, effective January 5, 1998.
See: 29 N.J.R. 3603(a), 30 N.J.R. 129(a).

5:23-2.20 Tests and special inspections

(a) All tests and special inspections required by the provi-
sions of the regulations shall be made and conducted under
the supervision of the enforcing agency and in accordance
with such inspection and test procedures as may be pre- -
scribed by the provisions of the regulations, with the ex-
pense of all test and inspections to be borne by the owner or
lessee, or the contractor performing the work.

(b) The construction official may accept tests and test
reports of the Department and other government agencies,
as well as signed statements and supporting inspection and
test reports filed by qualified licensed professionals or ap-
proved agencies or firms.

(c) The construction official may accept a Chimney Certi-
fication for Replacement of Fuel-Fired Equipment (Form
F-370), signed by the contractor who installed the replace-
ment fuel-fired equipment, in lieu of requiring the removal
and reinstallation of the chimney vent connector for pur-
poses of inspection of the chimney or vent. Certifications
from homeowners shall not be accepted in lieu of the
required inspection.

(d) The bonding and grounding certificate for swimming
pools, spas and hot tubs, shall be issued by a recognized
electrical testing agency or a New Jersey State licensed
electrical contractor. This certificate shall verify the continu-
ity and integrity of the bonding and grounding system. It
shall be valid for five years from the date of issuance.

Amended by R.1992 d.244, effective June 15, 1992.

See: 24 N.J.R. 1147(a), 24 N.J.R. 2243(a).
Special inspections added.

Amended by R.1995 d.249, effective June 5, 1995, (operative October 1,
1995).

Supp. 2-7-00



5:23-2.20

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

See: 27 N.J.R. 619(a), 27 N.J.R. 2187(a).

Added (c).
Amended by R.1996 d.512, effective November 4, 1996.
See: 28 N.J.R. 3697(a), 28 N.J.R. 4782(a).
Amended by R.1997 d.376, effective September 15, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 2741(a), 29 N.J.R. 4102(a).

In (c), inserted “Form (F-370)”, substituted “contractor” for “per-
son” and added last sentence.
Amended by R.2000 d.47, effective February 7, 2000.
See: 31 N.J.R. 2314(a), 32 N.J.R. 443(a).

Added (d).

5:23-2.21 Construction control

(a) Responsibilities: The provisions of this section shall
define the construction controls required for all buildings
involving professional architecture/engineering services and
delineate the responsibilities of such professional services
together with those services that are the responsibility of the
contractor during construction.

(b) Professional architecture or engineering services:

1. Design: All new, renovation, alteration, reconstruc-
tion, expansion, addition or modification work involving
the practice of professional architecture or engineering, as
defined by the statutory requirements of the professional
registration and licensing laws of this State, shall be
prepared by registered architects or licensed engineers.
All plans, computations and specifications required for a
construction permit application must be prepared by or
under the direct supervision of a registered architect or
licensed engineer and bear his or her signature and seal in
accordance with the State’s statutes and regulations gov-
erning the professional registration and licensing of archi-
tects and engineers.

(c) Responsible person in charge of work: The owner
shall designate a person to be in charge of the work who
shall be responsible for:

1. Review and approval of all shop drawings, docu-
ments, and details pertaining to the construction phase;

2. Verification of all controlled materials per building
subcode requirements of testing, certification and identifi-
cation; and

3. Special inspection of critical construction compo-
nents;

4. The responsible person in charge of work shall
perform the necessary services and be present on ‘the
construction site on a regular and periodic basis to deter-
mine that, generally, the work is proceeding in accordance
with the documents approved for the construction permit.

(d) Reporting: At the completion of the construction,
the responsible person in charge of work shall submit to the
construction official a report as to the satisfactory comple-
tion and the readiness of the project for occupancy. Major
deviations from the approved permit documents shall be
listed in the report; minor exceptions to the permit docu-
ments not endangering occupancy need not be included.

Supp. 2-7-00

(e) Construction contractor services: The actual con-
struction of the work shall be the responsibility of the
contractor(s) as identified on the approved construction
permit and shall involve:

1. Execution of work in accordance with the regula-
tions;

2. Execution and control of all methods of construc-
tion in a safe and satisfactory manner;

3. Execution of all work in accordance with the ap-
proved construction documents and directives of the ar-
chitect or engineer;

4. In general, render all such construction services as
required to effect a safe and satisfactory installation of the
project;

5. Upon completion of the construction, he shall certi-
fy to the best of his knowledge and belief that such has
been done in substantial accord with the above, with all
pertinent deviations specifically noted.

(f) The provisions of this section do not relieve the
enforcing agency of any of the responsibilities required by
the regulations.

Amended by R.1998 d.28, effective January 5, 1998.
See: 29 N.J.R. 3603(a), 30 N.J.R. 129(a).

5:23-2.22 Premanufactured construction

(a) Premanufactured construction certified in accordance
with N.JLA.C. 5:23-4A or 4B, and carrying an appropriate
label, shall be accepted as conforming to the requirements
of the regulations to the extent provided for by the particu-
lar label for purposes of local construction inspection ap-
proval.

1. Prior to accepting the unit, the appropriate subcode
official may require the performance of nondestructive
tests.

2. In the case of visible signs of damage and/or any
visible code violations, the construction official shall con-
sider the seriousness of the nonconformance or damage
and accordingly issue a Temporary Certificate of Occu-
pancy or Certificate of Occupancy or deny such Certifi-
cate. If a Temporary Certificate is issued or a Certificate
is denied, the construction official shall request that the
label-issuing agency reaffirm in writing that the assembly
still conforms to the regulations and notify the Depart-
ment in writing.

3. No inspection requiring disassembly, damage to, or
destruction of certified premanufactured construction
shall be conducted.

(b) The appropriate subcode officials shall inspect the
installation of any premanufactured unit or assembly and all
work installed or completed on site to determine compliance
with the regulations and the approved plans.

23-26



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.12

(d) Pursuant to Reorganization Plan No. 114-1996, the
Department or the municipal code enforcing agency shall
have authority to enforce and cite violations of N.J.A.C.
6A:26-6.2.

Amended by R.1986 d.142, effective May 5, 1986.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1169(a), 18 N.J.R. 945(a).

New (a)7; old (a)7 through 9 renumbered (a)8.~10.

Administrative Change: This section was originally part of N.J.A.C.
5:23-3.11.

See: 18 N.J.R. 1842(a).

Amended by R.1988 d.155, effective April 4, 1988.

See: 20 N.J.R. 824(d).

Added (d). This was amended by the rule adoption of the Depart-
ment of Education published in the New Jersey Register at 20 N.J.R.
824(d).

Administrative Correction to (c).

See: 22 N.I.R. 2503(b).

Amended by R.1990 d.507, effective October 15, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 2208(a), 22 N.J.R. 3214(a).

Text conformed to P.L. 1990, c.23, qualified agencies may perform
plan review of public school structures.

Amended by R.1991 d.309, effective June 17, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 1084(a), 23 N.J.R. 1922(a).

Rule conformed to P.L. 1990 c. 23; text at (c) revised to specify type
of project covered; BOCA cites updated; reference to N.J.A.C. 6:22
added.

Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a).

Amended by R.1997 d.417, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 3387(a), 29 N.J.R. 4285(a).

Deleted (a); recodified former (b) through (e) as (a) through (d); in
(b), Inserted “Prior to the release ... of projects,”; in (b)1 and 2,
inserted “public” preceding “school buildings”; in (c)7, deleted option
of inspecting agency requiring subsequent correction of any errors in
the plans, inserted second sentence, and in third sentence amended
notice provisions.

Amended by R.1998 d.332, effective July 6, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 1377(a), 30 N.J.R. 2421(b).

In (d), substituted “alarm” for “detection”, changed BOCA reference
and substituted a reference to (d)Sii for a reference to (e)5ii in 5, and
changed BOCA in 6.

Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April 17, 2000.
See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a).

Rewrote the section.

Amended by R.2001 d.127, effective April 16, 2001.
See: 33 N.J.R. 392(a), 33 N.J.R. 1195(a).

In (a)3, substituted “instructional spaces, the size of any such spaces”
for “units” and substituted “such” for * instructional”.
Administrative change.

See: 33 N.J.R. 4101(a).

5:23-3.11B Underground storage tank systems

(a) The installation, repair (other than “minor repair,” as
defined in N.J.A.C. 7:14B-10.5), and closure (or “demoli-
tion”) of underground storage tank systems, as defined in
N.J.A.C. 7:14B-10.1, shall be controlled by the State Uni-
form Construction Code and by N.J.A.C. 7:14B-1 through
15. '

(b) A DEP permit for the installation, repair or closure
of an underground storage tank system that requires a DEP
approval, or any part thereof, or an emergency permit
granted pursuant to N.J.A.C. 7:14B, shall be a prior approv-
al for any permit application submitted pursuant to the
State Uniform Construction Code Act and these rules.
Applicants installing secondarily contained systems for
which no prior DEP approval is necessary shall be required

23-43

to submit engineering drawings of the secondarily contained
systems and to certify that the underground storage tank
system meets all requirements of N.J.A.C. 7:14B.

(c) Construction code officials shall retain all penalty
powers, as set forth in these rules, with respect to the
installation, usage or closure (demolition) of underground
storage tank systems and parts thereof in violation of the
State Uniform Construction Code Act or these rules.

(d) The following types of underground storage tank
systems requiring a construction permit are exempt from the
requirements of N.J.A.C. 7:14B:

1. Farm or residential tanks of 1,100 gallons or less
capacity used for storing motor fuel for noncommercial
purposes; :

2. Tanks with a capacity of 2,000 gallons or less used
to store heating oil for onsite consumption in a nonresi-
dential building;

3. Tanks used to store heating oil for onsite consump-
tion in a residential building;

4. Septic tanks installed in compliance with rules
adopted by DEP pursuant to P.L. 1954, c.199 (N.J.S.A.
58:11-23 et seq.);

5. Tanks situated in an underground area, including,
but not limited to, basements, cellars, mines, drift shafts,
or tunnels, if the storage tank is situated upon or above
the surface of the floor;

6. Tanks situated in an underground area, including,
but not limited to, basements, cellars, mines, drift shafts,
or tunnels, if the storage tank is equipped with secondary
containment and is uncovered so as to allow visual inspec-
tion of the exterior of the tank;

7. Wastewater treatment tanks;
8. Electrical equipment;
9. Hydraulic lift tanks; and

10. Any pipes, lines, fixtures, or other equipment con-
nected to any tank exempted from the provisions of
N.J.A.C. 7:14B as set forth in (b)1 to 9 above.

New Rule, R.1990 d.562, effective November 19, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 2629(c), 22 N.J.R. 3482(d).
Amended by R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a).
In (d)3, deleted maximum capacity for tanks of 2000 gallons.
Amended by R.1998 d.332, effective July 6, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 1377(a), 30 N.J.R. 2421(b).
In (d)3, deleted “with a capacity of 2000 gallons or less” following
“Tanks”. .

5:23-3.12 Amended rules

Whenever the Commissioner shall make any modifica-
tions to the rules, notice of same shall be published in the
New Jersey Register.

Supp. 11-4-02



5:23-3.12

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Amended by R.1995 d.544, effective October 16, 1995.
See: 27 N.J.R. 2827(a), 27 N.J.R. 3933(a).
Amended by R.2000 d.413, effective October 16, 2000.
See: 32 N.J.R. 2278(a), 32 N.J.R. 3783(a).

Rewrote the section.

5:23-3.13 State-sponsored code change proposals

(a) Any municipality, other political subdivision, or agen-
cy of the State seeking to submit a “State-sponsored code
change proposal” shall do so not less than 90 days prior to
the code change meeting of the model code adoption agency
for which the amendment is proposed.

(b) Such proposal shall be on a form provided by the
model code organization where one is available. If none is
available, such proposal shall state the name and address of
the official proposing the code change, the agency or politi-
cal subdivision represented, the text of the amendment
suggested and an explanation of the amendment together
with any technical justification deemed necessary by the
proponents.

(c) A hearing shall thereafter be held in accordance with
N.J.S.A. 52:27D~124 of the Act.

(d) Copies of the submitted applications for code change
proposals, transcripts of hearings on such applications and
State-sponsored code change proposals as adopted, shall be
available from the department at a fee of $.50 per page.

(e) Whenever a model code change hearing is scheduled
so as not to permit adequate time to meet the procedures
set forth in this section and in N.J.S.A. 52:27D-124 of the
Act, the Commissioner may hold a hearing and require the
advice of the code advisory board within a lesser time
period, as the situation dictates.

5:23-3.14 Building subcode
(a) Rules concerning the building subcode adopted are as
follows: '

1. Pursuant to authority of P.L. 1975, c.217, as modi-
fied by P.L. 1996, c.53, the Commissioner hereby adopts
the model code of the Building Officials and Code Ad-
ministrators International, Inc., known as the “BOCA
National Building Code/1996.” This code is hereby
adopted by reference as the building subcode for New
Jersey subject to the modifications stated in (b) below.

i. Copies of this code may be obtained from the
sponsor at: BOCA, International, 4051 W. Flossmoor
Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois 60478-5795.

ii. “The BOCA National Building Code/1996,” may
be known and cited as the “building subcode.”

2. Any references to the mechanical code, plumbing
code, CABO One and Two Family Dwelling Code,
CABO A117.1 standard (including reference to chapter
11) or NFiPA 70 (including reference to Chapter 27)
listed in Chapter 35 shall be considered a reference to the
appropriate adopted mechanical, plumbing, one and two
family dwelling or electrical subcode referenced in
N.J.A.C. 5:23-3 or to the barrier-free subcode, N.J.A.C.
5:23-7, as appropriate.

Supp. 11-4-02

(b) The following chapters of the building subcode are
modified as follows:

1. Chapter 1 of the building subcode, entitled “Ad-
ministration,” is deleted in its entirety.

2. The following amendments are made to Chapter 2
of the building subcode, entitled “Definitions,” section
202.0, general definitions:

i. The term and definition of “Additions” is delet-
ed;

ii. The definition of the term “Agricultural build-
ing” is amended to add a sentence as follows: “Struc-
tures qualifying under the Uniform Construction Code
definition of Commercial Farm Buildings may be built
according to the regulations at N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.2(d).”;

ili. The definition of the term “Approved” is
amended to delete the phrase “or other authority”;

iv. The phrase and definition of “Approved materi-
al, equipment and methods” is deleted;

v. The term and definition of “Approved rules” is
deleted;

vi. The term and definition ‘“Attic, habitable” are
added from the 1990 BOCA National Building Code as
follows: “Attic, habitable: A habitable attic is an attic
which has a stairway as a means of access and egress
and in which the ceiling area at a height of seven feet
above the attic floor is not more than one third of the
area of the next floor below.”

vii. The definition of the term “Building” is deleted
and replaced by the definition at NJ.A.C. 5:23-1.4;

viii. The term and definition of “Building, existing”
is deleted;

ix. The term and definition of “Building line” is
deleted;

Xx. The term and definition of “Building service
equipment” is deleted and replaced by the term and
definition of “equipment” at N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4;

xi. The definition of the term “Code official” is
deleted and is redefined herein and throughout the
subcode as the “building subcode official” as defined in
N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4 unless indicated otherwise;

xii. The term and definition of “Equipment, exist-
ing” is deleted;

xiii. The terms and definitions of “hereafter” and
“heretofore” are deleted;

xiv. The term and definition of “Jurisdiction” is

deleted;

xv. The term and definition of “Occupancy, change
of” is deleted;

23-44



e

/

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.14

xvi. The definition of “Owner” is deleted and re-
placed by the definition at N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4;

xvii. The term and definition of “Permit” is deleted;

xviii. The term and definition of “Person” is delet-
ed;

xix. The term and definition of “Repair” is deleted;

xx. The definition of the term “Structure” is re-
placed by the definition at N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4;

xxi. The term and definition “Structure, existing” is
deleted;

xxii. The term and definition of “Writing” is delet-
ed;

xxili. The term and definition of “Zoning” is delet-
ed.

3. The following amendments are made to Chapter 3
of the building subcode, entitled “Use or Occupancy.”

i. Section 301.2 is deleted,;

ii. Section 307.8 is amended to replace the term
“less” in the second line of exception #3 with the term
“more.”

ifi. Section 310.6 is amended to delete the phrase
“not more than three stories in height.”

iv. Section 312.0 is deleted and substitute in lieu
thereof section 312.0 of the 1993 BOCA National
Building Code as follows: “312.0 Utility and Miscella-
neous Use Group—312.1 General: Buildings and struc-
tures of an accessory character and miscellaneous struc-
tures not classified in any specific use group shall be
constructed, equipped and maintained to conform to
the requirements of this code commensurate with the
fire and life hazard incidental to their occupancy. Use
Group U shall include fences over 6 feet (1829 mm)
high, tanks, cooling towers, retaining walls and build-
ings such as private garages, carports, sheds and agri-
cultural buildings.

v. Table 313.1.2 is modified to delete Use Group U
from the table.

4. The following amendments are made to Chapter 4
of the building subcode, entitled “Special Use and Occu-
pancy”; )

o i. Section 415.1 is amended to replace the phrase
“authority having jurisdiction” with the term “construc-
tion official’’;

ii. Section 416.11 is deleted;
ifi. Section 420.0 is amended to replace the terms
“Mobile Units,” “Unit” and “Units” with the terms

“Manufactured Homes,” “Home” and “Homes” re-
spectively;

23-45

iv. Sections 420.1 and 420.2 are deleted in their
entirety;

v. Section 421.3 is amended to replace the term
“code official” with the term “construction official”;

vi. Section 421.6 is amended to end with the phrase
“in accordance with the plumbing subcode”;

vii. Section 421.6.1 is deleted;

viii. Section 421.6.2 is amended to end with the
phrase “in accordance with the plumbing subcode”;

ix. Section 421.9.3 is amended to replace the term
“governing body” with the term “construction official.”

x. Section 421.10.1 #9 of the 1996 BOCA National
Building Code is deleted in its entirety.

5. The following amendment is made to Chapter 5 of
the building subcode, entitled “General Building Limita-
tions”:

i. Table 503 is modified to delete Use Group U
from the table.

6. The following amendments are made to Chapter 7
of the building subcode, entitled “Fireresistant Material
and Construction”:

i. Table 705.2 is modified to delete U¢ in the second
column and U° in the fourth column under the heading
of Use Group. Delete “Note c” and “Note d” of the
table.

ii. Table 707.1 is modified to delete U under the
heading of Use Group in the second row.

iii. Section 721.6.5 is deleted and substitute in lieu
thereof the text of Section 720.6.5 of the 1993 BOCA
National Building Code as follows: “Architectural
Trim: Fireblocking shall be installed in exterior corn-
ices and other exterior architectural elements where
permitted of combustible construction in Section
1406.0, or where erected with combustible frames, at
maximum intervals of 20 feet (6096 mm). If nonconti-
nuous, such elements shall have closed ends, with at
least 4 inches (102 mm) of separation between sec-
tions.”

iv. Section 723.6 is deleted in its entirety.

7. The following amendments are made to Chapter 8
of the building subcode, entitled “Interior Finishes”:

i. Table 803.4 is modified to delete U under the
heading of Use Group in the eighth row.

ii. Sections 805.1, 805.2.1, 807.2.1 and 807.2.2 are
amended to replace the term “code official” with the
term “fire protection subcode official.”

8. The following amendments are made to Chapter 9
of the building subcode, entitled “Fire Protection Sys-
tems””: '

Supp. 11-4-02



5:23-3.14

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

i. References to the term “code official” shall be
replaced with the term “fire protection subcode offi-
cial.”

ii. Section 901.4 is deleted in its entirety;

iii. Section 903.1 is amended to replace the term
“department” with the phrase “enforcement agency
responsible for plan review,” and in the note, to replace
the word “Since” with the term “If”;

iv. Section 917.0 is amended to replace the phrase
“administrative authority of the jurisdiction” with the
term “fire protection subcode official;”

v. Section 921.0 is deleted in its entirety.

9. The following amendments are made to Chapter 10
of the building subcode, entitled “Means of Egress”:

i. Section 1001.2 is amended to replace the phrase
“Article 1 for modification of this code or by adoption
of approved rules” with the regulations at “N.J.A.C.
5:23-27;

ii. Section 1005.5 is deleted and substitute in lieu
thereof Section 1005.5 of the 1993 BOCA National
Building Code as follows: “1005.5 Open-sided floor
areas: Guards shall be located along .open-sided walk-
ing surfaces, mezzanines and landings which are located
more than 30 inches (762 mm) above the floor or grade
below. The guards shall be constructed in accordance
with Section 1021.0. Exception: Guards are not re-
quired on the loading side of loading docks and the
auditorium side of stages and raised platforms.”

iii. Section 1005.6 is deleted and substitute in lieu
thereof section 1005.6 of the 1993 BOCA National
Building Code as follows:

“1005.6 Elevation Change: Where changes in ele-
vation exist in exit access corridors, exits or exit
discharge, ramps shall be used where the difference
in elevation is less than 12 inches (305 mm). Excep-
tion: A maximum step height of 8 inches (203 mm)
shall be permitted for buildings with occupancies in
Use Groups F, H, R and S at exterior doors not
required to be accessible by Chapter 11.”

iv. Section 1014.6 exception #8 is modified to re-
place the first sentence with the text of Section 1014.6
exception #8 of the 1993 BOCA National Building
Code and retain the 1996 text for the second sentence
as follows:

“8. In occupancies in Use Group R-3 and within
dwelling units in occupancies in Use Group R-2, the
maximum riser height shall be 8% inches (210 mm)
and the minimum tread depth shall be 9 inches (229
mm). A nosing of not less than % inches (19 mm) but
not more than 1% inches (32 mm) shall be provided
on stairways with a solid riser where the tread depth
is less than 11 inches (279 mm).”

Supp. 11-4-02 23-46

v. Section 1014.6.3 is deleted and substitute in lieu

thereof Section 1014.6.3 of the 1993 BOCA National
Building Code as follows:

“1014.6.3 Winders: Winders shall not be permitted
in required means of egress stairways except in occu-
pancies in Use Group R-3 and stairways serving a
single dwelling unit. Such winders shall have a tread
depth of not less than 9 inches (229 mm) at a point
not more than 12 inches (305 mm) from the side
where the tread is narrower and the minimum tread
depth shall not be less than 6 inches (152 mm).”

vi. Section 1014.9.1 is deleted and substitute in lieu

thereof Section 1014.9.1 of the 1993 BOCA National
Building Code as follows:

“1014.9.1 Strength: All stairways, platforms and
landings in other than occupancies in Use Group
R-3 shall be adequate to support a live load of 100
pounds per square foot (488.20 kg/m?) and a concen-
trated load of 300 pounds (136.20 kg).”

vii. Section 1017.1.1 is amended to add the word

“nominal” at the end of the sentence at exception #2.

viii. Section 1021.2 exception #1 is deleted and

substitute in lieu thereof Section 1021.2 exception #1
of the 1993 BOCA National Building Code as follows:

“l. In other than occupancies in Use Group E,
guards shall not be less than 34 inches (864 mm) in
height above the leading edge of the tread along
stairs which are not more than 20 feet (6096 mm) in
height or which reverse direction at an intermediate
landing with 12 inches (305 mm) or less measured
horizontally between successive flights.”

ix. In Section 1021.3, sentences 1 and 2 and Excep-

tions 1 and 2 shall be deleted and Section 824.3 of the
1990 BOCA National Building Code shall be inserted
as follows: '

“Opening limitations: In buildings of Use Groups
A, B, E, I-1, I-2, M and R, and in public garages and
open parking structures, open guards shall have ba-
lusters or other construction such that a sphere with
a diameter of 4 inches (102 mm) cannot pass through
any opening.

Exception: The triangular openings formed by the
riser, tread, and bottom rail at the open side of a
stairway shall be of a maximum size such that a
sphere 6 inches (152 mm) in diameter cannot pass
through the opening. In buildings of Use Groups 1-3,
F, H, and S, other than public garages and open
parking structures, the construction shall not permit a
sphere with a diameter of 21 inches (533 mm) to pass
through any opening.”

x. Section 1021.2, exception #3 is deleted in its

entirety.

o



Y

C

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.14

xi. Section 1022.2 and the exception are deleted and
substitute in lieu thereof Section 1022.2 of the 1993
BOCA National Building Code as follows:

“1022.2 Handrail details: Handrail-gripping sur-
face shall be continuous, without interruption by
newel posts, other structural elements or obstruc-
tions. A handrail and any wall or other surface
adjacent to the handrail shall be free of any sharp or
abrasive elements. The clear space between the
handrail and the adjacent wall or surface shall not be
less than 1% inches (38 mm). Edges shall have a
minimum radius of % inch (3 mm).”

xii. Section 1022.2.2 exception #1 is deleted and
substitute in lieu thereof Section 1022.2.2 exception #1
of the 1993 BOCA National Building Code as follows:

“1. Handrails that form part of a guard shall have
a height not less than 34 inches (864 mm) and not
more than 42 inches (1067 mm).”

xiii. Section 1022.2.4 is deleted and substitute in
lieu thereof the text of Section 828.2.4 of the 1987
BOCA National Building Code as follows:

“Handrail grip size: For all stair handrails located
within a dwelling unit, the maximum horizontal cross-
sectional dimension of the handrails shall not exceed
2 % inches (67 mm).”

xiv. Section 1024.1 is modified to delete the second
sentence in the paragraph.

xv. Section 1028.2 is deleted.

10. Chapter 11 is deleted in its entirety and replaced
by N.J.A.C. 5:23-7.

11. Chapter 12 of the building subcode, entitled “Inte-
rior Environment”, is modified as follows:

i. Sections 1207.2 and 1207.2.1 entitled “Stairway
illumination” and “Controls,” respectively, are deleted
in their entirety.

ii. Section 1210.1 is deleted and substitute in lieu
thereof Sections 1210.1 and 1210.1.1 of the 1993 BOCA
National Building Code as follows:

“1210.1 Roof spaces: Enclosed attics and enclosed
rafter spaces formed where ceilings are applied di-
rectly to the underside of roof rafters shall have cross
ventilation for each separate space by ventilation
openings that are protected against the entrance of
rain and snow. The openings shall be covered with
corrosion-resistant mesh not less than % inch (6 mm)
nor more the % inch (13 mm) in any direction.

1210.1.1 Ventilation Area: The minimum required
net free ventilation area shall be Yso of the area of
the space ventilated, except that the minimum re-
quired area shall be reduced to %0, provided that: a
vapor retarder having a permeance not exceeding 1

23-47

perm is installed on the warm side of the ceiling; or
at least 50 percent, and not more than 80 percent, of
the required ventilating area is provided by ventila-
tors located in the upper portion of the space to be
ventilated at least 3 feet (914 mm) above eave or
cornice vents, with the balance of the required venti-
lation provided by eave or cornice vents.”

12. Chapter 13 entitled “Energy Conservation” is de-
leted in its entirety.

13. The following amendment is made to Chapter 14
of the building subcode, entitled “Exterior Wall Cover-
ings”:

i. Section 1405.3.11, entitled “Foundation Insula-
tion” is deleted in its entirety.

14. The following amendment is made to Chapter 15
of the building subcode, entitled “Roofs and Roof Struc-
tures”:

i. Section 1512.1 is amended to delete the sentence
“The repair . ... for new roofing.”

15. The following amendments are made to Chapter
16 entitled “Structural Loads”:

i. Table 1609.7(6) Note e is deleted and substitute
in lieu thereof the text of Table 1611.7(6) Note e of the
1993 BOCA National Building Code as follows: “Note
e. Openings are permanent openings and those that are
likely to be breached during wind having the basic wind
speed per Section 1609.3. Doors and windows which
have been designed for wind loads in accordance with
Section 1609.8 are to be considered enclosures.”

ii. Section 1614.5 is amended to replace the term
“Change of Occupancy” with the term “Change of Use
as per N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.67;

16. The following amendments are made to Chapter
17 of the building subcode, entitled “Structural Tests and
Inspections™:

i. Section 1701.2 is amended to replace the term
“approved rules” with the word “regulations”;

ii. In Section 1702.1, the definition of the term
“approved agency” is amended to add the words “by
the building subcode official or other authority having
jurisdiction in accordance with the regulations” after
the word “approved”;

ili. In Section 1702.1, the definition and the term
“Inspection, special” are deleted;

iv. Section 1705.1 is amended to add the words “for
Class 1 structures or when requested by the building
subcode official” after the words “special inspections”
on lines 1 and 2;

v. Section 1705.1.1 is deleted in its entirety and
replaced with the sentence: “Permit applications shall
be made in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.15”;

Supp. 11-4-02



5:23-3.14

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

vi. Section 1705.2 is amended to add the sentence:
“Building elements fabricated off site shall be approved
in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.26”;

vii. Section 1705.3.1 is deleted in its entirety;

vili. Section 1707.1 is amended to replace the
phrase “approved rules” with the word “regulations,”
and to replace the phrase “Section 106.0” with the
phrase “the regulations.”

17. The following amendments are made to Chapter
18 entitled “Foundations and Retaining Walls.”

i. Table 1812.3.2(1) and Table 1812.3.2(2) are
amended as follows:
Table 1812.3.2(1)

PLAIN MASONRY AND PLAIN CONCRETE
FOUNDATION WALLS®

Plain masonry®
Minimal nominal wall thickness

5 7h Th 7h
6 74 7h .10
9 7 Th 10 10
8 10 12 12
9 10 12 Note d
Note a. For design lateral soil loads and descriptions of soil classes, see Section

1611.0. Soil classes are in accordance with the Unified Soil Classification System
and design lateral soil load are for moist soil conditions without hydrostatic
pressure.

Note b. Solid grouted hollow units or solid masonry units.

Note c. An analysis in compliance with ACI 530/ASCE 5/TMS 402 or reinforce-
ment in accordance with Table 1812.3.2(2) is required.

Note d. An analysis in compliance with ACI 318 is required.

Note e. Mortar shall be Type M or S and masonry shall be laid in running bond.
Note f. 1 foot = 304.8 mm; 1 inch = 25.4 mm; 1 pound per square foot = 47.9
Pa.

Table 1812.3.2(2)

REINFORCED CONCRETE AND REINFORCED
MASONRY FOUNDATION WALLS#b¢d

Vertical reinforcement for 8-inch
nominal wall (thickness)e
Soil classes and lateral soil load?
(pound per square foot

(inches)f Soil classes and lateral per 213} osfl\iep th)e
soil load? (pounds per square foot SM—S’C ML
per foot of depth)f GW, GP, inorgan}c CI:
sﬁl\g’c:Shl\/ffL SW, and and GC, SC and
oY N Depth of SPsoils ML~CLsoils  MH soils
Depth of GW, GP, inorganic CL unbalanced 30 45 60
unbalanced SW, and and GC, SC and . " : : : -
Wall height backfill height ~ SPsoils ML-CLsoils ~MHsoils " o loisnt bac}‘(ffgleg?ght (lgggf;‘)’n (“clgﬁfjr‘)’“ (l‘ggﬁfesr;’“
f f (feetle
feet A feelt % 4—2 % 4(orless)  #4atd8  #4atds #4 at 43
; (or fess) 5 . 2 7 5 #4atd8  #4atd8  #dat40
6 10 12 10 (solib 6 #4 at 48 #5 at 48 #5 at 40
8 o o2 0 (solid) 7 #hatd)  #Satd0  #6at4s
4 (oh : (S%l ) (S%I ) 4(orless)  #4atd8  #4atd8  #4atds
(or less) 8 s 5 5 #4atds  #4atd8  #4atd0
3 6 10 1 12 (solidb 8 6 #4 at 48 #5 at 48 #5 at 40
6 . 2y TAGe) 7 #5at48  #6at48  #6at40
7 102y 12 (solid)  Notec 8 #5atd0  #6at40  #7at40
ot (5%1 ) (S%I ) ote ¢ 4(orless)  #4atd8  #4atd8  #4atds
(or less) 3 S 3 s #4atd8  #4atd3 #5148
6 12 12 12 (solid® 6 #4 at 48 #5 at 48 #6 at 48
b (solid®) 9 7 #5at48  #6at48 #7 at 43
o 7 2~ 12(old) - Notee 8 #5at40  #7atd3  #8at4s
§ 12 (solid®)  Notec Note ¢ 9 #6at40  #8at48  #8at 32
9 Note ¢ Note c Note ¢ Note a. For design lateral soil loads and descriptions of soil classes, see Section
i 1611.0. Soil classes are in accordance with the Unified Soil Classification System
Plain concrete and design lateral soil load are for moist soil conditions without hydrostatic
Minimal nominal wall thickness eress%re. Provisi his tabl based . ) ified
(inche s)f Soil classes and lateral inost;zction fgf&sgogsl to this table are based on construction requirements specifie
soil load* (pounds per squfar e foot Note c. For alternate reinforcement, see Section 1812.3.2.2.
per foot of depth) Note d. Mortar shall be Type M or S and masonry shall be laid in running
GM, SM, bond.
SM-SC, ML, Note e. 1 foot = 304.8 mm; 1 inch = 254 mm; 1 pound per square foot = 47.9
Depth of GW, GP, inorganic CL Pa.
unbalanced SW, and and GC, SC and .
Walflegflfght baCk?éL??ght SP;S ils ML‘%‘ soils MH68°118 18. The following amendment is made to Chapter 26
4 (or less) 7% 7 7% of the building subcode, entitled “Plastic”:
7 5 Th Th 76 . .
6 T Th 8 i. Section 2603.5.1 is deleted in its entirety.
7 Th 8 10
4 (OTSICSS) ;iﬁ 7& 71/2 19. The following amendment is made to Chapter 27
g > iy T 5 of the building subcode, entitled “Electric Wiring, Equip-
7 74 10 10 ment and Systems’:
8 10 10 12 _
4 (or less) T4 Tk Th i. Chapter 27 is deleted in its entirety.
Supp. 11-4-02 23-48 Next Page is 23-48.1

C

‘<

O



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.14

20. The following amendments are made to Chapter
28 of the building subcode, entitled ‘“Mechanical Sys-
tems”:

i. Section 2803.0 is deleted in its entirety;
ii. Section 2809.0 is deleted in its entirety.

21. Chapter 29 of the building subcode, entitled
“Plumbing Systems” is deleted in its entirety.

22. The following amendments are made to Chapter
30 of the building subcode, entitled “Elevators and con-
veying systems””:

i. Section 3001.1 is amended to replace the phrase
“Except as otherwise provided by statute, the” in the
first line with “The”, to add the phrase “and where
applicable, of N.J.A.C. 5:23-12” after the word “Chap-
ter” in the second line, to delete the phrase “and
amusement devices” in the second sentence and to
replace the term “code official” with the term “con-
struction official” in the second sentence;

ii. The following text is added:

3001.1.1 Elevator car to accommodate ambulance
stretcher. In addition to the requirements of 403.8, if
applicable, an elevator installed in any newly-con-
structed multiple-family dwelling shall be of such a
size and arrangement as to accommodate a 24-inch
by 76-inch (610 mm by 1,930 mm) ambulance
stretcher in the horizontal, open position and shall be
identified by the international symbol for emergency
medical services (star of life). The symbol shall not
be less than three inches (76 mm) high and shall be
placed inside on both sides of the hoistway door
frame. At least one elevator accessing each residen-
tial floor shall be of such size and arrangement and
be so identified.

iii. Section 3001.2 is amended to substitute the term
“this code” for “these rules”, to add the phrase “with
the exception of Rule 1206.1h” after “ASME A17.17,
and to add the following sentence at the end of the first
paragraph: “However any education, experience or
training requirements included or cited in reference
standards shall not be binding in this State.”;

iv. Section 3002.1, “Hoisting and elevating equip-
ment, miscellaneous,” is amended to delete “inclined
elevators” in the fourth line;

v. Section 3003.0 is deleted in its entirety except
section 3003.3;

vi. Section 3004.1 is amended to delete the words
“and maintenance” and substitute in lieu thereof “in-
spection and,” and to delete the words “and periodic
inspections”;

vii. Section 3004.2 is amended to add the words
“and inspections” after the word “tests” in the title and
after the words “All such tests” in the seventh line; to
delete the words “this chapter” in the first sentence and
“this code” in the second sentence and substitute in

23-48.1

lieu thereof “these rules”; and to replace the term
“code official” with the term “appropriate subcode
official”’;

vili. Sections 3004.3 and 3004.4 are deleted in their
entirety;

ix. Section 3004.5.2 is amended to delete the words
“and amusement devices”;

x. Section 3004.5.4 is amended to replace the term
“code official” with the term “construction official”;

xi. Section 3005.0 is deleted in its entirety with the
exception of section 3005.4 which is amended to replace
the term “code official” with the term “construction
official”’;

xil. Section 3006.2 is amended to add in the fifth
line after the words “rescue purposes,” the phrase “and
all elevators installed as part of an accessible route or
approved to serve as an accessible means of egress”;

xiii. Section 3009.0 is amended to delete the words
“Signals and” after the word “Emergency” in the title;

xiv. Section 3010.2.2 is amended to replace the term
“code official” with the term “fire protection subcode
official”’;

xv. Section 3012.2 is deleted;

xvi. Section 3012.4 is amended to replace the term
“code official” with the term “construction official”;

xvii. Section 3012.5 is amended to replace the term
“code official” with the term ‘“construction official”;

xviii. Section 3013.0 is deleted in its entirety.

23. The following amendments are made to Chapter
31 of the building subcode, entitled “Special Construc-
tion”:

i. Section 3102.5 is deleted in its entirety.

ii. Section 3104.1.1 is deleted in its entirety and
replaced by the following language:

(1) Temporary structures: A construction permit
is required for the erection, operation or mainte-
nance of all temporary structures (excluding tents
and tensioned membrane structures) covering an
area in excess of 120 square feet, including all con-
necting areas or spaces with a common means of
egress or entrance, or which are used or intended to
be used for gatherings of 10 or more persons;

(2) Tents with appurtenances: A construction per-
mit is required for the erection, operation or mainte-
nance of all tents or tensioned membrane structures
of any size if they contain appurtenances such as
platforms or electrical equipment;

(3) Tents without appurtenances: No permit is
required for the erection, operation or maintenance

Supp. 11-4-02



5:23-3.14

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

of any tent or tensioned membrane structure without
appurtenances if the tent or structure is no more
than 900 square feet in area and no more than 30
feet in any dimension (excluding canopies), whether
it is one unit or composed of multiple units. Tents
used exclusively for recreational camping purposes
shall be exempt from the above requirements.

(4) A temporary greenhouse, also called a “hoop-
house” or “polyhouse,” used exclusively for the pro-
duction or storage of live plants, shall be exempt
from the permit requirements of the Uniform Con-
struction Code if it meets the following criteria:

(A) There is no permanent anchoring system or
foundation;

(B) There is no storage, temporary or otherwise,
of solvents, fertilizers, gases, or other chemical or
flammable materials;

(C) The structure is no wider than 31 feet and
there is an unobstructed path of no greater length
than 150 feet from any point to a door or fully
accessible wall area; and

(D) The covering of the structure is of a materi-
al no greater than six mils (152.4 micrometers) in
thickness, conforming to N.F.P.A. 701 standard,
that yields approximately four pounds of maximum
impact resistance to provide egress through the
wall.

(5) The provisions of (b) 22ii(4) above notwith-
standing, if a temporary greenhouse contains any
device subject to the electrical subcode or any me-
chanical equipment subject to the mechanical sub-
code, then a permit shall be required for the device,
system or fixture only. If the temporary greenhouse
is connected to a potable water system, a permit shall
be required for the backflow prevention devices only;

iii. Section 3104.6 is amended to replace the term
“code official” with the term “construction official”;

iv. Section 3106.5 is amended to replace the term
“authorities” with “authorities having jurisdiction”;

v. Section 3107.8 is amended to replace the term
“Mobile units” with the term “Manufactured Homes;”

vi. Section 3107.10 is amended as follows: The text
from the phrase “sections 118.0” to the end is deleted
and replaced with the following language: “N.J.A.C.
5:23-2.47; ’

vil. Section 3107.11 is amended to replace the term
“Section 3403.0” with the term “N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.5":

viii. Section 3108.5 is amended to add the phrase
“to comply with the requirements of the electrical
subcode” after the word “grounded.”

Supp. 11-4-02

23-482

24, The following amendments are made to Chapter
32 of the building subcode, entitled “Construction in the
Public Right of Way”:

i. Section 3202.5 is deleted in its entirety.
ii. Section 3204.2 is deleted.

iii. Section 3205.1 is amended to replace the term
“code official” on line 1 with the term “construction
official”.

25. The following amendments are made to Chapter

33 of the building subcode entitled “Site Work, Demoli-
tion and Construction’:

i. Section 3302.1 is amended to replace the term
“code official” on line 3 with the term ‘“‘construction
official”;

ii. Section 3309.2 is amended to delete the words
“and the construction and extension of soil and vent
stacks and the location of window openings shall com-
ply with the provisions of section 2908.3” and replace
them with the following language:

(1) “When a new building is erected higher than
an existing building, windows or other wall openings
shall not be located nearer than 10 feet to an existing
soil or vent stack on the lower building unless the
owner of the new building makes the necessary provi-
sion to extend such soil or vent stacks to a height of
not less than two feet above the topmost opening at
his own expense and with the approval of the adjoin-
ing owner.”

(2) “When the existing adjoining building is of
greater height than the new building, the owner of
the structure of greater height may, with consent of
the owner of the new structure, extend all new soil,
waste or vent stacks which are located within 20 feet
of the common lot line to a level above the higher
existing roof”; ‘

iii. Section 3310.0 is deleted in its entirety and
replaced by N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.17.

iv. Section 3315.0 is amended to replace the words
“Sections 1024.0 and 2702.2, item 5” with “Section
1024.0 and provide a level of illumination equivalent to
at least 3 foot candles (32 lux);”

26. Chapter 34 entitled “Existing Structures” is delet-
ed in its entirety.

27. The following amendments are made to Chapter
35 of the building subcode entitled “Referenced Stan-
dards™:

i. Under the subheading “ASME”, standard
“Al17.1-93”, add “and Al17.10-95 Addendum” after
“Al7.1a-94 Addendum;”

ii. Under the subheading “Codes” delete the fol-
lowing titles:

Next Page is 23-48.2.1



N

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.15

(1) BOCA National Property Maintenance Code;
(2) ICC International Mechanical Code;

(3) ICC International Plumbing Code—with 1996
Supplement;

(4) ICC International Private Sewage Disposal
Code—with 1996 Supplement;

(5) CABO Model Energy Code.

Amended by R.1981 d.132, effective May 7, 1981.
See: 13 N.J.R. 121(a), 13 N.J.R. 258(d).
Amended by R.1983 d.12, eff. February 7, 1983, operative February 22,

1983.

See: 14 N.J.R. 132(a), 15 N.J.R. 141(c).

Added (a)2 and (c).

Amended by R.1984 d.314, eff. August 6, 1984.
See: 16 N.J.R. 1139(a), 16 N.J.R. 2084(b).

This section was substantially amended.

Amended by R.1985 d.154, effective April 1, 1985 (operative July 1,

1985.)

See: 17 N.J.R. 239(a), 17 N.J.R. 810(a).

(a)2 added; subsection (c) added.

Correction: N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.14(c)5 was incorrect in adoption.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1409(a).

Amended by R.1985 d.324, effective July 1, 1985.

See: 17 N.J.R. 861(c), 17 N.J.R. 1646(a).

(b)3i: amended text.

Amended by R.1986 d.380, effective September 22, 1986.
See: 18 N.J.R. 1235(a), 18 N.J.R. 1931(a).

Substantially amended.

Amended by R.1987 d.374, effective September 21, 1987.
See: 19 N.J.R. 1024(a), 19 N.J.R. 1720(b).

Model subcode revisions.

Amended by R.1988 d.270, effective June 20, 1988.
See: 20 N.J.R. 575(a), 20 N.J.R. 1344(a).

Added (a)3 and (c).
Amended by R.1990 d.253, effective May 21, 1990.
See: 22 NLJ.R. 909(b), 22 N.J.R. 1554(a).

Text added at (c)2ii, 4, 5 and 7.
Amended by R.1990 d.325, effective July 2, 1990.
See: 21 NLJ.R. 1654(a), 22 N.J.R. 2001(a).
" Text added at (b)5xii(1) to conform to Fire Code.
Amended by R.1990 d.507, effective October 15, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 2208(a), 22 N.J.R. 3214(a).

Text conformed to BOCA National Code/1990.
Amended by R.1990 d.558, effective November 19, 1990.
See: 22 N.LR. 1969(b), 22 N.J.R. 3483(a).

Conditional exemption for hoophouses or polyhouses added.
Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991.

See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a).

Article 26 amended at (b)14.

Amended by R.1991 d.429, effective August 19, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 1487(a), 23 N.J.R. 2501(a).
In (a), added 3. Added (c).
Amended by R.1992 d.244, effective June 15, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 1147(a), 24 N.J.R. 2243(a).
Text added at (b)10v through viii.
Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a).
Amended by R.1995 d.144, effective March 20, 1995 (operative July 1,
1995).
See: 26 N.J.R. 2698(a), 26 N.J.R. 3524(a), 27 N.J.R. 1180(a).
Amended by R.1995 d.477, effective September 5, 1995.
See: 27 N.J.R. 1717(a), 27 N.J.R. 3328(a).
Added (b)2v.
Amended by R.1998 d.332, effective July 6, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 1377(a), 30 N.J.R. 2421(b).

Rewrote the section.

Amended by R.2000 d.492, effective December 18, 2000.
See: 32 N.J.R. 3219(a), 32 N.J.R. 4437(b).
Rewrote (b)25.

23-48.2.1

Amended by R.2001 d.127, effective April 16, 2001.
See: 33 N.J.R. 392(a), 33 N.J.R. 1195(a).

In (2)9, added new ix and recodified former ix through xiii as new x
through xiv.

Amended by R.2001 d.368, effective October 15, 2001.
See: 33 N.J.R. 1990(a), 33 N.J.R. 3673(b).

In (b)9, inserted a new ix and recodified former ix through xiv as x
through xv.

Amended by R.2001 d.369, effective October 15, 2001.
See: 33 N.J.R. 2365(a), 33 N.J.R. 3674(a).

In (b), substituted “seven” for “7% (2335 mm)” in 2vi, rewrote 10,
added a new 17, and recodified former 17 through 26 as 18 through 27.
Amended by R.2002 d.215, effective July 1, 2002.

See: 34 N.J.R. 1078(a), 34 N.J.R. 2312(a).

In (b)22, inserted new ii and recodified existing ii through xvii as iii
through xviii.

Administrative correction.
See: 34 N.J.R. 3771(b).

Case Notes

Set back provisions of borough zoning ordinance controlled conflict-
ing state building code provisions. Pfeuffer v. Sculco, 242 N.J.Super.
181, 576 A.2d 309 (A.D.1990).

5:23-3.15 Plumbing subcode
(a) Rules concerning subcode adopted are as follows:

1. Pursuant to authority of P.L. 1975, ¢.217, as modi-
fied by P.L. 1996, .53, the Commissioner hereby adopts
the Model Code of the National Association of Plumbing
Heating Cooling Contractors, known as “The National
Standard Plumbing Code/2000,” as the plumbing subcode
for New Jersey.

i. Copies of this code may be obtained from the
sponsor at: NAPHCC, P.O. Box 6808, Falls Church,
VA 22046.

2. “The National Standard Plumbing Code/2000,” may
be known and cited as “the plumbing subcode.”

(b) The following pages, chapters, sections or appendices
of the plumbing subcode are amended as follows:

1. The section entitled “Administration,” comprising
sections ADM 1.1 through ADM 1.13, is deleted in its
entirety.

2. Chapter 1 of the plumbing subcode, entitled “Defi-
nitions,” is amended as follows:

i. The definition of the term “administrative author-
ity” is deleted in its entirety, and substitute in lieu
thereof the following language, “Unless otherwise de-
fined herein, or unless the context clearly indicates
otherwise, the term “administrative authority” for pur-
poses of the plumbing subcode, shall mean the “plumb-
ing subcode official.”

ii. The definition of the term “approved” is amend-
ed to add after the word ‘“authority” on line 2, the
words “as defined in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.7.”

iii. The definition of the term “building” is deleted,
and substitute in lieu thereof, the definition of the term
“building” found in N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4.

Supp. 12-16-02



5:23-3.15

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 12-16-02

iv. The definition of the term “building classifica-
tion” is amended to delete the term “administrative
authority” and substitute in lieu thereof, the term
“building subcode official.”

v. The term and definition of “code” are deleted.
vi. The term and definition of “family” are deleted.

vil. The term and definition of “nuisance” are de-
leted.

viii. Add the following new definition after the defi-
nition of Swimming Pool: Swimming Pool, Public: A
swimming pool located on any property other than a
one or two family residential property and including,
but not limited to, swimming pools open to the use of
members, residents or the public.

3. Chapter 2 of the plumbing subcode, entitled “Gen-
eral Regulations,” is amended as follows:

i.  Section 2.4.1 is amended to delete the sentence
“The provisions of this paragraph may be waived by the
administrative authority.”

ii. Section 2.4.3 is amended to delete the phrase “or
is approved by the administrative authority as having a
desirable and acceptable function and is of ultimate
benefit to the proper and continuing functioning of the
plumbing system.”

iii. Section 2.5 is deleted in its entirety.

iv. Section 2.9.3 is amended to delete the phrase
“building code or as required by the proper administra-
tive authority” and substitute in lieu thereof, the term
“building subcode.”

v. Section 2.12 is amended to delete subparagraph
e.

vi. Section 2.16 is amended to insert the number
“Forty-two” in the blank space under item (a), and to
insert the number “Twenty-four” in the blank space
under item (b). Under item (c), delete the words “as
permitted in section 3.12.1.”

vii. Section 2.19.1 is amended to delete the blank
and the words “feet of any property line of the premis-
es, or other.”

viil. Section 2.19.2 is amended to delete the words
“the Health Department or other agency having juris-
diction” and substitute in lieu thereof “The New Jersey
Department of Environmental Protection.”

ix. Section 2.25 (h) is amended to add at the end,
the words “which does not otherwise adversely affect
health and safety.”

4. Chapter 3 of the plumbing subcode, entitled “Mate-
rials,” is amended as follows:

23-48.2.2

1. Section 3.1.1 is amended in the heading to delete
the word “minimum” and under items (a) and (b) to
delete the words “Section 3.12.2” at the end and substi-
tute in lieu thereof, the words “N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.7.”

ii. Section 3.1.2 is amended to delete the words “at
least” on line 1. Also the words “section 3.12” are
deleted at the end of the first paragraph and substitute
in lieu thereof, the words “N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.7.”

iii.  Section 3.1.3 is amended to delete the words
“Section 3.12.2” on line 2 and in lieu thereof, substitute
the words “N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.7.”

iv. Section 3.3.8a is amended to add the following
phrase: “Pressure vessels shall be designed and con-
structed in accordance with the requirements of Ameri-
can Society of Mechanical Engineers, (ASME), Rules
for Construction of Pressure Vessels, Section VIII/1998.
Any pressure vessel that exceeds any of the following,
shall meet the requirements of ASME and shall be
stamped ASME: A heat input rating of 200,000 BTU
per hour; or a water temperature of 200 degrees Fahr-
enheit; or a nominal water capacity of 120 gallons or
any other thresholds of ASME that apply.”

v. Section 3.3.11 entitled “septic tank” is deleted in
its entirety.

vi. Section 3.11.1 is amended to delete the phrase
“approved by the Administrative authority”.

vii. Section 3.11.2 is amended to delete the phrase
“except as may be otherwise authorized by the adminis-
trative authority”.

viii. Sections 3.12.1, 3.12.2, 3.12.3, 3.12.4, and 3.12.5
are deleted in their entirety.

5. Chapter 4 of the plumbing subcode entitled, “Joints
and Connections” is amended as follows:

i. Section 4.2.17(a) is amended to delete the phrase
“or be approved by the administrative authority.”

ii. Section 4.3.8(b)(3) is amended to delete the
words “be approved by the Administrative Authority if
such products are not listed or labeled” and to add the
phrase “or as permitted under N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.7.”

6. Chapter 5 of the plumbing subcode entitled,
“Traps, Cleanouts and Backwater Valves” is amended as
follows:

1. Section 5.3.2 is amended to add the phrase “in
accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.3” after the words
“administrative authority” on line 2.

ii. Section 5.3.4 is amended to add the phrase “in
accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.3” after the words
“administrative authority” on line 1.

7. Chapter 6 of the plumbing subcode, entitled “Inter-
ceptors,” is amended as follows:

Next Page is 23-48.3



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.16

vi. Section 18.8.4 is amended to add the phrase “for
dependent trailers” after the word “park” on line 1.

vil. Section 18.9 is deleted.
viii.  Section 18.10 is deleted.

17. Appendix A entitled “Sizing Storm Drainage Sys-
tems,” is deleted in its entirety.

18. Appendix E of the plumbing subcode, entitled
“Special Design Plumbing Systems,” is amended as fol-
lows:

i. Section E.2.1 is amended to delete the words
“local administrative authority’” on line 1 and in lieu
thereof, substitute “authority having jurisdiction.”

il. Section E.4.2 is amended to delete the term
“Administrative Authority” and substitute in lieu there-
of “Authority Having Jurisdiction.”

Amended by R.1981 d.132, effective May 7, 1981.
See: 13 NJ.R. 121(a), 13 N.J.R. 258(d).
Amended by R.1983 d.12, eff. February 7, 1983, operative February

22, 1983.

See: 14 N.J.R. 1326(a), 15 N.J.R. 141(c).

Added (a) 3 and (c).

Amended by R.1984 d.314, eff. August 6, 1984.
See: 16 N.J.R. 1139(a), 16 N.J.R. 2084(b).

Section substantially amended.

Amended by R.1986 d.12, effective February 3, 1986.
See: 17 N.J.R. 2714(a), 18 N.J.R. 267(a).

(a)1i had a change of address; (a)3 and (c) added.
Amended by R.1987 d.81, effective February 2, 1987.
See: 18 N.J.R. 2237(b), 19 N.J.R. 289(d).

Amended by R.1987 d.374, effective September 21, 1987.
See: 19 N.J.R. 1024(a), 19 N.J.R. 1720(b).

Model subcode revisions.

Amended by R.1989 d.66, effective February 6, 1989.
See: 20 N.J.R. 2846(a), 21 N.J.R. 288(a).

Added (c).

Amended by R.1990 d.58, effective February 5, 1990.
See: 21 N.J.R. 3346(a), 22 N.J.R. 351(a).

Added (d) adopting the 1989 Supplement to the 1987 National
Standard Plumbing Code.

Amended by R.1990 d.253, effective May 21, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 909(b), 22 N.J.R. 1554(a).

Text added at (a)3; (d)3ii amended.

Amended by R.1990 d.507, effective October 15, 1990.
See: 22 NJ.R. 2208(a), 22 N.J.R. 3214(a).

Text conformed to BOCA National Code/1990.
Amended by R.1991 d.326, effective July 1, 1991.

See: 23 N.J.R. 804(a), 23 N.J.R. 2044(a).

GPF set at 1.6; gravity water closets not permitted in commercial
uses.

Amended by R.1991 d.571, effective November 18, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 2619(a), 23 N.J.R. 3444(Db).

Added new (c).

Amended by R.1992 d.67, effective February 3, 1992.
See: 23 NJ.R. 3602(a), 24 N.J.R. 404(b).

Low volume water closet exception added at (b)18i(1).

Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993.

Next Page is 23-51

23-49

See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a).
Amended by R.1995 d.122, effective March 6, 1995 (operative July 1,
1995).
See: 26 N.J.R. 4874(a), 27 N.J.R. 894(a).
Amended by R.1998 d.136, effective March 16, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 4(a), 30 N.J.R. 1038(a).
In (b)9, added xii.
Amended by R.1998 d.332, effective July 6, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 1377(a), 30 N.J.R. 2421(b).
Rewrote the section.
Amended by R.2001 d.340, effective September 17, 2001.
See: 33 N.J.R. 1245(a), 33 N.J.R. 3308(b).
Rewrote the section.
Amended by R.2002 d.393, effective December 16, 2002.
See: 34 N.J.R. 2914(a), 34 N.I.R. 4428(a).
In (b)8, deleted former (ii) and recodified existing (iii) to (ix) as (ii)
to (viii).

Case Notes

Statute providing that only licensed master plumbers could be plumb-
ing contractors was unconstitutional. Mechanical Contractors Ass’'n of
New Jersey, Inc. v. State, 255 N.J.Super. 488, 605 A.2d 743 (A.D.1992).

5:23-3.16 Electrical subcode

(a) Rules concerning the subcode adopted are as follows:

1. Pursuant to authority of P.L. 1975, ¢.217, as modi-
fied by P.L. 1996, c.53, the Commissioner hereby adopts
the model code of the National Fire Protection Associa-
tion, known as ‘“The National Electrical Code 1999 as
the electrical subcode for New Jersey.

1. Copies of this code may be obtained from the
sponsors at NFPA, One Batterymarch Park, Quincy,
Massachusetts 02269.

2. The National Electrical Code 1999 may be known
and cited as “the electrical subcode.”

i. Codes and standards referenced in the Fine Print
Notes (FPNs) of the electrical subcode (NEC 99) shall
be considered adopted by reference to the extent pre-
scribed by each related section. These codes and stan-
dards also are printed in DCA Bulletin #00-1, which
contains a list of adopted codes and standards that are
applicable to the enforcement of the electrical subcode.

3. The Commissioner hereby adopts the National
Electrical Safety Code (ANSI C2-1997) for the installa-
tion of area lighting facilities by an electric utility on
private property on metal poles with an underground
electric feed.

i. Copies of the National Electrical Safety Code
may be obtained from the Institute of Electrical and
Electronic Engineers, Inc., PO Box 1331, 445 Hoes
Lane, Piscataway, New Jersey 08855-1331.

Supp. 12-16-02






UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.16

(b) The following chapters or articles of the electrical

subcode are amended as follows:

1. Article 90 of the electrical subcode, entitled “Intro-
duction,” is amended as follows:

i. Section 90-4, Enforcement, is amended to delete
in the first paragraph the phrase, “authority having
jurisdiction of enforcement of the code” and substitute
in lieu thereof, the term “electrical subcode official.”
And add a new last sentence in the first paragraph:
“Approval shall be in accordance with N.J.A.C.
5:23-2.9.” Delete in the second paragraph the phrase
“authority having jurisdiction” and substitute in lieu
thereof the term “electrical subcode official” and add
after “effective safety” the phrase “as provided in
N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.9.” Delete in the third paragraph the
phrase “authority having jurisdiction” and substitute in
lieu thereof the term “electrical subcode official” and
delete the phrase “by the jurisdiction” after the word
“adopted.”

ii. Section 90-5, entitled “Mandatory Rules, Permis-
sive Rules, and Explanatory Material,” is amended to
add “except as outlined under N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.16(a)2i”
after the word “Code” in line 6 under paragraph (c).

2. Chapter 1 of the electrical subcode, Article 100,
entitled “Definitions,” is amended as follows:

i. The definition of the term “approved” is amend-
ed to delete the phrase “the authority having jurisdic-
tion” and substitute in lieu thereof, the phrase “electri-
cal subcode. Approval shall be in accordance with
N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.7, 3.8 and 3.8A.”

ii. Amend to include the following definition: “Au-
thority having jurisdiction: Unless otherwise specifically
noted the authority having jurisdiction for the Electrical
Subcode shall be the Electrical Subcode Official”.

iii. The definition of the term “building” is deleted
and in lieu thereof, substitute the definition of the term
“building” found in N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4".

iv. The definition of the term “garage” is amended
to add the sentence, “The term cutoff is intended to
refer to the appropriate fire separation as required by
the building subcode.”

3. Chapter 2 of the electrical subcode, entitled “Wir-

ing and Protection,” is amended as follows:

i. Section 210-12(b) of Article 210, entitled
“Branch Circuits,” is amended to delete the words
“become effective January 1, 2002” at the end of the
section and in lieu thereof substitute the words “be
considered optional.”

4. Chapter 3 of the electrical subcode, entitled “Wir-
ing Methods and Materials,” is amended as follows:

i. Section 300-4(a)(1) is amended to delete the
words from “so that the edge ...” on line four through

23-51

(13

. cannot be maintained” on line six and in lieu
thereof substitute “as required by the building subcode.
Where the distance from the edge of the hole to the
nearest edge of the wood member is less than 1% inches
(31.8 mm).”

5. Chapter 5 of the electrical subcode, entitled “Spe-

cial Occupancies,” is amended as follows:

i. Exception to section 500-5(a)(4), section
514-5(b) and section 514-5(c) are amended to delete
the phrase “authority having jurisdiction” and substi-
tute in lieu thereof the phrase “fire protection subcode
official.”

ii. Part B of Article 550, entitled “Mobile Homes,
Manufactured Homes, and Mobile Home Parks” com-
prising sections 550-5 through 550-15 is deleted in its
entirety with the exception of section 550-5 which shall
be retained.

(1) Exception—Part B is retained in its entirety in
the case of mobile/manufactured homes undergoing
repair or alteration work.

ili. In Article 551, entitled “Recreation Vehicles
and Recreation Vehicle Parks,” delete from the title
the words “Recreation Vehicles and.”

(1) Section 551-1 is amended to delete the phrase
‘“within or on recreational vehicles” on line 2.

(2) Parts B, C, D, E and F, comprising sections
551-10 through 551-60, are deleted in their entirety,
with the exception of Figure 551-46(c), which shall

- be retained.

iv. The following amendments are made to Article
552, entitled “Park Trailers”:

(1) Parts B and C comprising Sections 552-10
through 55220 are deleted in their entirety.

(2) Part D comprising Sections 552-40 through
552-59 is deleted with the exception of Sections
552-43, 552-44 and 55247 which shall be retained.

(3) Part E is deleted in its entirety.

Amended by R.1981 d.132, effective May 7, 1981.
See: 13 NJ.R. 121(a), 13 N.J.R. 258(d).

Amended by R.1984 d.314, effective August 6, 1984.
See: 16 N.J.R. 1139(a), 16 N.J.R. 2084(b).

Section substantially amended.

Amended by R.1987 d.374, effective September 21, 1987.
See: 19 N.J.R. 1024(a), 19 N.J.R. 1720(b).
Model subcode revisions.
Amended by R.1990 d.253, effective May 21, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 909(b), 22 N.J.R. 1554(a).
Amendments to (b)4i(2), ii(2).
Administrative Correction to (b)4i(2).
See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b).
Amended by R.1990 d.507, effective October 15, 1990.
See: 22 NLJ.R. 2208(a), 22 N.J.R. 3214(a).

Text conformed to BOCA National Code/1990.
Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a).

Amended by R.1998 d.332, effective July 6, 1998.

Supp. 6-18-01



5:23-3.16

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

See: 30 N.J.R. 1377(a), 30 N.J.R. 2421(b).

Rewrote the section.

Amended by R.1998 d.362, effective July 20, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 1122(a), 30 N.J.R. 2644(b).

In (a), inserted a new 3.

Amended by R.2000 d.48, effective February 7, 2000.
See: 31 N.J.R. 2317(a), 32 N.J.R. 445(a).

In (a), substituted references to 1999 for references to 1996 through-
out, substituted a reference to One Batterymarch Park for a reference
to Batterymarch Park in 1i, and inserted 2i; and in (b), inserted 1ii,
inserted a new 3, recodified former 3 and 4 as 4 and 5, substituted a
reference to line four for a reference to line three and substituted a
reference to line six for a reference to line five in the new 4i, and
substituted a reference to section 500-5(a)(4) for a reference to section
500-3(a)4 in the new 5i.

Case Notes

Former N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.6 designated “National Electrical code of
1975” as controlling code; statute of limitations. Brown v. Jersey
Central Power and Light Co., 163 N.J.Super. 179 394 A.2d 397 (App.
Div.1978) certification denied 79 N.J. 489 401 A.2d 244.

5:23-3.17

(a) Rules concerning the subcode adopted area as fol-
lows:

Fire protection subcode

1. Pursuant to the authority of P.L. 1975, ¢.217 as
modified by P.L. 1996, c.53, the Commissioner hereby
adopts the following portions of the building, electrical,
mechanical and fuel gas subcodes, to the extent delineat-
ed in NJ.A.C. 5:23-3.4, as the fire protection subcode for
New Jersey.

i. BOCA National Building Code/1996 of the Build-
ing Officials and Code Administrators International
Inc. (N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.14):

(1) Chapter 3 entitled, “Use or Occupancy”
(2) Chapter 4—Special Use and Occupancy;

(3) Chapter 7—Fire resistant Materials and Con-
struction;

(4) Chapter 8—Interior Finishes;

(5) Chapter 9 Fire Protection Systems. Add the
following to section 906.8: Hydraulic system data
plates shall conform to N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.5(d);

(6) Chapter 10—Means of Egress;
(7) Sections 2113.0 through 2117.0 of Chapter

21—Masonry;

(8) Sections 2603.0 through 2605.0 of Chapter
26—Plastic;

(9) Section 3106.0 of Chapter 31—Special Con-
struction;

(10) Section 3305.0 of Chapter 33—Site Work,
Demolition and Construction;

(11) Section 3406.0 of Chapter 34—Existing Struc-
tures.

Supp. 6-18-01

ii. National Electrical Code/1999 of the National
Fire Protection Association (N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.16).

(1) Section 300-21 of Chapter 3—Wiring Methods
and Materials;

(2) Article 450, Part C—Transformer Vaults of
Chapter 4—Equipment for General Use;

(3) Chapter 5—Special Occupancies;

(4) Article 695—Fire Pumps of Chapter 6—Spe-
cial Equipment;

(5) Article 760—Fire Alarm Systems of Chapter
7—Special Conditions;

iii. International Mechanical Code/2000 of the In-
ternational Code Council (N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.20):

(1) Chapter 3—General Regulations;
(2) Chapter 5—Exhaust Systems;

(3) Chapter 6—Duct Systems;

(4) Chapter 7—Combustion Air;

(5) Chapter 8—Chimneys and Vents;

(6) Chapter 9—Specific Appliances, Fireplaces
and Solid Fuel Burning Equipment;

(7) Chapter 13—Fuel Oil Piping and Storage;

iv. International Fuel Gas Code/2000 of the Inter-
national Code Council (N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.22):

(1) Chapter 3—General Regulations;
(2) Chapter 5—Chimneys and Vans;
(3) Chapter 6—Specific Appliances.

2. The model code portions listed above may be
known as “the fire protection subcode.”

(b) Rules concerning modifications to subcodes are as
follows:

1. The modifications made to the appropriate portion
of the adopted model code in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.14 (Build-
ing Subcode), N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.16 (Electrical Subcode),
N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.20 (Mechanical Subcode) and N.J.A.C.
5:23-3.22 (Fuel Gas Subcode) will apply also to those
portions as regards this adoption.

Amended by R.1981 d.132, effective May 7, 1981.
See: 13 N.J.R. 121(a), 13 N.J.R. 258(d).
Amended by R.1984 d.314, effective August 6, 1984.
See: 16 N.J.R. 1139(a), 16 N.J.R. 2084(b).
Section substantially amended.
Amended by R.1986 d.380, effective September 22, 1986.
See: 18 N.J.R. 1235(a), 18 N.J.R. 1931(a).
Substantially amended.
Amended by R.1987 d.374, effective September 21, 1987.
See: 19 N.J.R. 1024(a), 19 N.J.R. 1720(b).
Model subcode revisions.
Amended by R.1990 d.253, effective May 21, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 909(b), 22 N.J.R. 1554(a).

23-52



NS

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.20A

(2) Delete “IFC—2000 International Fire Code”
and substitute the following: “BOCA National Fire
Prevention Code/1996.”

(3) Delete “IBC—2000 International
Code.”

(4) Delete “IEEC—2000 International Energy
Conservation Code.”

(5) Delete “IPC-2000 International
Code.”

Building

Plumbing

12. Appendix A of the mechanical subcode entitled
“Combustion Air and Chimney Connector Pass—
Throughs” is informative and is not part of the code.

13. Appendix B of the mechanical subcode entitled
“Recommended Permit Fee Schedule,” is deleted in its
entirety.

(c) Single station carbon monoxide alarms shall be install-
ed and maintained in full operating condition in the imme-
diate vicinity of each sleeping area in any guestroom or
dwelling unit located in a building of Use Group I-1, R-1,
R-2, R-3 or R4, if the building contains a fuel-burning
appliance or has an attached garage. An “open parking
structure,” as defined in the building subcode, shall not be
deemed to be an attached garage.

1. Exceptions: Guestrooms or dwelling units which do
not themselves contain a fuel-burning appliance or have
an attached garage, but which are located in a building
with a fuel-burning appliance or an attached garage, need
not be provided with single station carbon monoxide
alarms provided that:

i. The guestroom or dwelling unit is located more
than one story above or below any story which contains
a fuel-burning appliance or an attached garage; the
guestroom or dwelling unit is not connected by duct
work or ventilation shafts to any room containing a
fuel-burning appliance or to an attached garage; and
the building is provided with a common area carbon
monoxide alarm system. The individual alarms shall be
located in every room adjacent to the room(s) contain-
ing a fuel-burning appliance, and in every corridor, hall
or lobby adjacent to such room(s) and in the immediate
vicinity of any ventilated shaft, including, but not limit-
ed to, stair shafts, elevator shafts, ventilation shafts on
the story containing the fuel-burning appliance and any
story within two stories above or below said story. All
such common area alarm devices shall be connected to
an alarm monitoring station or shall be interconnected;
or

il. The building is provided with a monitored car-
bon monoxide alarm system. Individual alarms shall be
located in every room containing a fuel-burning appli-
ance. All such alarms shall be connected to an alarm
monitoring station that shall be staffed at all times by a
person who is trained and qualified to respond so as to

23-54.3

protect the health and safety of building occupants in
the event of the activation of one or more alarms.
Carbon monoxide alarms and fire alarms may be incor-
porated into a common monitored system.

2. Carbon monoxide alarms shall be manufactured,
listed and labeled in accordance with UL 2034 and shall
be installed in accordance with the requirements of this
section and NFPA 720. Carbon monoxide alarms shall
be battery operated, hard-wired or of the plug-in type.

R.1984 d.314, eff. August 6, 1984.
See: 16 N.J.R. 1139(a), 16 N.J.R. 2084(b).

New rule.

Amended by R.1985 d.154, effective April 1, 1985 (operative July 1,

1985).

See: 17 N.J.R. 239(a), 17 N.J.R. 810(a).
(a)2 added; subsection (c) added.
Amended by R.1986 d.380, effective September 22, 1986.
See: 18 N.J.R. 1235(a), 18 N.I.R. 1931(a).
Substantially amended.
Amended by R.1987 d.14, effective January 5, 1987.
See: 18 N.J.R. 2083(a), 19 N.J.R. 63(a).

In (b)5iv Section M-508 was deleted and Section M-508.1 was

substituted.
Amended by R.1987 d.374, effective September 21, 1987.
See: 19 N.J.R. 1024(a), 19 N.J.R. 1720(b).
Model subcode revisions.
Amended by R.1988 d.270, effective June 20, 1988.
See: 20 N.J.R. 575(a), 20 N.J.R. 1344(a).
Added (a)3 and (c).
Amended by R.1990 d.253, effective May 21, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 909(b), 22 N.J.R. 1554(a).

References to 1989 Supplement added; (c)1 and 3 added.
Amended by R.1990 d.507, effective October 15, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 2208(a), 22 N.J.R. 3214(a).

Text conformed to BOCA National Code/1990.
Amended by R.1991 d.429, effective August 19, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 1487(a), 23 N.J.R. 2501(a).

In (a), added 3. Added new (c). '

Amended by R.1992 d.183, effective April 20, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 167(a), 24 N.J.R. 1475(b).

Text added at (b)7 and (c)1, deleting parts of article 16 of the

mechanical subcode.

Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993.

See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a).

Amended by R.1995 d.120, effective March 6, 1995 (operative July 1,

1995).

See: 26 N.J.R. 4874(b), 27 N.J.R. 894(b).
Amended by R.1999 d.259, effective August 16, 1999.
See: 31 N.J.R. 825(a), 31 N.J.R. 2330(a).
Added (c).
Amended by R.2001 d.196, effective June 18, 2001.
See: 33 N.J.R. 6(a), 33 N.J.R. 2090(a).
Rewrote (a) and (b).
Administrative correction.
See: 33 N.J.R. 3310(a).
Amended by R.2002 d.15, effective January 22, 2002.
See: 33 N.J.R. 2933(b), 33 N.J.R. 3883(a), 34 N.J.R. 521(a).

In (c), added the last sentence in the introductory paragraph, and
rewrote 1.

Amended by R.2003 d.137, effective April 7, 2003.
See: 34 N.J.R. 4277(a), 35 N.J.R. 1558(c).

In (c), deleted “, or any dwelling unit of Use Group” following
“R-2”, and substituted “, R-3 or R-4” for “R-3 located in a building
required to be registered as a multiple dwelling” in the introductory
paragraph.

5:23-3.20A (Reserved)

New Rule R.1992 d.183, effective April 20, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 167(a), 24 N.J.R. 1475(b).

Supp. 4-7-03



5:23-3.20A

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Repealed by R.2001 d.196, effective June 18, 2001.
See: 33 N.J.R. 6(a), 33 N.J.R. 2090(a).
Section was “Indoor air quality subcode”.

5:23-3.21 One-and two-family dwelling subcode
(a) Rules concerning the subcode adopted are as follows:

1. Pursuant to authority of P.L. 1975, c.217, as modi-
fied by P.L. 1996, c.53, the Commissioner hereby adopts
the model code of the Council of American Building
Officials known as “The CABO One and Two Family
Dwelling Code/1995” ‘as the one and two-family dwelling
subcode for New Jersey subject to the modifications
stated in (c) below.

i. Copies of this code may be obtained from BOCA
International, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country
Club Hills, Illinois 60478-5795.

(b) The provisions of this subcode shall apply to the
construction, alteration, repair or increase in size of de-
tached one-or two-family dwellings or single family town-
houses, of Use Group R-4, of type 5B construction that are
not more than two stories or 35 feet in height and no more
than 4,800 square feet in area per floor. For the purpose of
applying this section, a habitable attic shall not constitute a
story. A habitable attic shall be an attic which has a stairway
as a means of access and egress and in which the ceiling
area at a height of seven feet above the attic floor is not
more than one-third the area of the next floor below.

1. The use of the CABO Code for the construction of
one or two family detached dwellings, as described in (b)
above, in flood prone areas shall be permitted. The
requirements of Section 3107.0 of the building subcode
shall supplement the requirements of the One and Two-
Family Dwelling Subcode when dwellings are built in
flood prone areas as identified by the most recent Flood
Insurance Rate Map published by the Federal Emergency
Management Agency.

(c) The following chapters or sections of the one and
two-family dwelling subcode are modified as follows:

1. Chapter 1 entitled “General Administration” is de-
leted in its entirety.

2. Chapter 2,
amended as follows:

entitled “Building Definitions,” is

i. The definition of the term “approved” is deleted.
In lieu thereof substitute “approved by the building
subcode official or other authority having jurisdiction in
accordance with the regulations.”

ii. The definition of the term “Approved Agency” is
amended to add the phrase “or other authority having
jurisdiction in accordance with the UCC” after the
word “Official” on line 4.

iii. The definition of the term “Building Official” is
deleted and is redefined herein and throughout the
subcode as the “building subcode official” as defined in
N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4 unless indicated otherwise.

iv. The definition of the term “Grade Plane” is
deleted. In lieu thereof substitute: “A reference plane
representing the average elevation of finished ground
level adjoining the building at all exterior walls. When
the finished ground level slopes away from the exterior
walls, the reference plane shall be established by the
lowest points within the area between the building and
the lot line, or when the lot line is more than 6 feet
from the building, between the building and a point 6
feet from the building.”

v. The definition of the term “Story” is amended to
delete “except that the topmost story shall be that
habitable portion of a building included between the
upper surface of the topmost floor and ceiling or roof
above.”

3. Chapter 3, entitled “Building Planning” is amended
as follows:

i. Section 301.2 is amended to modify Table 301.2a
to read as follows:

Table No. 301.2a
CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA

Roof Snow Load Wind Pressure Seismic Condition
(Ibs./sq. ft.) (Ibs./sq. ft.) by Zone
20 see see note 2
see note notes 4, 5, 6
3 and
fig. 301.2d
Notes:

Subject to Subject to
Damage from Frost Line Damage from
Weathering Depth Termite Decay
severe 2'-6" Yes Yes
see note 1 (Southern
Area)
3I_OH
(Northern
Area) See
notes 1, 2
and 3

1. Weathering may require a higher strength concrete or grade of masonry than necessary to satisfy structural requirements of

this code. The grade of masonry units shall be determined from the ASTM C34, C55, C62, C73, C90, C129, C145, C216, or C625 /

listed in Chapter 47. The frost line depth may require deeper footings than indicated in figure 403.1a.

Supp. 4-7-03 23-54.4

Next Page is 23-55

A\

|



W

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.21

Next Page is 23-57

2. New Jersey is divided into two zones: Zone one consists of Monmouth and Burlington Counties and all counties to the south.

Zone 2 consists of Mercer and Middlesex Counties and all counties to the north.

3. The enforcing agency having jurisdiction may establish values other than the ones listed for “roof snow load,” and “frost line
\ __ depth” if warranted by documented local climatic and geographic conditions.
4. Wind speed for Atlantic, Cape May, Monmouth, and Ocean counties, and Bass River, Washington, and Woodland townships

in Burlington County shall be 90 mph.

5. Wind speed for Bergen, Camden, Cumberland, Essex, Gloucester, Hudson, Mercer, Middlesex, Morris, Passaic, Salem,

Somerset, Union, and Burlington (except for Bass River, Washington, and Woodland townships) counties shall be 80 mph.

6. Wind speed for Hunterdon, Warren and Sussex counties shall be 70 mph.

ii. Section 302.1, in the first and fourth lines, delete
“3 feet” and substitute in lieu thereof, “5 feet.”

iii. Sections 303.4 and 303.4.1 are deleted in their
entirety.

iv. Section 303.6 “Required Heating” is deleted.

v. Section 309.1 Opening Protection—Delete and
substitute in lieu thereof the following: “Openings
from a private garage directly into a room used for
sleeping purposes shall not be permitted. Other open-
ings between the garage and residence shall be
equipped with solid core wood doors not less than 1%
inches in thickness or approved equivalent. The sills of
all door openings between garages and adjacent interior
spaces shall be raised not less than 4 inches above the
garage floor.”

vi. Section 309.2—Separation Required—Delete
and substitute in lieu thereof the following: “Private
garages located beneath rooms shall have walls, parti-
tions, floors and ceilings separating the garage from the
adjacent interior spaces constructed with not less than 1
hour fire resistance rating. Attached private garages
shall be completely separated from the adjacent interior
spaces and the attic area by means of %-inch gypsum
board or equivalent applied to the garage side.”

vii. Section 310.2.1—Minimum Size—In the second
sentence, in the fourth line, delete “22 inches (559
mm)” and substitute in lieu thereof ‘“24 inches (610
mm).”

viii. Section 312.1, under the second exception in
the second line, delete “8% inches” and substitute in
lieu thereof, “8 inches”;

ix. Sections 314.1, 314.2, 314.2.1 and 314.3 are de-
leted and substitute in lieu thereof the text of Section
R-213.1 of the 1992 CABO One and Two Family
Dwelling Code as follows:

23-55

“R-213.1 General: When risers are closed, all
treads may have a uniform projection not to exceed
1% inches.

The greatest riser height within a flight of stairs
shall not exceed the smallest by more than % inch.

The greatest tread run within any flight of stairs
shall not exceed the smallest by more than % inch.

Stairways shall not be less than 3 feet clear width,
and the headroom, rise and run shall conform to the
following requirements from Figure No. R-213.1 of
the 1992 CABO One and Two-Family Dwelling
Code. As per this figure, tread depth is 9" minimum,
riser height is 8%” maximum and headroom is 6’8"
minimum. Handrails may project from each side of
a stairway a distance of 4% inches into the required
width.”

x. Section 314.4 is amended to change “10 inches
(254 mm)” in the third line to “9 inches (229 mm).”

xi. Section 314.6 is amended to change “10 inches
(254 mm)” in the fourth line to “9 inches (229 mm).”

xii. Section 314.7 is deleted in its entirety;

xiii. Section 315.2 is deleted and substitute in lieu
thereof the following text from Section R-214.1 of the
1992 CABO One and Two-Family Dwelling Code.

“The handgrip portion of the handrails shall not be
more than 2 % inches in cross-sectional dimension, or
the shape shall provide an equivalent gripping surface.
The handgrip portion of handrails shall have a smooth
surface with no sharp corners.”

xiv. Section 316.1.1 entitled “Alterations, repairs
and additions” is deleted in its entirety.

xv. In Section 317.2.4, after the words “foam filled
doors” add the phrase “except for fire doors”;

Supp. 4-7-03



N

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.21

e

xvi. Section 324 is deleted in its entirety.

4. Chapter 4, entitled “Foundations,” is amended as
follows:

i. Section 404.1, Concrete and Masonry, is amended
to delete the exception.

ii. Section 404.2 is deleted and replaced with the
following text from the 1992 edition of the CABO One
and Two Family Dwelling Code, Section R-304.4:
“Foundation walls subject to more pressure than would
be exerted by backfill having an equivalent fluid weight
of greater than 30 pounds per cubic foot (4.72 kN/m?)
shall be designed in accordance with accepted engineer-
ing practices.” '

iii. In Section 405.1, the exception is amended to
delete the text and substitute the following language
from the 1992 edition of the CABO One and Two
Family Dwelling Code, Section R-305.1: “A drainage
system is not required when the foundation is installed
on well-drained ground or sand-gravel mixture soils
according to the Unified Soil Classification System,
Group I Soils.”

iv. Section 407 of the 1995 CABO One and Two-
Family Dwelling Code entitled “Foundation Insulation”
is deleted in its entirety.

>

v. Add new section 410 “Pile Foundation,” as fol-
lows: “Pile foundations utilized in buildings under the
scope of this subcode shall be regulated by Chapter 18
of the building subcode.”

5. Chapter 5, entitled “Floors,” is amended as follows:

i. In Section 501.1, replace the phrase “Section
108” with the phrase “N.J.A.C. 5: 23-3.6 and 3.7.”

ii. In Section 501.2, delete the words “imposed
according” from line three.

iii. In Section 502.4, replace the word “approval”
with “approved.”

iv. In Section 505.2.2, delete the exception and re-
place it with the following text: “Except where required
by the radon subcode, a base course is not required
when the concrete slab is installed on well-drained or
sand-gravel mixture soils.”

v. In Section 505.2.3, exception, insert the phrase
“Where permitted by the radon subcode,” at the begin-
ning of line one.

6. Chapter 6, entitled “Wall Construction,” is amend-
ed as follows:

i. In Section 601.1, delete the words “Section 108”
and in lieu thereof insert “N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.6 and 3.7”;

ii. Delete Section 604.1.1.

7. Chapter 7, entitled “Wall Covering,” is amended as
follows:

23-57

i. In Section 701.1, delete the words “Section 108”
and in lieu thereof insert “N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.6 and 3.7”;

8. Chapter 8, entitled “Roof Ceiling Construction,” is
amended as follows:

i. In Section 801.1, delete the words “Section 108”
and in lieu thereof insert “N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.6 and 3.7.”

9. Chapter 9, entitled “Roof Coverings,” is amended
as follows:

i. In Section 901.1, delete the words “Section 108”
and in lieu thereof insert “N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.6 and 3.77;

ii. In Section 901.3, “Roof Covering Materials,” on
line three, delete the phrase “in areas ... 3 feet” and
replace with the phrase: “when the edge of the roof is
less than 6 feet ( 1829 mm)”;

iii. Section 910.1 is amended to delete the words
“Sections 117 and” and substitute the word “Section”
and to delete the sentence “When the repair ... for
the new roofing.”

iv. Section 910.3, item number 3 is amended to
delete the word “three” and substitute in lieu thereof
“tWO,”

10. Chapter 10, entitled “Chimneys and Fireplaces,” is
amended as follows:

i. Section 1001.7 is amended to add the following
phrase after “1800°F”: “and embedded in medium duty
refractory mortar complying with ASTM C105.” Delete
the Exception.

ii. Section 1002 is amended to add the sentence:
“Factory-built chimneys shall conform to UL 103 and
be installed in accordance with their listing.”

iii. In Section 1003.4, in the last line, change “10
inches” to “12 inches.”

iv. In Section 1003.7, in the second line, change “2
inches (51 mm) thick” to “4 inches (102 mm) solid
masonry or equivalent.”

v. In Section 1003.9, in the second and fifth lines,
change “2 inches (51 mm)” to “4 inches (102 mm)” and
add the sentence “The minimum clearance to combusti-
bles from the exterior surface of the smoke chamber
shall be 2 inches (51 mm).”

vi. Section 1004.1, item #4 is amended to add the
following after the word “opening”: “for a fireplace
having an opening of less than 6 square feet. The
hearth of a fireplace with a larger opening shall extend
a minimum of 20 inches (508 mm) beyond the face of
the fireplace opening and a minimum of 12 inches (305
mm) on each side of the fireplace opening.” Also, in
item #5 of Section 1004.1, delete the text and substi-
tute in lieu thereof: “Factory-built fireplaces shall be
listed, labeled and tested according to UL 127, and
installed according to their listing.”

Supp. 10-15-01



5:23-3.21

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

vii. Section 1005.1 is amended to add “Factory-built
fireplace stoves shall be tested according to UL 737.” to
the end of the section.

11. Chapter 11 entitled, “Mechanical Administration”
is amended as follows:

i. Section 1101.2 is deleted;
ii. Section 1103 is deleted.

12. Chapter 12, entitled “Mechanical Definitions,” is
amended as follows:

i. In Section 1202.0, the term and definition ‘“Un-
usually tight construction” are deleted.

13. Chapter 13 entitled, “General Mechanical System
Requirements” is amended as follows:

i. Section 1304.1 is amended to add the sentence,
“This section shall not preclude the employees of a
natural gas utility from converting existing liquefied
petroleum installations to natural gas without permits.”

ii. Section 1307.1 is amended to delete the last
sentence.

iii. Section 1307.4 is deleted.

14. Chapter 14, entitled “Heating and Cooling Equip-
ment,” is amended as follows:

1. Section 1401.3 is deleted.

15. Chapter 15 entitled, “Electric Resistance Heating”
is amended as follows:

i. Section 1501.1 is amended to delete the words
“Chapters 39-46 of this code” and substitute in lieu
thereof “the requirements of the electrical subcode.”

ii. Section 1502.1 is amended to delete the words
“Chapters 39-46 of this code” and substitute in lieu
thereof “the requirements of the electrical subcode.”

iii. Section 1502.2 is amended to delete the words
“Chapters 39-46 of this code” and substitute in lieu
thereof “the requirements of the electrical subcode.”

iv. Section 1503.1 is amended to delete the words
“Chapters 39-46 of this code” and substitute in lieu
thereof “the requirements of the electrical subcode.”

16. Chapter 21 entitled, “Chimneys and Vents” is
amended as follows:

i. Section 2101.3 is amended to replace the words
“cleaned and free of obstructions.” with the words
“inspected in accordance with the chimney certification
program as provided for in N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.20(c).”

17. Chapter 25 entitled, “Hydronic Piping” is amend-
ed as follows:

i.  Section 2501.3 is amended to delete the words
“Chapter 29-38 of this code” and substitute in lieu
thereof “the requirements of the plumbing subcode.”

Supp. 10-15-01

ii. Section 2501.4 is amended to delete the words
“the provisions listed in Section 3402” and substitute in
lieu thereof “the requirements of the plumbing sub-
code.”

18. Chapter 26 entitled, “Fuel-Gas Piping” is amend-
ed as follows:

i. Section 2602 is deleted;

ii. Section 2603.1 is deleted;
iii. Section 2603.2 is deleted;
iv. Section 2603.3 is deleted;

v. Section 2608.9 is amended to delete the words
“Chapters 39-46 of this code” and substitute in lieu
thereof “the requirements of the electrical subcode.”

19. Chapters 29 through 46 are deleted.
20. Appendices A through F are deleted.

New Rule, R.1985 d.324, effective July 1, 1985.

See: 17 N.J.R. 861(c), 17 N.J.R. 1646(a).

Amended by R.1987 d.374, effective September 21, 1987.
See: 19 N.J.R. 1024(a), 19 N.J.R. 1720(b).

Model subcode revisions.
Amended by R.1988 d.388, effective August 1, 1988.
See: 20 N.J.R. 1130(a), 20 N.J.R. 2073(b).

Added (c).
Amended by R.1990 d.253, effective May 21, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 909(b), 22 N.J.R. 1554(a).

References to 1989 Supplement added; (b)lii(5), 2, 4, 8 and 9
amended; (b)5, 6 and 7 added; (c) deleted; Table R-201.2 added.
Amended by R.1991 d.571, effective November 18, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 2619(a), 23 N.J.R. 3444(b).

Added new (c).
Amended by R.1992 d.208, effective May 18, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 680(a), 24 N.J.R. 1879(a).

Code provisions applicable to flood hazard zones clarified.
Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a).

Amended by R.1998 d.332, effective July 6, 1998.

See: 30 N.J.R. 1377(a), 30 N.J.R. 2421(b).
Rewrote the section.

Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April 17, 2000.

See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a).

In (c)4, substituted “more pressure than would be exerted by back-
fill” for “lateral pressure from soils” following “subject to” in ii, and
substituted “drainage” for “designated disposal” preceding “system”
and added “according to the Unified Soil Classification System, Group
1 Soils” at the end of iii; and inserted (c)9iv.

Amended by R.2001 d.369, effective October 15, 2001.
See: 33 N.J.R. 2365(a), 33 N.J.R. 3674(a).

In (b), inserted “that are” following “type 5B construction”, “no
more” preceding “than 4,800 square feet”, and substituted “seven feet”
for “7% feet (2,235 mm.)”.

5:23-3.22 Fuel gas subcode

(a) Rules concerning the subcode adopted are as follows:

1. Pursuant to authority of P.L. 1975, ¢.217, the Com-
missioner hereby adopts the model code of the Interna-
tional Code Council, Inc., known as the International
Fuel Gas Code/2000. This code is hereby adopted by
reference as the Fuel Gas Subcode for the State of New
Jersey subject to the modifications stated in (b) below.

23-58



NS

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-12.10

5:23-12.8 Alterations, replacements, damages, increases in
size, changes in use group, minor work, ordinary
repairs

(a) In complying with this chapter, calculations concern-
ing alterations, replacements, damages, increases in size and
changes in use group, in N.J.A.C. 5:23-2, shall be performed
using data for entire structures. The alteration provisions
applicable to the whole structure and/or calculations in
N.J.A.C. 5:23-2 shall not be applied to individual elevator
devices.

(b) For purposes of this subchapter, alteration of an
elevator device means any change to equipment other than
minor work and ordinary repair, as defined in N.J.A.C.
5:23-2.17A and 5:23-9.3. When work that includes the
alteration of an elevator device has a total cost of less than
50 percent of the physical value of the building, the altera-
tion of the elevator device shall comply only with the
applicable requirements of Part XII (Alterations, Repairs,
Replacements and Maintenance) of the most recent edition
of ASME A17.1 referenced in the building subcode.

Amended by R.1995 d.564, effective November 6, 1995 (operative
March 1, 1996).
See: 27 N.J.R. 2829(a), 27 N.J.R. 4281(b).

5:23-12.9 Certificate of compliance requirements

(a) A device shall be granted a certificate of compliance
by the construction official for the time period specified
based upon N.J.A.C. 5:23-12.3. No device shall be operat-
ed unless a valid certificate of compliance has been issued
except for the initial period after work under a permit has
been completed as per (f) below. Any violation shall be
corrected before a new certificate of compliance may be
issued.

(b) A temporary certificate of compliance may be issued
by the construction official for a device in order to keep the
device in operation on which work, as a result of violations,
is being diligently performed, if the elevator subcode official
finds that no hazard to the public is thereby created. A
temporary certificate of compliance may be issued for no
longer than 180 days, even if the device is inspected on an
annual basis.

(c) The elevator subcode official shall provide written
notice to the construction official whenever a temporary
certificate of compliance or certificate of compliance is
granted by the construction official.

(d) No certificate of compliance shall be issued for any
elevator device in use on or before July 1, 1992 that is
subject to these rules and is not registered with the Depart-
ment in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-12.4, except elevator
devices in structures classified as Use Group R-3 and R-4
shall be exempt from registration. Elevator devices wholly
within R-2 residences, not accessible to the general public
shall also be exempt.

23-185

(e) No certificate of compliance or temporary certificate
of compliance shall be issued for any elevator device, as
required by this section, which has been approved to oper-
ate during the initial period, after a permit, in accordance
with (f) below if the device has not been registered pursuant
to this subchapter by its first routine inspection, even if a
certificate of occupancy, temporary certificate of occupancy
or certificate of approval has been issued.

(f) Except as otherwise provided in (e) above, a new
device or an existing device which has had work done under
a permit shall be issued a certificate of compliance upon the
first cyclical inspection based on the following:

1. A device has been approved following the inspec-
tion and witnessing of an acceptance test, as required by
N.J.A.C. 5:23-12.2, by the application of an Inspection
Sticker Approval for Elevator and a recommendation by
the elevator subcode official on an Elevator Subcode
Technical Section form for a certificate of occupancy or
approval, as the case may be.

i. The date of the approval shall begin the cycle of
inspections and tests for new devices in a new building
and for new devices in an existing building which did
not have elevator devices previously.

ii. The date of the approval of an existing device in
an existing building shall not change the device’s exist-
ing cycle of inspections and tests. The cycle shall
remain consistent with the inspection cycle in the build-
ing, except the device shall not be subject to the five
year test before it is due as long as the acceptance test
performed under the permit was a full five year test.

2. A device has been approved following the inspec-
tion process, as required for minor work by N.J.A.C.
5:23-2.17A(d)2 and 12.2, by the application of an Inspec-
tion Sticker Approval for Elevator and a recommendation
by the elevator subcode official on an Elevator Subcode
Technical Section form for a certificate of approval.

i. The device may operate under the approval given
under the permit until the next cyclical inspection, as
determined by the inspection cycle of the building, and
then shall be subject to a routine or periodic inspection
the same as all other elevator devices in the building.

New Rule, R.1995 d.476, effective September 5, 1995 (operative Janu-
ary 1, 1996).

See: 27 N.J.R. 1846(a), 27 N.J.R. 3325(b).

Amended by R.1995 d.564, effective November 6, 1995 (operative
March 1, 1996).

See: 27 N.J.R. 2829(a), 27 N.J.R. 4281(b).

Amended by R.1996 d.512, effective November 4, 1996.

See: 28 N.J.R. 3697(a), 28 N.J.R. 4782(a).

5:23-12.10 Inspections in seasonal facilities

(a) For purposes of this subchapter, a “seasonal facility”
is defined as a building that is open, and available for use by
members of the public, employees or maintenance person-
nel or any occupants, for a period of not more than 184

Supp. 2-18-03



5:23-12.10

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

consecutive days and is then closed and not available for
such use for at least 181 consecutive days.

(b) Elevator devices in seasonal facilities shall be subject
only to the applicable periodic inspections and tests (one,
three and five year). Such inspections and tests shall be
performed prior to the building being used by employees,
maintenance personnel, members of the public or occu-
pants. A certificate of compliance or temporary certificate
of compliance shall be granted only for the time period
during which the device is allowed to operate in the season-
al facility.

1. The fees for performing such inspections and wit-
nessing tests shall be in accordance with such provisions
of N.J.A.C. 5:23-12.6 as may be applicable.

(c) An owner of a building with one or more elevator
devices may obtain classification of the building as a “sea-
sonal facility” from the local enforcing agency. A request
for such classification shall contain the information in (d)
below and shall be signed by the owner.

(d) An application for classification of a building as a
seasonal facility shall include the following information:

1. The owner’s name and address, the building ad-
dress, the registration number, the device identification
number(s), and the date of the last inspection;

2. That the total number of consecutive calendar days
per year when the building is in use by the public,
employees, maintenance personnel or occupants does not
exceed 184 days and that the building is then closed for
such use for at least 181 consecutive calendar days;

3. That the elevator devices in the building are not
accessible to members of the public, employees, mainte-
nance personnel or building occupants during the time in
which the building is closed; and

4. That the disconnects located in elevator device
machine rooms and machinery spaces are, during the time
in which the building is closed, in the “off” position and
locked; and that the access to the keys is secured.

(e) The seasonal facility classification shall become inval-
id when the conditions of the classification are no longer
met. The owner shall immediately notify the enforcing
agency of any change in the conditions upon which the
approval of classification as a seasonal facility was based.

1. Classification of a building as a seasonal facility
shall not be renewed if the classification became invalid as
a result of a violation of any conditions of the approval of
the classification.

(f) During the period of time in which any device in
seasonal facility is in operation, it shall be subject to all
applicable code requirements in the same manner as any
other device subject to this subchapter.

Supp. 2-18-03

New Rule, R.1996 d.323, effective July 15, 1996 (operative January 1,
1997).
See: 28 N.J.R. 2112(a), 28 N.J.R. 3549(a).

5:23-12.11 Notice concerning accidents

(a) The construction official shall notify the Department
about those accidents involving elevator devices (reported to
the enforcing agency as required by the building subcode)
that involve either death or personal injury requiring medi-
cal treatment by a physician other than first aid or damage
to the elevator device that was either a result or cause of the
accident and which affects the future safe operation of the
device. For purposes of this section, “first aid” means the
one time treatment or observation of scratches, cuts not
requiring stitches, burns, splinters or contusions, or a diag-
nostic procedure, including examination and x-rays, which
does not indicate any need for further medical treatment.
First aid may be performed by licensed medical personnel or
by other persons.

1. The construction official shall notify the Elevator
Safety Unit about any accident within five working days
after the accident is reported to the enforcing agency,
except that accidents involving devices under the Depart-
ment’s jurisdiction shall be reported as soon as possible,
but not later than the end of the next business day after
an accident is reported to the construction official.

2. Within five working days after an accident involving
a device not under the Department’s jurisdiction is re-
ported to the enforcing agency, a copy of the Accident/In-
cident Report form and all attachments, as indicated in
the form, shall be forwarded to the Elevator Safety Unit
by the construction official.

3. When a special inspection is performed by a person
other than the Flevator Safety Unit subcode official, a
copy of the Inspection Report shall be forwarded to the
Elevator Safety Unit within five working days after the
date of the special inspection.

New Rule, R.1997 d.64, effective February 18, 1997 (operative May 19,
1997).
See: 28 N.J.R. 4695(a), 29 N.J.R. 550(a).

5:23-12.12 Special safety equipment

(a) On all existing elevators, a space between the elevator
hoistway door and the car door or gate shall comply with
the requirements of Rule 204.4e of ASME A17.1-1990.
Where the space exceeds the maximum distance, a space
guard shall be installed to minimize the gap. Sight guards
shall be installed along with the space guards on horizontally
sliding type hoistway doors.

1. Freight elevators that are equipped with horizontal-
ly swinging doors, are not accessible to the general public,
and are located in the factories, warehouses, garages, or
similar buildings shall not be required to comply.

23-186



~

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-12A.2

2. Installation of space and sight guards shall comply
with all applicable requirements of ASME A17.3-1993
and shall be considered minor work within the meaning of
N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.17A.

(b) In buildings containing more than one elevator de-
vice, each such device shall be identified by a number
according to BOCA, Rule 3003.3 and ASME A17.1 refer-
enced in the building subcode.

1. In addition, each elevator shall be identified by
such a number in every elevator lobby. The identification
number shall be a minimum of 1% inches high and of a
color that contrasts with the background. The number
shall be permanent and shall be on or adjacent to every
elevator hoistway entrance frame. By August 4, 2003, all
existing elevators shall comply with this requirement.

(c) On each existing escalator, a skirt obstruction device
conforming to ASME A17.1-93-95, Rule 805.1.h. and a step
level device conforming to ASME A17.1-93-95, Rule
805.1.s. shall be installed by August 4, 2003.

(d) On each existing elevator, a floating (movable) plat-
form that permits the operation of the elevator when the car
door or gate is not in the closed position shall be prohibited.
Use of a floating (movable) platform that exists as of
February 4, 2002 on any elevator shall be discontinued by
August 4, 2003.

(e) A sign stating “DO NOT USE A STANDING ESCA-
LATOR AS A BUILDING STAIR” shall be permanently
placed where it is readily visible to the general public at the
top and bottom landings of an escalator. Each sign shall
comply with the applicable requirements of ASME
A17.1-93-95, Rule 805.2.b. This requirement shall apply to
new escalator installations and to existing escalators. All
existing escalators shall be required to comply with this
subsection by August 18, 2004.

New Rule, R.1997 d.305, effective July 21, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 2205(a), 29 N.J.R. 3249(a).
Amended by R.2002 d.43, effective February 4, 2002.
See: 33 N.J.R. 3714(a), 34 N.J.R. 732(b).
Rewrote the section.
Administrative correction.
See: 35 N.J.R. 219(c).
Amended by R.2003 d.72, effective February 18, 2003.
See: 34 N.J.R. 3672(a), 35 N.J.R. 1055(a).
Added (e).

SUBCHAPTER 12A. OPTIONAL ELEVATOR
INSPECTION PROGRAM

5:23-12A.1 Title; scope; intent

(a) This subchapter of the rules, adopted pursuant to the
authority of the Uniform Construction Code Act, as supple-
mented by P.L. 1997, ¢.336, is entitled “Optional Elevator

23-187

Inspection Program” and shall be known and cited through-
out this chapter as N.J.A.C. 5:23-12A. When referred to in
this subchapter, it may be cited as “this subchapter.”

(b) Unless otherwise specifically provided, all references
to paragraphs, sections, or to provisions not specifically
identified, shall be construed to refer to such paragraph or
section or provision of this subchapter.

(c) This subchapter shall control all matters relating to
the administration of the registration of qualified elevator
device inspection firms, hereinafter referred to as “qualified
firms,” qualified elevator device inspectors and the elevator
devices enrolled in this optional program, as defined in (d)
below.

(d) For purposes of this subchapter, “elevator” or “eleva-
tor device” means a hoisting and lowering device equipped
with a car or platform which moves in guides for the
transportation of individuals or freight in a substantially
vertical direction through successive floors or levels of a
building or structure. The term shall include, without limi-
tation, elevators, dumbwaiters, wheelchair lifts, manlifts,
stairway chairlifts and any device within the scope of ASME
A17.1 (Safety Code for Elevators and Escalators) or ASME
A90.1 (Safety Standard for Belt Manlifts), except escalators
and moving walks.

1. This definition shall not apply to any conveyor
devices that are process equipment.

5:23-12A.2 Qualified elevator device inspection firms

(a) Any sole proprietorship, partnership, association or
corporation that is engaged in the business of maintaining,
inspecting and testing elevator devices, has at all times, as a
bona fide employee, at least one qualified elevator device
inspector, and carries general liability insurance in at least
the amount of $4,000,000 for each person and each occur-
rence to satisfy claims or judgments for property damage
and/or personal injury may apply for registration with the
Department as a qualified firm.

1. The application shall contain information relating
to the financial integrity of the firm, as evidenced by a
reviewed financial statement prepared by an independent
certified public accountant.

2. The application shall contain the names and ad-
dresses and home phone numbers of all persons who hold
at least a ten percent interest in the qualified firm and/or
are corporate officers.

3. Each applicant for registration as a qualified firm
shall disclose in the application any subsidiary or parent
relationship with any other qualified firm or other entity
regulated by the State Uniform Construction Code and
shall further disclose all interests of any officer, partner,
or stockholder of the firm in any other qualified firm or
other entity regulated by the State Uniform Construction
Code.

4. Each application shall include a sample form of the
contract of full service needs to be used for the purposes
of this subchapter.

Supp. 2-18-03



5:23-12A.2

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

(b) Upon receipt of a completed application on a form
prescribed by the Department, including the information in
(a) above and a nonrefundable fee of $250.00, the Depart-
ment shall issue a certificate of registration, unless the
application is denied in accordance with (c) below.

1. The certificate of registration shall remain valid,
unless revoked in accordance with (c) below, for two
consecutive years following the date of registration; pro-
vided, however, that the certificate of registration shall
become inactive for any period of time during which the
firm ceases to engage in the business of maintaining,
inspecting and testing elevator devices or ceases to em-
ploy at least one qualified elevator device inspector. It
shall be the responsibility of the qualified firm to inform
the Department within 30 days of any changes to the
status of the qualified firm during the two-year registra-
tion period. It shall be the responsibility of the firm to
reapply for registration at least two months prior to the
renewal date to make current the information contained
in the original application by submission of a completed
reapplication form, as prescribed by the Commissioner.

(c) A certificate of registration may be denied or revoked
if the Department determines that the firm, or any person
holding an ownership interest in the firm or otherwise
authorized to represent the firm, has at any time:

1. Willfully made a misstatement of material fact in an
application for issuance or renewal of a registration certif-
icate;

2. Willfully committed fraud in connection with the
maintenance, inspection or testing of any elevator device;

3. Maintained, inspected or tested any elevator device
in a grossly negligent manner;

4. Failed to ensure that the qualified elevator device
inspectors that it employs perform their duties in accor-
dance with the requirements of this subchapter;

5. Habitually failed to ensure the timely submission of
the elevator device certification in accordance with the
requirements of this subchapter;

6. Willfully violated the requirements of the State
Uniform Construction Code to any substantial degree; or

7. Failed to report an accident or equipment failure as
required by the building subcode and N.J.A.C. 5:23-12.11.

5:23-12A.3 Qualified elevator device inspector

(a) A candidate for certification as a qualified elevator
device inspector for the inspection and testing of elevator
devices enrolled under this subchapter shall pay a nonre-
fundable fee of $65.00 and shall meet the following compe-
tence and experience requirements:

1. Seven years of experience consisting of one or a
combination of the following:

i. Experience in construction, design, or supervision
as a journeyman in a skilled trade currently regulated
by the elevator subcode;

ii. Experience as an elevator inspector; or

Supp. 2-18-03

iii. Experience as a construction contractor in a
field of construction currently regulated by the elevator
subcode; and

2. Demonstration of competence by successful com-
pletion of one of the following:

i. Successful completion of the examination module
6B-Elevator General of the National Certification Pro-
gram for Construction Code Inspectors administered by
the Chauncy Group, a subsidiary of the Educational
Testing Service for the Department; or

ii. Possession of a current Qualified Elevator In-
spector (QEI) certificate issued pursuant to ASME
QEI-1-1993.

(b) The certificate shall be renewed every three years
upon the submission of a renewal application, payment of a
renewal fee of $65.00 and submission of documentation of
continuing education as follows:

1. Documentation of having completed 1.5 Continuing
Education Units (CEUs) in a related technical subject
area, as approved by the Bureau of Code Services, within
the three-year period preceding the date of application.
One CEU equals 10 contact hours;

2. Annual submission of a current QEI certificate; or

3. Submission of equivalent certification approved by
the Bureau of Code Services.

(c) A qualified elevator device inspector, when employed
by a qualified elevator device inspection firm, shall perform,
and certify by signature, the inspection and tests required by
this subchapter. The qualified inspector shall not inspect
his or her own work; however, the qualified elevator device
inspector may perform work as required under the contract
of full service needs on the device he or she is inspecting at
the time of the inspection and test, provided that work does
not require more than one person. The maintenance and
repair of a contracted device that is required at any other
time under a contract of full service needs shall be per-
formed by another individual, and not by the certifying
inspector.

(d) The Department may revoke a certificate, suspend a
certificate for not more than one year, and/or assess a civil
penalty of not more than $500.00 for each violation, if the
Department determines that a qualified inspector:

1. Has violated any provision of the State Uniform
Construction Code;

2. Has obtained a certificate by fraud or misrepresen-
tation;

3. Has been grossly negligent or has engaged in mis-
conduct in the performance of his or her duties pursuant
to this subchapter;

4. Has failed, over a period of time, to maintain a
minimally acceptable level of competence;

5. Has failed to comply with any order issued by the
Department;

23-188

\_/



L

w

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-12A4

6. Has made a false or misleading written statement,
or has made a material omission, in any submission to the
Department; or

7. Has engaged in any conduct which demonstrates
incompetency or dishonesty.

(e) An individual possessing an elevator inspector HHS
license issued pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.19 may apply for
the qualified elevator device inspector certificate by com-
pleting an application and paying a fee of $65.00. This
certificate shall be a rider to the elevator inspector HHS
license and shall be renewed separately from all other
licenses.

1. Any violation notice issued to a licensee pursuant
to this subchapter shall not be deemed to be an action
taken with regard to the elevator inspector HHS license.
Any such notice shall only be subject to review by a
review committee under N.J.A.C. 5:23-5.23(d) if the De-
partment indicates that it also intends to take action
regarding the licensee’s elevator inspector HHS license on
the basis of the same set of facts.

5:23-12A.4 Enrollment of devices

(a) Elevator.devices, as defined by this subchapter, can be
enrolled in this optional program by the owner or the
owner’s agent. To be eligible for enrollment, an elevator
device shall be subject to the cyclical inspections and wit-
nessing of tests, as defined by this subchapter, by the
qualified elevator device maintenance, inspection and test-
ing firm under a contract of full service needs with the
owner of the elevator.

1. For purposes of this subchapter, a contract of full
service needs is a contract which stipulates that:

i. The scope of the applicable inspections and tests
shall be in accordance with the most recent edition of
ASME A17.1 or A90.1 referenced in the building sub-
code and the frequency of the inspections and tests, as
well as the inspection/testing procedures, shall be in
accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-12;

ii. The registered firm shall issue a certification that
the inspection and tests have been performed and the
signed report on the results shall be issued to the owner
and to all other parties to whom the report is required
to be sent; and

iii. The performance of the repairs necessary to
ensure compliance of inspected/tested equipment with
the requirements of applicable ASME A17.1 or A90.1
is required.

(b) To allow for the construction official to make neces-
sary changes in official records regarding the elevator de-
vices inspected/tested by the qualified firm, the devices shall
be placed under or removed from this optional program by
the owner or the owners agent not later than two months
prior to the cyclical inspection/test, as required by the
building’s inspection cycle established, pursuant to N.J.A.C.
5:23-12.3(a)4, by the enforcing agency having jurisdiction.

23-189

This application for enrollment shall be on a form pre-
scribed by the Department. The Department shall be noti-
fied by the owner of any changes made with regard to
services being provided by the qualified firm not later than
two months prior to the date of the cyclical inspection.

1. In addition to forwarding lists of the registered
buildings and devices to the construction official quarter-
ly, the Department shall issue update letters to the owners
of devices placed under or removed from the optional
program, and shall send copies of these letters to the
construction official.

(c) As a result of an applicable inspection and test, the
qualified firm shall issue a device certification to the Bureau
of Code Services, so as to ensure that the required inspec-
tion and tests are performed and that the device is being
maintained as required by this subchapter.

1. Within 20 working days from the date when each
cyclical inspection/test was performed, the qualified firm
shall:

i. File a certification with the Department for each
device on a form prescribed by the Department, at the
same time providing the owner with a copy of such
certification; and

ii. Report to the owner, on a form prescribed by the
Department, the results of the performed inspec-
tion/test.

2. A certification filed with the Department by a
qualified firm shall include:

i. A statement that the elevator device was inspect-
ed and tested by the qualified firm according to the
most recent addition of ASME A17.1 or A90.1 refer-
enced in the building subcode and was found to be in
conformance with the requirements of the code(s) un-
der which the device was installed or altered;

ii. The building’s cycle and registration number;

iii. The date and the type of the applicable inspec-
tion or inspection/test performed;

iv. The expiration date of the certification; and

v. The name, signature and the certification number
of the qualified inspector.

3. The certification shall be accompanied by a filing
fee in the amount of $30.00.

(d) In addition to any other remedies provided for by
these rules, a penalty in the amount of $100.00 shall be
assessed whenever a certificate required by this section is
not filed with the Bureau of Code Services within 45 days of
the due date as described in (c) above. This penalty shall
be issued against the qualified firm with a information copy
to the owner. Additional penalties shall be assessed in the
event of further delay in filing. All violations of this filing
requirement by a qualified firm shall be made a part of the
qualified firm’s file and reviewed at the time of renewal
application, along with all other aspects of the qualified
firm’s performance pursuant to this subchapter.

Supp. 2-18-03



5:23-12A.5

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

5:23-12A.5 Permit process and monitoring

(a) All construction permit-related enforcement process-
es, inspection and witnessing of the “five year” tests of
traction and roped hydraulic elevators, and inspection and
witnessing of applicable tests at the “five-year” intervals of
all other types of elevator devices enrolled in the optional
program, shall be performed by the enforcing agency having
jurisdiction pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.3(a)3. The Depart-
ment shall define cyclical inspections/tests at the time when
those will be assigned to the enforcing agencies.

1. The Department shall notify the local jurisdiction at
least two months prior to the inspections and witnessing
of tests required to be done by the local jurisdiction.

2. Fees for permit-related enforcement shall be as
required by the Uniform Construction Code. The fee for
the required cyclical inspection and test performed/wit-
nessed by the local jurisdiction, in the amount of $150.00,
shall be reimbursed by the Department and such fee shall
be payable to a local enforcing agency only upon the
Department’s receipt of the inspection report. The in-
spection report shall be forwarded to the owner and the
Department within 20 working days from the date when
the inspection/test was performed.

(b) Notwithstanding the inspections and witnessing of
tests performed by the local jurisdiction, the Bureau of
Code Services shall have sole authority to monitor the
performance of qualified firms and qualified elevator device
inspectors.

(c) The Bureau shall develop and implement a perfor-
mance-based monitoring program to assess the conditions
impacting on the devices enrolled in this optional program
and shall report as required by law.

Supp. 2-18-03

5:23-12A.6 Special inspection and compliance procedures

(a) If, upon inspection or test, a qualified elevator device
inspector who is employed by a qualified firm shall find that
an elevator device is in a dangerous condition, or if there is
an immediate hazard to persons riding on or using any such
device, the qualified elevator device inspector, on behalf of
the qualified firm, shall immediately prohibit any further use
of such device and shall give written notice of this action
and of the condition to the owner, the enforcing agency
having jurisdiction and the Bureau of Code Services, and
shall take such other steps as may be necessary to protect
the public. Once the device is placed out of operation, it
shall remain out of operation until such time as the quali-
fied elevator device inspector shall issue a certification, on
behalf of the qualified firm, indicating that the dangerous
condition or immediate hazard has been removed or cor-
rected and that the elevator device is safe for public use.
Such a certification shall be forwarded to the enforcing
agency having jurisdiction, the Bureau of Code Services and
the owner before the device may be placed back in opera-
tion.

1. If, upon inspection or test, deficiencies beyond the
scope of this subchapter are observed, the qualified eleva-
tor device inspector shall issue a report on such findings
to the owner and shall forward a copy to the construction
official and the Bureau of Code Services.

(b) If the enforcing agency having jurisdiction shall deter-
mine, at any time, in response to a complaint or otherwise,
that an elevator device is in a dangerous condition or that
there is an immediate hazard to persons riding on or using
that device, the enforcing agency shall prohibit any further
use of the elevator device until the condition is corrected,
and shall require the owner of the elevator device to make
such repairs as may be necessary, or take other corrective
action, within such time as the enforcing agency may pre-
scribe. The enforcing agency may charge a fee not exceed-
ing $100.00 for each such inspection or reinspection.

23-190

@



