
MEDICAID ONLY 

Amended by R.1996 d.466, effective October 7, 1996. 
See: 28 N.J.R. 2779(c), 28 N.J.R. 4480(a). 
Amended by R.2000 d.415, effective October 16, 2000. 
See: 32 N.J.R. 2565(a), 32 N.J.R. 3844(a). 

In (a), substituted "board of social services" for "welfare agency" in 
the introductory paragraph, substituted "$84,120" for "$76,740" in the 
introductory paragraph of 1, substituted "$16,824" for "$15,348" in li, 
and substituted "CBOSS" for "CWA" throughout. 
Amended by R.2001 d.199, effective June 18, 2001. 
See: 32 N.J.R. 202l(a), 33 N.J.R. 2195(a). 

In (a), rewrote the third and fourth sentences of the introductory 
paragraph, substituted "$84,120, as indexed annually in accordance with 
42 U.S.C. § 1396r-5(g) and published as a notice in the New Jersey 
Register, and" for "$74,740" in 1, and rewrote li. 
Amended by R.2004 d.401, effective November 1, 2004. 
See: 36 N.J.R. 922(b), 36 N.J.R. 4982(a). 

In (a)!, substituted "$92,760" for "$84,120" in the introductory 
paragraph, and substituted "$18,552" for "$16,824" in i. 
Amended by R.2006 d.133, effective November 6, 2006. 
See: 37 N.J.R. 3774(a), 37 N.J.R. 4505(a), 38 N.J.R. 4712(a). 

In (a)l, substituted "$95,100" for "$92,760"; and in (a)li, substituted 
"$19,020" for "$18,552". 

Case Notes 
Medicaid eligibility when one spouse is institutionalized and the other 

is living in the community is determined by reference to total assets 
owned by the couple at time of application, and amount of exempt assets 
attributable to community spouse that was previously established at time 
of institutionalization, plus $2,000 of assets attributable to institution-
alized spouse, constitute the asset cap that cannot be exceeded at the 
time of application, unless that cap was increased to reflect a rise in the 
consumer price index. A.K. v. Div. of Med. Assistance, 350 NJ.Super. 
175, 794 A.2d 835. 

Federal Medicaid statute requiring that state's methodology for 
determining resource eligibility of medically needy person be no more 
restrictive than for categorically needy person required exclusion of 
husband's individual retirement account from computation of wife's 
resources for purposes of determining eligibility. Mistrick v Division of 
Medical Assistance and Health Services, 299 NJ.Super. 76, 690 A.2d 
651 (A.D.1997). 

Individual Retirement account (IRA) in husband's name is includable 
resource for purposes of determining a wife's Medicaid eligibility when 
wife enters a nursing home but husband remains in the community, 
despite claim that the "no more restrictive" provision excluding IRAs 
from supplemental security income (SSI) eligibility determinations 
controlled; the "no more restrictive" provision was superseded by 
Medicare Catastrophic Coverage Act of 1988 (MCCA). Mistrick v. 
Division of Medical Assistance & Health Services, 154 N.J. 158, 712 
A.2d 188 (N.J. 1998). 

Spouse's IRA must be included in calculation of institutionalized 
spouse's available resources for Medicaid eligibility determination. S.M. 
v. Division of Medical Assistance and Health Services and Passaic 
County Board of Social Services, 96 N.J.A.R.2d (DMA) 37. 

Combined countable resources included unsecured promissory notes. 
H.H. v. New Jersey Division of Medical Assistance and Health Services, 
93 N.J.A.R.2d (DMA) 58. 

Husband's estate funds were available to pay wife's nursing home 
costs. L.S. v. Division of Medical Assistance and Health Services, 93 
N.J.A.R.2d (DMA) 7. 

10:71-4.9 Resource assessment 

(a) At the beginning of the first continuous period of insti-
tutionalization (beginning on or after September 30, 1989), 
the institutionalized spouse or the community spouse (or a 
representative of either spouse) may request an assessment of 

10:71-4.10 

the couple's total countable resources. The purpose of the 
assessment is to establish the community spouse's share of 
the couple's total countable resources (see N.J.A.C. 10:71-
4.8(a)). 

(b) The county board of social services shall, upon a re-
quest for a resource assessment, advise the requesting parties 
of the documentation and verification necessary to make the 
assessment. When the necessary documentation and verifica-
tion is not submitted to the county board of social services in 
a timely manner, the requesting parties shall be advised that 
the resource assessment cannot be completed. Upon receipt of 
all relevant documentation of resources from the couple the 
county board of social services shall establish the total count-
able resources of the couple. The county board of social 
services shall notify both members of the couple of the total 
value assigned to their combined countable resources and the 
community spouse's share of those resources. A copy of the 
notice shall be retained at the county board of social services. 

1. The county shall complete the resource assessment 
and notify the requesting parties of its results within 45 
calendar days of the request unless third party verification 
has not been received by the county board of social ser-
vices or the requesting parties request a delay. 

( c) At the time of providing the couple with a copy of the 
resource assessment, the county board of social services shall 
advise the couple that there is no immediate right to a fair 
hearing on the county's resource assessment, but that there 
will be an opportunity to appeal the findings of the assess-
ment when and if the institutionalized spouse applies for 
Medicaid. 

New Rule, R.1991 d.32, effective January 22, 1991. 
See: 22 N.J.R. 7(a), 23 N.J.R. 215(b). 
Amended by R.2000 d.415, effective October 16, 2000. 
See: 32 N.J.R. 2565(a), 32 N.J.R. 3844(a). 

In (b) and ( c ), substituted "board of social services" for "welfare 
agency" throughout. 

10:71-4.10 Transfer of assets 

(a) The provisions of this section shall apply, effective 
June 18, 2001, only to persons who are receiving an insti-
tutional level of services, including individuals who are 
receiving services under a 42 U.S.C. § 1915(c) home and 
community care waiver under Medicaid, or who are seeking 
that level of service, and who have transferred assets on or 
after August 11, 1993. An individual shall be ineligible for 
institutional level services through the Medicaid program if 
he or she ( or his or her spouse) has disposed of assets at less 
than fair market value at any time during or after the 36 
month period, or the 60 month period in the case of a transfer 
to a trust, immediately before: 

1. In the case of an individual who is already eligible 
for Medicaid benefits, the date the individual becomes an 
institutionalized individual; or 

New Jersey State Library 
71-26.5 Supp. 11-6-06 



10:71-4.10 

2. In the case of an individual not already eligible for 
Medicaid benefits, the date the individual applies for 
Medicaid as an institutionalized individual. 

(b) The following definitions shall apply to the transfer of 
assets: 

1. Individual means: 

i. The individual him or herself who is applying for 
benefits; 

ii. The individual's spouse; 

m. A person, including a court or administrative 
body, with legal authority to act in place of or on behalf 
of the individual or the individual's spouse; 

iv. Any person including a court or administrative 
body, acting at the direction or upon the request of the 
individual or the individual's spouse. 

2. An institutionalized individual, for the purposes of 
this chapter, is a person who is receiving care in a 
Medicaid certified nursing facility, intermediate care facil-
ity for the mentally retarded (ICFMR), or a licensed special 
hospital (Class C) or Title XIX psychiatric hospital (if 
under the age of 21 or age 65 and over). For purposes of 
this chapter, an institutionalized individual shall also in-
clude a person seeking benefits under a home or commu-
nity care waiver program. An institutionalized individual 
shall not include a person who is receiving care in an acute 
care general hospital. 

3. Assets shall include all income and resources of the 
individual and of the individual's spouse. Assets shall also 
include income and resources which the individual or the 
individual's spouse is entitled to but does not receive 
because of action or inaction by the individual or the 
individual's spouse; or by any person, including a court or 
administrative body with the legal authority to act in place 
of or on behalf of the individual or the individual's spouse; 
or any person, including a court or administrative body, 
acting at the direction of or upon the request of the individ-
ual or the individual's spouse. Examples of actions that 
would cause income or resources not to be received shall 
include, but shall not be limited to: 

1. Irrevocably waiving pension income; 

ii. Waiving the right to receive an inheritance, 
including spousal elective share pursuant to N.J.S.A. 
3B:8-10; 

iii. Not accepting or accessing injury settlements; 

iv. Tort settlements which are diverted by the defen-
dant into a trust or similar device to be held for the 
benefit of an individual who is a plaintiff; and 

v. Refusal to take legal action to obtain a court 
ordered payment that is not being paid, such as child 
support or alimony. 

Supp. 11-6-06 71-26.6 

DEPT. OF HUMAN SERVICES 

4. Resources, for the purpose of asset transfer, shall 
include all resources, both included and excluded, in accor-
dance with the provisions of this chapter. For example, the 
transfer of a home, even if it is serving as the individual's 
principal place of residence, shall be subject to the transfer 
of assets provisions. 

5. Income, for the purposes of this section, shall have 
the same definition as found in N.J.A.C. 10:71-5. In deter-
mining whether a transfer of assets involves countable 
income, the income disregards in N.J.A.C. 10:71-5 shall be 
applied. 

6. Fair-market value shall be an estimate of the value of 
an asset, based on generally available market information, 
if sold at the prevailing price at the time it was actually 
transferred. Value shall be based on the criteria for eval-
uating assets as found in N.J.A.C. 10:71-4.l(d). 

i. In determining whether or not an asset was trans-
ferred for fair-market value, only tangible compensation, 
with intrinsic value shall be considered. For example, a 
transfer for "love and affection" shall not be considered 
a transfer for fair market value. 

ii. In regard to transfers intended to compensate a 
friend or relative for care or services provided in the 
past, care and services provided for free at the time they 
were delivered shall be presumed to have been intended 
to be delivered without compensation. In regard to trans-
fers allegedly intended to compensate a friend or a rela-
tive for care or services that were provided in the past, 
care and services provided for free at the time they were 
delivered shall be presumed to have been intended to be 
delivered without compensation. Thus, a transfer of 
assets to a friend or relative for the alleged purpose of 
compensating for care or services provided free in the 
past shall be presumed to have been transferred for no 
compensation. This presumption may be rebutted by the 
presentation of credible documentary evidence preexist-
ing the delivery of the care or services indicating the 
type and terms of compensation. Further, the amount of 
compensation or the fair market value of the transferred 
asset shall not be greater than the prevailing rates for 
similar care or services in the community. That portion 
of compensation in excess of the prevailing rate shall be 
considered to be uncompensated value. 

iii. Under a life estate, an individual who owns prop-
erty transfers the ownership of that property to another 
individual, while retaining for the rest of his or her life, 
or the life of another person, certain rights to that prop-
erty. A life estate entitles the owner of the life estate to 
possess, use, and obtain profits from the property as long 
as he or she lives, although actual ownership of the prop-
erty has passed to another individual. In a transaction 
involving a life estate, a transfer of assets is involved. In 
determining whether a penalty shall be assessed in the 
case of a transfer involving a life estate, the value of the 
asset transferred and the value of the life estate shall be 

Next Page is 71-26.6.1 


