N

UNIFORM FIRE CODE

5:70-3.2

New Jersey State Library

(12) The following text shall be deleted, following
“FIRE CODE OFFICIAL,” “The fire chief or other
designated authority charged with the administration
and enforcement of the code, or a duly authorized
representative.” The following text shall be inserted
“The fire official or fire inspector certified by the
Commissioner of the Department of Community Af-
fairs and appointed or designated to direct the enforce-
ment of the code by the appointing authority of a local
enforcing agency.

(13) The following text shall be inserted following
the definition of “FIRE EXIT HARDWARE,” “FIRE
HAZARD. Any thing or act increasing or causing an
increase of the hazard or menace of fire to a greater
degree than that customarily recognized by persons in
the public service who are regularly engaged in pre-
venting, suppressing or extinguishing a fire; or which
may obstruct, delay, hinder or interfere with the
operations of the fire department or the egress of
occupants in the event of a fire.”

(14) The following text shall be inserted following
the definition of “FIRE HAZARD,” “FIRE INSPEC-
TOR. A person working under the direction of the fire
official who is certified by the Commissioner of the
Department of Community Affairs and appointed or
designated to enforce the code by the appointing
authority of a local enforcing agency.”

(15) The following text shall be inserted following
the definition of “FIRE PARTITION,” “FIRE OFFI-
CIAL. A person certified by the Commissioner of the
Department of Community Affairs and appointed or
designated to direct the enforcement of the code by
the appointing authority of a local enforcing agency.
This term shall also include “Fire Marshal” where the
fire official has been appointed pursuant to N.J.A.C.
5:71-32.”

(16) The following text shall be inserted into the
definition of “FIREWORKS,” before “See Section
3302.1,” “Fireworks include any combustible or ex-
plosive composition, and any substance and combina-
tion of substances and articles prepared for the pur-
pose of producing a visible or an audible effect by
combustion, explosion, deflagration or detonation.
Fireworks shall include blank cartridges, toy pistols,
toy cannons, toy canes and toy guns in which ex-
plosives are utilized; firecrackers, torpedoes, sky-
rockets, Roman candles, sparklers and other devices
of similar construction; any device containing any
explosive or flammable compound; and any tablets
and other devices containing any explosive substance.

The term “fireworks” shall not include automobile
flares, paper caps containing not more than an average
of 0.25 grain (16 mg) of explosive content per cap,
and toy pistols, toy canes, toy guns and other devices
utilizing such caps. The sale and utilization of the

70-31

types of explosive devices listed herein which are not
considered fireworks shall be permitted at ail times.”

(17) The following text shall be inserted after the
definition for “GRANDSTAND,”

“GREASE CONSUMING APPLIANCES OR
FUME INCINERATOR. Means devices intended
for placement over restaurant type cooking equip-
ment in the exhaust duct and through which all ex-
haust vapors or smoke must pass. Grease and other
particulate matter from cooking fumes and exhaust
are removed by open flames.”

“GREASE EXTRACTOR. Means a device in-
tended for the removal of smoke and grease-laden
particles from exhaust fumes or vapors created by
cooking operations. A grease extractor devise nor-
mally consists of a hood, a grease collecting device,
a wash system, means to detect excessive tempera-
ture of the exhaust gases which activates a device to
prevent flame and excessively hot gases from
entering the exhaust duct, and associated electrical
controls.”

“GROUND VIBRATION. Shaking of the ground
by elastic waves emanating from blasting, usually
measured in inches per second of particle velocity.”

(18) The following text shall be inserted following
the definition for “INITIATING DEVICE,” “IN-
SPECTION CERTIFICATE. An identification ap-
plied on a product by an approved agency containing
the name of the manufacturer, the function and per-
formance characteristics, and the name and identifica-
tion of an approved agency which indicates that the
product or material has been inspected and evaluated
by an approved agency (see also Mark, Manufac-
turer’s designation and Inspection certificate).”

(19) The following text shall be inserted following
the definition of “MANUAL STOCKING METH-
ODS,” “MANUFACTURER’S DESIGNATION. An
identification applied on a product by the manufac-
turer indicating that a product or material complies
with a specified standard or set of rules (see also
Mark, Label and Inspection certificate).”

(20) The following text shall be inserted following
the definition of “MARINE MOTOR FUEL DIS-
PENSING FACILITY,” “MARK. An identification
applied on a product by the manufacturer indicating
the name of the manufacturer and the function of a
product or material (see also Manufacturer’s desig-
nation, Label and Inspection certificate).”

(21) The following text shall be inserted following
the definition of “MERCHANDISE PAD,” “MOBILE
ENCLOSED UNIT. A unit of closed construction
designed to be driven or towed from place to place,
which includes commercial cooking equipment pro-

Supp. 8-18-08



5:70-3.2

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 8-18-08

ducing grease-laden vapors and which allows for oc-
cupancy by the operator. Also known as “mobile
canteen.”

(22) The following text shall be inserted following
the definition of “NUISANCE ALARM,” “OCCU-
PANCY. The purpose for which a building or prem-
ises or portion thereof is used or intended to be used.”
The term shall also include the building, room or
enclosed space that houses a use.

(23) New Definition of “OCCUPANCY CLASSI-
FICATION” shall be inserted as follows, “OCCU-
PANCY CLASSIFICATION. The various use groups
contained on the premises’ Certificate of Occupancy
(C of O) issued pursuant to the Uniform Construction
Code (UCC) or, for premises constructed prior to
January 1, 1977 for which no such certificate of
occupancy has subsequently been issued, it means the
various use groups defined in this code at N.J.A.C.
5:70-4.”

(24) The text following “OCCUPANCY CLASSI-
FICATION. For the purpose of this code, certain
occupancies are defined as follows:” up to “[B]
OCCUPANT LOAD?” shall be deleted. This deletion
includes 7 pages of text.

(25) The following text shall be inserted following
the definition of “PERMISSIBLE EXPOSURE
LIMIT (PEL),” “PERSON. Includes a corporation,
firm, partnership, association, organization and any
other group acting as a unit, as well as individuals. It
shall also include an executor, administrator, trustee,
receiver or other representative appointed according to
law. Whenever the word “person” appears in any
section of this code prescribing a penalty or fine, as to
partnerships or associations, the word shall include the
partners or members thereof, and as to corporations,

“shall include the officer, agents or members thereof
who are responsible for any violation of such section.”

(26) The following text shall be inserted following
the definition of “POWERED INDUSTRIAL TRUCK”
“PREMISES.: A lot, plot or parcel of land and area
thereof, including any structure, building or part or
parts thereupon.”

(27) The following text shall be inserted following
the definition of “QUANTITY-DISTANCE (Q-D),”
“RADIOACTIVE MATERIAL. Any material or com-
bination of materials that spontaneously emits
ionizing radiation.”

(28) The following text shall be inserted following
the definition of “SCISSOR STAIR,” “SEALED
SOURCE. A quantity of radiation enclosed to prevent
the escape of any radioactive material, but at the same
time permitting radiation to come out for use.”

70-32

(29) The following text shall be inserted following
the definition of “SOLID,” “SOLID FUEL-FIRED
HEATER. Means a flue connected heater, fired with
solid fuels, such as a fireplace, fireplace insert or
stove, free standing wood stove or similar solid fuel-
fired appliance.”

(30) The following text shall be inserted following
the definition of “STEEL,” “STORAGE. Means arti-
cles that are stored, kept or accumulated for some
future use, or for disposal, and drawn upon as
needed.”

(31) The following text shall be deleted following
the definition of “STORAGE, HAZARDOUS MATE-
RIALS,” “STRUCTURE. That which is built or con-
structed or a portion thereof” and the following text
shall be inserted, “STRUCTURE. A combination of
materials to form a construction for occupancy, use or
ornamentation, whether installed on, above, or below
the surface of a parcel of land; provided, the word
“structure” shall be construed when used herein as
though followed by the words “or part or parts thereof
and all equipment therein” unless the context clearly
requires a different meaning.”

(32) The following text shall be inserted following
the definition of “USE (MATERIAL), “USE GROUP.
See “Occupancy Classification.”

3. Chapter 3, General Precautions Against Fire, shall be

amended as follows:

i.  New Section 301.1.1 shall be inserted as follows:
“301.1.1 The equipment, processes and operations of
vehicle-wrecking yards, junk yards and waste material-
handling plants and the storage of combustible or
flammable waste, rubbish and other materials shall com-
ply with this chapter and NFPA 230.”

ii.  Section 301.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its en-
tirety.

iii. In Section 302.1, Definitions, the following text
shall be inserted following the definition of “Open
Burning,” “FIREBREAK. A natural or constructed bar-
rier used to stop or check fires that occur, or to provide a
control line from which to suppress fires. A firebreak
shall consist of non-combustible materials including but
not limited to gravel, sand, or paved roads, irrigated
lawns, gardens and orchards, ponds, lakes or other wa-
tercourses that meet a width which is measured outward
174 times the height of fuels available to burn adjacent to
premises.”

iv. In Section 304.1.2, Vegetation, the text shall be
deleted in its entirety and the following new text shall be
inserted, “Adequate space shall be maintained around
the perimeter of developments, structures or other com-
bustible objects to provide defensible space against en-
croaching wildland fires or from fires escaping from the

C



UNIFORM FIRE CODE

5:70-3.2

objects to the surroundings. Weeds, grass, vines or other
growth that is capable of being ignited and endangering
property, shall be cut down and removed by the owner
or occupant of the premises. Vegetations requirements
on lands within the Pinelands National Reserve shall
conform to the requirements of the Pinelands Manage-
ment Plan, Fire Hazard Mitigation standards as regulated
by the New Jersey Pinelands Commission.”

\Z In Section 304.1.3, Space underneath seats,
“International Building Code” shall be deleted and
“building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

Vi. Add new Section 304.4 as follows, “Section
304.4 Waste material plants. Waste material plants shall
also comply with this section.

vii. Add new section 304.4.1, Fire Access, as
follows, “304.4.1 Fire access. Approved aisles, drive-
ways and uniform passageways shall be provided to
permit access for fire-fighting operations, including
areas where stripped vehicle bodies are stored.”

viii. Add new section 304.4.2, Picking rooms, as
follows: “304.4.2 Picking rooms. Picking rooms shall be
provided with exhaust systems of sufficient capacity to
remove dust and lint.”

ix.  Add new section 304.4.3, Burning operations,
as follows: “304.4.3 Burning operations. The burning of
wrecked or discarded vehicles, or any parts thereof, or
any junk or waste materials shall be prohibited.”

X. In Section 306.1, Motion picture projection
rooms, “Section 409 of the International Building Code”
shall be deleted and “construction code in effect at the
time of the construction or alteration” shall be inserted.

xi.  In Section 307.1.1, Prohibited open burning,
after “smoke,” “or odor” shall be deleted. Following
“prohibited,” the following text shall be inserted, “Forest
Fire Service. In districts for which Forest Fire Wardens
have been appointed in accordance with the General
Forest Fire Act (N.J.S.A. 13:9-44.1 et seq.), any fire
within, or adjacent to, any forest which has the potential
to cause a wildfire is prohibited by this subchapter,
without first obtaining a permit from the State Forest
Fire Service in the New Jersey Department of Environ-
mental Protection.”

xii.  In Section 307.2, Permit required, “Permit re-
quired” shall be deleted and the text of the section shall
be deleted in its entirety. The following text shall be in-
serted “Allowable burning. Open burning shall be al-
lowed without prior notification to the fire official for
recreational fires, highway safety flares, smudge pots
and similar occupational needs.

xiii. In Section 307.2.1, Authorization, the follow-
ing text shall be deleted “Authorization. Where required
by state or local law or regulations, open burning shall

70-33

only be permitted with prior approval from the state or
local air and water quality management authority pro-
vided that all conditions specified in the authorization
are followed.” The following text shall be inserted
“Approval required. Open burning shall be allowed after
obtaining a permit from the fire official for a bonfire. All
permits shall be requested by and issued to the owner or
agent of the land upon which the bonfire is to be
kindled.”

xiv. New Section 307.2.1.1, Application, shall be
inserted as follows: “307.2.1.1 Application: Applications
for open burning shall be submitted in writing at least
ten days before the fire is set and shall be in such form
and contain such information as required by the fire
official. Such applications shall contain, as a minimum,
information regarding the purpose of the proposed
burning, the nature and quantities of material to be
burned, the date when such burning will take place, the
location of the burning site and the on-site fire-
extinguishing equipment to be provided.

xv.  New Section 307.2.1.2, Agricultural burning,
shall be inserted as follows: “307.2.1.2 Agricultural
burning permitted: The burning of herbaceous or
infested plant life, the burning of orchard prunings and
cuttings, prescribed burnings and the clearing of agri-
cultural land by burning are prohibited by this sub-
chapter, unless in accordance with a permit issued under
the provisions of N.J.A.C. 7:27-2, administered by the
State Forest Fire Service in the New Jersey Department
of Environmental Protection.”

xvi. New Section 307.2.2, Waste disposal, shall be
inserted as follows: “307.2.2 Waste disposal. Open
burning shall not be utilized for waste disposal purposes,
shall be of the minimum size for the intended purpose,
and the fuel shall be chosen to minimize the generation
and emission of air contaminants.”

xvii. Add new Section 307.4.1.1 as follows:
“307.4.1.1 Bonfire size and duration. A bonfire shall not
be more than 5 feet (1524 mm) by 5 feet (1524 mm) by
5 feet (1524 mm) in dimension and shall not burn longer
than 3 hours. The maximum size and duration of a
bonfire shall not be increased by the fire official unless it
is determined that fire safety requirements of the
situation and the desirable duration of burn warrant the
increase.”

xviii. Add new section 307.4.1.2 as follows:
“307.4.1.2 Material. Fuel for a bonfire shall consist only
of seasoned dry firewood and shall be ignited with a
small quantity of paper. The fire shall not be utilized for
waste disposal purposes, and the fuel shall be chosen to
minimize the generation of air contaminants.”

XiX. In Section 307.4.2, Recreational fires, follow-
ing “ignition,” insert “Fires in approved containers shall

Supp. 8-18-08



5:70-3.2

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 8-18-08

be permitted, provided that such fires are not less than
15 feet (4572 mm) from any structure.”

XX. In Section 308.3 Open flame, following
“deliberation,” “worship” shall be deleted and following
“in accordance with,” “Section 105.6,” shall be deleted
and “N.J.A.C. 5:70-2.7.” shall be inserted.

XXi. In Section 308.3.1, Open-flame cooking
devices, “and outdoor fireplaces” shall be inserted in two
places each following “Open-flame cooking devices”.
The word “and” following “Charcoal burners” shall be
replaced by a comma. “Or stored” shall be inserted after
the word “operated”. “or decks” shall be inserted after
the word “balconies” “10” shall be deleted and “5” shall
be inserted in its place before the word “feet”. “(3048
mm)” shall be deleted. In Exception 1, “detached” shall
be inserted before “one- and two-family dwellings.”

xxii. In Section 308.3.1.1, Liquefied-petroleum-
gas fueled cooking devices, the following text shall be
deleted, “LP-gas burners having an LP-gas container
with a water capacity greater than 2.5 pounds [nominal 1
pound (0.454 kg) LP-gas capacity] shall not be located
on combustible balconies or within 10 feet (3048 mm) of
combustible construction.” The following text shall be
inserted, “Portable LP-gas cooking equipment such as
barbecue grills and outdoor fireplaces shall not be stored
or used:

1. On any porch, balcony or any other portion of
a building;

2. Within any room or space of a building;

3. Within five feet of any combustible exterior
wall;

4.  Within five feet, vertically or horizontally, of
an opening in any wall; or

5. Under any building overhang.

“Detached” shall be inserted in the Exception
before “one- and two—family dwellings.”

xxiil.  Section 308.3.5, Religious ceremonies, shall
be deleted in its entirety.

xxiv.  Section 308.3.7, Group A occupancies, in
Exception 1.1, “in accordance with Section 308.3.5”
shall be deleted. In Exception 2, “Chapter 6 and the
International Mechanical Code” shall be deleted and
“the mechanical subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

XXV. In Section 308.4, Torches for removing paint,
following the word “structure,” “or for sealing mem-
brane roofs” shall be inserted. Following the word
“utilized,” “The use of open flame burning or the use of
high temperature (in excess of 1000 degrees Fahrenheit)
heat guns on painted surfaces in buildings of Use Group
R that were constructed before 1978, Use Group E and

70-34

Use Group I-2 buildings used as child care facilities,
shall be prohibited unless the painted surfaces has been
tested and found to be free of lead-based paint.” shall be
inserted.

xxvi. In Section 308.4.1, Permit, after the word
“with,” “Section 105.6” shall be deleted and “N.J.A.C.
5:70-2.7” shall be inserted. After the word “paint,”
“from a structure” shall be deleted and “to seal mem-
brane roofs, or for any similar use in or around any
building, structure or combustible material.” shall be
inserted.

xxvii. In Section 308.5, Open-flame devices, fol-
lowing the word “with,” “Section 105.6” shall be deleted
and “N.J.A.C. 5:70-2.7” shall be inserted.

xxviii. Section 310.8, Hazardous environmental
conditions, shall be deleted in its entirety.

xxix. In Section 311.1.1, Abandoned premises,
“International Property Maintenance Code and the Inter-
national Building Code” shall be deleted. “Uniform Con-
struction Code” shall be inserted.

xxX. New Section 311.2.4, Utilities, shall be
inserted as follows: “311.2.4 Utilities. All utilities which
represent a potential source of ignition shall be
disconnected in a manner approved by the fire official.”

xxxi. In Section 311.3, Removal of combustibles,
under Exception 1, “International Building Code” shall
be deleted and “the building subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xxxii. In Section 311.5, Placards, after the words
“pursuant to,” “Section 110 of this code” shall be deleted
and “the Uniform Construction Code, determined to be
an imminent hazard pursuant to the Uniform Fire Code
or for which a demolition permit has been issued
pursuant to the Uniform Construction Code,” shall be
inserted after the words “pursuant to.”

xxxiii. In Section 312, Vehicle Impact Protection,
after “Vehicle” in the title, “Heavy Object” shall be in-
serted and after “vehicle” in the text, “or other heavy
object” shall be inserted.

xxxiv. In Section 312.2, Posts, in number 1, after the
words “concrete filled,” “and painted yellow” shall be
inserted. In number 2, after “4 feet,” “(914 mm)” shall
be deleted and “6 inches” shall be inserted. In number 3,
after “3 feet,” “15” shall be deleted and “18” shall be
inserted and after “inch,” “(381 mm)” shall be deleted.
In number 5, after less than, “3” shall be deleted and “2”
shall be inserted and after “feet,: “(941mm)” shall be
deleted.

xxxv. New Section 312.2.2, High speed or heavy
traffic areas, shall be inserted as follows: “312.2.2 High
speed or heavy traffic areas. In areas where high speed



<

UNIFORM FIRE CODE

5:70-3.2

or heavy duty traffic occurs the following shall be the re-
quirements for motor vehicle protection:

1. Posts are to be a minimum of six inch
diameter schedule 40 pipe and painted yellow;

2.  Posts are to be buried a minimum of 48 inches
deep and extend a minimum of 48 inches above grade
and be filled with concrete;

3. Posts are to be set at four feet maximum cen-
ters;

4. Posts are to be encased in concrete of 24
inches diameter and 48 inches in depth for minimum
standards; and

5.  The crash protection shall be installed a mini-
mum of 24 inches from the LP-gas container(s).

xxxvi. In Section 313.1, General, in Exception 1,
“International Building Code” shall be deleted and “the
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted. In Exception 2, “.4” shall be deleted
leaving “Section 314”.

xxxvii. In Section 313.2, Group R occupancies,
following the word “buildings,” “and shall be separated
from other occupancies in accordance with the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xxxviii. In Section 315.1, General, “and NFPA 230”
shall be inserted following the words “in accordance
with this section” and the following text shall be deleted,
“A permit shall be obtained in accordance with Section
105.6.”

xxxix. In Section 315.2.1, Ceiling clearance, “in
accordance with NFPA 25 with at least” shall be inserted
before the words “a minimum.”

xl. New Section 315.2.5 shall be added as follows:
“315.2.5 The storage of combustible or flammable mate-
rials shall be confined to approved storage areas.”

xli. In Section 315.3, Outside storage, “shall be com-
pact and orderly” shall be inserted after the words “com-
bustible materials”. “10” shall be replaced by “15”. “or
building” shall be inserted following the words “prop-
erty line.”

xlii. New Section 316, Rooming and Boarding
Houses and Residential Health Care Facilities, shall be
inserted as follows:

“SECTION 316

ROOMING AND BOARDING HOUSES AND
RESIDENTIAL HEALTH CARE FACILITIES

316.1 General: Every rooming and boarding house
shall have rules prohibiting the activities listed in

316.1.1 and 316.1.2 below, which shall be accepted in
writing by every resident as a condition of residency.

70-35

316.1.1 Cooking: The use of cooking and food
warming and portable heat producing devices, other
than microwave ovens, is prohibited in rooming units.

Exception: This prohibition shall not apply in
rooming units containing complete kitchens.

316.1.2 Smoking: Smoking is prohibited in
rooming units.”

4. Chapter 4, Emergency Planning and Preparedness,

shall be amended as follows:

i. New Section 401.3.4, Unplanned evacuation,
shall be inserted as follows, “401.3.4 Unplanned evacua-
tion. Evacuations made necessary by the unplanned
activation of a fire alarm system or by any other emer-
gency shall not be substituted for a required evacuation
drill.”

ii. New Section 404.1.1 shall be inserted as follows,
“404.1.1 Group Overnight Stays. Fire safety and evacua-
tion plans for Group Overnight Stays shall comply with
section 408.14.”

iii. In Section 404.2, Where required, the following
text shall be inserted in number 8. “Therapeutic resi-
dences of” shall be inserted before “Group” and R-2, R-
3 and” shall be inserted following “Group.” The
following text shall be inserted following 13: 14.
Casinos, 15 Flammable Liquid Terminals, 16 Adult and
child day care facilities, 17. Group Overnight Stays.

iv. New Section 404.5.1 shall be inserted as follows,
“404.5.1 The fire safety and evacuation plans shall be
distributed to the tenants and building service employees
by the owner or agent. Tenants shall distribute to their
employees applicable parts of the fire safety plan affect-
ing the employees’ actions in the event of a fire or other
emergency.

v. In Section 405.1, General, “or when required by
the fire code official” shall be deleted.

vi. In Section 405.5, Record keeping, after “evacua-
tion drills,” “and unplanned evacuations to” shall be in-
serted Following “evacuations,” “and” shall be deleted.

vii. New Section 405.5.1, Casino Fire Command
Center, shall be inserted as follows: “405.5.1 Casino Fire
Command Center: The Casino Fire Command Center
shall maintain a comprehensive log which shall include
the information required in 405.5.1.1 and 405.5.1.2
below.”

viii. New Section 405.1.1 shall be inserted as
follows: “405.5.1.1 The name and signature of each
employee on duty in the Fire Command Center along
with the date and time of arrival and departure.”

ix. New Section 405.5.1.2 shall be inserted as fol-
lows: “405.5.1.2 A description of each incident occur-
ring within the casino or hotel, including the date, time,

Supp. 8-18-08



5:70-3.2 COMMUNITY AFFAIRS
location and action taken. An incident shall include, but GROUP OR
not be limited to, fire, alarm activation, trouble signal, OCCUPANCY FREQUENCY PARTICIPATION
fire protection equipment malfunction, and any unre- Group Overnight At the start of each All occupants
corded communication pertaining to fire or life safety Stay nights activities

which is made to or from the Fire Command Center.”

x.  Table 405.2, Fire and Evacuation Drill Fre-
quency and Participation, shall be amended as follows:

Delete “Monthly” under Frequency column, row 3,
and insert “Two drills per month

Insert “Monthly to include” under Frequency col-
umn, row 4, and insert “All occupants® under Partici-
pation column

Delete Group R-4 under Group or Occupancy col-
umn, row 7, and insert “Therapeutic Residences”

Insert “Monthly to include” in the Frequency col-
umn, row 7, before “Quarterly on each shift”

Delete “Employee” in the Participation column row
7 and insert “All occupants”

Delete “Employee” in the Participation column row
8 and insert “All occupants”

Add new rows as follows: under Group or occu-
pancy, add “Casino” in row 9, “Flammable Liquid
Terminals” in row 10 and “Group overnight Stays” in
row 11.

Under Frequency, add “Twice per year” in row 9,
“Twice per year in row 10, and “At the start of each
night’s activities in row 11.

Under participation, add “Employees” in row 9,
“Employees” in row 10 and “All occupants” in row
11.

The table should appear as follows:

TABLE 405.2
FIRE AND EVACUATION DRILL
FREQUENCY AND PARTICIPATION

GROUP OR
OCCUPANCY FREQUENCY PARTICIPATION
Group A Quarterly Employees
Group B © Annually Employees
Group E Two drills per month * All occupants
Group I Monthly to include All occupants®
Quarterly on each shift Employees °
Group R-1 Quarterly on each shift Employees
Group R-2 ¢ Four annually All occupants
Therapeutic Monthly to include All occupants b
Residences Quarterly on each shift
High-rise Buildings Annually All occupants
Casinos Twice per year Employees
Flammable Liquid Twice per year Employees
Terminals

Supp. 8-18-08

a. The frequency shall be allowed to be modified in accordance with
Section 408.3.2.

b. Fire and evacuation drills in residential care assisted living facilities
shall include complete evacuation of the premises in accordance with Section
408.10.5. Where occupants receive habilitation or rehabilitation training, fire
prevention and fire safety practices shall be included as part of the training
program.

¢. Group B buildings having an occupant load of 500 or more persons or
more than 100 persons above or below the lowest level of exit discharge.

d. Applicable to Group R-2 college and university buildings in
accordance with Section 408.3.

e. Applicable to Group I day care centers in accordance with Section
408.3.

xi. In Section 407.1, General, after “under,”
“Section 2701.5” shall be deleted and “N.J.A.C. 5:70-2.7
or LHU registration under N.J.A.C. 5:70.2.4” shall be
inserted.

xii. The title of Section 408.3 shall be amended to
insert “, Group I day care centers” after “Group E
occupancies.” In addition, in the first sentence of the
same section, “and Group I” shall be inserted after
“Group E.”

xiii. In Section 408.3.1, First emergency evacuation
drill, insert “two” before “emergency evacuation drill”
and insert “s” in “drill” to make it plural. In addition, in
the first sentence, “for Group E and Group I” shall be
inserted after “classes.” Finally, a second sentence shall
be inserted as follows: “The first drill for Group R-2
shall be conducted within 10 days of the start of each
semester.”

xiv. In Section 408.3.3, Time of day, “and one shall
be held during daylight hours” shall be inserted after
“sunrise.”

xv. In Section 408.7.2, Staffing, “In Use conditions
3, 4 and 5 as defined in Chapter 2” shall be deleted. In
the Exception, after the word “with,” delete “Section
408.4 of the International Building Code” and insert “the
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code.”

xvi. In Section 408.9, Group R-2 occupancies, after
“occupancies,” insert “located in high rise buildings.”

xvii. In Section 408.10, Group R-4 occupancies, fol-
lowing “408.10,” delete “Group R-4 occupancies. Group
R-4 occupancies” and insert “Therapeutic residences.
Therapeutic residences”

xviii. New Section 408.10.3.1, Admission, shall be
inserted as follows: “408.10.3.1 Admission. Within 24
hours of admission, each new occupant shall participate
in a fire drill to ensure compliance with this chapter.”

xiX. New Section 408.10.3.2, Self Evacuation, shall
be inserted as follows: “408.10.3.2 Self-Evacuation.

70-36



UNIFORM FIRE CODE

5:70-3.2

Emergency power loads; Section 604.2.17, Group I-3
occupancies; Section 604.2.18, Airport traffic control
towers; Section 604.2.19, Elevators; Section 604.2.19.1,
Manual transfer; Section 604.2.19.2, One elevator;

Section 604.2.19.3, Two or more elevators; and Section

604.2.19.4, Venting.

xvii. New Section 604.3.1.1, Testing, shall be
inserted as follows, “604.3.1.1 Testing: Required emer-
gency lighting systems, including exit signs, shall be
tested for proper operation for a minimum of 30 seconds
every month. An annual test shall be conducted for at
least 1 hour. Equipment shall function properly for the
duration of these tests.”

xviii. New Section 604.3.1.2, Battery system, shall
be inserted as follows, “604.3.1.2 Battery system. Where
battery systems or unit equipment are involved, includ-
ing batteries utilized for starting, control or ignition in
auxiliary engines, routine maintenance shall be provided
in accordance with the manufacturer’s specifications.”

xix.  New Section 604.3.1.3, Emergency generators,
shall be inserted as follows, “604.3.1.3 Emergency
generators. Required emergency generators shall be
tested at least annually in accordance with the manufac-
turer’s specifications under anticipated load conditions.

1.  Transition test. A transition test shall be con-
ducted annually to ensure that the transfer time from
normal power to emergency power is 10 seconds or
less.

2. Fuel supply. Where internal combustion en-
gines are utilized as the prime mover for an
emergency generator, an on-site fuel supply shall be
provided sufficient for not less than 2 hours full-
demand operation of the system.”

XX. In Section 605.1, Abatement of electrical
hazards, “ICC Electrical Code” shall be deleted and
“electrical subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted. After “used,” “All electrical wiring,
devices, appliances and other equipment shall be main-
tained in accordance with the provisions of the New
Jersey Uniform Construction Code Electrical Subcode
and this subchapter.” shall be inserted.

xxi. In Section 605.3, Working space and clear-
ance, Exception, 1, after “allowed by,” “the ICC
Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “the Uniform
Construction Code.” shall be inserted.

xxii. In Section 605.4, Multiplug adapters, “the ICC
Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical sub-
code of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be in-
serted.

xxiii. In Section 605.9, Temporary wiring, “the ICC
Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical
subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be
inserted.

70-41

xxiv. New Section 605.11, Unused equipment, shall
be inserted as follows, “605.11 Unused equipment. All
unused fixtures, circuits, wiring and electrical devices or
fixtures shall be removed or properly secured in place
and maintained.”

xxv. In Section 606.1, Scope; Section 606.2,
Refrigerants; Section 606.3, Refrigerant classification;
Section 606.4, Change in refrigerant type; Section
606.6.1, Periodic testing; and Section 606.8, Refrigerant
detector, “the International Mechanical Code” shall be
deleted and “the mechanical subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xxvi. In Section 606.16, Electrical equipment, “the
International Mechanical Code” shall be deleted and
“the mechanical subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted. “The ICC Electrical Code” shall
be deleted and “the electrical subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted. In the Exception,
“Section 1106.3.20 of the International Mechanical
Code” shall be deleted and “the mechanical subcode of
the Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xxvii. In Section 607.3, Elevator keys, after “fire
department,” “and shall be in compliance with N.J.A.C.
5:70-2.23, Elevator key lock boxes.” shall be inserted.

xxviil. In Section 608.4, Room design and
construction, “the International Building Code” shall be
deleted and “the building subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xxix. In Section 608.6.1, Room ventilation, “the
International Mechanical Code” shall be deleted and
“the mechanical subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

xxX. In Section 608.8, Seismic protection, “the
International Building Code” shall be deleted and “the
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

xxxi. In Section 608.9 Smoke detection, “installed”
shall be deleted and “maintained” shall be inserted.

xxxii. In Section 609.1, General, “including those in
mobile enclosed units” shall be inserted after “exhaust
hoods” and “comply” shall be deleted and “be
maintained in accordance” shall be inserted. Also, “the
International Mechanical Code” shall be deleted and
“the mechanical subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code and NFPA 96” shall be inserted.

xxxiii. In Section 609.2, Where required, “Where
required” shall be deleted and the text of the section
shall be deleted and the following text shall be inserted,
“609.2 Maintenance. Commercial kitchen exhaust sys-
tems shall be cleaned to remove deposits of residue and
grease in the system at intervals specified in the cleaning
schedule required to be submitted in accordance with
609.2.1. Thorough cleaning of ducts, hoods and fans

Supp. 8-18-08



5:70-3.2

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 8-18-08

shall require scraping, brushing or other positive clean-
ing methods.”

xxxiv. New Section 609.2.1, Cleaning schedule,
shall be inserted as follows, “609.2.1 Cleaning schedule.
Where a cleaning schedule is not on file, the fire official
shall require a schedule to be submitted, indicating the
method of cleaning and the time intervals between clean-
ings.”

7. Chapter 7, Fire-Resistance-Rated Construction, shall

be amended as follows:

i. In Section 703.2, Opening protectives, the
following text shall be inserted after the word “inoper-
able” “Door stops, wedges and other unapproved hold-
open devices shall be prohibited.”

ii. In Section 703.2.2, Hold-open devices and
closers, the following text shall be inserted before the
first sentence starting with the word “hold-open,” “Ap-
proved self-closing”. The following text shall be inserted
following the second sentence after the word “position,”
“Where it is desired to keep the doors open, an auto-
matic-closing device actuated by automatic fire detectors
shall be provided in accordance with the building sub-
code of the Uniform Construction Code.

iii. In Section 704.1, Enclosure, the words “Table
704.1” shall be deleted and the following text shall be
inserted, “the construction code in effect at the time of
construction or N.J.A.C. 5:70-4 as applicable.”

iv. Table 704.1, Vertical Opening Protection Re-
quired shall be deleted.

8. Chapter 8, Interior Finish, Decorative Materials And

Furnishings, shall be amended as follows:

i. In Section 803.1, General, the text of the section
following “803.1 General.” shall be deleted in its
entirety and the following shall be inserted, “The interior
finish and trim shall be maintained in accordance with
the requirements of N.J.A.C. 5:23, the Uniform Con-
struction Code or N.J.A.C. 5:70-4 the Uniform Fire
Code, Fire Safety Code as applicable. Any interior finish
or trim installed without a permit issued in accordance
with N.J.A.C. 5:23, the Uniform Construction Code,
shall be removed.”

ii. In Section 803, Interior Wall and Ceiling Finish
and Trim in Existing Buildings, the following sections
shall be deleted: 803.1.1, Classification; 803.2, Stability;
803.3, Interior finish requirements based on occupancy;
803.4, Fire retardant coatings; 803.5, Textiles; 803.5.1,
Textile wall coverings; 803.5.1.1, Method A. test proto-
col Textiles; 803.6, 803.6.1, Expanded vinyl wall or ceil-
ing coverings, General; and 803.6.2, Compliance alter-
native.

70-42

iii. Table 803.3, Interior Wall And Ceiling Finish
Requirements By Occupancy, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

iv. In Section 803.7.1, Combustibility character-
istics, the following shall be deleted, “in Section 2603.9
of the International Building Code” and the following
shall be inserted, “the building subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code.”

v. In Section 803.7.2, Thermal barrier, the follow-
ing shall be deleted, “Section 2603.4 of the International
Building Code”, and the following shall be inserted, “the
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”.

vi. Section 804, Interior Wall and Ceiling Trim in
New and Existing Buildings, shall be deleted in its en-
tirety.

vii. In Section 805, Upholstered Furniture And Mat-
tresses In New And Existing Buildings, the following
text shall be deleted, “In New And Existing Buildings.”

viii. In Section 806, Decorative Vegetation In New
And Existing Buildings, the following text shall be de-
leted, “In New And Existing Buildings.”

ix. In Section 806.1.1, Restricted occupancies, the
following text shall be deleted, “Group A, E. I-1, 1-2, I-
3, I-4, M, R-1, R-2, R-4” and the following text shall be
inserted, “all”. In Section 806.1.1, Restricted Occupan-
cies, Exception, 1. The following text shall be deleted,
“in Groups A, E, M. R-1 and R-2.” In Section 806.1.1,
Restricted Occupancies, Exception 2, the following text
shall be deleted, “in Group R-2 occupancies” and the
word “individual” shall be added after the word
“within.”

X. In Section 806.3, Obstruction of Means of
Egress, after “vegetation,” the “and the decorative vege-
tation shall not be placed near any stairway or elevator
shaft” shall be inserted.

xi. New Section 806.6, Show windows, shall be in-
serted as follows, “806.6 Show windows. “Decorative
vegetation and wreaths shall not be used for decorative
purposes in show windows or other parts of buildings in
such a quantity as to constitute a fire hazard unless such
material is flameproofed in an approved manner.”

xii. New Section 806.7, Under-tree decorations, shall
be inserted as follows, “806.7 Under-tree decorations.
No flammable decorations, combustible tree skirts or
decorative gift packages may be placed on or under or
around decorative vegetation. This restriction does not
apply to decorative vegetation displayed in a sprinklered
building.”

xiii. New Section 806.8, Holiday wreaths, shall be
inserted as follows, “806.8 Holiday wreaths: Holiday
wreaths shall be permitted in any building but such



UNIFORM FIRE CODE

5:70-3.2

tamper switch installed in accordance with NFPA 72 and
separately annunciated”

xxv. In Section 903.4.2, Alarms, “provided” shall
be deleted, and “maintained” shall be inserted in the
third sentence. Following “approved location” the
following text shall be inserted “in accordance with the
construction code in effect at time of construction or
N.J.A.C. 5:70-4.”

xxvi.  Section 903.4.3 Floor control valve, shall be
deleted in its entirety.

xxvii.  In Section 903.6, Existing buildings, “Exist-
ing buildings” shall be deleted and the text of the section
shall be deleted and the following text shall be inserted,
“Placarding. Hydraulically calculated sprinkler systems
shall be placarded in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.5,
3.17 and 4.5 of the Uniform Construction Code for Form
F380.”

xxviil. Section 903.6.1, Pyroxylin plastics, shall be
deleted in its entirety.

xxix. In Section 904.1, General, “designed, in-
stalled,” shall be deleted.

XXX. Section 904.2, Where required, shall be
deleted in its entirety.

xxxi.  In Section 904.2.1, Commercial hood and
duct systems, “Section 610” shall be changed to
“Section 609” and “including mobile enclosed cooking
operations” shall be inserted following “Type I hood.” In
the same sentence, “protected with an approved
automatic fire extinguishing system installed” shall be
deleted and “maintained” shall be inserted.

xxxii. In Section 904.3, Installation, following “in
accordance with,” “this section” shall be deleted and
“the fire subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

xxxiii. The following sections shall be deleted in
their entirety: Section 904.3.1, Electrical wiring; Section
904.3.2, Actuation; Section 904.4, Inspection and
testing; Section 904.4.1, Inspection; Section 904.4.2,
Alarm testing; Section 904.4.2.1, Audible and visible
signals; and Section 904.4.3, Monitor testing.

xxxiv. In Section 904.3.3, System interlocking, fol-
lowing “systems shall be,” “provided” shall be deleted
and “maintained” shall be inserted.

xxxv. In Section 904.5, Wet-chemical systems, “in-
stalled” shall be deleted.

xxxvi. In Section 904.6, Dry chemical systems, “in-
stalled” shall be deleted.

xxxvii. In Section 904.7, Foam systems, “installed”
shall be deleted.

70-45

xxxviii. New Section 904.8.6, Total Flooding sys-
tems: shall be inserted as follows: “904.8.6 Total Flood-
ing systems: In any use of carbon dioxide systems where
there is a possibility that personnel will be trapped in, or
enter into, an atmosphere made hazardous by a
discharge, warning signs, discharge alarms and breathing
apparatus, when provided, shall be maintained to insure
prompt evacuation of and to prevent entry into such
atmospheres and also to provide means for prompt
rescue of any trapped personnel.”

xxxix. New Section 904.9.5, Total flooding sys-
tems, shall be inserted as follows: “904.9.5 Total Flood-
ing systems: In any use of halon total flooding systems
where there is a possibility that personnel will be trapped
in, or enter into, an atmosphere made hazardous by a
discharge, warning signs, discharge alarms and breathing
apparatus, when provided, shall be maintained to insure
prompt evacuation of and to prevent entry into such
atmospheres and also to provide means for prompt res-
cue of any trapped personnel.”

x1. In Section 904.10, Clean-agent systems,
“installed” shall be deleted.

xli. Section 904.11.3, Carbon dioxide systems
shall be deleted in its entirety.

xlii. In Section 904.11.6, Operations and mainte-
nance, “, including mobile enclosed cooking operations”
shall be inserted following “Commercial cooking sys-
tems.”

xliii. In Section 905.1, General, the following text
shall be deleted, “Standpipe systems shall be provided in
new buildings and structures in accordance with this
section.” and the following text shall be deleted, “The
location of fire department hose connections shall be
approved. In buildings used for high-piled combustible
storage, fire protection shall be in accordance with
Chapter 23.”

xliv. In Section 905 Standpipe Systems, the fol-
lowing sections shall be deleted in their entirety: Section
905.2, Installation standard; Section 905.3, Required;
Section 905.3.1, Building height; Section 905.3.2, Group
A; Section 905.3.3, Covered mall buildings; Section
905.3.4, Stages; Section 905.3.5, Underground build-
ings; Section 905.3.6, Helistops and heliports; Section
905.3.7, Marinas and boatyards; Section 905.4, Location
of Class I standpipe hose connections; Section 905.4.1,
Protection; Section 905.4.2, Interconnection; Section
905.5, Location of Class II standpipe hose connections;
Section 905.5.1, Groups A-1 and A-2; Section 905.5.2,
Protection; Section 905.5.3, Class II system 1 inch hose;
Section 905.6, Location of Class III standpipe hose
connections; Section 905.6.1, Protection; and Section
905.6.2, Interconnection.

Supp. 8-18-08



5:70-3.2

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 8-18-08

xlv.  The following sections shall be deleted in their
entirety: Section 905.8, Dry standpipes; Section 905.9,
Valve supervision; Section 905.10, During construction;
and Section 905.11, Existing buildings.

xlvi. In Section 907.1 General, after “This section
covers,” the following text shall be deleted, “application,
installation,” after “new and existing buildings and struc-
tures.” the following text shall be deleted, “The require-
ments of Section 907.2 are applicable to new buildings
and structures. The requirements of Section 907.3 are
applicable to existing buildings and structures.”

xlvii. The following sections shall be deleted in
their entirety: Section 907.1.1, Construction documents;
Section 907.1.2, Equipment; Section 907.2, Where
required; Section 907.2.1, Group A; Section 907.2.1.1,
System initiation in Group A occupancies; Section
907.2.1.2, Emergency power; Section 907.2.2, Group B;
Section 907.2.3, Group E; Section 907.2.4, Group F;
Section 907.2.5, Group H; Section 907.2.6, Group I;
Section 907.2.6.1, Group I; Section 907.2.6.2, Group I-
2; Section 907.2.6.3, Group I-3; Section 907.2.6.3.1,
System initiation; Section 907.2.6.3.2, Manual fire alarm
boxes; Section 907.2.6.3.3, Smoke detectors; Section
907.2.7, Group M; Section 907.2.7.1, Occupant notifica-
tion; Section 907.2.8, Group R-1; Section 907.2.8.1,
Manual fire alarm system; Section 907.2.8.2, Automatic
fire alarm system; Section 907.2.8.3, Smoke alarms; and
Section 907.2.9, Group R-2.

xlviii. The following sections shall be deleted in their
entirety: Section 907.2.10, Single and multiple station
smoke alarms; Section 907.2.10.1, Where required; Sec-
tion 907.2.1.1, Group R-1; Section 907.2.10.1.2, Groups
R-2, R-3, R4 and I-1; Section 907.2.10.1.3, Group I-1
Single; Section 907.2.10.2, Power source; Section
907.2.10.3, Interconnection; Section 907.2.10.4, Accep-
tance testing; Section 907.2.11, Special amusement build-
ings; Section 907.2.11.1, Alarm; Section 907.2.11.2, Sys-~
tem response; Section 907.2.11.3, Emergency voice/alarm
communication system; Section 907.2.12, High rise
buildings; Section 907.2.12.1, Automatic fire detection;
Section 907.2.12.2, Emergency voice/alarm communica-
tion system; Section 907.12.2.1, Manual override; Section
907.2.12.2.2, Live voice messages; Section 907.2.12.2.3,
Standard; and Section 907.2.12.2.3, Fire department
communication system.

xlix.  The following sections shall be deleted in
their entirety: Section 907.2.13, Atriums connecting
more than two stories; Section 907.2.14, High piled
combustible storage areas; Section 907.2.15, Delayed
egress locks; Section 907.2.16, Aerosol storage uses;
Section 907.2.17, Lumber wood structural panel and
veneer mills; Section 907.2.18, Underground buildings
with smoke exhaust systems; Section 907.2.18.1, Smoke
detectors; Section 907.2.18.2, Alarm required; Section

70-46

907.2.19, Underground buildings; Section 907.2.19.1,
Public address system; Section 907.2.20, Covered mall
buildings; Section 907.2.21, Residential aircraft hangars;
Section 907.2.22, Airport traffic control towers; and
Section 907.2.23, Battery rooms.

1. The following sections shall be deleted in their
entirety: Section 907.3, Where required; Section
907.3.1, Occupancy requirements; Section 907.3.1.1,
Group E; Section 907.3.1.2, Group I-1; Section
907.3.1.3, Group I-2; Section 907.3.1.4, Group I-3;
Section 907.3.1.5, Group R-1 hotels and motels;
Section 907.3.1.6, Group R-1 boarding and rooming
houses; Section 907.3.1.7, Group R-2; Section
907.3.1.8, Group R-4; Section 907.3.2, Single and
multiple station smoke alarms; Section 907.3.2.1,
General; Section 907.3.2.2, Interconnection; Section
907.3.2.3, Power source; Section 907.4, Manual fire
alarm boxes; Section 907.4.1, Location; Section
907.4.2, Height; and Section 907.4.4, Signs.

li. New Section 907.4.5, Protective covers, shall
be inserted as follows, “907.4.5 Protective covers. The
fire official is authorized to require the installation of
listed manual fire alarm box protective covers to prevent
malicious false alarms or to provide the manual fire
alarm box with protection from physical damage. The
protective cover shall be transparent or red in color with
a transparent face to permit visibility of the manual fire
alarm box. Each cover shall include proper operating
instructions. A protective cover that emits a local alarm
signal shall not be installed unless approved.”

lii.  The following sections shall be deleted in their
entirety: Section 907.5, Power supply; Section 907.6,
Wiring; Section 907.7, Activation; Section 907.8,
Presignal system; Section 907.9, Zones; Section 907.9.1,
Zoning indicator panel; Section 907.9.2, High rise
buildings; Section 907.10, Alarm notification; Section
907.10, Alarm notification appliances; Section 907.10.1,
Visible alarms; Section 907.10.1.1, Public and common
areas; Section 907.10.1.2, Employee work areas, Table

907.10.1.3, Visible and Audible Alarms; Section

907.10.1.3, Groups I-1 and R-1; Section 907.10.1.4,
Group R-2; Section 907.10.2, Audible alarms; and
Section 907.11, Fire safety functions.

liii.  In Section 907.14, Fire extinguishing systems,
“a fire alarm system is required by another section of
this code or is otherwise installed” shall be deleted and
the following text shall be inserted, “required by the con-
struction code in effect at the time of the fire alarm sys-
tem installation.”

liv.  In Section 907.15, Monitoring, text shall be
deleted in its entirety and the following text shall be
inserted, ‘“Fire alarm systems shall be maintained as
required by the construction code in effect at the time of
the fire alarm system installation.

Next Page is 70-46.1



P

\w\w/

' pe—

UNIFORM FIRE CODE

5:70-3.2

lv.  Section 907.17, Acceptance tests, shall be
deleted in its entirety.

Ivi.  Section 907.18, Record of completion, shall be
deleted in its entirety.

lvii. In Section 907.19, Instructions, “provided”
shall be deleted and “maintained” shall be inserted
before “at an approved location.”

Iviii. In Section 907.20.5, Maintenance, inspection
and testing, “qualification requirements of NFPA 72 for
maintaining, inspecting and testing such systems” shall
be deleted and “the requirements of N.J.A.C. 5:74 shall
be inserted.

lix. New Section 907.20.6, Engine-driven generator,
shall be inserted as follows: “907.20.6 Engine-driven
generator: Where an engine-driven generator provides
required secondary power source, such generator shall
be inspected weekly and exercised at least monthly
under load by disconnecting the normal supply to the
system for a minimum of % hour in a continuous
period.”

Ix. New Section 907.21, Periodic testing and in-
spection of Single-and Multiple-stations smoke detec-
tors, shall be inserted as follows: “907.21 Periodic
testing and inspections of Single- and Multiple-Stations
Smoke detectors. All single- and multiple- station smoke
detectors shall be maintained, periodically inspected and
tested in accordance with NFPA 72 and Section 907.21.1
and 907.21.2.

Ixi. New section 907.21.1, Single-station smoke
detectors, shall be inserted as follows, “907.21.1 Single-
station smoke detectors. Tests or inspections in
accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions shall be
conducted at 1-month intervals for other than battery-
powered smoke detectors and at 1-week intervals for
battery-powered smoke detectors.

Exception: The written log of tests as specified in
Section 901.6.2 shall not be required in R-3 occupan-
cies.”

Ixii. New Section 907.21.2 shall be added as follows,
“907.21.2 Battery operated smoke detectors. Battery
operated smoke detectors in Group R-1 and R-1
buildings and in bed and breakfast homestays shall be
maintained, tested and inspected as follows:

1. The owner of the building or the owner’s rep-
resentative shall inspect each detector whenever a
change of occupancy occurs;

2. The owner of the building or the owner’s rep-
resentative shall clean the detectors and or replace the
batteries as necessary, but, at least once and year, to
assure proper operation.”

70-46.1

Ixiii. New Section 908.7, High level alarms testing,
shall be inserted as follows: “908.7 High level alarms
testing. All high level alarm systems installed in accor-
dance with N.J.A.C. 5:72 shall be periodically tested in
accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:72-3.2(a)4.”

Ixiv. The following sections shall be deleted in their
entirety: Section 909.1, Scope and purpose; Section
909.2, General design requirements; Section 909.3,
Special inspection and test requirements; Section 909.4,
Analysis; Section 909.4.1, Stack effect; Section 909.4.2,
Temperature effect of fire; Section 909.4.3, Wind effect;
Section 909.4.4, Systems; Section 909.4.5, Climate;
Section 909.4.6, Duration of operation; Section 909.5,
Smoke barrier construction; Section 909.5.1, Leakage
area; Section 909.5.2, Opening protection; Section
909.5.2.1, Ducts and air transfer openings; Section
909.6, Pressurization method; Section 909.6.1, Mini-
mum pressure difference; Section 909.6.2, Maximum
pressure difference; Section 909.7, Airflow design
method; Section 909.7.1, Velocity; Section 909.7.2,
Prohibited conditions; Section 909.8, Exhaust method;
Section 909.8.1, Smoke layer; Section 909.9, Design
fire; Section 909.9.1, Factors considered; Section
909.9.2, Separation distance; Section 909.9.3, Heat re-
lease assumptions; and Section 909.9.4, Sprinkler effec-
tiveness assumptions.

Ixv. The following sections shall be deleted in their
entirety: Section 909.10, Equipment; Section 909.10.1,
Exhaust fans; Section 909.10.2, Ducts; Section 909.10.3,
Equipment, inlets and outlets; Section 909.10.4,
Automatic dampers; Section 909.10.5, Fans; Section
909.11, Power systems; Section 909.11.1, Power sources
and power surges; Section 909.12, Detection and control
systems; Section 909.12.1, Wiring; Section 909.12.2,
Activation; Section 909.12.2.1, Pressurization; Section
909.12.2.2, Passive method; Section 909.12.3, Auto-
matic control; Section 909.13, Control air tubing; Sec-
tion 909.13.1, Materials; Section 909.13.2, Isolation
from other functions; Section 909.13.3, Testing; Section
909.14, Marking and identification; Section 909.15,
Control diagrams; Section 909.16, Fire fighter’s smoke
control panel; Section 909.16.2, Smoke control panel;
and Section 909.16.3, Control action and priorities.

Ixvi. The following sections shall be deleted in their
entirety: Section 909.17, System response time; Section
909.18, Acceptance testing; Section 909.18.1, Detection
devices; Section 909.18.2, Ducts; Section 909.18.3,
Dampers; Section 909.18.4, Inlets and outlets; Section
909.18.5, Fans; Section 909.18.6, Smoke barriers;
Section 909.18.7, Controls; Section 909.18.8, Special
inspections for smoke control; Section 909.18.8.1, Scope
of testing; Section 909.18.8.2, Qualifications; Section
909.18.8.3, Reports; Section 909.18.8.3.1, Report filing;
Section 909.18.9, Identification and documentation; and
Section 909.19, System acceptance.

Supp. 8-18-08



5:70-3.2

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 8-18-08

Ixvii. In Section 909.20.1, Schedule, “Dedicated
smoke control systems shall be inspected and operated at
6 month intervals.” shall be inserted after “established.”

Ixviii. Section 910, Smoke And Heat Vents shall be
deleted in its entirety.

Ixix.  In Section 911, Explosion Control, “NFPA 68~
shall be inserted before “NFPA 69.”

Ixx.  Section 912.1, Installation, “installed” shall be
deleted and “maintained” shall be inserted.

Ixxi. Section 912.2, Location, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

Ixxii. Section 912.2.1, Visible location, shall be de-
leted in its entirety.

Ixxiii. Section 912.5 Backflow protection shall be de-
leted in its entirety.

Ixxiv. In Section 913.1 General, “installed” shall be
deleted and “maintained” shall be inserted.

Ixxv. Section 913.5.1, Acceptance test, shall be de-
leted in its entirety.

Ixxvi. New Section 914, Private Water Tanks And
Fire Service Mains, shall be inserted as follows:

“Section 914
Private Water Tanks And Fire Service Mains

914.1 Inspection, testing, maintenance: Private wa-
ter tanks and water service mains shall be periodically
inspected, tested and maintained in accordance with
NFPA 25.”

Ixxvii.  New Section 915, Elevator Recall, shall be
inserted as follows:

“SECTION 915
ELEVATOR RECALL

915.1 Testing: Elevators shall be tested annually in
accordance with 915.1.1 and 915.1.2 below. The fire
official shall accept a current Certificate of Compli-
ance issued in accordance with the Uniform Construc-
tion Code as evidence of compliance with this section.

915.1.1 Upon simulated activation of an elevator
lobby detector, the elevator controller shall cause all
elevator cars that serve that lobby to return nonstop to
the designated lobby, and prevent further operation of
the elevators without the use of an emergency service
key.

915.1.2 The emergency service keys shall be
utilized to place the recalled elevators into emergency
operation and to verify proper functioning of the
elevator for fire service operation.”

70-46.2

Ixxviii.  Section 914, Fire Protection Based on Spe-
cial Detailed Requirements of Use and Occupancy, shall
be deleted in its entirety.

10. Chapter 10, Means Of Egress, shall be amended as

follows:

i.  Section 1001.1, General, the text of the section
shall be deleted in its entirety and the following shall be
inserted, “Scope. The provisions of this chapter shall
govern the maintenance and utilization of means of

" egress.”

ii. In Section 1001.2, Minimum requirements, “this
code” shall be deleted and the following shall be
inserted, “the Uniform Construction Code in effect at the
time of construction or the Uniform Fire Code, as
applicable.”

iii. New Section 1001.2.1 shall be inserted as fol-
lows, “A structure shall not be altered in any manner
affecting the number or capacity of means of egress
without first obtaining a permit from the construction
official.”

iv. New Section 1001.2.2 shall be inserted as fol-
lows, “Structures or portions of structures undergoing
repair, renovation, alteration or reconstruction may be
occupied as permitted by the construction official.”

v. In Section 1002.1, Definitions, “Occupant Load,”
the first sentence shall be deleted and the following shall
be inserted, “The total number of persons permitted to
occupy a building or portion thereof at any one time.”

vi. In Section 1002.1, Definitions, the following
shall be inserted after “Occupant Load,” “Overcrowding.
A condition in which the number of occupants exceeds
the total number of persons permitted to occupy a
structure at any one time.”

vii. In Section 1002.1, Definitions, the following
shall be inserted after “Panic Hardware,” “Place Of As-
sembly, A place of assembly shall be a room or space
accommodating individuals for religious, recreational,
political or social or amusement purposes or for the con-
sumption of food and drink, including all connected
rooms or spaces with a common means of egress and en-
trance.”

viii. In Section 1003.1, Applicability, the text of the
section shall be deleted and the following shall be
inserted, “Owner responsibility. The owner or lessee of
every structure shall be responsible for the safety of all
persons in, or occupying, such premises with respect to
the adequacy of means of egress therefrom.”

ix. In Section 1003.2, Ceiling height, the text of the
section shall be deleted and the following shall be in-
serted, “Egress plan. Where required by Section 404.2, a
plan complying with Section 404.3 shall be submitted to



UNIFORM FIRE CODE

5:70-3.2

the fire official and an approved copy shall be kept on
the premises of assembly occupancies.”

Xx. In Section 1003.3, Protruding objects, the text of
the section shall be deleted and the following shall be
inserted, “Occupant load.: The occupant load for struc-
tures shall be maintained pursuant to the New Jersey
Uniform Construction Code provisions in effect at the
time of construction. The occupant load for structures
constructed under standards in force prior to adoption of
the New Jersey Uniform Construction Code shall be
calculated in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:70-4.11(f)3.”

xi. In Section 1003, General Means of Egress, the
following sections shall be deleted in their entirety:
Section 1003.3.1, Headroom; Section 1003.3.2, Free
standing objects; Section 1003.3.3, Horizontal projec-
tions; and Section 1003.3.4, Clear width.

Xil. In Section 1003.4, Floor surface, the text of
the section shall be deleted and the following shall be
inserted, “Posting of occupant load. An assembly occu-
pancy shall be posted with an approved legible sign in
contrasting colors conspicuously located near the main
point of egress from the room or space stating the
number of occupants permitted within such space. The
number of occupants permitted shall be in accordance
with the current certificate of occupancy issued pursuant
to the New Jersey Uniform Construction Code for
structures constructed and occupied under the provisions
of that code, and shall be in accordance with N.J.A.C.
5:70-4.11(f)3. for structures constructed under standards
in force prior to adoption of the New Jersey Uniform
Construction Code for which structures no such certifi-
cate of occupancy has subsequently been issued.”

xiii.  In Section 1003.5, Elevation change, the text
of the section shall be deleted and the following shall be
inserted, “Overcrowding. A person shall not permit
overcrowding or admittance of any person beyond the
approved occupant load. The fire official, upon finding
overcrowded conditions or obstructions in aisles, pas-
sageways or other means of egress, or upon finding any
condition which constitutes a hazard to life and safety,
shall cause the occupancy, performance, presentation,
spectacle or entertainment to be stopped until such a
condition or obstruction is corrected and the addition of
any further occupants prohibited until the approved
occupant load is reestablished.”

xiv.  In Section 1003.6, Means of egress continuity,
the text of the section shall be deleted and the following
shall be inserted, “Operator responsibility. The operator
or the person responsible for the operation of an
assembly or educational occupancy shall check egress
facilities before such building is occupied to determine
compliance with this chapter. If such inspection reveals
that any element of the required means of egress cannot
be accessed, is obstructed, locked, fastened or otherwise
unsuited for immediate utilization, admittance to the

70-46.3

building shall not be permitted until necessary corrective
action has been completed.”

XV. Section 1003.7, Elevators, escalators and
moving walks, shall be deleted in its entirety.

xvi.  Section 1004, Occupant Load, shall be deleted
in its entirety.

xvii. Section 1005, Egress Width, shall be deleted
in its entirety.

xviii. In Section 1006.1, Illumination required, Ex-
ceptions, “in Groups R-1, R-2 and R-3 of 3. and 4.
Sleeping units of Group I occupancies” shall be deleted.

xix. In Section 1006, Means of Egress
Illumination, the following sections shall be deleted in
their entirety: Section 1006.2, Illumination level, Section
1006.3, Illumination emergency power, Section 1006.4,
Performance of system.

XX. Section 1007, Accessible Means of Egress,
shall be deleted in its entirety.

xxi.  Section 1008.1, Doors, the following shall be
deleted, “Means of egress doors shall meet the require-
ments of this section. Doors serving a means of egress
section shall meet the requirements of this section and
Section 1017.2.”

xxii. In Section 1008, Doors, Gates and Turnstiles,
the following sections shall be deleted in their entirety,
Section 1008.1.1, Size of doors; Section 1008.1.1.1, Pro-
jections into clear width; Section 1008.1.2, Door swing;
Section 1008.1.3, Special doors; Section 1008.1.3.1,
Revolving doors, Table 1008.1.3.1, Revolving door
speeds; Section 1008.1.3.1.1, Egress component; Section
1008.1.3.1.2, Other than egress components; Section
1008.1.3.2, Power operated doors; Section 1008.1.3.3,
Horizontal sliding doors; and 1008.1.3.4, Access con-
trolled egress doors.

xxiii. Section 1008.1.3.5, Security grilles, the fol-
lowing text shall be deleted, “In Groups B, F, M and S,”
and “Where two or more means of egress are required,
not more than one half of the exits or exit access door-
ways shall be equipped with horizontal sliding or
vertical security grilles.”

xxiv. In Section 1008, Doors, Gates and Turnstiles,
the following sections shall be deleted in their entirety:
Section 1008.1.4, Floor elevation; Section 1008.1.5,
Landings at doors; Section 1008.1.6, Thresholds; and
Section 1008.1.7, Door arrangement.

xxv. In Section 1008.1.8, Door operations, “Except
as specifically permitted by this section” shall be
deleted.

xxvi. Section 1008.1.8.2, Hardware height shall be
deleted in its entirety.

Supp. 8-18-08



5:70-3.2

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 8-18-08

xxvii. New Section 1008.4, Locks permitted, shall be
inserted as follows, “Locks permitted. Locks or fasteners
shall not be installed on egress doors, except in accor-
dance with the following conditions:

1. In mental, penal or other institutions where
the security of inmates is necessary, in which case
properly trained supervisory personnel shall be
continuously on duty and approved provisions shall be
made to remove occupants safely in case of a fire or
other emergencies.

2. In problem security areas, special-purpose
door alarms or locking devices shall be approved prior
to installation. Manually operated edge or surface-
molded flush bolts shall be prohibited.

3. Where the door hardware is in compliance
with the Uniform Construction Code.”

xxviii. New Section 1008.5. Special performance
features, shall be inserted as follows, “Special perfor-
mance features. All hardware systems or assemblies util-
ized in the operation of a door, including special perfor-
mance features, shall be inspected for proper operation.
The inspection shall determine that the hardware
operates as required by this code.”

xxix. New Section 1008.6, Panic hardware, shall
be inserted as follows, “Panic hardware. All doors equip-
ped with latching devices serving rooms or spaces with
an assembly or educational occupancy with an occupant
load greater than 100 shall have the approved panic
hardware maintained in compliance with the construc-
tion code in effect at the time of first occupancy.”

XXX. New Section 1008.7, Closing, shall be
inserted as follows “Closing. All fire doors shall comply
with Section 703.”

xxxi.  The following sections shall be deleted in
their entirety: Section 1008.1.8.3 Locks and latches;
Section 1008.1.8.5, Unlatching; and Section 1008.1.8.6
Delayed egress locks.

xxxii. In Section 1008.1.8.7, Stairway doors, Ex-
ception 2 “the International Building Code” shall be
deleted and “the building subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xxxiii. In Section 1008, Doors, Gates and Turnstiles,
the following sections shall be deleted in their entirety:
Section 1008.1.9, Panic and fire exit hardware; Section
1008.2, Gates; Section 1008.2.1, Stadiums; Section
1008.3, Turnstiles; Section 1008.3.1, High turnstile; and
Section 1008.3.2, Additional door.

xxxiv. In Section 1009, Stairways, the following
sections shall be deleted in their entirety: Section 1009.1,
Stairway width; Section 1009.2, Headroom; Section
1009.3, Stair treads and risers; Section 1009.3.1, Winder
treads; Section 1009.3.3, Profile; Section 1009.4, Stair-

70-46.4

way landings; Section 1009.5, Stairway construction;
Section 1009.5.2, Outdoor conditions; Section 1009.5.3,
Enclosures under stairways; Section 1009.6, Vertical
rise; Section 1009.7, Curved stairways; Section 1009.8,
Spiral stairways; Section 1009.9, Alternating tread
devices; Section 1009.9.1, Handrails of alternating tread
devices; Section 1009.9.2, Treads of alternating tread
devices; Section 1009.10, Handrails; Section 1009.11,
Stairway to roof; Section 1009.11.1, Roof access; and
Section 1009.11.2, Protection at roof hatch openings.

xxxv. In Section 1010, Ramps, the following sec-
tions shall be deleted in their entirety: Section 1010.1,
Scope; Section 1010.2, Slope; Section 1010.3, Cross
slope; Section 1010.4, Vertical rise; Section 1010.5,
Minimum dimensions; Section 1010.5.1, Width; Section
1010.5.2, Headroom; Section 1010.5.3, Restrictions;
Section 1010.6, Landings; Section 1010.6.1, Slope;
Section 1010.6.2, Width; Section 1010.6.3, Length;
Section 1010.6.4, Change in direction; Section 1010.6.5,
Doorways; Section 1010.7, Ramp construction; Section
1010.7.1, Ramp surface; Section 1010.7.2, Outdoor
conditions; Section 1010.8, Handrails; Section 1010.9,
Edge protection; Section 1010.9.1, Curb, rail, wall or
barrier; Section 1010.9.2, Extended floor or ground
surface; and Section 1010.10, Guards.

xxxvi. In Section 1011.1, Where required, the text
of the section shall be deleted and the following shall be
inserted, “Exit signs. All means of egress shall be
indicated with approved “Exit” signs where required by
the construction code in effect at the time of first
occupancy or N.J.A.C. 5:70-4 et seq., as applicable. All
“Exit” signs shall be maintained visible, and all illumi-
nated exit signs shall be illuminated at all times the
structure is occupied. Supplemental internally illumi-
nated directional signs, when necessary, shall be in-
stalled in accordance with the technical requirements of
the Uniform Construction Code indicating the direction
and way of egress.”

xxxvii. In Section 1011.2, Illumination, the text of
the section shall be deleted and the following shall be
inserted, “Information signs. A sign shall be provided at
each floor landing in all interior stairways more than
three stories above grade, designating the floor level
above the floor of discharge. All elevator lobby call
stations on all floor levels shall be identified by
approved signs in accordance with the requirements for
new buildings in the Uniform Construction Code.
Exception: The emergency sign shall not be required for
elevators that are part of an accessible means of egress
complying with the construction code in effect at the
time of first occupancy.”

xxxviii. In Section 1011.3, Tactile exit signs, the text
of the section shall be deleted and the following shall be
inserted, “Mistaken egress. All doors, passageways and
stairways that are neither a means of egress nor provide



UNIFORM FIRE CODE

5:70-3.2

access to a means of egress and are located or arranged
so as to be mistaken for a means of egress, shall be
properly identified as to their purpose.”

xxxix. In Section 1011.4, Internally illuminated exit
signs, the text of the section shall be deleted and the
following shall be inserted, “Sign obscuration. Decora-
tions, furnishings and equipment impairing the visibility
of egress signs shall not be permitted. Brightly illumi-
nated signs for other than egress purposes, displays or
objects shall not be located in or near the line of vision
to the required egress sign when of a character so as to
detract attention from the egress sign such that the sign
will not be noticed.”

xL. The following sections shall be deleted in their
entirety: Section 1011.5, Externally illuminated exit
signs; Section 1011.5.1, Graphics; Section 1011.5.2, Exit
sign illumination; and Section 1011.5.3, Power source.

xli.  In Section 1012, Handrails, the following
sections shall be deleted in their entirety: Section 1012.1,
Where required; Section 1012.2, Height; Section 1012.3,
Handrail graspability; Section 1012.4, Continuity; Sec-
tion 1012.5, Handrail extensions; Section 1012.6, Clear-
ance; Section 1012.7, Projections; and Section 1012.8,
Intermediate handrails.

xlii. In Section 1013, Guards, the following
sections shall be deleted in their entirety: Section 1013.1,
Where required; Section 1013.2, Height; Section 1013.3,
Opening; Section 1013.4, Screen porches; Section
1013.5, Mechanical equipment; and Section 1013.6,
Roof access.

xliii. In Section 1014.1, General, the text of the
section shall be deleted and the following shall be
inserted, “Aisles. In each room where chairs or tables
and chairs are utilized, the arrangement shall provide for
ready access by aisle accessways and aisles to each
egress door. The minimum clear width of each aisle in
occupancies in Use Groups A, E and 1-2 shall be main-
tained in accordance with the construction code in effect
at the time of first occupancy. In all other occupancies,
aisles shall have a minimum required clear width of 44
inches (1118 mm) where serving an occupant load
greater than 50, and 36 inches (914 mm) where serving
an occupant load of 50 or less. The clear width of aisles
shall not be obstructed by chairs, tables or other objects.

xliv. In Section 1014, Exit Access, the following
sections shall be deleted in their entirety: Section 1014.2,
Egress through intervening spaces; Section 1014.2.2,
Group I 2; Section 1014.3, Common path of egress
travel; Section 1014.4, Aisles; Section 1014.4.1, Aisles
in Groups B and M; Section 1014.4.2, Aisle accessways
in Group M; Section 1014.4.3, Seating at tables; Section
1014.3.3.1 Aisle accessway for tables and seating;
Section 1014.4.3.2, Table and seating accessway width;
Section 1014.4.3.3, Table and seating accessway length;

70-46.5

Section 1014.5, Egress balconies; Section 1014.5.1,
Wall separation; and Section 1014.5.2, Openings.

xlv.  In Section 1015, Exit and Exit Access Door-
ways, the following sections and table shall be deleted in
their entirety: Section 1015.1, Exit or exit access
doorways required, Table 1015.1, Spaces with One
Means of Egress; Section 1015.2, Exit or exit access
doorway arrangement; Section 1015.2.1, Two exits or
exit access doorways; Section 1015.2.2, Three or more
exits or exit access doorways; Section 1015.3, Boiler,
incinerator and furnace rooms; Section 1015.4, Refriger-
ation; Section 1015.5, Refrigerated rooms or spaces;
Section 1015.6, Stage means of egress; and Section
1015.6.1, Gallery, gridiron and catwalk means of egress.

xlvi. In Section 1016, Exit access travel distance,
the following sections shall be deleted in their entirety:
Section 1016.1, Travel distances limitation; Section
1016.2, Roof vent increase; and Section 1016.3, Exterior
egress balcony increase, Table 1016.1, Exit Access
Travel Distance.

xlvii. In Section 1017, Corridors, the following
sections shall be deleted in their entirety: Section 1017.1,
Construction; Section 1017.2, Corridor width; Section
1017.3, Dead ends; Table 1017.1, Corridor Fire Resis-
tance Rating; Section 1017.4, Air movement in corri-
dors; Section 1017.4.1, Corridor ceiling; and Section
1017.5, Corridor continuity.

xlviii. In Section 1018.1, General, the following text
shall be deleted, “General. Exits shall comply with
Sections 1018 through 1023 and the applicable require-
ments of Section 1003 through 1013.” The following
sections shall be deleted in their entirety: Section 1018.2,
Exterior exit doors; Section 1018.2.1, Detailed require-
ments; and Section 1018.2.2, Arrangement.

xlix. In Section 1019, Number of Exits and
Continuity, the following sections shall be deleted in
their entirety: Section 1019.1, Minimum number of
exits, Table 1019.1, Minimum number of exits for
occupant load; Section 1019.1, Parking structures;
Section 1019.1.2, Helistops; Section 1019.2, Buildings
with one exit; Table 1019.2, Buildings with one exit;
Section 1019.3, Exit continuity; and Section 1019.4, Exit
door arrangement.

I.  In Section 1020, Vertical Exit Enclosures, the
following sections shall be deleted in their entirety:
Section 1020.1.1, Openings and penetrations; Section
1020.1.2, Penetrations; Section 1020.1.3, Ventilation;
Section 1020.1.4, Exit enclosure exterior walls; Section
1020.1.5, Discharge identification barrier; Section
1020.1.6, Stairway floor number signs; Section 1020.1.7,
Smokeproof enclosures; Section 1020.1.7.1, Enclosure
exit; and Section 1020.1.7.2, Enclosure access.

li. In Section 1020.1, Enclosures required, all text
shall be deleted except for the last sentence “An exit

Supp. 8-18-08



5:70-3.2

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 8-18-08

enclosure shall not be used for any purpose other than
means of egress.”

lii. Section 1021, Exit Passageways, shall be deleted
in its entirety.

liii. Section 1022, Horizontal Exits, shall be deleted
in its entirety.

liv. Section 1023, Exterior Exit Ramps and
Stairways, shall be deleted in its entirety.

lv. Section 1024, Exit Discharge, shall be deleted in
its entirety.

Ivi. In Section 1025, Assembly, the following
sections shall be deleted in their entirety: Section 1025.1,
General; Section 1025.1.1, Bleachers; Section 1025.2,
Assembly main exit; Section 1025.3, Assembly other
exits; Section 1025.4, Foyers and lobbies; Section
1025.5, Interior balcony and gallery means of egress;
Section 1025.5.1, Enclosure of balcony openings;
Section 1025.6, Width of means of egress for assembly;
Section 1025.6.1, Without smoke protection; Section
1025.6.2, Smoke protected seating, Table 1025.6.2,
Width of aisles for smoke protected assembly; Section
1025.6.2.1, Smoke control; Section 1025.6.2.2, Roof
height; Section 1025.6.2.3, Automatic sprinklers;
Section 1025.6.3, Width of means of egress for outdoor
smoke protected assembly; Section 1025.7, Travel
distances; Section 1025.8, Common path of travel;
Section 1025.8.1, Path through adjacent row; Section
1025.9, Assembly aisles are required; Section 1025.9.1,
Minimum aisle width; Section 1025.9.2, Aisle width;
Section 1025.9.3, Converging aisles; Section 1025.9.4,
Uniform width; Section 1025.9.5, Assembly aisle
termination; Section 1025.9.6, Assembly aisle obstruc-
tions; Section 1025.10, Clear width of aisle accessways
serving seating; Section 1025.10.1, Dual access, Table
1025.10.1, Smoke protected assembly aisle accessways;
Section 1025.10.2, Single access; Section 1025.11,
Assembly aisle walking surfaces; Section 1025.11.1,
Treads; Section 1025.11.2, Risers; Section 1025.11.3,
Tread contrasting marking stripe; Section 1025.12, Seat
stability; Section 1025.13, Handrails; Section 1025.13.1,
Discontinuous handrails; Section 1025.13.2, Intermedi-
ate handrails; Section 1025.14, Assembly guards; Sec-
tion 1025.14.1, Cross aisles; Section 1025.14.2, Sight-
line constrained guard heights; Section 1025.14.3,
Guards at the end of aisles; and Section 1025.15, Bench
seating.

lvii. Section 1026, Emergency Escape and Rescue,
shall be deleted in its entirety.

lviii. In Section 1027, Means of Egress for Existing
Buildings, Section 1027.1, General, the following text
shall be deleted, “1027.1 General. Means of egress in
existing buildings shall comply with Sections 1003
through 1026, except as amended in Section 1027.
Exception.” The following sections shall be deleted in

70-46.6

their entirety: Section 1027.2, Elevators, escalators and
moving walks; Section 1027.3, Exit sign illumination;
Section 1027.4, Power source; Section 1027.5,
[llumination emergency power; Section 1027.6, Guards;
Section 1027.6.1, Height of guards; Section 1027.6.2,
Opening limitations; Section 1027.7, Size of doors;
Section 1027.8, Opening force for doors; Section
1027.9, Revolving doors, Table 1027.9, Revolving Door
Speeds; Section 1027.9.1, Egress component; Section
1027.10, Stair dimensions for existing stairs; Section
1027.10.1, Stair dimensions for replacement stairs;
Section 1027.11, Winders; Section 1027.12, Circular
stairways; Section 1027.13, Stairway handrails; Section
1027.13.1, Height; Section 1027.14, Slope of ramps;
Section 1027.15, Width of ramps; Section 1027.16, Fire
escape signs; Section 1027.16.1, Existing means of
egress; Section 1027.16.2, Protection of openings; Sec-
tion 1027.16.3, Dimensions; Section 1027.16.4, Access;
Section 1027.16.5, Materials and strength; Section
1027.16.6, Termination; Section 1027.16.7, Mainte-
nance; Section 1027.17, Corridors; Section 1027.17.1,
Corridor openings; Section 1027.17.2, Dead ends;
Section 1027.17.3, Exit access travel distance; Section
1027.17.4, Common path of egress travel; Section
1027.18, Stairway discharge identification; Section
1027.19, Exterior stairway protection, Table 1027.17.2,
Common path dead end and travel distance limits (by
occupancy); and Section 1027.20, Minimum aisles
width.

lix. In Section 1028, Maintenance of the Means of
Egress, In Section 1028.1, the following text shall be
deleted, “The means of egress for buildings or portions
thereof shall be maintained in accordance with this
section.” The following text shall be inserted, “An exit
shall not be utilized for any purpose that interferes with
its function as a means of egress, except as otherwise
approved. The means of egress from each part of the
structure, including exits, stairways, egress doors and
any panic hardware installed thereon, aisles, corridors,
passageways and similar elements of the means of
egress, shall at all times be maintained in a safe
condition and available for immediate utilization and
free of all obstructions. Security devices affecting means
of egress shall be subject to approval.”

Ix. New Section 1028.1.1, Storage, shall be inserted
as follows, “1028.1.1 Storage. Combustible or
flammable material shall not be placed, stored or kept in
any portion of an exit, elevator car or hoistway, or at the
bottom of a stairway, fire escape or other means of
escape, unless such space is enclosed and protected as
required by the construction code in effect at the time of
first occupancy. Such storage shall be located so the
presence or burning of the materials will not obstruct or
render hazardous the means of egress.”

Ixi. Section 1028.2, Reliability shall be renumbered
as Section 1028.3. Section 1028.3, Obstructions, shall be



UNIFORM FIRE CODE

5:70-3.2

renumbered as Section 1028.5. Section 1028.4, Exit
signs, shall be renumbered as Section 1028.7. Section
1028.5, Furnishings and Decorations, shall be renum-
bered as Section 1028.8. Section 1028.6, Emergency
escape openings, shall be renumbered as Section
1028.10. Section 1028.7, Testing and Maintenance, shall
be renumbered as Section 1028.11.

Ixii. New Section 1028.2 shall be inserted as follows,
“1028.2 Exit capacity. The capacity of exits serving a
floor shall be sufficient for the occupant load thereof as
determined by the construction code in effect at the time
of first occupancy or N.J.A.C. 5:70-4 et seq., as applica-
ble.”

Ixiii. New Section 1028.4 shall be inserted as follows,
“1028.4 Continued maintenance. All means of egress
devices and safeguards that are required by this chapter
or which were required by a previous statute or another
code when the structure was erected, altered or repaired,
shall be maintained in good working order.”

Ixiv. New Section 1028.6 shall be inserted as follows,
“1028.6 Exterior egress. All exit discharge, exterior
stairways and fire escapes shall be kept free of snow and
ice. Any fire escape or exterior stairway found to be in a
state of deterioration or determined to be unsafe by the
fire official shall be repaired immediately. Depending
upon the structural condition, a load test of any fire
escape shall be conducted before the escape is returned
to service in accordance with the N.J.A.C. 5:23, the
Uniform Construction Code.”

Ixv. New section 1028.9 shall be inserted as follows,
“1028.9 Display. Aisles, passageways or stairways in
any structure shall not be obstructed with tables,
showcases, holiday displays, vending machines or other
obstructions during hours when the structure is open to
the public, nor shall such obstructions be located in such
a manner as to interfere with firefighting access. Display
boards, signs, coat racks and any other movable
equipment that obstructs the path of egress travel shall
be prohibited. A mirror shall not be placed in or adjacent
to any means of egress in such a manner as to confuse
the direction of egress. Draperies and similar hangings
shall not obscure an exit.”

11. Chapter 11, Aviation Facilities, shall be amended as

follows:

i.  Section 1101.3, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

ii. In Section 1104.6, Open flame, “the International
Building Code” shall be deleted and “the building sub-
code of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be in-
serted.

iii. In Section 1106.3.4, Protection of electrical
equipment, in the second sentence, “the ICC Electrical

70-46.7

Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical subcode of the
Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

iv. In Section 1106.17, Fuel-transfer locations, in the
exception, “the International Building Code” shall be
deleted and “the building subcode of the Uniform Con-
struction Code” shall be inserted.

v. In Section 1107.1, General, in the second sen-
tence, “the International Building Code” shall be deleted
and “the building subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

vi. In Section 1107.4, Exits, “Section 412.5 of the
International Building Code” shall be deleted and
“Chapter 10” shall be inserted.

vii. Section 1107.5, Standpipe systems, shall be
deleted in its entirety.

viii. In Section 1107.6, Foam protection, in the
second sentence, “the applicable provisions of Sections
903, 904 and 905 shall be deleted and “the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

12. Chapter 12, Dry Cleaning, shall be amended as fol-

lows:

i.  Section 1201.2, Permit required, shall be deleted
in its entirety.

ii. In Section 1203.3, Design, “the International
Building Code” shall be deleted and “the building sub-
code of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be in-
serted.

iii. In Section 1204.2, Building services, “designed,
installed and” shall be deleted before “maintained.”

iv. In Section 1204.2.1, Ventilation, in the first
sentence, “provided” shall be deleted and “maintained”
shall be inserted. In addition, in the same sentence,
“Section 502 of the International Mechanical Code and
DOL 29 CFR Part 1910.1000” shall be deleted and “the
mechanical subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

v. In Section 1204.2.3, Electrical wiring and equip-
ment, “the ICC Electrical Code” shall be deleted and
“the electrical subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

vi. In Section 1205.3, Type IV and V systems, “the
International Mechanical Code” shall be deleted and
“the mechanical subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

vii. In Section 1207.1, General equipment require-
ments, in the second sentence, “the International
Building Code” shall be deleted and “the building
subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be
inserted.

Supp. 8-18-08



5:70-3.2

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

viii. In Section 1208.3, Automatic fire-extinguishing
systems, “in accordance with the Uniform Construction
Code, N.J.A.C. 5:23” shall be inserted after “installed.”
In addition, the exception shall be deleted in its entirety.

13. Chapter 13, Combustible Dust-Producing Opera-

tions, shall be amended as follows:

i.  Section 1301.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

ii. In Table 1304.1, Explosion protection standards,
“NFPA 68 Venting of Deflagrations” shall be inserted in
between “NFPA 61 Agricultural and Food Products” and
“NFPA 69 Explosion Prevention.” In addition, in the
same table, “ICC Electrical Code Electrical Installa-
tions” shall be deleted and “N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.16 The
electrical subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted. The table shall appear as follows:

TABLE 1304.1
EXPLOSION PROTECTION STANDARDS

STANDARD SUBJECT

NFPA 61 Agricultural and Food Products

NFPA 68 Venting of Deflagrations

NFPA 69 Explosion Prevention

NFPA 85 Boiler and Combustion System
Hazards

NFPA 120 Coal Preparation Plants
Combustible Metals, Metal

NFPA 484 Powders and Metal Dusts
Manufacturing, Processing and

NFPA 654 Handling of Combustible
Particulate Solids

NEPA 655 Prevenpon of Sulfur Fires and
Explosions
Prevention of Fires and

NFPA 664 Explosions in Wood Processing
and Woodworking Facilities

) -The electrical subcode of the
NJ.A.C.5:23-3.16 Uniform Construction Code

Supp. 8-18-08

14. Chapter 14, Fire Safety During Construction and

Demolition, shall be amended as follows:

i. In Section 1403.1, Listed, “the International
Mechanical Code or the International Fuel Gas Code”
shall be deleted and “the mechanical subcode of the
Uniform Construction Code or the fuel gas subcode of
the Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

ii. In Section 1403.3, LP-gas heaters, “the Inter-
national Fuel Gas Code” shall be deleted and “the fuel
gas subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be
inserted.

iii. In Section 1404.7, Electrical, “the ICC Electrical
Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical subcode of the
Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

70-46.8

iv. Section 1413.1, Where required, shall be deleted
in its entirety.

v. Section 1413.2, Buildings being demolished,
shall be deleted in its entirety.

vi. Section 1417.1, General, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

15. Chapter 15, Flammable Finishes, shall be amended

as follows:

i.  Section 1501.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

ii. In Section 1503.2.5, Grounding, in the first sen-
tence, “the ICC Electrical Code” shall be deleted and
“the electrical subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

iii. In Section 1504.2, Location of spray-finishing
operations, in the first sentence, “the International Build-
ing Code” shall be deleted and “the building subcode of
the Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

iv. In Section 1504.3, Design and construction,
“Sections 1504.3 through 1504.3.3.1” shall be deleted
and “the Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

v. In Section 1504.3.1, Spray rooms, “the Inter-
national Building Code” shall be deleted and “the build-
ing subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be
inserted.

vi. In Section 1504.3.2, Spray booths, “Sections
1504.3.2.1 through 1504.3.2.6, Sections 1504.4 through
1504.8” shall be deleted and “the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

vii. In Section 1504.3.2.4, Means of egress, “Chapter
10” shall be deleted and “the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

viii. In Section 1504.3.3, Spraying spaces, “the
International Building Code” shall be deleted and “the
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

ix. In Section 1504.6.1.2.2, Portable infrared ap-
paratus, in the first sentence, “the ICC Electrical Code”
shall be deleted and “the electrical subcode of the Uni-
form Construction Code” shall be inserted.

x. In Section 1504.7, Ventilation, “Section 510 of
the International Mechanical Code” shall be deleted and
“the mechanical subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

xi. In Section 1504.7.2, Recirculation, in Exception
1.5, “Section 510 of the International Mechanical Code”
shall be deleted and “the mechanical subcode of the Uni-
form Construction Code” shall be inserted.



\43/

UNIFORM FIRE CODE

5:70-3.2

xii. In Section 1504.7.6, Termination point, in the
first sentence, “not be less than the following distances:”
shall be deleted and “be in accordance with the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted. In addition, Item 1
and Item 2 shall be deleted in their entirety.

xiii. In Section 1504.9.4, Electrical wiring, “the ICC
Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical
subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be in-
serted.

xiv. In Section 1505.2, Location of dip-tank opera-
tions, “the International Building Code” shall be deleted
and “the building subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

xv. In Section 1509.3, Fire protection, the second
and third sentences shall be deleted in their entirety.

16. Chapter 16, Fruit and Crop Ripening, shall be

amended as follows:

i.  Section 1601.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

ii. New Section 1601.4, General, shall be inserted as
follows: “1601.4 General. The layout, arrangement and
construction of structures in which the process of ripen-
ing or coloring of crops is conducted shall comply with
the construction code in effect at the time of first occu-
pancy. Fire protection and fire protection systems shall
be provided in accordance with the construction code in
effect at the time of first occupancy. Structures and their
service equipment shall be maintained in a safe and
sound condition in accordance with this code.”

17. Chapter 17, Fumigation and Insecticidal Fogging,

shall be amended as follows:

i. In the title of Chapter 17, “Thermal” shall be
deleted.

ii. In Section 1701.1, Scope, “thermal” shall be de-
leted before “insecticidal.”

iii. Section 1701.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

iv. In Section 1702.1, Definitions, the term “thermal
insecticidal fogging” shall be revised to “insecticidal
fogging.” In addition, before “fog-generating,” in the
text of the definition, “thermal” shall be deleted.”

v. In Section 1703.2.1, Electricity, in the exception,
“the ICC Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “the
electrical subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

vi. In Section 1703.4, “Thermal” shall be deleted
from the title of the section shall be revised to “Insecti-
cidal fogging liquids.” In addition, in the first sentence,
“Thermal” shall be deleted before “insecticidal.”

70-46.9

18. Chapter 18, Semiconductor Fabrication Facilities,

shall be amended as follows:

i. In Section 1801.1, Scope, in the first sentence,
“the International Building Code” shall be deleted and
“the building subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted. In addition, in the second sen-
tence, “the International Building Code” shall be deleted
and “the construction code in effect at the time of con-
struction.” shall be inserted.

ii. Section 1801.4, Existing buildings and existing
fabrication areas, shall be deleted in its entirety.

iii. Section 1801.5, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

iv. In Section 1803.3.1, Fabrication areas, “the
International Building Code” shall be deleted and “the
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

\A In Section 1803.3.2, Pass-throughs in exit
access corridors, “the International Building Code” shall
be deleted and “the building subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

Vi. In Section 1803.3.3, Liquid storage rooms, “the
International Building Code” shall be deleted and “the
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

vii.  In Section 1803.3.4, HPM rooms, “the Inter-
national Building Code” shall be deleted and “the build-
ing subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be
inserted.

viii. In Section 1803.3.8, Service corridors, “the
International Building Code” shall be deleted and “the
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

iX. In Section 1803.7.1, Fabrication areas, “the
ICC Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical
subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be in-
serted.

X. In Section 1803.7.2, Workstations, “the ICC
Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical
subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be
inserted.

Xi. In Section 1803.7.3, Hazardous production
material (HPM) rooms, gas rooms and liquid storage
rooms, “the ICC Electrical Code” shall be deleted and
“the electrical subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

xii.  Section 1803.10.1.1, Combustible worksta-
tions, shall be deleted in its entirety.

xiii.  Section 1803.10.1.2, Combustible tools, shall
be deleted in its entirety.

Supp. 8-18-08



5:70-3.2

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 8-18-08

xiv. In Section 1803.10.4, Exhaust ducts for HPM,
“the International Mechanical Code” shall be deleted
and “the mechanical subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xv.  Section 1803.10.4.4, Exhaust duct sprinkler
system requirements, shall be deleted in its entirety.

xvi. Section 1803.10.4.4.1, Sprinkler head loca-
tions, shall be deleted in its entirety.

xvii. In Section 1803.14, Exhaust ventilation sys-
tems for HPM, “the International Building Code and the
International Mechanical Code” shall be deleted and
“the building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code
and the mechanical subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xviii. In Section 1803.15.1, Required electrical sys-
tems, in Item 11, “the International Building Code” shall
be deleted and “the building subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xix. In Section 1805.2.2.1, Protection of vessels, in
the second sentence, “the International Building Code”
shall be deleted and “construction code in effect at the
time of construction” shall be inserted.

XX. In Section 1805.2.3.2, Protection of vessels, in
Item 2, “the International Building Code” shall be
deleted and “the construction code in effect at the time
of construction” shall be inserted.

xxi.  In Section 1805.3.1, Exit corridors access and
exit enclosures, “Section 415.8.6.3 of the International
Building Code” shall be deleted and “the construction
code in effect at the time of construction” shall be in-
serted.

xxii. In Section 1805.3.2, Transport in existing
access corridors, in the first sentence, “the International
Building Code” shall be deleted and “the construction
code in effect at the time of construction” shall be in-
serted.

xxiii. In Section 1805.3.3, Service corridors, the text
of the section shall be deleted and the following shall be
inserted: “Where service corridors are provided, the
transport of HPM from a liquid storage room, HPM
room, gas room or from the outside of a building to the
perimeter wall of a fabrication area shall be restricted to
service corridors.”

19. Chapter 19, Lumber Yards and Woodworking Sur-

faces, shall be amended as follows:

i.  In Section 1901.1, Scope, after “chapter,” “and
NFPA 230” shall be inserted.

ii. Section 1901.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

70-46.10

ili. In Section 1903.1, Open yards, in the first sen-
tence, “the International Building Code” shall be deleted
and “the construction code in effect at the time of con-
struction” shall be inserted. In addition, the following
shall be inserted as the second sentence: “Weeds shall be
kept down throughout the entire yard.”

iv. In Section 1903.3, Waste removal, in the second
sentence, “the International Mechanical Code” shall be
deleted and “the mechanical subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

v. In Section 1903.4, Electrical equipment, “the
ICC Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical
subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be
inserted.

vi. In Section 1904.3, Automatic sprinkler systems,
“installed” shall be deleted and “maintained” shall be
inserted. In addition, “in accordance with Section
903.3.1.1” shall be deleted and “in accordance with
Chapter 9” shall be inserted.

20. Chapter 20, Manufacture of Organic Coatings, shall

be amended as follows:

i.  Section 2001.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

ii. In Section 2003.4, Fire protection systems, “in-
stalled,” shall be deleted.

ifi. New Section 2003.10.1 shall be inserted as
follows: “2003.10.1 Emergency drainage systems con-
taining flammable and combustible liquid that are con-
nected to a public discharge into a public waterway shall
be prohibited without the express approval of the New
Jersey Department of Environment Protection.”

iv. Section 2003.11, Alarm systems, shall be deleted
in its entirety.

v. In Section 2004.1, Wiring and equipment, “the
ICC Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical
subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be
inserted.

vi. In Section 2005.1, Design, “the International
Building Code” shall be deleted and “the building sub-
code of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be in-
serted.

vii. In Section 2009.2, Tank storage, “the Interna-
tional Building Code” shall be deleted and “the con-
struction code in effect at the time of construction” shall
be inserted.

viii. In Section 2009.4, Nitrocellulose storage, “the
International Building Code” shall be deleted and “the
construction code in effect at the time of construction”
shall be inserted.



UNIFORM FIRE CODE

5:70-3.2

ix. In Section 2009.6, Finished products, “the
International Building Code” shall be deleted and “con-
struction code in effect at the time of construction” shall
be inserted.

21. Chapter 21, Industrial Ovens, shall be amended as

follows:

i.  In Section 2101.1, Scope, “the International Fuel
Gas Code, International Mechanical Code” shall be
deleted and “the construction code in effect at the time
of construction” shall be inserted.

ii. Section 2101.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

iii. Section 2103.1, Ventilation, shall be deleted in
its entirety.

iv. In Section 2104.1, Fuel-gas piping, “the Inter-
national Fuel Gas Code” shall be deleted and “the fuel
gas subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be
inserted.

22. Chapter 22, Motor Fuel-Dispensing Facilities and

Repair Garages, shall be amended as follows:

i. In Section 2201.1, Scope, “the International
Building Code, International Fuel Gas Code and the
International Mechanical Code” shall be deleted and
“the construction code in effect at the time of con-
struction” shall be inserted.

ii.  Section 2201.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

iii. Section 2201.3, Construction documents, shall be
deleted in its entirety.

iv. In Section 2201.4, Indoor motor fuel-dispensing
facilities, “the International Building Code” shall be
deleted and “the construction code in effect at the time
of construction” shall be inserted.

v. In Section 2201.5, Electrical, “the ICC Electrical
Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical subcode of the
Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

vi. In Section 2201.6, Heat-producing appliances,

“the International Fuel Gas Code or the International-

Mechanical Code” shall be deleted and “the fuel gas
subcode of the Uniform Construction Code or the me-
chanical subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

vii. Section 2203.1, Location of dispensing devices,
shall be deleted in its entirety.

viii. In Section 2203.2, Emergency disconnect
switches, the second and third sentences shall be deleted
following “other emergency.”

70-46.11

ix. Section 2204.2, Attended self-service motor fuel-
dispensing facilities, through Section 2204.2.5, Com-
munications, shall be deleted in their entirety.

X. New Section 2204.4.2, Portable containers, shall
be inserted as follows: “2204.4.2 Portable containers:
Portable containers intended to hold 10 gallons or less
and to be used for gasoline or other flammable liquid
shall be red in color. The name of the flammable liquid
shall be prominently displayed on the container in bold
letters of a contrasting color. The containers shall be of
metal or approved plastic with a spring-loaded or screw
cap. Containers for kerosene shall be blue.”

xi. New Section 2204.4.2.1 shall be inserted as
follows: “Whenever flammable liquids or kerosene are
dispensed into or offered for sale in containers, there
shall be a prominent sign located in a conspicuous loca-
tion indicating the required color and construction of this
container for each product sold. The sign shall not be
less than 12 inches in the least dimension.”

Xii. In Section 2205.4, Sources of ignition, in the
second sentence, “the ICC Electrical Code” shall be de-
leted and “the electrical subcode of the Uniform Con-
struction Code” shall be inserted.

xiii.  In Section 2205.5, Fire extinguishers, “75 feet
(22 860 mm)” shall be deleted and “30 feet” shall be in-
serted.

xiv.  Section 2206.2.2, Above-ground tanks located
inside buildings, shall be deleted in its entirety.

XV. In Section 2206.2.3, Above-ground tanks lo-
cated outside above grade, the text following “fuels
except” shall be deleted and the text from number 4 shall
be retained: “tanks located at farms, construction proj-
ects, or rural areas shall comply with Section 3406.2.”

xvi.  Section 2206.2.4, Above-ground tanks located
in above grade vaults or below grade vaults, shall be de-
leted in its entirety.

xvil.  Section 2206.2.6, Special enclosures, shall be
deleted in its entirety.

xviil. Section 2206.6, Piping, valves, fittings and
ancillary equipment for use with flammable or combusti-
ble liquids, shall be deleted in its entirety.

xix.  In Section 2206.7.3, Mounting of dispensers,
in the first sentence, “by mounting on a concrete island 6
inches (152 mm) or more in height, or shall be
protected” shall be deleted.

XX. Section 2206.7.7.2, Location, shall be deleted
in its entirety.

xxi.  Section 2206.7.9, Vapor recovery and vapor
processing systems, through Section 2206.7.9.1.3,
Piping, shall be deleted in their entirety.

Supp. 8-18-08



5:70-3.2

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 8-18-08

xxii.  Section 2206.7.9.2, Vapor processing systems,
through Section 2206.7.9.2.4, Piping, shall be deleted in
their entirety.

xxiii. The following new sections shall be added
after Section 2206.7.9.2:

“2206.8 Filling and discharging. The driver, opera-
tor or attendant of any tank vehicle shall not remain in
the vehicle cab and shall not leave the vehicle while
the vehicle is being filled or discharged. The delivery
hose, when attached to a tank vehicle, shall be con-
sidered a part of the tank vehicle. When making or
breaking hose connections, the motors of tank trucks
or tractors shall be shut down. If loading or unloading
is performed without a power pump, the tank truck or
tractor motor shall be shut down throughout such
operations.”

“2206.8.1 Hose connections. Delivery of flammable
liquids to underground tanks of more than 1,000
gallons (3785 L) in capacity shall be made by means
of vapor-tight connections between the hose and fill
pipe. Where underground tanks are equipped with any
type of vapor recovery system, all connections re-
quired to be made for the safe and proper functioning
of the particular vapor recovery process shall be
made. Such connections shall be made liquid and
vapor tight and remain connected throughout the un-
loading process. Vapors shall not be discharged at
grade level during delivery.”

“2206.8.2 Hose protection. Upon arrival at a point
of delivery and prior to discharging any flammable or
combustible liquids into underground tanks, the
driver, operator or attendant of the tank vehicle shall
ensure that all hoses utilized for liquid delivery and
vapor recovery, where required, will be protected
from physical damage by motor vehicles. Such
protection shall be by positioning the tank vehicle to
prevent motor vehicles from passing through the area
or areas occupied by hoses, or consist of portable
traffic-warning devices, such as traffic cones.”

xxiv. Section 2207.4, Location of dispensing op-
erations and equipment, shall be deleted in its entirety.

xxv.  Section 2207.5, Installation of LP-gas dispens-
ing devices and equipment, through Section 2207.5.1,
Valves, shall be deleted in their entirety.

xxvi. Section 2208.3, Location of dispensing oper-
ations and equipments, shall be deleted in its entirety.

xxvii. In Section 2210.1, General, in the first sen-
tence, “the International Building Code” shall be deleted
and “the construction code in effect at the time of
construction” shall be inserted.

xxviii. In  Section 2210.2.3, Heating equipment,
“comply with Section 2201.6” shall be deleted and “be

70-46.12

maintained in accordance with the code under which the
equipment was installed” shall be inserted.

xxix. In Section 2211.1, General, in the first sen-
tence, “the International Building Code” shall be deleted
and “the construction code in effect at the time of
construction” shall be inserted.

xxxX. In Section 2211.3.1, Equipment, “International
Building Code, the International Mechanical Code and
the ICC Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “building,
mechanical and electrical subcodes of the Uniform Con-
struction Code” shall be inserted.

xxxi. In Section 2211.4.1, Construction, “con-
structed” shall be deleted and “maintained” shall be
inserted. In addition, “the International Building Code”
shall be deleted and “the construction code in effect at
the time of construction” shall be inserted.

xxxii. In Section 2211.4.3, Ventilation, “the Inter-
national Mechanical Code” shall be deleted and “the
construction code in effect at the time of construction”
shall be inserted.

xxxiii. In Section 2211.7.1, Ventilation, in the sec-
ond sentence, “the International Mechanical Code” shall
be deleted and “the construction code in effect at the
time of construction” shall be inserted.

xxxiv. Section 2211.8.1.2.2, Construction docu-
ments, shall be deleted in its entirety.

xxxv. In Section 2211.8.1.2.3, Stability of cylinders,
in the last sentence, “the International Building Code”
shall be deleted and “the building subcode of the
Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xxxvi. In Section 2211.8.1.2.4, Grounding and bond-
ing, “the ICC Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “the
electrical subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

23. Chapter 23, High-Piled Combustible Storage, shall

be amended as follows:

i.  Section 2301.2, Permits, shall deleted in its
entirety.

ii. In Section 2301.3, Construction documents, the
first and second sentences shall be deleted. In addition,
in the third sentence, “Following approval of the plans,
a” shall be deleted. The sentence shall begin with “A.”

iii. Section 2306 General Fire Protection and Life
Safety Features, shall be deleted in its entirety.

iv. Section 2307, Solid Piled and Shelf Storage,
shall be deleted in its entirety.

v. Section 2308, Rack Storage, shall be deleted in
its entirety. In addition, Table 2308.3, Required Flue
Spaces for Rack Storage, shall be deleted in its entirety.

)



UNIFORM FIRE CODE

5:70-3.2

vi. Section 2309, Automated Storage, shall be
deleted in its entirety.

vii. Section 2310, Specialty Storage, shall be deleted
in its entirety.

24. Chapter 24, Tents, Canopies and Other Membrane
Structures, shall be amended as follows:

i. In Section 2402, Definitions, the definition of
“membrane structure” shall be modified as follows: In
the first sentence, “as defined by the International
Building Code and” shall be deleted. In addition, the
second sentence of the definition shall be deleted in its
entirety. In the definition of “tent,” *, with sidewalls or
drops on more than 25 percent of the perimeter” shall be
inserted after “protects.”

ii. In Section 2403.2, Approval required, the first
sentence and the exceptions shall be deleted in their
entirety and the following shall be inserted: “Tents, ten-
sioned membrane structures, and canopies meeting the
following criteria shall be subject to the permitting re-
quirements of N.J.A.C. 5:70-2.7. Tents and tensioned
membrane structures that do not meet these criteria in
(1) through (5) require a construction permit pursuant to
the Uniform Construction Code.

(1) The tent, tensioned membrane structure, or
canopy is less than 140 feet in any dimension and less
than 16,800 square feet in area whether it is one unit
or is composed of multiple units. For the purposes of
applying this, tents that are more than five feet apart,
regardless of whether they are connected by a walk-
way, shall be counted as separate tents. If tents are
closer than five feet, the tents shall be counted as the
same tent;

(2) The tent, tensioned membrane structure, or
canopy remains in place or will remain in place for
fewer than 180 days;

(3) The tent, tensioned membrane structure, or
canopy is used or occupied only between April 1 and
November 30;

(4) The tent, tensioned membrane structure, or
canopy does not have a permanent anchoring system
or foundation. A construction permit shall be required
for the original installation of a permanent anchoring
system foundation. In addition, a construction permit
shall be required each time a tent is erected on a
portable anchoring system; and

(5) The tent, tensioned membrane structure, or
canopy does not contain platforms or bleachers
greater than 11 feet in height.”

iii. Section 2403.3, Place of assembly, shall be de-
leted in its entirety.

70-46.13

iv. Section 2403.4, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

v.  Section 2403.5, Use period, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

vi. In Section 2403.6, Construction documents, the
following shall be inserted as the last sentence: “A con-
struction permit shall be obtained for heating, ventila-
tion, or electrical equipment that requires a construction
permit pursuant to the Uniform Construction Code.”

vii. In Section 2403.8.2, Location, in the first sen-
tence, “20 feet (6069 mm)” shall be deleted and “5 feet”
shall be inserted. The second sentence shall be deleted in
its entirety. In addition, in Exception 1, “15,000 square
feet (1394 m?)” shall be deleted and “16,800 square feet”
shall be inserted. Finally, Exception 2 shall be deleted in
its entirety.

viii. Section 2403.8.3, Location of structures in
excess of 15,000 square feet in area, shall be deleted in
its entirety.

ix. In Section 2403.8.4, Connecting corridors, the
last sentence shall be deleted and the following shall be
inserted: “Corridors connecting tents that are at least five
feet in length or greater shall have openings on each side
of the corridor that are opposite each other and that are
equal to width of the required means of egress in
accordance with Section 2403.12.

X. Section 2403.8.5, Fire break, shall be deleted in
its entirety.

xi.  Section 2403.10 to 2403.10.4, Temporary air
supported and air inflated membrane structures, shall be
deleted in its entirety.

xii. In Table 2403.12.2, Minimum Number of
Means of Egress and Means of Egress Widths from
Temporary Membrane Structures, Tents and Canopies,
Note a shall be deleted in its entirety.

xiii. In Section 2403.12.6.1, Exit sign illumination,
in the second sentence of Item 2, “the ICC Electrical
Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical subcode of the
Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xiv. In Section 2403.12.8, Maintenance of means of
egress, in the second sentence, “8 feet (2438 mm)” shall
be deleted and “7 feet” shall be inserted.

xv. In Section 2404.1, General, “the International
Building Code” shall be deleted and “the building
subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be in-
serted.

xvi. In Section 2404.7, Open or exposed flame, a
new exception shall be inserted as follows: “Exception:
Cooking tents as per Section 2404.15.1.”

Supp. 8-18-08



5:70-3.2

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 8-18-08

xvii. Section 2404.11, Clearance, shall be deleted in
its entirety.

xviii. In Section 2404.15.1, Installation, “the Inter-
national Mechanical Code and the International Fuel Gas
Code” shall be deleted and the mechanical subcode of
the Uniform Construction Code and the fuel gas subcode
of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xix. In Section 2404.15.2, Venting, in the first sen-
tence, “the International Fuel Gas Code and the Inter-
national Mechanical Code” shall be deleted and “the fuel
gas subcode of the Uniform Construction Code and the
mechanical subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

xX. In Section 2404.15.3, Location, the first sen-
tence shall be deleted in its entirety and the following
shall be inserted: “Suitable barricades shall be provided
to maintain a distance of 5 feet between the heat
producing appliances and the public.”

xxi. In Section 2404.15.5, Cooking tents, in the first
sentence, “20 feet (6096 mm)” shall be deleted and “5
feet” shall be inserted. In addition, the following excep-
tions shall be inserted: “Exceptions:

1. Cooking tents are not required to be separated
from other cooking tents.

2. Cooking tents shall be separated from other
tents, canopies or membrane structures with an oc-
cupant load of 50 or greater by a minimum of 20 feet
(6096 mm).”

xxii.  Section 2404.15.6, Outdoor cooking, shall be
deleted in its entirety.

xxiii. In Section 2404.15.7, Electrical heating and
cooking equipment, “the ICC Electrical Code” shall be
deleted and “the electrical subcode of the Uniform Con-
struction Code” shall be inserted.

xxiv. In Section 2404.16.2, Location of containers,
in the first sentence, “or on the exterior perimeter of a
canopy” shall be inserted after “outside.”

xxv. Section 2404.16.2.1, “Containers 500 gallons
or less, The following text shall be deleted “500 gallons
or less. Portable LP gas containers with a capacity of
500 gallons (1893 L) or less shall have a minimum sep-
aration between the container and structure not less than
10 feet (3048 mm).” The following text shall be inserted
after “Containers,” “LP-gas containers shall be located a
minimum of 5 feet from any heat producing appliance.”

xxvi. Section 2404.16.2.2 shall be deleted.

xxvii. In Section 2404.21, Vegetation removal, “30
feet (9144 mm)” shall be deleted and “20 feet” shall be
inserted.

70-46.14

xxviii. In Section 2404.22, Waste material, in the first
sentence, “30 foot (9144 mm)” shall be deleted and “20
foot” shall be inserted.

25. Chapter 25, Tire Rebuilding and Tire Storage, shall

be amended as follows:

i.  Section 2501.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

ii. In Section 2503.1, Construction, “the Interna-
tional Building Code” shall be deleted and “the construc-
tion code in effect at the time of construction” shall be
inserted.

26. Chapter 26, Welding and Other Hot Work, shall be

amended as follows:

i.  Section 2601.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

ii. In Section 2602, Definitions, the definition of
“hot work permits” shall be deleted in its entirety. In the
definition of “hot work program,” in the first sentence,
“permitted” shall be deleted before “program,” “and
issue permits for” shall be deleted before “hot work,”
and “or” shall be deleted after “personnel.” In addition,
in the definition of “responsible person,” in the second
sentence, “permits” shall be deleted and “approvals”
shall be inserted and “permit” shall be deleted before
“program.”

iii. In Section 2603.1, General, “and NFPA 51B”
shall be inserted at the end of the sentence after “chap-
ter.”

iv. In the title of Section 2603.3, “permit” shall be
deleted. In addition, the text of the definition shall be
deleted and the following shall be inserted: “Hot work
approvals issued by a responsible person under a hot
work program shall be available for review by the fire
official at the time the work is conducted and for 48
hours after the work is complete.”

v. In Section 2603.4, Qualifications of operators, in
the first sentence, “A permit” shall be deleted. The
sentence shall begin with “Approval.”

vi. In Section 2604.3, Area reviews, at the end of the
second sentence, “in accordance with Section 105.6”
shall be deleted.

vii. In Section 2606.4, Emergency disconnect, in the
second sentence, “the ICC Electrical Code” shall be de-
leted and “the electrical subcode of the Uniform Con-
struction Code” shall be inserted.

27. Chapter 27, Hazardous Materials—General Provi-

sions, shall be amended as follows:

i.  Section 2701.1.1, Waiver, shall be deleted in its
entirety.



N

UNIFORM FIRE CODE

5:70-3.2

ii. In Section 2701.2.2.2, Health hazards, new Item
3 shall be inserted as follows: “3. Radioactive
materials.”

ili. In Section 2701.5, Permits, “Sections 105.6 and
105.7” shall be deleted and “Subchapter 2 of the
Uniform Fire Code” shall be inserted.

iv. In Section 2701.5.1, Hazardous Materials Man-
agement Plan, in the first sentence, “or life hazard use
registration” shall be inserted after “permit.”

v. In Section 2701.5.2, Hazardous Materials Inven-
tory Statement (HMIS), in the first sentence, “or life
hazard use registration” shall be inserted after “permit.”

vi. In Section 2701.6.2, Permanently out-of-service
facilities, in the first sentence, “required” shall be in-
serted before “permit” and “or life hazard use registra-
tion” shall be inserted after “permit.” In addition, in the
second sentence, “and life hazard use facilities” shall be
inserted after “permittees.”

vii. In Section 2702, Definitions, a definition for
“radioactive material” shall be inserted as follows:
“Radioactive Material. Any material or combination of
materials that spontaneously emit ionizing radiation.”

viii. In Table 2703.1.1(2), Maximum Allowable
Quantity per Control Area of Hazardous Materials
Posing a Health Hazard™®, and Table 2703.1.1(4),
Maximum Allowable Quantity per Control Area of
Hazardous Materials Posing a Health Hazard in an
Outdoor Control Area®™’, the following text shall be
inserted as the fourth row of table 2703.1.1(2) under
“Material,” “Storaged,” “Use-Closed Systemsd,” and
Use-Open Systems™ Add footnote “k. Maximum dosage
allowed in any single whole-body short term (1 hour or
less) exposure.” the following text shall be inserted as
the fourth row of table 2703.1.1(4) under “Material,”
“Storage,” “Use-Closed Systems,” and Use-Open
Systems” Add footnote “h. Maximum dosage allowed in
any single whole-body short term (1 hour or less)
exposure.”

TABLE 2703.1.1(2)

MATERIAL STORAGE SYSTEM* USE-CLOSED SYSTEM* USE-OPEN SYSTEM!
“Radioactive® 25 REM unsealed source 100 REM sealed source 25 REM sealed source
100 REM sealed source

k. Maximum dosage allowed in any single whole body short term (1 hour or less) exposure.”

TABLE 2703.1.1(4)

MATERIAL STORAGE SYSTEM USE-CLOSED SYSTEM USE-OPEN SYSTEM
“Radioactive” 25 REM unsealed source 100 REM sealed source 25 REM sealed source
100 REM sealed source

h. Maximum dosage allowed in any single whole body short term (1 hour or less) exposure.”

ix.  In Section 2703.2.8, Seismic protection, “the xii.

In Section 2703.8.3.2, Percentage of maximum

International Building Code” shall be deleted and “the
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

X. In Section 2703.8.1, Buildings, in the first
sentence, “maintained as” shall be inserted before “con-
structed.” In addition, “International Building Code”
shall be deleted and “building subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

Xi. In Section 2703.8.3.1, Construction require-
ments, “maintained as” shall be inserted before “sepa-
rated.” In the same section, “Section 706 of the Inter-
national Building Code” shall be deleted and “the
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted. In addition, “Section 711 of the In-
ternational Building Code” shall be deleted and “the
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

70-46.15

allowable quantities, “Table 2703.8.3.2” shall be deleted
and “the Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xiii. In Section 2703.8.3.3, Number, “Table
2703.8.3.2” shall be deleted and “the Uniform Con-
struction Code” shall be inserted.

xiv. In Section 2703.8.3.4, Fire-resistance rating
requirements, in the first sentence, “Table 2703.8.3.2”
shall be deleted and “the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted. In addition, the second sentence and
the exception shall be deleted in their entirety.

xv. In Section 2703.8.4.1, Construction, in the
second sentence, “the International Building Code based
on the occupancy group into which it has been
classified” shall be deleted and “building subcode of the
Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xvi. In Section 2703.8.4.2, Ventilation system, in
the second sentence, “the International Mechanical

Supp. 8-18-08



5:70-3.2

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 8-18-08

Code” shall be deleted and “the mechanical subcode of
the Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xvii. In Section 2703.8.5.2, Ventilation, in the third
sentence, “the International Mechanical Code” shall be
deleted and “the mechanical subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xviii. In Section 2703.8.6.2, Ventilation, in the third
sentence, “the International Mechanical Code” shall be
deleted and “the mechanical subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xix. In Section 2703.9.4, Electrical wiring and
equipment, “the ICC Electrical Code” shall be deleted
and “the electrical subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

xx. In Section 2703.9.5, Static accumulation, after
“charge,” “in accordance with NFPA 77” shall be in-
serted at the end of the sentence.

xxi.  In Section 2703.9.9, Shelf storage, in the first
sentence, “the International Building Code” shall be
deleted and “the building subcode of the Uniform Con-
struction Code” shall be inserted.

xxii. In Section 2704.3.1, System requirements, the
text shall be deleted in its entirety and the following text
shall be inserted: “Exhaust ventilation systems installa-
tion shall be in accordance with the Uniform Construc-
tion Code.”

xxiii. In Section 2704.5, Automatic sprinkler
systems, in the first sentence, “Section 903.3.1.1” shall
be deleted and “the fire subcode of the Uniform Con-
struction Code” shall be inserted. In addition, the second
and third sentences shall be deleted in their entirety.

xxiv. In Section 2705.1.5, Standby or emergency
power, “the ICC Electrical Code and Section 604” shall
be deleted and “the electrical subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xxv. In Section 2705.2, Indoor dispensing and use,
“the International Building Code” shall be deleted and
“the building subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

xxvi. New Section 2706, Hazardous Material Tank
Vehicles, shall be inserted as follows: “Section 2706
Hazardous Material Tank Vehicles

2706.1 Vehicle transportation. The provisions of
this subsection apply to vehicles for transportation of
hazardous materials.

2706.2 Operation. Vehicles shall be operated as fol-
lows:

1. Vehicles shall not be parked or left un-
attended on any street, highway, avenue or alley,
provided that this shall not prevent a driver from

70-46.16

the necessary absence from the vehicle in connec-
tion with the delivery of the load, except that during
actual discharge of the load some responsible
person shall be present at the vehicle, nor shall it
prevent stops for meals during the day or night if
the street is well lighted at point of parking. Ve-
hicles shall not be parked out of doors at any one
point for longer than one hour except at flammable
liquid bulk terminals, bulk plants and other loca-
tions approved by the fire official.

2. Vehicles shall not be parked or garaged in
any building or structure other than those specifi-
cally approved for such use in accordance with the
construction code in effect at the time of first occu-

pancy.

2706.3 Loading and discharging. The driver, opera-
tor or attendant of any vehicle shall not leave the
vehicle while it is being filled or discharged. Delivery
hose, when attached to a tank vehicle, shall be consid-
ered to be a part of the tank vehicle. When making or
breaking hose connections, the motors of tank trucks
or tractors shall be shut down. If loading or unloading
is done without the use of a power pump, the tank
truck or tractor motor shall be shut down throughout
such operations.”

xxvii. New Section 2707, Radioactive Materials,
shall be inserted as follows: “Section 2707 Radioactive
Materials

2707.1 Scope. Unless preempted by the require-
ments of any federal, state or local agency, this chap-
ter shall apply to the storage of radioactive materials,
except that this chapter shall not apply to units gener-
ating induced radioactivity, such as X-ray machines
and accelerators capable of immediate shut down.
Radioactive materials shall be used, stored and
handled in an approved manner minimizing the per-
sonnel hazards and property damage by radioactive
contamination resulting from fires and explosions.

2707.2 Maximum amounts. The maximum amount
of radioactive material stored in one control area shall
either be 25 rem whole-body short-term (1 hour or
less) radiation dose from an unsealed source or 100
rem whole-body short-term (1 hour or less) radiation
dose from a sealed source.

2707.3. Definitions. The following words and terms
shall, for the purposes of this chapter and as stated
elsewhere in this code, have the meanings shown
herein.

Radioactive material: Any material or combina-
tion of materials that spontaneously emits ionizing
radiation.

Sealed source: A quantity of radiation enclosed
to prevent the escape of any radioactive material,



UNIFORM FIRE CODE

5:70-3.2

but at the same time permitting radiation to come
out for use.

2707.4 Maintenance. All storage areas of radio-
active materials in any quantity shall comply with
Sections 2707.4.1 through 2707.6.

2707.4.1 Signs. Durable and clearly visible signs
warning of radiation dangers shall be provided at all
entrances to areas or rooms where radioactive mate-
rials are used or stored. Additionally, each container
in which radioactive materials are used, stored or
transported shall bear the three-bladed radiation sym-
bol in magenta or purple on a yellow background.

2707.4.1.1 Signs not required. Signs are not re-
quired for storage of manufactured articles other than
liquids, such as instruments, clock dials, electronic
tubes or apparatus in which radioactive materials are a
component part, and luminous compounds, where
securely packed in strong containers, provided the
gamma radiation at any surface of the package is less
than 10 milliroentgen in 24 hours.

2707.5 Containers. When not in use, radioactive
materials shall be kept in adequately shielded fire
resistant containers designed such that the gamma
radiation will not exceed 200 milliroentgen per hour
or equivalent at any point on the container surface to
which ready access is provided.

2707.6 Outside storage. Outside storage of radio-
active materials shall not be permitted within 25 feet
(7620 mm) of an interior lot line, public way, exit
discharge or exterior wall opening. The separation
distance shall not apply where a 2-hour fire separation
wall extending not less than 30 inches (762 mm)
above and to the sides of the storage area is provided.”

28. Chapter 28, Aerosols, shall be amended as follows:

i. In Section 2801.1, Scope, “the International
Building Code” shall be deleted and “the construction
code in effect at the time of construction” shall be in-
serted.

ii. Section 2801.2, Permit required, shall be deleted
in its entirety.

iii. In Section 2806.5.1, Fire protection, “Table 7.4.1
and Figure 7.4.1 of NFPA 30B” shall be deleted and “the
construction code in effect at time of construction” shall
be inserted.

29. Chapter 29, Combustible Fibers, shall be amended

as follows:

i.  Section 2901.3, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

ii. In Section 2903.5, Dust collection, “Chapter 13
and Section 511 of the International Mechanical Code”

70-46.17

shall be deleted and “the mechanical subcode of the
Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

iii. In Section 2904.3, Storage of more than 100
cubic feet to 500 cubic feet, “the International Building
Code” shall be deleted and “the building subcode of the
Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

iv. In Section 2904.4, Storage of more than 500
cubic feet to 1,000 cubic feet, “the International Building
Code” shall be deleted and “the building subcode of the
Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

v. In Section 2904.5, Storage of more than 1,000
cubic feet, in the first sentence, “the International Build-
ing Code” shall be deleted and “the building subcode of
the Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

30. Chapter 30, Compressed Gases, shall be amended as

follows:

i.  In Section 3001.1, Scope, in the fifth paragraph,
“the International Fuel Gas Code” shall be deleted and
“the fuel gas subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

ii.  Section 3001.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

iii. In Section 3003.7.6, Heating, in the second
sentence, “the International Mechanical Code and ICC
Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “the mechanical
and the electrical subcodes of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

iv. In Section 3003.8, Wiring and equipment, in the
first sentence, “the ICC Electrical Code” shall be deleted
and “the electrical subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

v. In Section 3003.16.1, Listing required, in the ex-
ception, “the International Building Code” and “Section
1707 of the International Building Code” shall be
deleted and “the building subcode of the Uniform Con-
struction Code” shall be inserted.

vi. In Section 3003.16.2, Design and construction, in
the fourth sentence of the second paragraph, “the Inter-
national Building Code” shall be deleted and “the build-
ing subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be
inserted.

vii. In Section 3003.16.9, Ventilation, in the seventh
sentence, “the International Mechanical Code” shall be
deleted and “the mechanical subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

viii. In Section 3003.16.11, Liquid removal, “the ICC
Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical sub-
code of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be in-
serted.

Supp. 8-18-08



5:70-3.2

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 8-18-08

ix. In Section 3003.16.14, Classified area, “the ICC
Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical sub-
code of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be in-
serted.

X. In Section 3005.5, Venting, in the second sen-
tence, “the International Mechanical Code” shall be de-
leted and “the mechanical subcode of the Uniform Con-
struction Code” shall be inserted.

xi. In Section 3006.2.2, One-hour interior room, in
the fourth sentence, “the International Mechanical Code
and be provided at a minimum rate of 1 cubic foot per
minute per square foot [0.00508 m®/(s » m?)] of the area
of the room” shall be deleted and “the mechanical sub-
code of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be in-
serted.

31. Chapter 31, Corrosive Materials, shall be amended

as follows:

i.  Section 3101.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

32. Chapter 32, Cryogenic Fluids, shall be amended as

follows:

i.  Section 3201.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

ii. In Section 3203.1.2, Concrete containers, the first
sentence shall be deleted in its entirety.

iii. In Section 3203.5.2, Securing of containers, in
the first sentence, “the International Building Code”
shall be deleted and “the building subcode of the
Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

iv. In Section 3203.7, Electrical wiring and equip-
ment, “the ICC Electrical Code” shall be deleted and
“the electrical subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

v. In Section 3203.7.2, Electrical grounding and
bonding, in the second sentence, “the ICC Electrical
Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical subcode of the
Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

vi. In Section 3204.2.1.3, Ventilation, “the Inter-
national Mechanical Code” shall be deleted and “the
mechanical subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

vii. In Section 3204.2.2.2, Construction of indoor
areas, “the International Building Code” shall be deleted
and “the building subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

viii. In Section 3204.2.2.3, Ventilation, “the Inter-
national Mechanical Code” shall be deleted and “the
mechanical subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

70-46.18

ix. In Section 3204.3.1.1, Location, the second para-
graph shall be deleted in its entirety.

Xx. In Section 3204.4.3, Depth, cover and fill, in the
third sentence, “the International Building Code” shall
be deleted and “the building subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xi. In Section 3205.4.1, Dispensing areas, in the
second sentence, “the International Building Code” shall
be deleted and “the building subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

33. Chapter 33, Explosives and Fireworks, shall be

amended as follows:

i.  Section 3301.2, Permit required, shall be deleted
in its entirety.

ii. Section 3301.2.2, Sale and retail display, shall be
amended as follows: In the first sentence, “manufacture,
store,” shall be inserted before “offer.” In addition, “or
expose” shall be inserted after “offer.” Finally, “upon
highways, sidewalks, public property, or in Group A or
E occupancies” shall be deleted and “, except for the ap-
proved supervised display of fireworks” shall be in-
serted.

iii. In Section 3301.2.4, Financial responsibility,
“Section 3301.2, the applicant shall file with the jurisdic-
tion a corporate surety bond in the principal sum of
$100,000 or a public liability insurance policy for the
same amount, for the purpose of the payment of all
damages to persons or property which arise from, or are
caused by, the conduct of any act authorized by the
permit upon which any judicial judgment results. The
fire code official is authorized to specify a greater or
lesser amount when, in his or her opinion, conditions at
the location of use indicate a greater or lesser amount is
required. Government entities shall be exempt from this
bond requirement” shall be deleted and “N.J.A.C. 5:70-
2.7, the applicant must comply with Sections 3301.2.4.1
through 3301.2.4.4” shall be inserted.

iv. In Section 3301.2.4.1, Blasting, the first sentence
shall be deleted and the following shall be inserted:
“Any self-employed person in possession of a valid
permit to use explosives for blasting purposes, issued by
the New Jersey Department of Labor pursuant to
N.J.A.C. 12:190-3.11, shall have an insurance coverage
for blasting damage of not less than $500,000 for prop-
erty damage including explosion, collapse, and under-
ground utility damage and of $500,000 to $1,000,000 for
personal injury.

1. Any person in possession of a valid permit to
use explosives for blasting purposes, as outlined
above, and who is not-self employed, shall not use
explosives unless the employer is insured as specified
above.



N y
e

e

UNIFORM FIRE CODE

5:70-3.2

2. Proof of the possession of a valid insurance
policy covering blasting damage shall be readily
available for inspection at the site.

3. Nothing in this section shall be construed as
preventing greater insurance coverage for damage
from blasting when requested by any person for whom
blasting is being performed.”

v. In Section 3301.2.4.2, Fireworks display, the first
sentence shall be deleted and the following shall be
inserted: “The governing body of the municipality shall
require insurance in a sum not less than $500,000
conditioned for the payment of all damages, which may
be caused either to a person or persons or to property, by
reason of the display so as aforesaid permitted, and
arising from any acts of the permit holder, his agents,
employees, or subcontractors. Such surety shall run to
the municipality in which the permit is granted, and shall
be for the use and benefit of any person, persons, or the
owner or owners of any property so damaged, who is or
are authorized to maintain an action thereon, or his or
their heirs, executors, administrators, successors, or
assigns.”

vi. New Section 3301.2.4.3 shall be inserted as fol-
lows: “3301.2.4.3 Municipal resolution. The governing
body of any municipality may, upon application in writ-
ing accompanied by proof of proper insurance coverage,
grant permission by resolution, for the public display of
fireworks by municipalities, religious, fraternal or civic
organizations, fair associations, amusement parks, or
other organizations or groups of individuals approved by
the governing body of such municipality to whom the
application is made. After such permission shall have
been granted, and a permit shall have been issued by the
fire official, pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:70-2.7, the posses-
sion and use of fireworks for such display shall be lawful
for that purpose only.”

vii. New Section 3301.2.4.4 shall be inserted as fol-
lows: “3301.2.4.4 Application. Application for permits
for display or discharge shall be made in writing at least
15 days in advance of the date of the display or dis-
charge of fireworks. A permit granted hereunder shall
not be transferable, nor shall any such permit be ex-
tended beyond the dates set out therein. All applications
for permits shall set forth the date, the hour, the place of
making such display, and the place for storing of
fireworks prior to the display. The application shall also
contain the names of the person, persons, firm, partner-
ship, corporation, association, or group of individuals
making the display, and the name of the person or per-
sons in charge of the igniting, firing, setting-off, explod-
ing or causing to be exploded such fireworks. The loca-
tion of the storage place shall be subject to the approval
of the fire official of the jurisdiction.”

viii. In Section 3305.5, Buildings and equipment,
“and constructed in accordance with the requirements of

70-46.19

the International Building Code for Group H occupan-
cies” shall be deleted.

ix. In Section 3307.1, General, the first sentence
shall be deleted and the following shall be inserted: “The
handling and firing of explosives shall be performed in
accordance with NPFA 495 by the person possessing a
permit to use explosives issued by the N.J. Department
of Labor pursuant to N.J.A.C. 12:190 or by employees
under that person’s direct supervision who are at least 18
years old.”

x. New Section 3307.16, Magazines clearance, shall
be inserted as follows: “3307.16 Magazines Clearance.
At the site of blasting operations, a distance of at least
150 feet shall be maintained between magazines and the
blast area when the quantity of explosives temporarily
kept therein is in excess of 25 pounds, and at least 50
feet when the quality of explosives is 25 pounds or less.
When site restrictions are such that the distance specified
herein cannot be met, then the magazine shall be moved
from the site the required distance when the blasting is
actually to be performed.”

xi. New Section 3308.2.2.1 shall be inserted as fol-
lows: “3308.2.2.1 The use of what are technically known
as fireworks showers, or of any composition containing
potassium and sulfur, in theaters or public halls, shall be
subject to prior approval by the fire official and the fol-
lowing conditions shall apply:

1. The building was designed and constructed to
accommodate such activity in accordance with the
Uniform Construction Code.

2. Fireworks shall be discharged and operated in
accordance with manufacturer’s directions and speci-
fications.

3. The owner/operator shall provide a full dem-
onstration to the fire official prior to final operation.

4.  Fireworks shall be discharged so as not to en-
danger the public by escape of any hot particles from
the stage area.

5. A fire watch, with proper extinguishing equip-
ment as approved by the fire official shall be main-
tained during the operation at both sides of the stage
area.”

xii. Section 3308.11, Retail display and sale, shall be
deleted in its entirety.

34. Chapter 34, Flammable and Combustible Liquids,

shall be amended as follows:

i. In Section 3401.3, Referenced documents, “the
International Building Code and the International Me-
chanical Code” shall be deleted and “the building sub-
code of the Uniform Construction Code and the mechan-

Supp. 8-18-08



5:70-3.2

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 8-18-08

ical subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be
inserted.

ii.  Section 3401.4, Permits, shall be deleted it its
entirety.

iii. Section 3403.1.3, Other applications, “the ICC
Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical sub-
code of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be in-
serted.

iv. In Section 3403.6.1, Nonapplicability, “the Inter-
national Mechanical Code” shall be deleted and “the
mechanical subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

v. In Section 3404.2.7.7, Design of supports, “the
International Building Code” shall be deleted and “the
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

vi. In Section 3404.2.8.1, Listing required, in the
first sentence, “the International Building Code” and
“Section 1707 of the International Building Code” shall
be deleted and “the building subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

vii. In Section 3404.2.8.9, Ventilation, in the last
sentence, “the International Mechanical Code” shall be
deleted and “the mechanical subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

viii.  In Section 3404.2.8.12, Liquid removal, in the
third sentence, “the ICC Electrical Code” shall be de-
leted and “the electrical subcode of the Uniform Con-
struction Code” shall be inserted.

ix. In Section 3404.2.8.17, Classified area, “the
ICC Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical
subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be in-
serted.

X. In Section 3404.2.9.3, Stairs, platforms and
walkways, “the International Building Code” shall be
deleted and “the building subcode of the Uniform Con-
struction Code” shall be inserted.

xi. In the title of Section 3404.2.9.5.1, “prohib-
ited” shall be deleted and “permitted” shall be inserted.
In addition, the first sentence shall be deleted and the
following shall be inserted: “Storage of Class I and II
liquids in above ground tanks shall be permitted outside
of buildings in accordance with NFPA 30.”

Xii. Section 3404.2.13.1.4, Tanks abandoned in
place, shall be deleted in its entirety.

xiii.  In Section 3404.2.14, Removal and disposal of
tanks, “and 3404.2.14.2” shall be deleted and “through
3404.2.14.3” shall be inserted.

xiv.  In Section 3404.2.14.1, Removal, “and under-
ground” shall be deleted.

70-46.20

XV. In Section 3404.2.14.2, Disposal, “federal,
state and local regulations” shall be deleted and “the
New Jersey Department of Environmental Protection
regulations” shall be inserted.

xvi.  New Section 3404.2.14.3 shall be inserted as
follows: “3404.2.14.3 Underground tanks shall be
removed or abandoned in place in accordance with the
applicable requirements of Uniform Construction Code
and the New Jersey Department of Environmental
Protection.”

xvii. In Section 3404.3.1.1, Approved containers,
the following shall be inserted as the second sentence:
“Portable containers intended to hold 10 gallons or less
and to be used for gasoline or other flammable liquid
shall be red in color. The name of the flammable liquid
shall be prominently displayed on the container in bold
letters of a contrasting color. The containers shall be of
metal or approved plastic with a spring loaded or screw
cap. Containers for kerosene shall be blue in color.”

xviii. New Section 3404.1.1.1, Signs, shall be in-
serted as follows: “3404.1.1.1 Signs. Wherever flam-
mable liquids or kerosene are dispensed into or offered
for sale in containers, there shall be a prominent sign
located in a conspicuous location indicating the required
color and construction of portable containers for each
product sold. The sign shall not be less than 12 inches in
the least dimension.”

xix. In Section 3405.3.5.3, Quantities exceeding
limits for control areas, in the second and third
paragraphs, “the International Building Code” shall be
deleted and the building subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

XX. In Section 3405.3.7.1, Construction, location
and fire protection, “the International Building Code”
shall be deleted and “the building subcode of the
Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xxi. In Section 3405.3.7.4, Doors, “the Inter-
national Building Code” shall be deleted and “the
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

xxii. In Section 3405.3.7.5.1, Ventilation, in the
fourth sentence, “the International Building Code and
International Mechanical Code” shall be deleted and
“the building and mechanical subcodes of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xxiii. In Section 3406.2, Storage and dispensing of
flammable and combustible liquids on farms and con-
struction sites, in the exception, “the International
Mechanical Code” shall be deleted and the mechanical
subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be
inserted.

xxiv. In Section 3406.2.3, Containers for storage
and use, in the third paragraph, “the International Build-



UNIFORM FIRE CODE

5:70-3.2

ing Code” shall be deleted and “the building subcode of
the Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xxv. In Section 3406.2.8, Dispensing from tank
vehicles, in the sixth paragraph, “the ICC Electrical
Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical subcode of the
Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xxvi. In Section 3406.4.1, Building construction,
“the International Building Code” shall be deleted and
“the building subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

xxvil. In Section 3406.4.4, Ventilation, in the fourth
sentence, “the International Mechanical Code” shall be
deleted and “the mechanical subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

xxviii. In Section 3406.6.2.1, Parking near residential,
educational and institutional occupancies and other high-
risk areas, delete “chief” and insert “official” following
GLﬁre.’7

35. Chapter 35, Flammable Gases, shall be amended as

follows:

i.  In Section 3501.1, Scope, in the exception, “In-
ternational Fuel Gas Code” shall be deleted and “the fuel
gas subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be
inserted.

ii. Section 3501.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

iii. New definitions shall be added to Section 3502.1
as follows:

Metal hydride. A generic name for compounds
composed of metallic element(s) and hydrogen.

Metal hydride storage system. A closed system con-
sisting of a group of components assembled as a pack-
age to contain metal-hydrogen compounds for which
there exists an equilibrium condition where the hydro-
gen-absorbing metal alloy(s), hydrogen gas, and the
metal-hydrogen compound(s) co-exist and where only
hydrogen gas is released from the system in normal
use.

iv. In Section 3503.1.5.1, Bonding of electrically
conductive materials and equipment, “the 1ICC Electrical
Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical subcode of the
Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

v. New Section 3507 shall be added as follows:
Section 3507

Metal Hydride Storage Systems

3507.1 General requirements. The storage and use
of metal hydride storage systems shall be in accor-

70-46.21

dance with Sections 3501, 3503, 3504, 3505 and
3507. Those portions of the system that are used as a
means to store or supply hydrogen shall also comply
with Chapters 27 and 30 as applicable.

3507.1.1 Classification. The hazard classification of
the metal hydride storage system, as required by Sec-
tion 2701.2.2, shall be based on the hydrogen stored
without regard to the metal hydride content.

3507.1.2 Listed or approved systems. Metal hydride
storage systems shall be listed or approved for the ap-
plication and designed in a manner that prevents the
addition or removal of the metal hydride by other than
the original equipment manufacturer.

3507.1.3 Containers, Design and construction.
Compressed gas containers, cylinders and tanks shall
be designed and constructed in accordance with
Section 3003.2.

3507.1.4 Service life and inspection of containers.
Metal hydride storage system cylinders, containers or
tanks shall be inspected, tested and requalified for
service at not less than five year intervals.

3507.1.5 Marking and labeling. Marking and label-
ing of cylinders, containers, tanks and systems shall
be in accordance with Section 3003.4 and the follow-

ing:

3507.1.5.1 System marking. Metal hydride storage
systems shall be marked with the following.

1.  Manufacturer’s name.

2. Service life indicating the last date the sys-
tem can be used.

3. A unique code or serial number specific to
the unit.

4.  System name or product code that identifies
the system by the type of chemistry used in the sys-
tem.

5.  Emergency contact name, telephone num-
ber or other contact information, and

6. Limitations on refilling of containers to in-
clude rated charging pressure and capacity.

3507.1.5.2 Valve marking. Metal hydride storage
system valves shall be marked with the following:

1. Manufacturer’s name.

2. Service life indicating the last date the
valve can be used, and

3. Metal hydride service in which the valve
can be used, or a product code that is traceable to
this information.

Supp. 8-18-08



5:70-3.2

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

3507.1.5.3 Pressure relief device marking. Metal
hydride storage system pressure relief devices shall be
marked with the following:

1. Manufacturer’s name.

2. Metal hydride service in which the device
can be used, or a product code that is traceable to
this information, and

3. Activation parameters to include tempera-
ture, pressure or both.

3507.1.5.4 Pressure vessel markings. Cylinders,
containers and tanks used in metal hydride storage
systems shall be marked with the following:

1.  Manufacturer’s name.

2. Design specification to which the vessel
was manufactured.

3. Authorized body approving the design and
initial inspection and test of the vessel.

4.  Manufacturer’s original test date.
5. Unique serial number for the vessel.

6. Service life identifying the last date the ves-
sel can be used, and

7. System name or product code that identifies
the system by the type of chemistry used in the sys-
tem.

3507.1.6 Temperature extremes. Metal hydride
storage systems, whether full or partially full, shall not
be exposed to artificially created high temperatures
exceeding 125°F (52°C) or subambient (low) temper-
atures unless designed for use under the exposed
conditions.

3507.1.7 Falling objects. Metal hydride storage sys-
tems shall not be placed in areas where they are capa-
ble of being damaged by falling objects.

3507.1.8 Piping systems. Piping, including tubing,
valves, fittings and pressure regulators, serving metal
hydride storage systems shall be maintained gas tight
to prevent leakage.

3507.1.8.1 Leaking systems. Leaking systems shall
be removed from service. [H1:4.9]

3507.1.9 Refilling of containers. The refilling of
listed or approved metal hydride storage systems shall
be in accordance with the listing requirements and
manufacturers’ instructions.

3507.1.9.1 Industrial trucks. The refilling of metal
hydride storage systems serving powered industrial
trucks shall be in accordance with Section 309.

Supp. 8-18-08

70-46.22

3507.1.9.2 Hydrogen purity. The purity of hydro-
gen used for the purpose of refilling containers shall
be in accordance with the listing and the manufac-
turer’s instructions.

3507.1.10 Electrical. Electrical components for
metal hydride storage systems shall be designed,
constructed, and installed in accordance with the ICC
Electrical Code.

3507.2 Portable containers or systems.

3507.2.1 Securing containers. Containers, cylinders
and tanks shall be secured in accordance with Section
3003.5.3.

3507.2.1.1 Use on mobile equipment. Where a
metal hydride storage system is used on mobile
equipment the equipment shall be designed to restrain
containers, cylinders or tanks from dislodgement, slip-
ping or rotating when the equipment is in motion.

3507.2.1.2 Motorized equipment. Metal hydride
storage systems used on motorized equipment shall be
installed in a manner that protects valves, pressure
regulators, fittings and controls against accidental im-
pact.

3507.2.1.2.1 Protection from damage. Metal hy-
dride storage systems including cylinders, containers,
tanks and fittings shall not extend beyond the platform
of the mobile equipment.

3507.2.2 Valves. Valves on containers, cylinders
and tanks shall remain closed except when containers
are connected to closed systems and ready for use.

36. Chapter 36, Flammable Solids, shall be amended as
follows:

i.  Section 3601.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

ii. In Section 3606.4.2, Storage of 50 to 1,000 cubic
feet, “the International Building Code” shall be deleted
and “the building subcode of the Uniform Construction
Code” shall be inserted.

iii. In Section 3606.5.5, Electrical equipment, “the
ICC Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical
subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be
inserted.

iv. In Section 3606.5.6, Grounding, “the ICC Elec-
trical Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical subcode
of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

37. Chapter 37, Highly Toxic and Toxic Materials, shall
be amended as follows:

i.  Section 3701.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

Next Page is 70-47



S

UNIFORM FIRE CODE

5:70-3.2

ii. In Section 3703.1.3, Treatment system—highly
toxic liquids, “the International Mechanical Code” shall
be deleted and “the mechanical subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

iii. In Section 3703.1.4.2, Separation—highly toxic
solids and liquids, “the International Building Code”
shall be deleted and “the building subcode of the
Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

iv. In Section 3703.2.3.2, Treatment system—highly
toxic liquids, “the International Mechanical Code” shall
be deleted and the mechanical subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted.

v. In Section 3704.2.2.7, Treatment systems, in the
third sentence, “Section 510 of the International Me-
chanical Code” shall be deleted and “the mechanical
subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be
inserted.

vi. In Section 3704.2.2.8, Emergency power, “the
ICC Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “the electrical
subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be in-
serted.

vii. In Section 3705.3.1, Cabinets, in the second
paragraph, “the International Building Code” shall be
deleted and “the building subcode of the Uniform
Construction Code” shall be inserted. In addition, in the
third paragraph, “the International Mechanical Code”
shall be deleted and “the mechanical subcode of the
Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

viii. In Section 3705.3.2, Ozone gas generator room,
in the first sentence, “the International Mechanical
Code” shall be deleted and “the mechanical subcode of
the Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

38. Chapter 38, Liquefied Petroleum Gases, shall be

amended as follows:

i.  Section 3801.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

ii. Section 3801.3, Construction documents, shall be
deleted in its entirety.

iii. In Section 3803.1, General, “the International
Fuel Gas Code” shall be deleted and “the fuel gas sub-
code of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be in-
serted.

iv. In Section 3803.2.1.7, Use for food preparation,
“the International Fuel Gas Code, the International Me-
chanical Code” shall be deleted and “the fuel and me-
chanical subcodes of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

v. In Section 3803.3, Location of equipment and
piping, “the International Fuel Gas Code” shall be de-
leted and “the fuel gas subcode of the Uniform Con-
struction Code™ shall be inserted.

70-47

vi. New Section 3804.2, Roofs, shall be inserted as
follows: “3804.2 Roofs. Containers shall not be located
on roofs.”

vii. Section 3804.2, Maximum capacity within estab-
lished limits, shall be deleted in its entirety.

viii. In Section 3806.1, Attendants, “or the exchange
of LP-gas cylinders” shall be inserted after “LP-gas.”

ix. New Section 3806.3, Dispensing locations, shall
be inserted as follows: “3806.3 Dispensing locations.
The point of transfer of LP-gas from one container to
another shall be separated from exposures as specified in
NFPA 58.”

Xx. New Section 3806.4, Labeling, shall be inserted
as follows: “3806.4 Labeling. Prior to filling any cylin-
der 4 to 40 pounds LP-Gas capacity, except fork lift
cylinders, the operator of the fill plant or distribution
plant shall affix a label to the collar of the cylinder that
includes the following warning printed in English and in
Spanish: ‘Flammable Gas — Never Use or Store In-
doors/Gas Inflammable-Nunca Se Use o Guarde Aden-
tro.””

xi. New Section 3807.5, Container markings, shall
be inserted as follows: “3807.5 Container markings.
Containers of 100 pounds or more water capacity shall
be legibly marked with a warning followed by the name
of the gas contained. The warning label shall read ‘Flam-
mable Gas’ followed by the name of the gas, such as
‘Propane’ or ‘Butane.’”

xii. New Section 3807.6, Storage area signs, shall be
inserted as follows: “3807.6 Storage area signs. Storage
areas having containers exceeding 100 pounds product
water capacity shall be posted with adequate ‘No smok-
ing’ and ‘Flammable Gas’ signs legibly marked. The
‘Flammable Gas’ sign shall be marked ‘Flammable Gas’
and the name of the gas to indicate the contents such as
‘Flammable Gas-Propane’ or ‘Flammable Gas-Butane.’”

xiii. New Section 3807.7, Marker plates, shall be
inserted as follows: “3807.7 Marker plates. All LP-Gas
installations exceeding 250 gallons individual or aggre-
gate water capacity shall be provided with a marker plate
or sign indicating who should be called in the event of
an emergency involving the LP-Gas installation. The
marker or sign shall include the following:

1. The name of the gas supplier, plant installer,
owner, or operator who will respond to the emer-
gency; and

2. The telephone number of that person.”

xiv. New Section 3807.8, Notification response, shall
be inserted as follows: “3807.8 Notification Response.
The LP-Gas supplier, plant installer, owner or operator
indicated on the marker plate or sign required in Section
3807.7 above shall respond when notified to all LP-Gas

Supp. 8-18-08



5:70-3.2

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 8-18-08

emergencies occurring at the installation and shall main-
tain a 24-hour phone service.”

xv. New Section 3807.9, Fire or explosion, shall be
inserted as follows: “3807.9 Fire or explosion. When-
ever there is a fire or explosion or accident involving
serious injury or loss of life as a result of an incident
involving an LP-Gas installation, the responsible party
as identified per Section 3807.7 above shall promptly
notify the fire official of its occurrence.”

xvi. In Section 3809.6, Storage on roofs, “which are
not connected for use” shall be deleted.

xvil. In Section 3809.11.2, Construction, “the Inter-
national Building Code” shall be deleted and “the build-
ing subcode of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be
inserted.

39. Chapter 39, Organic Peroxides, shall be amended as

follows:

i.  Section 3901.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

ii. In Section 3904.1.2, Distance from detached
storage buildings to exposures, “the International Build-
ing Code” shall be deleted and “the building subcode of
the Uniform Construction Code” shall be inserted.

40. Chapter 40, Oxidizers, shall be amended as follows:

i.  Section 4001.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

ii. In Section 4004.1.2, Distance from detached
storage buildings to exposures, “the International
Building Code” shall be deleted and “the building sub-
code of the Uniform Construction Code” shall be in-
serted.

41. Chapter 41, Pyrophoric Materials, shall be amended

as follows:

i.  Section 4101.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

ii. In Section 4104.1.4, Separation from incompati-
ble materials, “the International Building Code” shall be
deleted and “the building subcode of the Uniform Con-
struction Code” shall be inserted.

iii. In Section 4106.1.1, Building construction, “the
International Building Code” shall be deleted and “the
building subcode of the Uniform Construction Code”
shall be inserted.

42. Chapter 42, Pyroxylin (Cellulose Nitrate) Plastics,

shall be amended as follows:

i.  Section 4201.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

43. Chapter 43, Unstable (Reactive) Materials, shall be

amended as follows:

70-48

i.  Section 4301.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

ii. In Section 4304.1, Indoor storage, in the second
paragraph, “the International Building Code” shall be
deleted and “the building subcode of the Uniform Con-
struction Code” shall be inserted.

44. Chapter 44, Water-Reactive Solids and Liquids,

shall be amended as follows:

i.  Section 4401.2, Permits, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

45. Chapter 45, Referenced Standards, shall be amended

as follows:

i.  Under the subheading “AASHTO,” the reference
to “HB-17 2002 Specification for Highway Bridges,
17th Edition 2002” shall be deleted.

ii. The reference standard, “AFSL” shall be deleted
in its entirety.

iii. Under the subheading “APL” the reference to
“Publication 2028-(2002) Guide for Safe Storage and
Handling of Heated Petroleum Derived Asphalt Products
and Crude Oil Residue” shall be deleted.

iv. Under the subheading “NFPA,” a new “Refer-
ence in code section number” “3404.2.9.5.1” shall be
added to “Standard reference number 30-03.”

v. Under the subheading “NFPA,” a new “Standard
reference number” “51B-03 Fire Prevention During
Welding, Cutting and Hot Work” shall be added be-
tween 51A-01 and 52-02. “Reference in code section
number” “2603.1” shall be added.

vi. Under the subheading “NFPA,” a new “Standard
reference number” “68-02 Venting of Deflagrations”
shall be added between 61-02 and 69-02. “Reference in
code section number” Table 1304.2 shall be added.

vii. Under the subheading “NFPA,” a new “Standard
reference number” ‘“27-07 Static Electricity” shall be
added between 72-02 and 80-99. “Reference in code sec-
tion number” “2703.9.5” shall be added.

viii. Under the subheading “NFPA,” a new “Standard
reference number” “92A-06 Smoke Controlled Systems”
shall be added between 86-03 and 92B-05. “Reference in
code section number” “Table 901.6.1” shall be added.

ix. Under the subheading “NFPA,” a new “Standard
reference number” “96-04 Ventilation Control and Fire

Protection of Commercial Cooking Operations” shall be
added.

x.  Under the subheading “NFPA,” a new “Standard
reference number” “204-02 Smoke and Heat Vents”
shall be added between 160-01 and 211-03. “Reference
in code section number” “Table 901.6.1” shall be added.

Next Page is 70-48.1



UNIFORM FIRE CODE

5:70-4.1

xi. Under the subheading “NFPA,” “Reference in
code section number” “301.1.1 and 1901.1” shall be
added to “Standard reference number 230-03”.

xii. Under the subheading “NFPA,” a new “Standard
reference number” “720-05 Carbon Monoxide Warning
Equipment” shall be added between 704-01 and 750-03.
“Reference in code section number” “Table 906.6.1,
901.6.3” shall be added.

46. The Appendices shall be amended as follows:

i.  Appendix A, Board of Appeals; Appendix B,
Fire-Flow Requirements for Buildings; and Appendix C,
Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution, shall be deleted
in their entirety.

Amended by R.1998 d.588, effective December 21, 1998 (operative

January 2, 1999).

See: 30 N.J.R. 3127(a), 30 N.J.R. 4349(b).

In (a)3, inserted a new xi, and recodified former xi through xxxi as xii
through xxxii.

Amended by R.1999 d.59, effective March 1, 1999.
See: 30 N.J.R. 3994(a), 31 N.J.R. 676(a).

Rewrote (a).

Emergency amendment, R.2000 d.402, effective September 8, 2000 (to

expire November 7, 2000).

See: 32 N.J.R. 3647(a).

In (a)7., added new i, iii, viii and ix; recodified existing i as ii,
existing ii through v as iv through vii and existing vi through viii as x
through xii.

Adopted concurrent proposal, R.2000 d.486, effective November 6,

2000.

Next Page is 70-48.3

70-48.1

See: 32 N.J.R. 3647(a), 32 N.J.R. 4310(a).

Readopted provisions of R.2000 d.402 with changes, effective
December 4, 2000.

Amended by R.2001 d.134, effective May 7, 2001.
See: 32 N.J.R. 4163(a), 33 N.J.R. 1402(a).
Rewrote the section.
Amended by R.2002 d.372, effective November 18, 2002.
See: 34 N.J.R. 2636(a), 34 N.J.R. 3958(a).
Rewrote the section.
Administrative correction.
See: 34 N.J.R. 4195(b).
Administrative correction.
See: 35 N.J.R. 221(a).
Amended by R.2003 d.30, effective January 21, 2003.
See: 34 N.J.R. 2639(a), 35 N.J.R. 403(a).

In (a)7, substituted “six” for “50” in vi, added a new vii and
recodified the existing vii and viii as viii and ix, added a new x through
xii and recodified existing ix through xv as xiii through xix.

Repeal and New Rule, R.2008 d.236, effective August 18, 2008.
See: 39 N.J.R. 3805(a), 39 N.J.R. 4893(a), 40 N.J.R. 4760(a).
Section was “Modifications”.

SUBCHAPTER 4. FIRE SAFETY CODE

5:70-4.1 Code adopted; scope

(a) Pursuant to authority of the Uniform Fire Safety Act
(P.L. 1983, c.383, N.J.S.A. 52:27D-192 et seq.), the Com-
missioner hereby adopts this subchapter as the State Fire
Safety Code.

Supp. 8-18-08



