
UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

111. Section 1607.9, Reduction in live loads, shall 
be amended as follows: ht the first sentence, "and 
applied" shall be inserted after "reduced." After the 
frrst sentence, "The method chosen shall be applied 
throughout the building." shall be inserted. 

iv. In Section 1607.9.1.4, Group A occupancies, 
"and Group E" shall be added to the title of the section 
and after "Group A" insert "and Group E". 

v. In Section 1607.9.2, Alternate floor live load re
duction, Item 1, "or Group E" shall be inserted after 
"Group A." 

vi. In Section 1611.1, Design rain load, the second 
sentence shall be deleted and "The design rainfall rates 
shall be based on the plumbing subcode, N.J.A.C. 5:23-
3.15." shall be inserted. 

vii. In Section 1611, Rain loads, Figure 1611.1, 
"100-year, 1-hour rainfall (inches)" shall be deleted. 

viii. In Section 1612.1, General, in the frrst sentence, 
"including substantial improvement and restoration of 
substantial damage to buildings and structures" shall be 
deleted. 

ix. Section 1613.3, Existing building, shall be de
leted in its entirety. 

17. Chapter 17, Structural Tests and Special Inspections, 
shall be amended as follows: 

i. In Section 1701.1, Scope, "shall apply to Class 1 
buildings and smoke control systems in all buildings 
and" shall be inserted after "chapter." 

ii. Section 1702.1, General, shall be amended as 
follows: In the title, "/Special Inspector" shall be in
serted after "Agency." In the frrst sentence, "or design 
professional acting as the approved agency" shall be 
inserted after "agency." At the end of the defmition, add 
the sentence, "Special inspectors shall be certified in ac
cordance with the administrative provisions of the 
Uniform Construction Code." 

iii. Section 1703.1, Approved agency, shall be 
amended as follows: In the frrst sentence, "Upon the re
quest of the construction official" shall be inserted be
fore "An." In the same sentence, "building official" shall 
be deleted and "construction official" shall be inserted 
and "applicable" shall be deleted and "following" shall 
be inserted. 

iv. Add new section1703.1.4 as follows: "1703.1.4 
Certification. An approved agency shall employ person
nel certified in accordance with the administrative pro
visions of the Uniform Construction Code, to conduct, 
supervise and evaluate tests or inspections." 

v. In Section 1703.6, Evaluation and follow-up 
inspection, "in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.26" 
shall be inserted after the second "assembly." 

New Jersey State Library 
23-55 

5:23-3.14 

vi. Section 1704.1, General, shall be amended as 
follows: In the first sentence of the first paragraph, ''the 
registered design professional" shall be deleted and 
"person" shall be inserted. Also, in the frrst sentence of 
the frrst paragraph, "of Class 1 buildings only or any 
building containing a smoke control system" shall be 
inserted after "construction." In the second sentence of 
the second paragraph, "the registered design profes
sional" shall be deleted and "person" shall be inserted. 

vii. Section 1704.1.2, Report requirement, shall be 
amended as follows: In the second sentence, "building 
official" shall be deleted and "construction official" shall 
be inserted and "registered design professional" shall be 
deleted and "person" shall be inserted. In the same 
sentence, "in accordance with N.J.A.C 5:23-2.21(c)" 
shall be inserted after "charge." In the fifth sentence, 
"building official" shall be deleted and "construction 
official" shall be inserted and "registered design pro
fessional" shall be deleted and "person" shall be in
serted. In the last sentence, "building official" shall be 
deleted and "construction official" shall be inserted. 

viii. In Section 1704.3, Steel construction, "the on
site erection of' shall be inserted after "for." 

ix. In Table 1704.3, Required Verification and In
spection of Steel Construction, Items 1, 3, and 4 shall be 
deleted. 

x. In Section 1704.5, Masonry construction, "in 
Seismic Design Category D" shall be inserted after the 
word "construction" within the text. ht the same section, 
in Exception 2, the reference to "Table 1807.1.6.3(1)" 
shall be deleted. 

xi. Section 1704.6, Wood construction, shall be de
leted in its entirety. 

xii. ht Section 1705.3, Seismic resistance, "for Seis
mic Design Category D buildings" shall be inserted after 
"inspections." 

xiii. Sections 1705.4, Wind resistance; 1705.4.1, 
Wind requirements in the statement of special in
spections; and 1705.4.2, Detailed requirements, shall be 
deleted in their entirety. 

xiv. Section 1706, Special inspection for wind re
quirements, shall be deleted. 

xv. In Section 1707.1, Special htspections for Seis
mic Resistance, in items 1 and 3, "C," shall be deleted in 
reference to seismic design categories. 

xvi. In Section 1707.7, Mechanical and Electrical 
Components, in items 1, 3, 4 and 5, "C," shall be deleted 
in reference to seismic design categories. 

xvii. Section 1708.3, Structural steel, shall be 
deleted. 

Supp. 6-3-13 



5:23-3.14 

xvm. ln Section 1709.1, Contractor responsibility, in 
the ftrst sentence, "main - wind- or" shall be deleted. In 
addition, in the same sentence, "or a wind-" shall be 
deleted. 

xix. Section 1710, Structural Observations, shall be 
deleted in its entirety. 

18. Chapter 18, Soils and Foundations, shall be amended 
as follows: 

i. Section 1803.3.1, Scope of investigation, shall be 
amended as follows: After the fust sentence, the 
following sentence from Section 1802.1 of the 1996 
BOCA National Building Code shall be inserted: "There 
shall be at least one exploratory boring to rock or to an 
adequate depth below the load-bearing strata for every 
2,500 square feet (232 m2) of built-over area, and such 
additional tests as the code official requires." 

ii. In the title of Section 1803.5.11, "C" shall be 
deleted and "D" shall be inserted. In the frrst sentence, 
the reference to "C" shall be deleted. 

iii. New Section 1803.5.13 from Section 1802.1 of 
the 1996 BOCA National Building Code shall be in
serted as follows: "Building Height: For all buildings 
that are more than three stories or 40 feet (12,192 mm) 
in height above the grade plane, the building official 
shall request soil tests." 

iv. In Section 1805.4.3, Drainage discharge, 
"International Plumbing Code" shall be deleted and 
"plumbing subcode (N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.15)" shall be 
inserted. 

v. New Section 1807.4 from Section 1813.8 of the 
1996 BOCA National Building Code shall be inserted as 
follows: "1807.4 Erosion protection: Where water im
pacts the ground from the edge of the roof, downspout, 
scupper or other rain water collection or diversion 
device, provisions shall be made to prevent soil erosion 
and direct the water away from the foundation." 

vi. Section 1809.4, Depth and width of footings, 
shall have the following exceptions added: 

"Exceptions: 

1. Garden-type utility sheds and similar struc-
tures that are 100 square feet or less in area, 10 feet 
or less in height and accessory to structures of 
Group R-2, R-3 or R-4 and does not contain a 
water, gas, oil or sewer connection. These struc
tures shall be of sufficient weight to remain in place 
or shall be anchored to the ground. 

2. Garden-type utility sheds and similar struc-
tures that are greater than 100 square feet, but not 
more than 200 square feet in area, 10 feet or less in 
height and accessory to structures of Group R-2, R-
3 or R-4 provided the shed is dimensionally stable 

Supp. 6-3-13 23-56 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

without the foundation system and does not contain 
a water, gas, oil or sewer connection. A shed shall 
be considered dimensionally stable if it is provided 
with a floor system that is tied to the walls of the 
structure such that it reacts to loads as a unit. These 
structures shall be of sufficient weight to remain in 
place or shall be anchored to the ground." 

vii. New Section 1810.3.1.7 from Section 1816.9 of 
the 1996 BOCA National Building Code shall be 
inserted as follows: "Spacing: The minimum center-to
center spacing of piles shall not be less than twice the 
average diameter of a round pile, nor less than 1 3/4 
times the diagonal dimension of a rectangular pile. 
Where driven to or penetrating into rock, the spacing 
shall not be less than 24 inches (610 mm). Where 
receiving principal support at the end from materials 
other than rock, or through friction resistance, the 
spacing shall not be less than 30 inches (762 mm) except 
that for piles having enlarged bases formed either by 
compacting concrete or driving a pre-cast base, the min
imum center-to-center spacing shall be 4 112 feet (1,372 
mm). The spacing of piles shall be such that the average 
load on the supporting strata will not exceed the safe 
load-bearing value of those strata as determined by test 
borings or other approved methods." 

viii. In Section 1810.3.3.1.3, Load test evaluation 
methods, Item 4 shall be deleted. 

ix. In Section 1810.3.13, Seismic ties, in the excep
tion, "and U" and "subject to approval of the building 
official" shall be deleted. 

19. Chapter 23, Wood, shall be amended as follows: 

i. In Section 2303.4.1.4.1, Truss design drawings, 
"Where required by the registered design professional, 
the building official, or the statutes of the jurisdiction in 
which the project is to be constructed," shall be deleted. 

ii. In Section 2303.4.2, Truss placement diagram, in 
the last sentence, "that serve only as a guide for instal
lation and do not deviate from the permit submittal 
drawings" shall be deleted. 

iii. New Section 2303.4.8, entitled "Truss Identi
fication," shall be inserted as follows: "Each truss shall 
be labeled or otherwise indelibly marked at the factory 
with the individual truss number as assigned in the truss 
layout plan. The indelible marking or label shall be 
located on the bottom chord of the truss, inside the bear
ing points. When indelible markings are used, each digit 
shall be not less than one inch high. When labels are 
used, the label shall be a minimum of ftve inches by 
three inches and shall be afftxed to the truss by a truss 
plate. Labels shall remain affixed to the truss." 

iv. In Table 2306.2.1(2), Allowable shear for wood 
structural panel blocked diaphragms utilizing multiple 
rows of fasteners (high load diaphragms) with framing 

u 

u 



0 

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE 

Amended by R.1985 d.154, effective Apri11, 1985 (operative July 1, 
1985.) 

See: 17 N.J.R. 239(a), 17 N.J.R. 810(a). 
(a)2 added; subsection (c) added. 

Correction: N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.14(c)5 was incorrect in adoption. 
See: 17 N.J.R. 1409(a). 
Amended by R.1985 d.324, effective July 1, 1985. 
See: 17N.J.R. 861(c), 17N.J.R. 1646(a). 

(b)3i: amended text. 
Amended by R.1986 d380, effective September 22, 1986. 
See: 18 N.J.R. 1235(a), 18 N.J.R. 1931(a). 

Substantially amended. 
Amended by R.1987 d.374, effective September 21, 1987. 
See: 19N.J.R. 1024(a), 19N.J.R. 1720(b). 

Model subcode revisions. 
Amended by R.1988 d.270, effective June 20, 1988. 
See: 20 N.J.R. 575(a), 20 N.J.R. 1344(a). 

Added (a)3 and (c). 
Amended by R.1990 d253, effective May 21, 1990. 
See: 22 N.J.R. 909(b), 22 N.J.R. 1554(a). 

Text added at (c)2ii, 4, 5 and 7. 
Amended by R.1990 d.325, effective July 2, 1990. 
See: 21 N.J.R. 1654(a), 22 N.J.R. 2001(a). 

Text added at (b)5xii(1) to conform to Fire Code. 
Amended by R.1990 d507, effective October 15, 1990. 
See: 22 N.J.R. 2208(a), 22 N.J.R. 3214(a). 

Text conformed to BOCA National Code/1990. 
Amended by R.1990 d.558, effective November 19, 1990. 
See: 22 N.J.R. 1969(b), 22 N.J.R. 3483(a). 

Conditional exemption for hoophouses or polyhouses added. 
Amended by R.1991 d325, effective July 1, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a). 

Article 26 amended at (b)14. 
Amended by R.1991 d.429, effective August 19, 1991. 
See: 23 N.J.R. 1487(a), 23 N.J.R. 2501(a). 

In (a), added 3. Added (c). 
Amended by R.1992 d244, effective June 15, 1992. 
See: 24 N.J.R. 1147(a), 24 N.J.R. 2243(a). 

Text added at (b )10v through viii. 
Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993. 
See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a). 
Amended by R.1995 d.144, effective March 20, 1995 (operative July 1, 

1995). 
See: 26 N.J.R. 2698(a), 26 N.J.R. 3524(a), 27 N.J.R. 1180(a). 
Amended by R.1995 d477, effective September 5, 1995. 
See: 27 N.J.R. 1717(a), 27 N.J.R. 3328(a). 

Added (b)2v. 
Amended by R.1998 d.332, effective July 6, 1998. 
See: 30N.J.R. 1377(a), 30N.J.R. 2421(b). 

Rewrote the section. 
Amended by R.2000 d.492, effective December 18, 2000. 
See: 32 N.J.R. 3219(a), 32 N.J.R. 4437(b). 

Rewrote (b)25. 
Amended by R.2001 d 127, effective April16, 2001. 
See: 33 N.J.R. 392(a), 33 N.J.R. 1195(a). 

In (a)9, added new ix and recodified former ix through xiii as new x 
through xiv. 
Amended by R.2001 d.368, effective October 15, 2001. 
See: 33 N.J.R. 1990(a), 33 N.J.R. 3673(b). 

In (b)9, inserted a new ix and recodified former ix through xiv as x 
throughxv. 
Amended by R.2001 d369, effective October 15, 2001. 
See: 33 N.J.R. 2365(a), 33 N.J.R. 3674(a). 

In (b), substituted "seven" for "7 1/3 (2335 mm)" in 2vi, rewrote 10, 
added a new 17, and recodified former 17 through 26 as 18 through 27. 
Amended by R.2002 d.215, effective July 1, 2002. 
See: 34 N.J.R. 1078(a), 34 N.J.R. 2312(a). 

In (b )22, inserted new ii and recodified existing ii through xvii as iii 
through xviii. 
Administrative correction. 
See: 34 N.J.R. 3771(b). 
Amended byR.2003 d187, effective May 5, 2003. 
See: 34 N.J.R. 4248(a), 35 N.J.R. 1939( c). 

Rewrote the section. 

Administrative correction. 
See: 35 N.J.R. 2864(b). 
Amended by R.2003 d351, effective September 2, 2003. 
See: 35 N.J.R. 1177(a), 35 N.J.R. 4051(a). 

In (b)9, added xi; recodified existing xi to xiii as xii to xiv. 
Amended by R.2003 d420, effective November 3, 2003. 
See: 34 N.J.R. 4248(a), 35 N.J.R. 5073(a). 

Rewrote (b). 
Administrative correction. 
See: 36 N.J.R. 3525( c). 
Amended by R.2004 d.423, effective November 15, 2004. 
See: 36 N.J.R. 3004(a), 36 N.J.R. 5090(a). 

In (b)5, added ii. 
Amended by R.2005 d.4, effective January 3, 2005. 
See: 36 N.J.R. 4049(a), 37 N.J.R. 47(a). 

5:23-3.14 

In (b)19, added new iv and recodified former iv and vas v and vi. 
Administrative correction. 
See: 37 N.J.R. 502(b), 674(a). 
Amended by R.2005 d.403, effective November 21, 2005. 
See: 37 N.J.R. 2753(a), 37 N.J.R. 4399(b). 

Added (b)14xi and recodified former (b)14xi-xiii as (b)14xii-xiv; 
added (b)18 and recodified former (b)18-25 as (b)19-26. 
Amended by R.2005 d446, effective December 19, 2005. 
See: 37 N.J.R. 2747(a), 37 N.J.R. 4907(a). 

In (b)3viii(3), substituted "one- and two-family" for "single-family"; 
in (b)3viii(5), "Group R-5 also includes: ... " 
Amended by R.2006 d.28, effective January 17, 2006. 
See: 37 N.J.R. 2750(a), 38 N.J.R. 485(b). 

Rewrote (b)9, 20 and 21. 
Amended by R.2006 d157, effective May 1, 2006. 
See: 37 N.J.R. 3108(a), 38 N.J.R. 1824(a). 

Rewrote (b)21ii. 
Administrative Correction. 
See: 38 N.J.R. 3024(a). 
Amended by R.2006 d.381, effective November 6, 2006. 
See: 38 N.J.R. 35(a), 38 N.J.R. 4691(a). 

In (b)15ii, added the last sentence; added new (b)15iv; and recodified 
former (b)15iv through (b)15xv as (b)15v through (b)15xvi. 
Amended by R.2007 d51, effective February 5, 2007. 
See: 38 N.J.R. 375(a), 39 N.J.R. 371(a). 

Added new (b )2viii; recodified former (b )2viii through (b )2x as (b )2ix 
through (b)2xi; added new (b)3iii; recodified former (b)3iii through 
(b)3viii as (b)3iv through (b)3ix; added new (b)9i; recodified former 
(b )9i through (b )9xi as (b )9ii through (b )9xii; added new (b )9xiii; re
codified former (b )9xii through (b )9xv as (b )9xiv through (b )9xvii; 
added new (b)10xxii and (b)10xxiii; and recodified former (b)10xxii as 
(b)10xxiv. 
Amended by R.2007 d65, effective February 20, 2007. 
See: 38 N.J.R. 3348(a), 39 N.J.R. 633(a). 

Rewrote the section. 
Administrative correction. 
See: 39N.J.R. 1249(a). 
Amended by R.2007, d384, effective December 17,2007. 
See: 39 N.J.R. 2684(a), 39 N.J.R. 5211(a). 

Added new (b)3i and (b)3ii; and recodified former (b)3i through 
(b)3vii as (b)3iii through (b)3ix. 
Amended by R.2008 d.39, effective March 3, 2008. 
See: 39 N.J.R. 2175(a), 40 N.J.R. 1084(a). 

Added new (b )24iii; and recodified former (b )24iii as (b )24iv. 
Administrative correction. 
See: 40 N.J.R. 1829(a). 
Amended by R.2008 d.184, effective July 7, 2008. 
See: 39 N.J.R. 2176(a), 40 N.J.R. 3990(a). 

Deleted former (b)9vii; and recodified former (b)9viii through (b)9xlii 
as (b )9vii through (b )9xli. 
Amended by R.2009 d48, effective February 2, 2009. 
See: 40 N.J.R. 5319(a), 41 N.J.R. 733(b). 

In (b)3iii, inserted "(not including food or drink consumption)"; added 
new (b)5ii; recodified former (b)5ii as (b)5iii; added new (b)5iv and 
(b)5v; recodified former (b)5iii through (b)5ix as (b)5vi through (b)5xii; 
in (b)7i, deleted "at" preceding and", 'and group U when used as an 
accessory to Group R3'" following ''Note b"; added new (b)8iii; re
codified former (b)8iii through (b)8v as (b)Siv through (b)8vi; in (b)8v, 
substituted "Exceptions 4 and 6" for "Exception 4" and ''their" for "its"; 

23-58.1 Supp. 6-3-13 



~:23-3.14 

in the second paragraph of (b)9ii, deleted ".1" following "903.1.2''; in 
(b)9v1, deleted ''that conforms to the requirements of Section 1005.3.6," 
fullowing "stairway" and substituted "1023" for "1003.3.4"; in the 
introductory paragraph of (b)9vi, substituted "903.2.14" fur "903.2.16"; 
in (b)9xii3, substituted "903.3.1.1" for "906.2.1"; rewrote (b)9xiii 
through (b)9xli; added (b)9xlii; rewrote (b)10, (b)17xiv through 
(b)17xxii; added new (b)18v; recodified funner (b)l8v through (b)18xi 
as (b)18vi through (b)18xii; rewrote (b)21; and in (b)22iv, deleted "In" 
preceding "Section" and "Item 3" preceding "shall". 
Amended by R.2009 d.126, effective April20, 2009. 
See: 41 N.J.R. 16(a), 41 N.J.R. 1725(a). 

Added new (b)18v; and recodified former (b)18v through (b)18xii as 
(b)18vi through (b)18xiii. 
Amended by R.2009 d255, effective August 17, 2009. 
See: 41 N.J.R. 1919(a), 41 NJ.R. 3065(a). 

In (b)21ii, inserted "insert" twice, substituted "8.6" fur "8.6.1.6.5" and 
deleted "shall be inserted" preceding "after" twice. 
Amended by R.2010 d.195, effective September 7, 2010. 
See: 41 N.J.R. 3140(a), 42 N.J.R. 2043(a). 

Rewrote the section. 
Amended by R.2012 d179, effective November 5, 2012. 
See: 44 N.J.R. 1679(a), 44 N.J.R. 2557(a). 

Added new (b)9xlvi, (b)10xxx and (b)10xxxi; recodified former 
(b )9xlvi through (b )9liii as (b )9xlvii through (b )9liv; and recodified 
fonner (b)10xxx through (b)10xxxviii as (b)10xxxii through (b)10xl. 
Amended by R.2013 d081, effective June 3, 2013. 
See: 44 N.J.R. 1303(a), 45 N.J.R. 1393(a). 

In (b) 17i, substituted "1" for "P'. 

Case Notes 

Set back provisions of borough zoning ordinance controlled conflict
ing state building code provisions. Pfeuffer v. Sculco, 242 N.J.Super. 
181, 576 A.2d 309 (A.D.1990). 

5:23-3.15 Plumbing subcode 

(a) Rules concerning subcode adopted are as follows: 

1. Pursuant to authority ofP.L. 1975, c. 217, as modi
fied by P.L. 1996, c. 53, the Commissioner hereby adopts 
the Model Code of the Plutilbing Heating-Cooling 
Contractors--National Association, known as "The Na
tional Standard Plumbing Code/2009," as the plumbing 
subcode for New Jersey. 

i. Copies of this code may be obtained from the 
sponsor at: PHCC-NA, P.O. Box 6808, Falls Church, 
VA22046. 

2. "The National Standard Plumbing Code/2009,'' in
cluding appendices, may be known and cited as ''the 
plumbing subcode." 

(b) The following pages, chapters, sections or appendices 
of the plumbing subcode shall be amended as follows: 

1. The section entitled "Administration," comprising 
sections ADM 1.1 through ADM 1.13, is deleted in its 
entirety. 

2. Chapter 1 of the plumbing subcode, entitled "Defini
tions," shall be amended as follows: 

i. Delete the term and definition of "Adopting 
Agency." 

ii. Amend the definition of "approved" as follows: 
delete "Sec. 3.12;' and insert "N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.7." 

iii. Delete the definition of "Authority Having Juris
diction" and insert the following: "Unless otherwise 

Supp. 6·3-13 23-58.2 

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS 

defined herein, or unless the context clearly indicates 
otherwise, the term "authority having jurisdiction" for 
purposes of the plumbing subcode, shall mean the 
''plumbing subcode official." 

iv. The definition of the term "building" is deleted, 
and substitute in lieu thereof, the definition of the term 
"building" found in N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4. 

v. In the definition of "Building Classification" de
lete "authority having jurisdiction" and insert "building 
subcode" atN.J.A.C. 5:23-3.14. 

vi. The term and definition of "code" are deleted. 

vii. The term and definition of "family" are deleted. 

viii. The definition of "hot water" shall be deleted and 
the following defmition shall be inserted: "Hot Water: 
Potable water at a temperature of not less than 120 
degrees F and not more than 140 degrees F. 

ix. The definition of "Dead End, Potable Water" 
shall be deleted in its entirety. 

x. The definition of "tempered water" shall be 
amended as follows: before ''temperature,'' delete "de
sired" and after "temperature," delete "for its intended 
use, typically" and insert "of." 

xi. The term and definition of ''nuisance" are de
leted. 

xii. Add the following new definition after the defini
tion of Swimming Pool: Swimming Pool, Public: A 
swimming pool located on any property other than a one 
or two family residential property and including, but not 
limited to, swimming pools open to the use of members, 
residents or the public. 

3. Chapter 2 of the plumbing subcode, entitled "Gen
eral Regulations,'' shall be amended as follows: 

i. Section 2.5 is deleted in its entirety. 

ii. In Section 2.9.3 delete "Building Code or as re
quired by the proper Authority Having Jurisdiction" and 
insert "building subcode." 

iii. In Section 2.11, Piping materials exposed within 
plenums, "Codes" shall be deleted and "subcodes" shall 
be inserted. 

iv. In Section 2.12, Sleeves, subparagraph e, ''regu
lations" shall be deleted and "subcode" shall be inserted. 

v. In Section 2.16, Freezing or overheating, at item 
1, "42" shall be inserted in the blank space provided. 
Additionally, the following shall be inserted: "Com
bination domestic/fire water service piping shall be in
stalled such that the minimum earth cover is 42 inches or 
the top of the pipe is 12 inches below the frost depth of 
the locality, whichever is greater. Limited-area sprinkler 
systems installed in accordance with Section 903.3.5.1.1 
of the building subcode, shall be installed such that the 

u 


