UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.12

(d) Pursuant to Reorganization Plan No. 114-1996, the
Department or the municipal code enforcing agency shall

have authority to enforce and cite violations of N.J.A.C.
6A:26-6.2.

Amended by R.1986 d.142, effective May 5, 1986.
See: 17 N.J.R. 1169(a), 18 N.J.R. 945(a).

New (a)7; old (a)7 through 9 renumbered (a)8.-10.

Administrative Change: This section was originally part of NJ.A.C.
5:23-3.11.

See: 18 N.J.R. 1842(a).

Amended by R.1988 d.155, effective April 4, 1988.

See: 20 N.J.R. 824(d).

Added (d). This was amended by the rule adoption of the Depart-
ment of Education published in the New Jersey Register at 20 N.J.R.
824(d).

Administrative Correction to (c).

See: 22 N.J.R. 2503(b).

Amended by R.1990 d.507, effective October 15, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 2208(a), 22 N.J.R. 3214(a).

Text conformed to P.L. 1990, c.23, qualified agencies may perform
plan review of public school structures.

Amended by R.1991 d.309, effective June 17, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 1084(a), 23 N.J.R. 1922(a).

Rule conformed to P.L. 1990 c. 23; text at (c) revised to specify type
of project covered; BOCA cites updated; reference to N.J.A.C. 6:22
added.

Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a).

Amended by R.1997 d.417, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 N.J.R. 3387(a), 29 N.J.R. 4285(a).

Deleted (a); recodified former (b) through (e) as (a) through (d); in
(b), Inserted “Prior to the release ... of projects,”; in (b)1 and 2,
inserted “public” preceding “school buildings”; in (c)7, deleted option
of inspecting agency requiring subsequent correction of any errors in
the plans, inserted second sentence, and in third sentence amended
notice provisions.

Amended by R.1998 d.332, effective July 6, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 1377(a), 30 N.J.R. 2421(b).

In (d), substituted “alarm” for “detection”, changed BOCA reference
and substituted a reference to (d)5ii for a reference to (e)5ii in 5, and
changed BOCA in 6.

Amended by R.2000 d.166, effective April 17, 2000.
See: 31 N.J.R. 4151(a), 32 N.J.R. 1376(a).

Rewrote the section.

Amended by R.2001 d.127, effective April 16, 2001.
See: 33 N.J.R. 392(a), 33 N.J.R. 1195(a).

In (a)3, substituted “instructional spaces, the size of any such spaces”
for “units” and substituted “such” for “ instructional”.
Administrative change.

See: 33 N.J.R. 4101(a).

5:23-3.11B Underground storage tank systems

(a) The installation, repair (other than “minor repair,” as
defined in N.J.A.C. 7:14B-10.5), and closure (or “demoli-
tion”) of underground storage tank systems, as defined in
N.J.A.C. 7:14B-10.1, shall be controlled by the State Uni-
form Construction Code and by N.J.A.C. 7:14B-1 through
15.

(b) A DEP permit for the installation, repair or closure
of an underground storage tank system that requires a DEP
approval, or any part thereof, or an emergency permit
granted pursuant to N.J.A.C. 7:14B, shall be a prior approv-
al for any permit application submitted pursuant to the
State Uniform Construction Code Act and these rules.
Applicants installing secondarily contained systems for
which no prior DEP approval is necessary shall be required

New Jersey State Library

23-43

to submit engineering drawings of the secondarily contained
systems and to certify that the underground storage tank
system meets all requirements of N.J.A.C. 7:14B.

(c) Construction code officials shall retain all penalty
powers, as set forth in these rules, with respect to the
installation, usage or closure (demolition) of underground
storage tank systems and parts thereof in violation of the
State Uniform Construction Code Act or these rules.

(d) The following types of underground storage tank
systems requiring a construction permit are exempt from the
requirements of N.J.A.C. 7:14B:

1. Farm or residential tanks of 1,100 gallons or less
capacity used for storing motor fuel for noncommercial
purposes;

2. Tanks with a capacity of 2,000 gallons or less used
to store heating oil for onsite consumption in a nonresi-
dential building;

3. Tanks used to store heating oil for onsite consump-
tion in a residential building;

4. Septic tanks installed in compliance with rules
adopted by DEP pursuant to P.L. 1954, c.199 (N.J.S.A.
58:11-23 et seq.);

5. Tanks situated in an underground area, including,
but not limited to, basements, cellars, mines, drift shafts,
or tunnels, if the storage tank is situated upon or above
the surface of the floor;

6. Tanks situated in an underground area, including,
but not limited to, basements, cellars, mines, drift shafts,
or tunnels, if the storage tank is equipped with secondary
containment and is uncovered so as to allow visual inspec-
tion of the exterior of the tank;

7. Wastewater treatment tanks;
8. Electrical equipment;
9. Hydraulic lift tanks; and

10. Any pipes, lines, fixtures, or other equipment con-
nected to any tank exempted from the provisions of
N.J.A.C. 7:14B as set forth in (b)1 to 9 above.

New Rule, R.1990 d.562, effective November 19, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 2629(c), 22 N.J.R. 3482(d).
Amended by R.1997 d.409, effective October 6, 1997.
See: 29 NJ.R. 2736(a), 29 N.J.R. 4281(a).
In (d)3, deleted maximum capacity for tanks of 2000 gallons.
Amended by R.1998 d.332, effective July 6, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 1377(a), 30 N.J.R. 2421(b).
In (d)3, deleted “with a capacity of 2000 gallons or less” following
“Tanks”.

5:23-3.12 Amended rules

Whenever the Commissioner shall make any modifica-
tions to the rules, notice of same shall be published in the
New Jersey Register.

Supp. 5-5-03



5:23-3.12

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Amended by R.1995 d.544, effective October 16, 1995.
See: 27 N.J.R. 2827(a), 27 N.J.R. 3933(a).
Amended by R.2000 d.413, effective October 16, 2000.
See: 32 N.J.R. 2278(a), 32 N.J.R. 3783(a).

Rewrote the section.

5:23-3.13 State-sponsored code change proposals

(a) Any municipality, other political subdivision, or agen-
cy of the State seeking to submit a “State-sponsored code
change proposal” shall do so not less than 90 days prior to
the code change meeting of the model code adoption agency
for which the amendment is proposed.

(b) Such proposal shall be on a form provided by the
model code organization where one is available. If none is
available, such proposal shall state the name and address of
the official proposing the code change, the agency or politi-
cal subdivision represented, the text of the amendment
suggested and an explanation of the amendment together
with any technical justification deemed necessary by the
proponents.

(c) A hearing shall thereafter be held in accordance with
N.J.S.A. 52:27D-124 of the Act.

(d) Copies of the submitted applications for code change
proposals, transcripts of hearings on such applications and
State-sponsored code change proposals as adopted, shall be
available from the department at a fee of $.50 per page.

(e) Whenever a model code change hearing is scheduled
so as not to permit adequate time to meet the procedures
set forth in this section and in N.J.S.A. 52:27D-124 of the
Act, the Commissioner may hold a hearing and require the
advice of the code advisory board within a lesser time
period, as the situation dictates.

5:23-3.14 Building subcode
(a) Rules concerning the building subcode are as follows:

1. Pursuant to authority of P.L. 1975, c.217, as modi-
fied by P.L. 1996, c¢.53, the Commissioner hereby adopts
the model code of the International Code Council, Inter-
national Building Code, known as the “IBC/2000.” This
code is hereby adopted by reference as the building
subcode for New Jersey subject to the modifications
stated in (b) below.

i. Copies of this code may be-obtained from the
International Code Council at 4051 West Flossmoor
Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois 60478-5795.

ii. The IBC/2000, as amended, may be known and
cited as the “building subcode.”

2. Any references to the mechanical code, plumbing
code, International Residential Code, ICC A117.1 stan-
dard (including reference to Chapter 11) or the ICC
Electrical Code listed in Chapter 35 shall be considered a
reference to the appropriate adopted mechanical, plumb-
ing, one-and two-family dwelling or electrical subcode
referenced in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3 or to the barrier free
subcode, N.J.A.C. 5:23-7, as appropriate.

Supp. 5-5-03

(b) The following chapters of the building subcode are
“modified as follows:

1. Chapter 1, Administration, shall be deleted in its
entirety. In addition, any referenced section of Chapter 1
shall be deleted throughout the code and “the administra-
tive provisions of the Uniform Construction Code
(N.J.A.C. 5:23)” shall be inserted.

2. Chapter 2, Definitions, shall be amended as fol-
lows:

i. The definition of “addition,” shall be deleted.

ii. In the definition of agricultural buildings, “A
structure qualifying under the Uniform Construction
Code definition of a Commercial Farm Building may be
built according to the regulations at N.J.A.C.
5:23-3.2(d)” shall be inserted after the last sentence.

iii. The definition of “alteration” shall be deleted.

iv. The definition of “building” shall be deleted and
the following shall be inserted: “BUILDING. A struc-
ture enclosed with exterior walls or fire walls, built,
erected and framed of component structural parts, de-
signed for the housing shelter, enclosure and support of
individuals, animals or property of any kind. When used
herein, building and structure shall be interchangeable
except where the context clearly indicates otherwise.”

v. The definition of “building line” shall be deleted.

vi. The definition of “building official” shall be
deleted and the following shall be inserted: “BUILD-
ING SUBCODE OFFICIAL. A qualified person ap-
pointed by the municipal appointing authority or the
commissioner pursuant to the act and the regulations to
enforce the provisions of the building subcode within
the jurisdiction of the enforcing agency.”

vii. The definitions of “existing structure,” “historic
building,” and “jurisdiction” shall be deleted.

vili. The definition of “owner” shall be deleted and
the following shall be inserted: “OWNER. The owner
or owners in fee of the property of a lesser estate
therein, a mortgagee or vendee in possession, an assign-
ee of rents, receiver, executor, trustee, lessee or any
other person, firm or corporation, directly or indirectly
in control of a building, structure or real property and
shall include any subdivision thereof of the State.”

2”&

ix. The definitions of “permit,
pair” shall be deleted.

person,” and “re-

x. The definition of “structure” shall be deleted and
the following shall be inserted: “STRUCTURE. A com-
bination of materials to form a construction for occu-
pancy, use, or ornamentation, whether installed on,
above, or below the surface of a parcel of land; provid-
ed the word ”structure shall be construed when used
herein as though followed by the phrase ”or part or
parts thereof and all equipment therein“ unless the
context clearly requires a different meaning.

23-44



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.14

3. Chapter 3, Use and Occupancy Classification, shall

be amended as follows:

i. In Section 302.3.3, Separated uses, the first sen-
tence of Exception 2 shall be deleted and the following
shall be inserted: “A private garage located beneath a
room(s) shall have walls, partitions, floors, and ceilings
separating the garage from the adjacent interior spaces
constructed with not less than a one-hour fire resistance
rating. Attached private garages shall be completely
separated from the adjacent interior spaces and the
attic area by a means of %-inch gypsum board or
equivalent applied to the garage side.”

ii. In Table 302.3.3, Required Separation of Occu-
pancies (Hours)?, Use Group U shall be deleted.

iii. Section 308.2, Group I-1, shall be amended as
follows: In the first sentence, “16” shall be deleted and
“5” shall be inserted. In the second sentence, “respond-
ing to” shall be deleted and “slow evacuation as defined
in Section 22-1.3 of NFPA 101-97, referenced in Chap-
ter 35, in” shall be inserted. In the third sentence,
“residential board and care facilities, assisted living
facilities” shall be deleted and “boarding houses” shall
be inserted. In the same sentence, “abuse” shall be
inserted after “drug.” Also, “A facility such as above,
housing at least six and not more than 16 persons shall
be classified as a Group R—4” shall be deleted and the
following definition of “boarding house” shall be insert-
ed:

be classified as Group I-4.” In the same section, the
exception shall be deleted.

viii. Section 310, Residential Group R, shall be
deleted and the following definitions shall be inserted:

“(1) R-1 Residential occupancies where the occu-
pants are primarily transient (less than 30 days)
including:

Hotels (including motels) having transient occupancy

Rooming houses, with more than five residents, having
transient occupancy

(2) R-2 Residential occupancies containing more
than two dwelling units where the occupants are
primarily permanent in nature, including:

Apartment houses

Convents

Dormitories

Fraternity and sorority houses

Monasteries

Rooming houses with more than five residents, not having
transient occupancy

“Boarding House: A building arranged or used for single

occupancy where meals or personal or financial services are Therapeutic residences with more than 16 residents
provided to the residents.”

(3) R-3 Detached one-and two-family dwellings
greater than three stories in height, multiple single-
family townhouses greater than three stories in
height, and attached two-family dwellings separated
from adjacent units by firewalls, including:

iv. In Section 308.3, Group I-2, “who are not capa-
ble of self-preservation” shall be deleted and “where
evacuation is impractical as defined in Section 22-1.3 of
NFPA 101-97, referenced in Chapter 35” shall be
inserted. In the second sentence, a comma shall be
inserted after “to” and “assisted living facilities” shall

be inserted before “mental hospitals.” Single residential occupancies, accessory to a dwelling

unit, having no more than five roomers or lodgers. (Single

v. In Section 308.5, Group 14, in the second sen-  occupancies, accessory to a dwelling unit, having more than
tence, “with” shall be deleted and “accessory to a  five roomers or lodgers shall be classified as Group R-2 or
dwelling unit and having” shall be inserted. I-1, as appropriate.)

vi. In Section 308.5.1, Adult Care Facility, “accom-
modations for less than 24 hours for more than five
unrelated adults and provides” shall be deleted, “ser-

Adult and child day care facilities, accessory to a dwelling
unit, serving five or fewer persons of any age for less than 24

vices” shall be deleted after “care,” and the following ~ DOUIS.

shall be inserted: “on less than a 24-hour basis where . o .

evacuation is slow or impractical as defined in Section Rooming houses with five or fewer residents.

22-1.3 of NFPA 101-97, referenced in Chapter 35, shall . . o )

be classified as Group I-4. Where evacuation is Therapeutic residences with five or fewer residents.

prompt, the facility shall be classified as Group A-3.” (4) R—4 Therapeutic residences including more
vii. Section 308.5.2, Child Care Facility, shall be than five but not more than 16 occupants, excluding

deleted and the following shall be inserted: “A facility staff, capable of prompt evacuation as defined by

that provides supervision and personal care on less than Section 22-1.3 of NFPA 101-97, referenced in Chap-

a 24-hour basis for children 2% years of age or less shall ter 35.

23-45 Supp. 5-5-03



5:23-3.14 COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Group R—4 occupancies shall meet the requirements for i
construction as defined for Group R-3 except as otherwise

Table 503, Allowable Heights and Building Ar-
eas, shall be amended as follows:

Supp. 5-5-03

provided in the code.

(5) R-5 Detached one-and two-family dwellings
not more than three stories in height and multiple
single-family townhouses not more than three stories
in height designed and constructed in accordance
with the International Residential Code.*

4. Section 310.2, Definitions, shall be amended as

follows:

i. The definition of “Boarding House” shall be de-
leted in its entirety.

ii. In the first sentence of the definition of “Dwell-
ing Unit,” “living as a single housekeeping unit” shall
be inserted after “persons” and before “including.”

iii. The definition of “Personal Care Service” shall
be deleted in its entirety.

iv. The definition of “Residential Care/Assisted Liv-
ing Facilities” shall be deleted in its entirety.

v. The definition of “Rooming House” shall be
inserted as follows: “Rooming House: A building ar-
ranged or used for single occupancy where no meals or
personal or financial services are provided to the resi-
dents.”

vi. The definition of “Single Residential Occupan-
cy” shall be inserted as follows: “Single Residential
Occupancy: A building arranged or used for individual
residency by persons living independently of one anoth-
er, regardless of whether the residents share the use of
common facilities, such as kitchen or bathing facilities.”

vii. The definition of “Therapeutic Residence” shall
be inserted as follows: “Therapeutic Residence: A resi-
dence for adults, each of whom is capable of prompt
evacuation as defined by Section 22-1.3 of NFPA
101-97, referenced in Chapter 35, and who live within a
single dwelling unit for therapeutic purposes, without a
resident landlord or operator, but with some govern-
ment or private social service provider oversight.”

viii. The definition of “Transient Occupancy” shall
be inserted as follows: “Transient Occupancy: A resi-
dential occupancy where no more than fifteen percent
of the residents occupy the residency for more than 90
days.”

5. Chapter 4, Special Detailed Requirements Based
on Use and Occupancy, shall be amended as follows:

i. In Section 402.4.2, Number of Means of Egress,
“used by persons other than employees” shall be delet-
ed.

6. Chapter 5, General Building Heights and Areas,

shall be amended as follows:

23-46

(1) Under construction Type VA for Group A-1,
“2” shall be deleted and “1” shall be inserted.

(2) Under construction Type IB for Group A-2,
“11” shall be deleted and “3” shall be inserted.
Under construction Types IIA and IIB for Group
A-2, “3” and “2” shall be deleted and “2” and “1”
shall be inserted, respectively. Under construction
Types IIIA and IIIB for Group A-2, “3” and “2”
shall be deleted and “2” and “1” shall be inserted,
respectively. In addition, under construction Type IV
for Group A-2, “3” shall be deleted and “2” shall be
inserted. Finally, under construction Type VA for
Group A-2, “2” shall be deleted and “1” shall be
inserted.

(3) Under construction Type IB for Group A-3,
“11” shall be deleted and “5” shall be inserted. In
addition, under construction Type VA for Group
A-3, “2” shall be deleted and “1” shall be inserted.

(4) Under construction Type IB for Group A—4,
“11” shall be deleted and “5” shall be inserted. In
addition, under construction Type VA for Group
A4, “2” shall be deleted and “1” shall be inserted.

(5) The maximum number of stories and maxi-
mum allowable area for Group A-5, construction
Types IIIB, IV, VA and VB shall be deleted.

(6) Under construction Type IB for Group B, “11”
shall be deleted and “7” shall be inserted. In addi-
tion, under construction Type IIB for Group B, “4”
shall be deleted and “3” shall be inserted. Finally,
under construction Type IIIA and IIIB for Group B,
“5” and “4” shall be deleted and “4” and “3” shall be
inserted, respectively.

(7) Under construction Type IB for Group F-1,
“11” shall be deleted and “6” shall be inserted.

(8) Under construction Type IB for Group F-2,
“11” shall be deleted and “7” shall be inserted.

(9) The maximum number of stories and maxi-
mum allowable area for Group H-2, construction
Type VB shall be deleted and “NP” shall be inserted.

(10) Under construction Type IIIA for Group
H-3, “4” shall be deleted and “3” shall be inserted.

(11) 'Under construction Type IIIA for Group
H-4, “5” shall be deleted and “4” shall be inserted.

(12) The maximum number of stories and the
maximum allowable area for Group I-3, construction
Type VB shall be deleted and “NP” shall be inserted.



S~

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.14

(13) Under construction Type IB for Group M,
“11” shall be deleted and “6” shall be inserted.
Under construction Type IIB for Group M, “4” shall
be deleted and “2” shall be inserted. In addition,
under construction Types IITIA and IIIB, “4” shall be
deleted and “3” and “2” shall be inserted, respective-
ly. Finally, under construction Type VA, “3” shall be
deleted and “2” shall be inserted.

(14) Under construction Type IB for Group R-1,
“11” shall be deleted and “9” shall be inserted. In
addition, under construction Type IIB for Group
R-1, “4” shall be deleted and “3” shall be inserted.
Finally, under construction Type IIIB for Group R-1,
“4” shall be deleted and “3” shall be inserted.

(15) Under construction Type IB for Group R-2,
“11” shall be deleted and “9” shall be inserted. In
addition, under construction Type IIB for R-2, “4”
shall be deleted and “3” shall be inserted. Finally,
under construction Type IIIB for Group R-2, “4”
shall be deleted and “3” shall be inserted.

(16) Under construction Type IB for Group R-3,
“11” shall be deleted and “4” shall be inserted.
Under construction Type IIB for Group R-3, “4”
shall be deleted and “3” shall be inserted. In addi-
tion, under construction Type IIIB for Group R-3,
“4” shall be deleted and “3” shall be inserted. Final-
ly, under construction Type VB for Group R-3, “3”
shall be deleted and “2” shall be inserted.

(17) Under construction Type IB for Group R-4,
“11” shall be deleted and “4” shall be inserted.
Under construction Type IIB for Group R4, “4”
shall be deleted and “3” shall be inserted. In addi-
tion, under construction Type IIIB for Group R4,
“4” shall be deleted and “3” shall be inserted. Final-
ly, under construction Type VB for Group R-4, “3”
shall be deleted and “2” shall be inserted.

(21) At the end of the table, after “UL = Un-
limited,” “NP = Not permitted” shall be inserted.

ii. Section 507.1, Unsprinklered, one story, shall be
deleted in its entirety.

ifli. Section 507.3, Two-story, shall be amended as
follows: In the first sentence, “building of Type I or
Type II construction under ” shall be inserted after
“two-story.”

7. Chapter 6, Types of Construction, shall be amend-

ed as follows:

i. In Table 602, Fire Resistance Rating Require-
ments for Exterior Walls Based on Fire Separation
Distance?, “U” shall be deleted from the heading of the
fifth column. In addition, in the same table, at Note b,
“and Group U when used as an accessory to Group
R3” shall be deleted.

ii. In Section 602.3, Type III, the last sentence shall
be deleted.

8. Chapter 7, Fire-Resistance-Rated Construction,

shall be amended as follows:

i. In Table 705.4, Fire Wall Fire Resistance Ratings,
under the heading “Group,” “U” shall be deleted.

ii. Section 705.5, Horizontal continuity, shall be de-
leted in its entirety. Section 707.6 of the 1996 BOCA
National Building Code shall be inserted as follows:
“Horizontal Continuity. Firewalls shall be made smoke
tight at the junction of exterior walls. In exterior wall
construction employing studs, the wall shall extend
through the stud space to the exterior sheathing.”

iili. Section 707.14.1, Elevator lobby, shall be -
amended as follows: In the first sentence, “In buildings
having occupied floors greater than 75 feet above the
lowest level of fire department vehicle access” shall be
inserted before “elevators.” In the same section, Excep-

tion 4 shall be deleted in its entirety.
(18) Under construction Type IB for Group S-1,

“11” shall be deleted and “5” shall be inserted.
Under construction Type IIB for Group S-1, “3”
shall be deleted and “2” shall be inserted. In addi- i. In Section 903.2.5, Group I, the exception shall be
tion, under construction Type IIIB for Group S-1, deleted and the following shall be inserted: “Exceptions
“3” shall be deleted and “2” shall be inserted. Final-

ly, under construction Type VA for Group S-1, “3” 1. For other than buildings of construction Types IIIB
shall be deleted and “2” shall be inserted. and VB, an automatic fire sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.2. shall be allowed in Group
[-1 facilities.

9. Chapter 9, Fire Protection Systems, shall be amend-
ed as follows:

(19) Under construction Type IB for Group S-2,
“11” shall be deleted and “7” shall be inserted.
Under construction Type IIB for Group S-2, “4” 2. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall not be re-
shall be deleted and “3” shall be inserted. In addi-  quired for Group I-4 child care facilities that are located at
tion, under construction Type IIIB for Group S-2,  the level of exit discharge and that accommodate 100 or

“4” shall be deleted and “3” shall be inserted. Final-  fewer children and in which each child care room has an exit
ly, under construction Type VA for Group S-2, “4”  door directly to the exterior.”

shall be deleted and “3” shall be inserted. . . .
ii. Section 903.2.8, Group R-2, shall be deleted in

(20) Use Group U shall be deleted. its entirety. Section 904.9 of the 1996 BOCA National

23-47 Supp. 5-5-03



5:23-3.14

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Building Code shall be inserted as follows: “Group
R-2: An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provid-
ed throughout all buildings with an occupancy in Group
R-2 in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2:

Exception: Buildings that do not exceed two stories
including basements, which are not considered a story
above grade, and with a maximum of 12 dwelling units
per fire area. Each dwelling unit shall have at least one
door opening to an exterior exit access that leads directly
to the exits required to serve the dwelling unit.“

ifi. In Section 903.2.9, Group R—4, the reference to
“Section 903.3.1.3” shall be deleted.

iv. Section 903.2.12.1, Stories and basements with-
out openings, shall be deleted in its entirety and Section
904.10 of the 1996 BOCA National Building Code shall
be inserted as follows: “Windowless story: An automat-
ic fire sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
every story or basement of all buildings where there is
not provided at least one of the following types of
openings:

1. An exterior stairway that conforms to the require-
ments of Section 1005.3.6, or an outside ramp that conforms
to the requirements of Section 1003.3.4, leading directly to
grade in each 50 linear feet (15240 mm) or fraction thereof
of exterior wall in the story or basement, on at least one side
of the building.

2. Openings entirely above the adjoining ground level
totaling 20 square feet (1.9 m?) in each 50 linear feet (15240
mm) or fraction thereof of exterior wall in the story or
basement, on at least one side of the building. Openings
shall have a least dimension of not less than 22 inches (559
mm), and shall have a minimum net clear opening of 5
square feet (0.5 m?). Access to such openings from the
exterior shall be provided to the fire department and such
openings shall be unobstructed to allow fire fighting and
rescue operations from the exterior.

Where openings in a story are provided on only one side
and the opposite wall of such story is more than 75 feet
(22860 mm) from such openings, the story shall be equipped
throughout with an automatic fire sprinkler system or open-
ings as specified herein shall be provided on at least two
sides of the exterior walls of the story. If any portion of a
basement is located more than 75 feet (22860 mm) from the
openings required in this section, the basement shall be
equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system.

Exception: Occupancies in Group R-3.”

v. New Section 903.2.16, Automatic sprinkler sys-
tem thresholds, shall be inserted as follows: “An auto-
matic sprinkler system shall be required in accordance
with Section 903.3.1.1 when the maximum area is ex-
ceeded for the following construction types of Groups
B, F-2, and S-2 according to table 903.2.16, Automatic
Sprinkler System Thresholds. All others not listed shall
follow the applicable requirements as set forth in the
IBC/2000.”

Supp. 5-5-03

23-48

“Automatic Sprinkler System Thresholds

Group
B
IIB 1B VB
Story Max. Area Max. Area Max. Area
1 36,000 * *
2 72,000 * *
(36,000
per floor)
3 99,360 99,360 *
(36,000 (36,000
per floor) per floor)
Group
F-2
IIB I11B VB
Story Max. Area Max. Area Max. Area
1 36,000 * 18,000
2 72,000 * 36,000
(36,000 (18,000
per floor) per floor)
3 99,360 * *
(36,000
per floor)
Group
S-2a
IIB I11B VB
Story Max. Area Max. Area Max. Area
1 36,000 36,000 18,000
2 72,000 72,000 36,000
(36,000 (36,000 (18,000
per floor) per floor) per floor)
3 99,360 99,360 *
(36,000 (36,000
per floor) per floor)

a. Exception—Open parking structures in accordance with
Section 406.3
*Requirements as set forth in the IBC/2000%

vi. Section 903.3.2, Quick response and residential
sprinklers, shall be deleted in its entirety.

vii. In Section 905.2, Installation standards, Sections
915.4, 915.5, and 915.6 of the 1996 BOCA National
Building Code shall be inserted as follows: “905.2.1
Piping design. The riser piping, supply piping and the
water service piping shall be sized to maintain a residu-
al pressure of at least 65 psi (448 kPa) at the topmost
outlet of each riser while flowing the minimum quanti-
ties of water specified in Sections 905.2.1.1 and
905.2.1.2. The pipe size shall be based on the capacity
of the automatic water supply system or, where an
automatic water supply is neither required nor provided
to maintain the residual pressure of 65 psi (448 kPa),
the pipe size shall be based on a pressure of 150 psi
(1,034 kPa) available at the fire department connection.

Exception: The residual pressure of 65 psi (448 kPa) is
not required in buildings equipped throughout with an
automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section
903.3.1.1 and where the highest floor level is not more than
150 feet (45720 mm) above the lowest level of fire depart-
ment vehicle access.

Next Page is 23-48.1



~

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.14

905.2.1.1 Riser sizing: The riser size shall be based on
hydraulic calculations for a minimum flow of 500 gallons per
minute (gpm) (1892 L/min.).

Exceptions:

1. Where only 1%-inch valves are provided, the riser(s)
shall be sized to provide a minimum flow of 100 gpm (378
L/min.).

2. In buildings where limited area sprinkler systems are
supplied with water from a common standpipe riser, the
riser shall be sized to satisfy total demand.

3. For occupancies in Group B, I, R-1 or R-2 in
buildings that are equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system in accordance with Section 906.2.1, each
riser shall be sized for a minimum flow of 250 gpm (945
L/min.).

4. Risers that are sized in accordance with the pipe
schedule requirements of NFPA 14 listed in Chapter 35 are
not subject to this requirement.

905.2.1.2 System pipe sizing: The system piping, includ-
ing the horizontal or common feeder lines shall be sized for
a minimum flow of 500 gpm (1,892 L/min.). Where more
than one standpipe riser is required or provided, all com-
mon system piping shall be sized for a minimum flow of 500
gpm (1892 L/min.) for the first riser plus 250 gpm (945
L/min.) for each additional riser, and the total shall not be
required to exceed 1,250 gpm (4731 L/min.).

Exceptions

1. Where only 1%-inch valves are provided, the supply
piping shall be sized for a minimum flow of 100 gpm (378
L/min.) for each riser, and the total shall not be required to
exceed 500 gpm (1892 L/min.).

2. In buildings where limited area sprinkler systems are
supplied with water from a common standpipe riser, the
supply piping shall be sized for a minimum flow of 500 gpm
(1892 L/min.) plus the sprinkler demand for the first riser,
plus 250 gpm (945 L/min.) for each additional riser, and the
total shall not be required to exceed 1,250 gpm (4731
L/min.).

3. For occupancies in Group B, I, R-1 or R-2 in
buildings that are equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, all
common supply piping shall be sized for a minimum flow of
250 gpm (945 L/min.) for the first riser plus 250 gpm (945
L/min.) for each additional riser, and the total shall not be
required to exceed 750 gpm (2838 L/min.).

905.2.2 Water supply: A water supply for fire depart-
ment equipment shall be available to the building site. The
water supply shall be capable of a minimum flow as required
by Section 905.2.1.2 for a duration of 30 minutes.

23-48.1

905.2.2.1 Automatic water supply: An automatic water
supply is required for all standpipe systems. The automatic
water supply and supply piping shall be capable of delivering
a flow of 500 gpm (1892 L/min.) at the residual pressure
specified in Section 905.2.1 for a duration of 30 minutes.

Exceptions

1. In buildings equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section
903.3.1.1 where the highest floor is located not more than
150 feet (45720 mm) above the lowest level of fire depart-
ment vehicle access, the automatic water supply is not
required to exceed the requirements of NFPA 13 listed in
Chapter 35.

2. Dry standpipe systems installed in open parking struc-
tures.

905.2.2.2 Interconnection: The required water supply
shall be connected to the base of each standpipe riser.
Where more than one standpipe riser is required, all risers
shall be interconnected with a common supply line. An
approved indicating valve shall be installed to permit indi-
vidual risers to be taken out of service.”

905.2.3 Control valves: Where a standpipe system riser
also serves as the automatic sprinkler system riser in build-
ing required to have both systems or in buildings having
both systems, sprinkler control valves shall be installed at
each floor level at the connection to the riser.

viii. In Section 905.4, Location of class I standpipe
hose connections, Items 1 and 2 shall be deleted in
their entirety. Section 915.7 of the 1996 BOCA Nation-
al Building Code shall be inserted as follows: “A stand-
pipe hose connection shall be located at each floor level
at every exit stairway, and on each side of the wall
adjacent to the exit opening of a horizontal exit.

Exceptions

1. Where the floor area adjacent to a horizontal exit
stairway outlets by a 30—foot (9,144 mm) hose stream from a
nozzle attached to 100 feet (30,480 mm) of hose, a hose
connection shall not be required at the horizontal exit.

2. Standpipe hose connections for systems required by
Section 905.3.2. shall be permitted to be located only at exits
such that all portions of the building floor area are not more
than 200 feet (60,960 mm) from a hose connection or 200
feet (122 m) from the nearest point of fire department
vehicle access.*

ix. Section 905.4.2, Interconnection, shall be deleted
in its entirety and Section 915.7.1 of the 1996 BOCA
National Building Code shall be inserted as follows
“905.4.2 Location: At each floor level and not more
than 5 feet (1,524 mm) above the floor, there shall be
connected to each standpipe a 2% inch hose connection

Supp. 5-5-03



5:23-3.14

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

with valves and threads compatible with the connec-
tions used by the local fire department.”

x. Section 906.0, Portable Fire Extinguishers, shall
be deleted in its entirety and new Section 906.0, enti-
tled “Fire Department Connections,” from Section
916.0 of the 1996 BOCA National Building Code shall
be inserted as follows: “906.1 Required: All required
water fire-extinguishing and standpipe systems shall be
provided with a fire department connection in accor-
dance with the applicable standards. Standpipes in
buildings under construction or demolition shall con-
form to Section 3311.

Exceptions

1. Limited area sprinkler systems supplied from the
domestic water system.

2. Where the local fire department approves a single
connection for a large diameter hose of at least four inches
(102 mm).

3. An automatic sprinkler system with less than 20 sprin-
Kklers.

906.2 Connections: Fire department connections shall be
arranged in such a manner that the attachment to any one
sprinkler connection will serve all sprinklers, and the attach-
ment to any one standpipe connection will serve all stand-
pipes within the building.

Exception: Fire protection systems in high rise buildings
designed with a low zone and a high zone may be provided
with a connection for each zone.

906.3 Location: Fire department connections shall be
located and shall be visible on a street front or on a location
approved by the fire department. Such connections shall be
located so that immediate access is provided to the fire
department. Fire department connections shall not be ob-
structed by fences, bushes, trees, walls, or any other similar
object.

906.4 Height: Fire department connections shall not be
less than 18 inches (457 mm) and more than 42 inches
(1,067 mm) in elevation, measured from the ground level to
the centerline of the inlets.

906.5 Projection: Where the fire department connection
will otherwise project beyond the property line or into the
public way, a flush-type fire department connection shall be
provided.

906.6 Hose thread: Hose thread in the fire department

connection shall be uniform with that used by the local fire
department.

Supp. 5-5-03

23-48.2

906.7 Fittings: Fire department inlet connection shall be

fitted with check valves, ball drip valves and plugs with

chains or frangible clips.

906.8 Signs: A metal sign with raised letters at least one
inch (25 mm) in height shall be mounted on all fire depart-
ment connections serving sprinklers or standpipes. Such
signs shall read “Automatic Sprinklers” or “Standpipes,” or
both, as applicable.”

xi. Section 907.2.10.1.4, Additions, alterations, or
repairs to Group R, shall be deleted in its entirety.

xii. In Section 907.2.10.3, Interconnection, Excep-
tion 2 shall be deleted in its entirety.

xiii. In Section 909.18.8.3, Reports, “The report
shall be reviewed by the registered design professional
and, when satisfied that the design intent has been
achieved, the responsible registered design professional
shall seal, sign, and date the report” shall be deleted.

10. Chapter 10, Means of Egress, shall be amended as
follows:

i. In Section 1003.3.1.3.5, Security grilles, “In
Groups B, F, M, and S” shall be deleted and “horizon-
tal” shall be capitalized.

ii. Section 1003.3.1.8, Locks and latches, shall be
amended as follows: In Exception 2, “Group A having
an occupant load of 300 or less” shall be deleted. In the
same section, Exception 5 shall be inserted as follows:
“5. Key operation shall be permitted from a dwelling
unit provided that the key cannot be removed from the
lock when the door is locked from the side from which
egress is made.”

iii. In Section 1003.3.1.8.2, Delayed egress locks,
“E” shall be deleted.

iv. In Section 1004.2.2.1, Two exit or exit access
doorways, the last sentence of Exception 1 shall be
deleted.

v. Section 1004.2.3, Egress through intervening
spaces, shall be deleted in its entirety. Section 1006.2.1
of the 1996 BOCA National Building Code shall be
inserted as follows: “Egress through adjoining spaces:
Egress from a room or a space shall not pass through
adjoining or intervening rooms or areas, except where
such adjoining rooms or areas are accessory to the area
served; are not a high-hazard occupancy; and provide a
discernable path of travel to an exit. A maximum of one
exit access shall be permitted to pass through a kitchen,
storeroom, restroom, closet or similar space provided
that a passage through such space is not the only means
of access to an exit. An exit access shall not pass
through a room subject to locking. Means of egress
from dwelling units or sleeping areas shall not lead
through other dwelling units or sleeping areas and shall
not lead through toilet rooms or bathrooms.”

Next Page is 23-48.2.1



N~

N

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.14

vi. In Section 1004.3.2, Corridors, “and passage-
ways” shall be inserted after “corridors.”

vii. In Table 1004.3.2.1, Corridor Fire Resistance
Rating, under the heading “Occupancy,” “U” shall be
deleted from the third row.

viii. In the title of Section 1004.3.2.2, “and passage-
way” shall be inserted after “Corridor.” In addition, in
the first sentence, “or passageway” shall be inserted
after “corridor.”

ix. Section 1004.3.2.3, Dead ends, shall be amended
as follows: In the first sentence “and passageways”
shall be inserted after “corridors.” In Exception 1, “or
passageway” shall be inserted after “corridor.” In Ex-
ception 2, “and passageways” shall be inserted after
“corridors.” In Exception 3, “or passageway” shall be
inserted after each “corridor.”

x. In Table 1005.2.2, Buildings with One Exit, under
the heading “Occupancy,” “U” shall be deleted from
the first row.

xi. In Section 1005.3.2, Vertical exit enclosures, Ex-
ception 1 shall be deleted and the following shall be
inserted: “1. In other than Group H and I occupan-
cies, a stairway connecting not more than two floor
levels, one of which is the level of exit discharge, which
serves an occupant load of not more than 10 or serves
four or fewer dwelling units is not required to be
enclosed.” In the same section, Exception 8 shall be
deleted.

xii. Section 1005.3.5, Horizontal exits, shall be delet-
ed in its entirety. Section 1019.0 of the 1996 BOCA
National Building Code shall be inserted as follows:
“Horizontal Exits

1005.3.5 General: Horizontal exits shall be accepted as
an approved exit element of a required means of egress.
The connection between an area of a building that the
horizontal exit serves and the area of refuge as herein
required shall be accomplished by protected openings in a
fire-resistance rated wall, or by an open-air balcony or
bridge.

1005.3.5.1 Separation: The separation between buildings
or areas of refuge connected by a horizontal exit shall be
provided by at least a two-hour fire-resistance rated firewall
or fire separation assembly with approved opening protec-
tives complying with Chapter 7 and Table 602.

1005.3.5.2 Doors: All doors shall swing in the direction
of egress travel. Where the horizontal exit serves as an exit
from both sides of the wall, there shall be adjacent openings
with swinging fire doors opening in opposite directions.

Exception: Horizontal sliding doors complying with Sec-
tion 1003.3.1.3.3.

23-48.2.1

1005.3.5.3 Area of refuge: The discharge area of a hori-
zontal exit shall be either public areas or spaces occupied by
the same tenant, and each such area of refuge shall be
adequate to hold the total occupant load of both connected
areas. The capacity of areas of refuge shall be computed on
a minimum net floor area allowance for each occupant to be
accommodated therein, not including areas of stairways,
elevators and other shafts or courts, as follows:

1. 30 square feet (3 m?) per patient for hospitals and
nursing homes.

2. Six square feet (0.56 m?) per occupant on stories not
housing patients confined to a bed or litter in an occupancy
in Group I-2.

3. Six square feet (0.56 m?) per occupant in an occupan-
cy in Group I-3.

4. Three square feet (0.28 m?) in all other cases.

1005.3.5.4 Egress from area of refuge: The path of
egress travel from the horizontal exit through the area of
refuge to another exit shall be continuously available. In
other than occupancies in Group I-3, there shall be at least
one exit on each side of the horizontal exit, which is not a
horizontal exit. Any area of refuge not having access to an
exit, other than a horizontal exit, shall be considered as part
of an adjoining area of refuge with such exit. In the area(s)
served by the horizontal exit, the length of exit access travel
distance to the horizontal exit or another exit shall not
exceed the requirements of Section 1004.2.4.”

xiii. Section 1009.1, General, shall be amended as
follows: In the second sentence, “Basements and” shall
be deleted and “sleeping™ shall be capitalized.

11. Chapter 11, Accessibility, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

12. Chapter 13, Energy Efficiency, shall be deleted in
its entirety.

13. Chapter 15, Roof Assemblies and Rooftop Struc-
tures, shall be amended as follows:

i. In Table 1505.1, Minimum Roof Covering Classi-
fication for Types of Construction, Note a shall be
deleted in its entirety. In addition, at Note b, “and U
occupancies” shall be deleted from the first sentence.

14. Chapter 16, Structural Design, shall be amended
as follows:

i. Section 1603.3, Live loads posted, shall be deleted
in its entirety.

ii. Section 1603.4, Occupancy permits for changed
loads, shall be deleted in its entirety.

iii. New Section 1604.9, General structural integrity,
from Section 1604.2 of the 1996 BOCA National Build-
ing Code, shall be inserted as follows: “The require-

Supp. 5-5-03



5:23-3.14

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 5-5-03

ments for general structural integrity shall be in accor-
dance with Section 1.4 of ASCE 7 listed in Chapter
35.”

iv. In Table 1607.1, Minimum Uniformly Distribut-
ed Live Loads and Minimum Concentrated Live Loads,
at Note g, “building official” shall be deleted and
“design professional” shall be inserted.

v. Section 1607.9, Reduction in live loads, shall be
amended as follows: In the first sentence, “and applied”
shall be inserted after “reduced.” After the first sen-
tence, “The method chosen shall be applied throughout
the building.” shall be inserted.

[13

vi. In Section 1607.9.1.3, Special occupancies, “or
educational occupancies” shall be inserted after “public
assembly occupancies.”

vii. In Section 1607.9.2, Alternate floor live load
reduction, Item 1, “or Group E” shall be inserted after
“Group A.”

viii. Section 1614.1.1, Addition to existing building,
shall be deleted in its entirety.

ix. Section 1614.2, Change of Occupancy, shall be
deleted in its entirety.

x. Section 1614.3, Alterations, shall be deleted in its
entirety.

xi. In Section 1621.1.7, Component anchorage #1,
Item 1 shall be deleted in its entirety.

xii. In Section 1621.3.14, Elevator design require-
ments, at the end of the section, the following shall be
inserted: “The scope of Part XXIV of ASME Al7.1,
entitled “Elevator Safety Requirements for Seismic
Risk Zone 2 or Greater,“ is deleted.”

xiii. In Table 1622.2.5(2), Importance Factor (/) and
Seismic Use Group Classification for Nonbuilding
Structures, at Notes H-II and H-III, “authority having
jurisdiction” shall be deleted and “construction official”
shall be inserted.

15. Chapter 17, Structural Tests and Special Inspec-
tions, shall be amended as follows:

i. In Section 1701.1, Scope, “shall apply to Class I
buildings and” shall be inserted after “chapter.”

ii. Section 1702.1, General, shall be amended as
follows: In the title, “/Special Inspector” shall be insert-
ed after “Agency.” In the first sentence, “or design
professional acting as the approved agency” shall be
inserted after “agency.”

iii. Section 1703.1, Approved agency, shall be
amended as follows: In the first sentence, “Upon the
request of the construction official” shall be inserted
before “An.” In the same sentence, “building official”
shall be deleted and “construction official” shall be
inserted and “applicable” shall be deleted and “follow-
ing” shall be inserted.

23-48.2.2

iv. In Section 1703.7, Evaluation and follow-up in-
spection, “in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-4.26” shall
be inserted after the second “assembly.”

v. Section 1704.1, General, shall be amended as
follows: In the first sentence, “of Class 1 buildings
only” shall be inserted after “construction.” In the
second sentence, “the registered design professional”
shall be deleted and “person” shall be inserted.

vi. Section 1704.1.2, Report requirement, shall be
amended as follows: In the second sentence, “building
official” shall be deleted and “construction official”
shall be inserted and “registered .design professional”
shall be deleted and “person” shall be inserted. In the
same sentence, “in accordance with N.J.A.C

5:23-2.21(c)” shall be inserted after “charge.”

" vii. In Section 1704.3, Steel construction, “the on-

site erection of” shall be inserted after “for.”

viii. In Table 1704.3, Required Verification and In-
spection of Steel Construction, Items 1, 3, and 4 shall
be deleted.

ix. In Section 1704.5, Masonry construction, “in
Seismic Design Category D” shall be inserted after the
second “construction.” In the same section, in Excep-
tion 2, the reference to “Table 1805.5(1)” shall be
deleted.

Xx. Section 1704.6, Wood construction, shall be de-
leted in its entirety.

xi. Section 1704.9, Pier foundations, shall be deleted
in its entirety.

xii. In Section 1705.1, Scope, “for Seismic Design
Category D buildings” shall be inserted after “provid-
ed.”

xiii. Section 1706, Quality Assurance for Wind Reg-
ulations, shall be deleted in its entirety.

xiv. Sections 1708.1, Masonry, 1708.1.1, Empirically
designed masonry and glass unit masonry in nonessen-
tial facilities, 1708.1.2, Empirically designed masonry
and glass unit masonry in essential facilities, 1708.1.3,
Engineered masonry in nonessential facilities, 1708.1.4,
Engineered masonry in essential facilities, 1708.3, Rein-
forcing and pre-stressing steel, 1708.4, Structural tests,
and 1708.5, Mechanical and electrical equipment, shall
be deleted in their entirety.

xv. Section 1709, Structural Observations, shall be
deleted in its entirety.

16. Chapter 18, Soils and Foundations, shall be

amended as follows:

N

)



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.14

i. In the title of Section 1802.2.6, “Seismic Design
Category C” shall be deleted and “Seismic Design
Category D” shall be inserted. In the first sentence, the
reference to “Seismic Design Category C” shall be
deleted and “Seismic Design Category D” shall be
inserted.

ii. New Section 1802.2.8 from Section 1802.1 of the
1996 BOCA National Building Code shall be inserted
as follows: “Building Height: For all buildings that are
more than three stories or 40 feet (12,192 mm) in
height, the building official shall request soil tests.”

iii. Section 1802.4.1, Exploratory boring, shall be
amended as follows: After the first sentence, the follow-
ing sentence from Section 1802.1 of the 1996 BOCA
National Building Code shall be inserted: “There shall
be at least one exploratory boring to rock or to an
adequate depth below the load-bearing strata for every
2,500 square feet (232.5 mm) of built-over area, and
such additional tests as the code official requires.”

iv. In Section 1802.6, Reports, “soil borings are
required” shall be inserted after “Where.”

v. In Section 1805.2.1, Frost protection, “400 square
feet (37 m?)” shall be deleted and “100 square feet
(9.25 m?)” shall be inserted.

vi. In Section 1806.3.1, Floors, “60” shall be deieted
and “6” shall be inserted.

vii. New Section 1806.5 from Section 1813.8 of the
1996 BOCA National Building Code shall be inserted
as follows: “1806.5 Erosion protection: Where water
impacts the ground from the edge of the roof, down-
spout, scupper or other rain water collection or diver-
sion device, provisions shall be made to prevent soil
erosion and direct the water away from the founda-
tion.”

viii. Section 1807.2.6, Spacing, shall be deleted in its
entirety and Section 1816.9 of the 1996 BOCA National
Building Code shall be inserted as follows: “Spacing:
The minimum center-to-center spacing of piles shall not
be less than twice the average diameter.of a round pile,
nor less than 1% times the diagonal dimension of a
rectangular pile. Where driven to or penetrating into
rock, the spacing shall not be less than 24 inches (610
mm). Where receiving principal support at the end
from materials other than rock, or through friction
resistance, the spacing shall not be less than 30 inches
(762 mm) except that for piles having enlarged bases
formed either by compacting concrete or driving a pre-
cast base, the minimum center-to-center spacing shall
be 4% feet (1,372 mm). The spacing of piles shall be
such that the average load on the supporting strata will
not exceed the safe load-bearing value of those strata as
determined by test borings or other approved meth-
ods.”

23-48.2.3

ix. In Section 1807.2.23.2, Seismic Design Category
D, E, or F, the references to “Seismic Design Catego-
ries E and F” shall be deleted.

x. Section 1808.2.2.1, Materials, shall be deleted in
its entirety and Section 1821.2.2 of the 1996 BOCA
National Building Code shall be inserted as follows:
“All concrete shall have a 28-day specified compressive
strength (|SUBSCRIPTEC|\SUBSCRIPT(E) of not
less than 4,000 psi (27579 kPa).”

17.  Chapter 21, Masonry, shall be amended as follows:

i. In Figure 2111.1, Fireplace and Chimney Details,
in the plan view illustration, Letter B is improperly
dimensioned. The text of Section 2111.10 shall prevail.

18. Chapters 27, Electrical; 28, Mechanical Systems;
and 29, Plumbing, shall be deleted in their entirety.

19. Chapter 30, Elevators and Conveying Systems,
shall be amended as follows:

i. In Section 3001.1, Scope, “and where applicable
N.J.A.C. 5:23-12” shall be inserted after “chapter.”

ii. In Section 3001.2, Referenced standards, “this
code” shall be deleted and “these rules” shall be insert-
ed. In the same section, “with the exception of Rule
1206.1h, Part XX and Part XXI” shall be inserted after
“ASME A17.1” and “ASME A18.1” shall be inserted
after “ASME A90.1.” In addition, at the end of the
section, the following shall be inserted: “The scope of
Part XXIV of ASME Al7.1, entitled “Elevator Safety
Requirements for Seismic Risk Zone 2 or Greater,” is
deleted.”

iii. New Section 3002.4.1, Elevators in newly con-
structed multiple dwellings, shall be inserted as follows:
“When an elevator is installed in a newly-constructed
multiple dwelling, the elevator shall meet the dimen-
sional requirements above.”

iv. In Section 3004.4, Closed vents, “annealed glass”
shall be deleted and “plain glass” shall be inserted.

v. In Section 3004.5, Plumbing and mechanical sys-
tems, the exception shall be deleted.

20. Chapter 31, Special Construction, shall be amend-
ed as follows: :

i. New Section 3102.3.2, which shall be the text of
Section 3104.6 of the 1996 BOCA National Building
Code, shall be inserted as follows: “Certification: An
affidavit or affirmation shall be submitted to the code
official and a copy retained on the premises on which
the tent or air-supported structure is located. The
affidavit or affirmation shall attest to the following
information relative to the flame-resistance of the fab-
ric:

1. Names and addresses of the owners of the tent
or air-supported structure.

Supp. 5-5-03



5:23-3.14

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

2. Date the fabric was last treated with flame-
resistant solution.

3. Trade name or kind of chemical used in treat-
ment

4. Name of person or firm treating the material.

5. Name of testing agency and test standard by
which the fabric was tested.”

ii. Section 3103.1.1 shall be deleted in its entirety
and the following shall be inserted:

“(1) Temporary structures: A construction permit
is required for the erection, operation or mainte-
nance of all temporary structures (excluding tents
and tensioned membrane structures) covering an
area in excess of 120 square feet, including all con-
necting areas or spaces with a common means of
egress or entrance, or which are used or intended to
be used for gatherings of 10 or more persons;

(2) Tents with appurtenances: A construction per-
mit is required for the erection, operation or mainte-
nance of all tents or tensioned membrane structures
of any size if they contain appurtenances such as
platforms or electrical equipment;

(3) Tents without appurtenances: No permit is
required for the erection, operation or maintenance
of any tent or tensioned membrane structure without
appurtenances if the tent or structure is no more
than 900 square feet in area and no more than 30
feet in any dimension (excluding canopies), whether
it is one unit or composed of multiple units. Tents
used exclusively for recreational camping purposes
shall be exempt from the above requirements.

(4) A temporary greenhouse, also called a “hoop-
house” or “polyhouse,” used exclusively for the pro-
duction or storage of live plants, shall be exempt
from the permit requirements of the Uniform Con-
struction Code if it meets the following criteria:

(A) There is no permanent anchoring system or founda-
tion;

(B) There is no storage, temporary or otherwise, of sol-
vents, fertilizers, gases, or other chemical or flammable
materials;

(C) The structure is no wider than 31 feet and there is an
unobstructed path of no greater length than 150 feet from
any point to a door or fully accessible wall area; and

(D) The covering of the structure is of a material no
greater than six nails (152.4 micrometers) in thickness,
conforming to NFPA 701 standard, that yields approximate-
ly four pounds of maximum impact resistance to provide
egress through the wall.

Supp. 5-5-03

(5) The provisions of the Uniform Construction
Code at N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.14(b)20ii(4) notwithstanding,
if a temporary greenhouse contains any device sub-
ject to the electrical subcode or any mechanical
equipment subject to the mechanical subcode, a per-
mit shall be required for the device, system or fixture
only. If the temporary greenhouse is connected to a
potable water system, a permit shall be required for
the backflow prevention devices only.

iii. Section 3109, Swimming Pool Enclosures, shall
be deleted in its entirety and the following shall be
inserted:

“3109
SWIMMING POOLS, SPAS AND HOT TUBS

3109.1 General. The provisions of this section shall con-
trol the design and construction of swimming pools, spas
and hot tubs .

3109.2 Definitions. For the purposes of these require-
ments, the terms used shall be defined as follows and as set
forth in Chapter 2.

BARRIER.

A fence, wall, building wall or combination thereof which
completely surrounds the swimming pool and obstructs ac-
cess to the swimming pool.

HOT TUB.

See “Swimming pool.”
IN-GROUND POOL.
See “Swimming pool.”
RESIDENTIAL.

That which is situated on the premises of a detached one-
or two-family dwelling or a one-family townhouse not more
than three stories in height.

SPA, NONPORTABLE.
See “Swimming pool.”
SWIMMING POOL.

Any structure intended for swimming or recreational
bathing that contains water, provided that these regulations
shall not be applicable to any such pool less than 24 inches
(610 mm) deep or having a surface area less than 250 square
feet (23.25 m?). This includes in-ground, aboveground and
on-ground swimming pools, hot tubs and spas.

SWIMMING POOL, INDOOR.

23-48.24

N



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.14

A swimming pool that is totally contained within a struc-

. ture and surrounded on all four sides by walls of said
; structure.

SWIMMING POOL, OUTDOOR.
Any swimming pool, which is not an indoor pool.

3109.3 In-ground public pools. In-ground pools shall be
designed and constructed in conformance with ANSI/
NSPI-1 as listed in Chapter 35.

31094 In-ground Residential pools. In-ground residen-
tial pools shall be designed and constructed in conformance
with ANSI/NSPI-5 as listed in Chapter 35.

3109.5 Permanently installed public spas and hot tubs.
Permanently installed public spas and hot tubs shall be
designed and constructed in conformance with ANSI/
NSPI-2 as listed in Chapter 35.

3109.6 Portable residential spas and hot tubs. Portable
residential spas and hot tubs shall be designed and con-
structed in conformance with ANSI/NSPI-3 as listed in
Chapter 35.

3109.7 Enclosures for private swimming pools, spas and
hot tubs. The provisions of this section shall control the
design of barriers for residential swimming pools, spas and
hot tubs.

3109.7.1 Outdoor swimming pool. An outdoor swimming
pool, including an in-ground, aboveground or on-ground
pool, hot tub or spa shall be provided with a barrier which
shall comply with the following:

1. The top of the barrier shall be at least 48 inches
(1,219 mm) above grade measured on the side of the
barrier, which faces away from the swimming pool. The
maximum vertical clearance between grade and the bottom
of the barrier shall be two inches (51 mm) measured on the
side of the barrier, which faces away from the swimming
pool. Where the top of the pool structure is above grade,
such as an aboveground pool, the barrier may be at ground
level, such as the pool structure, or mounted on top of the
pool structure. Where the barrier is mounted on top of the
pool structure, the maximum vertical clearance between the
top of the pool structure and the bottom of the barrier shall
be four inches (102 mm).

2. Openings in the barrier shall not allow passage of a
four-inch-diameter (102 mm) sphere.

3. Solid barriers, which do not have openings, such as a
masonry or stone wall, shall not contain indentations or
protrusions except for normal construction tolerances and
tooled masonry joints.

4. Where the barrier is composed of horizontal and
vertical members and the distance between the tops of the

23-48.2.5

horizontal members is less than 45 inches (1,143 mm), the

- horizontal members shall be located on the swimming pool

side of the fence. Spacing between vertical members shall
not exceed 1.75 inches (44 mm) in width. Where there are
decorative cutouts within vertical members, spacing within
the cutouts shall not exceed 1.75 inches (44 mm) in width.

5. Where the barrier is composed of horizontal and
vertical members and the distance between the tops of the
horizontal members is 45 inches (1,143 mm) or more,
spacing between vertical members shall not exceed four
inches (102 mm). Where there are decorative cutouts within
vertical members, spacing within the cutouts shall not ex-
ceed 1.75 inches (44 mm) in width.

6. Maximum mesh size for chain link fences shall be a
1.25-inch (32 mm) square unless the fence is provided with
slats fastened at the top or the bottom that reduce the
openings to not more than 1.75 inches (44 mm).

7. Where the barrier is composed of diagonal members,
such as a lattice fence, the maximum opening formed by the
diagonal members shall not be more than 1.75 inches (44
mm).

8. Access gates shall comply with the requirements of
Section AG105.2, Items 1 through 7, and shall be equipped
to accommodate a locking device. Pedestrian access gates
shall open outward away from the pool and shall be self-
closing and have a self-latching device. Gates other than
pedestrian access gates shall have a self-latching device.
Where the release mechanism of the self-latching device is
located less than 54 inches (1,372 mm) from the bottom of
the gate, the release mechanism and openings shall comply
with the following:

8.1. The release mechanism shall be located on the pool
side of the gate at least three inches (76 mm) below the top
of the gate, and

8.2. The gate and barrier shall have no opening greater
than 0.5 inch (12.7 mm) within 18 inches (457 mm) of the
release mechanism.

9. Where an aboveground pool structure is used as a
barrier or where the barrier is mounted on top of the pool
structure, and the means of access is a ladder or steps, then:

9.1. The ladder or steps shall be surrounded by a barrier
that meets the requirements of Section AG105.2, Items 1
through 9. When the ladder or steps are secured, locked or
removed, any opening created shall not allow the passage of
a four-inch-diameter (102 mm) sphere.

3109.8 Barrier exceptions. Spas or hot tubs with a safety
cover that complies with ASTM F 1346, as listed in Chapter
35, shall be exempt from the provisions of this section.

3109.9 Enclosures for public swimming pools, spas and
hot tubs. Public swimming pools shall be completely en-

Supp. 5-5-03



5:23-3.14

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

closed by a fence at least four feet (1,290 mm) in height or a
screen enclosure. Openings in the fence shall not permit the
passage of a four-inch (102 mm) diameter sphere. The fence
or screen enclosure shall be equipped with self-closing and
self-latching gates.*

21. Chapter 32, Encroachments into the Public Rights
of Way, shall be amended as follows:

i. In Section 3202.1.2, Vaults and other enclosed
spaces, “authority or legislative body having jurisdic-
tion” shall be deleted and “Uniform Construction Code
(N.J.A.C. 5:23)” shall be inserted.

ii. In Section 3202.3.4, Pedestrian walkways, “au-
thority having jurisdiction” shall be deleted and “the
construction official” shall be inserted. -

iii. In Section 3202.4, Temporary encroachments,
“local authority having jurisdiction” shall be deleted
and “municipality” shall be inserted.

22. Chapter 33, Safeguards During Construction, shall
be amended as follows:

i. Sections 3303.1, Construction documents; 3303.2,
Pedestrian protection; 3303.4, Vacant lot; 3303.5, Water
accumulation; and 3303.6, Utility connections, shall be
deleted in their entirety.

ii. In the last sentence of Section 3309.1, Where
required, “On construction sites,” shall be inserted
before “All.” In addition, in the last sentence, “Section
906 shall be deleted and “the International Fire Code”
shall be inserted.

23. Chapter 34, Existing Structures, shall be deleted in
its entirety.

24. Chapter 35, Referenced Standards, shall be
amended as follows:

i. Under the subheading “ASME,” the following
reference shall be inserted: “ASME A18.1-1999, Safety
Standard for Platform Lifts and Stairway Chairlifts,
with A18.1a-2001 addenda.”

ii. Under the subheading “NFPA,” “NFPA 13-96,
Installation of Sprinkler Systems; NFPA 13D-96, Instal-
lation of Sprinkler Systems in One-and Two-family
Dwellings and Manufactured Homes; and NFPA
13R-96, Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Residential
Occupancies Up to and Including Four Stories in
Height” shall be deleted and “NFPA 13-99 Installation
of Sprinkler Systems; NFPA 13D-99, Installation of
Sprinkler Systems in One-and Two-family Dwellings
and Manufactured Homes; and NFPA 13R-99, Installa-
tion of Sprinkler Systems in Residential Occupancies
Up to and Including Four Stories in Height” shall be
inserted. In addition, “NFPA 20-99, Installation of
Centrifugal Fire Pumps” shall be inserted after “NFPA
17A-98, Wet Chemical Extinguishing Systems.”

Supp. 5-5-03

ili. Under the subheading “NSPI” the following
NSPI Standards shall be inserted: “ANSI/NSPI-1, Per-
manently Installed Public In-ground Public Pools,
ANSI/NSPI-2, Permanently Installed Public Spas,
ANSI/NSPI-3, Standard for Permanently Installed Res-
idential Spas, ANSI/NSPI-4, Standard for Residential
Above-Ground/One-Ground Swimming Pools, and
ANSI/NSPI-5, Standard for Residential In-ground
Swimming Pools.”

25. The Appendices shall be amended as follows:

i. Appendix A, Employee Qualifications; Appendix
B, Board of Appeals; Appendix C, Group U-Agricul-
tural Buildings; Appendix D, Fire Districts; Appendix
E, Supplementary Accessibility Requirements; Appen-
dix F, Rodent Proofing; and Appendix G, Flood Resis-
tant Construction, shall be deleted in their entirety.

ii. In Appendix H, at the beginning of the Appen-
dix, the sentence, “The provisions contained in this

appendix are not mandatory unless specifically refer- -

enced in the adopting ordinance,” shall be deleted in its
entirety.

(1) In Appendix H, Section H101.2, Signs exempt
from permits, shall be deleted in its entirety.

(2) In Appendix H, Section H105.2, Permits, draw-
ings and specifications, “as provided in Chapter 1”
shall be deleted and “as provided in N.JA.C.
5:23-2.14” shall be inserted.

(3) In Appendix H, Section H106.1, Illumination,
“ICC Electrical Code” shall be deleted and “electri-
cal subcode” shall be inserted.

(4) In Appendix H, Section H106.2, Electrical ser-
vice, “ICC Electrical Code” shall be deleted and
“electrical subcode” shall be inserted.

iii. Appendix I, Patio Covers, and Appendix J, Sup-
plementary Accessibility Requirements for Qualified
Historic Buildings and Facilities, shall be deleted in
their entirety.

Amended by R.1981 d.132, effective May 7, 1981.
See: 13 NJ.R. 121(a), 13 N.J.R. 258(d).
Amended by R.1983 d.12, eff. February 7, 1983, operative February 22,
1983.
See: 14 N.J.R. 132(a), 15 N.J.R. 141(c).
Added (a)2 and (c).
Amended by R.1984 d.314, eff. August 6, 1984.
See: 16 N.J.R. 1139(a), 16 N.J.R. 2084(b).
This section was substantially amended.
Amended by R.1985 d.154, effective April 1, 1985 (operative July 1,
1985.)
See: 17 N.J.R. 239(a), 17 N.J.R. 810(a).
()2 added; subsection (c) added.
Correction: N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.14(c)5 was incorrect in adoption.
See: 17 NJ.R. 1409(a).
Amended by R.1985 d.324, effective July 1, 1985.
See: 17 N.J.R. 861(c), 17 N.J.R. 1646(a).
(b)3i: amended text.
Amended by R.1986 d.380, effective September 22, 1986.
See: 18 N.J.R. 1235(a), 18 N.J.R. 1931(a).
Substantially amended.

23-48.2.6

N



o’

P

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-3.15

Amended by R.1987 d.374, effective September 21, 1987.
See: 19 N.J.R. 1024(a), 19 N.J.R. 1720(b).

Model subcode revisions.
Amended by R.1988 d.270, effective June 20, 1988.
See: 20 N.J.R. 575(a), 20 N.J.R. 1344(a).

Added (a)3 and (c).
Amended by R.1990 d.253, effective May 21, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 909(b), 22 N.J.R. 1554(a).

Text added at (c)2ii, 4, 5 and 7.
Amended by R.1990 d.325, effective July 2, 1990.
See: 21 N.J.R. 1654(a), 22 N.J.R. 2001(a).

Text added at (b)5xii(1) to conform to Fire Code.
Amended by R.1990 d.507, effective October 15, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 2208(a), 22 N.J.R. 3214(a).

Text conformed to BOCA National Code/1990.
Amended by R.1990 d.558, effective November 19, 1990.
See: 22 N.J.R. 1969(b), 22 N.J.R. 3483(a).

Conditional exemption for hoophouses or polyhouses added.
Amended by R.1991 d.325, effective July 1, 1991.

See: 23 N.J.R. 805(a), 23 N.J.R. 2046(a).

Article 26 amended at (b)14.
Amended by R.1991 d.429, effective August 19, 1991.
See: 23 N.J.R. 1487(a), 23 N.J.R. 2501(a).

In (a), added 3. Added (c).
Amended by R.1992 d.244, effective June 15, 1992.
See: 24 N.J.R. 1147(a), 24 N.J.R. 2243(a).

Text added at (b)10v through viii.

Amended by R.1993 d.662, effective December 20, 1993.
See: 25 N.J.R. 3891(a), 25 N.J.R. 5918(a).
Amended by R.1995 d.144, effective March 20, 1995 (operative July 1,

1995).

See: 26 N.J.R. 2698(a), 26 N.J.R. 3524(a), 27 N.J.R. 1180(a).
Amended by R.1995 d.477, effective September 5, 1995.
See: 27 N.J.R. 1717(a), 27 N.J.R. 3328(a).

Added (b)2v.

Amended by R.1998 d.332, effective July 6, 1998.
See: 30 N.J.R. 1377(a), 30 N.J.R. 2421(b).
Rewrote the section.
Amended by R.2000 d.492, effective December 18, 2000.
See: 32 N.J.R. 3219(a), 32 N.J.R. 4437(b).
Rewrote (b)25.
Amended by R.2001 d.127, effective April 16, 2001.
See: 33 N.J.R. 392(a), 33 N.J.R. 1195(a).

In (a)9, added new ix and recodified former ix through xiii as new x
through xiv.

Amended by R.2001 d.368, effective October 15, 2001.
See: 33 N.J.R. 1990(a), 33 N.J.R. 3673(b).

In (b)9, inserted a new ix and recodified former ix through xiv as x
through xv.

Amended by R.2001 d.369, effective October 15, 2001.
See: 33 NLJ.R. 2365(a), 33 N.J.R. 3674(a).

In (b), substituted “seven” for “7% (2335 mm)” in 2vi, rewrote 10,
added a new 17, and recodified former 17 through 26 as 18 through 27.
Amended by R.2002 d.215, effective July 1, 2002.

See: 34 N.J.R. 1078(a), 34 N.J.R. 2312(a).

In (b)22, inserted new ii and recodified existing ii through xvii as iii

through xviii.

Administrative correction.

See: 34 N.J.R. 3771(b).

Amended by R.2003 d.187, effective May 5, 2003.

See: 34 N.J.R. 4248(a), 35 N.J.R. 1939(c).
Rewrote the section.

Case Notes

Set back provisions of borough zoning ordinance controlled conflict-
ing state building code provisions. Pfeuffer v. Sculco, 242 N.J.Super.
181, 576 A.2d 309 (A.D.1990).

U / 5:23-3.15 Plumbing subcode

(a) Rules concerning subcode adopted are as follows:

23-48.2.7

1. Pursuant to authority of P.L. 1975, ¢.217, as modi-
fied by P.L. 1996, c.53, the Commissioner hereby adopts
the Model Code of the National Association of Plumbing
Heating Cooling Contractors, known as “The National
Standard Plumbing Code/2000,” as the plumbing subcode
for New Jersey.

i. Copies of this code may be obtained from the
sponsor at: NAPHCC, P.O. Box 6808, Falls Church,
VA 22046.

2. “The National Standard Plumbing Code/2000,” may
be known and cited as “the plumbing subcode.”

(b) The following pages, chapters, sections or appendices
of the plumbing subcode are amended as follows:

1. The section entitled “Administration,” comprising
sections ADM 1.1 through ADM 1.13, is deleted in its
entirety.

2. Chapter 1 of the plumbing subcode, entitled “Defi-
nitions,” is amended as follows:

i. The definition of the term “administrative author-
ity” is deleted in its entirety, and substitute in lieu
thereof the following language, “Unless otherwise de-
fined herein, or unless the context clearly indicates
otherwise, the term “administrative authority” for pur-
poses of the plumbing subcode, shall mean the “plumb-
ing subcode official.”

ii. The definition of the term “approved” is amend-
ed to add after the word “authority” on line 2, the
words “as defined in N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.7.”

iii. The definition of the term “building” is deleted,
and substitute in lieu thereof, the definition of the term
“building” found in N.J.A.C. 5:23-1.4.

iv. The definition of the term “building classifica-
tion” is amended to delete the term ‘“administrative
authority” and substitute in lieu thereof, the term
“building subcode official.”

v. The term and definition of “code” are deleted.
vi. The term and definition of “family” are deleted.

vii. The term and definition of “nuisance” are de-
leted.

viii. Add the following new definition after the defi-
nition of Swimming Pool: Swimming Pool, Public: A
swimming pool located on any property other than a
one or two family residential property and including,
but not limited to, swimming pools open to the use of
members, residents or the public.

3. Chapter 2 of the plumbing subcode, entitled “Gen-
eral Regulations,” is amended as follows:

i. Section 2.4.1 is amended to delete the sentence
“The provisions of this paragraph may be waived by the
administrative authority.”

Supp. 5-5-03



5:23-3.15

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 5-5-03

ii. Section 2.4.3 is amended to delete the phrase “or
is approved by the administrative authority as having a
desirable and acceptable function and is of ultimate
benefit to the proper and continuing functioning of the
plumbing system.”

iii. Section 2.5 is deleted in its entirety.

iv. Section 2.9.3 is amended to delete the phrase
“building code or as required by the proper administra-
tive authority” and substitute in lieu thereof, the term
“building subcode.”

v. Section 2.12 is amended to delete subparagraph
€.

vi. Section 2.16 is amended to insert the number
“Forty-two” in the blank space under item (a), and to
insert the number “Twenty-four” in the blank space
under item (b). Under item (c), delete the words “as
permitted in section 3.12.1.”

vii. Section 2.19.1 is amended to delete the blank
and the words “feet of any property line of the premis-
es, or other.”

viii. Section 2.19.2 is amended to delete the words
“the Health Department or other agency having juris-
diction” and substitute in lieu thereof “The New Jersey
Department of Environmental Protection.”

ix. Section 2.25 (h) is amended to add at the end,
the words “which does not otherwise adversely affect
health and safety.”

4. Chapter 3 of the plumbing subcode, entitled “Mate-
rials,” is amended as follows:

i. Section 3.1.1 is amended in the heading to delete
the word “minimum” and under items (a) and (b) to
delete the words “Section 3.12.2” at the end and substi-
tute in lieu thereof, the words “N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.7.”

ii. Section 3.1.2 is amended to delete the words “at
least” on line 1. Also the words “section 3.12” are
deleted at the end of the first paragraph and substitute
in lieu thereof, the words “N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.7.”

iii. Section 3.1.3 is amended to delete the words
“Section 3.12.2” on line 2 and in lieu thereof, substitute
the words “N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.7.”

23-48.2.8

iv. Section 3.3.8a is amended to add the following
phrase: “Pressure vessels shall be designed and con-
structed in accordance with the requirements of Ameri-
can Society of Mechanical Engineers, (ASME), Rules
for Construction of Pressure Vessels, Section VIII/1998.
Any pressure vessel that exceeds any of the following,
shall meet the requirements of ASME and shall be
stamped ASME: A heat input rating of 200,000 BTU
per hour; or a water temperature of 200 degrees Fahr-
enheit; or a nominal water capacity of 120 gallons or
any other thresholds of ASME that apply.”

v. Section 3.3.11 entitled “septic tank” is deleted in
its entirety.

vi. Section 3.11.1 is amended to delete the phrase
“approved by the Administrative authority”.

vii. Section 3.11.2 is amended to delete the phrase
“except as may be otherwise authorized by the adminis-
trative authority”.

vili. Sections 3.12.1, 3.12.2, 3.12.3, 3.12.4, and 3.12.5

are deleted in their entirety.

5. Chapter 4 of the plumbing subcode entitled, “Joints
and Connections” is amended as follows:

i. Section 4.2.17(a) is amended to delete the phrase
“or be approved by the administrative authority.”

ii. Section 4.3.8(b)(3) is amended to delete the
words “be approved by the Administrative Authority if
such products are not listed or labeled” and to add the
phrase “or as permitted under N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.7.”

6. Chapter 5 of the plumbing subcode entitled,
“Traps, Cleanouts and Backwater Valves” is amended as
follows:

i. Section 5.3.2 is amended to add the phrase “in
accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.3” after the words
“administrative authority” on line 2.

ii. Section 5.3.4 is amended to add the phrase “in

accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.3” after the words"

“administrative authority” on line 1.

7. Chapter 6 of the plumbing subcode, entitled “Inter-
ceptors,” is amended as follows:

Next Page is 23-48.3

D,



UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-9.2

(d) Post abatement sampling and analysis for an asbestos
hazard abatement project shall be performed as per EPA 40
CFR 763.90i. Samples collected within the affected work
area shall be analyzed by TEM.

(e) Post abatement sampling and analysis for an asbestos
hazard abatement project utilizing the glovebag technique
and encapsulation shall be as follows:

1. One sample per 10,000 square feet of work area
with a minimum of five samples shall be required. Sam-
ples collected within the affected work area may be
analyzed by PCM to confirm completion of an asbestos
abatement project using the methodology specified in
NIOSH 7400.

(f) For TEM analysis, the project shall be considered
complete when the results of samples collected in the
affected work area comply with 40 CFR 763.90 and Appen-
dix A to Subpart E. Maximum turnaround time from
sample collection through data reporting shall be 72 hours.

(g) For PCM analysis, the project shall be considered
complete when the results of samples collected in the
affected work area show that the concentration of fibers for
each of the five samples is less than or equal to 0.01 fibers
per cubic centimeter.

‘(h) When the air analysis results for projects covered by
this subchapter show asbestos fiber concentrations above the
acceptance criteria, then clean-up shall be repeated until
compliance is achieved by re-cleaning all surfaces using wet
methods and operating all HEPA equipped air pressure
differential units to filter the air.

New Rule R.1986 d.143, effective May 5, 1986.
See: 18 N.J.R. 378(a), 18 N.J.R. 949(a).
Amended by R.1989 d.342, effective July 3, 1989.
See: 20 NJ.R. 1130(b), 21 N.J.R. 1844(Db).
Recodified old 8.20 as new 8.21. Section 8.21 was formerly “Demoli-
tion”.
Recodified from 5:23-8.23 by R.1993 d.198, effective June 7, 1993.
See: 24 N.J.R. 1422(a), 25 N.J.R. 2519(b).
Prior text at section, “Appeals”, repealed.

5:23-8.22 Disposal of asbestos waste

(a) The disposal of friable/non-friable asbestos-containing
material and asbestos-contaminated waste from the project
site shall be in accordance with New Jersey Department of
Environmental Protection and Energy requirements speci-
fied in N.J.A.C. 7:26 and 40 CFR Part 61, Subpart M.

Amended by R.1986 d.143, effective May 5, 1986.
See: 18 N.J.R. 378(a), 18 N.J.R. 949(a).
Recodified from 8.13 and substantially amended.
Amended by R.1987 d.525, effective December 21, 1987.
See: 19 N.J.R. 902(a), 19 N.J.R. 2389(a).
Substantially amended.
Amended by R.1989 d.342, effective July 3, 1989.
See: 20 N.J.R. 1130(b), 21 N.J.R. 1844(b).
Recodified old 8.14 as new 8.15, no change in text. Section 8.15 was
formerly “Duties of the asbestos safety technician”.

’

23-171

Recodified from 5:23-8.15 and amended by R.1993 d.198, effective
June 7, 1993.

See: 24 N.J.R. 1422(a), 25 N.J.R. 2519(b).
Prior section, “Demolition”, recodified as 5:23-8.18.

SUBCHAPTER 9. CODE INTERPRETATIONS

5:23-9.1 Interpretations: Plumbing Subcode

(a) Application of the Plumbing Subcode to certain man-
ufactured homes:

1. Chapter 18 of the Plumbing Subcode (National
Standard Plumbing Code) is not applicable to permanent-
ly installed manufactured homes meeting the Federal
Manufactured Home Construction and Safety Standards,
24 C.F.R. Part 3280.

2. An approved structure placed on a site for use as a
permanent dwelling shall meet the requirements of the
State Plumbing Subcode, excluding Chapter 18 of the
Plumbing Subcode (National Standard Plumbing Code),
or, if applicable, the Federal Manufactured Home Con-
struction and Safety Standards.

(b) Use of common water service and sewer lines under
Sections 1.2 and 2.19 of the Plumbing Subcode:

1. Common water services shall be permitted to serve
attached single family dwellings in groups of three or
more where the common water service is located within
property subject to an association easement or on com-
mon property and there is a homeowners’ association or
other entity responsible for maintenance and upkeep.

2. Common building sewers shall be permitted to
serve attached single family dwellings in groups of three
or more where the common sewer is located within
property subject to an association easement or on com-
mon property and there is a homeowners’ association or
other entity responsible for maintenance and upkeep.

Amended by R.1995 d.647, effective December 18, 1995 (operative
March 18, 1996).

See: 27 NJ.R. 3517(a), 27 N.J.R. 5012(a).

Amended by R.2002 d.319, effective October 7, 2002.

See: 33 NJ.R. 4185(a), 34 N.J.R. 3497(b).
Rewrote the section.

5:23-9.2 Interpretation: Construction Permit for a single-
family residence

(a) Any application for a construction permit for a single
family residence shall be accompanied by at least two copies
of plans drawn to scale, with sufficient clarity and detailed
dimensions to show the nature and character of the work to
be performed. Plans submitted shall not be required to
show more detail or include more information than is

reasonably necessary to assure compliance with the require-

ments of the Uniform Construction Code and rules in this
chapter.

Supp. 5-19-03



5:23-9.2

COMMUNITY AFFAIRS

Supp. 5-19-03

(b) Plans containing the following information shall be
considered to meet the requirements of (a) above:

1. Site diagram consisting of a site plan showing size
and location of all new and existing construction on the
site with distances from lot lines and indicating new
building services, location and size.

2. Construction plans consisting of a scale drawing
showing foundation, floor plans, and elevations, including
structural framing notes for all floors, ceilings and roofs.
Only girders and columns need be identified and located
on the plan. Included on the drawings shall be a loading
schedule indicating the live loads for which the structure
is designed.

3. The following details and submissions shall be re-
quired:

i. A cross section through one typical wall showing
construction details from footing to and including roof
framing. This section shall indicate all construction
materials used including roofing, vapor barriers, sheath-
ing type and thickness, insulation type and thickness,
windows, glazing type if other than standard window
glazing is used, interior finish material, floor type and
thickness, structure, foundation and footings. Decora-
tive material shall not be required to be shown unless it
contributes to the structural integrity of the section.

ii. When roof or other truss systems are used, the
details required by N.J.A.C. 5:23-2.15(e)1ii(1)(A) shall
be shown.

iii. [Electrical details indicating lighting; receptacles;
motors and equipment; smoke detectors; service en-
trance locations; size and type (overhead or under-
ground); panel size, location; number of proposed
circuits. A symbol legend shall be included.

iv. Plumbing details indicating the locations of fix-
tures and a notice or table listing water and drainage
pipe sizes. A note stating if sewage disposal is to
public sewer or individual septic system shall be includ-
ed.

v. Mechanical details indicating the type of heating
system; location, size and type of heating unit, noting
the distribution method and indicating design rates,
location of fire dampers and safeguards; and location,
type and size of flue.

vi. Energy subcode compliance shall be demonstrat-
ed with either detailed calculations, Energy Star com-
pliance documentation, the submission of printouts
from software recognized by the Department, such as
MECRES Check software is available from the Depart-
ment of Community Affairs, Division of Codes and
Standards, PO Box 802, Trenton, New Jersey 08625 or
from the U.S. Department of Energy at www.energy-

codes.gov.

4, The drawings shall bear the seal and signature of
an architect or engineer who prepared the plans and is
registered in the State of New Jersey. The seal and
signature shall appear on each sheet of each copy of the
plans submitted.

i. The construction official shall waive the require-
ments for sealed plans in the case of a single family
home owner who prepares his or her own plans for the
construction, alteration or repair of a structure used or
intended to be used exclusively as the owner’s private
residence, and which is to be constructed by the owner,
providing that the owner shall submit an affidavit at-
testing to the fact that he has prepared the plans and
that the plans are, in the opinion of the construction
official and appropriate subcode officials, legible and
complete for the purpose of ensuring compliance with
the regulations.

ii. Plumbing plans, electrical plans and mechanical
plans may be prepared by licensed plumbers, licensed
electrical contractors and mechanical contractors, re-
spectively, in accordance with these regulations.

5. Construction plans, and electrical, plumbing, and
mechanical details may be shown on more than one
drawing.

6. Where a prototype plan has been approved pursu-
ant to existing regulations, only a site diagram and refer-
ence to the approved prototype plan shall be required.
This site diagram must be signed and sealed by a regis-
tered architect or licensed professional engineer.

7. The Construction Official, upon the advice of the
appropriate subcode official, may waive any or all of the
requirements for plans in (b)1 through 6 above when the
work is of a minor nature.

Amended by R.2003 d.216, effective May 19, 2003.
See: 35 N.J.R. 16(a), 35 N.J.R. 2203(a).

In (b)3, inserted “and submissions” following “details” in the intro-
ductory paragraph, added new ii, recodified former ii through iv as iii
through v and added vi.

5:23-9.3 Interpretation: ordinary maintenance

(a) The following items are ordinary maintenance and
shall be treated as such by every enforcing agency. No
permits for, inspections of, or notice to the enforcing agency
of ordinary maintenance shall be required. This is not an all-
inclusive listing of ordinary maintenance.

1. Ordinary building maintenance shall include:
i. Exterior and interior painting;

ii. Installation, repair or replacement of any interior

~ finishes of less than 25 percent of the wall area in any

given room, in a one or two family dwelling. This shall
include plastering and drywall installation;

(1) Vinyl wall covering of any amount is an ordi-
nary repair;

23-172 Next Page is 23-172.1




NS

UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODE

5:23-9.3

Next Page is 23-173

(2) Paneling shall not be considered an ordinary
repair;

iii. Wall papering at any location;

iv. The replacement of glass in any window or door.
However, the replacement glass shall be of a type and
quality that complies with the minimum requirements
of the code;

v. The installation and replacement of any window
or door, including garage doors, in the same opening
without altering the dimensions or framing of the origi-
nal opening. This shall include storm windows and
storm doors. The installation and replacement of
means of egress and emergency escape windows and
doors may be made in the same opening without alter-
ing the dimensions or framing of the original opening,
and shall not reduce the required height, width or net
clear opening of the previous window or door assembly;

23-172.1

vi. The repair of any non-structural member such as
a partition railing or kitchen cabinet; '

vii. The repair or replacement of any interior or
exterior trim, decoration or moldings;

viii. The replacement or installation of any flooring
material, except carpeting, with a new material. How-
ever, installation of carpeting in one and two family
dwellings will be permitted under ordinary repairs;

ix. The repair of existing roofing material not ex-
ceeding 25 percent of the total roof area within any 12
month period;

x. The repair of existing siding with like material
not exceeding 25 percent of the total building exterior
wall area within any 12 month period;

Supp. 5-19-03



